

EXHIBIT 20

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	07/07/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	LEGAL RESEARCH; REVIEW EMAIL; REVIEW LEGISLATIVE HISTORY
1658.0001	07/09/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH; CONSIDER OPTIONS; RESEARCH TORT REFORM ACT; EMAIL RE: PREP FOR TUESDAY MEETING
1658.0001	07/10/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM; MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	07/12/2017	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	DRIVE TO TULSA AND BACK; ATTEND DEPOSITIONS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; REVIEW PROTECTIVE ORDER
1658.0001	07/13/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH BRAD BECKWORTH
1658.0001	07/14/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH LINDA BEEBE; REVIEW FILES; CONFERENCE WITH PHILLIP WHALEY
1658.0001	07/14/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	REVIEW ██████████
1658.0001	07/14/2017	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LINDA BEEBE, DREW PATE AND OUR TEAM; MEET WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN TO PREPARE TO DO MEMO ; LEGAL RESEARCH PRCA; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LINDA BEEBE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PATTI LEWIS; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	07/14/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LINDA BEEBE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	07/14/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	07/15/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LINDA BEEBE; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	07/16/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; MAP OUT STRATEGY FOR SUNOCO DISCOVERY
1658.0001	07/17/2017	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW EMAIL; DOCKET SEARCH; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; EMAILS WITH PATTI LEWIS AND LINDA BEEBE; ANALYZE CLAIMS IN OTHER CASES FOR DUPLICITY; EMAIL BARNES AND LEWIS
1658.0001	07/18/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: UPDATE
1658.0001	07/18/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	07/19/2017	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW CASES AND DOCKETS; REVIEW EMAILS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND ROBERT BARNES
1658.0001	07/19/2017	PMR	875.00	0.15	131.25	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND EMAIL
1658.0001	07/19/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	REVIEW FUEL GAS THEORY AND DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	07/20/2017	PMR	875.00	1.70	1,487.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JOANN MICKLE; REVIEW FILINGS; MEETING WITH BARNES & LEWIS; (2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MIKE BURRAGE; LENGTHY ANALYSIS TO TEAM; STRATEGY RE: CLAIMS; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; FURTHER EDITS
1658.0001	07/20/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	EXCHANGE OF EMAIL AMONG TEAM
1658.0001	07/21/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE; EXCHANGE EMAIL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LINDA BEEBE AND BOB BARNES
1658.0001	07/21/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DISCOVERY; REVIEW CASE LAW
1658.0001	07/22/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE; EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	07/24/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	REVIEW CASE; EMAIL WITH ROBERT BARNES, PATTI LEWIS AND LINDA BEEBE; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	07/24/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; CONFERENCE CALL WITH NIX PATTERSON
1658.0001	07/24/2017	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW SETTLEMENT PAYMENTS AND DOCKET SHEETS; REVIEW DOCUMENTS; REVIEW MULTIPLE CASES AND COMPLAINTS
1658.0001	07/25/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	EXCHANGE MULTIPLE EMAIL TO NIX PATTERSON AND BARNES & LEWIS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BRAD BECKWORTH; EMAIL WITH LINDA BEEBE
1658.0001	07/26/2017	PMR	875.00	1.60	1,400.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RACHEL HARRISON; EXCHANGE EMAIL; WORK ON DISCOVERY
1658.0001	07/26/2017	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LINDA BEEBE; JASON RYAN AND BARNES & LEWIS; REVIEW CHECK STUBS; REVIEW DISCOVERY REQUESTS; EXCHANGE MORE EMAIL; PREPARE DISCOVERY REQUESTS
1658.0001	07/27/2017	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW DISCOVERY; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; CONFERENCE WITH TREY DUCK AT NIX PATTERSON
1658.0001	08/01/2017	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW FILED DOCUMENTS AND EMAIL; REVIEW ANSWER
1658.0001	08/01/2017	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE AND JASON RYAN; REVIEW DRAFTS AND DOCUMENTS; EXCHANGE MULTIPLE EMAILS; EDIT DISCOVERY

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	08/02/2017	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH JOANN MICKLE; EMAIL WITH BOB BARNES AND PATTI LEWIS
1658.0001	08/02/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	LEGAL RESEARCH; EXCHANGE EMAIL RE: ROYALTY OWNER'S CLAIMS
1658.0001	08/08/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	LEGAL RESEARCH; EMAIL AND TELEPHONE CALL CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	08/10/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW LEASES AND EMAIL; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PHILLIP WHALEY
1658.0001	08/16/2017	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE; PREP DOCUMENTS FOR CASE TRANSFER (NOTICE OF REMOVAL)
1658.0001	08/17/2017	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	WORK ON LETTER; WORK ON MOTIONS; REVIEW FILINGS; EMAIL
1658.0001	08/17/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	REVIEW LEGAL RESEARCH; EMAIL
1658.0001	08/18/2017	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW PLEADINGS; REVIEW EMAILS; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	08/21/2017	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	REVIEW ANSWER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; EMAIL
1658.0001	08/22/2017	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	TELEPHONE CALL TO DREW PATE; EMAIL
1658.0001	08/22/2017	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFTS; EMAIL TO MIKE BURRAGE
1658.0001	08/22/2017	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL; WORK ON FILING
1658.0001	08/23/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	RESEARCH; EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	08/23/2017	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; EMAILS WITH MIKE BURRAGE
1658.0001	08/24/2017	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL TO DREW PATE; REVIEW DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	08/25/2017	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW FILE; REVIEW LOCAL RULES
1658.0001	08/28/2017	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; CHECK LOCAL RULES; EMAILS
1658.0001	08/28/2017	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN SCHEDULING CONFERENCE
1658.0001	08/29/2017	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DISCOVERY CONFERENCE AGREEMENTS; EMAIL
1658.0001	09/05/2017	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DRAFT; EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	09/06/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	09/20/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW OLD EMAIL
1658.0001	09/21/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM; REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	10/04/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW PLEADING AND FILE
1658.0001	10/05/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW FILE; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	10/06/2017	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW DRAFT OF JOINT STATUS REPORT; EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH TEAM; ARRANGE ATTENDANCE; REVIEW PAULA JANTZEN'S STATUS
1658.0001	10/06/2017	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MARK CHRISTIANSEN
1658.0001	10/09/2017	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW EDITS TO JOINT REPORT; TELEPHONE CALL TO MIKE BURRAGE
1658.0001	10/09/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DRAFT STATUS REPORT
1658.0001	10/09/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TEAM MEETING; REVIEW STATUS; REVIEW PLEADING
1658.0001	10/10/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW PLEADINGS; TELEPHONE CALL TO PATTI LEWIS
1658.0001	10/11/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND DRAFTS
1658.0001	10/11/2017	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW AND REVISE DOCUMENTS; REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	10/12/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	10/13/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	BRIEF TEAM
1658.0001	10/17/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	10/18/2017	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	REVIEW DRAFT OF SCHEDULING ORDER; REVIEW SUNOCO DISCOVERY RESPONSES; EMAIL
1658.0001	10/23/2017	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	REVIEW EMAIL; REVIEW SCHEDULING ORDER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	10/24/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND PLEADING
1658.0001	10/25/2017	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND PLEADING
1658.0001	10/30/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	11/07/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW COURT PLEADINGS
1658.0001	11/08/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW COURT ORDER
1658.0001	11/24/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILINGS
1658.0001	11/27/2017	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DISCOVERY REQUESTS
1658.0001	11/28/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH; REVIEW STRACK OPINION; EMAIL TEAM
1658.0001	11/28/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW DOCUMENTS WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND DREW PATE
1658.0001	11/28/2017	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	MULTIPLE EMAILS; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	12/04/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LOCATE AND REVIEW DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND EMAIL
1658.0001	12/04/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE MULTIPLE EMAIL
1658.0001	12/04/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL
1658.0001	12/04/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAILS AND DISCOVERY

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001	Cline/Perry					
1658.0001	12/04/2017	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DISCOVERY RESPONSE
1658.0001	12/05/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON SCHEDULE OF MEET AND CONFER
1658.0001	12/07/2017	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	DISCOVERY CONFERENCE WITH SUNOCO COUNSEL; SEPARATE CALL WITH DREW
1658.0001	12/07/2017	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	PREPARE FOR CALL; EXCHANGE EMIL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; (2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RACHEL HARRISON
1658.0001	12/08/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE; TELEPHONE CALL TO BRAD BECKWORTH
1658.0001	12/12/2017	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	(2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH LINDA BEEBE
1658.0001	12/12/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	12/13/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	12/14/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PHILLIP WHALEY RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	12/19/2017	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	MULTIPLE EMAILS; REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: SUNOCO PROFFER OF CHECK; REVIEW [REDACTED]
1658.0001	12/19/2017	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	12/20/2017	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW EMAIL; BRIEF MOTION AND ATTACHMENTS
1658.0001	12/20/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	12/20/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: DISCOVERY RESPONSE
1658.0001	12/21/2017	PMR	875.00	3.50	3,062.50	REVIEW AND EDIT INTERROGATORIES RESPONSES; WORK ON MOTION FOR INTERIM COUNSEL; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	12/21/2017	PMR	875.00	5.50	4,812.50	REVIEW AND EDIT REQUEST FOR PRODUCTIONS OF SUNOCO; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN; WORK ON BRIEF; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES AND REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS; LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	12/22/2017	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW DRAFTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	12/26/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND FILE
1658.0001	12/27/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	12/27/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	12/28/2017	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	WORK ON 30B(6); WORK ON INTERIM COUNSEL'S MOTIONS; EXCHANGE EMAILS
1658.0001	12/28/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW DRAFTS
1658.0001	12/28/2017	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW INTERIM COUNSEL'S MOTION
1658.0001	01/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE RE: VARIOUS MATERIALS
1658.0001	01/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	01/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DISCOVERY REQUESTS; REVIEW CLINE DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	01/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES DRAFT ANSWERS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	01/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: PRSA
1658.0001	01/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: CORP COMMISSION RULES
1658.0001	01/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: DISCOVERY RESPONSES
1658.0001	01/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	01/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	01/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	01/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WEEKLY CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	01/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	01/09/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	TEAM MEETING WITH CO-COUNSEL AND INTERNAL FIRM MEETING
1658.0001	01/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE AND TREY DUCK
1658.0001	01/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH AND EMAIL WITH BRAD BECKWORTH; REVIEW ALL LEASES
1658.0001	01/16/2018	PMR	875.00	3.00	2,625.00	REVIEW 30(B)(6) NOTICE; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	01/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	01/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	01/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	01/16/2018	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; REVIEW PLEADINGS; PREPARE 30(B)(6) NOTICE
1658.0001	01/17/2018	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	FURTHER EDIT 30(B)(6) NOTICE; EMAIL; EXCHANGE EMAIL AND DRAFT WITH DREW PATE; EDIT SUNOCO LETTER
1658.0001	01/17/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW CLINE CHECKS; EXCHANGE EMAILS
1658.0001	01/18/2018	PMR	875.00	4.70	4,112.50	REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE DOCUMENTS FROM SUNOCO

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001	Cline/Perry					
1658.0001	01/18/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	01/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	01/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW AND EDIT DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	01/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL AND SUMMARY
1658.0001	01/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND WORK ON SCHEDULE DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	01/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW AND EDIT LETTER TO SUNOCO'S COUNSEL
1658.0001	01/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	01/22/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	01/22/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE: CHECKS
1658.0001	01/22/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW SUMMARY
1658.0001	01/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	EMAIL AND DISCUSSION WITH CO-COUNSEL
1658.0001	01/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW MCCLURE LETTER
1658.0001	01/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH NIX PATTERSON
1658.0001	01/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	01/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; REVIEW MATERIALS
1658.0001	01/31/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL AND LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	01/31/2018	PMR	875.00	1.70	1,487.50	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: 30(B)(6)
1658.0001	02/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON 30(B)(6) ISSUES
1658.0001	02/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	WORK ON ALLOCATION OF WORK
1658.0001	02/07/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL INFO AND FOLLOW-UP RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	02/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	02/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND RETENTION AGREEMENT
1658.0001	02/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ROBERT BARNES AND DREW PATE
1658.0001	02/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	DEPO SCHEDULE; WORK ON LETTER TO McClure
1658.0001	02/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	WORK ON DEPO SCHEDULE; EMAIL; REVIEW ██████████
1658.0001	02/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW EMAIL RE: DEPOSITIONS; REVIEW PRODUCTION BY PLAINTIFF
1658.0001	02/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	02/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	02/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; EMAIL
1658.0001	02/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND EMAIL
1658.0001	02/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL AND DEPO LETTER
1658.0001	02/16/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	WORK ON DEPOSITION OUTLINE
1658.0001	02/16/2018	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	WORK ON DEPO OUTLINE
1658.0001	02/17/2018	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	PREPARE DEPO OUTLINE
1658.0001	02/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	REVIEW SUNOCO DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	02/19/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; PREP FOR DEPOSITION
1658.0001	02/19/2018	PMR	875.00	3.80	3,325.00	REVIEW SUNOCO DOCUMENTS FOR DEPO PREP
1658.0001	02/20/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	TRAVEL ARRANGEMENTS; EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	02/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND DEPO PREP
1658.0001	02/20/2018	PMR	875.00	2.70	2,362.50	REVIEW SUNOCO DOCUMENT AND DEPO PREP; MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	02/21/2018	PMR	875.00	2.80	2,450.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND DEPO PREP
1658.0001	02/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	02/22/2018	PMR	875.00	1.70	1,487.50	DEPO PREP RE: KAELLING
1658.0001	02/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DEPO PREP RE: KAELLING
1658.0001	02/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	PREP FOR DEPO RE: KAELLING
1658.0001	02/25/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE AND EMAIL
1658.0001	02/25/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE AND EMAIL
1658.0001	02/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EMAIL; CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	02/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	ARRANGEMENTS FOR OUTLINE AND EXHIBITS
1658.0001	02/26/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	ANALYSIS TO TEAM RE: BURDEN OF PROOF
1658.0001	02/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL; DEPO PREP
1658.0001	02/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM RE: ██████████
1658.0001	02/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	██████████ PULL MATERIALS TOGETHER FOR DEPOSITION
1658.0001	02/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW SUMMARY AND PREPARE FOR DEPO
1658.0001	02/28/2018	PMR	875.00	8.00	7,000.00	TRIP TO HOUSTON; REVIEW DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH CODY; WORK ON EXHIBITS
1658.0001	02/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL WITH NIX PATTERSON
1658.0001	03/01/2018	PMR	875.00	8.00	7,000.00	DEPOSITION OF KOELLING, HOUSTON, TX
1658.0001	03/02/2018	PMR	875.00	6.00	5,250.00	RETURN FROM HOUSTON
1658.0001	03/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON EXPENSE REPORT; EMAILS WITH KATHEY SHOCKS
1658.0001	03/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW
1658.0001	03/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL TO NIX PATTERSON
1658.0001	03/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW AG OPINION
1658.0001	03/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	WEEKLY TEAM CALL WITH NIX PATTERSON AND BARNES & LEWIS

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	03/06/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW OUTLINE RE: OKLAHOMA INTEREST
1658.0001	03/06/2018	PMR	875.00	2.90	2,537.50	WORK ON RUSTON
1658.0001	03/06/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	03/07/2018	PMR	875.00	5.00	4,375.00	REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE KOELLING DEPO
1658.0001	03/08/2018	PMR	875.00	3.10	2,712.50	COMPLETE DEPO SUMMARY OF KOELLING
1658.0001	03/09/2018	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	PREPARE OUTLINE FOR DEPOSITION
1658.0001	03/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	03/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	03/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW PAULA JANTZEN'S SUGGESTIONS FOR DEPOSITION
1658.0001	03/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	LEGAL RESEARCH; EDIT OUTLINE
1658.0001	03/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	LEGAL RESEARCH; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO PAULA JANTZEN'S MEMO; WORK ON SUNOCO DEPO PREP
1658.0001	03/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	SUGGEST ADDITIONAL QUESTIONS FOR HOLLAND
1658.0001	03/13/2018	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	REVIEW SUNOCO PRODUCTION OF ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS AND EMAIL
1658.0001	03/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	AMEND OUTLINE FOR DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	03/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: ESI
1658.0001	03/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	03/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW AND EDIT DISCOVERY; LETTER TO DEFENSE COUNSEL
1658.0001	03/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DEPO PREP; EMAIL WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	03/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW UNCLAIMED PROPERTY STATUTE; EMAIL TEAM
1658.0001	03/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL AND THOUGHTS WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	03/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL AND CONSIDER DEPO APPROACH
1658.0001	03/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	03/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	03/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	LEGAL RESEARCH; REVIEW ██████████
1658.0001	03/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DRAFTS OF EDITED DISCOVERY
1658.0001	03/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	ADDRESS KRAUSE OPINIONS
1658.0001	03/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW SEARCH TERMS AND EMAIL
1658.0001	03/22/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM; WORK ON WRITTEN DISCOVERY; EMAIL
1658.0001	03/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW SUNOCO DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	03/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND REVIEW AND EDIT LETTER TO DEFENDANT
1658.0001	03/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	WORK ON KRAUSE AND REVIEW ASSOCIATED DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	03/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND STATUS OF SUNOCO PRODUCTION
1658.0001	03/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TEAM CONFERENCE CALL AND EMAIL EXCHANGE
1658.0001	03/26/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	WORK ON KRAUSE REPORT AND IDENTIFYING ISSUES
1658.0001	03/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL; REVIEW SUNOCO DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	03/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW FINAL DRAFT TO MCCLURE
1658.0001	03/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW REPLY IN ██████████
1658.0001	03/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	BRIEF REVIEW OF HOLLAND DEPOSITION
1658.0001	03/29/2018	PMR	875.00	4.30	3,762.50	SUMMARIZE DEPO OF HOLLAND
1658.0001	03/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM AND REVIEW PLEADING
1658.0001	03/30/2018	PMR	875.00	3.40	2,975.00	COMPLETE SUMMARY OF HOLLAND DEPO
1658.0001	04/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	04/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	REVIEW BARNES' MEMO AND RESPOND; LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	04/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND LEGAL RESEARCH CLO
1658.0001	04/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH LINDA BEEBE
1658.0001	04/04/2018	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	REVIEW NOTES AND EARLIER EMAIL; EDIT DEPOSITION OUTLINE
1658.0001	04/04/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW MCCLUNE LETTER; LETTER TO TEAM
1658.0001	04/04/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW AND COMPARE OPINIONS IN ██████████ ██████████ TO KRAUSE
1658.0001	04/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: UNCLAIMED PROPERTY
1658.0001	04/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND REVIEW SUNOCO POSITION ON CERT
1658.0001	04/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	EMAIL
1658.0001	04/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	MULTIPLE EMAIL SENT AND RECEIVED RE: RULE 37
1658.0001	04/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	DEPOSITION PREP
1658.0001	04/06/2018	PMR	875.00	4.10	3,587.50	ANALYZE SUNOCO DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND EMAIL AND SEND RECOMMENDATION TO TEAM
1658.0001	04/06/2018	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	ANALYZE GASTOR'S CHECKS TO PERRY CLINE
1658.0001	04/06/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; DISCUSS APPROACH IN RULE 37
1658.0001	04/06/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	04/07/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL RE: OUTLINE AND ESI
1658.0001	04/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW ██████████ AND ESI SEARCH TERMS

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001	Cline/Perry					
1658.0001	04/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM RE: CASE ISSUES
1658.0001	04/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PHILLIP WHALEY
1658.0001	04/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	04/09/2018	PMR	875.00	1.70	1,487.50	REVIEW DISCOVERY RESPONSES BY SUNOCO; PREPARE FOR RULE 37 HEARING; PREPARE MEMO
1658.0001	04/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CALL TO MIKE BURRAGE; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	04/10/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	RULE 37 CONFERENCE WITH SUNOCO COUNSEL
1658.0001	04/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW STATE DATA BASE
1658.0001	04/10/2018	PMR	875.00	2.90	2,537.50	DRAFT DISCOVERY LETTER TO SUNOCO'S COUNSEL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW RELATED DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	04/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	04/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	ADDITIONAL WORK ON RULE 37 LETTER
1658.0001	04/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND FAX
1658.0001	04/12/2018	PMR	875.00	1.90	1,662.50	REVIEW AND FURTHER EDIT LETTER TO MCCLURE; REVIEW AND EDIT SEARCH TERMS; EMAIL EXCHANGES; REVIEW FINAL SEARCH TERMS; EMAIL WITH TEAM AND MCCLURE
1658.0001	04/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH AND EXCHANGE CHANGES WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: STRATEGY
1658.0001	04/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND SEND EMAIL RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	04/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	04/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	CONFERENCE WITH BRAD BECKWORTH; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	04/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	PREPARE MEMO RE: IMMEDIATE TASKS
1658.0001	04/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON KRAUSE; EMAIL WITH DREW PATE AND TEAM; REVIEW FILE, AND PLEADINGS
1658.0001	04/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM; PREPARE DISCOVERY; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	04/24/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON KRAUSE
1658.0001	04/24/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON KRAUSE
1658.0001	04/25/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW AND STUDY WORKING INTEREST ISSUE
1658.0001	04/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	ESI EMAIL
1658.0001	04/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ROBERT BARNES AND DREW PATE
1658.0001	04/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW ENTIRE PLEADING FILE
1658.0001	04/26/2018	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	REVIEW MCCLURE'S LETTERS RE: 30(B)(6) AND ESI; STUDY OUR REQUESTS; FORMULATE A RESPONSE
1658.0001	04/26/2018	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND CORRESPONDENCE; WRITE LENGTHY EMAIL TO ENTIRE TEAM
1658.0001	04/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	PREPARE ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY
1658.0001	04/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW 30(B)(6) AND MCCLURE'S RESPONSES
1658.0001	04/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVISE WRITTEN DISCOVERY AND EMAIL
1658.0001	04/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	04/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	04/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW MCCLURE'S LETTER; EMAIL WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	04/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH NIX PATTERSON
1658.0001	04/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH DREW PATE; REVIEW ROBERT BARNES' COMMENTS
1658.0001	04/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	ANALYZE AND STUDY REASONS DEFENDANT'S CLAIMS AND DEFENSES
1658.0001	04/30/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	FACT CHECK MCCLURE'S LETTER RE: DISCOVERY; PREPARE RESPONSE
1658.0001	04/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	CONFERENCE CALL AND REVIEW PLEADINGS
1658.0001	05/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	PREP FOR KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	05/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CALL TO DREW
1658.0001	05/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW SCHEDULING ORDER; REVIEW DISCOVERY; EMAIL; LETTER TO MCCLURE
1658.0001	05/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DRAFTS; EXCHANGE EMAILS AND THOUGHTS WITH TEAM
1658.0001	05/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL TEAM; REVIEW STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND EMAIL
1658.0001	05/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	05/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW ESI TERMS; EMAIL TEAM
1658.0001	05/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL; REVIEW SUNOCO OBJECTION
1658.0001	05/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	PREPARE FOR AND MAKE CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	05/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH DAN, DREW AND MARK
1658.0001	05/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	REVIEW INFORMATION KRAUSE; PREPARE LIST OF QUESTIONS AND MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	05/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	SEARCH FILES FOR KRAUSE'S WORK
1658.0001	05/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	FURTHER EMAIL WITH MCCLURE AND FILE REVIEW

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001	Cline/Perry					
1658.0001	05/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	05/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONSIDER ESI TERMS; REVIEW APPROACH AND EMAIL
1658.0001	05/07/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW FILE; CONSULT WITH TEAM; EMAIL TEAM
1658.0001	05/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	MULTIPLE EMAIL; REVIEW RULE 37
1658.0001	05/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL AND SCHEDULING
1658.0001	05/09/2018	PMR	875.00	3.40	2,975.00	REVIEW FILE AND ALL DISCOVERY TO DATE; CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCCLURE, CHRISTIANSEN AND DREW TO PERSUADE SUNOCO TO COMPLETE DISCOVERY; SEPARATE CALL WITH DREW; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: ESI
1658.0001	05/09/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW PRIOR CORRESPONDENCE; TELEPHONE CALL TO PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN IN PREP FOR RULE 37 CALL
1658.0001	05/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON SUNOCO PRODUCTION
1658.0001	05/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONTINUE WORK ON SUNOCO PRODUCTION
1658.0001	05/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND DATA RE: ESI
1658.0001	05/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	05/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; EMAIL
1658.0001	05/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	05/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DISCOVERY REQUESTS; EMAIL
1658.0001	05/10/2018	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	05/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DEPOSITION
1658.0001	05/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LETTER TO TEAM RE: STATUS
1658.0001	05/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM; REVIEW FILE IN PREP
1658.0001	05/14/2018	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	REVIEW FILE AND DEVELOP PLAN FOR DISCOVERY
1658.0001	05/14/2018	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE, PLEADINGS AND DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY SUNOCO
1658.0001	05/14/2018	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW
1658.0001	05/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON KRAUSE RE: DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	05/15/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW FILE AND TRANSCRIPTS; DRAFT LETTER TO MCCLURE
1658.0001	05/15/2018	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	REVIEW SUNOCO DOCUMENTS; EMAIL
1658.0001	05/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	MULTIPLE EMAIL; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	05/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW EMAIL; REVISE CORRESPONDENCE
1658.0001	05/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW PRODUCTION
1658.0001	05/16/2018	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	05/17/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MCCLURE
1658.0001	05/17/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	GATHER DISCOVERY TO CONNECT MCCLURE'S EMAIL
1658.0001	05/17/2018	PMR	875.00	3.50	3,062.50	PREP FOR PERRY'S DEPOSITION AND PREPARE OUTLINE; LETTER TO TEAM
1658.0001	05/18/2018	PMR	875.00	3.10	2,712.50	PREPARE OUTLINE MATERIALS FOR PERRY AND REVIEW PERRY'S DOCUMENTS; EMAIL AMONG TEAM
1658.0001	05/18/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: DEADLINES
1658.0001	05/18/2018	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW EARLIER EMAIL AND PRODUCTION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	05/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW ██████████ CONFIRM CASE NAME
1658.0001	05/21/2018	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW DEPOSITION OF HOLLAND & KOELING; EXCHANGE MULTIPLE EMAIL
1658.0001	05/21/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	TEAM TELEPHONE CALL TO DISCUSS CASE
1658.0001	05/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: SUNOCO DISCOVERY
1658.0001	05/22/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	WORK ON DEPOSITION SCHEDULE; REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	05/22/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	DRAFT LETTER; REVIEW DISCOVERY TO DATE
1658.0001	05/22/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW EMAIL; WORK ON DISCOVERY
1658.0001	05/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DISCOVERY; RESPONSE AND EMAIL
1658.0001	05/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND EDIT ESI LETTER
1658.0001	05/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; EMAILS
1658.0001	05/24/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: KRAUSE; REVIEW RECORDS
1658.0001	05/25/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: LEGAL ISSUES AND PRODUCTION
1658.0001	05/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	MULTIPLE EMAIL FROM SUNOCO; CONSULT WITH TEAM
1658.0001	05/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	PREP FOR CLINE DEPOSITION; EMAIL
1658.0001	05/28/2018	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW EMAIL; REVIEW SUNOCO DISCOVERY; DRAFT LETTER TO SUNOCO
1658.0001	05/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM; DISCUSS OUTSTANDING ITEMS
1658.0001	05/29/2018	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	REVIEW PAST EMAILS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
						JANTZEN; CONSULT WITH ROBERT BARNES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; SEND MCCLURE EMAIL; REVIEW AND EDIT PAULA JANTZEN EMAIL TO MCCLURE
1658.0001	05/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW STATUS OF SUNOCO DISCOVERY
1658.0001	05/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: PREP FOR CLINE DEPOSITION; EMAIL TO DREW PATE; EDIT DEPO PREP OUTLINE
1658.0001	05/29/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW SUNOCO DOCUMENTS WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	05/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	05/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW AND EDIT OUTLINE FOR CLINE DEPO PREP
1658.0001	05/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	05/30/2018	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SUNOCO TEAM; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN FOLLOW-UP AFTER TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
1658.0001	05/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	WORK ON CLINE PREP; EFFORT TO [REDACTED]; EMAIL WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	05/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	05/31/2018	PMR	875.00	2.80	2,450.00	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE AND DISCOVERY RESPONSES; WORK ON MOTION FOR EXTENSION; REVIEW AND EDIT ADDITIONAL WRITTEN DISCOVERY TO SUNOCO
1658.0001	05/31/2018	PMR	875.00	4.00	3,500.00	PREPARE FOR AND PREP PERRY CLINE FOR HIS DEPOSITION; WORK ON MOTION FOR EXTENSION; REVIEW LOCAL ED RULES; REVIEW HISTORY
1658.0001	06/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW MOTION FOR EXTENSION
1658.0001	06/01/2018	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW KRAUSE DEPO
1658.0001	06/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: MOTION
1658.0001	06/01/2018	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN; WORK ON MOTION; REVIEW DISCOVERY; EMAIL; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	06/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	06/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW LINCOLN'S COUNTY DOCKET
1658.0001	06/04/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	06/04/2018	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	SUMMARIZE KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	06/04/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LINDA BEEBE; EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	06/04/2018	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	REVIEW AND EDIT MOTION FOR EXTENSION
1658.0001	06/04/2018	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	06/05/2018	PMR	875.00	1.70	1,487.50	SUMMARIZE KRAUSE DEPO; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ROBERT BARNES
1658.0001	06/06/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/06/2018	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ADAM; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN; CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; WORK ON MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	06/06/2018	PMR	875.00	5.00	4,375.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/07/2018	PMR	875.00	9.50	8,312.50	PREPARE FOR AND WORK WITH PERRY CLINE; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EMAIL WITH BRAD BECKWORTH; EMAIL WITH DREW PATE; EMAIL WITH ROBERT BARNES
1658.0001	06/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW MCCLURE EMAILS; EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	06/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAIL
1658.0001	06/11/2018	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE DOCUMENTS AND ASSORTED EMAIL
1658.0001	06/11/2018	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH PERRY CLINE FOR DEPOSITION PREP; CONFER WITH DREW AND PERRY
1658.0001	06/11/2018	PMR	875.00	1.80	1,575.00	PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLIENT; REVIEW DISCOVERY
1658.0001	06/12/2018	PMR	875.00	8.50	7,437.50	PREP CLINE; DEPO OF CLINE
1658.0001	06/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	CONFERENCE WITH ROBERT BARNES; REVIEW PRODUCTION
1658.0001	06/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH ROBERT BARNES
1658.0001	06/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL
1658.0001	06/15/2018	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	REVIEW PRODUCTION
1658.0001	06/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON [REDACTED]
1658.0001	06/16/2018	PMR	875.00	2.60	2,275.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM SUNOCO; MULTIPLE EMAIL
1658.0001	06/18/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	06/18/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW RESPONSE TO MOTION TO EXTEND DEADLINES
1658.0001	06/18/2018	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	REVIEW BRIEF AND EXHIBITS ON RESPONSE BRIEF

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	06/18/2018	PMR	875.00	4.90	4,287.50	REVIEW SUNOCO PRODUCTION AND PULL HOT DOCS ; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/19/2018	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	REVIEW SUNOCO DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN; LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	06/19/2018	PMR	875.00	5.00	4,375.00	REVIEW SUNOCO DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/20/2018	PMR	875.00	5.10	4,462.50	REVIEW SUNOCO DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	DEAL WITH EXPENSES AND RELATED EMAIL
1658.0001	06/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	WORK ON SUNOCO'S FAILURE TO PROVIDE DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/21/2018	PMR	875.00	1.80	1,575.00	WORK ON BRIEFS
1658.0001	06/21/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR BRIEFS ON PRIVILEGE AND FOR THE REPLY
1658.0001	06/21/2018	PMR	875.00	2.80	2,450.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE, JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN RE: BRIEFS AND ATTACHMENTS NEEDED
1658.0001	06/21/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN RE: MOTION TO WAIVE PRIVILEGE AND REPLY; EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	06/22/2018	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	REVIEW PRIVILEGE LOG AND ITS DEFICITS; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	06/22/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW FILINGS; EXCHANGE MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	06/22/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BRAD BECKWORTH; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE; (2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	06/22/2018	PMR	875.00	4.00	3,500.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: RULE 34 AND DEFENDANTS' FAILURE TO COMPLY; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND CONTRAST WITH OURS; ORGANIZE KEY SUNOCO DOCUMENTS FOR USE IN DEPOSITION
1658.0001	06/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND SUNOCO DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/25/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	06/25/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/25/2018	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	ORGANIZE SUNOCO DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/25/2018	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	CONFERENCE WITH TEAM; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	06/25/2018	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	REVIEW AND EDIT WAIVER BRIEF; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/25/2018	PMR	875.00	3.30	2,887.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; REVIEW AND EDIT MOTION TO STRIKE DEFENDANT'S PRIVILEGE LOG
1658.0001	06/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH BRAD BECKWORTH
1658.0001	06/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	WORK ON 30(b)(6) TOPICS
1658.0001	06/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	06/26/2018	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	PREPARE AFFIDAVIT FOR REPLY BRIEF
1658.0001	06/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL MOTION AND BRIEF
1658.0001	06/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE RE: MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	06/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: MY AFFIDAVIT AND THE REPLY
1658.0001	06/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND EDIT AFFIDAVIT
1658.0001	06/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW ORDER BY JUDGE; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: ORDER; EMAIL TO TEAM; WORK ON LIST OF PROPOSED DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	06/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW COURT ORDER; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND DREW PATE; PREPARE LIST OF WITNESSES TO BE DEPOSED
1658.0001	06/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW SUNOCO FILINGS; REVIEW RULES; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: OUR RESPONSE
1658.0001	06/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	DISCUSS PRIVILEGE MOTION AND HEARING WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/28/2018	PMR	875.00	2.80	2,450.00	LEGAL RESEARCH; REVIEW SUNOCO MOTION; REVIEW CITED CASES; DRAFT AN INITIAL RESPONSE
1658.0001	06/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	06/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	SUNOCO MOTION TO FILE DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/28/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	WORK ON BRIEF; LEGAL RESEARCH; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	06/28/2018	PMR	875.00	3.80	3,325.00	RESEARCH EMAILS; WORK ON BRIEF RE: PRIVILEGE; CONFER WITH DREW PATE; CONFER WITH PAULA JANTZEN; TELEPHONE CALL TO MCCLURE; TELEPHONE CALL TO MARK CHRISTENSEN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MARK CHRISTENSEN (HE COULD NOT SPEAK FOR SUNOCO; HE WILL HAVE MCCLURE CALL)
1658.0001	06/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH PHILLIP WHALEY AND PAULA JANTZEN RE:

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	06/29/2018	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	MOTIONS AND DISCOVERY CONFERENCE CALL WITH SUNOCO COUNSEL RE: MEET AND CONFER; INTERNAL CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN, PAULA JANTZEN AND DREW PATE
1658.0001	06/29/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW DISCOVERY RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	06/29/2018	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	REVISE MESSAGE TO MCCLURE; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DRAFT LETTER TO MCCLURE
1658.0001	06/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	MULTIPLE EMAILS RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	06/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	LOOK FOR [REDACTED] FROM SUNOCO PRODUCTION
1658.0001	07/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONSIDER POSITION ON PRIVILEGE WAIVER
1658.0001	07/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	07/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TEAM CONFERENCE CALL; DISCUSSION LATER WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	07/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW FILINGS
1658.0001	07/02/2018	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW SUNOCO RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY; EXCHANGE MULTIPLE EMAIL
1658.0001	07/02/2018	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	DEVELOP STRATEGY FOR WAIVER HEARING
1658.0001	07/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW KOELLING DEPO AND ERRATA SHEET
1658.0001	07/03/2018	PMR	875.00	2.80	2,450.00	REVIEW AND EDIT MOTION TO COMPEL; EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	07/03/2018	PMR	875.00	1.80	1,575.00	REVIEW AND EDIT COMPLIANCE BRIEF; LEGAL RESEARCH; REVIEW DREW PATE'S EDITS
1658.0001	07/03/2018	PMR	875.00	1.90	1,662.50	REVIEW AND EDIT COMPLIANCE PAPERS WITH RULE 7.1; REVIEW OTHERS SUGGESTIONS AND EDITS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: BRIEF
1658.0001	07/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL RE: HEARING AND LOGISTICS
1658.0001	07/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH; CONFERENCE WITH CLERK
1658.0001	07/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL; CONFERENCE RE: MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	07/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; REVIEW BRIEF
1658.0001	07/05/2018	PMR	875.00	1.80	1,575.00	REVIEW DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND RULE 26; LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	07/05/2018	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	REVIEW BRIEFS; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	07/06/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; CHECK RE: PERRY CLINE
1658.0001	07/09/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	LEGAL RESEARCH [REDACTED]; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	07/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW PRIVILEGE LOG
1658.0001	07/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAIL; LEGAL RESEARCH [REDACTED]
1658.0001	07/09/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	RESEARCH KOELLING DEPO; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	07/09/2018	PMR	875.00	2.20	1,925.00	REVIEW AND EDIT SUNOCO BRIEF RE: WAIVER
1658.0001	07/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: HEARING
1658.0001	07/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE CALL; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	07/09/2018	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN, JASON RYAN AND DREW PATE; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON OUR MOTION TO STRIKE; LEGAL RESEARCH IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING; PREPARE FOR HEARING ON OUR MOTION TO STRIKE AND REVIEW DEFENDANT'S PRIVILEGE LOG
1658.0001	07/10/2018	PMR	875.00	9.00	7,875.00	ATTEND HEARING IN MUSKOGEE RE: MOTION TO STRIKE
1658.0001	07/11/2018	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	REVIEW RECENT PRODUCTION; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: DISCOVERY; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: SUNOCO PRIVILEGE LOG
1658.0001	07/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PHILLIP WHALEY
1658.0001	07/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EMAIL TO SUNOCO COUNSEL; (2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	07/11/2018	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	EMAIL BRAD BECKWORTH; REVIEW REPORT
1658.0001	07/11/2018	PMR	875.00	2.20	1,925.00	REVIEW AND EDIT MOTION TO COMPEL; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	07/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	REVIEW EMAIL; LEGAL RESEARCH; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	07/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	WORK ON 30(B)(6) DEPO NOTICE
1658.0001	07/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL RE: MEET AND CONFER
1658.0001	07/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	07/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	REVIEW EDIT 30(B)(6) ON MERITS
1658.0001	07/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S MOTION TO RECONSIDER; EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	07/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	ADDITIONAL COMMENTS AND EMAILS FROM DREW PATE AND PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW 30(B)(6) DRAFTS

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	07/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONSIDER [REDACTED]
1658.0001	07/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	FINALIZE MEET AND CONFER LETTER; OBTAINING TEAM'S INPUT AND EDITS
1658.0001	07/12/2018	PMR	875.00	3.20	2,800.00	REVIEW LAST PRODUCTION OF 7,000 OR SO PAGES
1658.0001	07/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH DREW PATE RE: 30(B)(6)
1658.0001	07/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW AND EDIT LIST OF TIMES TO BE COUNSEL IN THE MEET AND CONFER
1658.0001	07/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	WORK ON 30(B)(6) NOTICE RE: DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY
1658.0001	07/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EDITS TO MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	07/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	07/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	EXCHANGE MULTIPLE EMAILS ON NUMEROUS TOPICS
1658.0001	07/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL RE: SUNOCO WITNESSES; REVIEW 30(B)(6) NOTICE TO DEFENDANT
1658.0001	07/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL RE: DEFENDANT'S MOTION
1658.0001	07/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN RE: CHECKS TO PERRY CLINE RE; ESCHEAT THREAT
1658.0001	07/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	07/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND 30(B)(6) NOTICE
1658.0001	07/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW PERRY'S DEPOSITION
1658.0001	07/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	FIRM WITH RULE 37 CONFERENCE WITH EMAIL WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	07/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND REVIEW FILE FOR CONFERENCE TEAM CALL
1658.0001	07/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW FIRST 60 PAGES OF PERRY'S DEPO
1658.0001	07/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE CALL AND REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	07/17/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	07/17/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW TRANSCRIPT FROM CLINE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	07/17/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND SUMMARY
1658.0001	07/17/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DISCOVERY MEMO
1658.0001	07/17/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DEPO AND ERRATA SHEET
1658.0001	07/17/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	WORK ON WITNESS LIST FOR DEPO; REVIEW DEPO AND DOCUMENT SUMMARIES
1658.0001	07/18/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW PRODUCTION SUMMARIES
1658.0001	07/18/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW SUMMARIES OF SUNOCO PRODUCTION
1658.0001	07/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	SCHEDULE DEPO; EMAIL
1658.0001	07/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH MCCLURE
1658.0001	07/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL WITH MARK CHRISTIANSEN
1658.0001	07/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	07/24/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	07/25/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFER WITH TEAM; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	07/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	07/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL RE: SUNOCO WITNESSES
1658.0001	07/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DISCUSS DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY TOPICS WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	07/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW STATUTE; CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE RE: DEPOSITION
1658.0001	07/26/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW PRSA; REVIEW SUNOCO ANSWER
1658.0001	07/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL FROM DREW AND MCCLURE
1658.0001	07/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LARRY M.
1658.0001	07/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	07/28/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	WORK ON TOPICS FOR DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY
1658.0001	07/29/2018	PMR	875.00	3.20	2,800.00	LEGAL RESEARCH ESI; PREPARE OUTLINE FOR DEPOSITION
1658.0001	07/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	07/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	07/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	07/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	WORK ON DEPOSITION PREP
1658.0001	07/31/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	07/31/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CHECK ON SNOWMAN WELL; EMAIL
1658.0001	07/31/2018	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	WORK ON DEPO PREP RE: 30(B)(6); EMAIL
1658.0001	07/31/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON DEPO PREP
1658.0001	08/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: DEPOSITION; LEGAL RESEARCH; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: STATUTE OF LIMITATION
1658.0001	08/01/2018	PMR	875.00	6.50	5,687.50	DRIVE TO DALLAS; CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE RE: SUNOCO DEPOSITION
1658.0001	08/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	PREP FOR DEPOSITION; PULL DOCUMENTS TOGETHER; WORK ON

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
						DEPO PREP; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL LINDA BEEBE RE: UNIT POOLING
1658.0001	08/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	PREP FOR DEPO
1658.0001	08/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW MCCLURE'S OBJECTIONS TO DEPOSITION
1658.0001	08/02/2018	PMR	875.00	14.00	12,250.00	30 (B)(6) DEPOSITION IN DALLAS; RETURN TO OKLAHOMA CITY
1658.0001	08/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND REVIEW DISCOVERY RESPONSES; EMAIL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	08/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	DISCUSS DEPO STRATEGY
1658.0001	08/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: WITNESSES
1658.0001	08/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ROBERT BARNES AND RESEARCH
1658.0001	08/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE RE: DEPOSITION TOPICS; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	08/04/2018	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS RE: THEORIES OF RECOVERY
1658.0001	08/06/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE CALL; CALL WITH ROBERT BARNES RE: ISSUES
1658.0001	08/06/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND DRAFTS
1658.0001	08/07/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/07/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DISCOVERY TO PERRY CLINE
1658.0001	08/07/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	08/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	08/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/10/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR WITNESS DEPOSITIONS; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH ON OPEN RECORDS ACT AND AFFIRMATIVE DEFENSE
1658.0001	08/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: WITNESSES
1658.0001	08/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	SEND AND REVISE MULTIPLE EMAILS; REVIEW DISCOVERY RESPONSE BY SUNOCO
1658.0001	08/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH AND REVIEW RESEARCH MEMO
1658.0001	08/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON SCHEDULING AND DISCOVERY PLAN AS TO SUNOCO
1658.0001	08/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON DEPO LETTER FOR TEAM
1658.0001	08/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	08/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	08/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	08/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	ORGANIZE FILES
1658.0001	08/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	08/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DREW PATE'S THOUGHTS RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND LARRY
1658.0001	08/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LARRY; EMAIL LARRY MURPHY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/14/2018	PMR	875.00	5.00	4,375.00	REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE 30(B)(6) DEPO
1658.0001	08/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW [REDACTED] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; LEGAL RESEARCH FIDUCIARY DUTIES
1658.0001	08/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILES AND MEMO
1658.0001	08/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: 30(B)(6) DEPO
1658.0001	08/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW SETTLEMENTS
1658.0001	08/16/2018	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY AND PAULA JANTZEN; EMAIL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LARRY MURPHY; REVIEW 30(B)(6)
1658.0001	08/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LARRY MURPHY; REVIEW UNCLAIMED PROPERTY; LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	08/17/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL RE: DATA WITH BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	08/17/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	08/17/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; MEET AND CONFER; LETTER TO MCCLURE; EMAIL TO BARNES AND LEWIS
1658.0001	08/17/2018	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION; MULTIPLE EMAILS RE: SUNOCO DATA; SUNOCO DISCOVERY RESPONSES; MOTION TO COMPEL, ETC.
1658.0001	08/17/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	08/17/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	08/18/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	08/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW [REDACTED]; REVIEW CASES CITED
1658.0001	08/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOELLING DEPOSITION; EMAIL TO BARNES AND LEWIS

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	08/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TEAM CALL
1658.0001	08/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	08/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	REVIEW DEPOSITION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW DRAFT INTERROGATORIES
1658.0001	08/21/2018	PMR	875.00	3.00	2,625.00	TRAVEL TO AND MEET WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM
1658.0001	08/21/2018	PMR	875.00	1.80	1,575.00	JONES SUMMARY
1658.0001	08/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN RE: ACCOUNTING DATA
1658.0001	08/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND EMAIL
1658.0001	08/22/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH MARK CHRISTENSEN AND CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW DEPO SUMMARY
1658.0001	08/22/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PHILLIP WHALEY; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	08/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EMAIL; REVIEW DATA
1658.0001	08/24/2018	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE; MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH TEAM MEMBERS
1658.0001	08/24/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	08/24/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DATA ON GAS AND NGL PURCHASES BY SUNOCO
1658.0001	08/24/2018	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LARRY MURPHY; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; TELEPHONE CALL TO NIX PATTERSON LAWYERS AND MIKE BURRAGE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LARRY MURPHY; EMAIL
1658.0001	08/25/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	08/25/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW ESCHEAT RECORDS AND EMAIL
1658.0001	08/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND SEND EMAIL
1658.0001	08/28/2018	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	REVIEW ISSUES TO COMPEL; DISMISS DISCOVERY ISSUES; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	08/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW ESCHEAT DATA
1658.0001	08/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	08/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FILE; LETTER TO MCCLURE
1658.0001	08/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DEPO
1658.0001	08/30/2018	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	REVIEW JONES DEPOSITION AND IDENTIFY TOPICS HE DID NOT OR COULD NOT RESPOND TO; ESI RESEARCH
1658.0001	08/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL FROM NIX PATTERSON
1658.0001	08/31/2018	PMR	875.00	4.00	3,500.00	REVIEW AUSTIN JONES DEPOSITION FOR MOTION TO COMPEL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE AND PAULA JANTZEN RE: DEPOSITIONS AND MOTION TO COMPEL; SUMMARIZE JONES DEPO
1658.0001	08/31/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: MOTION AND DISCOVERY; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	09/03/2018	PMR	875.00	5.20	4,550.00	REVIEW FILE; REVIEW ALL CORRESPONDENCE AND EMAIL; REVIEW 30(B)(6) DEPO; MULTIPLE EMAILS TO TEAM, MCCLURE AND BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	09/04/2018	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	WORK ON BARBARA LEY; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	09/04/2018	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	09/04/2018	PMR	875.00	3.00	2,625.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE CALL WITH BARBARA LEY; EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	09/04/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENT SUMMARY
1658.0001	09/04/2018	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	REVIEW FILE; LETTER TO MCCLURE
1658.0001	09/04/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL TO JASON RYAN RE: STATUS AND CASE NEEDS; REVIEW MCCLURE EMAIL
1658.0001	09/04/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; TELEPHONE CALL TO NIX PATTERSON
1658.0001	09/05/2018	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	REVIEW EMAIL; CONFERENCE WITH PHILLIP WHALEY; REVIEW CLINE DISCOVERY RESPONSE
1658.0001	09/05/2018	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	EMAIL; FRAME LEGAL RESEARCH ISSUE RE: [REDACTED]; REVIEW ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS AND SUMMARIES
1658.0001	09/05/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	09/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; ATTORNEYS TO LOCATE [REDACTED] IN SUNOCO PRODUCTION
1658.0001	09/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	COMPLETE THE REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	09/05/2018	PMR	875.00	4.00	3,500.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MARK CHRISTIANSEN; CONFERENCE WITH LINDA BEEBE; REVIEW DOCUMENTS; START DEPO PREP; REVIEW DOCUMENT SUMMARIES
1658.0001	09/06/2018	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: DEPO PREP

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001						Cline/Perry
1658.0001	09/06/2018	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW KOELLING DEPO
1658.0001	09/06/2018	PMR	875.00	4.00	3,500.00	REVIEW KOELLING DEPO; PREPARE FOR ADDITIONAL DEPO; CONFERENCES WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	09/07/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LINDA BEEBE
1658.0001	09/07/2018	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	DEPOSITION PREP
1658.0001	09/07/2018	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	REVIEW MOTION TO COMPEL BRIEF; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	09/07/2018	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	REVIEW PREP; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES AND EMAILS RE: VARIETY OF SUNOCO ISSUES
1658.0001	09/07/2018	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	MEET AND CONFER
1658.0001	09/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW PRIOR DEPO OUTLINE
1658.0001	09/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	09/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW EMAIL RE: MOTION TO COMPEL AND CHALLENGING DESIGNATIONS
1658.0001	09/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAIL AND DRAFTS RE: MEET AND CONFER AND JONES FAILURES
1658.0001	09/09/2018	PMR	875.00	6.10	5,337.50	PREPARE FOR DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	09/10/2018	PMR	875.00	1.80	1,575.00	LEGAL RESEARCH AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	09/10/2018	PMR	875.00	2.80	2,450.00	CONTINUE REVIEW OF LANCESLIN DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	09/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW LANCESLIN DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	09/10/2018	PMR	875.00	1.60	1,400.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; WORK ON MOTION TO COMPEL; REVIEW JONES ERRATA; DEPO PREP; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	09/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EMAIL; REVIEW LANCESLIN DEPOSITION
1658.0001	09/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	09/11/2018	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	REVIEW EMAIL; REVIEW DOCUMENTS; REVIEW EXCEL SHEET PRODUCED BY SUNOCO; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: DOCUMENT FOR UPCOMMING DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	09/11/2018	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	MOTION TO COMPEL; EMAIL
1658.0001	09/11/2018	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	09/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH TEAM AND MCCLURE
1658.0001	09/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	09/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA RE: LOGISTICS FOR HOUSTON DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	09/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW ADDITIONAL EMAIL
1658.0001	09/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; MULTIPLE EMAIL
1658.0001	09/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: DOCUMENTS FOR DEPO
1658.0001	09/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	09/13/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW EXHIBITS AND DAMAGE
1658.0001	09/14/2018	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS; REVIEW PARTS OF WARREN DEPOSITION; REVIEW APPELLATE PAPERS RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/16/2018	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	[REDACTED] REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW DATA FROM SUNOCO; REVIEW WARREN DEPOSITION
1658.0001	09/16/2018	PMR	875.00	7.00	6,125.00	TRAVEL TO HOUSTON AND DEPO PREP
1658.0001	09/17/2018	PMR	875.00	12.20	10,675.00	DEPO PREP AND DEPO OF REDDING
1658.0001	09/18/2018	PMR	875.00	7.30	6,387.50	DEPO PREP AND DEPOSITION; EXCHANGE EMAIL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	09/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE PLEADINGS AND EMAIL
1658.0001	09/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW AND SEND EMAIL; REVIEW OBJECTION TO 30(B)(6)
1658.0001	09/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	09/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL RE: ISSUES
1658.0001	09/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH MULTIPLE PERSONS
1658.0001	09/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	09/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	09/21/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND SPREADSHEET INFO
1658.0001	09/22/2018	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND MCCLURE'S PROPOSAL; RE-READ OUR MOTION TO COMPEL; MAKE RECOMMENDATIONS TO TEAM
1658.0001	09/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; WORK ON RESOLUTION OF MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	09/24/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	09/24/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS; ADVISE ON DISCOVERY RESOLUTION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; REVIEW ADDITIONAL DEPOSITION
1658.0001	09/24/2018	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	COMPLETE REVIEW OF WARREN'S DEPOSITION; EXCHANGE EMAIL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	09/25/2018	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	REVIEW LANCESLIN'S DEPOSITION

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	09/25/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE AND PLEADINGS
1658.0001	09/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES RESPONSES AND EMAIL
1658.0001	09/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND FINAL TRANSCRIPT
1658.0001	09/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND EXHIBITS
1658.0001	09/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW FILE AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	09/27/2018	PMR	875.00	6.00	5,250.00	RETURN FROM HOUSTON AFTER DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	09/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW PLEADINGS AN FILINGS; MULTIPLE MCCLURE/DREW EMAILS
1658.0001	09/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH - [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW OBJECTIONS IN CHESAPEAKE CASE, AFFIDAVIT AND EMAIL BY MCCLURE
1658.0001	09/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW SUNOCO APPLICATION; EMAIL
1658.0001	09/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	09/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	DRAFT ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY
1658.0001	09/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: ANSWER
1658.0001	09/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW AND SCHEDULE DEADLINES
1658.0001	10/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW COURT ORDER; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	10/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW MATERIALS
1658.0001	10/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; RESPOND TO DEBRA MAPLE'S INQUIRY
1658.0001	10/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW FILE; EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	10/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW 1ST PORTION OF SUNOCO'S BRIEF
1658.0001	10/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	DISCUSS SUNOCO BRIEF WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW PORTIONS OF BRIEF
1658.0001	10/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW BRIEF; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	10/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILING BY SUNOCO
1658.0001	10/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW COURT ORDER; REVIEW INVOICES
1658.0001	10/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE MORE EMAILS
1658.0001	10/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	10/03/2018	PMR	875.00	10.00	8,750.00	REVIEW BRIEF; TELEPHONE CALL TO DREW PATE; PREPARE FOR HEARING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN; MULTIPLE EMAILS; MULTIPLE LENGTHY MEMOS RE: ISSUES IN MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	10/04/2018	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	REVIEW AND PREP FOR HEARING; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN; REVIEW NIX PATTERSON EMAIL RE: HEARING
1658.0001	10/04/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	PREPARE FOR HEARING
1658.0001	10/04/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	PREPARE FOR HEARING
1658.0001	10/05/2018	PMR	875.00	9.50	8,312.50	DRIVE TO MUSKOGEE AND BACK; HEARING ON MOTION TO COMPEL; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND DREW PATE
1658.0001	10/07/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW MCCLURE LETTER AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	10/07/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENT AND EMAIL FROM LEWIS
1658.0001	10/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW INVOICES
1658.0001	10/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW MCCLURE'S SUGGESTED ORDER AND CONFIDENTIALITY AND SUNOCO'S APPLICATION
1658.0001	10/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EXCHANGE THOUGHTS RE: SUNOCO APPLICATION; EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	10/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	10/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON SUNOCO MOTION TO DESIGNATE JONES TESTIMONY AS CONFIDENTIAL
1658.0001	10/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH TEAM RE: RESPONSE TO SUNOCO'S CLAIM OF DEPOSITION CONFIDENTIALITY
1658.0001	10/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW IT ISSUES
1658.0001	10/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	COORDINATE AND TRY TO RESOLVE REMAINING DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	10/10/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW COURT ORDER; TELEPHONE CALL TO DREW PATE; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: COMPLETING DISCOVERY
1658.0001	10/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL; EXCHANGE SEVERAL EMAIL WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	10/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE INTERNAL EMAIL; REVIEW FILING
1658.0001	10/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	INTERNAL EMAIL AND REVIEW ORDER
1658.0001	10/11/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND REVIEW ITEMS NEEDING ATTENTION; EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	10/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CHECK SCHEDULES; EMAIL WITH MCCLURE
1658.0001	10/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW MCCLURE LETTER RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	10/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL ADDRESSING SUNOCO LETTER
1658.0001	10/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW EMAIL

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001	Cline/Perry					
1658.0001	10/15/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONSIDER REMAINING DISCOVERY
1658.0001	10/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	10/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN RE: COMPLETING DISCOVERY
1658.0001	10/17/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW EMAIL; RESPOND TO DISCOVERY PLAN; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	10/17/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAIL RE: REMAINING DISCOVERY
1658.0001	10/18/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	10/18/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	GO OVER REDACTIONS AND EMAIL
1658.0001	10/18/2018	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: COVERING DEPOSITIONS AND STRATEGY
1658.0001	10/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: SCHEDULE AND PERRY CLINE'S DEPOSITION
1658.0001	10/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH AND REVIEW MEMO
1658.0001	10/19/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL EXCHANGE RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	10/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL
1658.0001	10/22/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	10/22/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	10/22/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN RE: DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	10/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW TRANSCRIPT OF PERRY CLINE; EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	10/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW LETTER AND ATTACHMENT
1658.0001	10/23/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: REMAINING DISCOVERY
1658.0001	10/24/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	10/25/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL
1658.0001	10/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	10/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	10/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL
1658.0001	10/28/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	10/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	10/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	10/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	10/29/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH TEAM RE: STRATEGY AND CLASS CERT
1658.0001	10/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILINGS AND EMAIL
1658.0001	10/30/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH JASON RYAN, PAULA JANTZEN AND DREW PATE RE: DEPOS AND PLEADINGS
1658.0001	10/31/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	10/31/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW PLEADINGS; EMAIL
1658.0001	10/31/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND PLEADINGS
1658.0001	11/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW AMENDED SCHEDULING ORDER
1658.0001	11/01/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DRAFTS; REVIEW BARNES' EMAIL
1658.0001	11/02/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND ORDER
1658.0001	11/05/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW KRAUSE REPORT AND PLAINTIFF'S REPORT IN ██████████
1658.0001	11/06/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND DATA
1658.0001	11/07/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW FILE; REVIEW SUPREME COURT BRIEFS
1658.0001	11/08/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: COMMON FUND
1658.0001	11/09/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW EMAIL; CHECK FILINGS AND LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	11/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; EMAIL TO BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	11/12/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW FILES BEFORE MEETING; CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	11/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS OF SUNOCO
1658.0001	11/16/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	ANALYZE DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	11/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW CONTRACTS RE: PURCHASE
1658.0001	11/20/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LINDA BEEBE; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; REVIEW DISCOVERY RESPONSE TO SUNOCO; LETTER RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	11/26/2018	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW DESCRIPTION LOG OF CLINE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	11/26/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	11/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW BARBARA LEY DRAFT
1658.0001	12/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL AND STATUS OF CASE
1658.0001	12/03/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND STRATEGY
1658.0001	12/04/2018	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW REPORT ON GOING FORWARD; PLAN AND ASSIGNMENTS
1658.0001	12/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	LEGAL RESEARCH; RESOLVE TIME AND EXPENSE ISSUES
1658.0001	12/14/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE AND STUDY CHANGES TO RULE 23

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	12/27/2018	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON DATA PROBLEM
1658.0001	01/03/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	LEGAL RESEARCH; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; TELEPHONE CALL TO CULLIN
1658.0001	01/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL RE: CORRUPT DATA
1658.0001	01/07/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	01/08/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DEADLINES AND FILE
1658.0001	01/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND INVOICES
1658.0001	01/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: PAY DATA
1658.0001	01/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW EMAIL RE: DEADLINES
1658.0001	01/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW ORDER FOR EXTENSION
1658.0001	01/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	EMAIL
1658.0001	01/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	01/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; EMAIL
1658.0001	01/18/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	01/21/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	01/21/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW DRAFT OF BARBARA LEY'S REPORT; EMAIL FROM NIX PATTERSON
1658.0001	01/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW BARBARA LEY REPORT
1658.0001	01/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH OFFICE RE: REPORT
1658.0001	01/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: GWEN AND TITLE ISSUES
1658.0001	01/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	01/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	01/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW BARBARA LEY'S REPORT AND EDIT; EMAIL
1658.0001	01/28/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW BARBARA LEY'S REPORT; SUGGEST CHANGES TO THIS GROUP; CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	01/28/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW CHARTS AND STATUS
1658.0001	01/28/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN, PAULA JANTZEN AND DREW PATE RE: SUNOCO DATA
1658.0001	01/28/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AMENDMENTS TO BARBARA LEY'S REPORT
1658.0001	01/29/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	01/29/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: SUNOCO DEFENSE
1658.0001	02/04/2019	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	REVIEW BARBARA LEY'S REPORT AND EXHIBITS; REVIEW FILE AND MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	02/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	WEEKLY TEAM CALL
1658.0001	02/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	ADDITIONAL EMAILS RE: EXPERTS
1658.0001	02/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: EXPERTS
1658.0001	02/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: VARIETY OF SUNOCO ISSUES; MULTIPLE CALLS AND EMAILS
1658.0001	02/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM FARR
1658.0001	02/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH ROBERT BARNES
1658.0001	02/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH DAN MCCLURE
1658.0001	02/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW SCHEDULE AND FILE; LETTER RE: DAN MCCLURE
1658.0001	02/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	02/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	EDIT LETTER TO DAN MCCLURE; EMAIL TO TEAM AND BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	02/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL TO BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	02/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CHECK STATUS AND DEADLINES; EMAIL
1658.0001	02/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DATA FROM BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	02/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DAN MCCLURE'S EMAIL AND WORK ON RESPONSE
1658.0001	02/05/2019	PMR	875.00	2.20	1,925.00	LETTER TO DAN MCCLURE
1658.0001	02/06/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL WITH JASON RYAN; TELEPHONE CALL TO DREW PATE
1658.0001	02/06/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; LEGAL RESEARCH; CONNECT WITH TEAM
1658.0001	02/07/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DATA NEEDED FOR LEY REPORT
1658.0001	02/07/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	02/07/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: REVISED COMPLAINT
1658.0001	02/07/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL AND CONSIDER DAN MCCLURE REQUEST
1658.0001	02/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	LETTER TO TEAM RE: STRATEGY
1658.0001	02/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TEAM CONFERENCE CALL; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	02/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL WITH BARBARA LEY AND TEAM
1658.0001	02/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	EMAIL MCCLURE
1658.0001	02/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DEVELOP CASE ISSUES RE: DAN MCCLURE
1658.0001	02/12/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW FILE; EMAIL; CHECK WITH BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	02/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL TO TEAM AND BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	02/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON SCHEDULING AND OBTAINING DOCUMENTS FOR BARBARA LEY'S DEPOSITION

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	02/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DISCUSS STRATEGY WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	02/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH ROBERT BARNES, JASON RYAN AND EMILY KITCH
1658.0001	02/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: BARBARA LEY REPORT AND DEPOSITION
1658.0001	02/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	02/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	02/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	02/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW BARBARA LEY'S DATA
1658.0001	02/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; VOICE MAIL WITH DAN MCCLURE; MULTIPLE EMAIL WITH TEAM MEMBERS
1658.0001	02/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	MULTIPLE EMAILS RE: MISSING INFO FROM SUNOCO
1658.0001	02/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	02/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DRAFT LETTER TO DAN MCCLURE; SEND TO TEAM FOR REVIEW
1658.0001	02/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL WITH TEAM RE: OPERATION AND INTEREST
1658.0001	02/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	EMAIL; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ON ASCERTAIN ABILITY
1658.0001	02/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	WORK ON BARBARA LEY'S PREP; SEND KOELLING CITATIONS TO TEAM
1658.0001	02/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	02/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONSIDER ██████████; EMAIL
1658.0001	02/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	02/15/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW ██████████ ARTICLES
1658.0001	02/18/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TEAM CALL
1658.0001	02/18/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW PRIOR ORDER RE: BARBARA LEY AND DAUBERT
1658.0001	02/18/2019	PMR	875.00	1.90	1,662.50	REVIEW BARBARA LEY DEPOSITION - PREP FOR HER DEPOSITION
1658.0001	02/19/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	02/21/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DAMAGES
1658.0001	02/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	02/28/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; COMMUNICATIONS RE: MARK CHRISTIANSEN
1658.0001	03/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	03/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW FILE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	03/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	EMAIL
1658.0001	03/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LARRY MURPHY
1658.0001	03/09/2019	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE; SUMMARY LEY DEPOSITION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	03/10/2019	PMR	875.00	4.30	3,762.50	COMPLETE SUMMARY OF BARBARA LEY'S DEPOSITION; REVIEW FILE AND PLEADINGS; EMAIL
1658.0001	03/11/2019	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	MEET WITH BARBARA LEY AND TEAM RE: ANALYSIS OF PAY DATA
1658.0001	03/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	03/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW BARBARA LEY'S REPORT
1658.0001	03/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	03/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL RE: DEPOSITION; TELEPHONE CALL TO MCCLURE
1658.0001	03/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	03/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH FOR CLASS CERT
1658.0001	03/14/2019	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	LEGAL RESEARCH; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: DEPOSITION OF BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	03/15/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	03/18/2019	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	LEGAL RESEARCH ON PRSA
1658.0001	03/20/2019	PMR	875.00	6.10	5,337.50	REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE BARBARA LEY'S DEPOSITION
1658.0001	03/21/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ██████████
1658.0001	03/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	03/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE CALL WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	03/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TEAM CONFERENCE CALL; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	03/26/2019	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	SUMMARIZE BARBARA LEY'S DEPOSITION
1658.0001	03/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE AND EMAIL
1658.0001	03/27/2019	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	COMPLETE LEY'S DEPOSITION SUMMARY
1658.0001	03/28/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	03/28/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	03/28/2019	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	REORGANIZE BARBARA LEY'S DEPOSITION SUMMARY; EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	03/28/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	03/28/2019	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	LOCATE DEPOSITION EXCERPTS FOR BRIEFING
1658.0001	03/29/2019	PMR	875.00	3.50	3,062.50	SUMMARIZE LEY DEPOSITION
1658.0001	03/29/2019	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW KRAUSE REPORT
1658.0001	03/31/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001						Cline/Perry
1658.0001	04/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	SUMMARIZE KRAUSE DEPOSITION IN CASILLAS
1658.0001	04/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN; EMAIL BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	04/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TEAM CALL
1658.0001	04/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	PULL OUT DOCUMENTS NEEDED BY BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	04/01/2019	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	REVIEW KRAUSE REPORT
1658.0001	04/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: DOCUMENTS BARNES AND LEWIS NEEDS
1658.0001	04/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL TEAM; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PATTI LEWIS
1658.0001	04/02/2019	PMR	875.00	3.60	3,150.00	SUMMARIZE KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	PULL TOGETHER MATERIALS FROM KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW DEADLINES AND SCHEDULE
1658.0001	04/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL ON KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL WITH BARBARA LEY AND TEAM
1658.0001	04/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL WITH ROBERT BARNES
1658.0001	04/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW PORTION OF KRAUSE REPORT
1658.0001	04/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL
1658.0001	04/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL AND SCHEDULE
1658.0001	04/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	PREP FOR KRAUSE DEPO
1658.0001	04/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAILS
1658.0001	04/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL
1658.0001	04/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	SCHEDULING
1658.0001	04/04/2019	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	WORK ON KRAUSE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	04/04/2019	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: KRAUSE
1658.0001	04/05/2019	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	GO THROUGH FILE AND PULL AND REVIEW SUMMARIES OF DEPOSITIONS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	04/05/2019	PMR	875.00	7.50	6,562.50	SUMMARIZE DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	04/06/2019	PMR	875.00	7.20	6,300.00	CONTINUE TO SUMMARIZE SUNOCO DEPOSITIONS; CONTINUE KRAUSE PREP; SUMMARIZE ADDITIONAL SUNOCO WITNESSES
1658.0001	04/07/2019	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; CALCULATION OF INTEREST; MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	04/08/2019	PMR	875.00	4.40	3,850.00	SUMMARIZE LANCESLIN'S DEPOSITION; EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	04/08/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE
1658.0001	04/08/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	04/08/2019	PMR	875.00	3.20	2,800.00	REVIEW CLO AND ALL DOCUMENTS; REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED; EMAIL INFO RE: KRAUSE DEPO
1658.0001	04/08/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	04/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW INVOICES; SEND CLO MATERIAL TO ROBERT BARNES; EMAIL
1658.0001	04/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN RE: CLO
1658.0001	04/09/2019	PMR	875.00	5.00	4,375.00	SUMMARIZE DEPOSITIONS; PREP FOR KRAUSE; MULTIPLE EMAIL
1658.0001	04/10/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	GENERAL OIL & GAS RESEARCH
1658.0001	04/10/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	04/10/2019	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	REVIEW OAKLEY DEPOSITION; MAKE NOTES AND SUGGESTIONS FOR KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/10/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL
1658.0001	04/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONSIDER OPTIONS FOR A STAY AND SEND MULTIPLE EMAIL ANALYZING OUR POSITION
1658.0001	04/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EXTENSION MOTION AND EMAIL
1658.0001	04/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	ADDRESS CLASS CERT ISSUES
1658.0001	04/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EDIT MOTION AND SEND TO JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	04/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: BRIEF ON KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE
1658.0001	04/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CALL TO ROBERT BARNES
1658.0001	04/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	04/15/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	RESEARCH FILES; EMAIL PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RAY
1658.0001	04/15/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL WITH JASON RYAN RE: KRAUSE
1658.0001	04/15/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	04/15/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	WORK ON REQUEST FOR EXTENSION
1658.0001	04/15/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	04/16/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	04/16/2019	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	REVIEW KRAUSE OUTLINE AND ANALYZE IT FOR BARBARA LEY'S REBUTTAL REPORT
1658.0001	04/16/2019	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	WORK ON REBUTTAL REPORT AND GO THROUGH DEPOSITION SUMMARIES

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	04/16/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	04/16/2019	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: BARBARA LEY REBUTTAL REPORT; EMAIL TO BARBARA LEY; REVIEW DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	WORK ON BARBARA LEY'S REPORT
1658.0001	04/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND ERRATA SHEET
1658.0001	04/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	WORK ON BARBARA LEY'S SUPPLEMENTAL REPORT
1658.0001	04/17/2019	PMR	875.00	3.00	2,625.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; REVIEW AND EDIT OUTLINE; DRAFT PORTIONS OF REBUTTAL REPORT BASED ON DEPOSITIONS AND OTHER OUTLINE
1658.0001	04/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; WORK ON BARBARA LEY'S REPORT
1658.0001	04/18/2019	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	WORK ON BARBARA LEY'S REBUTTAL REPORT DRAFT
1658.0001	04/18/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	04/18/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL
1658.0001	04/18/2019	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	REVIEW DEPOSITIONS AND CREATE MEMO REBUTTING KRAUSE
1658.0001	04/19/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	04/19/2019	PMR	875.00	7.10	6,212.50	SUMMARIZE KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/19/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	04/20/2019	PMR	875.00	3.90	3,412.50	COMPLETE SUMMARY OF KRAUSE DEPOSITION; EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	04/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW FILE; EMAIL
1658.0001	04/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION; EMAIL
1658.0001	04/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	04/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PATTI LEWIS
1658.0001	04/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: EXTENSION
1658.0001	04/23/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW EMAIL WITH BARBARA LEY AND JASON RYAN; TELEPHONE CALL TO JASON RYAN
1658.0001	04/23/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON BARBARA LEY'S REPORT
1658.0001	04/23/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EDIT AND SEND MOTION
1658.0001	04/24/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: LEY
1658.0001	04/24/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW DRAFT
1658.0001	04/24/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	KRAUSE'S SUMMARY REVIEW
1658.0001	04/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DREW PATE'S EDITS TO MOTION
1658.0001	04/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN RE: LEY'S REPORT
1658.0001	04/25/2019	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW PROBLEMS WITH KRAUSE REPORT
1658.0001	04/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL; REVIEW EDITS
1658.0001	04/25/2019	PMR	875.00	1.60	1,400.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BARNES AND LEWIS AND TEAM
1658.0001	04/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; FINALIZE MOTION; EMAIL TO JO ANN MICKLE AND TEAM
1658.0001	04/25/2019	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	REVIEW AND EDIT INITIAL DRAFT OF LEYS REBUTTAL
1658.0001	04/26/2019	PMR	875.00	3.20	2,800.00	COMPLETE STUDY AND MAKE NOTES OF KRAUSE REPORT; EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	04/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	04/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	RE: ESI SEARCH TERMS
1658.0001	04/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW PRSA
1658.0001	04/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DRAFT; EMAIL WITH NIX PATTERSON AND MIKE BURRAGE
1658.0001	04/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	DISCUSS CLASS DEFINITION; LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	04/29/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	WEEKLY CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	04/29/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; EMAIL WITH DEREK
1658.0001	04/29/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: REBUTTAL
1658.0001	04/29/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DRAFT SECTION OF REBUTTAL REPORT
1658.0001	04/29/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON CLASS CERT
1658.0001	04/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND REPORT
1658.0001	04/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW KRAUSE REPORT
1658.0001	04/30/2019	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	EDIT LEY'S REBUTTAL REPORT
1658.0001	04/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	04/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	FURTHER REVIEW OF KRAUSE
1658.0001	05/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW JASON RYAN ANALYSIS ON LEASES AND DIVISION ORDERS
1658.0001	05/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: POTENTIAL ADDITIONAL CLAIMS; EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	05/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL AND CALLS WITH TEAM
1658.0001	05/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN RE: REBUTTAL REPORT AND STARTING ON CERT MOTION
1658.0001	05/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DRAFT BRIEF FOR CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	05/01/2019	PMR	875.00	3.00	2,625.00	EDIT LEY'S REBUTTAL REPORT
1658.0001	05/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	05/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL TO PERRY CLINE
1658.0001	05/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	ADDRESS BARBARA LEY'S REBUTTAL REPORT
1658.0001	05/02/2019	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	REVIEW EMAIL; REVIEW ORDER OF COURT; REVIEW PAULA JANTZEN'S ANALYSIS; LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	05/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: LEY REBUTTAL REPORT
1658.0001	05/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	05/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REPORT FROM PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	05/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	05/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: SUNOCO
1658.0001	05/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON [REDACTED]
1658.0001	05/03/2019	PMR	875.00	5.80	5,075.00	REVISE BARBARA LEY REBUTTAL DRAFT
1658.0001	05/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	05/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW ROBERT BARNES' EDITS
1658.0001	05/04/2019	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW PAULA JANTZEN'S EDITS
1658.0001	05/06/2019	PMR	875.00	4.80	4,200.00	REVISE BARBARA LEY'S REPORT; REVIEW BRIEF BY SUNOCO; EMAIL MIKE BURRAGE
1658.0001	05/07/2019	PMR	875.00	3.00	2,625.00	CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM FARR; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	05/07/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW ADAM FARR'S RESPONSES AND DRAFTS
1658.0001	05/07/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW [REDACTED]
1658.0001	05/08/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW AND EDIT RECENT DRAFT OF BARBARA LEY'S REPORT
1658.0001	05/08/2019	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW AND STRATEGIZE DAMAGE CLAIM AND REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	05/08/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW [REDACTED]
1658.0001	05/09/2019	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	WORK ON BRIEF RE: DISCOVERY; REVIEW DRAFT OF SURREPLY
1658.0001	05/09/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	LEGAL RESEARCH; REVIEW CASES CITED; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	05/10/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	05/10/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL TEAM
1658.0001	05/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW LEY AFFIDAVIT
1658.0001	05/21/2019	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	REVIEW DRAFT OF LEY REPORT AND EMAIL
1658.0001	05/21/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW REPORT
1658.0001	05/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EMAIL RE: REBUTTAL REPORTS TO TEAM
1658.0001	05/22/2019	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	LEGAL RESEARCH; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN; REVIEW [REDACTED]
1658.0001	05/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH ADAM FARR
1658.0001	05/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: CLASS CERT
1658.0001	05/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW LEY REPORT; DISCUSS FILING
1658.0001	05/23/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH ROBERT BARNES RE: REPORTS
1658.0001	05/23/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CALL TO DREW PATE; REVIEW DEADLINES
1658.0001	05/23/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFER WITH DERRICK G.
1658.0001	05/24/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	CONFER WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN RE: EXPERTS
1658.0001	05/24/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WRITE STATUS REPORT TO TEAM
1658.0001	05/24/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	TELEPHONE CALL TO ADAM FARR; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	05/24/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	FURTHER EDIT TO BARBARA LEY'S REPORT; EMAIL EXCHANGE; CONFERENCE WITH ADAM FARR
1658.0001	05/24/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	PROOF FINAL REBUTTAL REPORT; EMAIL WITH ADAM FARR AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	05/24/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	05/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EMAIL RE: CLASS CERT
1658.0001	05/28/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; STRATEGIZE CLASS CERT
1658.0001	05/28/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	05/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: MCCLURE REQUESTS
1658.0001	05/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW [REDACTED]; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: CLASS CERT
1658.0001	05/31/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	CONFERENCE WITH BARNES AND LEWIS; CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SUSAN WHATLEY; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	06/03/2019	PMR	875.00	3.50	3,062.50	WORK ON CERT BRIEF; REVIEW SUNOCO DEPOSITIONS MINING FOR GOOD CITES
1658.0001	06/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TEAM CONFERENCE CALL
1658.0001	06/03/2019	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	WORK ON CLASS CERT; PREPARE AFFIDAVIT FOR PERRY CLINE
1658.0001	06/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	WORK ON CLASS MOTION
1658.0001	06/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	WORK ON CLASS CERT
1658.0001	06/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW DEPOSITIONS AND WORK ON CLASS CERT

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	06/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FINAL AFFIDAVIT FOR PERRY CLINE
1658.0001	06/05/2019	PMR	875.00	7.20	6,300.00	SUMMARIZE DEPOSITION AND MINE FOR CITES TO CLASS CERT BRIEF
1658.0001	06/06/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	WORK ON CLASS CERT; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/06/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	WORK ON CLASS CERT
1658.0001	06/07/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON CLASS CERT BRIEF
1658.0001	06/07/2019	PMR	875.00	3.10	2,712.50	REVIEW KRAUSE DEPO FOR CLASS CERT MOTION AND BRIEF
1658.0001	06/10/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON CERT BRIEF
1658.0001	06/10/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE CALL
1658.0001	06/10/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/10/2019	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	WORK ON EXHIBITS FOR CLASS CERT
1658.0001	06/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW AND APPROVE LETTER
1658.0001	06/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	COMPLETE REVIEW OF EXHIBITS
1658.0001	06/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW 570. 1-10; REVIEW ██████████ AND LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ██████████ IN SUNOCO; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/13/2019	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	EDITING BRIEF; CHECK CITES
1658.0001	06/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW PLEADINGS AND DISCOVERY RESPONSES; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW BRIEF
1658.0001	06/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	06/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW COURT ORDERS AND FILE
1658.0001	06/19/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW MCCLURE CORRESPONDENCE AND BARBARA LEY'S RESPONSE AND SPREADSHEET
1658.0001	06/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW RESPONSE TO SUNOCO RE: BARBARA LEY'S REPORT
1658.0001	06/24/2019	PMR	875.00	1.80	1,575.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; MULTIPLE EMAIL; DETERMINE HOW TO DEAL WITH MCCLURE'S DECEPTION
1658.0001	06/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	07/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	07/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: ADDITIONAL LATE PAYMENTS
1658.0001	07/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON NEGLIGENCE PER SE
1658.0001	07/09/2019	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	REVIEW ALL DEPOSITIONS AND EXHIBITS FOR POTENTIAL WITNESSES TO INTERVIEW
1658.0001	07/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	MINE DEPOSITIONS FOR ██████████
1658.0001	07/10/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ██████████
1658.0001	07/10/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EFFORTS TO LOCATE EXPERT; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; EMAIL LINDA BEEBE
1658.0001	07/10/2019	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	RESEARCH
1658.0001	07/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW FILE; TELEPHONE CALL TO LINDA BEEBE
1658.0001	07/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LINDA BEEBE
1658.0001	07/16/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	SET-UP MEETING WITH LINDA BEEBE
1658.0001	07/18/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW ORDER; TELEPHONE CALL TO TEAM
1658.0001	07/18/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	07/19/2019	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	EMAIL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	07/19/2019	PMR	875.00	2.40	2,100.00	REVIEW ██████████
1658.0001	07/19/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE RE: ██████████
1658.0001	07/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	07/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	07/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DISCUSS DEADLINES AND ASSIGNMENTS
1658.0001	07/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	07/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BRAD BECKWORTH
1658.0001	07/22/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN, PAULA JANTZEN AND LINDA BEEBE
1658.0001	07/29/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW MEMO ON ██████████
1658.0001	07/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND SET UP DEPOSITION DATES
1658.0001	07/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL RE: DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	07/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	07/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL; CONSIDER MCCLURE REQUEST FOR 75 PAGES
1658.0001	07/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	ADDRESS HEARING WITH NEW JUDGE
1658.0001	07/31/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	07/31/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL; TELEPHONE CALL TO DREW PATE
1658.0001	07/31/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	07/31/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	08/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE RE: HEARING
1658.0001	08/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; EMAIL WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	08/02/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW RECENTLY PRODUCED DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	08/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	MEETING BEFORE AND AFTER CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE GIBNEY; CONFERENCE WITH COURT
1658.0001	08/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE
1658.0001	08/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	08/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: CONFERENCE WITH COURT
1658.0001	08/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; EMAIL BARBARA LEY RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	08/06/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	08/06/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE; EMAIL; IDENTIFY PROJECTS
1658.0001	08/06/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW COURT ORDER AND CALENDAR EVENTS
1658.0001	08/06/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL WITH BARBARA LEY AND TEAM
1658.0001	08/06/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	08/06/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	08/07/2019	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	WORK ON THEIR EVASIVE DISCOVERY RESPONSE
1658.0001	08/07/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	08/07/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH ADAM FARR
1658.0001	08/07/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	DISCUSS DAMAGES WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM FARR; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/07/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW PRSA; FORMULATE QUESTIONS AND PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM FARR
1658.0001	08/08/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND REVIEW OF LEGAL AUTHORITIES
1658.0001	08/08/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW BARBARA LEY'S DATA AND INPUT; PREPARE DRAFT ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/08/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	DISCUSS DISCOVERY WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/08/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	PREPARE SUMMARY OF SUNOCO'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES
1658.0001	08/08/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL TEAM WITH RECOMMENDATIONS
1658.0001	08/08/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	DRAFT ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY; EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	08/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW MOTION TO DISMISS; DISCUSS WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	08/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	08/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	FINALIZE DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO SUNOCO
1658.0001	08/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON DISCOVERY REQUESTS
1658.0001	08/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: PICKING OFF CLASS REPS AND EMAIL TO TEAM RE: RESPONSE BRIEF
1658.0001	08/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EDITS TO ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH JO ANN MICKLE; WORK ON DISCOVERY; EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	08/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	DIVIDE TASKS AND DISCUSS MONTH WITH ENTIRE GROUP
1658.0001	08/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH CHANCE AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	08/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILINGS BY SUNOCO AND EMAIL
1658.0001	08/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW AND ADOPT REVISIONS IN DISCOVERY ON SUNOCO
1658.0001	08/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	ORGANIZE FILE AND DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: DEADLINES
1658.0001	08/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED
1658.0001	08/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	EMAIL TO DEBRA MAPLE
1658.0001	08/15/2019	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	REVIEW DAUBERT MOTION; WORK ON ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY; MULTIPLE EMAIL; SEND DAUBERT MOTION TO BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	08/15/2019	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	REVIEW RESPONSE TO CLASS CERT MOTION; EMAIL TO GROUP
1658.0001	08/16/2019	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND FILINGS
1658.0001	08/16/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	08/19/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WEEKLY MEETING WITH TEAM
1658.0001	08/19/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND MIKE BURRAGE
1658.0001	08/20/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM AND BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	08/20/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DREW PATE'S EDITS TO DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/20/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW FILINGS
1658.0001	08/20/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL TEAM RE: ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/20/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EXHIBITS
1658.0001	08/20/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	ADDITIONAL EMAIL WITH BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	08/20/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL WITH TEAM RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/20/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW, EDIT AND APPROVE ADDITIONAL WRITTEN DISCOVERY

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001						Cline/Perry
1658.0001	08/20/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE CALL WITH BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	08/20/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH DREW PATE, JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/20/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW AND EDIT BRIEF ON LACK OF JURISDICTION
1658.0001	08/21/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	FINALIZE DISCOVERY AND EMAIL
1658.0001	08/21/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	ADDITIONAL EMAIL RE: MOTION TO DISMISS
1658.0001	08/21/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW BARBARA LEY'S EMAIL
1658.0001	08/21/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DRAFT DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/21/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH TEAM; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN RE: CLASS CERT
1658.0001	08/21/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	FINAL REVIEW OF MOTION TO DISMISS AND EMAIL
1658.0001	08/21/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL EXCHANGE RE: SUNOCO CASES
1658.0001	08/22/2019	PMR	875.00	2.40	2,100.00	REVIEW SUNOCO AUTHORITIES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/22/2019	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	LEGAL RESEARCH; STUDY RESPONSE BRIEF
1658.0001	08/22/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EMAIL RE: REPLY BRIEF; REVIEW FILE; LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	08/23/2019	PMR	875.00	4.00	3,500.00	LEGAL RESEARCH; MINE CITATIONS
1658.0001	08/23/2019	PMR	875.00	6.50	5,687.50	LEGAL RESEARCH; REVIEW BRIEF; DRAFT REPLY THOUGHTS
1658.0001	08/24/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW EMAIL; WORK ON REPLY
1658.0001	08/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW LEY BRIEF
1658.0001	08/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW FRAUD RESEARCH; SEND UNIT FRAUD DISCUSSION
1658.0001	08/26/2019	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	REVIEW ALL SUNOCO AFFIDAVITS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW CLASS DEFINITION; EMAIL TO JASON RYAN RE: STATUTES
1658.0001	08/26/2019	PMR	875.00	1.90	1,662.50	REVIEW EXHIBITS; CONFER WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW PLEADINGS
1658.0001	08/27/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON BRIEF
1658.0001	08/27/2019	PMR	875.00	2.70	2,362.50	REVIEW AND EDIT REPLY; MULTIPLE CALLS AMONG TEAM; [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY; REVIEW EDITS
1658.0001	08/27/2019	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S AND DEFENDANT'S EXHIBITS; CONFER WITH DREW PATE AND PAULA JANTZEN RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	08/27/2019	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	DISCUSS CLASS ISSUES; MINE CUTS FOR BRIEF; STUDY FRAUD ISSUE
1658.0001	08/29/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FINAL FILING RE: CLASS CERT
1658.0001	08/29/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/29/2019	PMR	875.00	4.40	3,850.00	MULTIPLE CALLS AND EMAIL IN THE TWO BRIEFS DUE TODAY
1658.0001	08/29/2019	PMR	875.00	4.20	3,675.00	WORK ON [REDACTED]; EXCHANGE MULTIPLE EMAILS; REVIEW RECOMMENDATION OF OTHERS; REVIEW BARBARA LEY'S RESPONSE RE: DAUBERT; FINALIZE CASES; REVIEW AND EDIT REPLY ON CLASS CASE; REVIEW AND EDIT RESPONSE TO DISQUALIFYING
1658.0001	08/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND SUNOCO'S FILING ON CONFIDENTIAL DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	08/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; AND DEADLINES AND COURT SCHEDULE
1658.0001	08/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW CONFIDENTLY DESCRIPTION
1658.0001	09/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	09/03/2019	PMR	875.00	1.60	1,400.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL; REVIEW BRIEFING ON CLASS AND LEY; REVIEW TRANSCRIPTION OF 2018 HEARING
1658.0001	09/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW BRIEFS RE: LEY
1658.0001	09/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW COURT FILING; REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE RE: BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	09/04/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL; LETTER TO MCCLURE
1658.0001	09/05/2019	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	DISCUSS POTENTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENTS AND RE-READ REPLY BRIEF; REVIEW [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	09/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW REPLY BRIEF ON JURISDICTION
1658.0001	09/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	09/06/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW BRIEFING
1658.0001	09/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	EMAIL TO SUNOCO'S COUNSEL
1658.0001	09/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL; NOTIFY TEAM OF [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	09/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	09/09/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL TO TEAM; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	09/10/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	RESEARCH ITS OIL PRODUCTION AS AN OPERATOR
1658.0001	09/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	09/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW REPLY BRIEF; EMAIL TEAM; EMAIL BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	09/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW PLEADINGS; EMAIL TO MCCLURE

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	09/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: SURREPLY
1658.0001	09/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW SUNOCO'S DISCOVERY RESPONSE; MULTIPLE EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	09/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN RE: RULE 37 AND MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	09/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: SURREPLY
1658.0001	09/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	09/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW AND EDIT RESPONSE TO SURREPLY AND DISCUSS SUNOCO'S FUTURE AND RESPOND TO OUR MOTION RE: DISCOVERY
1658.0001	09/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	READY SURREPLY MOTION; PREPARE OBJECTION; DRAFT OBJECTION
1658.0001	09/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	STUDY PAULA JANTZEN'S ANALYSIS AND THINK ABOUT ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY
1658.0001	09/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY; EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	09/13/2019	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	REVIEW RULE 37 EMAIL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN; LOCATE DEPO EXHIBITS
1658.0001	09/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAP
1658.0001	09/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	09/13/2019	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	EFFORTS TO FIND ██████████
1658.0001	09/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH NIX PATTERSON
1658.0001	09/16/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	09/16/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EDIT DRAFT OF DISCOVERY
1658.0001	09/16/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW BRIEF; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	09/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	09/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON DISCOVERY REQUESTS
1658.0001	09/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	09/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DISCUSS MEET AND CONFER; REVIEW MCCLURE EMAIL
1658.0001	09/19/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	09/23/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	DISCUSS STRATEGY OF MOTION TO COMPEL RE SUNOCO CODES
1658.0001	09/23/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE; REVIEW DISCOVERY
1658.0001	09/23/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: MOTIONS TO BE FILED; REVIEW CHRONOLOGY
1658.0001	09/27/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EMAIL RE: DISCOVERY AND MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	09/27/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	ATTEMPTS TO LOCATION ██████████
1658.0001	09/27/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND STIPULATION
1658.0001	09/27/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW TECHNICAL DATA RE: OIL & GAS
1658.0001	09/27/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND CHANCE PEARSON
1658.0001	09/27/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON DISCOVERY
1658.0001	09/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW MOTION TO COMPEL AND DATA FOR BARBARA LEY; DISCUSS MOTION IN LIMINE AND MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT
1658.0001	09/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EMAILS RE: DISCOVERY; PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT
1658.0001	10/31/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EMAIL; REVIEW POTENTIAL WITNESS
1658.0001	11/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAILS
1658.0001	11/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL WITH JASON RYAN AND TEAM
1658.0001	11/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND ARRANGEMENTS RE: MEDIATION; REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	11/01/2019	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND SUNOCO DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	11/01/2019	PMR	875.00	1.90	1,662.50	REVIEW FILINGS; EMAIL
1658.0001	11/02/2019	PMR	875.00	3.10	2,712.50	REVIEW RESPONSE TO SUMMARY JUDGMENT; REVIEW EXPERT REPORTS AND ATTACHMENTS; MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	11/03/2019	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	REVIEW DESIGNATIONS AND EMAIL
1658.0001	11/04/2019	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	RECOMMEND FINAL DESIGNATION FOR REDDING
1658.0001	11/04/2019	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	REVIEW ORDER; EXCHANGE EMAIL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	11/04/2019	PMR	875.00	2.40	2,100.00	PREPARE AGENDA FOR WEEK; WORK ON DOCUMENT REVIEW AND CONFERENCE WITH TEAM; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR. CALDWELL; CONFERENCE WITH TEAM RE: DR. CALDWELL
1658.0001	11/04/2019	PMR	875.00	4.20	3,675.00	EMAIL WITH MCCLURE AND BRAD; WORK ON WITNESS LIST AND SUNOCO DOCUMENTS, REVIEW EMAIL FROM TEAM; CALL TO SEVERAL OWNERS; MULTIPLE EMAILS AND RESEARCH
1658.0001	11/05/2019	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	REVIEW 10TH CIRCUIT BRIEF; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; MULTIPLE EMAILS RE: DEADLINES; REVIEW DESIGNATIONS; REVIEW

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	Description
Client ID 1658.0001						DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH TEAM MEMBERS
1658.0001	11/05/2019	PMR	875.00	6.00	5,250.00	WORK ON DESIGNATIONS; IDENTIFY WITNESSES; REVIEW SUNOCO DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	11/05/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND DESIGNATIONS
1658.0001	11/06/2019	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	DISCUSS MEDIATION POSITION WITH TEAM; WORK ON WITNESS LIST; TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. CALDWELL
1658.0001	11/06/2019	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW EMAIL; TELEPHONE CALL TO DREW; EMAIL TO BRAD AND DREW; WORK ON SERVING KOELLING
1658.0001	11/06/2019	PMR	875.00	7.70	6,737.50	TELEPHONE CALLS TO OWNERS; CONFERENCE WITH DREW, PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN; PREPARE PROPOSED STIPULATION; GENERAL TRIAL PREP; REVIEW DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS; REVIEW AND EDIT EXHIBITS; WITNESS LISTS
1658.0001	11/06/2019	PMR	875.00	5.50	4,812.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND CALLS FROM OWNERS; LETTER PAUL WALKER; EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH BRAD; PREPARE MEMO SUMMARIZING SUNOCO DOCUMENTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH POTENTIAL WITNESSES; REVIEW SUNOCO BRIEF; REVIEW MULTIPLE DOCUMENTS INCLUDING DESIGNATIONS AND WITNESS LIST
1658.0001	11/07/2019	PMR	875.00	2.80	2,450.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: FRAUD CLAIM; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; CONFERENCE WITH BRAD
1658.0001	11/07/2019	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	REVIEW SUNOCO'S REPLY BRIEF; EXCHANGE MULTIPLE EMAILS RE: EXHIBIT AND WITNESS LIST; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DAN CALDWELL
1658.0001	11/07/2019	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	REVIEW COURT ORDER; EMAIL RE: MEDIATION TEAM; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW REPLY BRIEF
1658.0001	11/07/2019	PMR	875.00	2.20	1,925.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OWNERS; LEGAL RESEARCH; REVIEW CASES; [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW EMAIL RE: MEDIATION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	11/08/2019	PMR	875.00	2.20	1,925.00	CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY; CONFERENCE WITH DREW, PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN RE: LEY REPORT
1658.0001	11/08/2019	PMR	875.00	4.30	3,762.50	REVIEW AND FURTHER EDIT BARBARA LEY'S REPORT; REVIEW NIX PATTERSON EDITS; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES; LEGAL RESEARCH ON A VARIETY OF ISSUES
1658.0001	11/08/2019	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	EDIT LEY REPORT
1658.0001	11/08/2019	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	ADDITIONAL WORK ON LEY REPORT; REVIEW ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS AND EDITS; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES
1658.0001	11/08/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: FRAUD
1658.0001	11/09/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW FINAL REBUTTAL BRIEF; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH AND EMAIL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	11/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW PLEADINGS; TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	11/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CORRESPONDENCE TO MCCLURE AND BARNES AND LEWIS
1658.0001	11/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	MORE EMAILS RE: EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	11/11/2019	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	LEGAL RESEARCH; MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	11/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	11/11/2019	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	COMPLETE RESEARCH AND PREP MEMO RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	11/11/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW JUDGE'S RECOMMENDATIONS AND SUGGESTIONS; CONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL
1658.0001	11/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	TRIAL STRATEGY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	11/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW COURT ORDER; EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH DREW AND BRAD; EMAIL LINDA BEEBE RE: ESCHEATED OWNERS
1658.0001	11/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	PREPARE MEMO RE: FEES AND EXPERT
1658.0001	11/12/2019	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	PREPARE TRIAL STRATEGY MEMO
1658.0001	11/12/2019	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	REVIEW SUNOCO DOCUMENTS AND EMAIL; LEGAL RESEARCH ON [REDACTED]
1658.0001	11/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	TELEPHONE CALL TO DREW; REVIEW MEDIATION VIEWS; EMAIL TRIAL STRATEGY AND DISCUSSION OF LABOR
1658.0001	11/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW EMAIL; EMAIL TO MIKE BURRAGE; EMAIL TO JASON RYAN; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	11/12/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	11/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE
1658.0001	11/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	WORK ON ESCHEAT ISSUES

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	11/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW [REDACTED]; REVIEW PLEADINGS
1658.0001	11/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	PROCEDURE FOR [REDACTED]
1658.0001	11/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW COURT ORDER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	11/13/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ROBERT BARNES
1658.0001	11/13/2019	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	WORK ON CALDWELL; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	11/14/2019	PMR	875.00	5.20	4,550.00	WORK ON SUNOCO PRODUCTION FOR CALDWELLS; REVIEW ORDER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DAN CALDWELL; EMAIL TO DAN, JOANN MICKLE AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	11/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW DATA
1658.0001	11/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW BRAD'S LETTER
1658.0001	11/15/2019	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	WORK ON STIPULATION OF FACTS; EMAIL
1658.0001	11/15/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW MCCLURE REPORT AND DISCUSS WITH TEAM
1658.0001	11/15/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL TO DAN CALDWELL AND JOANN MICKLE
1658.0001	11/15/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: CALDWELL
1658.0001	11/15/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	11/15/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	PREPARE MEMO RE: CALDWELL AND EXHIBIT; CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	11/15/2019	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	MULTIPLE EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	11/15/2019	PMR	875.00	5.00	4,375.00	REVIEW MOTION TO CHANGE TRIAL VENUE; MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH DREW; WORK ON TRIAL EXHIBITS ; EMAIL WITH DR. CALDWELL
1658.0001	11/16/2019	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MCCLURE, TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; EMAIL; WORK ON STIPULATIONS
1658.0001	11/16/2019	PMR	875.00	7.40	6,475.00	REVIEW SUNOCO'S BRIEF ON ESCHEAT AND PREPARE MEMO FOR TEAM; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; WORK ON AFFIDAVIT FOR DR. CALDWELL; MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CALLS AND EMAILS WITH DR. CALDWELL, PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN; REVIEW CALDWELL'S DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	11/16/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW TEAM EMAILS
1658.0001	11/16/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EXCHANGE MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH DR. CALDWELL
1658.0001	11/17/2019	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW MEMO; REVIEW PLEADINGS
1658.0001	11/17/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW EMAIL; REVIEW EXHIBIT AND WITNESS LIST; SEND AFFIDAVIT
1658.0001	11/18/2019	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	MULTIPLE EMAIL WITH PAULA JANTZEN, JASON RYAN AND DREW PATE
1658.0001	11/18/2019	PMR	875.00	9.70	8,487.50	WORK ON BRIEF AND AFFIDAVITS; REVIEW SUNOCO DOCUMENTS; MULTIPLE CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL TEAM MEMBERS
1658.0001	11/19/2019	PMR	875.00	8.50	7,437.50	REVIEW BRIEF RE: UNCLAIMED PROPERTY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DAN CALDWELL; EDIT AFFIDAVIT; LEGAL RESEARCH [REDACTED]. REVIEW AFFIDAVIT AND REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAIL; REVIEW AND EDIT BRIEF; REVIEW KRUSE AND EPPESSON REPORTS; MULTIPLE EMAIL AND CONFERENCE; WORK ON EPPESSON AND KRUSE
1658.0001	11/20/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	WORK ON EPPERSON PREP; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW; LENGTHY WORK NEEDED TO BE ACCOMPLISH THIS WEEK
1658.0001	11/20/2019	PMR	875.00	9.30	8,137.50	TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	11/21/2019	PMR	875.00	7.90	6,912.50	TRIAL PREP; REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND EXHIBITS; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES AND EMAIL
1658.0001	11/22/2019	PMR	875.00	6.10	5,337.50	TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	11/23/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	ANALYZE BARBARA LEY'S DEPOSITION
1658.0001	11/23/2019	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW SUNOCO'S MOTION; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	11/25/2019	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	PREPARE FOR HEARING; ATTEND HEARING; CONFERENCE WITH TEAM AS FOLLOW-UPS; TELEPHONE CALL TO BRAD RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	11/25/2019	PMR	875.00	4.30	3,762.50	REVIEW JASON RYAN'S SUMMARY OF EXHIBITS; REVIEW AND CONSIDER ARGUMENTS OF SUNOCO RE: CLASS; EMAIL; WORK ON DR. CALDWELL'S DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	11/25/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BURRAGE; EMAIL BRAD; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	11/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EXCHANGE CALLS AND EMAILS
1658.0001	11/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW CALDWELL DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	11/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON SUNOCO EXHIBITS
1658.0001	11/26/2019	PMR	875.00	2.40	2,100.00	MULTIPLE EMAILS AND TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	11/27/2019	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	11/27/2019	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	REVIEW FILINGS
1658.0001	12/01/2019	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND TRIAL PREP; REVIEW MATERIALS FROM DR. CALDWELL
1658.0001	12/02/2019	PMR	875.00	8.80	7,700.00	EMAIL AND TRIAL PREP; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; TELEPHONE CALL TO DREW; OBTAIN AND REVIEW NEW EXHIBIT LISTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW AND BRAD; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: TEXAS UNCLAIMED PROPERTY; RESEARCH DATES SENT TO TEXAS; WORK ON EXHIBITS; GENERAL TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/03/2019	PMR	875.00	7.50	6,562.50	LEGAL RESEARCH; WORK ON WITNESS OUTLINES; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; WORK ON EXPERTS REPORTS AND CROSS EXAM; REVIEW ORDERS; WORK ON EPPERSON; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES AND EMAILS
1658.0001	12/04/2019	PMR	875.00	7.10	6,212.50	REVIEW FILINGS; TRIAL PREP; CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	12/05/2019	PMR	875.00	9.00	7,875.00	REVIEW CALDWELL RESUME; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PHILLIP WHALEY; MULTIPLE EMAILS; WORK ON CALDWELL DOCUMENTS AND OUTLINE; REVIEW PRE-TRIAL ORDER; CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE; PREPARE WITNESS OUTLINES; GENERAL TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/06/2019	PMR	875.00	8.10	7,087.50	REVIEW BRIEFS ON KRAUSER AND BURDEN OF PROOF; CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE GIBNEY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM; TRIAL PREP; WORK ON ENERGY TRANSFER; WORK ON EXHIBITS AND WITNESSES LISTS BY SUNOCO; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	12/07/2019	PMR	875.00	3.90	3,412.50	REVIEW BRIEFS IN SUNOCO; EXCHANGE EMAIL
1658.0001	12/08/2019	PMR	875.00	1.60	1,400.00	REVIEW ADDITIONAL MATERIALS AND FILINGS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	12/09/2019	PMR	875.00	8.00	7,000.00	TRIAL PREP; WORK ON FINDINGS OF FACT; REVIEW MEMBERS AND SUCH; MANY CONFERENCES AND EMAILS
1658.0001	12/10/2019	PMR	875.00	8.40	7,350.00	PREP FOR EPPERSON; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: MARKETABLE TITLE; TRIAL PREP; CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE AND BARBARA LEY; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN; WORK ON FINDINGS OF FACT
1658.0001	12/11/2019	PMR	875.00	12.00	10,500.00	PREPARE FOR AND TAKE DEPOSITION OF EPPERSON; WORK ON FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; WORK ON GENERAL TRIAL PREP; CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT
1658.0001	12/12/2019	PMR	875.00	10.80	9,450.00	REVIEW EMAILS; SUMMARIZE EPPERSON DEPO; REVIEW SUNOCO FINDINGS AND CONCLUSIONS; TRAIL PREP ALL DAY AND EVENING
1658.0001	12/13/2019	PMR	875.00	9.30	8,137.50	TRIAL PREP; CONFERENCE WITH TEAM MEMBERS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR. CALDWELL
1658.0001	12/14/2019	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	TRIAL PREP; EMAIL
1658.0001	12/15/2019	PMR	875.00	11.00	9,625.00	TRIAL PREP; TRAVEL TO MUSKOGEE; WORK WITH TEAM
1658.0001	12/16/2019	PMR	875.00	17.00	14,875.00	TRIAL; WORK WITH DR. CALDWELL
1658.0001	12/17/2019	PMR	875.00	15.00	13,125.00	TRAIL AND TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/18/2019	PMR	875.00	15.00	13,125.00	TRIAL AND PREP
1658.0001	12/19/2019	PMR	875.00	8.10	7,087.50	TRIAL PREP; TRIAL AND RETURN TO OKLAHOMA CITY
1658.0001	12/20/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND EMAIL RE: EXHIBITS
1658.0001	12/23/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND APPROVE AND FORWARD INVOICES
1658.0001	12/23/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH PAUL K.
1658.0001	12/26/2019	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH TEAM RE: FINDINGS
1658.0001	12/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL TO PAULA JANTZEN AND REVIEW ORDER
1658.0001	12/30/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: EXHIBITS
1658.0001	12/31/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	12/31/2019	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE AND EMAIL
1658.0001	12/31/2019	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	01/06/2020	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	LEGAL RESEARCH ON [REDACTED]; (2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	01/06/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DISCUSS POST-TRIAL BRIEFING
1658.0001	01/10/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	01/10/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; CALL TO DREW
1658.0001	01/10/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EXHIBITS; EMAIL TO DREW

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	01/10/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COURT
1658.0001	01/14/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW MCCLURE LETTER AND OUR EXHIBIT STATUS
1658.0001	01/15/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW AND CHECK ON MINUTE ORDER
1658.0001	01/18/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND ADDRESS EXHIBITS
1658.0001	01/27/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL
1658.0001	01/28/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL AND REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	01/29/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL
1658.0001	01/31/2020	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	ADDITIONAL RESEARCH AND REVIEW JASON RYAN'S RESEARCH
1658.0001	01/31/2020	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED] AND EMAIL
1658.0001	01/31/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: DR. CALDWELL
1658.0001	02/03/2020	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	REVIEW PLEADING AND FILE; TRAVEL TO OKC; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	02/04/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	02/04/2020	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: FINDINGS OF FACT
1658.0001	02/05/2020	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	ANALYZE PUNITIVE DAMAGE ISSUE
1658.0001	02/05/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW EMAIL AND FILE
1658.0001	02/06/2020	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	RETURN FROM OKC AND REVIEW FILE AND STATUS
1658.0001	02/07/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL AND ADDRESS DR. CALDWELL'S REIMBURSEMENT
1658.0001	02/07/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	TEAM MEETING
1658.0001	02/10/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	WORK ON UNCLAIMED PROPERTY LAWS
1658.0001	02/12/2020	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: DR. CALDWELL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DAN CALDWELL; ADDRESS PAYMENT ISSUES; EMAIL WITH PAULA JANTZEN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	02/13/2020	PMR	875.00	4.30	3,762.50	EMAIL RE: SUNOCO BRIEFING; REVIEW AND EDIT RESPONSE BRIEF; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; CONFER WITH DR. CALDWELL; REVIEW AND SEND EMAIL
1658.0001	02/14/2020	PMR	875.00	6.10	5,337.50	REVIEW BARNES AND LEWIS EDITS TO POST TRIAL BRIEF; REVIEW FACTS AND FINDINGS AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; SEND MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	02/15/2020	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	REVIEW REVISED FACTS AND FINDINGS AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW AND EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	02/17/2020	PMR	875.00	3.10	2,712.50	FURTHER REVIEW AND EDIT RESPONSE BRIEF; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	02/17/2020	PMR	875.00	4.10	3,587.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE: FACTS AND FINDINGS AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW;; FURTHER REVIEW AND EDITION OF THESE; EMAIL
1658.0001	02/18/2020	PMR	875.00	3.50	3,062.50	COMPLETE REVIEW OF FACTS AND FINDINGS AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; REVIEW SUNOCO FILINGS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE; FACTS AND FINDINGS AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; EMAIL TO TEAM
1658.0001	02/19/2020	PMR	875.00	5.10	4,462.50	REVIEW SUNOCO SUBMISSIONS; WORK ON OUTLINE FOR RESPONSE BRIEF; PREPARE MOTION RE: RESPONSE BRIEF; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; EMAIL
1658.0001	02/24/2020	PMR	875.00	6.60	5,775.00	REVIEW SUNOCO SUBMISSIONS; WORK ON RESPONSE
1658.0001	02/25/2020	PMR	875.00	4.30	3,762.50	DEAL WITH DR. CALDWELL; LEGAL RESEARCH ON EQUITABLE AND LEGAL REMEDIES; WORK ON RESPONSE BRIEF; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	02/26/2020	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	WORK ON RESPONSE BRIEF; REVIEW PAULA JANTZEN'S COMMENTS; LEGAL RESEARCH; REVIEW DRAFT
1658.0001	02/27/2020	PMR	875.00	5.30	4,637.50	WORK ON RESPONSE BRIEF; REVIEW OTHER COMMENTS
1658.0001	02/28/2020	PMR	875.00	2.70	2,362.50	FINAL EDIT AND EMAIL; REVIEW ADDITIONAL NIX PATTERSON COMMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND EMAIL; PROOFREAD BRIEF
1658.0001	02/29/2020	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	REVIEW SUNOCO RESPONSE BRIEF
1658.0001	03/02/2020	PMR	875.00	7.10	6,212.50	REVIEW ENTIRE TRANSCRIPT; MAKE MULTIPLE SUGGESTIONS RE: ORAL ARGUMENT; REVIEW ERIC KOELLING'S DEPOSITION
1658.0001	03/02/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW [REDACTED]
1658.0001	03/03/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DISCUSS ARGUMENT AT FINAL HEARING
1658.0001	03/04/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	CHECK WHETHER SUNOCO REALLY STOPPED ROYALTY DISTRIBUTION IN OKLAHOMA
1658.0001	03/04/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	03/04/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	LEGAL RESEARCH; EMAIL BRAD
1658.0001	03/09/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND SEND EMAIL
1658.0001	03/09/2020	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	03/10/2020	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	REVIEW APPLICATION AND PROPOSED ORDER; EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH BOOKKEEPER AND TEAM

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	03/10/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	COORDINATE ON RESPONSE BRIEF
1658.0001	03/10/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW AND SEND EMAIL; REVIEW ORDER
1658.0001	03/10/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW FILE; EMAIL
1658.0001	03/11/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL
1658.0001	03/11/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN; LEGAL RESEARCH; EMAIL TO MIKE BURRAGE AND NIX PATTERSON
1658.0001	03/11/2020	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW FILE; EMAIL; REVIEW BRIEF BY SUNOCO
1658.0001	03/12/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW COURT ORDER; CONFER WITH COUNSEL
1658.0001	03/12/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	WORK ON TOTAL TIME; EMAIL TO OFFICE TEAM
1658.0001	03/12/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL RE: HEARING; MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	03/12/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL EXCHANGE
1658.0001	03/12/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL STRING RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	03/12/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	WORK ON [REDACTED]
1658.0001	03/12/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND EMAIL
1658.0001	03/16/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM
1658.0001	03/16/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW BARNES EMAIL AND EDITED BRIEF
1658.0001	03/16/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL
1658.0001	03/16/2020	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW AND EDIT RESPONSE TO SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF
1658.0001	03/17/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND FILE
1658.0001	03/23/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	03/23/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW EMAIL AND PLEADINGS
1658.0001	03/23/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL; REVIEW INVOICE
1658.0001	04/13/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE AND BARBARA LEY'S INVOICES
1658.0001	04/16/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH TEAM; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	04/21/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN
1658.0001	04/30/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	VIDEO CONFERENCE RE: CLOSING MAIL
1658.0001	04/30/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EMAIL RE: CLOSING
1658.0001	05/04/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL AND REVIEW FILE
1658.0001	05/04/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN
1658.0001	05/05/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW DRAFT SUBMISSION AND ALL EDITS
1658.0001	05/06/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW ORDER; EMAIL TEAM
1658.0001	05/11/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	EMAIL WITH MB
1658.0001	05/14/2020	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	REVIEW BRIEF ON COMPOUND INTEREST AND PROCEEDS
1658.0001	05/18/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW [REDACTED] AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DREW
1658.0001	05/20/2020	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	LEGAL RESEARCH AND WORK ON ATTORNEY FEE ISSUE
1658.0001	05/21/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	LEGAL RESEARCH
1658.0001	05/27/2020	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE FEES; [REDACTED]
1658.0001	05/27/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW ORDER; EMAIL TO TEAM MEMBERS
1658.0001	05/28/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE ATTORNEY FEES
1658.0001	05/28/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EMAIL RE HEARING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; EMAIL
1658.0001	05/28/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	EMAIL RE LOGISTICS OF HEARING
1658.0001	06/01/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE HEARING
1658.0001	06/10/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE PERRY AND HEARING
1658.0001	06/15/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	REVIEW FILE AND EMAIL
1658.0001	06/15/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE HEARING THIS WEEK; REVIEW COURT'S ORDER RE PARTICIPATION; CONFERENCE WITH BLAKE AND PAULA
1658.0001	06/16/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DISCUSS HEARING AND PERRY'S ATTENDANCE AND FEE APPLICATION WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/17/2020	PMR	875.00	4.80	4,200.00	LISTEN TO CLOSING ARGUMENT; CONSULT WITH CO-COUNSEL
1658.0001	06/18/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW FILINGS RE DEMONSTRATIVES
1658.0001	06/18/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH NIX PATTERSON
1658.0001	07/06/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN; REVIEW ORDER
1658.0001	08/10/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM
1658.0001	08/14/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW DOCKET
1658.0001	08/17/2020	PMR	875.00	2.00	1,750.00	REVIEW ORDER AND MULTIPLE EMAILS
1658.0001	08/18/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	DISCUSS ORDER WITH TEAM
1658.0001	08/19/2020	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	EVALUATE CHANCE OF REVERSAL
1658.0001	08/19/2020	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	CONFERENCE WITH DREW AND PAULA RE ATTORNEY FEE APPLICATION AND OTHER DEADLINES
1658.0001	08/19/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	LETTER TO DR. DAN CALDWELL
1658.0001	08/19/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	EXCHANGE EMAIL WITH DR. CALDWELL
1658.0001	08/24/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW ORDERS AND EMAIL; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	08/24/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	TEAM CONFERENCE
1658.0001	08/26/2020	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	DISCUSS OPTIONS WITH TEAM
1658.0001	08/26/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	REVIEW SUNOCO SUBMISSION
1658.0001	08/28/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH TEAM; EMAIL BRAD AND DREW
1658.0001	08/31/2020	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	CONFERENCE WITH BRAD, DREW AND PAULA
1658.0001	08/31/2020	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	DISCUSS [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/04/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review Barbara Affidavit; legal research
1658.0001	09/04/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review exhibit to Barbara Ley declaration and email with Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	09/07/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review email fro Drew and Paula
1658.0001	09/08/2020	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	Telephone conference with team re plan of allocation
1658.0001	09/09/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Telephone conference with Mike Burrage
1658.0001	09/24/2020	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	Review filings by Sunoco
1658.0001	09/25/2020	PMR	875.00	1.80	1,575.00	Legal research; Review pleadings; Conference with Phillip Whaley
1658.0001	09/28/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review pleadings; Conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0001	09/28/2020	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review and edit brief re allocation
1658.0001	09/28/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Team conference
1658.0001	09/28/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review email
1658.0001	09/30/2020	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	Review research; Conference with Paula Jantzen re research
1658.0001	09/30/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Review file
1658.0001	10/01/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review pleadings
1658.0001	10/01/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review email
1658.0001	10/01/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review response to motion for sur-reply
1658.0001	10/02/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review filings; Conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	10/05/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Team conference
1658.0001	10/06/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Update on new email; Review file
1658.0001	10/13/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Email; Review Order; Review file re Paula Jantzen research
1658.0001	10/13/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	10/15/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Team email exchange
1658.0001	10/16/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review Brief
1658.0001	10/19/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review allocation; Email
1658.0001	10/19/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Team conference call; Review case file
1658.0001	10/22/2020	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	Review Sunoco Reply Brief; Review Trial Brief
1658.0001	10/23/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Conference with Paula Jantzen; Review case status
1658.0001	10/30/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Review allocation orders; Conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	11/02/2020	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen; Telephone conference with Jason Ryan; Review filing
1658.0001	11/02/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Research lawyers for Sunoco
1658.0001	11/02/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Weekly call
1658.0001	11/12/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Conference with team; Email
1658.0001	11/16/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Team conference call
1658.0001	11/25/2020	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review two briefs and file
1658.0001	12/09/2020	PMR	875.00	2.20	1,925.00	Review all Orders and filings; Telephone conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0001	01/05/2021	PMR	875.00	1.70	1,487.50	Review [REDACTED] and legal research re interest
1658.0001	01/18/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Telephone conference with team; Review deadlines
1658.0001	02/08/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Deal with Dr. Caldwell and tax issues
1658.0001	02/09/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Multiple emails
1658.0001	02/22/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review documents
1658.0001	08/13/2021	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	Review email and telephone conference with Dr. Caldwell
1658.0001	08/18/2021	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Legal research; Conference with Drew
1658.0001	08/25/2021	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	Conference with team and Brad
1658.0001	09/20/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Email; Review file
1658.0001	09/21/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Team meeting
1658.0001	09/22/2021	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Conference with Jason Ryan; Email
1658.0001	10/04/2021	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	Multiple conferences with Brad, Drew, Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen re settlement
1658.0001	10/29/2021	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	Work on Sunoco payments; Review email; Multiple conferences with Drew and Paula; Legal research payments to the class
1658.0001	11/01/2021	PMR	875.00	3.40	2,975.00	Conference with Jason Ryan; Conference with Paula Jantzen; Email with Nix Patterson; Legal research re PRSA; Multiple conferences
1658.0001	11/04/2021	PMR	875.00	2.20	1,925.00	Legal research statutory fees; Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen and Jason Ryan
1658.0001	11/16/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Work on time and expenses
1658.0001	12/07/2021	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	Review drafts of 30(b)(6); Email with team; Review law re execution of judgment
1658.0001	12/08/2021	PMR	875.00	3.10	2,712.50	Multiple conferences with team re fees, execution, hearing on

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
						assets, etc.
1658.0001	12/09/2021	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	Conference with Nix Patterson and Jason Ryan
1658.0001	12/13/2021	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Team call
1658.0001	12/13/2021	PMR	875.00	2.20	1,925.00	Review proposed filings; Conference with Paula Jantzen and Drew Pate; Email
1658.0001	12/20/2021	PMR	875.00	3.10	2,712.50	Conference with Paula Jantzen; Legal research re liens and bonds
1658.0001	12/20/2021	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	Further conference with Paula re liens and execution; Team conference; Legal research
1658.0001	12/21/2021	PMR	875.00	1.90	1,662.50	Review Russell's memo; Legal research
1658.0001	12/27/2021	PMR	875.00	3.50	3,062.50	Review Brief; Legal research; Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen; Team call; Research Sunoco's assets
1658.0001	01/10/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review Response to HOH Motion
1658.0001	01/10/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Team conference call; Review pleadings
1658.0001	01/11/2022	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	Review Orders and filings re fees
1658.0001	01/12/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	01/13/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Case assessment/strategies
1658.0001	01/14/2022	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	Review documents and briefs
1658.0001	01/17/2022	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Review and discuss brief with team
1658.0001	01/24/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Legal research
1658.0001	02/02/2022	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	Review Order; Conference with team
1658.0001	02/04/2022	PMR	875.00	2.70	2,362.50	Conference with team; Review Orders; Legal research
1658.0001	02/05/2022	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	Conference with expert re fees; Consider multiple options
1658.0001	02/08/2022	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	Team conference call; Conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0001	02/09/2022	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	Conference call re settlement
1658.0001	02/09/2022	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Legal research re [REDACTED]; Conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0001	02/10/2022	PMR	875.00	3.10	2,712.50	Conference call re judgment; Conference with Paula Jantzen re liens; Review Sunoco filings; Conference with Court
1658.0001	02/11/2022	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Conference with Jason Ryan re execution
1658.0001	02/14/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Exchange email with Nix Patterson
1658.0001	02/15/2022	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Review [REDACTED]; Discussion with [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/15/2022	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	Conference with Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen re [REDACTED]; Email with Drew
1658.0001	02/16/2022	PMR	875.00	3.50	3,062.50	Review [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/17/2022	PMR	875.00	3.90	3,412.50	Complete review of [REDACTED]; Go over [REDACTED] Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	02/17/2022	PMR	875.00	4.10	3,587.50	[REDACTED] with Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	02/18/2022	PMR	875.00	2.40	2,100.00	Review motions; Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen and Mike Burrage re motions
1658.0001	02/21/2022	PMR	875.00	4.30	3,762.50	Review and edit brief re HOA; Review Paula Jantzen's edits; Conference with Paula Jantzen and Jason Ryan; Team conference; Prepare [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/22/2022	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	Edit brief on HOA; Conference with team
1658.0001	02/22/2022	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	Review others' edits to brief
1658.0001	02/23/2022	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	Review [REDACTED]; Email re [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/23/2022	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	Review [REDACTED]; Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen; Email with Brad; Conference with Jason Ryan re [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/24/2022	PMR	875.00	1.90	1,662.50	Review and edit brief; Email with team
1658.0001	02/24/2022	PMR	875.00	1.90	1,662.50	Review and edit brief; Email with Nix Patterson and Jason Ryan
1658.0001	02/25/2022	PMR	875.00	2.70	2,362.50	Legal research re [REDACTED]; Email with Brad; Telephone call to Michael Burrage
1658.0001	02/25/2022	PMR	875.00	2.70	2,362.50	Legal research re [REDACTED]; Email Brad; Telephone conference with Mike Burrage
1658.0001	02/28/2022	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	Draft affidavit re fees; Team call
1658.0001	02/28/2022	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	Review draft of brief re fees; Conference with Paula Jantzen re revisions; Discuss agenda on team call
1658.0001	02/28/2022	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	Team call; Review [REDACTED] ege
1658.0001	02/28/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen re appeal and proceedings before trial court
1658.0001	03/01/2022	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	Study finalize [REDACTED]; Conference with Paula Jantzen re strategy and status
1658.0001	03/02/2022	PMR	875.00	1.70	1,487.50	Conference with Paula Jantzen; Edit revised Affidavit; Telephone conference with Mike Burrage; Review NP email; Telephone conference with Brad
1658.0001	03/03/2022	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	Review Motion to Strike; Team Email

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	03/04/2022	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	Email; Review stipulation; Review brief by Sunoco; Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	03/07/2022	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	Conference with Paula Jantzen and Jason Ryan; Email with Brad re expenses; Review Sunoco brief
1658.0001	03/08/2022	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	Review Response to Motion to Strike; Review additional Sunoco briefs; Review additional filing
1658.0001	03/14/2022	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	Conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	03/18/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Email with Court and parties
1658.0001	03/21/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0001	03/21/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Team call
1658.0001	03/22/2022	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	Telephone conference with Drew; Telephone conference with Si Bonderant; Email
1658.0001	03/23/2022	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	Review oil and gas law; Review status
1658.0001	03/23/2022	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	Telephone conference with Drew
1658.0001	03/29/2022	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	Email and review pleading; Telephone conference with Jason Ryan; Email Brad; Review Sunoco Motion for Extension; Email with Paula Jantzen and others
1658.0001	03/31/2022	PMR	875.00	1.80	1,575.00	Telephone conference with and email before and after Court hearing; Telephone conference with Court
1658.0001	04/04/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Team conference call
1658.0001	04/06/2022	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	Review Order
1658.0001	04/11/2022	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	Review emails re mediation; Team call; Send info; Conference with Jason Ryan; Telephone conference with Drew
1658.0001	04/13/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review email and rules; Review Orders of Magistrate; Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	04/18/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Discuss mediation and briefing
1658.0001	04/22/2022	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	Work on interest calculation and logistics of mediation; Conference with Drew, Jason ryan, Paula Jantzen and Mike Burrage; Multiple emails
1658.0001	04/23/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Telephone conference re logistics
1658.0001	04/25/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Telephone conference with Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen re case evaluation for mediation
1658.0001	04/25/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Telephone conference with Mike Burrage; Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen; Telephone conference with Drew re settlement and logistics
1658.0001	04/27/2022	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	Email and telephone calls re logistics and settlement (Paula, Patti, Mike and pilot)
1658.0001	04/27/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Telephone conference with Patti and Paula; Email with Paula
1658.0001	04/28/2022	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	Review draft settlement position and brief from mediator and review the Judge's memo for mediation; Conference with Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen re edits to mediation submission
1658.0001	05/02/2022	PMR	875.00	1.90	1,662.50	Review revised mediation submission; Telephone conference with Paula; Conference call with Nix Patterson, Ross and Mike Burrage; Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen; Telephone conference with Jason Ryan; Email
1658.0001	07/15/2022	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	Review asset list of defendants; Email
1658.0001	07/18/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review email and collection efforts
1658.0001	08/30/2022	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	Review collection memo; Exchange email; Conference with Paula Jantzen; Review McClure letter; Legal research re Supreme Court stay
1658.0001	08/31/2022	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	Review and exchange email; Review ET; Review ET 20k; Review Gibney Order
1658.0001	09/08/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Review brief, Order and email all re efforts to collect judgment
1658.0001	09/22/2022	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	Legal research; Conference with Paula re collection
1658.0001	09/25/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Review settlement drafts and email
1658.0001	10/05/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Discuss mediation
1658.0001	10/06/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Consider mediation and email
1658.0001	10/18/2022	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Review garnishment returns and email
1658.0001	10/20/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Review settlement email; Conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0001	10/24/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Discuss with team the hearing on depositing funds
1658.0001	10/25/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Review court filing; Review file
1658.0001	11/01/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review case status and conference with Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	11/02/2022	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	Conference with Drew re settlement and the hearing on the \$161MM; Review Sunoco filings
1658.0001	11/03/2022	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	Review again Sunoco's filings; Conference with team re analysis of filing by Sunoco and steps forward

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	11/03/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review Magistrate's Order and call team
1658.0001	11/07/2022	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	Conference with Jason Ryan, Paula Jantzen and Drew Pate; Review filings; Discuss approach to Sunoco's deposit
1658.0001	11/09/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review multiple filings by Sunoco
1658.0001	11/14/2022	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Conference with Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen re settlement and acceptable terms
1658.0001	11/18/2022	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	Review expenses and time; Edit email to Brad
1658.0001	11/21/2022	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	Telephone conference with team; Review firm time and expense documents
1658.0001	11/28/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review pleadings and deadlines; Conference with team
1658.0001	11/29/2022	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	Review today's filings by the parties
1658.0001	11/30/2022	PMR	875.00	2.20	1,925.00	Review pleadings; Conference with Nix Patterson
1658.0001	12/01/2022	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	Review pleadings; Conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0001	01/11/2023	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Review Court Order; emails with team
1658.0001	01/13/2023	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Multiple communications with Paula Jantzen, Jason Ryan, and Drew Pate
1658.0001	01/18/2023	PMR	875.00	1.70	1,487.50	Review materials related to Dr. Caldwell and trial; draft declaration for Dr. Caldwell; communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	01/19/2023	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	Continue working on Dr. Caldwell's declaration; review/comment on revised draft; multiple communications with Dr. Caldwell and co-counsel; finalize Declaration
1658.0001	01/23/2023	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review and edit Perry Cline's Declaration; teleconference with Paula Jantzen
Subtotal for Timekeeper PMR			Billable	1,627.35	1,423,931.25	Patrick M. Ryan
1658.0001	07/14/2017	PGW	700.00	0.20	140.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN
1658.0001	07/14/2017	PGW	700.00	0.30	210.00	VARIOUS EMAILS RE: FILINGS
1658.0001	08/15/2017	PGW	700.00	0.30	210.00	REVIEW FILINGS
1658.0001	08/16/2017	PGW	700.00	0.30	210.00	RECEIVE/REVIEW VARIOUS FILINGS
1658.0001	08/17/2017	PGW	700.00	0.20	140.00	RECEIVE/REVIEW FILINGS
1658.0001	08/18/2017	PGW	700.00	0.20	140.00	VARIOUS EMAILS
1658.0001	08/28/2017	PGW	700.00	0.20	140.00	ATTENTION TO CORRESPONDENCE AND EMAILS
1658.0001	10/12/2017	PGW	700.00	0.30	210.00	VARIOUS EMAILS
1658.0001	01/17/2018	PGW	700.00	0.80	560.00	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE AND ATTENTION TO CORP REP DEPO ISSUES
1658.0001	01/19/2018	PGW	700.00	1.10	770.00	REVIEW NIX PATTERSON LETTER AND DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE
1658.0001	06/27/2018	PGW	700.00	0.20	140.00	REVIEW MINUTE ORDERS
1658.0001	06/27/2018	PGW	700.00	0.40	280.00	REVIEW MOTION
1658.0001	06/27/2018	PGW	700.00	0.20	140.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN
1658.0001	06/28/2018	PGW	700.00	0.20	140.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/28/2018	PGW	700.00	1.00	700.00	REVIEW MOTION AND RESPONSE
1658.0001	06/28/2018	PGW	700.00	0.10	70.00	REVIEW ORDER
1658.0001	06/29/2018	PGW	700.00	0.70	490.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
Subtotal for Timekeeper PGW			Billable	6.70	4,690.00	Phillip G. Whaley
1658.0001	07/28/2017	JAR	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	REVIEW/REVISE DRAFT DISCOVERY TO SUNOCO
1658.0001	08/01/2017	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	FINALIZE DISCOVERY TO SUNOCO; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW RE: SAME
1658.0001	08/23/2017	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	REVIEW NOTICE OF RELATED CASE AND LETTER
1658.0001	08/28/2017	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL REGARDING DISCOVERY PLANNING CONFERENCE
1658.0001	10/11/2017	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	REVIEW JOINT STATUS REPORT AND EMAILS BETWEEN COUNSEL REGARDING THE SAME
1658.0001	10/18/2017	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS RESPONSE TO WRITTEN DISCOVERY
1658.0001	10/18/2017	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	DRAFT PROPOSED PROTECTIVE ORDER
1658.0001	10/23/2017	JAR	700.00	1.70	1,190.00	FINALIZE AND FILE NOTICE OF SCHEDULE
1658.0001	10/23/2017	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH CO-COUNSEL REGARDING THINGS TO DO AND STRATEGY
1658.0001	10/23/2017	JAR	700.00	3.00	2,100.00	REVIEW EMAILS AND NEGOTIATIONS RELATED TO THE PROPOSED SCHEDULING ORDER; REVIEW DRAFTS OF THE JOINT STATUS

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	10/24/2017	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	REPORT; DRAFT NOTICE OF SCHEDULE TO BE FILED.
1658.0001	10/25/2017	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS NOTICE OF PROPOSED SCHEDULE AND MAKE ARRANGEMENTS FOR JOANN TO FILE ORDER
1658.0001	10/30/2017	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	REVIEW COURT ORDER
1658.0001	11/07/2017	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	REVIEW AND REVISE DEFENDANTS PROPOSED PROTECTIVE ORDER
1658.0001	12/04/2017	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	REVIEW JOINT MOTION TO ENTER PROTECTIVE ORDER
1658.0001	12/08/2017	JAR	700.00	1.70	1,190.00	EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL REGARDING MEET AND CONFER
1658.0001	12/21/2017	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	REVIEW DISCOVERY RESPONSES
1658.0001	12/22/2017	JAR	700.00	5.60	3,920.00	WORK ON MOTION REGARDING INTERIM COUNSEL AND MOTION REGARDING CONTACT WITH CLASS
1658.0001	01/08/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION REGARDING INTERIM COUNSEL; REVIEW SIMILAR MOTION REGARDING CONTACTING MEMBERS OF CLASS; LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING THE SAME; CONFERENCE WITH PAT AND PAULA REGARDING THE SAME
1658.0001	01/09/2018	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH NPR REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	01/29/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TEAM MEETING
1658.0001	01/30/2018	JAR	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH DAN REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	02/11/2018	JAR	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	RESEARCH REGARDING 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION
1658.0001	03/09/2018	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	REVIEW DISCOVERY DISPUTES ISSUE AND RESEARCH ISSUE REGARDING THE SAME; DRAFT LETTER TO DEFENSE COUNSEL
1658.0001	03/12/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	REVIEW THE DEPOSITION OF KOELLING
1658.0001	03/12/2018	JAR	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH GROUP TO DISCUSS DEPOSITION ISSUES
1658.0001	03/13/2018	JAR	700.00	8.30	5,810.00	REVIEW DISCOVERY RESPONSES
1658.0001	03/14/2018	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	REVIEW DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND DOCUMENTS; RESEARCH DISCOVERY STANDARDS; DRAFT LETTER TO SUNOCO
1658.0001	03/19/2018	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	REVISE DISCOVERY LETTER TO MCCLURE
1658.0001	03/26/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH GROUP REGARDING DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	03/30/2018	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	FINALIZE AND SEND DISCOVERY LETTER
1658.0001	04/02/2018	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT AND PAULA REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	04/02/2018	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	EMAIL TO COUNSEL REGARDING A TIME TO CONDUCT A RULE 37 CONFERENCE
1658.0001	04/04/2018	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH CO COUNSEL REGARDING ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY
1658.0001	04/06/2018	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	REVIEW DISCOVERY LETTERS REGARDING DISPUTES
1658.0001	04/09/2018	JAR	700.00	0.60	420.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH PMR ABOUT CHECKS CLINE RECEIVED AND FUTURE DISCOVERY NEEDS
1658.0001	04/09/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH GROUP ON DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	04/16/2018	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH GROUP REGARDING DISCOVERY DISPUTE WITH DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	04/23/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TEAM TO DISCUSS DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	04/30/2018	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH GROUP REGARDING DISCOVERY EFFORTS
1658.0001	05/14/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH GROUP REGARDING DISCOVERY
1658.0001	05/15/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	PROGRESS
1658.0001	05/18/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH GROUP REGARDING DISCOVERY NEEDS
1658.0001	05/21/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSSIONS WITH GROUP REGARDING DOCUMENT DISCOVERY
1658.0001	05/21/2018	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH PAT, PAULA AND DREW ABOUT DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	05/22/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH GROUP TO DISCUSS RECORDS AND DISCOVERY
1658.0001	05/30/2018	JAR	700.00	1.60	1,120.00	REVIEW RECORDS RELATED TO MR SUCCOP
1658.0001	05/31/2018	JAR	700.00	5.00	3,500.00	REVIEW EMAILS AND ATTEMPTS TO REACH JOHN SUCCOP
1658.0001	05/31/2018	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	DISCOVERY CALL AND MEETING WITH PAT AND PAULA
1658.0001	05/31/2018	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION OF KOELLING AND DRAFT DISCOVERY REQUESTS
1658.0001	06/04/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	MEET WITH PERRY CLINE TO PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION
1658.0001	06/04/2018	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	FINALIZE DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	06/06/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH GROUP REGARDING DISCOVERY AND STRATEGY ON MOTION TO EXTEND DEADLINES
1658.0001	06/11/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO EXTEND TIME
1658.0001	06/12/2018	JAR	700.00	3.00	2,100.00	DISCUSS WITH GROUP A MOTION TO COMPEL ON ACCOUNTING DATA AND TALK WITH ADAM REGARDING THE SAME
1658.0001	06/13/2018	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES
						REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY SUNOCO
						REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED AND PRINT IMPORTANT DOCUMENTS

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001						
1658.0001	06/18/2018	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	REVIEW SUNOCO'S RESPONSE TO PLAINTIFFS MOTION TO EXTEND DEADLINES
1658.0001	06/18/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSSION WITH GROUP ABOUT REPLY TO MOTION TO EXTEND TIME AND FILING MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	06/18/2018	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH PAT AND PAULA REGARDING SUNOCO'S RESPONSE TO THE MOTION TO EXTEND DEADLINES
1658.0001	06/19/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	MEETING TO DISCUSS REPLY TO MOTION TO EXTEND
1658.0001	06/20/2018	JAR	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY DEFENDANT
1658.0001	06/21/2018	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH DREW, PAT AND PAULA REGARDING MOTIONS TO COMPEL AND MOTIONS FOR PRIVILEGE LOG
1658.0001	06/21/2018	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT AND PAULA ABOUT DISCOVERY MOTIONS TO BE FILED
1658.0001	06/22/2018	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	MEETING WITH PAT AND PAULA TO DISCUSS MOTION TO STRIKE PRIVILEGE LOG, MOTION TO COMPEL, AND NOTICING WITNESSES
1658.0001	06/25/2018	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO STRIKE PRIVILEGE LOG
1658.0001	06/28/2018	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	REVIEW SUNOCOS MOTION TO STRIKE FOR FAILURE WITH RULES REQUIRING A MEET AND CONFER
1658.0001	06/28/2018	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT AND PAULA REGARDING SUNOCO PRODUCTION AND REPLY TO DEFENDANTS RESPONSE TO MOTION TO STRIKE
1658.0001	06/29/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT AND PAULA REGARDING SUNOCO HEARING
1658.0001	06/29/2018	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	MEET AND CONFER WITH MARK AND DAN REGARDING PRIVILEGE LOG
1658.0001	07/02/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS MOTION TO COMPEL AND ACCOUNTING DATA WITH GROUP
1658.0001	07/02/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	REVIEW SUNOCO RESPONSE TO SECOND SET OF DISCOVERY
1658.0001	07/03/2018	JAR	700.00	3.50	2,450.00	REVIEW AND REVISE COMPLIANCE OF LCVR 7(F) AND MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	07/03/2018	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	FURTHER REVISE AND SEND EMAIL REGARDING MOTION TO COMPEL; REVIEW REVISIONS TO 7(F) COMPLIANCE MOTION
1658.0001	07/06/2018	JAR	700.00	3.00	2,100.00	TELEPHONE CALLS AND TEXTS TO PERRY; REVIEW PERRY'S DEPOSITION AND EXHIBITS TO HELP WITH ERRATA SHEET
1658.0001	07/09/2018	JAR	700.00	1.40	980.00	FINISH REVIEW OF CLINE DEPOSITION AND BEGIN SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSES; TELEPHONE CALL WITH CLINE REGARDING DOCUMENTS HE RECENTLY FORWARDED
1658.0001	07/09/2018	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS RESPONSE TO MOTION TO STRIKE PRIVILEGE LOGS AND PREPARE FOR HEARING
1658.0001	07/09/2018	JAR	700.00	1.20	840.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED TODAY
1658.0001	07/09/2018	JAR	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	MEETING WITH PAULA AND PAT AND TELEPHONE CALL WITH DREW TO HELP PAULA PREPARE FOR HEARING
1658.0001	07/11/2018	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT AND PAULA ABOUT THE HEARING AND STRATEGY ON DISCOVERY
1658.0001	07/12/2018	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	REVIEW AND REVISE 30(B)(6) NOTICE REGARDING DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY
1658.0001	07/12/2018	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	REVIEW RESEARCH REGARDING DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY
1658.0001	07/12/2018	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	ADDITIONAL RESEARCH REGARDING DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY
1658.0001	07/13/2018	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	CONFERENCE WITH PMR AND PJ REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES; TELEPHONE CALL WITH PERRY; REVIEW NEW DOCUMENTS PROVIDED BY PERRY
1658.0001	07/16/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS 30(B)(6) AND DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY WITH GROUP
1658.0001	07/17/2018	JAR	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH PERRY AND REVIEW DEPOSITION FOR ERRATA CHANGES
1658.0001	07/17/2018	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	DISCUSS POTENTIAL DISCOVERY DEPOSITIONS WITH PAT AND PAULA
1658.0001	07/18/2018	JAR	700.00	3.30	2,310.00	TRAVEL TO HENNESSEY TO MEET WITH CLINE ABOUT ██████████
1658.0001	07/23/2018	JAR	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	RULE 31 CONFERENCE WITH DAN MCLURE, PAULA, DREW AND MARK
1658.0001	07/25/2018	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	DISCUSS DEFENSES OF 1ST PURCHASE UNDER PRSA WITH PAT AND PAULA
1658.0001	07/31/2018	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	DISCUSS UPCOMING DEPOSITION WITH GROUP
1658.0001	07/31/2018	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	DISCUSS SNOWMAN WELL WITH CLINE
1658.0001	08/06/2018	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	DISCUSS ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY NEEDED
1658.0001	08/13/2018	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	DISCUSS DISCOVERY STRATEGY WITH GROUP
1658.0001	08/28/2018	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	MEET WITH PAT AND PAULA REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	09/04/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH LINDA REGARDING OBTAINING DATE OF FIRST SALE FOR SUNOCO WELLS

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001	Cline/Perry					
1658.0001	09/04/2018	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT AND PAULA REGARDING ADDITIONAL WRITTEN DISCOVERY NEEDED
1658.0001	09/04/2018	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	DRAFT 4TH SET OF INTERROGATORIES TO SUNOCO
1658.0001	09/04/2018	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH DREW ABOUT TELEPHONE CALL WITH BARBARA LEY AND 4TH SET OF INTERROGATORIES
1658.0001	09/04/2018	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH BARBARA LEY, PAT AND PAULA REGARDING IDENTIFYING LATE PAYMENTS AND DATA
1658.0001	09/05/2018	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH PAT AND PAULA REGARDING CASE AND DISCOVERY EFFORTS
1658.0001	09/10/2018	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	REVIEW/REVISE MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	09/11/2018	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	CONFERENCE WITH PMR REGARDING HOW SUNOCO CALCULATES INTEREST
1658.0001	09/12/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH DREW AND PAULA ABOUT UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	09/13/2018	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	REVIEW PRODUCTION FOR [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/19/2018	JAR	700.00	7.00	4,900.00	TRAVEL TO HOUSTON; REVIEW WARREN DEPOSITION; MEET WITH DREW PATE
1658.0001	09/19/2018	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION IN HOUSTON
1658.0001	09/20/2018	JAR	700.00	18.50	12,950.00	REVIEW WARREN DEPOSITION; MEET WITH DREW PATE; ATTEND DEPOSITION OF ERIC KOELLER; TRAVEL HOME
1658.0001	09/24/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TEAM TO DISCUSS DISCOVERY STRATEGY
1658.0001	09/28/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS DISCOVERY EFFORTS AND MOTION TO COMPEL WITH PAT AND PAULA
1658.0001	10/03/2018	JAR	700.00	5.60	3,920.00	REVIEW/REVISE BRIEFING ON MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	10/04/2018	JAR	700.00	5.60	3,920.00	REVIEW/REVISE BRIEFING ON MOTION TO COMPEL AND DISCUSS WITH PAT AND PAULA
1658.0001	10/08/2018	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	DISCUSS HEARING ON MOTION TO COMPEL WITH PAULA
1658.0001	10/08/2018	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH GROUP TO DISCUSS HEARING ON MOTION TO COMPEL AND ADDITIONAL TIME NEED FOR KOELLING DEPOSITION
1658.0001	10/15/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH GROUP TO DISCUSS DISCOVERY EFFORTS
1658.0001	10/16/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS DISCOVERY EFFORTS WITH PAT AND PAULA
1658.0001	10/17/2018	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	GOOD FAITH CONFERENCE WITH DAN MCCLURE, MARK CHRISTENSEN, DREW AND PAULA
1658.0001	10/22/2018	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH CO COUNSEL REGARDING UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS; DISCOVERY CUT-OFF AND BRIEFING
1658.0001	10/22/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT AND PAULA REGARDING UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	10/25/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS UPCOMING DEPOSITION OF OAKLEY WITH PAULA
1658.0001	10/26/2018	JAR	700.00	4.50	3,150.00	STUDY DOCUMENTS AND TESTIMONY REGARDING OCC REPORTS AND PREPARE FOR OAKLEY DEPOSITION
1658.0001	10/29/2018	JAR	700.00	7.80	5,460.00	PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION OF TERRY OAKLEY; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	10/29/2018	JAR	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	TRAVEL TO HOUSTON FOR OAKLEY DEPOSITION
1658.0001	10/30/2018	JAR	700.00	5.60	3,920.00	TRAVEL HOME FROM HOUSTON
1658.0001	10/30/2018	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	PREPARE FOR OAKLEY DEPOSITION
1658.0001	10/30/2018	JAR	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	TAKE TERRY OAKLEY DEPOSITION
1658.0001	11/12/2018	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	DISCUSS CLASS CERT BRIEFING WITH TEAM
1658.0001	11/16/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS ISSUES WITH PMR AND PJ
1658.0001	12/03/2018	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TEAM REGARDING LEY REPORT AND BRIEFINGS
1658.0001	12/28/2018	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING UPDATED PAY DATA
1658.0001	01/14/2019	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	DISCUSS UPCOMING DEADLINES WITH CO COUNSEL
1658.0001	01/24/2019	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	MEET WITH LEY REGARDING EXPERT REPORT; DISCUSS WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	01/26/2019	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	REVIEW BARBARA LEY EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	02/04/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH PAT AND PAULA TO DISCUSS BARBARA LEY OPINIONS AND OTHER EXPERT ISSUES
1658.0001	02/04/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	CALL WITH GROUP TO DISCUSS EXPERT REPORTS AND DISCOVERY
1658.0001	02/04/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS EXPERT REPORTS WITH PAULA
1658.0001	02/05/2019	JAR	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	REVIEW THE MISSING DATA AND DISCOVERY AND EXPERT ISSUE; CALL WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	02/07/2019	JAR	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	RESEARCH EXPERT DISCLOSURE ISSUES; DAUBERT AT CLASS CERTIFICATION STAGE; TALK WITH ADAM; REVIEW KOELLY DEPOSITION
1658.0001	02/11/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH GROUP TO DISCUSS PRESENTING EXPERT FOR DEPOSITION

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	02/13/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL AND EMAILS REGARDING LEY DEPOSITION
1658.0001	03/04/2019	JAR	700.00	4.00	2,800.00	PREPARE FOR BARBARA LEY DEPOSITION
1658.0001	03/04/2019	JAR	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION TESTIMONY TO PREPARE FOR BARBARA LEY DEPOSITION
1658.0001	03/05/2019	JAR	700.00	9.10	6,370.00	REVIEW DEPOSITIONS TO PREPARE FOR EXPERTS
1658.0001	03/06/2019	JAR	700.00	8.30	5,810.00	REVIEW DEPOSITIONS TO PREPARE FOR EXPERTS
1658.0001	03/11/2019	JAR	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	MEETING WITH BARBARA LEY TO PREPARE FOR HER DEPOSITION; MULTIPLE EMAILS RE: SAME
1658.0001	03/13/2019	JAR	700.00	4.00	2,800.00	PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION OF BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	03/14/2019	JAR	700.00	8.80	6,160.00	ATTEND DEPOSITION OF BARBARA LEY; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	03/29/2019	JAR	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	REVIEW FILE AND EXPERT DISCLOSURES
1658.0001	04/01/2019	JAR	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	REVIEW EXPERT REPORT OF KRAUSE
1658.0001	04/02/2019	JAR	700.00	4.00	2,800.00	REVIEW KRAUSE REPORT; EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH MCCLURE AND OTHERS REGARDING KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/03/2019	JAR	700.00	7.30	5,110.00	SEARCH FOR AND PREPARE DOCUMENTS AND EXHIBITS FOR KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/04/2019	JAR	700.00	5.00	3,500.00	SEARCH FOR AND PREPARE DOCUMENTS AND EXHIBITS FOR KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/05/2019	JAR	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	SEARCH FOR AND PREPARE DOCUMENTS AND EXHIBITS FOR KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/06/2019	JAR	700.00	5.30	3,710.00	SEARCH FOR AND PREPARE DOCUMENTS AND EXHIBITS FOR KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/07/2019	JAR	700.00	3.00	2,100.00	SEARCH FOR AND PREPARE DOCUMENTS AND EXHIBITS FOR KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/08/2019	JAR	700.00	4.50	3,150.00	PREPARE FOR KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/08/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS STRATEGY ON ██████████ WITH CO COUNSEL
1658.0001	04/08/2019	JAR	700.00	4.50	3,150.00	PREPARE FOR KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/09/2019	JAR	700.00	9.80	6,860.00	PREPARE EXHIBITS FOR KRAUSE DEPOSITION; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN
1658.0001	04/10/2019	JAR	700.00	13.30	9,310.00	TRAVEL TO HOUSTON AND PREPARE FOR KRAUSE DEPOSITION WITH CO-COUNSEL
1658.0001	04/11/2019	JAR	700.00	10.70	7,490.00	DEPOSITION OF KRAUSE AND TRAVEL HOME; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN
1658.0001	04/15/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	CALL WITH GROUP TO DISCUSS ██████████
1658.0001	04/16/2019	JAR	700.00	8.80	6,160.00	WORK THROUGH KRAUSE REPORT AND WORK ON SUPPLEMENTAL REPORT FOR BARBARA LEY; CALLS WITH PAT RYAN
1658.0001	04/17/2019	JAR	700.00	9.30	6,510.00	WORK ON LEY SUPPLEMENTAL REPORT; MULTIPLE CALLS WITH PAT RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	04/22/2019	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	REVIEW KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/22/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS POTENTIAL EXTENSION WITH CO COUNSEL
1658.0001	04/22/2019	JAR	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	WORK ON LEY REBUTTAL REPORT
1658.0001	04/23/2019	JAR	700.00	9.30	6,510.00	WORK ON LEY REBUTTAL REPORT
1658.0001	04/25/2019	JAR	700.00	5.00	3,500.00	REVISE LEY REBUTTAL REPORT
1658.0001	04/26/2019	JAR	700.00	5.00	3,500.00	REVISE LEY REBUTTAL REPORT; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN
1658.0001	04/29/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS REBUTTAL REPORT WITH PAULA
1658.0001	05/01/2019	JAR	700.00	5.00	3,500.00	REVIEW AND REVISE SUPPLEMENTAL EXPERT REPORT; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	05/06/2019	JAR	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	WORK ON REBUTTAL REPORT
1658.0001	05/06/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS CLASS CERT BRIEFINGS WITH TEAM
1658.0001	05/06/2019	JAR	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	WORK ON REBUTTAL REPORT
1658.0001	05/07/2019	JAR	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	MEETING WITH BARBARA LEY TO DISCUSS SUPPLEMENTAL REPORT
1658.0001	05/07/2019	JAR	700.00	4.80	3,360.00	REVIEW AND REVISE SUPPLEMENTAL EXPERT REPORT; CONFERENCE WITH LEY
1658.0001	05/08/2019	JAR	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	REVIEW AND REVISE EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	05/16/2019	JAR	700.00	1.20	840.00	EMAIL TO BARBARA RE REPORT; CONFERENCE WITH LEY RE REPORT; CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	05/21/2019	JAR	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	DISCUSS REPORT WITH BARBARA AND PAULA; WORK ON EDITS
1658.0001	06/03/2019	JAR	700.00	1.20	840.00	DISCUSS CLASS CERT BRIEFING WITH PAT AND PAULA; REVIEW TESTIMONY
1658.0001	06/05/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH PAT REGARDING TESTIMONY FOR CLASS BRIEF
1658.0001	06/07/2019	JAR	700.00	6.50	4,550.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS FOR CLASS CERT BRIEF
1658.0001	06/10/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS CASE WITH CO COUNSEL

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	06/10/2019	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	REVIEW DEPOSITIONS FOR CLASS CERT BRIEF
1658.0001	06/10/2019	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	REVIEW DEPOSITIONS FOR CLASS CERT BRIEF
1658.0001	06/10/2019	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	RESEARCH 28 USC SECTION 1746 AND LEY REPORT
1658.0001	06/11/2019	JAR	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS FOR CLASS CERT BRIEF
1658.0001	06/12/2019	JAR	700.00	3.00	2,100.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION TESTIMONY FOR CLASS CERT BRIEF; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	06/13/2019	JAR	700.00	8.30	5,810.00	REVIEW AND REVISE CLASS CERT BRIEF
1658.0001	06/14/2019	JAR	700.00	5.30	3,710.00	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	06/19/2019	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	REVIEW AND REVISE BARBARA'S RESPONSE TO MCLURE QUESTIONS
1658.0001	07/18/2019	JAR	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	RESEARCH CASES AND ORDERS ISSUED BY JUDGE GIBNEY
1658.0001	07/22/2019	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	DISCUSS UPCOMING DEADLINES WITH CO-COUNSEL
1658.0001	08/08/2019	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS
1658.0001	08/09/2019	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	REVIEW MTD RE JURISDICTION; DISCUSS WITH PAT RYAN
1658.0001	08/09/2019	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	MEETING WITH PAT AND PAULA TO DISCUSS IMPENDING MOTIONS THREATENED BY DAN M
1658.0001	08/12/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	P/C WITH GROUP RE CLASS CERT BRIEFING
1658.0001	08/14/2019	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	REVIEW EXPERT REPORTS AND REVISE 5TH AND 6TH DISCOVERY REQUEST TO SUNOCO
1658.0001	08/15/2019	JAR	700.00	5.00	3,500.00	REVIEW DEF. MOTION TO STRIKE AND RESPONSE TO CLAIM CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	08/16/2019	JAR	700.00	4.80	3,360.00	REVIEW FILINGS AND KRAUSE TRANSCRIPT
1658.0001	08/16/2019	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	PREPARE FOR CALL WITH DREW ON SUNOCO DISCOVERY ISSUE
1658.0001	08/19/2019	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	REVIEW MOTION FILED BY SONOCO
1658.0001	08/19/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS DISCOVERY REQUEST WITH PAULA AND REVIEW KRAUSE DEPO FOR ██████████
1658.0001	08/19/2019	JAR	700.00	0.60	420.00	P/C WITH PMR RE RESPONSE TO MOTION
1658.0001	08/20/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	P/C WITH LEY RE DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/20/2019	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	P/C WITH DREW, PAT AND PAULA RE 6TH SET OF DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/21/2019	JAR	700.00	2.60	1,820.00	DRAFT/REVISE AND FINALIZE DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/21/2019	JAR	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	REVIEW/REVISE RESPONSE TO JURISDICTION MOTION
1658.0001	08/21/2019	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	REVIEW/ REVISE WRITTEN DISCOVERY TO SUNOCO
1658.0001	08/23/2019	JAR	700.00	8.00	5,600.00	RESEARCH OTHER STATES THAT HAVE SI LAWS
1658.0001	08/26/2019	JAR	700.00	9.30	6,510.00	RESEARCH OTHER NO EXCUSE SI STATES; REVIEW AFFIDAVITS ATTACHED TO SONOCO'S MOTION; REVIEW DOCS PRODUCED BY SONOCO RELATED TO THE ISOS HOG WELL
1658.0001	08/27/2019	JAR	700.00	8.00	5,600.00	REVIEW BRIEFING AND LOOK AT SONOCO DOCS
1658.0001	08/28/2019	JAR	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION FOR BRIEFS; RESEARCH LAW, REVIEW AND REVISE CLASS CERT BRIEFING AND RESPONSE TO MOTION TO STRIKE LEY
1658.0001	08/28/2019	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	REVIEW AND REVISE CLASS CERT BRIEFING
1658.0001	09/11/2019	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	READ REPLY AND SW REPLY AND APPLICATION TO FILE SW REPLY; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	09/18/2019	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	MEET AND CONFERENCE WITH DEFENDANT'S COUNSEL
1658.0001	09/18/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	MEETING WITH PAULA RE GOOD FAITH CONFERENCE
1658.0001	09/23/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS UPCOMING DEADLINE WITH PAT AND PAULA
1658.0001	09/30/2019	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	DISCUSS ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY WITH GROUP
1658.0001	09/30/2019	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	DISCUSS MSJ POTENTIALS WITH PAT AND PAULA
1658.0001	10/03/2019	JAR	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	REVIEW MULTIPLE ORDER AND OPINION FROM THE JUDGE AND EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH CO COUNSEL
1658.0001	10/14/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	PHONE CALL WITH GROUP RE UPCOMING DEADLINES AND DIVISION OF LABOR
1658.0001	10/15/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	REVIEW BRIEFING ON MOTION TO STAY
1658.0001	10/16/2019	JAR	700.00	4.00	2,800.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED AND WORK ON EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	10/16/2019	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED AND DRAFT EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	10/17/2019	JAR	700.00	6.50	4,550.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED AND DRAFT EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	10/18/2019	JAR	700.00	4.00	2,800.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED AND DRAFT EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	10/21/2019	JAR	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED AND WORK ON EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	10/21/2019	JAR	700.00	5.60	3,920.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED AND WORK ON EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	10/22/2019	JAR	700.00	5.30	3,710.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED AND WORK ON EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	10/22/2019	JAR	700.00	3.00	2,100.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED AND WORK ON EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	10/23/2019	JAR	700.00	1.20	840.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED AND DRAFT EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	10/23/2019	JAR	700.00	7.50	5,250.00	REVIEW DOCS PRODUCED BY SUNOCO AND DRAFT EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	10/23/2019	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	RESEARCH WHEREABOUTS OF ERIC KOELLEY
1658.0001	10/24/2019	JAR	700.00	10.50	7,350.00	REVIEW DOCS PRODUCED AND PREPARE EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	10/25/2019	JAR	700.00	3.50	2,450.00	REVIEW DOCS AND PREPARE EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	10/27/2019	JAR	700.00	8.30	5,810.00	DRAFT/REVISE EXHIBIT LIST

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	11/04/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	CALL WITH GROUP RE UPCOMING DEADLINES
1658.0001	11/04/2019	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	PREPARE WITNESS LIST
1658.0001	11/04/2019	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	P/C W/ PAT, BRAD, DREW, PAULA AND TROY ABOUT MEDIATION STRATEGY
1658.0001	11/04/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	P/C W/ PAT AND PAULA TO DISCUSS MEDIATION STRATEGY
1658.0001	11/04/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DRAFT WITNESS LIST
1658.0001	11/06/2019	JAR	700.00	11.50	8,050.00	TRAVEL TO AUSTIN; PREPARE FOR MEDIATION
1658.0001	11/06/2019	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	PREPARE FOR MEDIATION
1658.0001	11/07/2019	JAR	700.00	17.00	11,900.00	ATTEND MEDIATION AND TRAVEL HOME
1658.0001	11/08/2019	JAR	700.00	10.80	7,560.00	REVIEW DOCS; REVIEW/REVISE EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	11/10/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	P/C W/ PAT RE TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	11/11/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	P/C W/ CO-COUNSEL RE [REDACTED]
1658.0001	11/12/2019	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	P/C W/ PAT AND TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	11/13/2019	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	REVIEW 10TH CIRCUIT RULING; P/C W/ PMR; TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	11/14/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	P/C W/ PMR RE CALDWELL DOCS
1658.0001	11/15/2019	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	ANALYZE THINGS TO DO TO PREPARE FOR TRIAL
1658.0001	11/16/2019	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE BRIEF ON ESCHEAT
1658.0001	11/17/2019	JAR	700.00	3.50	2,450.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S BRIEF ON THE ESCHEAT ISSUE; REVIEW EMAILS AND MAKE NOTES OF ISSUE TO RESPOND TO
1658.0001	11/18/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DISCUSS BRIEFING W/ PAULA
1658.0001	11/18/2019	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	P/C W/ BRAD AND DREW RE RESPONSE BRIEF AND TRIAL SCHEDULE
1658.0001	11/18/2019	JAR	700.00	3.50	2,450.00	DRIVE TO HENNESSEY TO GET PERRY [REDACTED]
1658.0001	11/18/2019	JAR	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	REVIEW DOCS FOR ESCHEAT ISSUE AND WORK ON CALDWELL AFFIDAVIT
1658.0001	11/19/2019	JAR	700.00	6.30	4,410.00	REVIEW/REVISE RESPONSE BRIEF
1658.0001	11/20/2019	JAR	700.00	5.00	3,500.00	COUNTER DEPO DESIGNATION OF KOELLING
1658.0001	11/21/2019	JAR	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	WORK ON COUNTER DESIGNATION OF DEPOSITION; MULTIPLE P/C W/ PMR
1658.0001	11/21/2019	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	WORK ON DEPOSITION DESIGNATION
1658.0001	11/22/2019	JAR	700.00	5.50	3,850.00	SUMMARIZE DEFENDANT'S EXHIBITS 181-208
1658.0001	11/23/2019	JAR	700.00	6.50	4,550.00	SUMMARIZE DEFENDANT'S TRIAL EXHIBITS
1658.0001	11/24/2019	JAR	700.00	3.30	2,310.00	SUMMARIZE DEFENDANT'S TRIAL EXHIBITS
1658.0001	11/25/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	DRAFT DEPO DESIGNATION OBJECTION
1658.0001	11/25/2019	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	HEARING ON DEFENDANT'S MOTION TO RECONSIDER
1658.0001	11/25/2019	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	POST HEARING PHONE CALL WITH CO-COUNSEL
1658.0001	11/25/2019	JAR	700.00	3.50	2,450.00	REVIEW EMAIL FROM DEFENDANT'S COUNSEL RE DESIGNATION OBJECTION; REVIEW LOCAL RULES; DRAFT OBJECTION TO DEPOSITION DESIGNATION
1658.0001	11/25/2019	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	DRAFT OBJECTION TO DEPO DESIGNATION
1658.0001	11/26/2019	JAR	700.00	10.00	7,000.00	WORK ON PRETRIAL FILINGS AND SUBMISSIONS
1658.0001	11/27/2019	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	REVIEW ORDER
1658.0001	12/02/2019	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	P/C W/ BRAD, PAT, AND DREW RE TRIAL STRATEGY
1658.0001	12/02/2019	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	CONFERENCE W/ PAT AND PAULA RE TRIAL BRIEFS AND TRIAL STRATEGY
1658.0001	12/03/2019	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	RESEARCH ATTORNEY FILL ISSUE
1658.0001	12/03/2019	JAR	700.00	4.00	2,800.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE PUNITIVE DAMAGES AND NO EXCUSE PRSA
1658.0001	12/03/2019	JAR	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	PREPARE EXCERPT OF WALKER
1658.0001	12/04/2019	JAR	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/04/2019	JAR	700.00	4.30	3,010.00	TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/05/2019	JAR	700.00	9.50	6,650.00	TRIAL PREP AND PUNITIVE DAMAGE RESEARCH
1658.0001	12/06/2019	JAR	700.00	7.80	5,460.00	TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/06/2019	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	REVIEW AN OFFER TO STRIKE AND MOTION RE BURDEN
1658.0001	12/06/2019	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	ATTEND HEARING ON PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT
1658.0001	12/07/2019	JAR	700.00	6.50	4,550.00	TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/09/2019	JAR	700.00	10.30	7,210.00	TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/10/2019	JAR	700.00	7.60	5,320.00	TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/11/2019	JAR	700.00	8.50	5,950.00	TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/11/2019	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	PRETRIAL HEARING
1658.0001	12/12/2019	JAR	700.00	7.20	5,040.00	TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/13/2019	JAR	700.00	7.00	4,900.00	TRIAL EXHIBITS AND TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/13/2019	JAR	700.00	3.50	2,450.00	PREP FOR MEETING WITH P. WALKER AND MEET WITH P. WALKER TO PREPARE FOR TRIAL
1658.0001	12/13/2019	JAR	700.00	4.00	2,800.00	MEET WITH PERRY TO PREPARE FOR TRIAL
1658.0001	12/14/2019	JAR	700.00	8.00	5,600.00	TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/15/2019	JAR	700.00	13.50	9,450.00	TRAVEL TO MUSKOGEE AND PREPARE FOR TRIAL
1658.0001	12/16/2019	JAR	700.00	15.80	11,060.00	TRIAL AND TRIAL PREP

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	12/17/2019	JAR	700.00	15.50	10,850.00	TRIAL AND TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/18/2019	JAR	700.00	16.00	11,200.00	TRIAL AND TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	12/19/2019	JAR	700.00	8.80	6,160.00	TRIAL AND TRAVEL HOME
1658.0001	01/03/2020	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	DISCUSS FINDINGS OF FACT WITH PAULA
1658.0001	01/06/2020	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	CALL W/ CO-COUNSEL RE DRAFTING AND DISCOVERY OF FACTS AND CONCLUSION OF LAW
1658.0001	01/15/2020	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	P/C W/ JUDGE GIBNEY RE SCHEDULING ISSUE
1658.0001	01/22/2020	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	DISCUSS W/ GROUP FFCLS
1658.0001	02/16/2020	JAR	700.00	3.00	2,100.00	REVIEW FOFCOL
1658.0001	02/17/2020	JAR	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	REVIEW EMAILS RE FOFCK; TALK EXTENSIVELY WITH PAT AND PAULA RE SAME; REVIEW REDLINE CHANGES TO FOFCK MADE BY MULTIPLE CO COUNSEL
1658.0001	02/17/2020	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	PHONE CALL WITH PAT AND PAULA RE FOFCK
1658.0001	02/24/2020	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	CALL W CO COUNSEL RE FOFCOL AND BRIEFING
1658.0001	02/25/2020	JAR	700.00	5.00	3,500.00	REVIEW SUNOCO'S FOFCOL
1658.0001	02/26/2020	JAR	700.00	8.80	6,160.00	REVIEW/REVISE SUNOCO'S FOFCOL AND PART TRIAL BRIEF; REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S PART TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	02/27/2020	JAR	700.00	6.30	4,410.00	REVIEW/REVISE MULTIPLE VERSIONS OF OUR RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S POST TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	03/01/2020	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	REVIEW SUNOCO'S RESPONSE TO PLF'S POST-TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	05/05/2020	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	REVIEW RESPONSE TO SUPPLEMENTAL AUTHORITY AND EMAILS RE SAME
1658.0001	05/14/2020	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	REVIEW SUNOCO'S REPLY RE NEW AUTHORITY
1658.0001	06/17/2020	JAR	700.00	4.80	3,360.00	LISTEN TO CLOSING ARGUMENTS; CONSULT WITH CO-COUNSEL
1658.0001	08/17/2020	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	REVIEW OPINION AND ORDER AND DISCUSS WITH CO-COUNSEL
1658.0001	08/24/2020	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	REVIEW NOTICE OF INTEREST AND EXHIBITS
1658.0001	08/25/2020	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	REVIEW SUNOCO NOTICE, COURT ORDERS AND DISCUSS WITH COUNSEL
1658.0001	08/26/2020	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	REVIEW FILING AND DISCUSS WITH CO-COUNSEL
1658.0001	08/27/2020	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING RE INTEREST
1658.0001	09/01/2020	JAR	700.00	8.30	5,810.00	Review Judgment and Opinion; consider and research Appellate issues; Research and consider [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/03/2020	JAR	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	Research [REDACTED]; discuss with Paula
1658.0001	09/08/2020	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	Review final Opinion and review and revise Motion regarding distribution; review joint Motion to Stay Proceedings on attorney fee issue; discuss [REDACTED] issue with Paula
1658.0001	09/08/2020	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Personal conference with co-counsel regarding Motion on Distribution
1658.0001	09/23/2020	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	Review Sunoco's Response to Plaintiff's Plan of Distribution; discuss with Pat and Paula
1658.0001	09/25/2020	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Conference with Pat and Paula regarding recent filings
1658.0001	09/26/2020	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	Review and study Sunoco's Motion for New Trial and Motion to Alter and Amend the Judgment
1658.0001	09/28/2020	JAR	700.00	0.70	490.00	Review Reply regarding proposed Plan of Distribution of Damages award and related events from co-counsel
1658.0001	09/28/2020	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Discuss Reply regarding proposed Plan of Distribution with Pat and Paula
1658.0001	10/01/2020	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Review Sunoco Motion for Sur-reply; Proposed Sur-reply; Plaintiff's response to Motion for Sur-reply
1658.0001	10/19/2020	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Reviewed Plaintiff's and Sunoco's brief and Plan of Allocation of Distribution; discuss with Pat
1658.0001	12/09/2020	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review Judge Gibney's Opinion and Order regarding new trial
1658.0001	02/08/2021	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Review state court dismissal and call Judge Olsen
1658.0001	10/04/2021	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Personal conference with Pat and Paula re: potential settlement
1658.0001	11/03/2021	JAR	700.00	3.30	2,310.00	Research Attorney Fee Application issues; personal conference with Pat and Paula to discuss the same
1658.0001	12/03/2021	JAR	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	Review Order; research attorney fee issues; exchange and review e-mails from co-counsel
1658.0001	12/03/2021	JAR	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	Review detailed correspondence from Beckworth; call with group re:execution; research execution
1658.0001	12/04/2021	JAR	700.00	6.20	4,340.00	Research re: execution and hearing on assets
1658.0001	12/05/2021	JAR	700.00	3.50	2,450.00	Research on execution and hearing on assets
1658.0001	12/06/2021	JAR	700.00	6.20	4,340.00	Research execution and hearing on assets; call with co-counsel re: execution and Fee application issues; exchange e-mails and calls re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	12/07/2021	JAR	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	Review/revise Memo on Execution and Asset hearing
1658.0001	12/07/2021	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Review correspondence and memos about execution

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	12/08/2021	JAR	700.00	4.20	2,940.00	Review execution research; research supercedance issues and rule 62(f)
1658.0001	12/20/2021	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review no execution offer from Sunoco; talk strategy with co-counsel
1658.0001	01/03/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Discuss plan for upcoming filings with co-counsel
1658.0001	01/10/2022	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Review and discuss two district court filings with co-counsel
1658.0001	01/11/2022	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review Judge Gibney's Order re: HOA
1658.0001	02/03/2022	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Review and exchange e-mails with co-counsel re: next steps and analysis of where we are; Review draft Notice and Order to Court
1658.0001	02/04/2022	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	Call with Patrick Ryan and Paula Jantzen re: [REDACTED]; Exchange e-mails with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	02/04/2022	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Review and exchange e-mails with counsel re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/08/2022	JAR	700.00	1.40	980.00	Call with co-counsel re: execution; attorney fee application; experts for fees. etc.
1658.0001	02/08/2022	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Conference with Patrick Ryan re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/10/2022	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Personal conference with Patrick Ryan and Paula Jantzen re: execution assignments
1658.0001	02/10/2022	JAR	700.00	3.20	2,240.00	Search for LP property in Oklahoma
1658.0001	02/16/2022	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Review Motion to Enjoin Enforcement
1658.0001	02/21/2022	JAR	700.00	7.00	4,900.00	Review time records in general; separate time for appeal related work for Jason Ryan, Patrick Ryan and JoAnn Mickle; telephone conference with Patrick Ryan re: same; personal conference with co-counsel re: response briefs to be filed this week; review multiple e-mails re: strategy of execution; review draft Motion To Strike
1658.0001	02/22/2022	JAR	700.00	0.60	420.00	Review and revise Response Brief re: production of documents for Hearing on Assets and proposed Order
1658.0001	02/22/2022	JAR	700.00	5.80	4,060.00	Review and revise multiple versions of Response Brief re: document production for Hearing on Assets; review and exchange e-mails re: same; review Sunoco's Application for Extension of Time to file Petition for Writ of Certiorari; gather documents for [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/23/2022	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Personal conference with Paula re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/23/2022	JAR	700.00	2.60	1,820.00	Research [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/28/2022	JAR	700.00	0.90	630.00	Personal conference with team re: Fee application
1658.0001	02/28/2022	JAR	700.00	0.60	420.00	Conference with Paula Jantzen re: Fee application
1658.0001	02/28/2022	JAR	700.00	1.60	1,120.00	Review law on [REDACTED]
1658.0001	03/01/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review/revise Patrick Ryan's Declaration of Fees
1658.0001	03/01/2022	JAR	700.00	0.70	490.00	Research law on Fee Application
1658.0001	03/02/2022	JAR	700.00	7.30	5,110.00	Research [REDACTED]; call with Beckworth; review multiple e-mails re: same
1658.0001	03/03/2022	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Review Class Representative's Motion to Strike
1658.0001	03/07/2022	JAR	700.00	0.70	490.00	Review/Revise Motion for Statutory Fees; Motion to Approve Notice and proposed Notice; e-mails to group re: same
1658.0001	03/08/2022	JAR	700.00	1.40	980.00	Review multiple Sunoco briefs filed March 7th
1658.0001	03/08/2022	JAR	700.00	1.20	840.00	Review/revise Reply to Motion to Strike; e-mails to/from team re: same
1658.0001	03/09/2022	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Review Reply to Motion to Strike
1658.0001	03/21/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Personal conference with co-counsel re: upcoming hearing
1658.0001	03/28/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Conference with co-counsel re: upcoming hearing
1658.0001	03/31/2022	JAR	700.00	1.40	980.00	Review file, exhibits and transcripts for how Sunoco [REDACTED]; (This was to help prepare for hearing)
1658.0001	03/31/2022	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	Attend Hearing on Motion to Modify Judgment and Motion for Injunction; discuss results with co-counsel
1658.0001	04/04/2022	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Personal conference with co-counsel re: last weeks hearing and appellate issues
1658.0001	04/05/2022	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	Personal conference with Drew re: deadline to contact Magistrate Judge re: Settlement conference
1658.0001	04/05/2022	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	Personal conference with Pat and Paula re: Appeal and upcoming Settlement conference
1658.0001	04/06/2022	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	E-mails with Drew re: Settlement conference issues
1658.0001	04/11/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Personal conference with c-counsel re: scheduling and planning for

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
						Settlement conference
1658.0001	04/13/2022	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Conference with Paula re: Settlement conference logistics
1658.0001	04/13/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Personal conference with Paula re: upcoming Settlement conference
1658.0001	04/18/2022	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Personal conference with co-counsel re: upcoming mediation
1658.0001	04/25/2022	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	Conference with co-counsel re: upcoming Settlement conference
1658.0001	04/28/2022	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	Review/revise Mediation Brief; Personal conference and e-mails with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	04/28/2022	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Telephone conference with co-counsel re: Mediation Brief
1658.0001	04/29/2022	JAR	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	Review Petition for Cert and discuss [REDACTED] with co-counsel
1658.0001	05/10/2022	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Discuss upcoming mediation with Pat and Paula
1658.0001	05/11/2022	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	Prep for mediation
1658.0001	05/12/2022	JAR	700.00	8.00	5,600.00	Travel to Austin and meet with co-counsel to prepare for Mediation
1658.0001	05/12/2022	JAR	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	Prep for mediation
1658.0001	05/13/2022	JAR	700.00	10.30	7,210.00	Attend Mediation and travel home from Austin
1658.0001	05/25/2022	JAR	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	Attend Mediation
1658.0001	06/14/2022	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Review Court Order re: Supplemental briefing and discuss with Paula
1658.0001	07/12/2022	JAR	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	Review Motions for Responses due this week; conference with Paula re: same; personal conference with Drew re: same
1658.0001	07/14/2022	JAR	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	Talk with Paula; review pleadings re: execution; review research re: execution
1658.0001	07/15/2022	JAR	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	Search for assets to execute on
1658.0001	07/18/2022	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Conference with Paula re: execution; research execution issues and filing Statement of Judgment; exchange e-mails re: same with co-counsel
1658.0001	07/20/2022	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	Research re: execution; draft Statements of Judgment; prepare for filings in three (3) counties
1658.0001	08/08/2022	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Review research and do additional research on execution and Rule 60
1658.0001	08/22/2022	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Review and respond to e-mail from Emily re: Notice of Judgment filing
1658.0001	08/27/2022	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Review e-mails and talk with team about execution
1658.0001	09/07/2022	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	Phone call with co-counsel to discuss upcoming HOA and execution
1658.0001	09/07/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Sunoco's Response to Class Representative's Notice
1658.0001	09/08/2022	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Conference with Paula re: Application to Stay HOA and upcoming HOA
1658.0001	09/09/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review additional documents produced by Sunoco for HOA
1658.0001	09/13/2022	JAR	700.00	0.60	420.00	Conference with Paula re: HOA; Review court minutes
1658.0001	09/27/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Sunoco's Sur-Reply to Plaintiff's draft report and recommendation
1658.0001	10/06/2022	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	Prepare Garnishment, Summons and Affidavit for service
1658.0001	10/06/2022	JAR	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	Serve Garnishment Summons
1658.0001	10/11/2022	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review Sunoco's emergency Motion to deposit funds and discuss with Pat
1658.0001	10/12/2022	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Review plaintiff's Response to Sunoco's Emergency Motion and discuss with Pat
1658.0001	10/13/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Sunoco's Reply to Emergency Motion
1658.0001	10/14/2022	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Review Sunoco's verified Answers to garnishment Summons
1658.0001	10/25/2022	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Telephonic hearing on Sunoco's Motion to Deposit Funds
1658.0001	11/02/2022	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Personal conference with Drew, Pat, and Paula re: collection efforts and strategy
1658.0001	12/01/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Personal conference with Drew re: hearing and agreement with defense counsel
1658.0001	12/20/2022	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Personal conference with Drew re: upcoming briefing issues and the CLA; Work on CLA issues
1658.0001	12/20/2022	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Personal conference with Perry re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	01/06/2023	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Review Court Order and talk with co-counsel re: CCA, Fees and Notice to the Class
1658.0001	01/07/2023	JAR	700.00	3.30	2,310.00	Review [REDACTED]
1658.0001	01/08/2023	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Call with Perry re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	01/08/2023	JAR	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	Work on CCA issues
1658.0001	01/09/2023	JAR	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	Meeting with Paula re: CA; Multiple calls with Perry and Drew re: CCA; Analyze CCA issues for Notice
1658.0001	01/12/2023	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Personal conference with co-counsel re: Tenth Circuit Order for Oral

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
						Argument
1658.0001	01/18/2023	JAR	700.00	4.30	3,010.00	Review the trial testimony of Paul Walker and draft affidavit
1658.0001	01/19/2023	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Revise Affidavit for Paul Walker
Subtotal for Timekeeper JAR			Billable	1,063.10	744,170.00	Jason A. Ryan
1658.0001	06/14/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: PETITION AGAINST SUNOCO ET AL
1658.0001	06/15/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS RE: PLAINTIFF'S CLAIMS AGAINST SUNOCO ET AL
1658.0001	06/30/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: REVISIONS TO FINAL DRAFT PETITION; REVIEW AND FINALIZE PETITION
1658.0001	07/27/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: DISCOVERY AGAINST SUNOCO DEFENDANTS; REVIEW DRAFT DISCOVERY
1658.0001	07/28/2017	PMJ	700.00	1.00	700.00	REVISE FIRST SET OF REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION, REQUESTS FOR ADMISSION, AND INTERROGATORIES
1658.0001	08/06/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: PREVAILING PARTY STATUS UNDER PRSA
1658.0001	08/07/2017	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: PREVAILING PARTY STATUS UNDER STATUTE AND WITHIN CONTEXT OF CLASS ACTIONS
1658.0001	08/08/2017	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: PRSA CLAIMS, REMEDIES, FEE SHIFTING, AND PREVAILING PARTY STATUS
1658.0001	08/15/2017	PMJ	700.00	1.00	700.00	REVIEW SUNOCO NOTICE OF REMOVAL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	08/28/2017	PMJ	700.00	1.60	1,120.00	REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR RULE 26 CONFERENCE WITH DEFENDANTS; PARTICIPATE IN RULE 26 CONFERENCE; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	08/31/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: CASE ASSESSMENT AND STRATEGY
1658.0001	09/20/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: CASE ASSESSMENT AND STRATEGY
1658.0001	09/26/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: CASE ASSESSMENT AND STRATEGY
1658.0001	09/27/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	REVIEW ORDER SETTING STATUS AND SCHEDULING CONFERENCE; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME
1658.0001	10/02/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: CASE STATUS AND STRATEGY
1658.0001	10/03/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	REVIEW NOTICE OF REMOVAL RE: JURISDICTIONAL ALLEGATIONS
1658.0001	10/06/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: JOINT STATUS REPORT AND PREPARATIONS FOR SCHEDULING CONFERENCE; REVIEW DRAFT JOINT STATUS REPORT
1658.0001	10/09/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: CASE STATUS, COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL, AND PREPARATION FOR SCHEDULING CONFERENCE WITH COURT
1658.0001	10/11/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	REVIEW MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: REVISIONS TO JOINT STATUS REPORT AND PREPARATIONS FOR SCHEDULING CONFERENCE WITH COURT
1658.0001	10/12/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	REVIEW MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: JOINT STATUS REPORT AND PROPOSED SCHEDULE; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SCHEDULING CONFERENCE WITH THE COURT AND REQUIRED FOLLOW-UP WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL
1658.0001	10/18/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S RESPONSES TO PLAINTIFF'S FIRST SET OF WRITTEN DISCOVERY; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	10/23/2017	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS RE: COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL ON PROPOSED SCHEDULE, NOTICE TO COURT RE: SAME, AND SUBMISSION OF PLAINTIFF'S PROPOSED SCHEDULE TO COURT
1658.0001	10/25/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	REVIEW SCHEDULING ORDER ISSUED BY COURT; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME
1658.0001	10/30/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: CASE STATUS AND DISCOVERY
1658.0001	11/06/2017	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT PROPOSED PROTECTIVE ORDER; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	11/21/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	E-MAILS RE: MEET AND CONFER ON DEFENDANT'S OBJECTIONS AND RESPONSES TO PLAINTIFF'S DISCOVERY REQUESTS; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: CASE STATUS AND ACTIVITY
1658.0001	11/27/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS RE: MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANT REGARDING RESPONSES TO PLAINTIFF'S DISCOVERY

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	11/28/2017	PMJ	700.00	2.70	1,890.00	REQUESTS REVIEW E-MAILS RE: DEFENDANT'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND EFFORTS TO SET MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANT'S COUNSEL; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S FIRST SET OF DISCOVERY TO PLAINTIFF; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVIEW RECENT OKLAHOMA COURT OF CIVIL APPEALS DECISION RE: CLASS ACTION CERTIFICATION ISSUES
1658.0001	12/01/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO DEFENDANT'S FIRST SET OF DISCOVERY REQUESTS
1658.0001	12/04/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANT REGARDING DISCOVERY RESPONSES
1658.0001	12/05/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: DEFENDANT'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND ASSOCIATED MEET AND CONFER CONFERENCE
1658.0001	12/06/2017	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	E-MAILS RE: MEET AND CONFER TO DISCUSS DEFENDANT'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES
1658.0001	12/13/2017	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF DISCOVERY
1658.0001	12/14/2017	PMJ	700.00	1.70	1,190.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH MR. CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: DISCOVERY RESPONSES; DRAFT PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO DEFENDANT'S DISCOVERY REQUESTS
1658.0001	12/15/2017	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	DRAFT PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION AND INTERROGATORIES; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL AND PLAINTIFF RE: SAME
1658.0001	12/17/2017	PMJ	700.00	4.90	3,430.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES/ANSWERS TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS AND INTERROGATORIES; REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED IN RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY REQUESTS
1658.0001	12/18/2017	PMJ	700.00	3.70	2,590.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING PERRY CLINE'S ANSWERS/OBJECTIONS TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF INTERROGATORIES; IDENTIFY DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED IN RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	12/19/2017	PMJ	700.00	2.70	1,890.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE; CONTINUE DRAFTING MR. CLINE'S ANSWERS/RESPONSES/OBJECTIONS TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF DISCOVERY REQUESTS; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S PAYMENT TO PERRY CLINE RE: PAYMENT OF INTEREST OWING UNDER THE PRODUCTION REVENUE STANDARDS ACT; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	12/20/2017	PMJ	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF INTERROGATORIES AND REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; REVIEW E-MAILS RE: CHECKS DEFENDANTS' SENT TO MR. CLINE AND PUTATIVE CLASS MEMBERS RE: OFFER TO PAY STATUTORY INTEREST OWING TO THEM
1658.0001	12/21/2017	PMJ	700.00	5.50	3,850.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES AND OBJECTIONS TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF INTERROGATORIES AND REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; [REDACTED]; REVIEW/IDENTIFY DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED IN RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEFENDANTS' OFFER TO PAY PERRY CLINE AND PUTATIVE CLASS MEMBERS STATUTORY INTEREST OWING ON THEIR ACCOUNTS; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS RE: MOTION TO BE DECLARED INTERIM CLASS COUSEL; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT MOTION TO APPOINT INTERIM CLASS COUNSEL
1658.0001	12/22/2017	PMJ	700.00	3.10	2,170.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES AND OBJECTIONS TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF INTERROGATORIES AND REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO BE APPOINTED INTERIM CLASS COUNSEL
1658.0001	12/29/2017	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	WORK ON PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY REQUESTS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: MOTION FOR INTERIM COUNSEL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	12/30/2017	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING/REVISING PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS AND INTERROGATORIES
1658.0001	01/02/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING/REVISING PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO DEFENDANTS' REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION AND ANSWERS TO DEFENDANTS' INTERROGATORIES
1658.0001	01/03/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS RE: PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF DISCOVERY; REVIEW REVISIONS TO SAME
1658.0001	01/04/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.30	910.00	REVIEW PROPOSED REVISIONS TO PERRY CLINE'S RESPONSES TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF DISCOVERY; COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME
1658.0001	01/05/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.10	2,170.00	IDENTIFY FINAL DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION IN RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION; FINALIZE PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES AND ANSWERS TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF DISCOVERY
1658.0001	01/16/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	E-MAILS RE: COMMENTS ON DRAFT 30(B)(6) NOTICE TO DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	01/17/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: SAME; REVIEW PAYMENT INFORMATION SENT TO PERRY CLINE
1658.0001	01/18/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.60	1,120.00	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: CHECKS DEFENDANTS SENT TO PERRY CLINE AND THE GWEN CLINE TRUST; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED] [REDACTED];
1658.0001	01/19/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	E-MAILS RE: RULE 30(B)(6) DEPOSITIONS OF DEFENDANT AND ASSOCIATED DOCUMENT PRODUCTION ISSUES IN RESPONSE TO DISCOVERY
1658.0001	01/20/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	REVIEW PAYMENT RECORDS FROM PERRY CLINE; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL RE: SAME; E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: CORRESPONDENCE TO DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	01/22/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.60	1,120.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL RE: DISCOVERY AND RECENT CHECKS SENT TO PERRY CLINE AND THE GWEN CLINE TRUST; COMMUNICATIONS RE: RULE 30(B)(6) DEPOSITIONS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLIENT RE: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]
1658.0001	01/25/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL RE: PLAINTIFF'S REQUEST FOR DEFENDANTS TO CONFIRM DECEMBER 22 CHECKS WERE NOT AN ATTEMPT TO PAY FOR STATUTORY INTEREST OWED TO PLAINTIFF; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE TO PLAINTIFF'S LETTER REGARDING SAME; MULTIPLE FOLLOW-UP E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	01/29/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	REVIEW E-MAILS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE
1658.0001	01/30/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLIENT AND CO-COUNSEL RE: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/02/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEFENDANTS' RE: SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	02/09/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM CLIENT TO IDENTIFY MATERIALS THAT ARE RESPONSIVE TO DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY REQUESTS; REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR PRIVILEGE; REVIEW TERMS OF THE PARTIES' AGREED PROTECTIVE ORDER RE: IDENTIFY INFORMATION PROTECTED AS CONFIDENTIAL; E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	02/12/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	REVIEW MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' FIRST SET OF RFPS; [REDACTED]; FINALIZE DOCUMENTS TO BE PROVIDED IN SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION; E-MAILS WITH DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	02/15/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEPOSITION OF SUNOCO EMPLOYEE ALICE HOLLAND

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	03/05/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: STATUS OF PLAINTIFF'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES TO DEFENDANT'S FIRST SET OF REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION AND DEPOSITIONS OF DEFENDANT'S EMPLOYEES
1658.0001	03/07/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	REVIEW STATUS OF DISCOVERY; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND CASE ASSESSMENT/STATUS OF VARIOUS LITIGATION ACTIVITIES
1658.0001	03/08/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: STANDARD OF CARE/ACTIVITIES REQUIRED FOR DEFENDANT TO DEMONSTRATE DUE DILIGENCE IN LOCATING OWNERS LEGALLY ENTITLED TO PAYMENT OF ROYALTY ; POSSIBLE DEPOSITION IN SUPPORT OF PRSA COMPLIANCE ISSUES
1658.0001	03/09/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S FIRST AND SECOND PRODUCTIONS OF DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S DISCOVERY REQUESTS; TELECONFERENCE WITH DANIEL MCCLURE, COUNSEL FOR DEFENDANT, RE: SAME AND INQUIRIES REGARDING ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS THAT MAY BE RESPONSIVE TO DEFENDANT'S DISCOVERY REQUESTS; E-MAIL WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLIENT
1658.0001	03/12/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: FOLLOW-UP DISCOVERY TO ADDRESS ISSUES RAISED IN DEPOSITION OF ALICE HOLLAND; REVIEW MATERIALS FROM DEPOSITION OF ALICE HOLLAND
1658.0001	03/13/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.60	2,520.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: OKLAHOMA LAW ON UNCLAIMED PROPERTY REPORTING REQUIREMENTS FOR NON-POOLED WELLS AND WELLS SUBJECT TO CORPORATION COMMISSION POOLING ORDERS; LEGAL REVIEW STATE LAND OFFICE REPORTS RE: STATUTORY INTEREST OWED TO THE STATE PURSUANT TO THE PRSA; REVIEW MATERIALS IN SUPPORT OF DEPOSITION OF ALICE HOLLAND, DIVISION ORDER ANALYST FOR DEFENDANT; DRAFT PROPOSED QUESTIONS FOR HOLLAND DEPOSITION; MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; RESEARCH OKLAHOMA OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUIREMENTS
1658.0001	03/15/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH IN SUPPORT OF OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUESTS TO STATE LAND OFFICE, CORPORATION COMMISSION, AND STATE TREASURER; MULTIPLE E-MAILS AND TELECONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND ROBERT BARNES RE: SAME
1658.0001	03/16/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	ANALYZE BRIEFING ON CLASS CERTIFICATION IN OKLAHOMA AND ASSOCIATED EXPERT REPORTS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	03/20/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	REVIEW EXPERT REPORT PREPARED BY ERIC KRAUSE, APPLIED ECONOMICS, RE: CLASS CERTIFICATION ISSUES ASSOCIATED WITH PRSA CLAIMS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND [REDACTED]
1658.0001	03/22/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; PARTICIPATE IN GROUP CALL WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: REVISED DISCOVERY TO DEFENDANT
1658.0001	03/26/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND CASE MANAGEMENT ISSUES; FOLLOW-UP ON OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUESTS
1658.0001	03/30/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	ANALYZE [REDACTED]
1658.0001	04/02/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	PARTICIPATE IN EXTENDED TELECONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: CASE STATUS AND BRIEFING/DISCOVERY ACTIVITIES; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH THE OKLAHOMA COMMISSIONERS OF THE LAND OFFICE AND THE OKLAHOMA CORPORATION COMMISSION RE: FOLLOW-UP FROM OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUESTS; REVIEW MATERIALS RELATED TO OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUESTS AND STATUTORY SUPPORT FOR REQUESTS
1658.0001	04/03/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CORPORATION COMMISSION AND STATE LAND OFFICE RE: OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUESTS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND AMENDMENTS TO ORIGINAL REQUESTS; REVIEW [REDACTED]

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	04/05/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	██████████; COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME REVIEW MINERAL OWNERS ESCROW ACCOUNT INFORMATION PRODUCED BY THE OKLAHOMA CORPORATION COMMISSION IN RESPONSE TO OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUEST; MULTIPLE TELECONFERENCES WITH PERRY CLINE RE: ██████████ ██████████ ██████████
1658.0001	04/06/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: ██████████ ██████████; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND GENERAL STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND ELECTRONIC DOCUMENTS/SEARCH TERMS
1658.0001	04/07/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	REVIEW INFORMATION RELATED TO GASTAR EXPLORATION AND SUNOCO RE: RECENT CHECKS ISSUED TO PERRY CLINE AND THE GWEN CLINE TRUST; REVIEW MCCLURE'S APRIL 4, 2018 LETTER RE: DISCOVERY DISPUTE RELATING TO ESI AND RULE 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION NOTICE; MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND PREPARATIONS FOR RULE 37 CONFERENCE WITH DEFENDANTS; DRAFT LIST OF ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY SEARCH TERMS
1658.0001	04/10/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.40	3,080.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES IN PREPARATION FOR RULE 37 CONFERENCE WITH DEFENDANT'S COUNSEL; PARTICIPATE IN RULE 37 CONFERENCE WITH DEFENDANT'S COUNSEL; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE AND PAT RYAN RE: STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND FOLLOW-UP FROM RULE 37 CONFERENCE; DRAFT LIST OF ESI SEARCH TERMS FOR SUBMISSION TO DEFENDANT'S; TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: DRAFTING RULE 37 LETTER TO FOLLOW-UP ON CONFERENCE WITH DEFENDANTS; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: DURATION OF RULE 30(B)(6) CORPORATE DESIGNEE DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	04/11/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.60	1,120.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: ██████████ ██████████ ██████████; DEVELOP LIST OF ESI SEARCH TERMS FOR SUBMISSION TO DEFENDANTS AS FOLLOW-UP TO MONDAY'S RULE 37 CONFERENCE WITH DEFENDANT'S COUNSEL;
1658.0001	04/12/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	04/13/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	REVIEW/RESPOND TO MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEFENDANT'S RESPONSES TO PLAINTIFF'S DISCOVERY REQUESTS
1658.0001	04/16/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH DAN MCCLURE, COUNSEL FOR SUNOCO, RE: ESI SEARCH TERMS AND PRODUCTION ISSUES AND STATUS OF DEFENDANT'S EFFORT TO IDENTIFY DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO PLAINTIFF'S DISCOVERY REQUESTS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND SCHEDULING ISSUES
1658.0001	04/18/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: ██████████; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: STATUS OF DEFENDANT'S RESPONSES TO PLAINTIFF'S DISCOVERY REQUESTS
1658.0001	04/23/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: ASSESSMENT OF CHECKS FROM GASSTAR AND POTENTIAL CONNECTION TO SUNOCO; ██████████ ██████████
1658.0001	04/26/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.60	1,120.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: STATUS OF EFFORTS TO SECURE ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY FROM DEFENDANT AND ADDITIONAL COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENDANT REGARDING THE ADEQUACY OF DEFENDANT'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES
1658.0001	04/27/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: STATUS OF CASE; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S RESPONSE TO ESI SEARCH TERM REQUEST; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE AND PAT RYAN RE: SAME AND ██████████
1658.0001	04/30/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND OTHER CO-COUNSEL RE: SUPPLEMENTAL DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO DEFENDANT
1658.0001	05/02/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: ██████████ ██████████; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO DEFENDANT AND ██████████ ██████████
1658.0001	05/02/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	REVIEW EXCHANGES OF LETTERS BETWEEN PAT RYAN AND DANIEL MCCLURE RE: DEFENDANT'S RESPONSES TO PLAINTIFF'S

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001						DISCOVERY REQUESTS; REVIEW MCCLURE RESPONSE TO PLAINTIFF'S REQUEST FOR DEFENDANT TO USE PLAINTIFF'S PROPOSED LIST OF ESI SEARCH TERMS; DRAFT RESPONSE TO SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: SAME
1658.0001	05/03/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: RULE 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION OF DEFENDANTS AND STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND POSSIBLE RULE 37 CONFERENCE IN PREPARATION FOR MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	05/04/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUEST COMMUNICATIONS WITH STATE LAND OFFICE RE: LATE PAYMENTS AND INTEREST PAID BY DEFENDANTS; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: STATUS OF DISCOVERY
1658.0001	05/08/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH STATE AGENCIES RE: OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUESTS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEFENDANTS' DOCUMENT PRODUCTION
1658.0001	05/09/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' RECENT DOCUMENT PRODUCTION; COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME
1658.0001	05/14/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS RE: ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY ISSUES AND DEVELOPMENT OF ESI SEARCH TERMS; E-MAILS WITH DANIEL MCCLURE, COUNSEL FOR DEFENDANTS, RE: DISCOVERY AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DOCUMENT PRODUCTION
1658.0001	05/14/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: STATUS OF CASE AND ASSESSEMENT OF CLASS CERTIFICATION ISSUES
1658.0001	05/15/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.60	1,820.00	REVIEW MATERIALS PRODUCED BY THE OCC IN RESPONSE TO OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUEST AND DRAFT UPDATED/REVISED SUPPLEMENTAL REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS; CALLS AND COMMUNICATIONS TO PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' DOCUMENT PRODUCTION, COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL, AND REQUESTS TO DEPOSE CERTAIN EMPLOYEES OF DEFENDANT
1658.0001	05/16/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.70	2,590.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CORPORATION COMMISSION RE: OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUEST; REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY DEFENDANTS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DISCOVERY AND CASE MANAGEMENT ISSUES; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENDANTS RE: DEPOSITION OF PERRY CLINE; [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENDANTS RE: FORM OF FUTURE PRODUCTIONS OF DOCUMENTS AND ASSOCIATED ESI ISSUES
1658.0001	05/17/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.70	1,890.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION NOTICE FOR PERRY CLINE; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITION AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION/REVIEW ISSUES; E-MAILS WITH DEFENDANTS RE: ESI AND DISCOVERY; LOCATE FORMER SUNOCO EMPLOYEES FOR POSSIBLE DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	05/18/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: DEFENDANTS' PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, PLAINTIFF'S REQUEST FOR DEFENDANTS TO SUPPLEMENT DISCOVERY RESPONSES, AND DEPOSITIONS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: DISCOVERY ISSUES AND REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	05/21/2018	PMJ	700.00	5.90	4,130.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AT THE OKLAHOMA CORPORATION COMMISSION RE: DEFENDANTS' ANNUAL SUBMISSIONS/FILINGS TO THE MINERAL OWNERS ESCROW FUND; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: ANALYSIS OF SAME AND STATUS OF DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO MULTIPLE E-MAILS BETWEEN CO-COUNSEL AND TO/FROM MCCLURE RE: DEFENDANTS' DEFICIENT DISCOVERY RESPONSES; EFFORTS TO LOCATE FORMER SUNOCO EMPLOYEES FOR POSSIBLE INTERVIEWS/DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	05/22/2018	PMJ	700.00	6.10	4,270.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING DEFENDANTS' PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; REVIEW E-MAILS FROM DAN MCCLURE RE: ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY ISSUES; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE FROM PAT RYAN TO DAN MCCLURE RE: GENERAL DISCOVERY ISSUES; REVIEW FEDERAL RULES ON

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
						ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY; REVIEW E-MAIL FROM DREW PATE AND MCCLURE RE: SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS FROM DEFENDANTS AND REQUEST FOR MODIFIED PRODUCTION FORMAT FROM PERRY CLINE; DRAFT E-MAIL TO MCCLURE RE: ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY ISSUES; REVIEW MATERIALS PRODUCED BY OKLAHOMA CORPORATION COMMISSION IN RESPONSE TO OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUEST
1658.0001	05/23/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	E-MAILS WITH DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL RE: ESI DISCOVERY ISSUES; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL
1658.0001	05/25/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.30	910.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING DEFENDANTS' PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENT; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND ANNA JANTZEN RE: SAME
1658.0001	05/29/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	DRAFT E-MAIL TO DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL RE: ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY ISSUES; REVIEW E-MAILS AND CONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEADLINES IN CASE AND STATUS OF DISCOVERY; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' PRODUCTION OF ESI
1658.0001	05/30/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.30	2,310.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH MCCLURE RE: DISCOVERY ISSUES; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEPOSITION OF PERRY CLINE; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: DISCOVERY ISSUES AND AMENDED SCHEDULE; DRAFT E-MAIL TO MCCLURE RE: ESI AND DOCUMENT CUSTODIAN ISSUES; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	05/31/2018	PMJ	700.00	7.80	5,460.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR MEETING WITH PERRY CLINE; CONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE [REDACTED]; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: SUPPLEMENTAL DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO DEFENDANTS; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS SENT TO DEFENDANTS; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; DRAFT MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; DRAFT E-MAILS TO DEFENDANTS RE: REQUEST FOR DEFENDANTS TO PROVIDE A PRIVILEGE LOG
1658.0001	06/01/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.30	2,310.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' REVISED PROPOSED LIST OF ESI SEARCH TERMS; DRAFT E-MAIL TO DEFENDANTS RE: AGREEMENT TO ESI SEARCH TERMS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/02/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS AND CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN THE PARTIES' COUNSEL
1658.0001	06/03/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER
1658.0001	06/04/2018	PMJ	700.00	6.30	4,410.00	REVIEW PROPOSED REVISIONS TO MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; REVISE AND FINALIZE MOTION; IDENTIFY AND FINALIZE EXHIBITS TO BE FILED IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; E-MAILS AND CONFERENCES RE: MOTION TO AMEND; CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY, JASON RYAN, AND PAT RYAN RE: ANALYSIS OF ACCOUNTING AND PAYMENT INFORMATION PROVIDED BY SUNOCO
1658.0001	06/05/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.60	2,520.00	REVIEW INFORMATION RELATED TO DEFENDANT'S PAYMENTS TO OWNERS; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: REVIEW OF DEFENDANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/06/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION AND REVIEW OF RECORD MATERIALS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DAN MCCLURE RE: E-DISCOVERY ISSUES; REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY DEFENDANT
1658.0001	06/07/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.90	2,730.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR MEETING WITH PERRY CLINE TO PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION; MEET WITH PERRY CLINE, PAT RYAN, AND DREW PATE TO PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION OF PERRY CLINE; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DOCUMENT PRODUCTION; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO MULTIPLE E-MAILS FROM DAN MCCLURE RE: DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	06/08/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.70	1,890.00	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: DEFENDANT'S REQUEST FOR DOCUMENTS IN ADVANCE OF DEPOSITION OF PERRY CLINE; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ANALYZE DEFENDANT'S

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	06/10/2018	PMJ	700.00	5.50	3,850.00	ASSERTED AUTHORITY IN SUPPORT OF REQUEST TO PRODUCE FEE RETENTION AGREEMENT WITH PERRY CLINE; COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME
1658.0001	06/11/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.90	2,730.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ANALYZE CASE LAW PROVIDED BY DEFENDANTS IN ADVANCE OF DEPOSITION OF PERRY CLINE; CONDUCT ADDITIONAL LEGAL RESEARCH ON VARIOUS DISCOVERY ISSUES; REVIEW AND DRAFT RESPONSES TO MULTIPLE E-MAILS FROM DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL, DAN MCCLURE REGARDING VARIOUS DISCOVERY ISSUES; TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME AND PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITION OF PERRY CLINE
1658.0001	06/12/2018	PMJ	700.00	7.20	5,040.00	REVIEW MATERIALS FOR PREPARATION OF PERRY CLINE FOR DEPOSITON; MEET WITH PERRY CLINE; DRAFT E-MAIL RESPONSE TO DAN MCCLURE RE: ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: CLINE DEPOSITION, ADDITIONAL DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FROM DEFENDANTS, AND DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	06/13/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	MEET WITH PERRY CLINE TO PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION; ATTEND DEPOSITION OF PERRY CLINE; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: SAME
1658.0001	06/18/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.40	3,080.00	COMMUNICATION WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEFENDANTS' RECENT PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/19/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.10	2,870.00	E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN RE: REVIEW OF SUNOCO'S DOCUMENTS AND STATUS OF DISCOVERY; DRAFT MOTION TO COMPEL; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE TO MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS FOR ALICE HOLLAND AND ERIC KOELLING RE: REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER
1658.0001	06/20/2018	PMJ	700.00	5.80	4,060.00	REVIEW SUNOCO'S DOCUMENTS; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: GOOD CAUSE FOR AMENDING SCHEDULING ORDER; CONTINUE REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; MULTIPLE E-MAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME AND REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; DRAFT REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT FROM ALICE HOLLAND
1658.0001	06/21/2018	PMJ	700.00	5.90	4,130.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME, STATUS OF DISCOVERY, AND REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: DISCOVERY RULES AND OBLIGATIONS OF PARTY ASSERTING OBJECTIONS TO REQUESTED DISCOVERY; TELECONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: MOTION TO ADDRESS DEFENDANTS' FAILURE TO PRODUCE A PRIVILEGE LOG OR TO COMPLY WITH RULE 34(B)(2)(C); DRAFT MOTION TO ADDRESS DEFENDANTS' DEFICIENT DISCOVERY RESPONSES
1658.0001	06/22/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.60	3,220.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENDANTS RE: DISCOVERY ISSUES; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR MOTION TO DECLARE DEFENDANTS HAVE WAIVED PRIVILEGE; TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: SAME; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME AND ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES; DRAFT MOTION TO DECLARE DEFENDANTS HAVE WAIVED PRIVILEGE
1658.0001	06/23/2018	PMJ	700.00	6.10	4,270.00	MULTIPLE CONFERNCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: MOTION TO STRIKE DEFENDANTS' PRIVILEGE LOG AND DECLARE WAIVER AND REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO STRIKE PRIVILEGE LOG; ANALYZE DEFENDANTS' PRIVILGE LOG AND ASSOCIATED DOCUMENTS CONTAINED ON LOG; DRAFT MOTION TO STRIKE AND MOTION TO DECLARE WAIVER
1658.0001	06/23/2018	PMJ	700.00	6.10	4,270.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' PRIVILEGE LOG AND ASSOCIATED DOCUMENTS TO DETERMINE WHETHER DEFENDANTS ARE IN

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	06/24/2018	PMJ	700.00	5.80	4,060.00	COMPLIANCE WITH FEDERAL RULES; DRAFT MOTION TO STRIKE DEFENDANTS' PRIVILEGE LOG AND TO DECLARE DEFENDANTS HAVE WAIVED PRIVILEGE; E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME CONTINUE REVIEWING DEFENDANTS' PRIVILEGE LOG TO IDENTIFY DEFICIENCIES AND ERRORS; DRAFT MOTION TO STRIKE DEFENDANTS' PRIVILEGE LOG AND TO DECLARE DEFENDANTS HAVE WAIVED THEIR PRIVILEGE CLAIMS
1658.0001	06/25/2018	PMJ	700.00	7.70	5,390.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION TO STRIKE DEFENDANTS' PRIVILEGE LOG AND TO DECLARE DEFENDANTS HAVE WAIVED THEIR PRIVILEGE CLAIMS; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS AND CONFERENCES WITH CO-COUNSEL RE; SAME; IDENTIFY EXHIBITS FOR MOTION TO STRIKE
1658.0001	06/26/2018	PMJ	700.00	7.40	5,180.00	MULTIPLE CONFERENCES AND E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO STRIKE DEFENDANTS' PRIVILEGE LOG AND TO DECLARE DEFENDANTS HAVE WAIVED PRIVILEGE; REVISE AND FINALIZE MOTION AND ASSOCIATED EXHIBITS; BEGIN DRAFT REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER
1658.0001	06/27/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.40	3,080.00	MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: REVIEW OF SUNOCO DOCUMENTS, COURT ORDERS RELATING TO MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER AND MOTION TO STRIKE PRIVILEGE LOG; REVISE MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE DOCUMENTS UNDER SEAL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS RE: PREPARATIONS FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE PRIVILEGE LOG; REVIEW E-MAILS TO DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL RE: CLARIFICATION OF CERTAIN MATERIALS PRODUCED IN RESPONSE TO PLAINTIFF'S REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: IDENTIFY SUNOCO EMPLOYEES FOR DEPOSITION AND IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	06/28/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.70	3,290.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES; E-MAILS WITH COUNSEL FOR DEFENDANTS RE: MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE DOCUMENTS UNDER SEAL; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' REQUEST TO VACATE HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE; CONFERENCES AND E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVIEW DRAFT RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO VACATE HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME AND COURT ORDER DIRECTING PLAINTIFF TO FILE SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEFING ON COMPLIANCE WITH LOCAL RULES; FINALIZE MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE DOCUMENTS UNDER SEAL; DRAFT BRIEF RE: COMPLIANCE WITH LOCAL RULES; REVIEW/COMMENT ON E-MAILS WITH DAN MCCLURE RE: PRIVILEGE LOG AND MEET AND CONFER EFFORTS
1658.0001	06/29/2018	PMJ	700.00	5.60	3,920.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SUPPLEMENTAL MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANTS REGARDING PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES AND MOTION TO STRIKE; PARTICIPATE IN SUPPLEMENTAL MEET AND CONFER WITH MARK CHRISTIANSEN AND DAN MCCLURE; REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE; REVIEW REVISED MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	07/01/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO STRIKE DEFENDANTS' PRIVILEGE LOG
1658.0001	07/02/2018	PMJ	700.00	5.80	4,060.00	DRAFT CERTIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO STRIKE DEFENDANTS' PRIVILEGE LOG; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME; MULTIPLE E-MAILS AND CONFERENCES RE: MOTION TO COMPEL DEFENDANTS TO COMPLY WITH DISCOVERY OBLIGATIONS
1658.0001	07/03/2018	PMJ	700.00	6.90	4,830.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MULTIPLE DRAFTS OF CERTIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE IN RESPONSE TO MINUTE ORDER RELATED TO MOTION TO STRIKE DEFENDANTS' PRIVILEGE LOG; TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: SAME; MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; FINALIZE CERTIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE AND ASSOCIATED EXHIBITS IN SUPPORT; TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: MOTION TO COMPEL DEFENDANTS TO COMPLY WITH DISCOVERY OBLIGATIONS; COMMUNICATIONS RE: PREPARATIONS

<u>Client</u>	<u>Trans Date</u>	<u>Tkpr</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours to Bill</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	07/05/2018	PMJ	700.00	6.70	4,690.00	FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE REVIEW AND RESPOND TO MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: MOTION TO COMPEL, PREPARATIONS FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE, REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, AND STATUS OF CASE; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO COMPEL; REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE; REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO COMPEL; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES
1658.0001	07/06/2018	PMJ	700.00	6.70	4,690.00	ADDITIONAL LEGAL RESEARCH IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE; REVIEW/REVISE DRAFT MOTION TO COMPEL AGAINST DEFENDANTS; REVIEW PROPOSED REVISIONS TO MOTION TO COMPEL; REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE; COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN AND PAT RYAN RE: SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS FROM PERRY CLINE AND PROPOSED DEPOSITIONS; ASSESS STATUS OF EXPERT REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' PAYMENT INFORMATION
1658.0001	07/07/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.80	3,360.00	REVIEW CASE LAW AND RECORD MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO STRIKE DEFENDANTS' PRIVILEGE LOG AND TO DECLARE PRIVILEGE WAIVED
1658.0001	07/08/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.40	3,080.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING CASE LAW AND RECORD MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO STRIKE; DRAFT OUTLINE FOR ARGUMENT AT HEARING; MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	07/09/2018	PMJ	700.00	8.70	6,090.00	CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE; TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE; REVIEW MATERIALS AND CONDUCT ADDITIONAL LEGAL RESEARCH IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE; REVISE DEMONSTRATIVES FOR HEARING; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO STRIKE, REVISED PRIVILEGE LOG, AND SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	07/10/2018	PMJ	700.00	8.20	5,740.00	ATTEND HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE DEFENDANTS' PRIVILEGE LOG AND TO DECLARE PRIVILEGE WAIVED; PREPARE PROPOSED LIST OF AREAS OF INQUIRY FOR 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION NOTICE FOR DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY AS GRANTED BY JUDGE SHREDER; E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: SAME
1658.0001	07/11/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.10	2,170.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: FOLLOW-UP FROM HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE, REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS PREVIOUSLY WITHHELD UNDER CLAIM OF PRIVILEGE, REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' AMENDED PRIVILEGE LOG, AND AREAS OF INQUIRY FOR DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY DEPOSITIONS AUTHORIZED BY COURT; REVIEW UPDATED DRAFT OF MOTION TO COMPEL; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: REVISIONS TO SAME AND REQUEST FOR DEFENDANTS TO PARTICIPATE IN MEET AND CONFER ON OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY ISSUES; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: IDENTIFICATION OF ADDITIONAL DEPOSITIONS AND PRODUCTION ISSUES
1658.0001	07/12/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.60	3,220.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' RESPONSES TO PLAINTIFF'S FIRST AND SECOND SET OF DISCOVERY REQUESTS AND IDENTIFY LIST OF DISCUSSION TOPICS FOR MEET AND CONFER IN ADVANCE OF POSSIBLE MOTION TO COMPEL; DRAFT E-MAIL TO DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: SAME; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: MEET AND CONFER ISSUES; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT 30(B)(6) NOTICES TO DEFENDANTS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF COURT ORDER ON PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO STRIKE; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; WORK ON MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	07/13/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: RULE 30(B)(6) NOTICE TO DEFENDANT; REVIEW COURT ORDER GRANTING IN PART/DENYING IN PART DEFENDANT'S MOTION FOR

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	07/16/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.30	910.00	RECONSIDERATION OF ORDER ADDRESSING DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANT; DRAFT LETTER TO DEFENDANT RE: OUTSTANDING CHECK FOLLOW-UP NOTICES SENT TO PERRY CLINE; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	07/17/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.90	1,330.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, DREW PATE, AND COUNSEL FOR DEFENDANTS RE: MEET AND CONFER ON OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY ISSUES; CONFERENCES WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' AMENDED PRIVILEGE LOG AND SUPPLEMENTAL DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS AND IDENTIFICATION OF PERSONS FOR DEPOSITION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: RULE 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION NOTICE TO DEFENANTS ON DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY PER ORDER FROM JUDGE SHREDER; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: STATUS OF DISCOVERY, SUPPLEMENTAL DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FROM PERRY CLINE, ERRATA SHEET FOR CLINE, AND SUPPLEMENTAL DISCOVERY RESPONSES
1658.0001	07/19/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: IDENTIFICATION OF ADDITIONAL DEPOSITIONS; REVIEW MATERIALS PRODUCED BY DEFENDANTS RE: IDENTIFY INDIVIDUALS FOR POSSIBLE DEPOSITION; DRAFT E-MAIL TO DREW PATE AND TREY DUCK RE: SAME
1658.0001	07/21/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.30	910.00	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S UPDATED RULE 30(B)(6) NOTICE TO DEFENDANT; REVIEW MCCLURE LETTER RESPONDING TO PAT RYAN LETTER RE: REQUEST TO CEASE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE AND FOLLOW-UP ON NOTICE OF UNCASHED CHECKS; [REDACTED]
1658.0001	07/23/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS ISSUES
1658.0001	07/24/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL ON DISCOVERY ISSUES; E-MAILS WITH DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL RE: SAME; PARTICIPATE IN EXTENDED MEET AND CONFER CONFERENCE WITH DEFENDANTS' COUSEL; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	07/26/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	DRAFT PROPOSED AGREEMENT FOR THE PARTIES TO ACCEPT SERVICE BY MEANS OF E-MAIL; COMMUNICATIONS RE: FOLLOW-UP FROM MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	07/27/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	E-MAILS RE: SUNOCO'S PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO PLAINTIFF'S SECOND SET OF REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION
1658.0001	07/31/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.20	2,940.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: DEFENDANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION, ASSESSMENT OF DISCOVERY AND POSSIBLE MOTIONS
1658.0001	08/01/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; DRAFT QUESTIONS FOR RULE 30(B)(6) DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY DEPOSITION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: SAME; REVIEW OWNERSHIP INTERESTS RELATED TO SNOWMAN WELL
1658.0001	08/02/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING OUTLINE/QUESTIONS FOR DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY DEPOSITION OF RULE 30(B)(6) WITNESS; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S OBJECTIONS TO RULE 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION NOTICE; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: DEPOSITION; IDENTIFY MATERIALS/POTENTIAL EXHIBITS FOR USE AT DEPOSITION ON DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY ISSUES; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: STATUTE OF LIMITATION ISSUES AND TOLLING ISSUES
1658.0001	08/13/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.50	3,150.00	CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH ON STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS ISSUES; TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: PROVIDE INFORMATION IN SUPPORT OF DESPOSITION OF 30(B)(6) WITNESS ON DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY ISSUES
						REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY SUNOCO RE: IDENTIFY DOCUMENTS FOR DEPOSITIONS OF KATHLEEN KOSKI, KATHY WARREN, DEMI LANCELIN, PATRICIA REDDING, SONJA WIDNER, AND POSSIBLE RE-DEPOSITION OF ALICE HOLLAND AND ERIC KOELLING; REVIEW MATERIALS RE: UPDATED MOTION TO COMPEL IN RESPONSE TO SUNOCO'S AMENDED RESPONSES TO

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	08/16/2018	PMJ	700.00	5.80	4,060.00	PLAINTIFF'S FIRST AND SECOND SETS OF DISCOVERY; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEPOSITION NOTICES AND MOTION TO COMPEL LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS RE: ANALYSIS OF ACCOUNTING DATA PRODUCED BY SUNOCO; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANT'S PAYMENT DATA, MOTION TO COMPEL, ADDITIONAL DEPOSITIONS, AND SETTLEMENT OF SIMILAR CLASS ACTION FOR STATUTORY INTEREST; TELECONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE RE: MOTION TO COMPEL AND DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	08/17/2018	PMJ	700.00	5.60	3,920.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: MOTION TO COMPEL, DEPOSITIONS, ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY DEFENDANTS, DEFICIENCIES IN DEFENDANT'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES, AND ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANT'S ACCOUNTING INFORMATION; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: FIDUCIARY DUTIES, TOLLING DOCTRINES, AND CLASS CERTIFICATION ISSUES; COMMUNICATIONS WITH STATE TREASURER'S OFFICE; E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	08/18/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.60	2,520.00	CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: FIDUCIARY DUTIES AND TOLLING ISSUES
1658.0001	08/19/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: TOLLING ISSUES, FIDUCIARY DUTIES, AND PUNITIVE DAMAGES
1658.0001	08/20/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.70	3,290.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES; DRAFT DEPOSITION NOTICES FOR KATHY WARREN, PATRICIA REDDING, DEMI LANCESLIN, KATHLEEN LOSKI, AND SONJA WIDNER; DRAFT DEPOSITION NOTICE OF CORPORATE REPRESENTATIVE OF DEFENDANTS; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES AND E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITIONS AND MOTION TO COMPEL; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANT; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANT'S AFFIRMATIVE DEFENSES; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: ANALYZE MATERIALS OBTAINED FROM OKLAHOMA CORPORATION COMMISSION
1658.0001	08/21/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.60	2,520.00	CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANT'S ACCOUNTING/PAYMENT DATA; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES AND E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, DREW PATE, AND OTHER CO-COUNSEL RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANT'S PAYMENT INFORMATION, MOTION TO COMPEL, PREPARATIONS FOR MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANT, AND PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITONS OF DEFENDANT AND DEFENDANT'S EMPLOYEES; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S AMENDED PRIVILEGE LOG RE: IDENTIFY DEFECTS; E-MAILS WITH DREW PATE RE: ANALYSIS OF DEPOSITION TESTIMONY FROM ALICE HOLLAND, ERIC KOELLING, AND DEFENDANT'S CORPORATE DESIGNEE ON DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	08/23/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND ROBERT BARNES RE: REVIEW OF ANNUAL REPORTS AND PAYMENTS DEFENDANT MADE TO THE OKLAHOMA CORPORATION COMMISSION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: ASSESSMENT OF DEPOSITION TESTIMONY PROVIDED BY ERIC KOELLING
1658.0001	08/24/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: DEPOSITIONS, DISCOVERY, AND MOTION TO COMPEL; CONFERENCES WITH ANNA JANTZEN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITIONS OF SUNOCO EMPLOYEES AND CORPORATE REPRESENTATIVES; TELECONFERENCE WITH MARK CHRISTIANSEN RE: DISCUSS DEFENDANT'S AMENDED DISCOVERY RESPONSES, PRIVILEGE LOG, AND CORPORATE DESIGNEE ON DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY ISSUES IN PREPARATION FOR MEET AND CONFER; REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY SUNOCO; E-MAILS WITH DREW PATE RE: MEET AND CONFER AND DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0001	08/25/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	ANALYZE PAYMENTS FROM DEFENDANT TO THE MINERAL OWNERS ESCROW FUND AND REPORTS TO THE OKLAHOMA CORPORATION COMMISSION; CREATE TABLE SUMMARIZING

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	08/27/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.20	2,940.00	SAME; E-MAILS TO PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME REVIEW DEFENDANT'S AMENDED RESPONSES TO PLAINTIFF'S FIRST AND SECOND SET OF DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO PREPARE FOR MEET AND CONFER; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S DOCUMENT PRODUCTION RE: SAME; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE RE: MEET AND CONFER; PARTICIPATE IN MEET AND CONFER WITH MARK CHRISTIANSEN, DAN MCCLURE, REBECCA COLE, AND DREW PATE; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENDANT RE: PLAINTIFF'S NOTICED DEPOSITIONS; TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	08/28/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	[REDACTED] CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: FOLLOW-UP FROM MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANT ON DISCOVERY ISSUES AND MOTION TO COMPEL; REVIEW MATERIALS FOR MOTION TO COMPEL; TELECONFERENCE AND MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH DONICE BLAKELY, STATE TREASURER'S OFFICE, RE: UNCLAIMED PROPERTY REPORTING ISSUES
1658.0001	08/29/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.10	2,170.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO COMPEL; CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	08/30/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	WORK ON MOTION TO COMPEL; CONFERNCES WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	08/31/2018	PMJ	700.00	5.80	4,060.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR MOTION TO COMPEL; REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR MOTION TO COMPEL; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: MOTION TO COMPEL AND PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITIONS; TELECONFERENCE AND E-MAILS WITH DREW PATE RE: SAME; CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	09/01/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.80	3,360.00	WORK ON MOTION TO COMPEL; LEGAL RESEARCH IN SUPPORT OF SAME; REVIEW E-MAILS FOR SUPPORT FOR MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	09/02/2018	PMJ	700.00	5.70	3,990.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION TO COMPEL; E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN RE: REVIEW OF COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL REGARDING MEET AND CONFER FOLLOW-UP AND MOTION TO COMPEL; COMMUNICATIONS/E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: FACT WITNESS DEPOSITIONS AND REVISIONS TO RULE 30(B)(6) NOTICE TO DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	09/03/2018	PMJ	700.00	6.70	4,690.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION TO COMPEL; E-MAILS WITH EXPERTS RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANTS' PAY DATA; E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: FACT WITNESS DEPOSITIONS, ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANTS' PAY DATA, DEFENDANTS' DEFECTIVE LITIGATION HOLD;
1658.0001	09/04/2018	PMJ	700.00	6.40	4,480.00	E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: ADDITIONAL MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANTS TO ADDRESS AUSTIN JONES DEPOSITION FAILURES AND DEFECTIVE LITIGATION HOLDS; E-MAILS WITH BARBARA LEY RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANTS' PAY DATA; REVIEW E-MAILS FROM MCCLURE RE: FACT WITNESS DEPOSITIONS; TELECONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM FARR RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANTS' PAY DATA; E-MAILS WITH JASON RYAN RE: ADDITIONAL SET OF INTERROGATORIES TO DEFENDANTS; REVIEW DRAFT OF SAME; CONTINUE WORKING ON MOTION TO COMPEL; E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO DEFENDANTS' SECOND SET OF INTERROGATORIES
1658.0001	09/05/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.70	2,590.00	REVISE DRAFT ANSWERS AND OBJECTIONS RE: DEFENDANTS' SECOND SET OF INTERROGATORIES TO PLAINTIFF; E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: EVIDENTIARY ISSUES ASSOCIATED WITH DAMAGE CALCULATIONS; COMMUNICATIONS RE: AMENDED DEPOSITION NOTICES FOR KATHY WARREN, DEMI LANCESLIN, PATRICIA REDDING, SONJA WIDNER, AND RULE 30(B)(6) NOTICE TO DEFENDANTS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITIONS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PUBLICLY AVAILABLE INFORMATION FROM OCC
1658.0001	09/06/2018	PMJ	700.00	6.70	4,690.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING DEFENDANTS' PRODUCTION TO PREPARE FOR DEPOSITIONS AND IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR MOTION TO

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	Detail Description
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						COMPEL; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION TO COMPEL; MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITIONS OF SUNOCO EMPLOYEES AND NEED TO RE-DEPOSE AUSTIN JONES; REVIEW ERRATA SHEET FROM AUSTIN JONES; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; E-MAILS RE: SCOPE OF PROTECTIVE ORDER; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: PREPARATION FOR MEET AND CONFER
1658.0001	09/07/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.10	2,870.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR MEET AND CONFER; REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR MEET AND CONFER; PARTICIPATE IN MEET AND CONFER TO ADDRESS AUSTIN JONES, LITIGATION HOLD, ETC. ISSUES; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME; REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITIONS; REVISE MOTION TO COMPEL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE RE: EXHIBITS FOR DEPOSITIONS; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: SCOPE OF PERMISSIBLE CHANGES IN DEPOSITION ERRATA SHEET; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEFENDANTS' IMPROPER DESIGNATION OF MATERIALS AS CONFIDENTIAL AND TERMS OF THE PARTIES' PROTECTIVE ORDER; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: DEFENDANTS' PAYMENT OF STATUTORY INTEREST TO THE STATE CLO; REVIEW OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUEST INFORMATION FROM CLO RE: STATUTORY INTEREST PAYMENTS
1658.0001	09/08/2018	PMJ	700.00	6.40	4,480.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT FOR AUSTIN JONES TO IDENTIFY SUPPORT TO RE-DEPOSE HIM; CREATE LIST OF QUESTIONS MR. JONES COULD NOT ANSWER; DRAFT E-MAIL REQUEST TO DEFENSE COUNSEL TO RE-DEPOSE MR. JONES; MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND MOTION TO COMPEL; RESEARCH LITIGATION SOFTWARE USED BY DEFENDANTS TO UNDERSTAND LITIGATION HOLD PROCESS
1658.0001	09/10/2018	PMJ	700.00	8.80	6,160.00	REVISE/FINALIZE MOTION TO COMPEL; E-MAIL EXCHANGES WITH DAN MCCLURE RE: PLAINTIFF'S REQUEST TO REDEPOSE AUSTIN JONES; IDENTIFY EXHIBITS FOR MOTION TO COMPEL; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITIONS OF DEFENDANTS' EMPLOYEES
1658.0001	09/11/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.90	3,430.00	MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: MOTION TO COMPEL AND DEFENDANTS' REQUEST FOR AN EXTENSION OF TIME TO RESPOND; CONFERENCES WITH JOANN MICKLE RE: PREPARATION OF EXHIBITS TO FILE UNDER SEAL; REVIEW SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS FROM DEFENDANTS RE: PATRICIA REDDING LOG OF ACTIVITY; FOLLOW-UP E-MAILS WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: SAME; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITIONS OF PATRICIA REDDING, DEMI LANCESLIN, AND SONJA WIDNER; REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR SAME; PREPARE OUTLINE FOR DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	09/12/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.30	3,010.00	REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITIONS; E-MAILS/CALLS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO COMPEL AND DEFENDANTS' REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL TIME TO RESPOND; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' OBJECTIONS TO CERTAIN RULE 30(B)(6) TOPICS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; TELECONFERENCE WITH EXPERTS RE: ANALYSIS OF SUNOCO PAYMENT/ACCOUNTING DATA
1658.0001	09/13/2018	PMJ	700.00	6.80	4,760.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING DOCUMENTS TO IDENTIFY EXHIBITS FOR DEPOSITIONS OF PATRICIA REDDING, DEMI LANCESLIN, AND SONJA WIDNER; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE RE: ISSUED RAISED DURING DEPOSITION OF KATHY WARREN; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DOCUMENT PRODUCTION TO ADDRESS ISSUES IDENTIFIED DURING WARREN DEPOSITION; CONFERENCES WITH JASON RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	09/14/2018	PMJ	700.00	5.80	4,060.00	IDENTIFY MATERIALS IN SUPPORT OF DEPOSITIONS OF DEMI LANCESLIN AND PATRICIA REDDING; DRAFT/REVISE OUTLINE FOR DEPOSITION; MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: SAME
1658.0001	09/15/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.80	3,360.00	REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITIONS OF PATRICIA REDDING AND DEMI LANCESLIN; REVISE OUTLINE FOR REDDING DEPOSITION
1658.0001	09/16/2018	PMJ	700.00	10.20	7,140.00	TRAVEL TO HOUSTON FOR DEPOSITIONS; REVISE OUTLINE FOR

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	09/17/2018	PMJ	700.00	14.20	9,940.00	REDDING DEPOSITION; REVIEW EXHIBITS/PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION OF PATRICIA REDDING; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: SAME; ATTEND DEPOSITION OF PATRICIA REDDING; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION OF DEMI LANCESLIN
1658.0001	09/18/2018	PMJ	700.00	13.70	9,590.00	REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION OF DEMI LANCESLIN; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: SAME; ATTEND DEPOSITION OF DEMI LANCESIN; RETURN TRAVEL TO OKLAHOMA CITY
1658.0001	09/25/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: HEARING ON MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	09/26/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; REVIEW MATERIALS ASSOCIATED WITH MOTION TO COMPEL AND RECENT DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	09/28/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.25	1,575.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: PENDING MOTION TO COMPEL AND PREPARATIONS FOR HEARING; REVIEW AND REVISE ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO DEFENDANTS; MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL AND DEFENDANTS RE: MOTION TO COMPEL AND DISCOVERY
1658.0001	10/01/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO COMPEL AND DEFENDANTS' REQUEST FOR LEAVE TO FILE EXHIBITS UNDER SEAL; REVIEW E-MAILS FROM DEFENDANTS RE: RESPONSE TO PLAINTIFF'S REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF CALL LOGS; E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	10/02/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.30	2,310.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE TO PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO COMPEL; PREPARE FOR HEARING; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	10/03/2018	PMJ	700.00	6.80	4,760.00	REVIEW CASE LAW CITED IN DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE TO MOTION TO COMPEL; IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO COMPEL; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: PREPARATIONS FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO COMPEL; REVIEW MATERIALS TO PREPARE FOR HEARING
1658.0001	10/04/2018	PMJ	700.00	7.70	5,390.00	PREPARE FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO COMPEL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND POSSIBLE REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	10/05/2018	PMJ	700.00	8.50	5,950.00	PREPARE FOR/ATTEND HEARING ON MOTION TO COMPEL; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; E-MAILS WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: DISPUTE ON DEFENDANTS' DESIGNATION OF AUSTIN JONES DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT AS CONFIDENTIAL
1658.0001	10/08/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	FOLLOW-UP FROM HEARING ON MOTION TO COMPEL; MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL AND DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: DEFENDANTS' DESIGNATION OF AUSTIN JONES DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT AS CONFIDENTIAL; PARTICIPATE IN MEET AND CONFER RE: SAME; REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY DEFENDANTS; TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	10/09/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S MOTION TO DESIGNATE AUSTIN JONES DEPOSITION TESTIMONY AS CONFIDENTIAL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DISCOVERY ISSUES; REVIEW COURT ORDER ON MOTION TO COMPEL; COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME
1658.0001	10/10/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: ORDER ON MOTION TO COMPEL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY AND DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	10/11/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: ADDITIONAL DEPOSITIONS AND DISCOVERY; REVIEW E-MAILS FROM DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: RE-DEPOSITION OF AUSTIN JONES AND PRODUCTION OF ADDITIONAL PAYMENT DATA IN ACCORDANCE WITH COURT ORDER ON MOTION TO COMPEL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: CASE STRATEGY/ANALYSIS

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	10/12/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: DISCOVERY AND DSPOSITIONS; TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; REVIEW UPDATED PRODUCTION FROM DEFENDANT
1658.0001	10/15/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS FROM DEFENDANT, REMAINING DEPOSITIONS, SCHEDULING, AND CLASS CERTIFICATION ISSUES; REWIEV CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEFEDANT RE: DISCOVERY ISSUES; COMMUNICATIONS RE: RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S MOTION TO DESIGNATE AUSTIN JONES TRANSCRIPT AS CONFIDENTIAL; REVIEW DISCOVERY MATERIALS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH MCCLURE RE: MEET AND CONFER
1658.0001	10/16/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.70	2,590.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN, PAT RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: REMAINING DEPOSITIONS, RESPONSE TO MCCLURE LETTER REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL DISCOVERY, AND PREPARATIONS FOR MEET AND CONFER; REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES IN LIGHT OF OF MCCLURE LETTER; TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	10/17/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.60	3,220.00	PREPARE FOR MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANTS RE: OCTOBER 12 CORRESPONDENCE FROM MCCLURE; PARTICIPATE IN EXTENDED MEET AND CONFER CONFERENCE; MULTIPLE FOLLOW-UP EMAILS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL AND CO-COUNSEL RE: DISCOVERY ISSUES AND DEPOSITIONS; DRAFT DEPOSITION NOTICES FOR TERRY OAKLEY AND SECOND 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION ON DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY ISSUES; REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS AND DISCOVERY RESPONSES; TELECONFERNCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	10/18/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.90	2,030.00	MULTIPLE E-MAIL EXCHANGES WITH DEFENDANTS' COUNSEL RE: DISCOVERY AND DEPOSITIONS; E-MAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: SAME; REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS TO IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR RESPONDING TO DEFENDANTS' INQUIRIES/E-MAILS; [REDACTED]; REVISE DEPOSITION NOTICES; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' EXPLANATION OF REDACTIONS FROM RECENT DOCUMENT PRODUCTION
1658.0001	10/19/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.10	2,170.00	MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH DAN MCCLURE RE: DEPOSITIONS OF PERRY CLINE, AUSTIN JONES, TERRY OAKLEY, AND THE SECOND DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY DEPOSITION; TELECONFERENCE AND E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT FOR PERRY CLINE; REVIEW DOCUMENT PROPOSED FOR QUESTIONING BY DEFENDANTS; [REDACTED]; REVIEW MATERIALS ASSOCIATED WITH DEPOSITION OF AUSTIN JONES; RESPOND TO E-MAILS RE: DEPOSITION OF PATRICIA REDDING
1658.0001	10/20/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.30	910.00	REVIEW E-MAILS FROM DEFENANTS RE: SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS AND DEPOSITIONS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO DESIGNATE EXCERPTS FROM AUSTIN JONES DEPOSITION AS CONFIDENTIAL
1658.0001	10/21/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO DESIGNATE AUSTIN JONES DEPOSITION EXCERPTS AS CONFIDENTIAL; E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS AND DISCOVERY RESPONSES TO IDENTIFY ADDITIONAL SUPPORT FOR PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE BRIEF
1658.0001	10/22/2018	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEPOSITIONS, DISCOVERY, AND SCHEDULING ISSUES; E-MAILS WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: DEPOSITIONS; REVIEW MATERIALS FOR SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS BY PLAINTIFF; COMMUNICATIONS RE: REVIEW OF PAYMENT/ACCOUNTING DATA PRODUCED BY DEFENDANTS IN RESPONSE TO COURT ORDER ON PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	10/23/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.70	2,590.00	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: DEPOSITIONS OF TERRY OAKLEY AND CORPORATE DESIGNEE DEPOSITIONS ON DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY; E-MAILS WITH DREW PATE RE: SAME

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						AND EXPERT ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANTS' PAY DATA; REVISE DEPOSITION NOTICES FOR CORPORATE DESIGNEES; REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITIONS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: DEPOSITIONS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; IDENTIFY MATERIALS FOR SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS BY PLAINTIFF; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	10/24/2018	PMJ	700.00	3.90	2,730.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE RE: PREPARATIONS FOR FOLLOW-UP DEPOSITION OF DEFENDANTS' CORPORATE DESIGNEE; IDENTIFY POSSIBLE EXHIBITS FOR DEPOSITION; PREPARE FOR DEPOSITIONS OF TERRY OAKLEY AND AUSTIN JONES; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVIEW AS-FILED RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO DESIGNATE AUSTIN JONES' DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT AS CONFIDENTIAL; REVIEW COURT ORDER ON SAME; REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION OF PERRY CLINE; IDENTIFY POTENTIAL EXHIBITS FOR CLINE DEPOSITION;
1658.0001	10/25/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.50	3,150.00	REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION OF PERRY CLINE; ATTEND DEPOSITION OF PERRY CLINE IN HENNESSY; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLINE AND JASON RYAN; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITIONS OF AUSTIN JONES AND TERRY OAKLEY; REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR JONES AND OAKLEY DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	10/26/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.50	3,150.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO EXTEND DEADLINES IN SCHEDULING ORDER; E-MAILS WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: SAME; IDENTIFY POSSIBLE EXHIBITS FOR DEPOSITIONS OF AUSTIN JONES AND TERRY OAKLEY; CONFERNCES WITH JASON RYAN RE: SAME; PREPARE FOR DEPOSITIONS OF AUSTIN JONES; COMMUNICATIONS WITH EXPERTS RE: DAMAGE CALCULATIONS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' ERRATA SHEETS AND CONFIDENTIAL DESIGNATIONS FOR DEPOSITIONS OF KATHY WARREN, PATRICIA REDDING, AND DEMI LANCESLIN; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' OBJECTIONS TO THE DEPOSITION OF AUSTIN JONES RE: DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY DEPOSITION TOPICS; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	10/27/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.20	2,940.00	REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITIONS OF AUSTIN JONES; PREPARE OUTLINES FOR DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	10/28/2018	PMJ	700.00	7.60	5,320.00	PREPARE FOR DEPOSITIONS OF DEFENDANTS' CORPORATE WITNESS DESIGNEE RE: DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY; TRAVEL TO DALLAS FOR DEPOSITIONS OF AUSTIN JONES; TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: S AME
1658.0001	10/29/2018	PMJ	700.00	12.30	8,610.00	PREPARE FOR DEPOSITIONS OF AUSTIN JONES; TAKE TWO 30(B)(6) DEPOSITIONS RE: DISCOVERY ON DISCOVERY ISSUES; RETURN TRAVEL FROM DALLAS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITION OF TERRY OAKLEY
1658.0001	10/30/2018	PMJ	700.00	4.40	3,080.00	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEFENDANTS RE: OBJECTIONS AND THE CLOSING OF DISCOVERY; REVIEW MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: DEFENDANTS' ADDITIONAL DESIGNATIONS OF DEPOSITOIN TESTIMONY AS CONFIDENTIAL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN AND PAT RYAN RE: DEPOSITION OF TERRY OAKLEY; REVIEW DISCOVERY AND DISCLOSURES; DRAFT PLAINTIFF'S AMENDED DISCLOSURES AND DISCOVERY RESPONSES; E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; DRAFT MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' AMENDED DISCLOSURES
1658.0001	10/31/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; FINALIZE MOTION TO AMEND
1658.0001	11/06/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: DEFENDANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF ACCOUNTING DATA; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEFENDANT RE: SAME
1658.0001	11/07/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	11/09/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001	Cline/Perry					
1658.0001	11/12/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	██████████ COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: ANALYSIS OF PAY DATA AND CERTIFICATION ISSUES
1658.0001	11/14/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH EXPERTS AND CO-COUNSEL RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANT'S PAY DATA AND PREPARATIONS FOR EXPERT REPORT IN SUPPORT OF CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	11/16/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR EXPERT REPORT IN SUPPORT OF CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	11/20/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: ANALYSIS OF SUNOCO'S PAY DATA AND SUNOCO'S OBJECTION TO PRODUCING WELL NUMBER INFORMATION
1658.0001	11/23/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT FOR PERRY CLINE; REVIEW E-MAILS RELATED TO SAME
1658.0001	11/26/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: ██████████ ██████████; E-MAILS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; REVIEW MATERIALS RELATED TO THE DEPOSITIONS OF AUSTIN JONES, DEMI LANCESLIN, AND PATRICIA REDDING
1658.0001	12/03/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND DEVELOPMENT OF EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	12/11/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: REVISED RULE 23 REQUIREMENTS AND STATUS OF EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	12/12/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: EXPERT REPORTS; TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: ██████████
1658.0001	12/13/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: EXPERT REPORTS DUE IN JANUARY
1658.0001	12/14/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: EXPERT REPORTS AND CLASS CERTIFICATION ISSUES
1658.0001	12/18/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	E-MAILS RE: STATUS OF BARBARA LEY'S ANALYSIS OF SUNOCO PAY DATA AND DEVELOPMENT OF EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	12/20/2018	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: ██████████; REVIEW DOCUMENTS SENT BY MR. CLINE
1658.0001	12/26/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	REVIEW MATERIALS SENT BY PERRY CLINE; REVIEW MATERIALS RE: EXPERT REVIEW OF PAY DATA FROM SUNOCO AND NEED FOR REPLACEMENT DATA BECAUSE OF CORRUPT FILES
1658.0001	12/27/2018	PMJ	700.00	1.00	700.00	E-MAILS WITH DREW PATE RE: STATUS OF EFFORTS TO SECURE REPLACEMENT PAY DATA FROM SUNOCO BECAUSE OF CORRUPT FILES AND STATUS OF BARBARA LEY EXPERT REPORT; REVIEW EXPERT ANALYSES OF DEFENDANT'S PAY DATA
1658.0001	01/07/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE AND OTHER CO-COUNSEL RE: STATUS OF EXPERT REVIEW OF REPLACEMENT PAY DATA FROM SUNOCO AND STATUS OF BARBARA LEY EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	01/08/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE RE: STATUS OF EXPERT ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANT'S CORRECTED PAY DATA; E-MAILS WITH DREW PATE AND DAN MCCLURE RE: PAY DATA ISSUES AND MOTION TO EXTEND DEADLINES FOR EXPERT REPORTS
1658.0001	01/10/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH DAN MCCLURE AND DREW PATE RE: MOTION TO EXTEND EXPERT DEADLINES
1658.0001	01/11/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	DRAFT MOTION TO EXTEND EXPERT DEADLINES; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE AND JAMES WARNER RE: SAME; REVIEW/REVISE DRAFT MOTION AND PROPOSED ORDER; E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; FILE MOTION AND SEND PROPOSED ORDER TO COURT
1658.0001	01/14/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	REVIEW COURT ORDER GRANTING MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS RE: EXPERT REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	01/21/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE AND PAT RYAN RE: REVIEW OF DRAFT BARBARA LEY EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	01/22/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: BARBARA LEY EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	01/23/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: BARBARA LEY EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	01/24/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANT'S PAY DATA AND EXPERT REPORT OF BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	01/25/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DRAFT EXPERT REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY; REVIEW E-MAIL FROM DAN MCCLURE RE: SUNOCO REQUEST TO CONTACT GWEN CLINE

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001	Cline/Perry					
1658.0001	01/26/2019	PMJ	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	REGARDING SUSPENDED PAYMENTS REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT EXPERT REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY; REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS TO IDENTIFY ADDITIONAL SUPPORT FOR REPORT; E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	01/27/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	01/28/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.70	1,890.00	MULTIPLE CONFERENCES AND E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: BARBARA LEY EXPERT REPORT; [REDACTED] WORK WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM FARR TO FINALIZE REPORT AND ASSOCIATED EXHIBITS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENDANTS RE: PRODUCTION OF LEY EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	01/30/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: EXPERT REPORT OF BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	02/01/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	REVIEW EMAILS FROM MCCLURE RE: EXPERT DEPOSITIONS AND CONTACT WITH PENNY CLINE; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	02/04/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	REVIEW EMAILS FROM DAN MCCLURE RE: LEY EXPERT REPORT AND DEPOSITION; MULTIPLE FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: SAME; TELECONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: EXPERT ISSUES
1658.0001	02/05/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: ANALYSIS BY BARBARA LEY AND RESPONSE TO MCCLURE ON EXPERT DISCLOSURE ISSUES
1658.0001	02/06/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	EMAILS FROM MCCLURE RE: EXPERT ISSUES; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: EXPERT ISSUES AND DEPOSITION OF BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	02/11/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	REVIEW/RESPOND TO MULTIPLE EMAILS RE: DEFENDANT'S REQUEST TO DEPOSE BARBARA LEY AND REVIEW OF DEFENDANT'S PAY DATA INFORMATION; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME; REVIEW EMAILS FROM DREW PATE RE: SAME
1658.0001	02/12/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND OTHER CO-COUNSEL RE: BARBARA LEY EXPERT REPORT AND DEPOSITION; REVIEW MATERIALS RELATED TO BARBARA LEY'S EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	02/13/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, DREW PATE, JASON RYAN, AND ROBERT BARNES RE: PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITION OF BARBARA LEY; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/14/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.90	1,330.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS RE: DEPOSITION OF BARBARA LEY AND ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANT'S PAY DATA; REVIEW DECISIONS RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/15/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: EXPERT TESTIMONY AT CLASS CERTIFICATION STAGE
1658.0001	02/17/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR DEFENDING SUNOCO'S DEPOSITION OF BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	02/21/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	EMAILS RE: PREPARATIONS TO DEFEND DEPOSITION OF BARBARA LEY; REVIEW LEGAL RESEARCH ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED]
1658.0001	03/01/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: PREPARATIONS FOR DEFENDANT'S DEPOSITION OF BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	03/05/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL AND BARBARA LEY RE: PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION BY SUNOCO
1658.0001	03/07/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN AND ROBERT BARNES RE: MEETING WITH BARBARA LEY AND ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANT'S PAY DATA
1658.0001	03/11/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.60	1,120.00	MEETING WITH BARBARA LEY RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANT'S PAY DATA; EMAILS WITH JASON RYAN AND ROBERT BARNES RE: SAME
1658.0001	03/13/2019	PMJ	700.00	4.60	3,220.00	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DAN MCCLURE RE: REQUEST FOR INFORMATION ASSOCIATED WITH BARBARA LEY'S EXPERT OPINIONS; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL AND BARBARA LEY RE: SAME; REVIEW LISTING OF EXCLUDED OWNERS FROM SUNOCO'S PAY DATA; COMMUNICATIONS WITH BARBARA LEY AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME; MEET WITH BARBARA

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	03/14/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	LEY TO PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH JASON RYAN AND BARBARA LEY RE: PREPARATIONS FOR SUNOCO'S DEPOSITION OF MS. LEY; IDENTIFY MATERIALS IN SUPPORT OF DEFENDING MS. LEY
1658.0001	03/25/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: CLASS CERTIFICATION MOTION AND ANTICIPATED EXPERT REPORT FROM DEFENDANT
1658.0001	04/01/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.90	1,330.00	REVIEW EXPERT REPORT OF ERIC KRAUSE; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	04/01/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.00	0.00	REVIEW EXPERT REPORT OF ERIC KRAUSE
1658.0001	04/02/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: DEPOSITION OF ERIC KRAUSE; MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH JASON RYAN, PAT RYAN, AND ROBERT BARNES RE: SAME
1658.0001	04/03/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN, ROBERT BARNES, AND PAT RYAN RE: DEPOSITION OF ERIC KRAUSE
1658.0001	04/05/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN AND PAT RYAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITION OF ERIC KRAUSE; IDENTIFY MATERIALS TO BE USED AT KRAUSE DEPOSITION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN AND PAT RYAN RE: CLASS CERTIFICATION BRIEFING
1658.0001	04/07/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITION OF ERIC KRAUSE
1658.0001	04/08/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.30	910.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND ROBERT BARNES RE: PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITION OF ERIC KRAUSE; WORK WITH PAT RYAN TO IDENTIFY MATERIALS TO BE USED DURING KRAUSE DEPOSITION; REVIEW MATERIALS PRODUCED IN RESPONSE TO OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUEST TO THE STATE LAND OFFICE
1658.0001	04/09/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND ROBERT BARNES RE: PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITION OF ERIC KRAUSE; IDENTIFY MATERIALS FROM OPEN RECORDS ACT REQUESTS RE: POTENTIAL EXHIBITS FOR KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/10/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	REVIEW EXPERT REPORT OF BARBARA LEY AND PORTIONS OF LEY DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT RE: MISSING INFORMATION FROM DEFENDANT
1658.0001	04/11/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN RE: DEPOSITION OF ERIC KRAUSE; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: POSSIBLE MOTION TO STAY PROCEEDINGS
1658.0001	04/12/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: DEPOSITION OF ERIC KRAUSE AND POSSIBLE MOTION TO STAY
1658.0001	04/15/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND OTHER CO-COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO STAY PROCEEDINGS, EXPERT DEPOSITION ANALYSIS, AND CLASS CERTIFICATION BRIEFING
1658.0001	04/17/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN AND PAT RYAN RE: SUPPLEMENTAL EXPERT REPORT BY BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	04/18/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: REQUEST TO MODIFY SCHEDULING ORDER
1658.0001	04/22/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO STAY PROCEEDINGS AND EXPERT REPORT ISSUES
1658.0001	04/24/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	CONFERENCES WITH JASON RYAN RE: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]
1658.0001	04/25/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO STAY PROCEEDINGS, SUPPLEMENTAL EXPERT REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY, AND CLASS CERTIFICATION BRIEFING; REVIEW KRAUSE MATERIALS
1658.0001	04/26/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.70	1,190.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND DEBRA MAPLE RE: REVIEW OF ERIC KRAUSE REPORT; REVIEW KRAUSE EXPERT MATERIALS; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	04/27/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	REVIEW KRAUSE EXPERT REPORT AND DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT RE: BARBARA LEY'S SUPPLEMENTAL EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	04/28/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: EXPERT TESTIMONY IN SUPPORT OF CLASS CERTIFICATION; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	04/29/2019	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	SUPPLEMENTAL EXPERT REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY CONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL AND SUMMER INTERN RE: STATUS OF CASE, SUPPLEMENTAL EXPERT REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY, AND CLASS CERTIFICATION BRIEFING; CONTINUE REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT SUPPLEMENTAL EXPERT REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	04/30/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	[REDACTED]; FOLLOW-UP COMMENTS ON REVISED DRAFT; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME AND CLASS CERTIFICATION BRIEFING
1658.0001	05/01/2019	PMJ	700.00	3.70	2,590.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT B. LEY REBUTTAL REPORT; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: CLASS CERTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH TY WILSON AND DEREK GILLAND RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	05/02/2019	PMJ	700.00	5.70	3,990.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME AND REVISED SUPPLEMENTAL REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY; CONFERENCE WITH ADAM FARR AND BENJAMIN HUDGENS RE: EXPERT ANALYSIS OF SUNOCO'S PAY DATA AND INFORMATION FOR BARBARA'S SUPPLEMENTAL REPORT; TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; REVIEW REVISED SUPPLEMENTAL REPORT; IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS
1658.0001	05/03/2019	PMJ	700.00	3.70	2,590.00	MEET WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; REVIEW OWNERSHIP RECORDS FOR CLINE AND CLINE TRUST; EMAILS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME; REVIEW EMAILS RE: [REDACTED]; REVIEW UPDATED REBUTTAL REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY; EMAILS WITH ADAM FARR RE: DAMAGE CALCULATIONS BROKEN OUT BY OWNERSHIP TYPE
1658.0001	05/04/2019	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED SUPPLEMENTAL REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY; REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS FROM BARBARA LEY AND ERIC KRAUSE; REVIEW KRAUSE EXPERT REPORT; EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	05/05/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED REBUTTAL REPORT BY BARBARA LEY; REVIEW MATERIALS REFERENCED/CITED IN REBUTTAL REPORT
1658.0001	05/06/2019	PMJ	700.00	5.80	4,060.00	MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: B. LEY REBUTTAL REPORT; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT REPORT; TELECONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND PENDING MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; REVIEW SUNOCO'S RESPONSE TO MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; REVIEW SUNOCO'S AMENDED RESPONSE; REVIEW COURT ORDER GRANTING MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; FOLLOW-UP CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR DRAFTING MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS; EMAILS WITH B. LEY RE: REBUTTAL REPORT
1658.0001	05/07/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY, ADAM FARR, PAT RYAN, AND JASON RYAN RE: REBUTTAL REPORT AND ANALYSIS OF CLASS DAMAGES; FOLLOW-UP CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	05/08/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	REVIEW ANALYSIS OF PAY DATA FROM BARBARA LEY; EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	05/10/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN RE: STATUS OF REBUTTAL REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	05/13/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION BRIEFING
1658.0001	05/16/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH BARBAR LEY AND JASON RYAN RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	05/17/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	REVIEW NOTICE OF CONFIDENTIALITY DESIGNATIONS FOR DEPOSITION OF ERIC KRAUSE
1658.0001	05/21/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED REBUTTAL REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY; CONFERENCES WITH JASON RYAN RE: SAME; EXTENDED TELECONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM FARR RE: SAME; FOLLOW-UP EMAILS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON

<u>Client</u>	<u>Trans Date</u>	<u>Tkpr</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours to Bill</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	05/22/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	RYAN RE: SAME MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND BARBARA LEY RE: BARBARA LEY'S REBUTTAL REPORT AND ASSOCIATED EXHIBITS; REVIEW REVISED REBUTTAL REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	05/23/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	EMAILS WITH JASON RYAN AND PAT RYAN RE: REVISED REBUTTAL REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	05/24/2019	PMJ	700.00	3.10	2,170.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: CLASS CERTIFICATION REQUIRMENTS; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED REBUTTAL REPORT FROM BARBARA LEY; MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH PAT RYAN, BARBARA LEY, AND ADAM FARR RE: SAME
1658.0001	05/25/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	05/29/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: CLASS CERTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS
1658.0001	05/30/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.90	1,330.00	REVIEW EMAIL FROM DAN MCCLURE RE: REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION RELATED TO BARBARA LEY'S REBUTTAL REPORT; REVIEW DRAFT MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	05/31/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	REVIEW MCCLURE EMAIL RE: REQUEST FOR INFORMATION RELATED TO BARBARA LEY REBUTTAL REPORT; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; TELECONFERENCE WITH SUSAN WHATLEY AND PAT RYAN RE: MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH BARBARA LEY RE: SUPPORT FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION MOTION
1658.0001	06/02/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: REQUIREMENTS FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	06/03/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.90	2,030.00	REVIEW MATERIALS RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: SUPPORT FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION BRIEF; REVIEW/COMMENT ON AFFIDAVIT FOR PERRY CLINE RE: SUPPORT FOR MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	06/05/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: REVIEW OF DEPOSITIONS AND PRODUCTION FROM SUNOCO TO IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: SAME
1658.0001	06/07/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION SUMMARIES FROM PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SUPPORT FOR MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; TELECONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY RE: AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	06/09/2019	PMJ	700.00	5.30	3,710.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION FOR CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	06/10/2019	PMJ	700.00	7.60	5,320.00	MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: EVIDENTIARY SUPPORT FOR MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: SAME; DRAFT MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	06/11/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.70	6,090.00	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM DAN MCCLURE RE: BARBARA LEY'S REBUTTAL REPORT; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: MOTION FOR CERTIFICATION; REVIEW RECORD MATERIALS RE: SUPPORT FOR CERTIFICATION MOTION; CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	06/12/2019	PMJ	700.00	7.30	5,110.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	06/13/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.80	6,160.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PROPOSED REVISIONS TO SAME; IDENTIFY EXHIBITS FOR MOTION
1658.0001	06/14/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.30	5,810.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; FINALIZE MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION AND ASSOCIATED EXHIBITS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DAN MCCLURE RE: MOTION TO FILE EXHIBITS UNDER SEAL
1658.0001	06/17/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	EMAILS WITH DAN MCCLURE RE: EXHIBITS TO BE FILED UNDER SEAL AND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION RELATED TO B. LEY'S REBUTTAL EXPERT REPORT; COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. LEY RE: REQUEST FOR INFORMATION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. MICKLE RE: DOCUMENTS TO BE FILED UNDER SEAL AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH THE COURT

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	06/18/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH DAN MCCLURE RE: REQUEST FOR INFORMATION CONTAINED IN BARBARA LEY'S REBUTTAL EXPERT REPORT; EMAILS WITH BARBARA LEY RE: SAME
1658.0001	06/19/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: FILING OF CONFIDENTIAL MATERIALS IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	06/20/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	REVIEW BARBARA LEY DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT RE: ASSESSMENT OF SUPPLEMENTAL INFORMATION REQUESTED BY SUNOCO; COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	06/21/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. LEY AND A. FARR RE: INFORMATION IN RESPONSE TO D. MCCLURE REQUEST FOR INFORMATION RELATED TO FOOTNOTE 2 AND PARAGRAPH 25 IN B. LEY REBUTTAL REPORT; REVIEW RULE 26 REQUIREMENTS FOR REBUTTAL/SUPPLEMENTAL REPORTS
1658.0001	06/24/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH DAN MCCLURE RE: DEFENDANT'S AMENDED INTERROGATORY ANSWERS; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEFENDANT'S AMENDED INTERROGATORY ANSWERS
1658.0001	06/25/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	REVIEW EMAIL FROM DAN MCCLURE RE: SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; REVIEW PRODUCED DOCUMENTS RELATED TO DCP AND PAYMENTS TO PERRY CLINE; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE RE: [REDACTED]
						[REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: B. LEY REBUTTAL REPORT AND BRIEFING DEADLINES IN CERTIFICATION RESPONSE/REPLY
1658.0001	06/26/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: RECENT SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS FROM DEFENDANT
1658.0001	07/01/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	07/03/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	07/19/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: REASSIGNMENT OF CASE TO JUDGE GIBNEY; REVIEW MATERIALS RELATED TO SAME
1658.0001	07/29/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: ASSIGNMENT OF CASE TO JUDGE GIBNEY AND REQUEST TO SET STATUS CONFERENCE WITH COURT; TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	07/30/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S REQUEST FOR LEAVE TO EXCEED PAGE LIMITS FOR RESPONSE TO PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVIEW EMAILS FROM CLERK FOR JUDGE GIBNEY; REVIEW EMAILS FROM DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: CONFERENCE WITH COURT
1658.0001	07/31/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	EMAILS WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO EXCEED PAGE LIMIT FOR RESPONSE BRIEF ON CLASS CERTIFICATION; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S MOTION FOR LEAVE; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT
1658.0001	08/01/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR STATUS CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE GIBNEY
1658.0001	08/02/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: PREPARATIONS FOR STATUS CONFERENCE WITH COURT
1658.0001	08/05/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.90	2,030.00	REVIEW MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION AND CORRESPONDENCE/ORDERS FROM JUDGE GIBNEY RE: PREPARATIONS FOR STATUS CONFERENCE WITH COURT; PARTICIPATE IN STATUS CONFERENCE; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JUDGE BURRAGE, AND DREW PATE RE: SAME; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE AND PAT RYAN RE: [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH BARBARA LEY RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANT'S PAY DATA AND PREPARATIONS FOR REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; REVIEW PRIOR DISCOVERY REQUESTS RE: IDENTIFY ADDITIONAL REQUESTS IN LIGHT OF COURT ORDER AUTHORIZING MERITS DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/06/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: RESEARCH ON

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
						AFFIRMATIVE DEFENSES, CLASS CERTIFICATION, AND EXPERT TESTIMONY IN SUPPORT OF CLASS CERTIFICATION; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	08/07/2019	PMJ	700.00	3.10	2,170.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH DAN MCCLURE RE: PLAINTIFF'S CLAIM OF CONFIDENTIALITY FOR CERTAIN DOCUMENTS AND DEFENDANT'S MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE DOCUMENTS UNDER SEAL IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS; REVIEW COURT'S PRETRIAL ORDER; TELECONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM FARR RE: PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL AND ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY TO DEFENDANTS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' RESPONSES TO PAST DISCOVERY; REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENDANTS RE: SCOPE OF DISCOVERY
1658.0001	08/08/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.80	4,760.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES WITH PAT RYAN; REVIEW PROPOSED NEW RFPs AND INTERROGATORIES TO DEFENDANTS' COMMUNICATIONS WITH BARBARA LEY RE: SAME; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO DISMISS PLAINTIFF'S CLAIMS FOR LACK OF SUBJECT MATTER JURISDICTION; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO DISMISS
1658.0001	08/09/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ASSESSMENT OF AUTHORITY CITED IN DEFENDANT'S MOTION TO DISMISS BASED ON SUBJECT MATTER JURISDICTION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME; EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PRELIMINARY RESEARCH TO SUPPORT PLAINTIFF'S REPLY BRIEF
1658.0001	08/12/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	EMAILS WITH DAN MCCLURE RE: CONFIDENTIAL DOCUMENTS TO BE USED IN DEFENDANT'S RESPONSE TO PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S MOTION TO DISMISS FOR LACK OF SUBJECT MATTER JURISDICTION AND REPLY IN SUPPORT OF CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	08/13/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT; TELECONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE RE: SAME; EMAILS WITH DREW PATE AND JAMES WARNER RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: DRAFT DISCOVERY TO DEFENDANT
1658.0001	08/14/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.10	5,670.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; IDENTIFY LEGAL AUTHORITY TO SUPPORT PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO DEFENDANT'S MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: REVISIONS TO RESPONSE BRIEF AND EXHIBITS TO BE FILED IN SUPPORT; REVISE RESPONSE BRIEF; REVIEW DRAFT DISCOVERY TO SUNOCO; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME AND RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S MOTION TO DISMISS FOR LACK OF SUBJECT MATTER JURISDICTION
1658.0001	08/15/2019	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S MOTION TO EXCLUDE BARBARA LEY AND RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: SAME
1658.0001	08/16/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.50	4,550.00	RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; REVIEW EXPERT MATERIALS RE: CALCULATIONS OF STATUTORY INTEREST; REVISE NEW SET OF DISCOVERY TO DEFENDANTS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' PRIOR DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND COURT ORDER ON MOTION TO COMPEL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH BARBARA LEY RE: ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY REQUESTS; REVIEW MOTION TO EXCLUDE BARBARA LEY; REVIEW RECORD MATERIALS SUBMITTED IN SUPPORT OF DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO CLASS CERTIFICATION MOTION; REVIEW COURT ORDER ON MOTION TO FILE SEALED DOCUMENTS; REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S PRODUCTION AND IDENTIFY DOCUMENTS DESIGNATED AS CONFIDENTIAL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	08/17/2019	PMJ	700.00	4.80	3,360.00	DETAILED REVIEW OF PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR CLASS

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						CERTIFICATION AND DEFENDANT'S RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO CLASS CERTIFICATION; REVIEW AUTHORITIES CITED THEREIN
1658.0001	08/18/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.50	4,550.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING AUTHORITIES CITED IN DEFENDANT'S RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	08/19/2019	PMJ	700.00	7.70	5,390.00	[REDACTED]; PREPARE OUTLINE FOR REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; EMAIL WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO STRIKE BARBARA LEY'S TESTIMONY; REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; AND RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO DISMISS PLAINTIFF'S CLAIMS FOR LACK OF SUBJECT MATTER JURISDICTION; CONTINUE RESEARCH IN SUPPORT OF CLASS CERTIFICATION; REVISE DISCOVERY REQUEST TO DEFENDANTS' REVIEW DEFENDANTS' PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS AND DEPOSITION TESTIMONY RE: SUPPORT FOR DISCOVERY REQUESTS; REVIEW DOCUMENTS DESIGNATED AS CONFIDENTIAL RE: COURT ORDER IN RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE DOCUMENTS UNDER SEAL; EMAIL TO DAN MCCLURE RE: SAME
1658.0001	08/20/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.50	4,550.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, DREW PATE, AND BARBARA LEY RE: DRAFT DISCOVERY REQUESTS AND DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO STRIKE BARBARA LEY'S TESTIMONY; REVISE DRAFT DISCOVERY; REVIEW EMAILS FROM BARBARA LEY RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANTS' PAY DATA; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH IN SUPPORT OF CLASS CERTIFICATION; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: POSSIBLE EXHIBITS FOR REPLY BRIEF
1658.0001	08/21/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.70	4,690.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO DISMISS FOR LACK OF SUBJECT MATTER JURISDICTION; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: DISCOVERY TO BE ISSUED TO DEFENDANTS; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ANALYZE AUTHORITIES CITED IN DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO CLASS CERTIFICATION; CONFERENCES WITH JASON RYAN AND TELECONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME AND STRATEGY FOR REPLY BRIEF ON CERTIFICATION; EMAILS WITH DREW PATE RE: REPLY BRIEF ON CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	08/22/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.70	6,090.00	CONTINUED LEGAL RESEARCH RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; TELECONFERENCE WITH CHANCE RABON RE: RESEARCH ON CLASS CERTIFICATION AND FRAUD; EXTENDED TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: REPLY BRIEF ON CLASS CERTIFICATION AND REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO CLASS CERTIFICATION MOTION; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH JASON RYAN RE: CLASS CERTIFICATION BRIEFING; CONFERENCE RE: RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO DISMISS FOR LACK OF SUBJECT MATTER JURISDICTION; BEGIN DRAFTING REPLY IN SUPPORT OF CLASS CERTIFICATION; EMAILS WITH DREW PATE RE: SAME
1658.0001	08/23/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.40	5,880.00	EMAILS WITH DREW PATE RE: REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION AND RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO STRIKE BARBARA LEY; CONFERENCES WITH JASON RYAN RE: SUPPORT FOR REPLY ON CERTIFICATION; TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO CLASS CERTIFICATION MOTION AND STRATEGY FOR REPLY BRIEF; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION REPLY BRIEF; CONTINUE DRAFTING REPLY BRIEF
1658.0001	08/24/2019	PMJ	700.00	7.80	5,460.00	CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; CONTINUE DRAFTING REPLY BRIEF
1658.0001	08/25/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.20	5,740.00	CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: DISTINGUISH AUTHORITIES CITED IN DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE BRIEF IN OPPOSITION TO CLASS CERTIFICATION MOTION; EMAILS WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; CONTINUE DRAFTING REPLY BRIEF; ADDITIONAL LEGAL

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	08/26/2019	PMJ	700.00	9.90	6,930.00	RESEARCH RE: SUPPORT FOR REPLY; REVIEW DEPOSITIONS AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR REPLY BRIEF ON CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	08/27/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.80	6,160.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF CLASS CERTIFICATION; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; IDENTIFY EXHIBITS FOR REPLY BRIEF
1658.0001	08/28/2019	PMJ	700.00	11.20	7,840.00	CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS; DRAFT MOTION FOR LEAVE TO EXCEED PAGE LIMIT FOR REPLY; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DAN MCCURE RE: SAME; REVISE REPLY BRIEF; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, DREW PATE, AND JASON RYAN RE: REPLY BRIEF AND EXHIBITS
1658.0001	08/29/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.90	1,330.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, JAMES WARNER, AND DREW PATE RE: REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS; REVIEW PROPOSED REVISIONS TO REPLY; REVIEW MATERIALS FOR USE AS POTENTIAL EXHIBITS FOR REPLY; REVIEW COURT ORDER GRANTING LEAVE TO FILE OVERSIZED BRIEF; FINALIZE REPLY BRIEF AND ASSOCIATED EXHIBITS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO STRIKE OPINIONS FROM BARBARA LEY; REVIEW EMAILS FROM BARBARA LEY; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: WAIVER OF CLAIM OF CONFIDENTIALITY ON CERTAIN DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	08/30/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	REVIEW RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO STRIKE EXPERT TESTIMONY OF BARBARA LEY; COMMUNICATIONS RE: COURTESY COPY OF REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS TO SEND TO JUDGE GIBNEY; REVIEW PRETRIAL ORDER RE: PREPARATIONS FOR REMAINING DEADLINES
1658.0001	09/04/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH DAN MCCLURE RE: CONFIDENTIALITY DESIGNATIONS FOR CERTAIN DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY PLAINTIFF; REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S PRODUCTION RE: SAME
1658.0001	09/09/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.70	1,890.00	REVIEW SUNOCO'S RESPONSE TO COURT ORDER RE: JUSTIFICATION FOR SEEKING TO FILE DOCUMENTS UNDER SEAL; REVIEW CERTAIN COMMERCIAL DOCUMENTS FOR WHICH SUNOCO WILL RETAIN A CLAIM OF CONFIDENTIALITY
1658.0001	09/10/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS FOR LACK OF SUBJECT MATTER JURISDICTION; REVIEW CASE LAW CITED THEREIN; REVIEW DEFENSE COUNSEL EMAIL RE: REQUEST TO FILE SUR-REPLY ON CLASS CERTIFICATION; REVIEW BRIEFING RECORD AND DRAFT/REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S REQUEST TO FILE A SUR-REPLY
1658.0001	09/11/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.70	1,190.00	E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEFENDANT'S REQUEST TO FILE A SUR-REPLY
1658.0001	09/12/2019	PMJ	700.00	4.60	3,220.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO EXCLUDE TESTIMONY FROM BARBARA LEY; TELECONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAT RYAN RE: SAME; EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND STATUS OF DEFENDANTS' RESPONSES TO PLAINTIFF'S RECENT DISCOVERY REQUESTS
1658.0001	09/13/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.90	2,030.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE SUR-REPLY RELATING TO PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION; REVIEW PROPOSED SUR-REPLY; MULTIPLE EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND TREY DUCK RE: PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR LEAVE; DRAFT MOTION FOR LEAVE AND PREPARE EXHIBIT IN SUPPORT; REVIEW PRE-TRIAL ORDER AND PLAINTIFF'S AUGUST 21 DISCOVERY REQUESTS; EMAILS WITH PAT RYAN RE: DATE FOR DEFENDANTS' RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY REQUESTS; REVIEW EMAILS RE: SAME; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES; TELCONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME AND REQUEST FOR MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	09/13/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.90	2,030.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM SUNOCO COUNSEL RE: RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR UPDATED PAY DATA; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: POSSIBLE DEPOSITIONS OF SUNOCO EMPLOYEES AND ANALYSIS OF SUNOCO'S IT/SOFTWARE PLATFORMS FOR ACCOUNTING AND ROYALTY

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	09/16/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	PAYMENTS; REVIEW INFORMATION ON INDUSTRY SOFTWARE AND STANDARDS FOR ROYALTY PAYMENTS
1658.0001	09/17/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEFENDANTS' RESPONSES TO PLAINTIFF'S DISCOVERY REQUESTS AND REQUEST TO SUPPLEMENT PAY DATA AND PREPARATIONS FOR MEET AND CONFER; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND PRIOR BRIEFING ON MOTION TO COMPEL ADDITIONAL PAY DATA; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE WITH DEFENDANTS RE: SCOPE OF DISCOVERY; COMMUNICATIONS RE: ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY TO SERVE ON DEFENDANTS; TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT CLERK RE: COURTESY COPIES OF PENDING MOTIONS; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL
1658.0001	09/18/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL AND DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR MEET AND CONFER ON DISCOVERY DISPUTES; TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/19/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR MEET AND CONFER ON DEFENDANTS' RESPONSES TO PLAINTIFF'S RECENT DISCOVERY REQUESTS; PARTICIPATE IN MEET AND CONFER
1658.0001	09/20/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE SUR-REPLY RE: PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES RE: IDENTIFY GROUNDS FOR MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	09/23/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.90	1,330.00	REVIEW EMAIL FROM DAN MCCLURE RE: FOLLOW-UP FROM MEET AND CONFER ON DISCOVERY ISSUES; REVIEW PRETRIAL ORDER; PREPARE TIMELINE OF PRETRIAL ACTIVITIES AND IDENTIFY POTENTIAL MOTIONS IN LIMINE AND ISSUES FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT
1658.0001	09/25/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: PRETRIAL BRIEFING; REVISE TABLE OF PRE-TRIAL DEADLINES; TELECONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO COMPEL AND TIMING FOR DEFENDANT'S PRODUCTION OF INFORMATION IN RESPONSE TO RECENT DISCOVERY REQUESTS
1658.0001	09/26/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	DRAFT NEW DISCOVERY FOR DEFENDANTS; REVIEW RESPONSE EMAIL FROM PAT RYAN; REVIEW PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS FROM DEFENDANTS RE: [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH BARBARA LEY RE: SAME
1658.0001	09/27/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.60	1,120.00	CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: DISCOVERY AND PRE-TRIAL BRIEFING; TELECONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY RE: ANALYSIS OF RECENT PRODUCTION FROM DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	09/30/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.30	910.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: DISCOVERY, MOTION TO COMPEL, AND PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL AND PRETRIAL MOTIONS
1658.0001	10/03/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	REVISE TABLE OF PRE-TRIAL DEADLINES AND IDENTIFY ADDITIONAL TOPICS FOR POTENTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: SAME AND MOTION TO COMPEL PRODUCTION OF PAY DATA; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL
1658.0001	10/04/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.00	700.00	REVIEW DRAFT MOTION TO COMPEL DEFENDANTS' PAY DATA; REVIEW ORDERS/OPINIONS ON DEFENDANT'S MOTION TO DISMISS FOR LACK OF SUBJECT MATTER JURISDICTION, MOTION TO STRIKE TESTIMONY FROM BARBARA LEY, AND PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVIEW EMAIL FROM COURT RE: TELECONFERENCE WITH JUDGE GIBNEY; REVIEW RULE 23 RE: INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL REQUIREMENTS; TELECONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY RE: COURT ORDERS; [REDACTED]
1658.0001	10/07/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE AND JASON RYAN RE: DISCOVERY AND ORDER ON CERTIFICATION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT AND NOTICE TO CLASS
1658.0001	10/07/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: STATUS OF DEFENDANTS' OBJECTIONS TO DISCOVERY AFTER

<u>Client</u>	<u>Trans Date</u>	<u>Tkpr</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours to Bill</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
						COURT ORDER ON CLASS CERTIFICATION AND SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION FROM BOTH DEFENDANTS AND PLAINTIFF; TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	10/08/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	REVIEW EMAILS FROM DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO STAY PENDING APPEAL; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT NOTICE TO CLASS; COMMUNICATIOSN WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT
1658.0001	10/09/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.70	1,190.00	REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT; PARTICIPATE IN TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT RE: NOTICE TO CLASS, OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY DISPUTES, AND PREPARATION FOR TRIAL; FOLLOWUP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL; TELECONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: SAME AND DISPOSITIVE MOTIONS
1658.0001	10/10/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS AND PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL; REVIEW COURT ORDERS RE: MEET AND CONFER DIRECTIVE, BRIEFING ON CLASS CERTIFICATION PROCESS; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO STAY PENDING APPEAL
1658.0001	10/11/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO STAY PENDING APPEAL AND PLAINTIFF'S PROVISION OF PROPOSED NOTICE TO CLASS; REVIEW COURT ORDERS ON BRIEFING REQUIRED ON DISCOVERY/PAY DATA DISPUTE; REVIEW EMAIL FROM DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: DEFENDANTS' REFUSAL TO PRODUCE CERTAIN PAY DATA INFORMATION
1658.0001	10/14/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.20	4,340.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES TO IDENTIFY INFORMATION FOR TRIAL; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MULTIPLE EMAILS TO/FROM COUNSEL FOR DEFENDANTS RE: DISPUTE REGARDING DISCOVERY REQUESTS FOR PAY DATA AND INFORMATION REQUIRED TO SEND NOTICE TO CLASS; REVIEW COURT ORDERS RE: CLASS NOTICE AND PAY DATA DISPUTE; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL, DISPOSITIVE BRIEFING, COMMUNICATIONS WITH BARBARA LEY, AND BRIEFING IN RESPONSE TO COURT ORDERS ADDRESSING CLASS NOTICE; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	10/15/2019	PMJ	700.00	5.30	3,710.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE, PAT RYAN, AND SUSAN WHATLEY RE: BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFF'S POSITION ON PAY DATA AND INFORMATION REQUIRED FOR CLASS NOTICE; COMPREHENSIVE REVIEW OF DEFENDANT'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND PRODUCTION OF DATA/DOCUMENTS RE: [REDACTED]; REVISE DRAFT BRIEF; PREPARE MEMORANDUM OF KEY DISCOVERY REQUESTS/DEFENDANTS' RESPONSES THERETO; REVIEW MCCLURE EMAIL IN RESPONSE TO D. PATE EMAIL RE: PAY DATA DISPUTE AND NOTICE TO THE CLASS
1658.0001	10/16/2019	PMJ	700.00	3.20	2,240.00	REVIEW BRIEFING ON THE PARTIES' DISPUTE ON PRODUCTION OF PAY DATA AND CLASS MEMBER NAMES/ADDRESSES IN SUPPORT OF CLASS NOTICE; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE RE: PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF CLASS NOTICE FORM AND PROCEDURES; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PRETRIAL ACTIVITIES AND DISPOSITIVE BRIEFING; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	10/17/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.00	700.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: PENDING MOTIONS AND PRETRIAL ACTIVITIES
1658.0001	10/18/2019	PMJ	700.00	7.30	5,110.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, BROOKE CHURCHMAN, AND DREW PATE RE: SAME; REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S AMENDED INITIAL DISCLOSURES; REVIEW AND CORRECT EXHIBITS TO MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						JUDGMENT; COMMUNICATIONS RE: DEFENDANTS' CONFIDENTIALITY DESIGNATIONS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DESIGNATIONS OF DEPOSITIONS AS CONFIDENTIAL AND REVISE EXHIBITS FOR MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT; FINALIZE MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND ASSOCIATED EXHIBITS FOR FILING; DRAFT MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE EXHIBITS UNDER SEAL AND ASSOCIATED PROPOSED ORDER FOR COURT; REVIEW AGREED PROTECTIVE ORDER; CONTINUED COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: BARBARA LEY'S EXPERT REPORT IN SUPPORT OF DAMAGES
1658.0001	10/21/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.80	4,760.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: BARBARA LEY EXPERT REPORT ON DAMAGES AND PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; MEET WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM FARR RE: DAMAGES EXPERT REPORT FOR TRIAL; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION OF PAY DATA; FOLLOW-UP EMAILS WITH DREW PATE AND BARBARA LEY RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: ██████████; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ██████████
1658.0001	10/22/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.30	4,410.00	██████████; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: SAME; REVIEW EXPERT REPORT OF ERIC KRAUSE RE: IDENTIFY ISSUES FOR LEY EXPERT REPORT; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: DAMAGES FOR TRIAL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: ██████████; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL, EXHIBIT/WITNESS LISTS, EFFORTS TO SUBPOENA WITNESSES FOR TRIAL, PRETRIAL BRIEFING
1658.0001	10/23/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.90	6,230.00	WORK WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM FARR RE: EXPERT REPORT ON DAMAGES FOR TRIAL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, DREW PATE, AND BRAD BECKWORTH RE: PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL AND POSSIBLE MEDIATION; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT EXPERT REPORT
1658.0001	10/24/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.80	6,160.00	REVIEW DISCOVERY RESPONSES RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR B. LEY EXPERT REPORT; ██████████; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, DREW PATE, BARBARA LEY, AND ADAM FARR RE: EXPERT REPORT ON DAMAGES AND PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR MEDIATION; REVIEW EMAILS FROM DAN MCCLURE RE: PAY DATA FROM DEFENDANTS AND EXPERT REPORTS
1658.0001	10/25/2019	PMJ	700.00	9.40	6,580.00	MULTIPLE EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCES WITH DREW PATE, PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, BARBARA LEY, AND ADAM FARR RE: EXPERT REPORT FOR TRIAL AND ASSOCIATED EXHIBITS; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON EXPERT REPORT AND EXHIBITS; FINALIZE SAME; EMAIL TO DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: ██████████
1658.0001	10/26/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S RESPONSE BRIEF IN OPPOSITION TO PLAINTIFF'S PROPOSED PLAN FOR PROVIDING NOTICE TO THE CLASS; REVIEW PAT RYAN EMAIL RE: SAME
1658.0001	10/28/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.50	4,550.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS RE: IDENTIFY EXHIBITS FOR TRIAL; REVIEW DRAFT RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO DEFENDANTS' APPEAL OF CLASS CERTIFICATION ORDER; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS RE: BARBARA LEY EXPERT REPORT; REVIEW EMAILS FROM MCCLURE RE: BARBARA'S SUPPORTING MATRIALS; FOLLOW-UP EMAILS WITH BARBARA AND DREW PATE RE: SAME
1658.0001	10/29/2019	PMJ	700.00	5.70	3,990.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL; REVIEW DRAFT LIST OF PLAINTIFF'S TRIAL EXHIBITS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND DREW PATE RE: PLAINTIFF'S WITNESSES FOR TRIAL; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S MOTION TO STAY/STRIKE PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH COURT RE: STATUS CONFERENCE WITH COURT; REVIEW LOCAL RULES ON

<u>Client</u>	<u>Trans Date</u>	<u>Tkpr</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours to Bill</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	10/30/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.10	4,270.00	DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; CONTINUE REVIEWING DOCUMENTS TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE EXHIBITS FOR TRIAL; COMMUNICATIONS RE: MOTIONS IN LIMINE
1658.0001	10/30/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.10	4,270.00	MULTIPLE EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCES WITH DREW PATE, PAT RYAN, AND JASON RYAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL, EXHIBIT LIST, WITNESS LIST, PRE-TRIAL MOTIONS, AND DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS; REVIEW COURT ORDERS ON DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO STAY RULING ON PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND MOTION TO STAY CASE PENDING APPEAL OF CLASS CERTIFICATION; EMAILS WITH COURT RE: STATUS CONFERENCE ON CLASS NOTICE; REVIEW DEPOSITIONS TO IDENTIFY DESIGNATIONS FOR TRIAL; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	10/31/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.30	4,410.00	[REDACTED] REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR TELEPHONIC HEARING WITH JUDGE GIBNEY RE: PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO APPROVE FORM AND PLAN OF CLASS NOTICE; PARTICIPATE IN TELECONFERENCE; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: REVISED NOTICE, PLAN OF NOTICE, AND OPT-OUT FORM REQUIRED BY COURT; REVIEW AND REVISE SAME; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO STAY FILED IN TENTH CIRCUIT; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH JND RE: NOTICE TO CLASS AND OPT-OUT FORM; EMAILS RE: CONTACT WITH OWNERS/POTENTIAL FACT WITNESSES FOR TRIAL; REVIEW EMAIL FROM DAN MCCLURE RE: DEFENDANTS' EXPERT DISCLOSURES; CONTINUE TO WORK ON DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS
1658.0001	11/01/2019	PMJ	700.00	4.10	2,870.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE, SETTLEMENT ADMINISTRATOR, AND COURT RE: CLASS NOTICE FOR MAILING; NOTICE PLAN; AND REQUEST FOR EXCLUSION FORM; EMAILS RE: DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS; REVIEW ORDER GRANTING PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO APPROVE FORM AND MANNER OF CLASS NOTICE; COMMUNICATIONS WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM FARR RE: SPREADSHEETS SENT BY SUNOCO IN SUPPORT OF KRAUSE EXPERT REPORT, KRAUSE AND EPPERSON EXPERT REPORTS; REVIEW SAME
1658.0001	11/02/2019	PMJ	700.00	4.70	3,290.00	WORK ON DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS; IDENTIFY PROPOSED STIPULATED FACTS; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: EXPERT REPORTS FROM SUNOCO; COMMUNICATIONS WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM FARR RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR MEDIATION; EMAILS FROM PAT RYAN RE: DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE TO PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT
1658.0001	11/03/2019	PMJ	700.00	5.20	3,640.00	REVIEW EXPERT REPORTS FROM SUNOCO RE: DAMAGES AND MARKETABLE TITLE ISSUES; MULTIPLE FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME; REVIEW MATERIALS RELIED UPON BY BARBARA LEY AND REVIEW SUNOCO'S RECENT PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	11/04/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.70	4,690.00	MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: REVIEW OF SUNOCO'S EXPERT REPORTS; TELECONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR MEDIATION, APPELLATE BRIEFING, CLASS NOTICE, AND REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT; CONTINUE REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' EXPERT REPORTS FROM KRAUSE AND EPPERMAN; CONTINUE WORKING ON DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS; REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY DEFENDANTS RE: IDENTIFY ADDITIONAL EXHIBITS FOR TRIAL; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: IDENTIFICATION OF WITNESSES FOR TRIAL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE AND SETTLEMENT ADMINISTRATOR RE: NOTICE TO CLASS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE REPLY TO PETITION FOR PERMISSION TO APPEAL CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	11/05/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.20	5,740.00	REVIEW SUPPORTING MATERIALS FROM ERIC KRAUSE; MEET WITH BARBARA LEY RE: REBUTTAL REPORT AND PREPARATION FOR MEDIATION; REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS'

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	Detail Description
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						MOTION TO STAY DISTRICT COURT PROCEEDINGS; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH COURT, SETTLEMENT ADMINISTRATOR, AND DREW PATE RE: NOTICE TO THE CLASS; MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR MEDIATION; IDENTIFY MATERIALS TO SEND TO BARBARA LEY RE: SUNOCO PAYMENTS TO THE OCC; EXTENDED TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR MEDIATION, WITNESS/EXHIBIT LISTS FOR TRIAL, PROPOSED STIPULATED FACTS, DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS, AND BARBARA LEY'S REBUTTAL REPORT; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE RE: SAME AND PLAINTIFF'S REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT
1658.0001	11/06/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.40	5,880.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON PLAINTIFF'S DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS FOR MULTIPLE WITNESSES; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON PLAINTIFF'S TRIAL WITNESS LIST; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE, PAT RYAN, AND JASON RYAN RE: PROPOSED STIPULATED FACTS, FINAL WITNESS AND EXHIBIT LISTS, AND DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DOCUMENT PRODUCTION TO IDENTIFY POTENTIAL EXHIBITS FOR TRIAL; CONTINUE WORKING ON B. LEY EXPERT REPORT; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH BARBARA LEY, ADAM FARR, AND BEN HUDGENS RE: REBUTTAL REPORT ON DAMAGES AND TRIAL TESTIMONY; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR MEDIATION; MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND STRATEGY FOR MEDIATION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: WITNESS TESTIMONY AT TRIAL
1658.0001	11/07/2019	PMJ	700.00	9.40	6,580.00	CONFERENCE WITH BARBARA LEY AND BEN HUDGENS RE: REBUTTAL REPORT ON DAMAGES; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME AND MEDIATION PROCEEDINGS; [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; MULTIPLE EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCES WITH BARBARA LEY RE: REBUTTAL REPORT; REVIEW DRAFT REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: MEDIATION; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH SETTLEMENT ADMINISTRATOR AND DREW PATE RE: NOTICE TO CLASS
1658.0001	11/08/2019	PMJ	700.00	13.40	9,380.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MULTIPLE DRAFTS OF REBUTTAL REPORT ON DAMAGES; MULTIPLE EMAILS, CONFERENCES, AND TELECONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: SAME; MULTIPLE TELECONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH BARBARA LEY RE: SAME; REVIEW DOCUMENTS REFERENCED IN LEY REBUTTAL REPORT; REVIEW EXPERT REPORTS FROM KRAUSE AND EPPERSON;
1658.0001	11/11/2019	PMJ	700.00	4.20	2,940.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: FOLLOW-UP FROM MEDIATION AND PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL; REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S WITNESS LIST AND EXHIBITS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH BARBARA LEY AND ADAM FARR RE: BARBARA LEY'S REBUTTAL REPORT; REVIEW PRETRIAL ORDER; COMMUNICATIONS RE: TRIAL STRATEGY; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: FACT WITNESS TESTIMONY AT TRIAL
1658.0001	11/12/2019	PMJ	700.00	5.60	3,920.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, DREW PATE, AND BRAD BECKWORTH RE: TRIAL PREPARATION/WITNESS ASSIGNMENTS; REVIEW COURT ORDER ON MODIFYING PRETRIAL ORDER; REVIEW MCCLURE EMAIL RE: REQUEST FOR EXPERT MATERIALS; FOLLOWUP COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME; REVIEW POSSIBLE EXHIBITS FOR TRIAL
1658.0001	11/13/2019	PMJ	700.00	4.70	3,290.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ADAM FARR RE: RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' INQUIRIES REGARDING BARBARA LEY EXPERT REPORT; REVIEW TENTH CIRCUIT ORDER DENYING INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	11/14/2019	PMJ	700.00	3.20	2,240.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN AND PAT RYAN RE: CALDWELL DOCUMENTS AND POTENTIAL TRIAL TESTIMONY; REVIEW SUMMARY OF CALDWELL DOCUMENTS; WORK ON PROPOSED STIPULATIONS OF FACT; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: FOLLOW-UP FROM MEDIATION
1658.0001	11/15/2019	PMJ	700.00	4.30	3,010.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL; REVIEW MEMORANDUM/ANALYSIS ON [REDACTED]; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS RE: MEDIATION ISSUES; REVIEW EMAILS WITH DAN MCCLURE RE: IDENTIFY POSSIBLE STIPULATIONS OF FACT; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND DRAFTING OF VARIOUS PRETRIAL FILINGS; COMMUNICATIONS RE: POSSIBLE FACT WITNESSES FOR TRIAL
1658.0001	11/16/2019	PMJ	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, DREW PATE, AND BRAD BECKWORTH RE: THE PARTIES' STIPULATIONS OF FACT; DRAFT/REVISE THE PARTIES' STIPULATIONS OF FACT; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO CLARIFY THE CLASS DEFINITION AND PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE THERETO; COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING FACT WITNESS TESTIMONY FOR TRIAL; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' WITNESS AND EXHIBIT LISTS
1658.0001	11/17/2019	PMJ	700.00	3.70	2,590.00	REVIEW ROBERT BARNES' EMAIL RE: [REDACTED]; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	11/18/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.80	4,760.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH DAN MCCLURE RE: DEFENDANTS' DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SUBPOENA TO KOELLING; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; REVIEW/COMMENT ON DRAFT RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO CLARIFY CLASS DEFINITION/DECERTIFY CLASS; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, DREW PATE, AND BRAD BECKWORTH RE: [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; REVIEW/COMMENT ON DRAFT AFFIDAVITS FOR PERRY CLINE AND DR. CALDWELL
1658.0001	11/19/2019	PMJ	700.00	5.80	4,060.00	REVIEW/COMMENT ON REVISED RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO CLARIFY CLASS DEFINITION/DECERTIFY CLASS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND AFFIDAVITS FROM DR. CALDWELL AND PERRY CLINE; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLASS MEMBERS RE: NOTICE; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	11/20/2019	PMJ	700.00	5.50	3,850.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: OBJECTIONS TO DESIGNATED DISCOVERY/WITNESSES/EXHIBITS, DEPOSITION SUMMARIES, PRETRIAL BRIEFING, AND PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; EMAILS RE: EXPERT DEPOSITIONS; COMMUNICATIONS RE: DEPOSITION COUNTER-DESIGNATIONS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS AND WORK ON COUNTER-DESIGNATIONS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' TRIAL EXHIBITS
1658.0001	11/21/2019	PMJ	700.00	5.50	3,850.00	WORK ON DEPOSITION COUNTER-DESIGNATIONS; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: TRIAL PREPARATIONS, EXPERT DEPOSITIONS, AND REBUTTAL DISCOVERY; COMMUNICATIONS RE: DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO CLARIFY CLASS DEFINITION/DECERTIFY CLASS; RESPOND TO INQUIRIES FROM CLASS MEMBERS
1658.0001	11/22/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.40	4,480.00	REVIEW NEW TRIAL EXHIBITS FROM DEFENDANTS; REVIEW DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS RE: IDENTIFY OBJECTIONS; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME AND PRETRIAL WORK/ASSIGNMENTS AND PREPARATION FOR

<u>Client</u>	<u>Trans Date</u>	<u>Tkpr</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours to Bill</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	11/24/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	HEARING ON MONDAY RE: MOTION TO DECERTIFY THE CLASS; MULTIPLE TELECONFERENCES WITH CLASS MEMBERS RE: ANSWER QUESTIONS FROM CLASS NOTICE
1658.0001	11/25/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.80	4,760.00	REVIEW JASON RYAN'S SUMMARY OF CERTAIN DEFENDANTS' NEWLY-DISCLOSED TRIAL EXHIBITS; REVIEW ASSIGNED SET OF DEFENDANTS' NEWLY-DISCLOSED TRIAL EXHIBITS AND PREPARE SUMMARY OF SAME
1658.0001	11/26/2019	PMJ	700.00	5.80	4,060.00	FINISH SUMMARY OF DEFENDANTS' NEWLY-DISCLOSED TRIAL EXHIBITS; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME AND TRIAL PREPARATIONS; PARTICIPATE IN TELEPHONIC HEARING WITH COURT RE: DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO CLARIFY CLASS DEFINITION AND/OR TO DECERTIFY THE CLASS; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENDANTS REGARDING DEPOSITION COUNTER DESIGNATIONS AND OBJECTIONS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DAN MCCLURE, DREW PATE, AND BARBARA LEY RE: DEFENDANTS' REVIEW OF BARBARA LEY'S SUPPORTING MATERIALS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DECERTIFY/CLARIFY CLASS; WORK ON TRIAL PREP
1658.0001	11/27/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	EMAILS RE: OBJECTIONS TO PROPOSED DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS; EMAILS WITH MCCLURE AND CO-COUNSEL RE: DATE FOR KOELLING TESTIMONY; REVIEW DESIGNATED DEPOSITION TESTIMONY AND IDENTIFY PLAINTIFF'S OBJECTIONS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN RE: SAME; REVIEW SUMMARIES OF TERRY OAKLEY, DEMI LANCELIN, AND KATHY WARREN; PREPARE SUMMARIES OF ALICE HOLLAND AND PATRICIA REDDING DEPOSITIONS; REVIEW INSTRUCTIONS/EMAIL FROM COURT RE: EXHIBITS SUBJECT TO OBJECTION; REVIEW ORDER DENYING DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO CLARIFY/DECERTIFY CLASS; CONFERENCES WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; FINALIZE PLAINTIFF'S DEPOSITION SUMMARIES AND SEND TO COURT
1658.0001	12/02/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.40	4,480.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: EXPERT DEPOSITIONS; TELECONFERENCES WITH MULTIPLE CLASS MEMBERS RE: ANSWER QUESTIONS ABOUT CLASS NOTICE; REVIEW EPPERSON MATERIALS
1658.0001	12/03/2019	PMJ	700.00	5.10	3,570.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND CO-COUNSEL FROM NIX PATTERSON RE: TRIAL BRIEF, WITNESSES AND EXHIBITS FOR TRIAL, AND PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES RE: TRIAL PREPARATIONS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' WITNESS AND EXHIBIT LISTS FOR TRIAL; REVIEW COURT ORDER SETTING HEARING ON PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVIEW EMAILS FROM MCCLURE RE: HEARING AND REQUEST TO FILE A SUR-REPLY BRIEF; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS RE: EXPERT DEPOSITIONS; REVIEW MATERIALS FROM EXPERTS
1658.0001	12/04/2019	PMJ	700.00	5.30	3,710.00	WORK ON TRIAL BRIEF RE: PUNITIVE DAMAGES, AFFIRMATIVE DEFENSES, BURDEN OF PROOF, AND MARKETABLE TITLE ISSUES; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SUPPLEMENTAL EXPERT REPORT FROM ERIC KRAUSE; COMMUNICATIONS WITH NIX PATTERSON RE: TRIAL PREPARATION; CONFERENCES RE: WITNESS PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL AND PREPARATIONS FOR EXPERT DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	12/05/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.70	6,090.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS/CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, JAMES WARNER, AND DREW PATE RE: PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL, FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW, TRIAL BRIEF, EXPERT DEPOSITIONS, AND PRESENTATION OF WITNESSES AT TRIAL; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: PUNITIVE DAMAGES, BURDENS OF PROOF, AND TITLE MARKETABILITY ISSUES; CONTINUE DRAFTING TRIAL BRIEF ON PUNITIVE DAMAGES; DRAFT FINDINGS OF FACT
1658.0001	12/05/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.70	6,090.00	CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH AND DRAFTING PORTIONS OF TRIAL BRIEF RE: PUNITIVE DAMAGES, BURDENS OF PROOF, AFFIRMATIVE DEFENSES, TITLE ISSUES, KNOWLEDGE OF DEFENDANTS, PUBLIC POLICY IN OKLAHOMA, ETC.; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: EXPERT DEPOSITIONS, PRESENTATION OF FACT

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	12/06/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.70	6,090.00	WITNESSES AT TRIAL, REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' TRIAL EXHIBITS, MEET AND CONFER WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL RE: OBJECTIONS TO DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS; REVIEW DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS/OBJECTIONS THERETO; REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S TRIAL BRIEF ON BURDEN OF PROOF AND MOTION TO STRIKE EXPERT TESTIMONY FROM ERIC KRAUSE
1658.0001	12/06/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.70	6,090.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING TRIAL BRIEF ON PUNITIVE DAMAGES; ADDITIONAL LEGAL RESEARCH ON PUNITIVE DAMAGES; PARTICIPATE IN TELEPHONIC HEARING ON PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT; FOLLOW-UP TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, BRAD BECKWORTH, AND DREW PATE; REVISE TRIAL BRIEF ON PUNITIVE DAMAGES; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: PUNITIVE DAMAGES, WITNESS TESTIMONY AT TRIAL, EXPERT DEPOSITIONS, AND DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH NP ATTORNEYS RE: TRIAL BRIEFS AND PLAINTIFF'S PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; CONFERENCES RE: TRIAL EXHIBITS AND COMPLIANCE WITH PRETRIAL ORDER; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' TRIAL BRIEF ON BURDEN OF PROOF AND INDIVIUDAL LIABILITY ISSUES; DRAFT PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT; REVEW DEFENDANTS' TRIAL BRIEF ON PUNITIVE DAMAGES AND FRAUD; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN, PAT RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: FINAL REVISIONS TO PLAINTIFF'S TRIAL BRIEF ON PUNITIVE DAMAGES
1658.0001	12/07/2019	PMJ	700.00	4.80	3,360.00	WORK ON PLAINTIFF'S PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW
1658.0001	12/08/2019	PMJ	700.00	4.30	3,010.00	CONTINUE WORKING ON FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; EMAILS RE: ANALYSIS OF TRIAL BRIEFS AND PREPARATIONS FOR EXPERT DEPOSITIONS
1658.0001	12/09/2019	PMJ	700.00	6.10	4,270.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVIEW DRAFT CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: FINDINGS OF FACT; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DEPOSITION OF BARBARA LEY AND PREPARATIONS FOR EPPERSON DEPOSITION
1658.0001	12/10/2019	PMJ	700.00	7.30	5,110.00	REVIEW COURT OPINION AND ORDER RE: PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT; CONFERENCE WITH DREW PATE RE: SAME, FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW, AND DEPOSITION OF BARBARA LEY; CONTINUE DRAFTING PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT/CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: DEPOSITION OF EPPERSON; REVIEW OKLAHOMA TITLE EXAMINAITON STANDARDS; REVIEW EPPERSON REPORT; CONFERENCE WITH JAMES WARNER RE: FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; REVIEW EMAILS FROM MCCLURE RE: DOCUMENTS REQUESTED FROM SUNOCO'S EXPERTS; REVIEW BRIEFING ON MOTION TO STRIKE SUNOCO'S EXPERT, ERIC KRAUSE; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	12/11/2019	PMJ	700.00	10.90	7,630.00	REVIEW MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR CONFERENCE WITH COURT; PARTICIPATE IN PRETRIAL CONFERENCE WITH COURT; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; REVISE PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: EPPERSON DEPOSITION AND FINDINGS OF FACT; COMMUNICATIONS WITH JAMES WARNER, DREW PATE, AND BRAD BECKWORTH RE: FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; REVISE/FINALIZE FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; COMMUNICATIONS RE: SUMMARIES OF TRIAL EXHIBITS
1658.0001	12/12/2019	PMJ	700.00	10.60	7,420.00	CONFERENCE RE: SUNOCO'S FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL; REVIEW MATERIALS ON UNCLAIMED PROPERTY; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; IDENTIFY/PREPARE MATERIALS FOR TRIAL; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ISSUES RELATED TO

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	12/13/2019	PMJ	700.00	9.20	6,440.00	THE PARTIES' TRIAL BRIEFS; COMMUNICATIONS RE: OPENING STATEMENTS AND FACT WITNESS TESTIMONY; REVIEW EXPERT REPORTS AND SUPPORTING MATERIALS
1658.0001	12/14/2019	PMJ	700.00	4.80	3,360.00	MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH JASON RYAN AND PAT RYAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR TRIAL, TESTIMONY FROM DR. CALDWELL AND PAUL WALKER; MEET WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; MULTIPLE EMAILS AND TELECONFERNCES WITH DREW PATE RE: EXHIBITS FOR TRIAL; ASSIST WITH WITNESS
1658.0001	12/15/2019	PMJ	700.00	11.50	8,050.00	PREP/OUTLINES/DEMONSTRATIVE EXHIBITS; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR CROSS EXAMINATION AT TRIAL
1658.0001	12/16/2019	PMJ	700.00	15.20	10,640.00	TRIAL PREPARATION RE: COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, AND DREW PATE RE: DEMONSTRATIVES, OPENING STATMENTS, FACT WITNESS TESTIMONY, EXPERT TESTIMONY FROM BARBARA LEY, AND REVIEW OF TRIAL BRIEFS; CONTINUE REVIEWING DOCUMENTS FOR CROSS-EXAMINATION AT TRIAL AND SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFF'S WITNESSES
1658.0001	12/17/2019	PMJ	700.00	15.10	10,570.00	TRAVEL TO MUSKOGEE; MEETINGS/CONFERENCES WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: TRIAL PREPARATIONS, OPENING STATMENTS, SUPPORT FOR WITNESS TESTIMONY/CROSS-EXAMINATION, LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; CONFERENCES WITH BARBARA LEY RE: TRIAL TESTIMONY; MEETING WITH PERRY CLINE RE: SAME
1658.0001	12/18/2019	PMJ	700.00	14.80	10,360.00	REVIEW MATERIALS FOR TRIAL; ATTEND TRIAL; MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: LEGAL RESEARCH, WITNESS PREP, AND CASE STRATEGY; POST-TRIAL MEETINGS RE: WITNESS PREP, CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN AND PAUL WALKER, REVIEW PROPOSED DEPOSITION VIDEOS; PREPARE FOR NEXT DAY OF TRIAL
1658.0001	12/19/2019	PMJ	700.00	8.00	5,600.00	REVIEW MATERIALS FOR TRIAL; ATTEND TRIAL; LEGAL RESEARCH; REVIEW DOCUMENTS IDENTIFIED BY DEFENDANTS; POST-TRIAL CONFERENCES AND PREPARATIONS FOR NEXT DAY OF TRIAL
1658.0001	12/20/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	REVIEW MATERIALS FOR TRIAL; ATTEND TRIAL; LEGAL RESEARCH AND TRIAL SUPPORT; POST-TRIAL CONFERENCES RE: CLOSING ARGUMENTS
1658.0001	12/23/2019	PMJ	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	CONFERENCES WITH TRIAL TEAM; ATTEND TRIAL; POST-TRIAL CONFERENCES WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: POST-TRIAL BRIEFING, SUBMISSION OF EXHIBITS TO COURT, LEGAL RESEARCH ASSIGNMENTS
1658.0001	12/24/2019	PMJ	700.00	1.60	1,120.00	FOLLOW-UP FROM TRIAL RE: IDENTIFY EXHIBITS TO SEND TO COURT, PREPARATIONS FOR DRAFTING FINDINGS OF FACT/CONCLUSIONS OF LAW, AND ADDITIONAL LEGAL RESEARCH TO SUPPORT POST-TRIAL BRIEFING
1658.0001	12/26/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: EXHIBITS ADMITTED IN TRIAL; REVIEW DEMONSTRATIVES AND DEFENDANTS' OBJECTIONS TO PLAINTIFF'S EXHIBITS; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	12/30/2019	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	COMMUNICATIONS RE: EXHIBITS TO SEND TO COURT; RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	01/06/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	EMAILS RE: POST-TRIAL BRIEFING AND FINDINGS OF FACT/CONCLUSIONS OF LAW
1658.0001	01/15/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	REVIEW COURT ORDER RE: FINDINGS OF FACT/CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; FOLLOW-UP EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	01/20/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: POST-TRIAL BRIEFING AND REVISED FINDINGS OF FACT/CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	01/22/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	PARTICIPATE IN TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT RE: POST-TRIAL BRIEFING AND ORAL ARGUMENT; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: EXHIBITS TO BE PROVIDED TO COURT
1658.0001	01/24/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH CLASS MEMBER RE: QUESTIONS REGARDING CASE/TRIAL
1658.0001	01/27/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.70	1,190.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: POST-TRIAL BRIEFING AND PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW
						TELECONFERENCE WITH CLASS MEMBER RE: STATUS OF CASE
						COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: TRIAL TRANSCRIPTS, POST-TRIAL BRIEF, AND UPDATED FINDINGS OF

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	01/28/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.70	1,890.00	FACT/CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	01/29/2020	PMJ	700.00	3.20	2,240.00	[REDACTED]; REVIEW TRIAL TRANSCRIPT CONTINUE REVIEWING TRIAL TRANSCRIPT; IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR POST-TRIAL BRIEFING AND REVISED PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW
1658.0001	01/30/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING TRIAL TRANSCRIPT RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR POST-TRIAL BRIEF AND REVISED PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW
1658.0001	01/31/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.30	910.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING TRIAL TRANSCRIPT/EXHIBITS RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR REVISED PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW
1658.0001	02/03/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.90	2,030.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING TRIAL TRANSCRIPT AND EXHIBITS RE: PREPARE UPDATED PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT
1658.0001	02/04/2020	PMJ	700.00	5.70	3,990.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING TRIAL TRANSCRIPT AND EXHIBITS RE: UPDATES/REVISIONS TO FINDINGS OF FACT; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	02/05/2020	PMJ	700.00	7.80	5,460.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING TRIAL TRANSCRIPT, DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS, AND EXHIBITS RE: DRAFTING OF PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT/CONCLUSIONS OF LAW AND SUPPORT FOR POST-TRIAL BRIEFING; CONTINUE DRAFTING PROPOSED FOFS/COLS; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/06/2020	PMJ	700.00	4.80	3,360.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT/CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: SAME; REVIEW EMAILS FROM DAN MCCLURE RE: TRIAL EXHIBITS
1658.0001	02/07/2020	PMJ	700.00	5.90	4,130.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; REVIEW TRIAL EXHIBITS RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR FOFS/COLS; CONTINUE DRAFTING FOFS/COLS
1658.0001	02/08/2020	PMJ	700.00	6.70	4,690.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH IN SUPPORT OF FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW AND POST-TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	02/09/2020	PMJ	700.00	5.90	4,130.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; REVIEW PRIOR ORDERS FROM COURT RE: IDENTIFY ISSUES THAT HAVE BEEN DETERMINED/FACTS THAT HAVE BEEN ESTABLISHED
1658.0001	02/10/2020	PMJ	700.00	6.50	4,550.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING FINDINGS OF FACT/CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; TELECONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: FINDINGS OF FACT, CONCLUSION OF LAW, AND POST-TRIAL BRIEFING; TELECONFERENCE WITH CLASS MEMBER RE: RESPOND TO REQUEST FOR INFORMATION ABOUT THE CASE; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/11/2020	PMJ	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	CONTINUE WORKING ON FINDINGS OF FACT/CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH IN SUPPORT OF POST-TRIAL BRIEFING
1658.0001	02/12/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	CONTINUE WORKING ON FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; REVIEW TRIAL EXHIBITS TO IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: TRIAL RECORD
1658.0001	02/13/2020	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: FINDINGS OF FACT/COMMUNICATIONS OF LAW/ POST-TRIAL BRIEF; REVIEW DRAFT TRIAL BRIEF AND MULTIPLE COMMENTS/PROPOSED REVISIONS FROM CO-COUNSEL; EMAILS RE: SAME
1658.0001	02/14/2020	PMJ	700.00	3.20	2,240.00	CONTINUE WORKING TO IDENTIFY RECORD SUPPORT FOR FINDINGS OF FACT; REVIEW/COMMENT ON TRIAL BRIEF; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, DREW PATE, AND WINN CUTLER RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLASS MEMBERS SEEKING INFORMATION ON STATUS OF CASE
1658.0001	02/15/2020	PMJ	700.00	7.50	5,250.00	CONTINUE WORKING ON REVISED PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; TELECONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						RE: SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE RE: FOFS/COLS AND POST-TRIAL BRIEF; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH ON
1658.0001	02/16/2020	PMJ	700.00	8.10	5,670.00	REVIS/COMMENT ON REVISED PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; IDENTIFY SUPPORT FROM TRIAL TRANSCRIPT AND TRIAL EXHIBITS
1658.0001	02/17/2020	PMJ	700.00	7.80	5,460.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING TRIAL EXHIBITS TO IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR PROPOSED FOFS/COLS; CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE: FOFS/COLS/ AND POST-TRIAL BRIEF; EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON UPDATED TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	02/18/2020	PMJ	700.00	7.40	5,180.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH WINN CUTLER, DREW PATE, PAT RYAN, AND JASON RYAN RE: FINAL REVISIONS TO FOFS/COLS AND TRIAL BRIEF; REVIEW TRIAL EXHIBITS TO FIND ADDITIONAL SUPPORT FOR FOFS; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON PROPOSED FINAL FOFS/COLS AND TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	02/19/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' FOFS/COLS AND TRIAL BRIEF; REVIEW STATE TREASURER REGULATIONS ON UNCLAIMED PROPERTY; EMAILS WITH DRE PATE RE: FOFS/COLS
1658.0001	02/20/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE: REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' FINDINGS OF FACT/CONCLUSIONS OF LAW AND TRIAL BRIEF; REVIEW EMAILS RE: SAME; REVIEW EMAILS RE: INSTRUCTIONS FROM COURT ON LENGTH OF RESPONSE BRIEFS; REVIEW EMAILS FROM DAN MCCLURE RE: REQUEST FOR MATRIALS FROM BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	02/23/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' AMENDED FOFS/COLS
1658.0001	02/24/2020	PMJ	700.00	4.90	3,430.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR RESPONSE TRIAL BRIEF; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' TRIAL BRIEF; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVIEW DRAFT MEMOS FROM CO-COUNSEL RE: STRATEGY FOR RESPONDING TO DEFENDANTS' TRIAL BRIEF; CONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	02/25/2020	PMJ	700.00	6.70	4,690.00	CONTINUE REVIEWING DEFENDANTS' PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT/CONCLUSIONS OF LAW AND TRIAL BRIEF; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR RESPONSE BRIEF; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: ANALYSIS OF DEFENDANTS' TRIAL BRIEF ARGUMENTS
1658.0001	02/26/2020	PMJ	700.00	5.90	4,130.00	CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR RESPONSE TRIAL BRIEF; DRAFT EMAIL TO CO-COUNSEL RE: ARGUMENTS AND AUTHORITY FOR PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' TRIAL BRIEF; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVIEW DRAFT RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	02/27/2020	PMJ	700.00	6.00	4,200.00	CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' TRIAL BRIEF; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MULTIPLE REVISED DRAFTS OF PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE BRIEF; IDENTIFY TRIAL TRANSCRIPT/EXHIBIT SUPPORT FOR PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE BRIEF AND ISSUES TO BE ADDRESSED DURING FINAL ARGUMENTS ON MARCH 31; TELECONFERENCES WITH PAT RYAN RE: RESPONSE BRIEF AND CLOSING ARGUMENTS
1658.0001	02/28/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON FINAL DRAFT OF PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' TRIAL BRIEF; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME; FINALIZE PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE BRIEF FOR FILING
1658.0001	03/03/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATION FOR CLOSING ARGUMENTS ON MARCH 31
1658.0001	03/05/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	TELECONFERENCES WITH CLASS MEMBERS RE: QUESTIONS ABOUT CASE AND RECENT NOTICES THAT SUNOCO WILL NO LONGER BE THE PAYING ENTITY
1658.0001	03/09/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	REVIEW MCCLURE EMAIL RE: REQUEST TO FILE SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF ON COMPOUNDING INTEREST; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	03/10/2020	PMJ	700.00	3.90	2,730.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF ON COMPOUNDING INTEREST; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: POST-TRIAL BRIEFING AND PREPARATIONS FOR CLOSING ARGUMENTS; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: IDENTIFY SUPPORT FOR SUPPLEMENTAL

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	03/11/2020	PMJ	700.00	3.20	2,240.00	POST-TRIAL BRIEF REVIEW BRIEFING ON COMPOUNDING INTEREST; CONTINUE DRAFTING RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND PREPARATIONS FOR CLOSING ARGUMENTS
1658.0001	03/12/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	EMAILS WITH DREW PATE RE: POST-TRIAL ISSUES; REVIEW EMAILS FROM COURT RE: RESCHEDULED CLOSING ARGUMENTS; CONTINUE WORKING ON RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	03/13/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL AND COURT RE: RESCHEDULED CLOSING ARGUMENTS; CONTINUE DRAFTING RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	03/15/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	CONTINUE DRAFTING RESPONSE SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	03/16/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF RE: UNIT ORDER; REVIEW PROPOSED REVISIONS TO SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF; FINALIZE BRIEF AND ASSOCIATED MOTION FOR LEAVE; REVIEW EMAILS FROM COURT RE: REVISED DATE FOR CLOSING ARGUMENTS;
1658.0001	03/17/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	████████████████████ FINALIZE MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF; PREPARE PROPOSED ORDER FOR COURT; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	03/18/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH DREW PATE RE: PROPOSED ORDER GRANTING MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF; FINALIZE PROPOSED ORDER
1658.0001	03/23/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	REVIEW COURT ORDER GRANTING LEAVE TO FILE RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF; FINALIZE PLAINTIFF'S BRIEF AND ASSOCIATED EXHIBIT; TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: ██████████ ████████████████████; TELECONFERNCES WITH CLASS MEMBERS CALLING TO CHECK ON STATUS OF CASE
1658.0001	04/30/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	REVIEW EMAIL FROM COURT RE: TELEPHONIC CLOSING ARGUMENTS; EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	05/01/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	MULTIPLE EMAILS RE: TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT TO DISCUSS TELEPHONIC CLOSING ARGUMENTS
1658.0001	05/04/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT TO DISCUSS REVISED PLANS FOR PRESENTING CLOSING ARGUMENTS
1658.0001	05/05/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT NOTICE RE: ORDER ON COMPOUND INTEREST; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	05/06/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	PARTICIPATE IN TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT RE: PREPARATIONS FOR CLOSING ARGUMENTS IN JUNE; TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: ██████████
1658.0001	05/11/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	████████ COMMUNICATION WITH PERRY CLINE RE: ██████████
1658.0001	05/14/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S RESPONSE TO NOTICE OF RULING ON MOTION TO RECONSIDER; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	05/18/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR CLOSING ARGUMENTS
1658.0001	05/27/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	REVIEW COURT ORDER ON JUNE 17 CLOSING ARGUMENTS; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	05/28/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR CLOSING ARGUMENTS
1658.0001	06/01/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR CLOSING ARGUMENTS AND ██████████ ████████
1658.0001	06/08/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH JASON RYAN AND PAT RYAN RE: CLOSING ARGUMENTS ON JUNE 17
1658.0001	06/15/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PERRY CLINE RE: ██████████ ████████████████████; REVIEW COURT ORDER RE: CLOSING

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	06/17/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	ARGUMENTS ATTEND PARTS OF THE TELEPHONIC HEARING RE: CLOSING ARGUMENTS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	07/06/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	REVIEW COURT ORDER ON TRANSCRIPT FOR CLOSING ARGUMENTS; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	08/03/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	COMMUNICATION WITH CLASS REPRESENTATIVE RE: STATUS OF CASE
1658.0001	08/17/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	REVIEW OPINION AND ORDER ENTERED BY COURT; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL AND EXPERT TEAM RE: ANALYSIS OF SAME; [REDACTED]
1658.0001	08/18/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH BARBARA LEY RE: INFORMATION REQUIRED BY COURT ORDER/JUDGMENT; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	08/24/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.30	910.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: UPDATED DAMAGES CLAIMS FROM BARBARA LEY; REVIEW NOTICE OF UPDATED DAMAGES FROM BARBARA LEY; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S OBJECTIONS TO PLAINTIFF'S REVISED DAMAGES
1658.0001	08/25/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	REVIEW COURT ORDER RE: HEARING ON DEFENDANT'S OBJECTIONS TO UPDATED DAMAGES; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME
1658.0001	08/26/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	REVIEW SUNOCO'S SUPPLEMENTAL NOTICE AND OBJECTIONS REGARDING UPDATED TRIAL DAMAGES; MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND PREPARATIONS FOR HEARING
1658.0001	08/27/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.30	910.00	REVIEW SUNOCO'S OBJECTIONS TO UPDATED DAMAGES CALCULATIONS; PARTICIPATE IN VIDEO HEARING RE: SAME AND ENTRY OF FINAL JUDGMENT; REVIEW MULTIPLE FILINGS RELATED TO JUDGMENT AND APPEAL; COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE: SAME
1658.0001	08/28/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	REVIEW JOINT MOTION TO PREPARE ADDITIONAL TRIAL TRANSCRIPT; COMMUNICATIONS WITH -CO-COUNSEL RE: SAME AND APPEAL ISSUES
1658.0001	08/30/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.90	2,030.00	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	08/31/2020	PMJ	700.00	4.70	3,290.00	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN, DREW PATE, AND BRAD BECKWORTH RE: [REDACTED]; TELECONFERENCE WITH PERRY CLINE RE: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/01/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	Continue legal research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/02/2020	PMJ	700.00	7.40	5,180.00	Continue legal research re: [REDACTED]; teleconference with Susan Whatley re: same; multiple communications with Pat Ryan and Jason Ryan re: motion for fees/costs; review and comment on draft proposed plan for distribution; review and comment on draft joint motion to suspend cost and fee-related deadlines; review joint motion to approve stipulation regarding deposition testimony played at trial; review order granting same
1658.0001	09/03/2020	PMJ	700.00	5.40	3,780.00	Communications with Barbara Ley re: allocation issues; work on draft Affidavit for Barbara Ley re: proposed allocation; legal research re: [REDACTED]; communications with Jason Ryan and Pat Ryan re: same
1658.0001	09/04/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.70	1,890.00	Review Orders and Judgment re: testimony from Barbara Ley regarding methodology for calculating damages in individual and class-wide basis; teleconference with Barbara Ley and Adam Farr re: same and proposed plan for distribution of damages to the Class; review proposed exhibit for Barbara Ley Declaration; continue

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	09/07/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	drafting Declaration for proposed plan for distribution of damages; follow-up communications with Barbara Ley, Adam Farr, and co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	09/08/2020	PMJ	700.00	5.90	4,130.00	Multiple emails with Drew Pate re: Barbara Ley's Declaration on Proposed Plan for Distribution of Judgment to Class Members; [REDACTED]; emails with Barbara Ley re: same; review proposed exhibit to Barbara Ley's Declaration; emails re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/09/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review authority on class action fees/costs
1658.0001	09/10/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Review Order granting Joint Motion to Stay Deadlines related to attorney fees and costs; teleconference with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/17/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Review legal authorities addressing [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/22/2020	PMJ	700.00	5.90	4,130.00	Review Defendants' Response and Objections to Plaintiff's Proposed Distribution Plan for damages awarded to class members; legal research re: [REDACTED]; legal research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/23/2020	PMJ	700.00	4.40	3,080.00	Conference with Pat Ryan and Jason Ryan re: analysis of Defendants' Response and Objections to Plaintiff's proposed distribution plan; emails with co-counsel re: same; legal research re: analyze authority identified in Defendants' Response and Objections
1658.0001	09/24/2020	PMJ	700.00	4.50	3,150.00	Legal research re: [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; review Defendants' Motion for New Trial and Motion to Alter or Amend Judgment; communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	09/25/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	Review record materials to identify support for Reply re: proposed Distribution Plan; communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	09/26/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	Legal research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/27/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	Review legal authority cited in Defendants' Response and Objections to proposed Distribution Plan; review Defendants' Motion for New Trial and Brief in Support
1658.0001	09/28/2020	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	Legal research re: [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; review and comment on Reply in support of distribution plan; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same and appellate issues
1658.0001	09/29/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	09/30/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Communications with Barbara Ley re: plan of disbursement
1658.0001	10/01/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review Defendants' Motion for Leave to file Sur-Reply in support of objections to Plaintiff's Plan for Distribution of Damages; communications with co-counsel re: appellate issues
1658.0001	10/01/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.10	70.00	Review Plaintiff's Response to Defendants' Motion for Leave to file Sur-Reply re: Plaintiff's Plan for Distribution
1658.0001	10/02/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review Order granting Defendants' Motion for Leave to File Sur-Reply in opposition to Plaintiff's Plan of Distribution; conference with Pat Ryan re: case activity
1658.0001	10/08/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review Class Representative's Response to Defendant's Motion for New Trial
1658.0001	10/13/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Review Court Order directing the parties to submit briefing on allocation vs. distribution plans; legal research re: same;

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	10/15/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	communications with Jason Ryan and Pat Ryan re: same
1658.0001	10/16/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Communications with Jason Ryan and Pat Ryan re: briefing on allocation vs. distribution in response to Court Order
1658.0001	10/19/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Communications with Jason Ryan re: Plaintiff's briefing on allocation vs. distribution; Review Sunoco's briefing on allocation vs. distribution issues
1658.0001	10/22/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review Defendants' Reply in Support of Motion for New Trial and Reply in Support of Motion to Alter/Amend Judgment
1658.0001	10/30/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Plan of Allocation Order; Review multiple notices re: Sunoco's appeal of various rulings by district court
1658.0001	11/03/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review Sunoco's supplemental brief on finality of judgment; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	11/06/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	11/16/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	Review and comment on draft Memorandum in support of finality of judgment; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	11/17/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	Review the parties briefs on jurisdictional issues; review associated orders/notices; follow-up communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	11/20/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	11/23/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Communications with co-counsel re: status of appeal and pending district court motions to alter order/judgment and for new trial
1658.0001	11/30/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: response to Defendant's Motion for New Trial and Motion to Alter Order/Judgment and appellate issues
1658.0001	12/09/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	Review District Court Opinion and Order denying Defendants' Motion to Amend Judgment and Motion for New Trial; review associated filings in Appeal; [REDACTED]
1658.0001	01/15/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/10/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Teleconference with class member seeking information on the status of case and appeal
1658.0001	02/15/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	Communications with co-counsel re: state court disposition docket and status of appeal; communications with class members re: status of case
1658.0001	03/23/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.10	70.00	Review Joint Stipulation on Interest Payments
1658.0001	10/28/2021	PMJ	700.00	2.70	1,890.00	Multiple communications with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]; review prior checks and associated materials from Sunoco re: statutory interest; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	10/29/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Conference with Jason Ryan re: Energy Transfer statutory interest check to Perry Cline; communications with Barbara Ley/Adam Farr re: same; review emails from co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	11/03/2021	PMJ	700.00	5.20	3,640.00	Communications with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same and next steps in appeal and at district court; legal research re: same
1658.0001	11/04/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Multiple communications with Pat Ryan, Jason Ryan, and other co-counsel re: appellate procedures after dismissal of appeal and next steps in district court; review materials related to same
1658.0001	11/04/2021	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	Legal research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	11/19/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	Communications with co-counsel re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	11/22/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Legal research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	12/01/2021	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: next steps in district court after mandate from Court of Appeals; review filings related to fees/costs/allocation; legal research re: same and writ of execution on judgment
1658.0001	12/02/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline
1658.0001	12/04/2021	PMJ	700.00	3.10	2,170.00	Legal research re: requirements for executing on Sunoco's property to satisfy Judgment
1658.0001	12/05/2021	PMJ	700.00	4.40	3,080.00	Continue research re: substantive/procedural requirements for executing on Sunoco's property to satisfy Judgment; draft memo re: same
1658.0001	12/06/2021	PMJ	700.00	4.60	3,220.00	Continue drafting memorandum discussing substantive/procedural requirements for executing on Sunoco's property to satisfy

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	12/06/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	Judgment; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same and post-judgment discovery/asset hearing requirements Multiple communications with co-counsel re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	12/07/2021	PMJ	700.00	4.60	3,220.00	Revise/finalize memorandum discussing procedural/substantive requirements for executing on Sunoco's property to satisfy Judgment; legal research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	12/08/2021	PMJ	700.00	4.90	3,430.00	Legal research re: Rule 62(f); multiple communications with co-counsel re: same, enforcement of Judgment, next steps in district court, and communications with defense counsel
1658.0001	12/13/2021	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	Review and comment on draft motion to extend deadline for filing motions for fees/costs and draft motion to set asset hearing; multiple follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	12/20/2021	PMJ	700.00	4.60	3,220.00	Review Memorandum re: procedural and substantive requirements for executing on Judgment; legal research re: review Oklahoma law on domestication of foreign judgments and execution on judgments and supersedeas bonds; multiple conferences and teleconferences with Pat Ryan and other co-counsel re: same; emails re: same
1658.0001	12/21/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Legal research re: procedural/substantive requirements for executing on Final Judgment against Sunoco
1658.0001	12/27/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Communications with co-counsel re: pending motion for asset hearing and execution on final judgment
1658.0001	01/03/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Communications with co-counsel re: replies in support of motion for attorneys' fees and motion for asset hearing
1658.0001	01/10/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.60	1,120.00	Review and comment on draft reply in support of motion for asset hearing and motion for extension of time to file motion in support of attorneys' fees; communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	01/11/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	Review Order postponing disposition of Plaintiff's Motion for Asset Hearing and Motion to extend date for briefing on attorneys' fees; follow-up communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	02/03/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.90	2,030.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: activity in District Court after denial of Sunoco's Petition for Writ; review and comment on notice to District Court re: denial of Petition for Writ and pending Motion to set hearing on assets and briefing for attorneys' fees; multiple follow-up communications re: same; review Order setting briefing deadline for attorneys' fees; [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/04/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.60	1,820.00	Multiple communications with Pat Ryan, Jason Ryan, and other co-counsel re: review of District Court Order setting briefing deadline for motion for attorneys' fees, notice to class, etc.; follow-up communications re: preparations for same; [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/07/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review Court Order granting part of Plaintiff's Motion to Set Asset Hearing; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	02/08/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	Extended conference call with co-counsel re: preparations for asset hearing, briefing on attorneys' fees, and communications with defense counsel; follow-up teleconference with Jason Ryan re: same
1658.0001	02/08/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.90	1,330.00	[REDACTED]; review post-trial interest payments to Mr. Cline; review Joint Stipulation regarding post-Judgment interest payments to class members; communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	02/08/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	Legal Research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/10/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Teleconference with co-counsel re: preparations for Status Conference on Plaintiff's Motion to Set Asset Hearing
1658.0001	02/10/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.90	1,330.00	Legal research re: procedural/substantive requirements for asset hearing and Plaintiff's request for Sunoco to produce documents in advance of hearing
1658.0001	02/10/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.70	1,190.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: identification of Sunoco's property and requirements to enforce Final Judgment by executing on such property
1658.0001	02/10/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Multiple communications with Pat Ryan and Jason Ryan re:

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	02/10/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	preparation for Status Conference on Plaintiff's Motion for Asset Hearing
1658.0001	02/10/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	Participate in Status Conference on Plaintiff's Motion to Set Asset Hearing
1658.0001	02/11/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Review Sunoco's Motion to Amend Plan of Allocation/Final Judgment
1658.0001	02/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Legal research re: federal and state procedural requirements for enforcing Final Judgment entered against Sunoco
1658.0001	02/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Review materials re: Statement of Judgment to be filed in Payne County; communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	02/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	Legal research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	Review Sunoco's Rule 58/60 Motion for new final judgment; communications with co-counsel re: response to same
1658.0001	02/15/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/15/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	Legal research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/15/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.00	700.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/16/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.90	1,330.00	Review materials re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/16/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/16/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Conference with Jason Ryan re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/16/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.10	70.00	Identify [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/17/2022	PMJ	700.00	4.40	3,080.00	Review Sunoco's Supplement to Motion to Amend Plan of Allocation and Final Judgment
1658.0001	02/17/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	Review [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/17/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Sunoco's Motion for Injunction related to enforcement of Final Judgment; review Sunoco's opposition to Plaintiff's request for Sunoco to produce documents at Hearing on Assets, including associated Exhibits
1658.0001	02/17/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	Communications with co-counsel re: Sunoco's pending motions and Plaintiff's responses thereto
1658.0001	02/17/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	Legal research re: Rule 62 and bond issues; post-judgment motions; and finality of judgment/allocation plan issues
1658.0001	02/18/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.60	1,820.00	Legal research re: identify authority to refute Sunoco's arguments in Brief in Opposition to request to appear and produce documents at Asset Hearing
1658.0001	02/18/2022	PMJ	700.00	3.90	2,730.00	Review [REDACTED]; conference with Jason Ryan re: same
1658.0001	02/20/2022	PMJ	700.00	5.80	4,060.00	Identify evidentiary support for Plaintiff's response in support of asset discovery; legal research re: Oklahoma statute and case law authorizing asset discovery; communications with Jason Ryan and Drew Pate re: same
1658.0001	02/21/2022	PMJ	700.00	7.80	5,460.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: brief addressing the production of documents at asset hearing; draft brief in support of Class Representative's request for Defendants to produce documents before/at asset hearing; legal research re: asset hearing procedure in Oklahoma
1658.0001	02/21/2022	PMJ	700.00	7.80	5,460.00	Review and comment on draft Motion to Strike Defendants' Opposed Motion to Modify the Plan of Allocation Order and Issue a Rule 58 Judgment; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same; continue drafting brief in support of request for Court to require the production of documents at the asset hearing; identify materials to be used as exhibits to brief; draft proposed order for Court; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same; review proposed revisions to asset hearing brief; multiple communications with co-counsel re: identification of Defendants assets and procedures to execute on such properties to satisfy Judgment; [REDACTED]

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	Description
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	02/22/2022	PMJ	700.00	7.10	4,970.00	[REDACTED]; communications with co-counsel re: response to Defendants' Motion to Enjoin Enforcement of Judgment; legal research re: Oklahoma procedural/substantive requirements for asset hearing/post-judgment proceedings
1658.0001	02/23/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Sunoco's Application for extension of time to file petition for writ of certiorari; follow-up communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	02/23/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.90	1,330.00	[REDACTED]; multiple communications with Jason Ryan and Pat Ryan re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/24/2022	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	Review and comment on draft Motion to Strike Sunoco's Motion to Modify Plan of Allocation/Rule 58 Motion; review and comment on draft Response to Motion to Sunoco's Motion to Modify Plan of Allocation/Rule 58 Motion; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same; teleconference with Class Representative re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/24/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	Legal research re: [REDACTED]; multiple communications with Jason Ryan and Pat Ryan re: same
1658.0001	02/27/2022	PMJ	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	[REDACTED]; legal research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	02/28/2022	PMJ	700.00	4.40	3,080.00	[REDACTED]; review timesheets and expense documentation; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same and Motion for fees/costs; [REDACTED]; review Sunoco's motion for leave to file reply brief in support of opposition to document production for asset hearing
1658.0001	03/01/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Sunoco's Reply in Opposition to Document Discovery Concerning Defendants' Property and Assets and supplemental Declaration filed in support
1658.0001	03/01/2022	PMJ	700.00	3.30	2,310.00	[REDACTED]; multiple teleconferences with Pat Ryan re: same; conference with Jason Ryan re: [REDACTED]; multiple communications with co-counsel re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	03/02/2022	PMJ	700.00	4.10	2,870.00	Multiple communications with Jason Ryan and co-counsel re: [REDACTED]; review Ryan Whaley's timesheets; review stipulation with Defendants re: fees/costs; teleconference with Jason Ryan re: same; review Motion to Strike Motion to Enjoin Enforcement of Judgment
1658.0001	03/03/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: motion for fees/costs
1658.0001	03/04/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	Review draft Motion for Statutory Costs and Fees and Motion to approve form/manner of Notice to class regarding Motion for Fees and Expenses
1658.0001	03/04/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Sunoco's Reply in support of Motion opposing asset discovery; follow-up communications re: same
1658.0001	03/07/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	Multiple communications with Pat Ryan and Jason Ryan re: review of motion for fees/costs; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: final review of same
1658.0001	03/08/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	Review Sunoco's Response to Motion to Strike Motion to Amend Judgment; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same; review and comment on draft Reply in support of Motion to Strike and identify support for Reply

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	03/09/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.00	700.00	Review and comment on Reply in support of motion to enjoin enforcement of judgment; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	03/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Communications with co-counsel re: pending motions and asset discovery
1658.0001	03/18/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.10	70.00	Review Court Notice re: setting of motion hearing
1658.0001	03/23/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Communications with co-counsel re: preparations for motion hearing
1658.0001	03/23/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Telephone conference with class member calling to inquire about status of case
1658.0001	03/24/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Court Order on Motion Hearing; communications with co-counsel re: preparations for hearing
1658.0001	03/28/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Communications with co-counsel re: preparations for Motions Hearing
1658.0001	03/29/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Obtain Sunoco's Second Application for extension of time to file Petition for Certiorari; follow-up communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	03/30/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review materials in preparation for Motion Hearing
1658.0001	03/31/2022	PMJ	700.00	4.40	3,080.00	Review Motions and key appellate documents to prepare for hearing; identify record support for presentation/argument at hearing; attend Motions hearing via Zoom; follow-up communications re: same
1658.0001	04/01/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline
1658.0001	04/01/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.10	70.00	Review Minutes from Motions Hearing and Order granting in part/denying in part Defendant's Motion to stay enforcement of judgment
1658.0001	04/05/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Communications with co-counsel re: contact with Magistrate Judge to set date for mediation; follow-up communications re: preparations for same
1658.0001	04/06/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Court Order denying Defendant's motion to alter/amend Judgment; communications with co-counsel re: efforts to set mediation as directed by the Court
1658.0001	04/11/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: preparations for settlement conference with Judge Colombell
1658.0001	04/12/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	Review Memorandum from Judge Colombell re: Procedures for Settlement Conference; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: preparations for Settlement Conference
1658.0001	04/13/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Communications with co-counsel re: Judge Colombell's Memorandum Regarding Procedures for Settlement Conference; teleconference with Pat Ryan re: settlement conference and case status
1658.0001	04/18/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Communications with co-counsel re: materials required by court before settlement conference
1658.0001	04/19/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline
1658.0001	04/22/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: preparations for mediation
1658.0001	04/22/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.60	1,120.00	Review materials to prepare for Mediation Statement drafting; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	04/25/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline; multiple communications with co-counsel re: preparations for mediation
1658.0001	04/28/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	Revise draft Mediation Statement; follow-up communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	04/29/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Review and comment on revised Mediation Statement
1658.0001	04/29/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Communications with co-counsel re: response to Petition for Writ of Certiorari
1658.0001	05/02/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	Review and comment on revised Mediation Statement; communications with co-counsel re: activity in District Court and preparations for Mediation
1658.0001	05/02/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Review Defendants' new appellate filings; communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	05/09/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Multiple communications with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]; multiple communications with co-counsel re: preparations for mediation
1658.0001	05/10/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: preparation for mediation
1658.0001	05/12/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.60	1,820.00	Review materials in preparation for mediation; multiple communications with co-counsel re: preparations for mediation; multiple communications with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	05/13/2022	PMJ	700.00	7.20	5,040.00	Meet with Perry Cline in preparation for settlement conference;

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
						participate in settlement conference with Judge Colombell; follow-up communications with Perry Cline and co-counsel re: [REDACTED]
1658.0001	05/16/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	Review multiple filings in the District Court; conferences with Pat Ryan and Jason Ryan re: follow-up from settlement conference
1658.0001	05/25/2022	PMJ	700.00	5.30	3,710.00	Review materials to prepare for mediation; participate in mediation; follow-up communications with co-counsel and Perry Cline
1658.0001	06/09/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review Sunoco's Response to Plaintiff's Notice regarding asset discovery and judgment enforcement proceedings; follow-up communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	06/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review Order re: supplemental briefing on attorney fees and proceedings to enforce Judgment
1658.0001	06/17/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Communications re: fee motion update
1658.0001	06/20/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Review Order requesting supplemental briefing on notice to class; review record materials related to same; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same and draft supplemental briefing
1658.0001	06/20/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Respond to request for information from Class member, [REDACTED]
1658.0001	06/21/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	Review Plaintiff's Supplemental Briefing on Motion to approve form and manner of service of service to class; communication with class representative re: case activity
1658.0001	06/22/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Communications with co-counsel re: pending motions and discovery in support of efforts to execute on judgment
1658.0001	06/28/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	Communications with co-counsel re: pending motions and asset discovery for executing on judgment
1658.0001	07/05/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline
1658.0001	07/06/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review Defendants' Response to Motion to approve form and notice to class, set schedule, and address fees/costs; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	07/11/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.10	70.00	Review filings in District Court
1658.0001	07/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	Review filings/orders re: authorization to pursue enforcement of judgment; conference with Jason Ryan re: same; emails with co-counsel re: enforcement of judgment and identification of Sunoco assets/property
1658.0001	07/15/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	Review information on Defendants' assets subject to enforcement of judgment; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same; review Orders governing enforcement of judgment and related discovery
1658.0001	07/18/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Review authorities governing enforcement of judgment; review information on Sunoco's assets; communications with Jason Ryan and James Warner re: same
1658.0001	07/20/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	Review materials in support of enforcement activities; conference with Jason Ryan re: same
1658.0001	07/21/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: Statements of Judgment filed in various counties in efforts to enforce judgment; review materials related to same
1658.0001	07/22/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Review Statements of Judgment; communications with co-counsel re: same and efforts to execute/enforce judgment
1658.0001	08/08/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: enforcement of judgment; review procedures/requirements for seizing property in satisfaction of judgment; review briefing and Orders addressing asset discovery
1658.0001	08/09/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.30	910.00	Review Order requiring Defendants to appear and answer concerning property and assets; follow-up communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	08/10/2022	PMJ	700.00	3.60	2,520.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: preparations for asset hearing; review defendants' filings re: same and status of defendants' corporate disclosures; legal research re: enforcement of judgments
1658.0001	08/11/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: enforcement of judgment and preparations for asset hearing; review information related to defendants' assets
1658.0001	08/17/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Conference with Jason Ryan re: preparation for asset hearing
1658.0001	08/22/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	Review corporate filings re: Defendants' corporate name changes/updates; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same and additional efforts to prepare for asset hearing/enforce judgment

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	08/23/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	Review Defendants' Brief re: Objections to Order for Production of Documents and Asset Hearing; follow-up communications re: same; identify support for Plaintiff's response to Defendants' Objections
1658.0001	08/24/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.90	1,330.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: Plaintiff's Response to Defendants' Objections to asset discovery and efforts to enforce judgment; review materials re: identification of Defendants' property subject to seizure in satisfaction of Judgment
1658.0001	08/25/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.60	1,120.00	Review Plaintiff's Response to Defendants' Objections to asset hearing and related discovery; communications with co-counsel re: same and preparations for asset hearing and enforcement of Judgment; review notice to District Court re: Tenth Circuit Court's denial of Defendants' Motion for Stay/Injunctive Relief and Motion for Administrative Stay
1658.0001	08/26/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: enforcement of judgment and preparations for asset hearing
1658.0001	08/27/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	Review materials related to enforcement of Judgment; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same and preparations for asset hearing
1658.0001	08/29/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Teleconference with Pat Ryan re: issues related to enforcement of Judgment and preparations for asset hearing; review Defendants' Reply in Support of Objections to Magistrate Judge's Order for Production; teleconference with Perry Cline
1658.0001	08/30/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	Review materials related to enforcement of judgment; review legal authority for same and demonstrating wrongful transfer of assets; communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	09/02/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	Review Notice of Non-compliance With Court Order re: asset discovery; follow-up communications re: same; review Defendants' production related to asset discovery; communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	09/06/2022	PMJ	700.00	4.30	3,010.00	Research re: procedures for executing on Defendants' property/bank accounts to secure payment of judgment; multiple communications with co-counsel re: preparations for asset hearing
1658.0001	09/07/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.90	2,030.00	Teleconference with co-counsel re: preparations for asset hearing; review Defendants' production of documents related to assets; legal research re: enforcement of judgment
1658.0001	09/08/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	Review Defendants' Response to Plaintiff's Notice of Non-Compliance; follow-up communications re: same; extended teleconference with Emily Kitch re: preparation for asset hearing; identify materials for asset hearing; review briefing on asset discovery
1658.0001	09/09/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline; multiple communications with co-counsel; review materials in preparation for asset hearing; review supplemental production of documents from Defendants
1658.0001	09/11/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	Review materials in preparation for asset hearing
1658.0001	09/12/2022	PMJ	700.00	11.40	7,980.00	Review materials in preparation for asset hearing; attend asset hearing in Muskogee; follow-up communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	09/13/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Communications with client; communications with co-counsel re: follow-up from asset hearing
1658.0001	09/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	Identify materials Defendants agreed to produce during testimony/negotiations at asset hearing; communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	09/19/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	Communications with co-counsel re: follow-up from asset hearing and Defendants' supplemental production of documents; review Defendants' Response to Plaintiff's Draft Report & Recommendation re: asset discovery and execution on judgment
1658.0001	09/27/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Defendants' Opposed Motion for Leave to File Sur-Reply and proposed Sur-Reply; communications re: same
1658.0001	10/03/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Communications with co-counsel re: efforts to collect Judgment; review multiple filings re: same
1658.0001	10/04/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	Review Defendants' Sur-Reply in opposition to proposed Report and Recommendation re: asset hearing; multiple communications re: efforts to enforce Judgment
1658.0001	10/05/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Communications with co-counsel re: enforcement of Judgment; review legal support/procedures for same
1658.0001	10/07/2022	PMJ	700.00	4.50	3,150.00	Review requirements/procedures for serving garnishment summons; draft affidavits for service of garnishment summons;

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	10/10/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	multiple communications with co-counsel re: same Review rules governing service and proof thereof; finalize affidavits in support of service of garnishment summons; communications with counsel for garnishee; multiple follow-up communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	10/11/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.60	1,820.00	Review final affidavits from process servers; communications re: filing requirements and proof of service; review status of certified mail service on garnishees; teleconference with Valero re: garnishment summons; multiple communications with co-counsel re: enforcement of judgment and filing by defendant; review defendant's emergency motion
1658.0001	10/11/2022	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	Continue working on various motions, briefs, and declarations to be filed in support of request for final approval of settlement; communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	10/12/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Communications with co-counsel re: response to Defendant's emergency motion
1658.0001	10/13/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Communications with co-counsel re: Defendants Motion to Deposit Funds
1658.0001	10/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review Answer filed by Garnishee Castleton Commodities Merchant Trading
1658.0001	10/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review Defendants' multiple affidavits re: Garnishment Summons; communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	10/19/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.30	910.00	Communication with Perry Cline; review recent Energy Transfer payment to Perry Cline; review prior payments to Cline; follow-up communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	10/20/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Communications with co-counsel; review email from Court re: settlement negotiations
1658.0001	10/21/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.10	70.00	Review Defendants' Motion for Hearing on their Emergency Motion to deposit funds
1658.0001	10/25/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Communications re: hearing on Defendants' Emergency Motion to deposit funds into court registry
1658.0001	10/28/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	Review emails re: status of settlement efforts; teleconference with Perry Cline; review materials re: Energy Transfer statutory interest check to Perry Cline
1658.0001	10/31/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Garnishee Answer filed by Phillips 66 Company; follow-up communications
1658.0001	11/03/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	Review Defendants' Notice re: payment of judgment into Settlement Administrator account; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same and garnishment summons
1658.0001	11/07/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: Report and Recommendation, garnishment summonses, and status of case
1658.0001	11/08/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Teleconference with [REDACTED], class member, re: inquiry regarding status of case
1658.0001	11/09/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Review multiple filings by Defendants re: Affidavits of Verified Amended Answers and Motions to Dismiss Garnishment Proceeding; review legal authority cited therein; communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	12/12/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline
1658.0001	12/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review Agreed Response to Report and Recommendation re: enforcement proceedings; communications re: same
1658.0001	12/19/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Communications re: Motion to update proposed schedule for notice to class and associated briefing; review final Motion
1658.0001	12/19/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline
1658.0001	12/20/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Order adopting Judge West's Findings and Recommendations; communications with co-counsel re: motions/documentation in support of distribution to class, case contribution, and attorneys' fees/costs
1658.0001	12/21/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Communications with co-counsel re: motions/declarations in support of distributions from Judgment Fund
1658.0001	01/03/2023	PMJ	700.00	0.10	70.00	Review Defendants' Notice of Withdrawal of Opposition; communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	01/06/2023	PMJ	700.00	1.70	1,190.00	Review orders setting hearing on attorneys' fees and notice to class re: attorneys' fees and case contribution award; multiple communications with co-counsel; communications with Perry Cline
1658.0001	01/07/2023	PMJ	700.00	6.40	4,480.00	Multiple communications with Jason Ryan re: filings in support of case contribution award; review materials from record re: identify support for briefing on case contribution award

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	01/08/2023	PMJ	700.00	3.70	2,590.00	Continue working on materials to be filed in support of notice to class and filing for hearing on incentive award and final distribution to class; multiple communications with Jason Ryan and Perry Cline
1658.0001	01/09/2023	PMJ	700.00	3.30	2,310.00	Multiple communications with Jason Ryan, Drew Pate, and Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]; work on materials to be filed in support of same
1658.0001	01/10/2023	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	Review materials re: notice to class; communications with co-counsel re: same and preparations for hearing; review filing by Defendants
1658.0001	01/11/2023	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	Communications with co-counsel; continue working on materials for February 28 hearing
1658.0001	01/12/2023	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	Work on filings for February 28 hearing; teleconference with class member [REDACTED] re: status of case; teleconference with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0001	01/16/2023	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	Work on filings for February 28 hearing
1658.0001	01/17/2023	PMJ	700.00	1.70	1,190.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: filings in support of February 28 hearing; work on declarations, motion, and briefing for hearing; teleconference with class member re: questions about postcard notice
1658.0001	01/18/2023	PMJ	700.00	4.20	2,940.00	Review/revise draft declaration for Paul Walker; review/revise draft declaration for Dr. Caldwell; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same and additional filings for February 28 hearing; review trial transcripts and exhibits re: identify support for declarations
1658.0001	01/19/2023	PMJ	700.00	5.80	4,060.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline; work on Dr. Caldwell's declaration; multiple teleconferences with Pat Ryan re: same; review trial transcript, deposition testimony, and trial exhibits re: identify support for declarations from Dr. Caldwell and Perry Cline; work on Perry Cline's declaration; review updated declaration for Paul Walker
1658.0001	01/20/2023	PMJ	700.00	3.20	2,240.00	Review/comment on Walker Declaration; multiple communications re: same; work on Cline Declaration; communications re: support for motions/memoranda/declarations; teleconference with class member calling for information after receiving Notice
1658.0001	01/21/2023	PMJ	700.00	5.70	3,990.00	Review/revise Declaration of Perry Cline; review record materials re: identify support for same; multiple communications with Perry Cline; review revised Declaration for Paul Walker; work on additional filings for February 28 hearing
1658.0001	01/23/2023	PMJ	700.00	6.40	4,480.00	Multiple communications with Perry Cline; revise Cline Declaration; work on Motion and Memorandum in support of request for Case Contribution Award; legal research re: identify support for same; multiple communications with co-counsel re: filings for February 28; work on Ryan Whaley Declaration
1658.0001	01/24/2023	PMJ	700.00	5.90	4,130.00	Work on filings for February 28 Hearing; continue drafting memo in support of case contribution award; continue legal research re: same; multiple communications with Susan Whatley and Jason Ryan re: filings for February 28 hearing; review declaration information from class members; multiple teleconferences with class members calling for information on February 28 hearing after receiving Notice
1658.0001	01/24/2023	PMJ	700.00	2.60	1,820.00	Continue working on Ryan Whaley declaration and supporting materials; multiple communications/conferences with Pat Ryan, Jason Ryan, and Susan Whatley
1658.0001	01/25/2023	PMJ	700.00	4.60	3,220.00	Continue legal research re: case contribution awards; multiple conferences with Jason Ryan re: Cline Declaration and Walker Declaration and briefing for case contribution award; review draft declarations for class counsel; review time sheets; work on filings for February 28 hearing; multiple teleconferences with class members calling for information after receiving Notice
1658.0001	01/26/2023	PMJ	700.00	5.60	3,920.00	Work on filings for February 28 hearing; multiple teleconferences with class members calling for information on February 28 hearing and status of case; multiple communications with co-counsel
1658.0001	01/27/2023	PMJ	700.00	7.80	5,460.00	Conference with Paul Walker; revise Declaration for Walker; multiple communications with Pat Ryan and Drew Pate; review record support for case contribution award; revise/continue drafting

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
						Memorandum in support of Motion for Case Contribution Award; review Ryan Whaley litigation expenses re Motion for Reimbursement; teleconference with class member calling for information about Notice and February 28 Hearing; legal research re: information to redact from timesheets
1658.0001	01/28/2023	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	Additional legal research to support Case Contribution Award briefing; review absent class member declarations; revise Motion and Memorandum in support of Case Contribution Award; communications with Pat Ryan and Drew Pate
1658.0001	01/29/2023	PMJ	700.00	8.80	6,160.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: Motion and Memorandum in support of request for Case Contribution Award; revise Cline Declaration; review Nix Patterson Declaration; work on Ryan Whaley Declaration; review Ryan Whaley fee/expense supporting materials; multiple teleconferences with Jason Ryan
Subtotal for Timekeeper PMJ			Billable	1,990.45	1,393,315.00	Paula M. Jantzen
1658.0001	06/14/2017	JM	275.00	2.30	632.50	REVIEW PETITION; PREPARE APPEARANCES FOR BURRAGE, NIX PATTERSON, RICHARDS & CONNER, RYAN WHALEY; PREPARE CIVIL COVER SHEET; PREPARE SUMMONSES FOR DEFENDANTS; DISCUSSIONS WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE CHANGES TO PETITION
1658.0001	06/30/2017	JM	275.00	0.60	165.00	FINALIZE ALL DOCUMENTS AND EMAIL TO ALL COUNSEL RE DOCUMENTS NEEDING SIGNATURE TO FILE LAWSUIT
1658.0001	06/30/2017	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE STATUS OF FILING LAWSUIT
1658.0001	07/05/2017	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	COMMUNICATION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE NIX PATTERSON APPEARANCE AND EMAIL TO DREW PATE FORWARDING APPEARANCE FOR SIGNATURE
1658.0001	07/06/2017	JM	275.00	1.00	275.00	FINALIZE ALL DOCUMENTS FOR FILING NEW LAWSUIT AND FORWARD TO SEMINOLE COUNTY FOR FILING
1658.0001	07/10/2017	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	COMMUNICATION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE STATUS OF LAWSUIT
1658.0001	07/14/2017	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	SERVE SUMMONSES ON DEFENDANTS AND FORWARD ALL INITIAL FILINGS TO CO-COUNSEL
1658.0001	08/01/2017	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	EMAILS WITH PAT RYAN AND JASON RYAN RE SERVICE ON DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	08/07/2017	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	EMAIL WITH LARRY MURPHY RE SERVICE ON DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	08/10/2017	JM	275.00	1.00	275.00	FINALIZE AND SERVE DISCOVERY ON DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	08/14/2017	JM	275.00	1.00	275.00	PREPARE RETURNS OF SERVICE FOR FILING WITH CLERK
1658.0001	08/15/2017	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	REVIEW ALL REMOVAL RELATED FILINGS AND FORWARD PERTINENT DEADLINES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	08/16/2017	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	PREPARE DRAFT OF LETTER TO SUNOCO COUNSEL RE CONSENT TO PROCEED BEFORE MAGISTRATE JUDGE
1658.0001	08/16/2017	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	DISCUSSION WITH PAT RYAN RE PREPARING LETTER TO DEFENSE COUNSEL RE PROCEEDING BEFORE MAGISTRATE JUDGE
1658.0001	08/17/2017	JM	275.00	0.60	165.00	PREPARE NOTICE RE CORRESPONDENCE TO DEFENSE COUNSEL AND FORWARD TO PAT RYAN
1658.0001	08/17/2017	JM	275.00	1.20	330.00	PREPARE AND FILE APPEARANCES FOR PAT RYAN, PHILIP WHALEY, JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/18/2017	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW COURT'S ORDER SETTING SCHEDULING CONFERENCE AND FORWARD RELATED DEADLINES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	09/05/2017	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT ORDERS REASSIGNING CASE TO DIFFERENT JUDGE AND STRIKING ANY PREVIOUS DEADLINES
1658.0001	09/19/2017	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW RE-ISSUED DISCOVERY TO DEFENDANTS AND FORWARD RESPONSE DEADLINE TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	09/19/2017	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE INITIAL DISCLOSURES
1658.0001	09/20/2017	JM	275.00	2.00	550.00	PREPARE DRAFT OF PLAINTIFF'S INITIAL DISCLOSURES AND DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	09/28/2017	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER SETTING SCHEDULING CONFERENCE AND FORWARD DATE AND RELATED DEADLINES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	10/10/2017	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW RECENT FILINGS IN CASE
1658.0001	10/13/2017	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE SHEET RE STATUS CONFERENCE AND FORWARD DEADLINE TO SUBMIT REVISED PROPOSED SCHEDULING ORDER
1658.0001	10/18/2017	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES
1658.0001	10/24/2017	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	SUBMIT PLAINTIFF'S PROPOSED SCHEDULING ORDER TO COURT PER LOCAL RULES AND DISCUSSION WITH JASON RYAN RE SAME

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001						
1658.0001	10/24/2017	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW ALL PARTIES PROPOSED SCHEDULING ORDERS
1658.0001	10/25/2017	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	REVIEW COURT'S SCHEDULING ORDER AND FORWARD ALL DEADLINES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	10/27/2017	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE INITIAL DISCLOSURES AND WORK ON INITIAL DISCLOSURES
1658.0001	12/05/2017	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	UPDATE TABLE OF ACTIONS AND DEADLINES AND DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	01/02/2018	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	ASSIST CLIENT WITH REVIEW OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES
1658.0001	01/05/2018	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE PRODUCTION DOCUMENTS; BATES LABEL DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION
1658.0001	01/15/2018	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	WORK ON TABLE OF ACTIONS AND DEADLINES; WORK ON PRODUCTION LOG
1658.0001	01/16/2018	JM	275.00	2.00	550.00	DISCUSSION WITH PAT RYAN RE SUNOCO PRODUCTION; DOWNLOAD SUNOCO PRODUCTION FOR REVIEW; EMAIL TO PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	03/08/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH REVIEW OF ERIC KOELLING DEPOSITION
1658.0001	03/13/2018	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH REVIEW OF SUNOCO 03/13/18 PRODUCTION
1658.0001	03/23/2018	JM	275.00	1.00	275.00	EMAILS TO PAT RYAN RE SUNOCO PRODUCTION; DOWNLOAD 02/01/18 AND 02/14/18 PRODUCTIONS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW
1658.0001	03/29/2018	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH REVIEW OF HOLLAND DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/11/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW ERRATA OF KOELLING DEPOSITION
1658.0001	05/09/2018	JM	275.00	1.80	495.00	DOWNLOAD SUNOCO PRODUCTION OF 05/07/18 AND ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH REVIEW OF SAME
1658.0001	05/29/2018	JM	275.00	0.60	165.00	DOWNLOAD 05/07/18 DOCUMENTS (WHICH WERE RE-PRODUCED BY SUNOCO) FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW AND EMAIL TO ATTORNEYS RE SAME
1658.0001	05/31/2018	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	ASSIST PAT RYAN WITH PREP FOR MEETING
1658.0001	06/01/2018	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	DOWNLOAD SUNOCO 06/01/18 PRODUCTION FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW
1658.0001	06/04/2018	JM	275.00	1.00	275.00	ACCESS AND OBTAIN ALL FILINGS IN CASE OF FOSTER TRUST V. MONTCLAIRE AS REFERENCED IN SUNOCO PRODUCTION FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW
1658.0001	06/04/2018	JM	275.00	1.50	412.50	DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE FILING MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; WORK ON EXHIBITS; REVIEW MOTION
1658.0001	06/11/2018	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	BATES NUMBER CLINE DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION AND DISCUSSIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE SAME
1658.0001	06/12/2018	JM	275.00	1.00	275.00	DOWNLOAD SUNOCO 06/11/18 PRODUCTION FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW AND ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH REVIEW
1658.0001	06/15/2018	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	ASSIST PAT RYAN WITH REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	06/18/2018	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE TO MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER AND FORWARD DEADLINE TO FILE REPLY
1658.0001	06/20/2018	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAT RYAN RE SUNOCO DOCUMENT PRODUCTION
1658.0001	06/26/2018	JM	275.00	0.70	192.50	PREPARE DRAFT OF MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE EXHIBITS UNDER SEAL
1658.0001	06/26/2018	JM	275.00	2.80	770.00	WORK ON MOTION TO COMPEL AND EXHIBITS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	06/27/2018	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER GRANTING MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER AND FORWARD NEW RELATED DEADLINES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	06/27/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER SETTING MOTION TO STRIKE PRIVILEGE LOG FOR HEARING AND FORWARD RELATED DEADLINES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	06/28/2018	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	FINALIZE AND FILE MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE EXHIBITS UNDER SEAL; PREPARE AND SUBMIT ORDER RE SAME; DISCUSSIONS WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	06/28/2018	JM	275.00	1.40	385.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' NOTICE/REQUEST TO STRIKE MOTION TO STRIKE PRIVILEGE LOG, DISCUSSION WITH PAT RYAN RE SAME, RESEARCH CASES CITED IN SAME
1658.0001	06/28/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE FILING MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE EXHIBITS UNDER SEAL
1658.0001	06/29/2018	JM	275.00	2.50	687.50	FINALIZE EXHIBITS TO BE FILED UNDER SEAL AND FORWARD TO COURT FOR FILING; SERVE ON ALL COUNSEL
1658.0001	06/29/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER RE SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEFING RE COMPLIANCE WITH LOCAL RULES AND FORWARD RELATED

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	07/02/2018	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	DEADLINE TO ATTORNEYS EMAILS TO DAN MCCLURE AND MARK CHRISTIANSEN FORWARDING EXHIBITS FILED UNDER SEAL PER MCCLURE'S REQUEST
1658.0001	07/03/2018	JM	275.00	1.50	412.50	REVIEW CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE AND SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEFING RE MOTION TO STRIKE, FINALIZE EXHIBITS AND FILE WITH COURT AND DISCUSSIONS WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	07/09/2018	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	DOWNLOAD SUNOCO 07/09/18 PRODUCTION FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW
1658.0001	07/09/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE TO MOTION TO STRIKE AND FORWARD TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	07/11/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER RE HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE PRIVILEGE LOG
1658.0001	07/12/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF MINUTE ORDER AND FORWARD RESPONSE DEADLINE TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	07/13/2018	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	SERVE 07/13/18 LETTER ON DEFENSE COUNSEL
1658.0001	07/16/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER GRANTING/DENYING IN PART DEFENDANTS' MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF 07/11/18 RULING
1658.0001	07/27/2018	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	DOWNLOAD SUNOCO 07/26/18 PRODUCTION FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW
1658.0001	08/01/2018	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	DOWNLOAD 08/01/18 SUNOCO PRODUCTION FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW
1658.0001	08/09/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	FORWARD TO ATTORNEYS RESPONSE DATE TO SUNOCO'S SECOND SET OF INTERROGATORIES
1658.0001	08/21/2018	JM	275.00	0.70	192.50	ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH PREP FOR UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS RE DOCS RECEIVED FROM OKLAHOMA CORPORATION COMMISSION
1658.0001	08/21/2018	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION NOTICES FOR DEFENDANT'S CORPORATE REP AND OTHER DEFENDANT RELATED WITNESSES AND FORWARD DATES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	08/22/2018	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	FORWARD CLINE DEPOSITION AND EXHIBITS TO NIX PATTERSON PER REQUEST OF BRITTANY KELLOGG
1658.0001	08/27/2018	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE OCC DOCUMENTS, REVISE AND RE-BATES DOCS
1658.0001	09/05/2018	JM	275.00	1.40	385.00	WORK ON AMENDED DEPOSITION NOTICES, AND FORWARD NEW DATES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	09/07/2018	JM	275.00	2.50	687.50	WORK ON MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	09/07/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	09/10/2018	JM	275.00	6.00	1,650.00	WORK ON MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	09/11/2018	JM	275.00	1.50	412.50	PREPARE DRAFT OF MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE EXHIBITS UNDER SEAL; PREPARE DRAFT OF ORDER RE SAME
1658.0001	09/11/2018	JM	275.00	2.50	687.50	WORK ON EXHIBITS TO BE FILED UNDER SEAL
1658.0001	09/11/2018	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE PREPARING MOTION TO FILE EXHIBITS UNDER SEAL, ETC.
1658.0001	09/11/2018	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	DOWNLOAD 09/10/18 PRODUCTION FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW
1658.0001	09/12/2018	JM	275.00	3.20	880.00	FINALIZE AND FILE MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE EXHIBITS UNDER SEAL; SUBMIT ORDER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH NICK IN CLERK'S OFFICE RE FORWARDING COURTESY COPY; FINALIZE EXHIBITS TO BE FILED UNDER SEAL AND FORWARD TO CLERK'S OFFICE; PREPARE COURTESY COPY OF MOTION TO COMPEL
1658.0001	09/12/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER SETTING MOTION TO COMPEL FOR HEARING AND COMMUNICATION WITH ATTORNEYS RE SAME
1658.0001	09/12/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE FILING MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE EXHIBITS UNDER SEAL
1658.0001	09/13/2018	JM	275.00	2.00	550.00	DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE EXHIBIT 9 AND SUPPLEMENTING AN EXTRA PAGE TO EXHIBIT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH NICK AT EDOK RE SAME; PREPARE CORRECTED EXHIBIT 9 AND FORWARD TO COURT; PREPARE DROPBOX AND FORWARD ALL SEALED EXHIBITS TO ALL COUNSEL; FINALIZE COURTESY COPY OF MOTION TO COMPEL AND EXHIBITS AND FORWARD TO COURT PER COURT'S REQUEST
1658.0001	09/25/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW APPEARANCE OF YANKOWSKY FOR DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	10/02/2018	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	DOWNLOAD DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE TO MOTION TO COMPEL FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW PRIOR TO HEARING
1658.0001	10/15/2018	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	ATTEMPT TO DOWNLOAD 10/12/18 SUNOCO PRODUCTION AND DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	10/16/2018	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	DOWNLOAD SUNOCO 10/12/18 PRODUCTION FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW
1658.0001	10/23/2018	JM	275.00	0.60	165.00	SET UP DEPOSITIONS FOR 10/29 AND 10/30 AND DISCUSSIONS WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	10/29/2018	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	CONFIRM 10/30/18 DEPOSITION WITH COURT REPORTER
1658.0001	10/30/2018	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	REVIEW NUMEROUS COURT FILINGS AND DISCOVERY EMAILS
1658.0001	10/31/2018	JM	275.00	1.40	385.00	WORK ON, FINALIZE AND FILE MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER; PREPARE ORDER GRANTING MOTION AND SUBMIT TO COURT
1658.0001	11/01/2018	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	REVIEW COURT'S SECOND AMENDED SCHEDULING ORDER AND FORWARD NEW DEADLINES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	11/02/2018	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	DOWNLOAD 10/25/18 CLINE DEPOSITION FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW
1658.0001	01/15/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW COURT'S THIRD AMENDED SCHEDULING ORDER AND FORWARD NEW DEADLINES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	01/30/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE PROVIDING HARD COPY OF EXPERT REPORT AND EXHIBITS TO REPORT TO DEFENSE COUNSEL
1658.0001	01/30/2019	JM	275.00	1.30	357.50	PREPARE LEY EXPERT REPORT AND EXHIBITS TO PRODUCE HARD COPIES TO DEFENSE COUNSEL AND FORWARD VIA FEDERAL EXPRESS
1658.0001	02/05/2019	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	ASSIST PAT RYAN WITH REVIEW OF ALL DISCOVERY IN CASE
1658.0001	02/14/2019	JM	275.00	1.20	330.00	REVIEW FILE RE STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND PREPARE CHART RE SAME
1658.0001	02/14/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEPOSITION NOTICE FOR BARBARA LEY AND FORWARD DATE TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	02/15/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	FINALIZE CHART RE STATUS OF DISCOVERY
1658.0001	02/21/2019	JM	275.00		0.00	ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH REVIEW OF BARBARA LEY SPREADSHEET
1658.0001	03/29/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	UPLOAD LEY DEPOSITION AND FORWARD TO NIKKI CAMERON AT NIX PATTERSON
1658.0001	04/01/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	UPLOAD AND PREPARE LINK FOR DEPOSITIONS OF AUSTIN JONES (X2) AND TERRY OAKLEY AND FORWARD TO NIKKI CAMERON PER HER REQUEST
1658.0001	04/02/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	REVIEW CASE AND PREPARE SUMMARY OF DEADLINES PER PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	04/09/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	UPLOAD AND FORWARD DOCUMENTS TO CO-COUNSEL FOR REVIEW PRIOR TO KRAUSE DEPOSITION
1658.0001	04/18/2019	JM	275.00	1.80	495.00	WORK ON REBUTTAL REPORT OF BARBARA LEY AND EMAILS WITH PAT RYAN RE SAME
1658.0001	05/02/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME AND FORWARD EXPEDITED RESPONSE DATE TO ATTORNEYS PER COURT'S MINUTE ORDER
1658.0001	05/06/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S RESPONSE AND AMENDED RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME
1658.0001	05/23/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	UPDATE SPREADSHEET RE SUMMARY OF DEADLINES AND EMAIL TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	06/05/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	FINALIZE AND FORWARD CLINE AFFIDAVIT FOR SIGNATURE
1658.0001	06/13/2019	JM	275.00	4.80	1,320.00	REVIEW DRAFT OF MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS AND BEGIN WORKING ON EXHIBITS TO MOTION
1658.0001	06/14/2019	JM	275.00	9.00	2,475.00	WORK ON, FINALIZE AND FILE MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS AND MULTIPLE DISCUSSIONS WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	06/17/2019	JM	275.00	4.00	1,100.00	FINALIZE EXHIBITS TO BE FILED UNDER SEAL RE MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS; REVIEW LOCAL RULES RE SAME
1658.0001	06/17/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH EASTERN DISTRICT COURT CLERK'S OFFICE RE PROCEDURE TO FILE EXHIBITS UNDER SEAL
1658.0001	06/18/2019	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	ASSIST COURT CLERK'S OFFICE WITH TROUBLESHOOTING EXHIBIT 15 TO MOTION TO CERTIFY AND FORWARD CORRECTED EXHIBIT FOR FILING
1658.0001	06/19/2019	JM	275.00	1.50	412.50	PREPARE, FINALIZE AND FILE NOTICE OF CONVENTIONAL FILING RE EXHIBIT TO LEY REPORT; PREPARE EXHIBIT TO BE SUBMITTED TO COURT; PREPARE TRANSMITTAL LETTER TO COURT
1658.0001	06/26/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	UPDATE SUMMARY OF DEADLINES FOR ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	07/18/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER REASSIGNING CASE TO JUDGE GIBNEY
1658.0001	07/31/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER SETTING TELEPHONIC STATUS CONFERENCE WITH NEW JUDGE
1658.0001	08/05/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE RESPONSE BRIEF IN EXCESS OF PAGE LIMITATIONS

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	08/05/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW APPEARANCE OF EMILY KITCH
1658.0001	08/06/2019	JM	275.00	0.60	165.00	REVIEW COURT'S ORDER CONTAINING PRETRIAL DEADLINES AND TRIAL DATE AND FORWARD ALL TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	08/08/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S MOTION TO DISMISS AND FORWARD RESPONSE DEADLINE TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	08/12/2019	JM	275.00	1.80	495.00	PREPARE DRAFT OF 4TH REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS AND 5TH INTERROGATORIES TO SUNOCO, INC.; PREPARE DRAFT OF 4TH REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS AND 6TH INTERROGATORIES TO SUNOCO PARTNERS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE SAME
1658.0001	08/15/2019	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	ACCESS LINK PROVIDED BY DEFENDANTS TO DOWNLOAD APPENDIX OF ALL EXHIBITS (WHETHER TO BE FILED UNDER SEAL OR NOT) RE RESPONSE TO MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS AND MOTION TO EXCLUDE LEY
1658.0001	08/15/2019	JM	275.00	1.50	412.50	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE APPENDIX OF EXHIBITS UNDER SEAL; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S RESPONSE TO MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS AND DOWNLOAD ALL EXHIBITS FILED WITH COURT
1658.0001	08/15/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S MOTION TO EXCLUDE LEY AND FORWARD RESPONSE DEADLINE TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	08/16/2019	JM	275.00	1.30	357.50	PREPARE CHART AND ORGANIZE CLINE DOCUMENTS USED AS EXHIBITS IN DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE TO MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS AND FORWARD SAME TO ATTORNEYS FOR REVIEW
1658.0001	08/16/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S ORDER DIRECTING DEFENDANTS TO FILE RESPONSE WHY EXHIBITS SHOULD BE FILED UNDER SEAL
1658.0001	08/19/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	REDACT PERSONAL IDENTIFIERS FROM CLINE EXHIBITS IN DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE TO MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS
1658.0001	08/21/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	ASSIST JASON RYAN WITH SERVING DISCOVERY ON DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	08/22/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISMISS
1658.0001	08/26/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE PREPARING CHART TO BE USED AS EXHIBIT IN REPLY RE MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS
1658.0001	08/26/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S NOTICE TO THE COURT RE DE-DESIGNATING CERTAIN EXHIBITS AS CONFIDENTIAL
1658.0001	08/26/2019	JM	275.00	2.50	687.50	PREPARE CHART AND OBTAIN PERTINENT PLEADINGS RE ██████████ ██████████
1658.0001	08/27/2019	JM	275.00	0.90	247.50	WORK ON MOTION TO EXCEED PAGE LIMITATION RE REPLY; PREPARE ORDER RE SAME; FINALIZE AND FILE MOTION AND SUBMIT ORDER TO JUDGE FOR APPROVAL; DISCUSSIONS WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	08/28/2019	JM	275.00	3.50	962.50	WORK ON, FINALIZE AND FILE REPLY RE MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS
1658.0001	08/29/2019	JM	275.00	1.80	495.00	PREPARE COURTESY COPY OF REPLY AND EXHIBITS FOR DELIVERY TO JUDGE GIBNEY VIA FEDERAL EXPRESS
1658.0001	08/29/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	REVIEW AND ORGANIZE PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE TO MOTION TO EXCLUDE LEY FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW
1658.0001	09/04/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE RE SEALING EXHIBITS
1658.0001	09/06/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' REPLY RE MOTION TO DISMISS
1658.0001	09/11/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' REPLY RE MOTION TO EXCLUDE LEY
1658.0001	09/12/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE SUR-REPLY RE MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS
1658.0001	09/12/2019	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	WORK ON AND FINALIZE OBJECTION TO MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE SUR-REPLY
1658.0001	09/16/2019	JM	275.00	2.30	632.50	WORK ON COURTESY COPIES OF PLEADINGS REQUESTED BY JUDGE GIBNEY'S CLERK AND EMAIL TO CO-COUNSEL RE MISSING EXHIBITS
1658.0001	09/17/2019	JM	275.00	2.00	550.00	FINALIZE AND SEND COURTESY COPIES OF DOCS 91, 95, 109, 110, 113, 116, AND 120 TO JUDGE GIBNEY AND EMAIL TO ALL COUNSEL ATTACHING LETTER TO JUDGE
1658.0001	09/27/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SERVING DISCOVERY ON SUNOCO
1658.0001	09/30/2019	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	REVIEW EMAILS TO DETERMINE DOCUMENTS/INFORMATION SENT TO EXPERT LEY AND EMAIL TO ATTORNEYS RE SAME
1658.0001	10/03/2019	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	REVIEW COURT'S OPINIONS/ORDERS DENYING MOTION TO DISMISS, DENYING MOTION TO EXCLUDE LEY, GRANTING MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS, ETC. AND FORWARD TO ATTORNEYS; REVIEW

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry					
					COURT'S ORDER DIRECTING PLAINTIFF TO SUBMIT PROPOSED NOTICE FORM RE MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS
1658.0001	10/04/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 REVIEW MINUTE ORDER OF JUDGE GIBNEY SETTING CONFERENCE CALL RE FORM OF NOTICE RE MOTION TO CERTIFY CLASS
1658.0001	10/09/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 FORWARD ATTORNEYS DEADLINE TO RESPOND TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO STAY PENDING RULE 23(F) APPEAL
1658.0001	10/09/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 REVIEW DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO STAY PENDING APPEAL AND FORWARD RESPONSE DEADLINE TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	10/10/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 REVIEW COURT'S ORDERS RE PROPOSED CLASS NOTICE FORM, AND RE BRIEFING RE PROPOSED CLASS NOTICE; FORWARD DEADLINES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	10/11/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE TO MOTION TO STAY CASE PENDING APPEAL
1658.0001	10/11/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 REVIEW CLASS REPRESENTATIVE'S MOTION TO APPROVE FORM AND MANNER OF NOTICE
1658.0001	10/16/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 REVIEW STATUS REPORT RE CLASS NOTICE
1658.0001	10/16/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 RESPOND TO NIKKI CAMERON EMAIL RE MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION
1658.0001	10/16/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 REVIEW CLASS REPRESENTATIVE'S BRIEF RE PROPOSED CLASS NOTIFICATION PROCESS AND NECESSARY DATA; REVIEW DEFENDANTS' BRIEF RE NOTIFICATION PROCESS
1658.0001	10/16/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 REVIEW DEFENDANTS' REPLY RE MOTION TO STAY CASE PENDING APPEAL
1658.0001	10/18/2019	JM	275.00	3.20	880.00 WORK ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT, FINALIZE AND FILE WITH COURT
1658.0001	10/18/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 REVIEW SUNOCO'S APPEAL AND FORWARD RESPONSE DEADLINE TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	10/21/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE COURTESY COPY OF MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT
1658.0001	10/24/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 ATTEMPT ACCESS TO FTP LINKS PROVIDED BY DEFENSE COUNSEL FOR EXPERT REPORTS AND EMAIL TO ATTORNEYS RE SAME
1658.0001	10/26/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 RESEARCH TO LOCATE ADDRESS FOR ERIC KOELLING IN ORDER TO SERVE TRIAL SUBPOENA PER JASON RYAN
1658.0001	10/26/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 PREPARE DRAFT OF TRIAL SUBPOENA FOR ERIC KOELLING
1658.0001	10/28/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 REVIEW DEFENDANTS' RESPONSE TO MOTION TO APPROVE FORM AND MANNER OF CLASS NOTICE AND FORWARD REPLY DEADLINE TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	10/28/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 DOWNLOAD EXHIBITS TO BARBARA LEY EXPERT REPORT FOR DAMAGES (EXCEPT BACKUP FOR EX. 10)
1658.0001	10/28/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 DISCUSSION WITH PAULA FOIA REQUEST TO OKLAHOMA TAX COMMISSION FOR ESCHEAT INFORMATION
1658.0001	10/29/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S STATUS REPORT AND REQUEST FOR STATUS CONFERENCE
1658.0001	10/29/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 PREPARE LINK TO EXHIBITS TO LEY EXPERT REPORT ON DAMAGES AND FORWARD TO NIX PATTERSON PER THEIR REQUEST AND EMAILS WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	10/29/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 REVIEW MODIFIED STATUS REPORT AND MOTION FOR STATUS CONFERENCE
1658.0001	10/29/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 REVIEW DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO STRIKE PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT, ETC.
1658.0001	10/30/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 FINALIZE ERIC KOELLING TRIAL SUBPOENA FOR SERVICE
1658.0001	10/30/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 REVIEW MOTION TO ADMIT LEONOUKAKIS PHV FOR CLINE
1658.0001	10/30/2019	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00 DOWNLOAD EXHIBIT 10 BACKUP TO LEY EXPERT REPORT ON DAMAGES
1658.0001	10/30/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 REVIEW MOTION TO ADMIT WOODS AND YETTER PHV FOR DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	10/30/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON RYAN RE SERVICE OF TRIAL SUBPOENA ON ERIC KOELLING
1658.0001	10/30/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ADAM TAYLOR RE SERVICE OF TRIAL SUBPOENA ON ERIC KOELLING
1658.0001	10/30/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH EASTERN DISTRICT RE COURTROOM FOR TRIAL
1658.0001	10/30/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER SETTING TELEPHONIC STATUS CONFERENCE
1658.0001	10/30/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 DISCUSSION WITH MEGAN MOSER RE LOCATING PHONE NUMBERS FOR FACT WITNESSES
1658.0001	10/30/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 REVIEW OPINION AND ORDER DENYING DEFENDANTS' MOTION

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	10/31/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	TO STAY PENDING APPEAL REVIEW COURT'S ORDER RE MOTION TO APPROVE FORM AND MANNER OF CLASS NOTICE AND FORWARD ALL DEADLINES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	10/31/2019	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	PREPARE DRAFT OF FINAL WITNESS LIST
1658.0001	10/31/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW MINUTE ORDERS GRANTING PRO HAC VICE MOTIONS OF LEONOUidakis, Woods and Yetter
1658.0001	10/31/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	EMAIL TO ATTORNEYS RE LISTING OF PHONE NUMBERS OF FACT WITNESSES
1658.0001	10/31/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW APPEARANCE OF LEONOUidakis
1658.0001	11/01/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW COURT'S ORDER GRANTING MOTION TO APPROVE FORM AND MANNER OF CLASS NOTICE AND FORWARD DEADLINE TO FILE REVISED CLASS NOTICE PLAN, ETC. TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	11/04/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ADAM TAYLOR (PROCESS SERVER) RE STATUS OF TRIAL SUBPOENA TO BE SERVED ON ERIC KOELLING AND EMAIL TO JASON RYAN RE SAME
1658.0001	11/04/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	PULL CERTAIN SUNOCO DOCUMENTS AND FORWARD TO JAY MCCAIN AT PAT RYAN'S REQUEST
1658.0001	11/04/2019	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	DOWNLOAD DEFENDANTS' EXPERT REPORT RE KRAUSE, KRAUSE BACKUP, DOWNLOAD DEFENDANTS' EXPERT REPORT RE EPPERSON
1658.0001	11/05/2019	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	PULL CERTAIN DOCUMENTS RE PAUL WALKER AND SEND VIA FEDERAL EXPRESS PER PAT RYAN
1658.0001	11/05/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PROCESS SERVER RE STATUS OF SERVICE OF TRIAL SUBPOENA ON ERIC KOELLING AND EMAIL TO JASON RYAN RE SAME
1658.0001	11/06/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ROD BAKER, NEW PROCESS SERVER, RE SERVING ERIC KOELLING TRIAL SUBPOENA
1658.0001	11/06/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	ASSIST JASON RYAN WITH REVIEW OF DRAFT OF EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	11/06/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	REVIEW 10TH CIRCUIT FILINGS RE REPLY RE PETITION FOR PERMISSION TO APPEAL CLASS CERTIFICATION, REPLY RE MOTION TO STAY, CLIENT'S RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO FILE REPLY FOR PERMISSION TO APPEAL
1658.0001	11/06/2019	JM	275.00	1.50	412.50	FINALIZE AND FILE FINAL EXHIBIT LIST, FINALIZE AND FILE FINAL WITNESS LIST
1658.0001	11/07/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW CLASS REPRESENTATIVE'S SUPPLEMENTAL NOTICE RE MOTION TO APPROVE FORM AND MANNER OF CLASS NOTICE
1658.0001	11/07/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S ORDER APPROVING PROPOSED CLASS WEBSITE
1658.0001	11/08/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S REPLY RE MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT
1658.0001	11/08/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	PULL CERTAIN DOCUMENTS RE [REDACTED] PER PAT RYAN
1658.0001	11/11/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW APPEARANCE OF WOODS FOR DEFENDANTS
1658.0001	11/11/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S AGREED MOTION TO MODIFY PRETRIAL ORDER RE DEMONSTRATIVE EXHIBITS
1658.0001	11/11/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW EMAIL FROM PROCESS SERVER RE SERVICE OF TRIAL SUBPOENA ON ERIC KOELLING AND EMAIL TO JASON RYAN RE SAME
1658.0001	11/12/2019	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH NUMEROUS CLASS MEMBERS RE QUESTIONS ABOUT NOTICE
1658.0001	11/13/2019	JM	275.00	0.90	247.50	NUMEROUS CALLS WITH CLASS MEMBERS RE QUESTIONS ABOUT NOTICE
1658.0001	11/14/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW ORDER GRANTING PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO MODIFY PRETRIAL ORDER RE DEMONSTRATIVE EXHIBITS, APPEARANCE OF YETTER FOR DEFENDANTS, 10TH CIRCUIT'S ORDER DENYING PERMISSION TO FILE PETITION
1658.0001	11/14/2019	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	PULL CALDWELL DOCUMENTS AND FORWARD TO DAN CALDWELL AT PAT RYAN'S REQUEST
1658.0001	11/18/2019	JM	275.00	1.50	412.50	WORK ON DECLARATION OF DAN CALDWELL AND DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	11/18/2019	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	REVIEW JOINT MOTION TO RELOCATE TRIAL TO OKLAHOMA CITY; DEFENDANTS' INITIAL WITNESS LIST; PARTIES' STIPULATION OF FACTS; DEFENDANT'S MOTION TO CLARIFY CLASS DEFINITION; DEFENDANTS' INITIAL WITNESS LIST; DEFENDANTS' PROPOSED EXHIBIT LIST; COURT'S ORDER SHORTENING TIME TO RESPOND TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO CLARIFY CLASS DEFINITION
1658.0001	11/18/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	DOWNLOAD DEFENDANTS' TRIAL EXHIBITS FOR ATTORNEY

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						REVIEW
1658.0001	11/19/2019	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	PREPARE LINK TO LEY REBUTTAL REPORT EXHIBITS AND FORWARD TO BRITTANY KELLOGG AND AMANDA THOMPSON
1658.0001	11/19/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW PAT RYAN EMAIL RE SUNOCO TRIAL EXHIBITS AND PRODUCTIONS AND RESPOND TO SAME
1658.0001	11/19/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VANESSA AT OKLAHOMA STATE TREASURER'S OFFICE RE ESCHEAT REPORTS THROUGH OPEN RECORDS REQUEST FOR SUNOCO
1658.0001	11/20/2019	JM	275.00	1.00	275.00	PREPARE LIST OF COUNTER-DESIGNATIONS FOR KOELLING 03-01-18 DEPOSITION AND MARK DESIGNATIONS
1658.0001	11/20/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE TO MOTION TO CLARIFY CLASS DEFINITION, NOTICE REGARDING FILING OF RESPONSE BRIEF AND REQUESTING TELEPHONIC HEARING
1658.0001	11/20/2019	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	DOWNLOAD AND ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS
1658.0001	11/20/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	EMAILS WITH PAT RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN RE DEFENDANTS' TRIAL EXHIBITS
1658.0001	11/21/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	EMAIL TO ATTORNEYS RE SUBMITTING SUMMARIES OF DEPOSITION TESTIMONY TO JUDGE'S CHAMBERS
1658.0001	11/21/2019	JM	275.00	4.30	1,182.50	WORK ON PLAINTIFF'S COUNTER-DESIGNATIONS
1658.0001	11/21/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	EMAIL TO DAN CALDWELL RE DX 109; PREPARE LINK FOR DX 110-114 AND FORWARD TO DAN CALDWELL
1658.0001	11/21/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW COURT'S ORDER SETTING TELEPHONIC HEARING RE DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO CLARIFY CLASS DEFINITION
1658.0001	11/21/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW CLASS REPRESENTATIVE'S PROPOSED REBUTTAL EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	11/22/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	ATTEMPT TO DOWNLOAD PLAINTIFF'S TRIAL EXHIBITS AND REBUTTAL EXHIBITS AND EMAIL TO ATTORNEYS RE SAME
1658.0001	11/22/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MARIA TORRES WITH DAN MCCLURE'S OFFICE RE SENDING LINK TO COUNTER-DESIGNATIONS AND EMAIL TO MARIA TORRES RE SAME
1658.0001	11/25/2019	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	ASSIST PAT RYAN WITH REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM DAN CALDWELL
1658.0001	11/25/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE REPLY BRIEF IN EXCESS OF PAGE LIMITS RE MOTION TO CLARIFY CLASS DEFINITION AND COURT'S ORDER GRANTING SAME
1658.0001	11/26/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S MEMORANDUM ORDER DENYING DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO CLARIFY CLASS DEFINITION
1658.0001	11/26/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PROFESSIONAL REPORTERS TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF KRAETTLI EPPERSON
1658.0001	11/26/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' OBJECTIONS TO DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS, PLAINTIFF'S OBJECTIONS TO DEFENDANT'S PROPOSED EXHIBIT LIST; PLAINTIFF'S OBJECTIONS TO DEFENDANTS' PROPOSED WITNESS LIST; DEFENDANTS' OBJECTIONS TO PLAINTIFF'S PROPOSED WITNESS LIST; DEFENDANTS' OBJECTIONS TO PLAINTIFF'S PROPOSED EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	11/26/2019	JM	275.00	4.00	1,100.00	WORK ON OBJECTIONS TO DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH JASON RYAN RE SAME; FINALIZE AND FILE WITH COURT; ASSIST PAT RYAN WITH DEPOSITION SUMMARIES
1658.0001	11/27/2019	JM	275.00	0.70	192.50	PREPARE DEPOSITION NOTICE FOR KRAETTLI EPPERSON AND SERVE ON COUNSEL VIA EMAIL
1658.0001	12/02/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	EMAIL TO DREW PATE AND BRAD BECKWORTH RE CALDWELL FAMILY ESCHEAT PAYMENTS PER PAT
1658.0001	12/02/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	COMMUNICATION WITH ATTORNEYS REGARDING TRANSCRIPT OF 10/05/19 HEARING
1658.0001	12/02/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION NOTICE FOR BARBARA LEY AND FORWARD DATE TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	12/02/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	FILE RETURN OF SERVICE RE TRIAL SUBPOENA FOR ERIC KOELLING
1658.0001	12/03/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER SETTING TELEPHONIC MOTION HEARING RE PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND FORWARD DETAILS TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	12/03/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	EMAIL WITH AMANDA THOMPSON OF NIX PATTERSON RE PLAINTIFF'S TRIAL EXHIBITS
1658.0001	12/03/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S ORDER DENYING MOTION TO RELOCATE TRIAL

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
						AND JOYCE VAUGHN
1658.0001	12/03/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE SUR-REPLY RE PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT
1658.0001	12/04/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE SUR-REPLY
1658.0001	12/04/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	DISCUSSION WITH PAT RYAN RE REVIEWING DEPOSITIONS FOR REFERENCES TO DIVISION ORDER TITLE OPINIONS
1658.0001	12/04/2019	JM	275.00	1.20	330.00	REVIEW ALICE HOLLAND DEPOSITION FOR ANY REFERENCES TO DIVISION ORDER TITLE OPINIONS
1658.0001	12/05/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	DISCUSSION WITH PAT RYAN RE DEPOSITIONS CONTAINING REFERENCES TO [REDACTED]
1658.0001	12/05/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW PRO HAC VICE MOTIONS FOR CUTTER AND PERRY, MINUTE ORDERS GRANTING SAME, AND APPEARANCE FOR CUTTER
1658.0001	12/06/2019	JM	275.00	1.50	412.50	SEARCH DEFENDANTS' DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FOR DOCUMENTS RE [REDACTED] AND DISCUSSION WITH PAT RYAN RE SAME
1658.0001	12/06/2019	JM	275.00	2.90	797.50	TRIAL PREP RE EXHIBITS
1658.0001	12/06/2019	JM	275.00	1.50	412.50	COMPLETE SEARCH OF DEPOSITIONS FOR REFERENCES TO [REDACTED] AND DISCUSSION WITH PAT RYAN RE SAME
1658.0001	12/06/2019	JM	275.00	4.00	1,100.00	WORK ON, FINALIZE AND FILE DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS, AMENDED COUNTER-DESIGNATIONS AND OBJECTIONS TO DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS, AND MULTIPLE DISCUSSIONS WITH JASON RYAN RE SAME
1658.0001	12/06/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S PRETRIAL BRIEF RE BURDEN OF PROOF ON APPLICABLE INTEREST RATE, REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO STRIKE DEFENDANTS' EXPERT KRAUSE
1658.0001	12/07/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER SETTING FINAL TELEPHONIC PRETRIAL CONFERENCE HEARING
1658.0001	12/07/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER SETTING BRIEFING DEADLINES RE PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO STRIKE DEFENDANTS' EXPERT KRAUSE AND FORWARD TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	12/07/2019	JM	275.00	0.60	165.00	REVIEW ALL PRETRIAL BRIEFS FILED BY ALL PARTIES
1658.0001	12/09/2019	JM	275.00	4.80	1,320.00	TRIAL PREP (TRIAL BRIEFS, EXHIBIT NOTEBOOKS); PREPARE BOUND COPIES OF DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS, COUNTER-DESIGNATIONS AND FLAG OBJECTIONS AND FORWARD TO JUDGE GIBNEY VIA FEDERAL EXPRESS; EMAIL TO OPPOSITION COUNSEL FORWARDING COPY OF LETTER TO JUDGE GIBNEY AND FEDEX LABEL
1658.0001	12/09/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' AMENDED PROPOSED EXHIBIT LIST
1658.0001	12/10/2019	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TEKA STEPHENS, EDOK COURTROOM DEPUTY, RE TRIAL
1658.0001	12/10/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S OPINION AND ORDER GRANTING PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT
1658.0001	12/10/2019	JM	275.00	7.20	1,980.00	TRIAL PREP; WORK ON EXHIBIT NOTEBOOKS; EMAILS WITH AMANDA THOMPSON AT NIX PATTERSON RE TRIAL EXHIBITS RE ADDITIONAL EXHIBITS TO BE USED AT TRIAL (EX. 454A - LATE PAYMENTS LINE 1, LATE PAYMENTS LINE 2)
1658.0001	12/11/2019	JM	275.00	8.60	2,365.00	TRIAL PREPARATION (WORK ON EXHIBIT NOTEBOOKS)
1658.0001	12/12/2019	JM	275.00	11.00	3,025.00	TRIAL PREPARATION - TRIAL EXHIBIT NOTEBOOKS, PAY DATA LINE 1 AND LINE 2 NOTEBOOKS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COURT RE SETTING UP FOR TRIAL; PREPARE DEPOSITION DESIGNATION NOTEBOOKS FOR TRIAL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MOVERS RE TRIAL EXHIBITS
1658.0001	12/13/2019	JM	275.00	5.50	1,512.50	TRIAL PREPARATION, WITNESS NOTEBOOKS, DEPOSITION NOTEBOOKS; MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH IDOXS RE COORDINATING COPYING OF WITNESS NOTEBOOKS, DEPOSITION NOTEBOOKS; LOCATE ORIGINAL DEPOSITIONS TO BE FILED AT TRIAL
1658.0001	12/16/2019	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH IDOXS RE NEW EXHIBITS
1658.0001	12/16/2019	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MOVING COMPANY RE DELIVERING NEW EXHIBITS
1658.0001	12/16/2019	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	PREPARE NEW COVERS FOR EXHIBIT 454A WITH LEY CHANGES TO DAMAGES REPORT
1658.0001	12/17/2019	JM	275.00	2.00	550.00	MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MOVERS AND IDOXS

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001						RE DOCUMENTS FOR MUSKOGEE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME; TRIP TO IDOXs TO ASSIST WITH NEW EXHIBITS TO BE DELIVERED TO MUSKOGEE
1658.0001	12/20/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	DISCUSSION WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE TRIAL EXHIBITS
1658.0001	12/23/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE ADMITTED EXHIBITS, ETC.
1658.0001	12/23/2019	JM	275.00	2.20	605.00	WORK ON ORGANIZING TRIAL EXHIBITS, WITNESS EXHIBIT NOTEBOOKS, ETC.
1658.0001	12/24/2019	JM	275.00	1.80	495.00	WORK ON ORGANIZING TRIAL EXHIBITS, ETC.
1658.0001	12/30/2019	JM	275.00	1.30	357.50	ORGANIZE HARD COPY OF TRIAL EXHIBITS (10 BOXES), FLASH DRIVE OF TRIAL EXHIBITS, AND FLASH DRIVE OF EXHIBIT 454 FOR DELIVERY TO JUDGE GIBNEY
1658.0001	12/31/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S ORDER RE PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW
1658.0001	01/03/2020	JM	275.00	1.50	412.50	FILE ORGANIZATION/RETENTION FOR POST-TRIAL BRIEFING AND POTENTIAL APPEAL
1658.0001	01/07/2020	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	PREPARE AND FILE NOTICE OF CHANGE OF ADDRESS
1658.0001	01/08/2020	JM	275.00	1.30	357.50	POST-TRIAL EXHIBIT/DOCUMENT ORGANIZATION
1658.0001	01/14/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW MINUTE ORDER SETTING TELEPHONIC CONFERENCE FOR 01/15/2020 AND COMMUNICATION WITH ATTORNEYS RE SAME
1658.0001	01/28/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH KEN SIDWELL, COURT REPORTER, RE OBTAINING COPY OF TRIAL TRANSCRIPT AND EMAIL TO ATTORNEYS RE COPY PREVIOUSLY SENT TO DREW PATE
1658.0001	01/28/2020	JM	275.00	1.60	440.00	PREPARE TRIAL TRANSCRIPT NOTEBOOKS FOR REVIEW BY ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	01/31/2020	JM	275.00	0.90	247.50	POST-TRIAL FILE ORGANIZATION
1658.0001	01/31/2020	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	RETURN OVERSIZE EXHIBIT BACK TO LEGAL GRAPHICS
1658.0001	02/19/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW AND ORGANIZE ALL FILINGS RE RIAL BRIEFS AND PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW
1658.0001	02/28/2020	JM	275.00	2.50	687.50	WORK ON POST-TRIAL RESPONSE BRIEF AND DISCUSSIONS WITH PAULA JANTZEN RE SAME
1658.0001	03/12/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW COURT'S ORDER GRANTING LEAVE FOR DEFENDANTS TO FILE SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF, REVIEW SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	03/16/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	WORK ON RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	03/16/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S ORDER RESETTING HEARING ON CLOSING ARGUMENTS
1658.0001	03/17/2020	JM	275.00	1.80	495.00	WORK ON MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF, AND PREPARE ORDER GRANTING SAME
1658.0001	03/18/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	FORWARD PROPOSED ORDER GRANTING MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE RESPONSE TO SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF TO COURT FOR APPROVAL
1658.0001	03/23/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW ORDER GRANTING PLAINTIFF LEAVE TO FILE RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	03/23/2020	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	WORK ON RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL POST-TRIAL BRIEF
1658.0001	03/27/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	CHECK STATUS OF DEADLINES IN CASE
1658.0001	05/04/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW EMAIL FROM JUDGE'S CLERK RE UPCOMING CONFERENCE CALL WITH COURT AND COMMUNICATION WITH ATTORNEYS RE SAME
1658.0001	05/05/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW CLASS REP'S NOTICE TO COURT OF COCKERELL OPINION AND ORDER
1658.0001	05/07/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER CONFIRMING ORAL CLOSING ARGUMENTS FOR JUNE
1658.0001	05/14/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW DEFENDANT'S RESPONSE TO CLASS REP'S NOTICE OF RECONSIDERATION AND REVERSAL OF OPINION
1658.0001	05/27/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S ORDER RE COVID PROCEDURES RE UPCOMING HEARING
1658.0001	05/27/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	DISCUSSIONS WITH PAT RYAN RE [REDACTED]
1658.0001	05/28/2020	JM	275.00	2.00	550.00	WORK ON ATTORNEY FEE APPLICATIONS
1658.0001	06/15/2020	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION FOR UPCOMING HEARING
1658.0001	06/16/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER PROVIDING DIAL-IN INFO FOR CLOSING ARGUMENTS HEARING
1658.0001	06/17/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE SHEET RE ORAL CLOSING ARGUMENTS
1658.0001	06/19/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW PLAINTIFF AND DEFENDANTS' NOTICES OF FILING DEMONSTRATIVE EXHIBITS

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	08/10/2020	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	REVIEW AND DOWNLOAD DEFENDANTS' SECOND NOTICE OF FILING EXHIBITS AND ALL 43 EXHIBITS
1658.0001	08/17/2020	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	REVIEW COURT'S OPINION AND ORDER AND FORWARD RESPONSIVE DEADLINES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0001	08/17/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	LETTER TO PERRY CLINE ENCLOSING COPIES OF OPINION AND ORDER
1658.0001	08/20/2020	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	ASSIST PAT RYAN WITH REVIEW OF JUDGE'S OPINION
1658.0001	08/24/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S NOTICE REGARDING UPDATED DAMAGES
1658.0001	08/25/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW DEFENDANTS' NOTICE AND OBJECTIONS RE POST-TRIAL DAMAGES CLAIM
1658.0001	08/25/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE ORDER RE VIDEO CONFERENCE HEARING ON 08/27/2020 AND EMAILS TO ATTORNEYS RE SAME
1658.0001	08/25/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	REVIEW COURT'S ORDER DIRECTING DEFENDANTS TO CONFIRM PRECISE AMOUNT OF DAMAGES AT UPCOMING HEARING
1658.0001	08/26/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	EMAILS FROM/TO PAULA JANTZEN RE UPCOMING VIDEO HEARING AND EMAIL TO TEKA STEPHENS AT EDOK RE SAME
1658.0001	09/04/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review Joint Motion to Approve Stipulation re Deposition Testimony Played at Trial and Order granting same
1658.0001	09/09/2020	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	Review ECF Notice re filing of transcript, Joint Motion to Stay Briefing re Attorney Fees and Costs Pending Appeal, and Class Counsel's Proposed Plan for Distribution of Damages Award
1658.0001	09/10/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Review Order granting Joint Motion to Stay Proceedings on Attorney Fees and Costs pending appeal
1658.0001	09/23/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review Defendants' Response and Objection to Plan of Distribution
1658.0001	09/24/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review Defendants' Motion for New Trial and forward response deadline to attorneys
1658.0001	09/24/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review Defendants' Motion to Alter or Amend the Judgment and forward response deadline to attorneys
1658.0001	09/28/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review Class Rep's Reply re Plan for Distribution of Damages
1658.0001	09/29/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Review Plaintiff's Motion to Seal Ex. 5 to Reply re Plan for Distribution of Damages
1658.0001	09/30/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Review Court's Order granting Plaintiff's Motion to File Ex. 5 to Reply under seal
1658.0001	09/30/2020	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	Forward recent filings to client
1658.0001	10/01/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Receive and review Plaintiff's Sealed Exhibit 5 to Reply re Plan for Distribution of Damages
1658.0001	10/01/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review Defendants' Motion for Leave to File Sur-Reply and forward deadline to respond to attorneys
1658.0001	10/01/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review Plaintiff's Response to Motion for Leave to File Sur-Reply
1658.0001	10/02/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Review Court's Order granting Defendants leave to file Sur-Reply
1658.0001	10/05/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Review Defendants' Sur-Reply re Plaintiff's Plan for Distribution of Damages
1658.0001	10/08/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review Plaintiff's Response to Motion for New Trial; Review Plaintiff's Response to Motion to Alter or Amend Judgment
1658.0001	10/13/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review Court's Order directing parties to file statement re plan of distribution vs. plan of allocation and communication with attorneys re same
1658.0001	10/16/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Review Defendants' Response re Plan of Allocation vs. Plan of Distribution
1658.0001	10/19/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Review Class Representative's Statement re Allocation vs. Distribution
1658.0001	10/20/2020	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	Forward copies of filings re Distribution vs. Allocation to client
1658.0001	10/22/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review Defendants' Reply re Motion to Alter or Amend Judgment, and Reply re Motion for New Trial
1658.0001	10/30/2020	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	Review Court's Plan of Allocation Order; Review Notice of Appeal and Second Amended Notice of Appeal, and Transmission of Notice of Appeal
1658.0001	11/30/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review Sunoco's 2nd Motion for New Trial and 2nd Motion to Alter or Amend Judgment and forward response deadlines to attorneys
1658.0001	12/09/2020	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	Review Court's Opinion and Order denying Defendants' Motions for New Trial and Motions to Alter or Amend Judgment, new Notice of Appeal, Civil Case Docketed, and Transmission of Appeal
1658.0001	03/23/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Receive and review Joint Stipulation re interest payments
1658.0001	12/13/2021	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	(Federal Court) Receive and review Class Rep's Opposed Motion to Set 01/12/2022 as deadline to file motions for attorney fees and costs; Email to attorneys re response deadline
1658.0001	12/14/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	(Federal Court) Receive and review Plaintiff's Motion for Order

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						Requiring Judgment Debtor to Appear and Answer as to Assets
1658.0001	12/28/2021	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	Receive and review Sunoco's Response in Opposition to Motion for Order Requiring Judgment Debtor to Appear and Answer as to Assets; Sunoco's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Deadline to File Motion for Attorney Fees & Costs; Forward reply deadlines for both to attorneys
1658.0001	01/11/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Plaintiff's Reply re Motion to Set Deadline to File Motion for Attorney Fees, Reply re Motion for Order Requiring Judgment Debtor to Appear and Answer as to Assets
1658.0001	01/11/2022	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	Compile recent filings and prepare and send letter and filings to client
1658.0001	02/03/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Plaintiff's Notice to Court re 10th Circuit ruling and Court's Order setting deadlines re filing Motion for Attorney Fees, etc.; Forward deadline to attorneys
1658.0001	02/07/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Court's Order granting in part Plaintiff's Motion for Order Requiring Defendant to Appear and Answer as to Assets, and forward deadline contained in Order to attorneys
1658.0001	02/08/2022	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	Save Cline 1099/2 to pdfs and forward to Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	02/09/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Court's Minute Order setting status conference re Plaintiff's Motion for Order Requiring Judgment Debtor to Appear and Answer as to Assets; Forward hearing date to attorneys
1658.0001	02/09/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Email to Renee at EDOK confirming Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen participation in telephonic status conference
1658.0001	02/10/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Defendants' Motion to Modify the Plan of Allocation and Issue Rule 58 Judgment; Forward response date to attorneys
1658.0001	02/10/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Receive and review Court's Minute Sheet re telephonic Status Conference
1658.0001	02/10/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Telephone conference with Renee at EDOK re upcoming telephonic status conference; Email to attorneys re same
1658.0001	02/10/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Court's Minute Order setting briefing schedule re Doc. 360; Forward briefing deadlines to attorneys
1658.0001	02/17/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Defendants' Motion to Enjoin Enforcement of the Judgment, and Defendants' Supplemental Statement re Motion to Modify Plan of Allocation; Forward response deadline to attorneys
1658.0001	02/17/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Receive and review Defendant's Opposition to Document Discovery Concerning Defendants' Property and Assets
1658.0001	02/22/2022	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	Work on exhibits to Response Brief re Production of Documents for Defendants' Hearing on Assets
1658.0001	02/22/2022	JM	275.00	1.80	495.00	Compile [REDACTED] and forward to Jason Ryan; Discussions with Jason Ryan re same
1658.0001	02/22/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen re filing Response Brief re Production of Documents for Defendants' Hearing on Assets
1658.0001	02/22/2022	JM	275.00	2.00	550.00	Review, finalize and file Response Brief re Production of Documents for Defendants' Hearing on Assets; Multiple telephone conferences and emails with Paula Jantzen re same
1658.0001	02/24/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Plaintiff's Motion to Strike Defendants' Motion to Modify Plan of Allocation; Forward response deadline to attorneys
1658.0001	02/28/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Receive and review letter from U.S. Supreme Court granting extension to Sunoco to file Writ of Certiorari
1658.0001	03/03/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Receive and review Class Rep's Motion to Strike Defendants' Motion to Enjoin Enforcement of the Judgment
1658.0001	03/03/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Receive and review Court's Order directing date for Defendants to respond to Motion to Strike
1658.0001	03/07/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Motion for Withdrawal of Counsel re Rebecca Cole, Order granting withdrawal, Defendants' Reply re Opposition to Document Discovery re Assets
1658.0001	03/07/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Receive and review Defendants' Reply re Motion to Modify Plan of Allocation Order
1658.0001	03/07/2022	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	Receive and review (1) Class Rep's Motion for Statutory Costs and Fees, (2) Class Rep's Motion to Approve Form and Manner of Notice to Class re Motion for Attorney Fees, (3) Defendants' Response to Class Rep's Motion to Strike Motion to Modify Plan of Allocation Order (x 2); Email all to Pat Ryan
1658.0001	03/08/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	Receive and review Defendants' Reply re Motion to Enjoin

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry					Enforcement of Judgment, Defendants' Response to Motion to Strike Motion to Enjoin Enforcement of Judgment; Forward all to Pat Ryan
1658.0001	03/09/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Plaintiff's Reply re Motion to Strike Defendants' Motion to Modify Plan of Allocation Order
1658.0001	03/22/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Court's Minute Order setting hearing on four pending motions; Forward hearing details to attorneys
1658.0001	03/25/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Motion to Withdraw for Emma Perry and Minute Order granting same
1658.0001	03/30/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 EDOK - Receive and review Appearance of Erin Murphy
1658.0001	03/31/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 Receive and review Court's Order ruling on numerous motions, and directing parties to contact magistrate judge re settlement conference, etc.; Forward applicable deadlines to attorneys
1658.0001	04/06/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Notice of Filing transcript of 03/31/2022 hearing, and Court's Order Denying Defendants' Motion to Modify, and Plaintiff's Motions to Strike
1658.0001	04/13/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 Receive and review information on upcoming settlement conference and forward all related deadlines to attorneys
1658.0001	04/29/2022	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00 Receive and review Defendants' Notices of Appeal re interlocutory appeal and final judgment appeal; Review transmission of Notices of Appeal to 10th Circuit; Email to attorneys re deadline to file Appearances in new appeals
1658.0001	05/03/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 EDOK - Receive and review letter from 10th Circuit re appeals docketed (22-7017, 22-7018)
1658.0001	06/03/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Plaintiff's Notice to Court that 60-day stay re enforcement of judgment has expired
1658.0001	06/10/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 (Federal Court Acton) Receive and review Defendants' Response to Plaintiff's Notice re 60-day stay of execution of action
1658.0001	06/14/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Federal Court - Receive and review Court's Order denying Defendants' request for extension of stay and setting briefing deadlines; Forward pertinent deadlines to attorneys
1658.0001	06/21/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Class Representative's Supplemental Brief re Motion to Approve Notice to Class re Motion for Attorney Fees, etc.
1658.0001	07/13/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 Receive and review Class Rep's Reply re Manner of Notice to Class re Motion for Attorney Fees, etc.; Convert to Word for Pat Ryan
1658.0001	07/20/2022	JM	275.00	1.50	412.50 Telephone conferences with County Clerks of Creek, Okmulgee and Tulsa Counties re filing fees for Statement of Judgment; Finalize Statements of Judgment for all three counties for filing; Discussion with Jason Ryan re same
1658.0001	08/09/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 Receive and review Court's Order for Production of Documents and for Asset Hearing; Communications with attorneys re related deadlines and hearing date
1658.0001	08/11/2022	JM	275.00	3.00	825.00 Research Oklahoma Secretary of State, Texas Secretary of State, Pennsylvania Secretary of State to obtain documents re Sunoco entities' change of name; Emails to attorneys re same
1658.0001	08/25/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Class Rep's Response to Objection to Magistrate Judge's Order re asset hearing, and forward to attorneys
1658.0001	08/29/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Defendants' Reply in Support of Objections to Magistrate Judge's Order for Production and forward to attorneys for review
1658.0001	08/31/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Judge Gibney's Order denying Defendants' stay of case pending appeal, and forward to attorneys for review
1658.0001	09/01/2022	JM	275.00	0.60	165.00 Work on downloading Sunoco asset production and email to Heather Cook re same
1658.0001	09/02/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Class Rep's Notice of Non-Compliance with Court's Order and forward to attorneys for review
1658.0001	09/09/2022	JM	275.00	0.60	165.00 Receive and review Defendants' Response to Class's Rep's Notice of Non-Compliance and Appearance of Reeves for Cline; Access and download Sealed Plaintiff's Motion for Leave to File Documents Under Seal, including all exhibits
1658.0001	09/12/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Appearance of Nathan Hall for Plaintiff
1658.0001	09/13/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Minute Sheet re asset hearing and forward to attorneys
1658.0001	09/19/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Court's Minute Order re asset hearing and directing responses to proposed Report & Recommendations; Forward deadlines to attorneys
1658.0001	09/19/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 Work on downloading encrypted production and email to Heather

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry					
1658.0001	09/19/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 Cook re same
1658.0001	09/20/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Sunoco's Response to Draft Report and Recommendation, and Motion to Seal Draft Report and Recommendation and Exhibit 1 thereto (filed under seal); Forward to attorneys
1658.0001	09/23/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Court's sealed Minute Order granting Defendants' Motion to Seal re Dkt. 446 and forward same to attorneys
1658.0001	09/27/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Plaintiff's Reply in Support of Proposed Report and Recommendation
1658.0001	09/29/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Sunoco's Opposed Motion for Leave to File Sur-Reply re Report and Recommendation
1658.0001	10/04/2022	JM	275.00	1.20	330.00 Receive and review Court's Order granting Defendants' leave to file Sur-Reply re proposed Report and Recommendation, and setting briefing deadlines for all parties; Forward deadlines to attorneys
1658.0001	10/04/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive, review and compile Plaintiff's Post-Judgment Garnishment Affidavits (x15) and Garnishment Summonses and attachments (x15)
1658.0001	10/05/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Defendants' Sur-Reply re draft Report and Recommendation and forward to attorneys
1658.0001	10/06/2022	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50 Receive and review Court's Minute Order granting Plaintiff's Motion for Garnishment Summons; Receive and review Class Representative's Response to Sur-Reply re draft Report and Recommendation and forward to attorneys
1658.0001	10/06/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review 15 issued garnishment summonses
1658.0001	10/06/2022	JM	275.00	3.00	825.00 Discussion with Jason Ryan re serving 15 garnishments via certified mail and personal service
1658.0001	10/07/2022	JM	275.00	1.70	467.50 Prepare and serve 15 garnishments via certified mail; Prepare extra set for hand delivery by Jason Ryan
1658.0001	10/10/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Review and finalize Affidavits for Process Server; Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen re same; Research re form of federal court affidavit of service
1658.0001	10/10/2022	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00 Emails with Paula Jantzen and forward Affidavits of Service to process server
1658.0001	10/11/2022	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00 Prepare draft of Return of Service re garnishments served via Certified Mail and emails with Jason Ryan re same
1658.0001	10/12/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen re filing Garnishment Affidavit of Service for service on CT Corporation and Corporation Service Company; Telephone conference with EDOK re procedure for filing returns; Finalize and file returns with Court
1658.0001	10/13/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Defendants' Emergency Motion for Leave to Deposit Funds into Court's Registry and forward to attorneys for review
1658.0001	10/14/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Plaintiff's Response to Defendants' Emergency Motion to Deposit Funds and forward to attorneys
1658.0001	10/14/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Sunoco's Reply re Emergency Motion to Deposit Funds and forward to attorneys
1658.0001	10/14/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Garnishee Answer of Castleton Commodities and forward to attorneys
1658.0001	10/14/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Respond to email from Paula Jantzen re update on receipt of green cards re garnishments
1658.0001	10/14/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Appearances of McVicker and Carwile for Garnishee Castleton Commodities
1658.0001	10/17/2022	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50 Receive and review Defendants' Verified Garnishee Answers (x 15)
1658.0001	10/17/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 Work on draft of Affidavit of Service for Jason Ryan re garnishments served via certified mail; Discussion with Jason Ryan re same
1658.0001	10/17/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Garnishee Answer of Truman Arnold Companies
1658.0001	10/18/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Appearance of Robertson for Motiva (garnishee), and Garnishee Answer of Motiva
1658.0001	10/19/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 Convert check and check detail received from client to pdf and email to Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	10/20/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Garnishee Affidavit (Range Resources-Appalachia), and Post-Judgment General Garnishment Summons (and attachments) re Range Resources-Appalachia
1658.0001	10/24/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Defendants' Motion for Video Hearing re Emergency Motion for Leave to Deposit Funds into Court's Registry
1658.0001	10/24/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Court's Minute Order setting Defendants'

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry					Emergency Motion for Leave to Deposit Funds into Court's Registry for telephonic hearing, and forward hearing date to attorneys
1658.0001	10/25/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Class Rep's Notice to Court re establishment of judgment fund account and forward to attorneys for review
1658.0001	10/25/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Court's Minute Sheet re telephone hearing on Defendants' Emergency Motion to Deposit Funds into Court's Registry
1658.0001	10/31/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Appearance of Stein for Garnishee Phillips 66, and Answer of Garnishee; Forward Answer to attorneys for review
1658.0001	11/03/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Plaintiff's Motion for Entry of Order and Notice of Default as to certain garnishee's, and Defendants' Notice of Payment to Claims Administrator, etc.
1658.0001	11/04/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 Receive and review Appearance of Shelton for Marathon Petroleum entities and Response to Garnishment by Marathon Petroleum entities
1658.0001	11/04/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Findings & Recommendations of Magistrate Judge West; Forward to attorneys; Forward deadline contained in Findings & Recommendations to attorneys
1658.0001	11/08/2022	JM	275.00	1.20	330.00 Receive and review Sunoco's Verified Amended Answers re Garnishments (x 15); and receive and review Sunoco's Motion to Dismiss Garnishment Proceedings, etc. (x 15)
1658.0001	11/09/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Minute Order setting numerous motions for hearing and forward to attorneys
1658.0001	11/18/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 Receive and review (1) Marathon's Motion to Attend Hearing Via Telephone, (2) Class Rep's Omnibus Response to Defendants' Motions to Dismiss Garnishment Proceedings, (3) Sunoco's Objections to Findings and Recommendation, (4) Supplemental Declaration of Keough re establishment of judgment fund account, and (5) Sunoco's Motion to Enjoin Garnishments and Further Enforcement Efforts and Request for Hearing
1658.0001	11/23/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review (1) Court's Minute Order granting Garnishee Marathon's Motion to Attend hearing via telephone; (2) Motion to Appear Pro Hac Vice re McConnell for Sunoco; (3) Appearance of Blessingame on behalf of Saratoga RP East
1658.0001	11/29/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Notice of Transcript filed by Court Reporter re 10/25/2022 hearing
1658.0001	11/30/2022	JM	275.00	0.70	192.50 Receive and review multiple filings by all parties and Minute Orders received from the Court
1658.0001	12/01/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review (1) Appearance of McConnell for Defendants, (2) Minute Order granting Defendants' Emergency Motion for Witness to Appear Via Zoom (Chen), and (3) Minute Order re Plaintiff's Motion to Strike will be heard at 12/01/22 hearing
1658.0001	12/02/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Court's Minute Sheet re 12/01/22 hearing
1658.0001	12/06/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Court's Findings and Recommendation re 12/01/22 hearing, and forward objection deadline to attorneys
1658.0001	12/13/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 22-7018 Receive and review Court's Order directing all non-governmental parties to file Rule 26 corporate disclosure, and review Sunoco's corporate disclosure
1658.0001	12/14/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review parties' Agreed Statement of No Objection and Clarification re Findings and Recommendation (Dkt. 60)
1658.0001	12/20/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Class Rep's Notice to the Court re proposed Schedule for Class Counsel's Notice and Motion for Attorney Fees, etc.
1658.0001	12/20/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Court's Order adopting the Report & Recommendation of Mag. Judge West
1658.0001	12/21/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review (1) Plaintiff's Notice of Voluntary Dismissal of Garnishment Proceedings Without Dismissal, and (2) Notice of Withdrawal of Motion for Entry of Order and Notice of Default
1658.0001	01/03/2023	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Defendants' Notice of Withdrawal of Opposition
1658.0001	01/09/2023	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Court's Minute Order setting hearing re Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs, and forward to attorneys
1658.0001	01/09/2023	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 Receive and review Court's Order setting hearing re attorney fees and costs, approving briefing schedule re same; Forward briefing deadlines to attorneys
1658.0001	01/12/2023	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review (1) Defendants' Motion for Clarification of Order Adopting Magistrate Judge's Report and Recommendation, and (2) Court's Order granting motion

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	01/19/2023	JM	275.00	0.60	165.00	Prepare excerpt of trial transcript of Perry Cline testimony and forward to Paula Jantzen
1658.0001	01/26/2023	JM	275.00	0.60	165.00	Research Defendants' production re last bates number of documents produced and email to Paula Jantzen re same
Subtotal for Timekeeper JM			Billable	274.80	75,570.00	JoAnn Mickle
1658.0001	05/02/2018	HC	275.00	0.20	55.00	DISCUSS GLOBAL DEDUPLICATION, EMAIL THREADING AND SEARCH TERMS WITH PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0001	08/23/2019	HC	275.00	2.00	550.00	
1658.0001	08/26/2019	HC	275.00	3.00	825.00	SEARCH FOR INTEREST DUE OWNER REPORTS AND PROCESS OWNERS DUE INTEREST ON SUSPENSE MONIES DOCUMENTS IN ECLIPSE DATABASE; IDENTIFY DOCUMENTS AND PROVIDE TO PAULA JANTZEN FOR REVIEW; ISOLATE DOCUMENTS COLLECTED TO CERTAIN REPORTS
1658.0001	12/12/2019	HC	275.00	5.50	1,512.50	ASSIST IN COMPLETING EXHIBIT NOTEBOOKS FOR THE COURT
1658.0001	09/29/2020	HC	275.00	0.30	82.50	Research articles and presentations by Expert Russell Post.
1658.0001	05/13/2022	HC	275.00	0.70	192.50	Mediation Zoom conference room setup and tech support
1658.0001	05/25/2022	HC	275.00	0.70	192.50	Mediation Zoom conference room setup and tech support
1658.0001	09/19/2022	HC	275.00	0.30	82.50	Discuss production download with Jo Ann Mickle and assist with download and extraction of production
1658.0001	01/19/2023	HC	275.00	0.20	55.00	Prepare DocuSign for Dr. Caldwell and emails re same
Subtotal for Timekeeper HC			Billable	12.90	3,547.50	Heather W. Cook
<hr/>						
1658.0001	07/28/2017	FRM	275.00	0.70	192.50	RH - REVISIONS TO DISCOVERY TO SUNOCO INC AND SUNOCO PARTNERS; EMAIL TO PMR
1658.0001	02/07/2018	FRM	200.00	0.40	80.00	WORK ON EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT SPREADSHEET AND COMPARE WITH STATUTORY INTEREST AGREEMENT BETWEEN PARTIES
1658.0001	02/14/2018	FRM	400.00	4.00	1,600.00	MAC - RESEARCH REGARDING DISCOVERY ABOUT E-DISCOVERY
1658.0001	02/15/2018	FRM	400.00	1.00	400.00	MAC - RESEARCH REGARDING DISCOVERY ABOUT E-DISCOVERY
1658.0001	02/16/2018	FRM	400.00	4.50	1,800.00	MAC - RESEARCH REGARDING E-DISCOVERY
1658.0001	02/27/2018	FRM	200.00	3.00	600.00	ASSIST PAT RYAN WITH DEPO PREP OF ERIC KOELLING; GATHER AND IDENTIFY EXHIBITS TO BE USED IN DEPO
1658.0001	05/01/2018	FRM	200.00	3.00	600.00	JKL - PRINT AND ORGANIZE PLEADINGS, DISCOVERY, AND PRODUCTION DOCUMENTS FOR PMJ REVIEW
1658.0001	05/25/2018	FRM	200.00	5.50	1,100.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	05/29/2018	FRM	200.00	1.50	300.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	05/30/2018	FRM	200.00	3.30	660.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	05/30/2018	FRM	200.00	0.50	100.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	05/30/2018	FRM	200.00	4.00	800.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	05/31/2018	FRM	200.00	5.50	1,100.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	06/01/2018	FRM	200.00	6.00	1,200.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	06/04/2018	FRM	200.00	7.50	1,500.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	06/05/2018	FRM	200.00	4.00	800.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	06/06/2018	FRM	200.00	4.00	800.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	06/07/2018	FRM	200.00	5.00	1,000.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	06/08/2018	FRM	200.00	5.00	1,000.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	06/14/2018	FRM	200.00	3.00	600.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	06/15/2018	FRM	200.00	5.00	1,000.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	06/18/2018	FRM	200.00	2.50	500.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/02/2018	FRM	200.00	6.00	1,200.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/05/2018	FRM	200.00	3.00	600.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/06/2018	FRM	200.00	6.00	1,200.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/09/2018	FRM	200.00	7.00	1,400.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/10/2018	FRM	200.00	7.00	1,400.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/11/2018	FRM	200.00	5.00	1,000.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/12/2018	FRM	200.00	7.50	1,500.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/17/2018	FRM	200.00	7.00	1,400.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/18/2018	FRM	200.00	5.00	1,000.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry						
1658.0001	07/18/2018	FRM	200.00	1.00	200.00	WORK ON SUNOCO PRODUCTION SUMMARY
1658.0001	07/19/2018	FRM	200.00	3.00	600.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/19/2018	FRM	200.00	2.00	400.00	WORK ON SUNOCO PRODUCTION SUMMARY
1658.0001	07/23/2018	FRM	200.00	0.70	140.00	ARB - BEGAN TO RESEARCH 52 O.S. § 570.10 AND LOOK INTO AFFIRMATIVE DEFENSES AND BURDEN OF PROOF
1658.0001	07/24/2018	FRM	200.00	1.50	300.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/25/2018	FRM	200.00	8.00	1,600.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/26/2018	FRM	200.00	5.00	1,000.00	ARB - LOOKED OVER CASE LAW TO DETERMINE [REDACTED]
1658.0001	07/26/2018	FRM	200.00	6.00	1,200.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/27/2018	FRM	200.00	1.30	260.00	ARB - LOOKED OVER CASE LAW TO DETERMINE [REDACTED]
1658.0001	07/30/2018	FRM	200.00	6.00	1,200.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/30/2018	FRM	200.00	3.70	740.00	ARB - RESEARCHED [REDACTED]
1658.0001	07/31/2018	FRM	200.00	7.00	1,400.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	07/31/2018	FRM	200.00	7.10	1,420.00	ARB - RESEARCHED [REDACTED]; BEGAN TO WRITE MEMOS FOR THE TWO RESEARCH ASSIGNMENTS
1658.0001	08/01/2018	FRM	200.00	4.50	900.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	08/01/2018	FRM	200.00	2.60	520.00	ARB - RESEARCH [REDACTED]
1658.0001	08/02/2018	FRM	200.00	5.70	1,140.00	ARB - RESEARCHED CASE LAW REGARDING [REDACTED]
1658.0001	08/03/2018	FRM	200.00	2.70	540.00	ARB - RESEARCHED SOL REQUIREMENTS, CONTINUING VIOLATION DOCTRINE, AND THE DISCOVERY RULE
1658.0001	08/06/2018	FRM	200.00	2.30	460.00	ARB - TALKED TO PAT ABOUT RESEARCH OVER STATUTORY REQUIREMENT FOR PAYING INTEREST ON LATE ROYALTY PAYMENTS AND BEGAN WRITING MEMO
1658.0001	08/07/2018	FRM	200.00	4.90	980.00	ARB - WRITING MEMO FOR PAT PERTAINING TO STATUTORY REQUIREMENTS, AFFIRMATIVE DEFENSES, BURDEN OF PROOF, AND OPEN ACCOUNTS
1658.0001	08/07/2018	FRM	200.00	8.00	1,600.00	DOCUMENT SUMMARIZING/SORTING
1658.0001	08/08/2018	FRM	200.00	6.30	1,260.00	ARB - WRITING MEMO FOR PAT PERTAINING TO STATUTORY REQUIREMENTS, AFFIRMATIVE DEFENSES, BURDEN OF PROOF, AND OPEN ACCOUNTS AND WRITING A MEMO FOR PAULA REGARDING TOLLING THE STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS
1658.0001	08/09/2018	FRM	200.00	5.80	1,160.00	ARB - FINISHED BOTH MEMOS FOR PAT AND PAULA REGARDING THE PRODUCTION REVENUE STANDARDS ACT
1658.0001	08/10/2018	FRM	200.00	1.20	240.00	ARB - SENT RESPONSE TO PAT ABOUT WHETHER AN ACTION TO RECOVER UNPAID INTEREST IMPOSED BY A STATUTE CONSTITUTES AN OPEN ACCOUNT
1658.0001	08/13/2018	FRM	200.00	8.00	1,600.00	WITNESS FILE COMPILATION
1658.0001	08/14/2018	FRM	200.00		0.00	WITNESS FILE COMPILATION
1658.0001	08/15/2018	FRM	200.00	8.25	1,650.00	WITNESS FILE COMPILATION
1658.0001	08/16/2018	FRM	200.00	7.25	1,450.00	WITNESS FILE COMPILATION
1658.0001	08/17/2018	FRM	200.00	8.00	1,600.00	WITNESS FILE COMPILATION
1658.0001	09/12/2018	FRM	200.00	6.00	1,200.00	WORK ON PAT RYAN'S DEPO PREP BINDER FOR WARREN, WIDNER, LANCESLIN AND REDDING, WORK ON DEPOSITION MATERIALS (HOUSTON)
1658.0001	09/13/2018	FRM	200.00	7.00	1,400.00	WORK ON DEPOSITION MATERIALS (HOUSTON)
1658.0001	09/14/2018	FRM	200.00	8.00	1,600.00	WORK ON DEPOSITION MATERIALS (HOUSTON)
1658.0001	10/05/2018	FRM	200.00	1.50	300.00	WORK ON UPDATING INFORMATION IN WORKING BINDERS
1658.0001	10/23/2018	FRM	275.00	0.30	82.50	RH - BATES LABEL DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION PER PJ
1658.0001	02/06/2019	FRM	200.00	1.00	200.00	WORK ON UPDATING WORKING BINDERS
1658.0001	04/01/2019	FRM	275.00	0.30	82.50	RH - PULL DOCKET SHEETS PER JAR
1658.0001	04/05/2019	FRM	275.00	3.50	962.50	RH - GATHER DOCUMENTS, SCAN, AND CREATE BINDER OF KRAUSE SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS
1658.0001	04/08/2019	FRM	275.00	0.30	82.50	RH - DRAFT DEPOSITION NOTICE FOR KRASUE
1658.0001	04/08/2019	FRM	275.00	0.40	110.00	RH - DROPBOX LINK TO R. BARNES FOR DEPO EXHIBITS
1658.0001	04/08/2019	FRM	275.00	1.00	275.00	RH - CREATE COPY OF NOTEBOOK PER JAR
1658.0001	04/08/2019	FRM	275.00	0.50	137.50	RH - TRAVEL ARRANGEMENTS FOR JAR
1658.0001	04/09/2019	FRM	275.00	0.30	82.50	RH - ARRANGE FOR CONFERENCE ROOM FOR DEPO

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount
Client ID 1658.0001 Cline/Perry					
					PREPARATIONS
1658.0001	04/09/2019	FRM	275.00	3.00	825.00 RH - ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF DEPOSITION EXHIBITS; FEDEX TO HOTEL
1658.0001	04/10/2019	FRM	275.00	1.00	275.00 RH - ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF DEPOSITION EXHIBITS
1658.0001	04/16/2019	FRM	275.00	0.30	82.50 RH - TELEPHONE CALL TO KRAUSE COURT REPORTER RE EXPEDITED TRANSCRIPT
1658.0001	04/16/2019	FRM	275.00	0.30	82.50 RH - REVIEW, FORWARD TO ATTORNEY
1658.0001	04/26/2019	FRM	200.00	1.50	300.00 WORK ON DR. KRAUSE'S WORD COUNT; MADE TABLE FOR WORD COUNT; PLACED PARAGRAPHS NUMBERS IN TABLE
1658.0001	05/07/2019	FRM	200.00	5.00	1,000.00 WORK ON PREPARING PLEADING BINDERS FOR PERRY CLINE'S REVIEW
1658.0001	05/08/2019	FRM	200.00	2.00	400.00 WORK ON PREPARING BINDERS FOR DISCOVERY INCLUDING INDEX AND EXPERT REPORTS
1658.0001	05/23/2019	FRM	275.00	0.80	220.00 RH - TRAVEL TO AND DELIVER NOTEBOOK TO BARBARA LEY
1658.0001	09/12/2019	FRM	200.00	1.00	200.00 PREPARE PLEADING BINDER FOR CLIENT WITH INDEX
Subtotal for Timekeeper FRM			Billable	305.20	63,892.50 Former Timekeepers

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0002 Cline/Perry						
1658.0002	08/26/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	CONFERENCE WITH PAULA JANTZEN AND JASON RYAN RE APPEAL
1658.0002	08/27/2020	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	HEARING; REVIEW MCCLURE'S FILINGS
1658.0002	08/27/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	REVIEW ORDERS AND EMAIL
1658.0002	09/02/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review motion and consider bond issue
1658.0002	09/02/2020	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	Conference with Paula Jantzen re bond and need to ask for fees now; discuss preparing fee application
1658.0002	09/02/2020	PMR	875.00	2.10	1,837.50	Review correspondence; legal research and conference with Paula Jantzen and Jason Ryan; review [REDACTED]
1658.0002	09/04/2020	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	Conference with paula Jantzen re appellate issues; legal research
1658.0002	09/04/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Conference with Phillip Whaley re spreadsheet on appeal
1658.0002	09/04/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review email and file re [REDACTED]
1658.0002	09/11/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Discuss specialized 10th Circuit counsel with team
1658.0002	09/12/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review correspondence re specialist
1658.0002	09/14/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Conference with Paula jantzen and update file
1658.0002	09/14/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Team telephone conference
1658.0002	09/14/2020	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	Review lengthy memo re security on judgment; legal research - bankruptcy exemptions; conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	09/16/2020	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review Motion to Abate; conference with co-counsel
1658.0002	09/17/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Consider bond issue; conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0002	09/18/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review 10th Circuit Order; legal research; conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0002	09/20/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Telephone conference with Mike Burrage
1658.0002	09/21/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Team call
1658.0002	09/22/2020	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen; review Sunoco brief and 10th Circuit Order
1658.0002	09/23/2020	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	Review 10th Circuit Brief; Conference with Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	09/23/2020	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	Conference with team re Sunoco brief
1658.0002	09/28/2020	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Legal research and search re appellate course
1658.0002	09/29/2020	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	Conference with Jason Ryan; Conference with Paula Jantzen; Email Brad re [REDACTED]
1658.0002	09/29/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Exchange email with Brad
1658.0002	11/03/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review Order; Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	11/13/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review Sunoco docketing statement; Email
1658.0002	11/17/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review filings and email
1658.0002	11/23/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	11/23/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Conference with team
1658.0002	11/24/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review 10th Circuit Order; Telephone conference with team
1658.0002	12/14/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	12/14/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Conference call and telephone conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0002	12/17/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Email from and update to lawyers
1658.0002	12/18/2020	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Review 10th Circuit Orders; Conference with team
1658.0002	12/21/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Review email and Order
1658.0002	12/22/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review pleadings and filings
1658.0002	12/22/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	12/22/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Review disclosures and motion
1658.0002	12/28/2020	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review file and exchange email
1658.0002	12/28/2020	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Discuss settlement hearing
1658.0002	12/29/2020	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	Review email; Exchange email re hearing; Review file
1658.0002	01/04/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Telephone conference with Drew and Jason Ryan
1658.0002	01/05/2021	PMR	875.00	1.80	1,575.00	Mediation with 10th Circuit; Conference with Brad, Drew, Jason and Paula prior to mediation
1658.0002	03/04/2021	PMR	875.00	1.00	875.00	Review multiple filings
1658.0002	03/08/2021	PMR	875.00	1.60	1,400.00	Review brief
1658.0002	03/09/2021	PMR	875.00	3.20	2,800.00	Review Appellants' brief
1658.0002	03/10/2021	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Team conference
1658.0002	03/10/2021	PMR	875.00	3.20	2,800.00	Review Amicus briefs; Complete review of Sunoco opening brief
1658.0002	03/11/2021	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Discuss defendant's brief
1658.0002	03/12/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Team conference; Review file summaries
1658.0002	03/15/2021	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	Review materials in prep for briefs
1658.0002	03/15/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Conference with team
1658.0002	03/16/2021	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Review briefs
1658.0002	03/18/2021	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	Conference with Paula Jantzen and Jason Ryan; Review pleadings and orders re Sunoco
1658.0002	03/25/2021	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Email from Paula
1658.0002	03/29/2021	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Review email and summary of meeting

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0002 Cline/Perry						
1658.0002	04/06/2021	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	Review appellate brief
1658.0002	04/07/2021	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	Review amicus brief
1658.0002	04/16/2021	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	Review brief; Call with Tom
1658.0002	04/19/2021	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Team conference; Follow up with Jason and Paula
1658.0002	05/17/2021	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	05/17/2021	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	Complete reading of Sunoco appellate brief
1658.0002	05/17/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Telephone conference with team
1658.0002	05/19/2021	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	Review pleading
1658.0002	05/28/2021	PMR	875.00	3.20	2,800.00	Review and edit brief
1658.0002	05/28/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Conference with team re brief
1658.0002	06/01/2021	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review brief; Conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	06/21/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Conference call with team
1658.0002	06/22/2021	PMR	875.00	2.50	2,187.50	Review Sunoco Reply Brief
1658.0002	06/28/2021	PMR	875.00	1.90	1,662.50	Team meeting; Review Sunoco's supplemental authority
1658.0002	06/29/2021	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Conference with Jason Ryan re supplemental authority
1658.0002	07/12/2021	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Team call re status
1658.0002	08/03/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Telephone conference with Mike Burrage
1658.0002	08/05/2021	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	Conference with Burrage and Jason Ryan
1658.0002	08/09/2021	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Weekly call
1658.0002	09/15/2021	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	Review Order
1658.0002	10/08/2021	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Telephone conferences with Drew Pate and Bondurant
1658.0002	10/11/2021	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Conference with Paula Jantzen, Bondurant
1658.0002	10/12/2021	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Email with Bondurant; Send briefs
1658.0002	10/13/2021	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0002	10/14/2021	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Review merits of appeal with colleagues
1658.0002	10/15/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review 10th Circuit Order and discuss with team
1658.0002	10/18/2021	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	Conference with Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen; Legal research and review appellate record; Team call
1658.0002	10/21/2021	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Conference with Paula Jantzen and Jason Ryan
1658.0002	10/22/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review pleadings and talk with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	10/23/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0002	10/26/2021	PMR	875.00	3.30	2,887.50	Review Bondurant analysis; Multiple emails; Legal research re unidentified funds; Conference with JT and PJ; Review appellate brief
1658.0002	10/27/2021	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	Legal research; Review [REDACTED]
1658.0002	10/28/2021	PMR	875.00	1.20	1,050.00	Review email and conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	11/02/2021	PMR	875.00	5.10	4,462.50	Multiple conferences with Nix Patterson, Jason Ryan, Paula Jantzen, Bondurant and Burrage; Legal research re interest rate and 10th Circuit rules for appellate courts
1658.0002	11/03/2021	PMR	875.00	7.90	6,912.50	Review Judge Gibney Opinion; Review email; Telephone conference with Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen; Telephone conference with Russell; Telephone conference with Brad; Legal research re [REDACTED]; Telephone conference with Drew; Legal research re [REDACTED]
1658.0002	11/05/2021	PMR	875.00	4.30	3,762.50	Legal research; Review email; Send emails to Paula Jantzen; Telephone conference with Drew; Review 10th Circuit Opinion; Telephone conference with Paula; Telephone call to Nix Patterson
1658.0002	11/08/2021	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	Team call; Review correspondence with Si and Paula Jantzen; Review Record
1658.0002	11/08/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review Oliver Sporting; Conference with team
1658.0002	11/10/2021	PMR	875.00	3.50	3,062.50	Discuss options re settlement; Review procedure rules on appeal; Conference with Paula Jantzen and B.R.; Review all briefs and 10th Circuit Opinion; Conference with team;
1658.0002	11/11/2021	PMR	875.00	5.70	4,987.50	Review Sunoco brief; Review case law; Multiple conferences with team members
1658.0002	11/12/2021	PMR	875.00	4.60	4,025.00	Review all cases cited by the Court and Sunoco; Telephone conference with team; Telephone conference with Russell
1658.0002	11/15/2021	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Team call
1658.0002	11/19/2021	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Review time and expenses; Telephone conference with Paula; Email
1658.0002	11/22/2021	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Email with team
1658.0002	11/23/2021	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	Email with and conference with team and Bondurant
1658.0002	11/24/2021	PMR	875.00	2.30	2,012.50	Legal research; Email
1658.0002	11/29/2021	PMR	875.00	2.40	2,100.00	Review appellate costs; Legal research; Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen and Jason Ryan
1658.0002	11/30/2021	PMR	875.00	3.10	2,712.50	Legal research; Conference with team; Conference with Paula Jantzen and Jason Ryan; Telephone call to Russell
1658.0002	12/01/2021	PMR	875.00	3.70	3,237.50	Telephone conference with Russell; Legal research; Several

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0002 Cline/Perry						
						conferences with Paula; Email team
1658.0002	12/02/2021	PMR	875.00	4.10	3,587.50	Legal research; Telephone conference with team members
1658.0002	12/03/2021	PMR	875.00	3.70	3,237.50	Review Court Order; Conference with team members; Email with team
1658.0002	12/04/2021	PMR	875.00	2.70	2,362.50	Legal research; Conference with team
1658.0002	12/05/2021	PMR	875.00	2.70	2,362.50	Legal research; Conference with team
1658.0002	12/06/2021	PMR	875.00	4.00	3,500.00	Legal research; Conference with team
1658.0002	12/13/2021	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Discuss status and mandate
1658.0002	12/28/2021	PMR	875.00	3.10	2,712.50	Review briefs and proposed orders; Legal research on finality
1658.0002	01/03/2022	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	Conference with Paula Jantzen re appellate issues and filings, pending motions
1658.0002	01/03/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Team conference call
1658.0002	01/06/2022	PMR	875.00	3.10	2,712.50	Review and study draft brief re mandamus; Conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	01/07/2022	PMR	875.00	1.70	1,487.50	Review re-draft of mandamus brief
1658.0002	01/10/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Conference with team re next steps
1658.0002	06/02/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Conference with team re Supreme Court filing
1658.0002	06/02/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Conference with Jason Ryan; Review filing
1658.0002	06/06/2022	PMR	875.00	1.50	1,312.50	Conference with Jason Ryan; Review filings; Correspondence with Team; Conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0002	06/08/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Conference with team
1658.0002	06/10/2022	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	Review Sunoco filing; Consult re SC filing; Review docs
1658.0002	06/21/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review filing re fees; Confer with team
1658.0002	06/22/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Read ██████████
1658.0002	06/24/2022	PMR	875.00	1.80	1,575.00	Email and review filings by Sunoco; Conference with Paula and MK
1658.0002	06/30/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review Orders and Rule 8a; Conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	07/01/2022	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	Conference with Paula Jantzen and review case law
1658.0002	07/05/2022	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	Conference with Paula Jantzen; Review pleadings and deadlines
1658.0002	07/07/2022	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	Review email; Conference with Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	07/13/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Email; Review brief
1658.0002	07/15/2022	PMR	875.00	1.30	1,137.50	Review both jurisdictional briefs; Legal research; Email
1658.0002	07/19/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review national account of the case; Email; Conference with Paula Jantzen re thoughts on Supreme Court
1658.0002	07/20/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review additional email and collection documents
1658.0002	07/21/2022	PMR	875.00	0.10	87.50	Review NP email
1658.0002	07/22/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Study Sunoco reply brief
1658.0002	08/02/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Conference with Jason Ryan; Review filings
1658.0002	08/04/2022	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	Review Court Orders and federal rules; Conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	08/05/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review Orders and email with team
1658.0002	08/08/2022	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	Review Brad Beckworth analysis; Conference with Paula and Jason; Email
1658.0002	08/10/2022	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	Email; Work on liability of Energy Transfer
1658.0002	08/24/2022	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	Review Defendants' Motion and exchange email; Conference with Paula Jantzen and Jason Ryan re Sunoco collection
1658.0002	08/25/2022	PMR	875.00	2.20	1,925.00	Review multiple briefs; Exchange emails with Nix Patterson; Telephone conferences with Paula Jantzen and Jason Ryan; Legal research re ██████████
1658.0002	08/26/2022	PMR	875.00	0.60	525.00	Review briefs and email and telephone call to Nix Patterson
1658.0002	08/27/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review email and legal research
1658.0002	08/29/2022	PMR	875.00	2.60	2,275.00	Review 10th Circuit Sunoco brief; Telephone conference with Paula Jantzen and Jason Ryan re collections; Review Sunoco motion for stay in Supreme Court
1658.0002	09/02/2022	PMR	875.00	0.70	612.50	Review filing and multiple emails with co-counsel
1658.0002	09/06/2022	PMR	875.00	0.80	700.00	Review response to Supreme Court re stay; Exchange email
1658.0002	09/09/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review email and documents
1658.0002	09/13/2022	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	Conference with team and review Court minutes; Review Sunoco 10th Circuit brief; Conference with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	09/19/2022	PMR	875.00	1.10	962.50	Legal research; Conference with Paula Jantzen; Review Sunoco brief re discovery
1658.0002	09/26/2022	PMR	875.00	0.20	175.00	Review objection; Email
1658.0002	09/27/2022	PMR	875.00	0.30	262.50	Review Order; Conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0002	09/30/2022	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Review Supreme Court decision; Conference with Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	10/03/2022	PMR	875.00	0.40	350.00	Review decision; Conference with Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen; Review file
1658.0002	10/10/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Work on collection

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0002 Cline/Perry						
1658.0002	10/12/2022	PMR	875.00	0.50	437.50	Review email; Conference with Jason Ryan
1658.0002	10/13/2022	PMR	875.00	1.40	1,225.00	Review briefs and filings
1658.0002	10/14/2022	PMR	875.00	0.90	787.50	Review briefs; Conference with team
Subtotal for Timekeeper PMR			Billable	168.00	147,000.00	Patrick M. Ryan
1658.0002	09/12/2018	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	REVIEW ORDERS FROM JUDGE SHREDDER ON DISCOVERY ISSUES
1658.0002	08/27/2020	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	REVIEW ORDERS AND NOTICES OF APPEAL
1658.0002	08/31/2020	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL RE APPEAL ISSUES
1658.0002	09/02/2020	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	Conference with Pat and Paula regarding [REDACTED]
1658.0002	09/14/2020	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Talk with co-counsel regarding Appellate issues
1658.0002	09/16/2020	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Review Appellants opposed Motion to Abate Appeal
1658.0002	09/18/2020	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review Order regarding Motion to Abate Appeal
1658.0002	09/21/2020	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Review Appellants Memorandum Regarding Finality of Final Judgment
1658.0002	09/28/2020	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Call with counsel to discuss Reply and Appellate issues
1658.0002	09/28/2020	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review and discuss email regarding hiring Appellate counsel
1658.0002	09/29/2020	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Conference with Pat and Paula regarding hiring Appellate lawyer
1658.0002	10/05/2020	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Discuss Appeal and thing to do with co-counsel
1658.0002	11/18/2020	JAR	700.00	1.20	840.00	Review Appellee and Appellant Briefing on finality to discuss with co-counsel
1658.0002	11/25/2020	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review 10th Circuit Order and Sunoco's Motion for New Trial and Motion to Alter Judgment following Plan of Allocation
1658.0002	12/09/2020	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Appellant's Supplemental memo regarding finality
1658.0002	01/05/2021	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Attend Court ordered telephonic Mediation
1658.0002	03/04/2021	JAR	700.00	3.80	2,660.00	Study Appellate brief
1658.0002	03/08/2021	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	Discuss Appellant briefing with co-counsel
1658.0002	03/11/2021	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Discuss Appellate briefing with Pat and Paula
1658.0002	03/15/2021	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Personal conference with co-counsel to discuss Appellate briefing
1658.0002	05/24/2021	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	Discuss Appellate Briefing with co-counsel
1658.0002	07/12/2021	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	Discuss supplemental authority with co-counsel
1658.0002	07/12/2021	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review Plaintiff's Response to additional supplemental authority
1658.0002	08/26/2021	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Personal conference with Pat Ryan re: appeal and possible settlement negotiations
1658.0002	09/27/2021	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Discuss upcoming oral argument with co-counsel
1658.0002	10/04/2021	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Call with Beckworth, Pate and Pat re: oral argument and possible settlement
1658.0002	10/18/2021	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	Conference with co-counsel re: Order for additional briefing on jurisdictional issues
1658.0002	10/18/2021	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Review prior Orders and briefs on finality given the Tenth Circuits recent Order to supplemental briefing
1658.0002	10/20/2021	JAR	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	Review supplemental brief on Jurisdiction and previous briefing on the topic
1658.0002	10/21/2021	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Personal conference with Drew re: supplemental briefing on jurisdiction
1658.0002	10/25/2021	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review correspondence
1658.0002	10/25/2021	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Review draft of Appellee's supplemental memo regarding Finality of Judgment
1658.0002	11/01/2021	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Review and research Order dismissing appeal; multiple phone calls with co-counsel discovery same
1658.0002	11/02/2021	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Research issues related to the Order discussing appeal
1658.0002	11/02/2021	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	Call with co-counsel re: strategy for dealing with Court's recent
1658.0002	11/08/2021	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Personal conference with co-counsel re: appeal strategy and settlement strategy
1658.0002	11/29/2021	JAR	700.00	1.20	840.00	Review Order from Tenth Circuit and discuss with Pat and Paula
1658.0002	11/30/2021	JAR	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	Call with co-counsel re: Order denying re-hearing and strategy; call with Pat and Paula re: same
1658.0002	12/02/2021	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Review new filings at the Tenth Circuit by Sunoco and discuss with Paula and Drew
1658.0002	12/13/2021	JAR	700.00	1.30	910.00	Review and discuss extension filing and appellate attorney fee filing with co-counsel
1658.0002	12/22/2021	JAR	700.00	3.20	2,240.00	Review Appellate filings and orders; discuss with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	12/28/2021	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Review District Court filings 362 & 363 and Sunoco's Response to Application for Fee's in Appellate Court; Discuss same with Pat Ryan
1658.0002	12/28/2021	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Discuss recent filings with Pat Ryan and review Beckworth e-mail re:

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0002 Cline/Perry						
1658.0002	01/06/2022	JAR	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	Reply strategy Review/Study Defendant's Petition for Mandamus;
1658.0002	01/07/2022	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Review/Study/Revise Response to Petition for Mandamus
1658.0002	01/07/2022	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Discuss Response to Petition for Mandamus with Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	01/07/2022	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Discuss Response to Petition for Mandamus with Pat Ryan and Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	01/07/2022	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Review latest draft of Response and provide comments to co-counsel
1658.0002	01/10/2022	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Discuss upcoming filing with co-counsel
1658.0002	01/14/2022	JAR	700.00	1.20	840.00	Review/study/research Defendant's Reply re: Mandamus
1658.0002	01/31/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Discuss current state of appeal with co-counsel
1658.0002	02/02/2022	JAR	700.00	1.20	840.00	Review Order denying Mandamus; Talk with Patrick Ryan re: same; Review trial court opinions denying new trial for statements of finality
1658.0002	02/03/2022	JAR	700.00	0.80	560.00	Call with Patrick Ryan and Paula Jantzen to discuss recent Tenth Circuit opinion and next steps
1658.0002	02/03/2022	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Call with appellate counsel, Russell Post, about next steps
1658.0002	05/02/2022	JAR	700.00	1.50	1,050.00	Review Sunoco's new 10th Circuit Appeals; Review draft Mediation Brief; Call with Pat to discuss the same and waiver of Response on Cert
1658.0002	05/31/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Talk with Pat re: Sunoco's denial of Settlement demand and appeal
1658.0002	06/01/2022	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Conference with Pat and Paula re: Appeal and response to Petition for Writ of Certiorari
1658.0002	06/08/2022	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	Personal conference with Drew re: Appellate briefing
1658.0002	06/21/2022	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review class counsel's Supplemental Brief
1658.0002	06/28/2022	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Conference with Paula re: pending motions at Tenth Circuit
1658.0002	07/15/2022	JAR	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	Review Tenth Circuit filings
1658.0002	07/17/2022	JAR	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	Review, research and study response to Motion for Cert
1658.0002	08/04/2022	JAR	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	Review multiple Tenth Circuit Orders and look back at briefing; Conference with Paula re: same
1658.0002	09/07/2022	JAR	700.00	0.70	490.00	Review Plaintiff's Response to the Motion to Stay filed in SCOTUS
1658.0002	09/08/2022	JAR	700.00	0.50	350.00	Review Defendant's Reply to Motion to Stay in SCOTUS
1658.0002	09/08/2022	JAR	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review SCOTUS ruling in Stay and e-mail co-counsel
1658.0002	10/03/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Order denying Certiorari and exchange e-mails with co-counsel
1658.0002	10/03/2022	JAR	700.00	0.40	280.00	Discuss Scotus ruling with Paula and what is left pending at Tenth Circuit
1658.0002	10/04/2022	JAR	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Defendant's Sur-reply in Response to Plaintiff's draft report and recommendation
1658.0002	10/10/2022	JAR	700.00	0.60	420.00	Conference with Pat and Paula re: remaining Tenth Circuit Appeal
1658.0002	10/10/2022	JAR	700.00	2.50	1,750.00	Work on service Affidavit and research same
1658.0002	11/07/2022	JAR	700.00	1.00	700.00	Review Sunoco Appellate Reply; Talk with Pat Ryan and Paula Jantzen; Personal conference Drew re: next steps
Subtotal for Timekeeper JAR			Billable	62.90	44,030.00	Jason A. Ryan
1658.0002	09/01/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Communications with Pat Ryan and Drew Pate re: appellate issues and remaining activity before trial court
1658.0002	09/09/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review filings in appeal; communications with co-counsel re: same and issues identified for appeal
1658.0002	09/11/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review filings in Tenth Circuit
1658.0002	09/14/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	Review memo on Appeal bonds and costs; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	09/16/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Defendant's Motion to Abate Case; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	09/19/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	Review appellate filings by Sunoco re: Motion to Abate
1658.0002	09/21/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	Review Sunoco brief in appeal re: whether there is a final judgment; teleconference with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]; legal research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0002	09/29/2020	PMJ	700.00	1.00	700.00	Communications with co-counsel re: appellate issues
1658.0002	09/30/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Communications with Pat Ryan re: appellate issues
1658.0002	10/07/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review Plaintiff/Appellee's Memorandum Regarding Finality of Judgment; conference with Jason Ryan re: same
1658.0002	11/03/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Teleconference with Pat Ryan re: appellate issues
1658.0002	11/09/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Communications with co-counsel re: case activity in appeal
1658.0002	11/13/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Review Sunoco's statement of issues on appeal; follow-up

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0002 Cline/Perry						
1658.0002	11/24/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	communications with Pat Ryan and Jason Ryan re: same
1658.0002	12/10/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	Review Order Abating Appeal pending District Court ruling on motion for new trial and motion to vacate/amend judgment; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	12/14/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Teleconference with Jason Ryan re: Order/Opinion from Judge Gibney and associated appeal issues; review Sunoco filings in Appellate Court
1658.0002	12/21/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Communications with co-counsel re: Judge Gibney Opinion and Order and status of proceedings in Appeal
1658.0002	12/22/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Review filings in appellate court and district court re: remaining activities/information required to initiate briefing process
1658.0002	12/28/2020	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	Review Sunoco's Docketing Statement re: issues identified for appeal; review Order directing the parties to mediation; follow-up communications with Pat Ryan re: same; review Motion and Order extending time for Sunoco's opening brief
1658.0002	01/05/2021	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	Review Court Order re: January 5, 2021 Mediation teleconference; communications with Pat Ryan and Jason Ryan re: same; emails with co-counsel re: preparations for mediation; teleconference with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0002	02/08/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	Review materials in preparation for mediation teleconference; participate in teleconference with Hope Eckert; follow-up communications with Pat Ryan and Jason Ryan re: same
1658.0002	03/04/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.90	1,330.00	Communications with Jason Ryan and Pat Ryan re: activity in state court action and status of appeal; communications with class members re: status of case/appeal
1658.0002	03/08/2021	PMJ	700.00	3.70	2,590.00	Begin review of Sunoco's opening brief
1658.0002	03/10/2021	PMJ	700.00	2.90	2,030.00	Finish review of Sunoco's Opening Brief; multiple communications with co-counsel re: analysis of/response to same
1658.0002	03/24/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: Defendant's opening brief and amicus briefs; analyze case law cited in opening brief
1658.0002	03/25/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Communications with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0002	04/05/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0002	04/08/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Communications with co-counsel re: response brief for appeal
1658.0002	04/15/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Communications with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0002	04/19/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Communications with co-counsel re: appellate briefing
1658.0002	04/30/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Communications with co-counsel re: appellate briefing
1658.0002	05/17/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Teleconference with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0002	05/19/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	communications with co-counsel re: appeal brief
1658.0002	05/20/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	Review Motion seeking leave to file oversized brief; follow-up communications with co-counsel
1658.0002	05/27/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	Review Order granting Plaintiffs leave to file oversized brief; communications with Pat Ryan and Drew Pate re: response brief
1658.0002	05/29/2021	PMJ	700.00	4.60	3,220.00	Review draft appellate brief; communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	06/01/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.70	1,190.00	Review Sunoco's Opening brief; review and comment on draft Response brief; review and respond to multiple emails with legal team re: same
1658.0002	06/02/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review updated Response brief; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	06/03/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Communications with co-counsel re: final Response Brief for appeal
1658.0002	06/07/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Review Defendant's Motion to file oversized Reply brief; review Order re: same; teleconference with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0002	07/06/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review Amicus brief filed by National Association of Royalty Owners; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	07/08/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.40	980.00	Communications with Jason Ryan re: supplemental authority identified by Sunoco
1658.0002	07/09/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review Sunoco's Notice of Supplemental Authority re: TransUnion v. Ramirez; review TransUnion case re: assess case for responsive filing by Mr. Cline
1658.0002	09/15/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Communications with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0002	09/16/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Multiple communications re: preparations for oral argument before Court of Appeals
1658.0002	09/20/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Communications with co-counsel re: status of appeal and preparations for oral argument
1658.0002	10/04/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Communications with co-counsel re: preparations for oral argument; [REDACTED]
1658.0002	10/04/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Multiple communications with Pat Ryan, Jason Ryan, and

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0002 Cline/Perry						co-counsel at NP re: preparations for oral argument in support of appeal briefing; review appellate briefing
1658.0002	10/06/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Communications with co-counsel re: preparations for oral argument in support of appeal briefing; teleconference with class member re: request for status update on appeal
1658.0002	10/15/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.70	1,190.00	Review Order directing the parties to file supplemental briefs on jurisdiction; follow-up emails with co-counsel re: same; review filings in district court re: jurisdiction/allocation issues
1658.0002	10/18/2021	PMJ	700.00	2.10	1,470.00	Review district court and appellate filings re: jurisdictional issues and recent court order directing the parties to submit additional briefing; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	10/20/2021	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	Review Sunoco's supplemental brief on jurisdictional issues; review underlying briefs/orders from District Court; communications with Jason Ryan re: same
1658.0002	10/21/2021	PMJ	700.00	2.00	1,400.00	Additional review of motions/briefs/orders relating to jurisdictional questions raised in appeal; multiple communications with Pat Ryan and Jason Ryan re: same
1658.0002	10/25/2021	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: supplemental briefing on jurisdictional issues; review draft brief on jurisdictional issues; communications re: preparations for oral argument
1658.0002	11/01/2021	PMJ	700.00	3.60	2,520.00	Review materials in support of efforts to prepare for oral arguments; review Order dismissing appeal; multiple follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same; legal research re: review authority cited in Order dismissing appeal
1658.0002	11/02/2021	PMJ	700.00	5.20	3,640.00	Multiple emails and teleconferences with co-counsel re: Order dismissing appeal and next steps; continue legal research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0002	11/08/2021	PMJ	700.00	2.20	1,540.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: dismissal of appeal and next steps in the Court of Appeals and District Court; legal research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0002	11/11/2021	PMJ	700.00	3.60	2,520.00	Review Sunoco's Petition for Rehearing/En Banc Review; review case law cited in Petition; review select filings from district court and Appeal No. 7064; multiple follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	11/29/2021	PMJ	700.00	2.80	1,960.00	Review Order denying Sunoco's request for panel rehearing and for rehearing en banc; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same and next steps; legal research re: [REDACTED]
1658.0002	12/01/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	Review email from Defense Counsel re: planned motion for writ of mandamus and other appeal issues; follow-up communications with co-counsel; review Rules governing mandates, writs of mandamus, motions for appellate attorneys' fees; legal research re: same
1658.0002	12/01/2021	PMJ	700.00	1.30	910.00	Review Sunoco's Motion to Stay Issuance of Mandate and Petition for Writ of Mandamus; communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	12/03/2021	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	Review Order denying Sunoco's Motion to Stay Issuance of Mandate; multiple follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same; legal research re: writs of mandamus
1658.0002	12/06/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Multiple communications with co-counsel re: motion for appellate fees
1658.0002	12/13/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Review/comment on draft motion for appellate attorneys' fees; follow-up communications re: same
1658.0002	12/14/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.10	70.00	Review court order setting response date for Motion for appellate attorneys' fees
1658.0002	12/21/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review Court Order requesting response briefing on Sunoco's Petition for Writ of Mandamus; multiple follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	12/27/2021	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	Review Sunoco's Response in opposition to Plaintiff's Motion for Attorneys' Fees; review cited authority therein; follow-up communications with co-counsel
1658.0002	01/03/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	Review Court Order denying Motion for Attorneys' fees in appeal; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	01/03/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.00	700.00	Communications with co-counsel re: response to Petition for Writ of Mandamus
1658.0002	01/06/2022	PMJ	700.00	3.40	2,380.00	Review Sunoco's Petition for Writ of Mandamus and filings/authorities cited therein; review draft Response to Petition; follow-up communications with Pat Ryan and Jason Ryan re: same

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0002 Cline/Perry						
1658.0002	01/07/2022	PMJ	700.00	3.30	2,310.00	Review and comment on revised draft Response to Sunoco's Petition for Writ of Mandamus; multiple communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	01/10/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review Sunoco's Motion for leave to file supplemental Appendix; communications with co-counsel re: Sunoco's Petition for Writ of Mandamus; teleconference with Perry Cline
1658.0002	01/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.20	840.00	Review Sunoco's Reply brief in support of Petition for Writ of Mandamus; follow-up communications with co-counsel
1658.0002	02/03/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Review Order denying Sunoco's Petition for Writ of Mandamus; multiple follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same and next steps in possible appeal proceedings
1658.0002	02/19/2022	PMJ	700.00	4.30	3,010.00	Legal research re: identify support to refute Sunoco's opposition to asset discovery; draft Plaintiff's response in support of asset discovery
1658.0002	02/28/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.10	70.00	Review Order granting Sunoco's application for extension of time to file Petition for Writ of Certiorari
1658.0002	05/13/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review filings in appellate court
1658.0002	05/16/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Review multiple filings in new appeals by Sunoco
1658.0002	05/18/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	Review Supreme Court request for Response to Petition for Certiorari; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	06/28/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	Communications with co-counsel re: status of pending appeals and motion to consolidate appeals in Tenth Circuit
1658.0002	07/05/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Teleconference with Pat Ryan re: Order addressing jurisdictional issues; teleconference with Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]
1658.0002	07/08/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.90	630.00	Review multiple filings in appeals; follow-up communications re: same
1658.0002	07/11/2022	PMJ	700.00	3.30	2,310.00	Identify support for briefing on jurisdictional issues and response to Sunoco's request for injunctive relief in 22-7018
1658.0002	07/12/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.40	1,680.00	Continue review of cases governing issues raised in Defendants' multiple appeals; conference with Pat Ryan re: same
1658.0002	07/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Review Cline brief on jurisdictional issues; communications with co-counsel re: same and response brief in 22-7018
1658.0002	07/15/2022	PMJ	700.00	4.60	3,220.00	Review Sunoco brief on jurisdictional issues; communications with co-counsel re: same and brief in 22-7018; review response to Petition for Certiorari and response to Defendants' Motion for Injunction
1658.0002	07/22/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.60	420.00	Review Sunoco's Reply in Support of Motion for Injunction or Stay Pending Appeal; follow-up communications re: same
1658.0002	08/04/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	Review Orders dismissing appeals for lack of jurisdiction and Order directing briefing in 22-7018; follow up communications with co-counsel; teleconference with Perry Cline
1658.0002	08/05/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Review filings in Appeal No. 22-7018; communications with co-counsel re: appellate activity
1658.0002	08/17/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Conference with Jason Ryan re: case status/briefing
1658.0002	08/25/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.70	490.00	Review Defendants' Motion for Administrative Stay; Review Order denying Motion for stay or injunction pending appeal and Motion for administrative stay; follow-up communications with co-counsel re: same
1658.0002	08/30/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.90	1,330.00	Review Defendants' request for stay in Supreme Court; teleconference with Pat Ryan; review notice from Supreme Court re: request for response brief; communications with co-counsel
1658.0002	09/06/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Review brief in opposition to Defendants' motion to stay asset discovery; communications with co-counsel
1658.0002	09/07/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Communications with co-counsel re: Defendants' Emergency Application for Injunction or Stay Pending Resolution of Petition for Certiorari
1658.0002	09/08/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Review Defendants' Reply in Support of Emergency Application for Injunction or Stay Pending Resolution of Petition for Certiorari; review order denying Application; follow-up communications re: same
1658.0002	09/13/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Communications with co-counsel re: Defendants' opening brief
1658.0002	09/14/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.80	1,260.00	Review Defendants' opening brief; review cited authorities
1658.0002	09/19/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.30	210.00	Communications with co-counsel re: response brief
1658.0002	09/22/2022	PMJ	700.00	2.30	1,610.00	Legal research re: identify support for Response brief; conference with Pat Ryan re: Response brief and Defendants' Petition for Certiorari
1658.0002	10/03/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.50	350.00	Communications with co-counsel and Perry Cline re: [REDACTED]

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0002 Cline/Perry						
1658.0002	10/07/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.80	560.00	Communications with co-counsel re: Plaintiff's response brief
1658.0002	10/10/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.40	280.00	Communications with Jason Ryan and Pat Ryan re: response brief
1658.0002	10/13/2022	PMJ	700.00	1.10	770.00	Final review of Response to Defendants' Opening Brief; communications with co-counsel and Class Representative
1658.0002	12/13/2022	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review filings in Tenth Circuit; communications with co-counsel
1658.0002	01/11/2023	PMJ	700.00	0.20	140.00	Review Order setting matter for oral argument; follow-up communications with co-counsel
Subtotal for Timekeeper PMJ			Billable	123.70	86,590.00	Paula M. Jantzen
1658.0002	10/28/2019	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	(APPEAL) PREPARE AND FILE APPEARANCE FOR PAT RYAN, JASON RYAN AND PAULA JANTZEN
1658.0002	10/28/2019	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	(APPEAL) REVIEW APPEARANCES FILED BY NIX PATTERSON ATTORNEYS, BARNES & LEWIS ATTORNEYS, BURRAGE, SUNOCO COUNSEL
1658.0002	10/29/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	(APPEAL) REVIEW CLIENT'S RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO PETITION FOR PERMISSION TO APPEAL
1658.0002	10/29/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	(APPEAL) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 10TH CIRCUIT RE APPEARANCES
1658.0002	10/30/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	(APPEAL) REVIEW APPEARANCE OF FRANKLIN ON BEHALF OF SUNOCO
1658.0002	10/31/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	(APPEAL) REVIEW PETITIONERS' MOTION TO STAY PENDING APPEAL AND FORWARD TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0002	10/31/2019	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	(APPEAL) REVIEW COURT'S ORDER DIRECTING CLINE TO FILE RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR STAY PENDING APPEAL AND FORWARD TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0002	11/01/2019	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	(APPEAL) REVIEW SUNOCO'S ADDITIONAL NOTICE OF SUPPLEMENTAL AUTHORITY AS WELL AS CLINE'S RESPONSE
1658.0002	08/27/2020	JM	275.00	0.60	165.00	REVIEW COURT'S MINUTE SHEET RE VIDEO CONFERENCE HEARING; NOTICE OF APPEAL; TRANSMISSION OF NOTICE OF APPEAL; JUDGMENT ORDER; FIRST AMENDED NOTICE OF APPEAL; AND TRANSMISSION OF AMENDED NOTICE OF APPEAL
1658.0002	08/27/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	APPEAL - REVIEW 10TH CIRCUIT'S TRANSMITTAL SHEET, AMENDED TRANSMITTAL SHEET AND FORWARD DEADLINE TO FILE APPEARANCES TO ATTORNEYS
1658.0002	09/08/2020	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	Appeal - Prepare draft of Appearance for 10th Circuit
1658.0002	09/09/2020	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	Appeal - Finalize and file Appearance in 10th Circuit
1658.0002	09/09/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Appeal - Review Appearance of Yeates for Appellants, Docketing Statement for appellants, Appearance of Heidler for Appellants
1658.0002	09/09/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Appeal - Telephone conference with Jeanette at 10th Circuit re 10th Circuit's error on Notice of Docket Activity re not listing Paula Jantzen as entering an appearance
1658.0002	09/10/2020	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	Appeal - Review Acknowledgement of Transcript Order by Appellants, Appearances of Dekovich & McClure for Appellants, Minute Order directing deadline for completion of record, Appearances of Angelovich, Beckworth and Pate for Appellees
1658.0002	09/15/2020	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	Appeal - Review Appearance of Christiansen, Appearance of Barnes & Lewis attorneys, Appearance of Stevenson for Appellants, Notice that record is complete, and deadline for appellate to file opening brief and appendix
1658.0002	09/16/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Appellants' Opposed Motion to Abate Appeal and Briefing Deadlines
1658.0002	09/21/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Appeal - Review Court's Order re Appellants' Motion to Abate Appeal and forward deadline contained in Order to attorneys
1658.0002	09/21/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review Appellant's Memo re Finality of Judgment
1658.0002	09/22/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Appeal - Receive and review Court's Order directing Appellee to file response brief and email to attorneys re same
1658.0002	09/23/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Appeal - Review Appearances of Yetter and Woods
1658.0002	10/06/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Appeal - Review Appearance by Post; Review Appellee's Memorandum re Finality of Judgment
1658.0002	10/30/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review new 10th Circuit cases - civil case docketed, and forward deadline to file appearance to attorneys
1658.0002	11/02/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	20-7055 - Review Appellants' Supplemental Memo re Finality of Judgment Filed Due to New Developments
1658.0002	11/02/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	20-7064 Review Appearances of Heidler and Yeates for Appellants
1658.0002	11/02/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	EDOK Review letter from 10th Circuit re case docketed and appeal

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0002 Cline/Perry						
						number
1658.0002	11/03/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	20-7064 Review Court's Order directing briefing on finality of district court judgment re plan of allocation and forward deadlines to attorneys
1658.0002	11/12/2020	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	Appeal 20-7064 - Prepare draft of Entry of Appearance and email to attorneys re same
1658.0002	11/12/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Appeal 20-7064 - Review Appearances of Stevenson, McClure, Dekovich, Nix Patterson attorneys
1658.0002	11/13/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Appeal 20-7064 - Review Appellants' docketing statement
1658.0002	11/13/2020	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	Appeal 20-7064 - Finalize and file Appearance for Ryan Whaley attorneys
1658.0002	11/16/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Appeal 20-7064 - Review Appearances of Barnes & Lewis attorneys, Woods and Yetter
1658.0002	11/17/2020	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	Review Appellee's Memorandum re Finality of Judgment, Court's Notice to Appellants' re deficiency re docketing statement, Appellants' Memo re Finality of Judgment, Appellants' Appendix; Transcript Order Form
1658.0002	11/18/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	20-7064 - Review Court's Minute Order directing Court Clerk to complete record, Notice from Court that record complete, and District Court's filing that record is complete
1658.0002	11/30/2020	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	20-7064 - Review Court's Order abating appeal
1658.0002	12/09/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	20-7064 - Review District Court's Opinion and Order, Appellants' Status Report, Appellants' Supplemental Memorandum
1658.0002	12/17/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	20-7022 - Review Court's Notice of deadline to file Appearance and forward to attorneys
1658.0002	12/18/2020	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	Review Court's order procedurally consolidating appeals 20-7064 and 20-7072; Review Court's Order in 20-7064 lifting abatement and reviewing merits of case on briefing
1658.0002	12/18/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	20-7072 - Review Appearances of Heidler for Sunoco, Yeates for Sunoco, Post for Client, and Acknowledgement of Transcript already on file
1658.0002	12/21/2020	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Appeal - Review Court's Minute Order directing deadline to complete record, notice re record complete, and setting Appellants' briefing deadline
1658.0002	12/22/2020	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	Appeal - Prepare and file Entry of Appearance in 20-7072
1658.0002	12/22/2020	JM	275.00	1.10	302.50	Appeal - Review numerous attorney Appearances, Transcript Order Form, Notice advising record is complete, Notice of Mediation Conference, Appellants' Motion for Extension of time to file opening brief; Forward briefing deadline to attorneys; Forward mediation conference related deadlines to attorneys
1658.0002	12/29/2020	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	Complete 10th Circuit Mediation Conference form and forward to 10th Circuit; Emails with and telephone conference with Paula Jantzen re same
1658.0002	03/03/2021	JM	275.00	3.20	880.00	Download and compile Appellants' Opening Brief, Appellants' Appendix Vols. 1-58, Court's Minute Order directing Emery to file Appearance; Compile copies of Opening Brief for attorney review
1658.0002	03/03/2021	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Review 10th Circuit Rules re deadline for Appellee to file Answer Brief and forward deadline to attorneys
1658.0002	03/04/2021	JM	275.00	4.30	1,182.50	Download and compile Appellants' Appendix Vols. 59-140, Motion for Leave to File Appendix Vols. 136-140 Under Seal, Motion for Leave to 9 Large Exhibits on USB Thumb Drive; Minute Order accepting Appellants' Brief and Appendix and setting Appellee's response deadline
1658.0002	03/10/2021	JM	275.00	0.80	220.00	Receive and review Amicus Curiae Brief of U.S. Chamber of Commerce, Minute Order directing counsel for Chamber to file appearance, Minute order accepting Amicus brief for filing, Appearances of counsel for Amicus Curiae Petroleum Alliance of Oklahoma, Amicus Curiae Brief of Petroleum Alliance of Oklahoma, and Minute Order accepting Petroleum Alliance of Oklahoma brief
1658.0002	03/15/2021	JM	275.00	1.10	302.50	Compile copies of Appellants' Opening Brief, and Amicus Briefs by U.S. Chamber and OK Petroleum Alliance and forward to Perry Cline
1658.0002	03/18/2021	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	Receive and review Notice from Court that paper copies of Chamber brief received, paper copies of OK Petroleum Alliance brief received, Cline's Motion for 30-day extension to file answer Brief, and Order granting extension; Forward new deadline to attorneys
1658.0002	05/19/2021	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Cline's Motion for Leave to Exceed Word

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount
Client ID 1658.0002 Cline/Perry					
					County, and Order granting Motion in part
1658.0002	06/01/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Appeal - Receive and review Appearance of Burrage for Cline
1658.0002	06/02/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Appellee's brief
1658.0002	06/03/2021	JM	275.00	1.20	330.00 Receive and review Court's Minute Order accepting Appellee's brief and setting deadline for option Reply Brief; Prepare and send copy of Appellee's Brief to Perry Cline; Receive and review Appellant's Motion to exceed word count re Reply Brief, and Order granting in part Motion to exceed word count
1658.0002	06/07/2021	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50 Appeal - Receive and review Notice that Court received Appearances of Appellee's brief, Appearance of Knott for Amicus Curiae OK-NARO, Amicus Curiae Brief of OK-NARO, and Minute Order accepting OK-NARO brief
1658.0002	06/22/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Appellants' Reply Brief
1658.0002	06/28/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Appellants' Notice of Supplemental Authority
1658.0002	09/07/2021	JM	275.00	0.60	165.00 Review Jason Ryan's email requesting information on three 10th Circuit cases; Research and obtain information requested on three 10th Circuit cases and forward to Jason Ryan
1658.0002	09/15/2021	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Court's Notice re oral arguments and forward to attorneys
1658.0002	09/20/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Email to attorneys re deadline to submit oral argument acknowledgment form
1658.0002	09/20/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review oral argument acknowledgment form re Yeates for Sunoco
1658.0002	10/05/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Oral Argument Acknowledgement Forms for Post (Cline) and Yeates (Sunoco)
1658.0002	10/18/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 10th Circuit - Receive and review Court's Order directing supplemental briefing
1658.0002	10/20/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Appellant's Second Supplemental Brief re Final, Appealable Judgment
1658.0002	10/25/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Appellee's Supplemental Memo re Finality of Judgment
1658.0002	11/01/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Appeal - Receive and review Order dismissing appeal and minute order vacating oral arguments
1658.0002	11/02/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review EDOK's Court's filing of 10th Circuit Order
1658.0002	11/11/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Appellants' Petition for Rehearing
1658.0002	11/30/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Order denying Appellants' Petition for Rehearing En Banc
1658.0002	12/01/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Appellants' Motion to Stay Issuance of Mandate
1658.0002	12/02/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Appearance on behalf of Appellants in newest 10th Circuit Appeal
1658.0002	12/02/2021	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Appellants' Petition for Writ of Mandamus (new 10th Circuit appeal)
1658.0002	12/03/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Court's Order denying Motion to Stay Issuance of Mandate
1658.0002	12/03/2021	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review 10th Circuit's letter to EDOK re Appellants' Petition for Writ of Mandamus (and attachments) docketed
1658.0002	12/13/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Appeal - Receive and review Client's Application for Attorneys' Fees
1658.0002	12/14/2021	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 (Appeal) Receive and review Court's Order setting deadline for Appellants to respond to Application for Attorneys' Fees; Forward response deadline to attorneys
1658.0002	12/21/2021	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review 10th Circuit's Order directing response/reply deadlines re Sunoco's Petition for Writ of Mandamus
1658.0002	12/28/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Sunoco's Response to Application for Appellate Attorney Fees
1658.0002	12/28/2021	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review EDOK's filing of 10th Circuit's Order directing Plaintiff to file Response to Petition for Writ of Mandamus
1658.0002	01/07/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Appeal - Receive and review Cline's Response to Petition for Writ of Mandamus
1658.0002	01/10/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Sunoco's Motion for Leave to File Bookmarked Mandamus attachments
1658.0002	01/14/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 10th Circuit - Receive and review Sunoco's Reply re Petition for Writ of Mandamus
1658.0002	02/02/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Appeal - Receive and review 10th Circuit's Order denying Petition for Writ of Mandamus; Receive and review Appellants' Bookmarked Version of Petition for Writ of Mandamus
1658.0002	02/04/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review EDOK's filing of 10th Circuit's Order denying Petition for Writ of Mandamus

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	
Client ID 1658.0002 Cline/Perry						
1658.0002	03/29/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Motion for Admission Pro Hac Vice re Erin Murphy, Order granting same; Receive and review letter from U.S. Supreme Court granting extension of time to file Petition for Writ of Certiorari filed in 10th Circuit cases
1658.0002	03/30/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	EDOK - Receive and review letter from U.S. Supreme Court granting extension for Sunoco to file Petition for Writ of Certiorari
1658.0002	05/03/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Appeals 7064/7072 - Receive and review letter from U.S. Supreme Court re Petition for Writ of Certiorari filed
1658.0002	05/12/2022	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	22-7017 & 22-7018 - Prepare drafts of Appearance of Counsel for new appeals
1658.0002	05/13/2022	JM	275.00	1.20	330.00	22-7017 & 22-7018 - Receive and review numerous Appearances, Docketing Statement, Transcript Order form
1658.0002	05/13/2022	JM	275.00	0.40	110.00	22-7017 & 22-7018 - Finalize and file Appearances for Pat Ryan, Paula Jantzen and Jason Ryan
1658.0002	05/16/2022	JM	275.00	0.60	165.00	22-7017 & 22-7018 - Receive and review multiple filings, and notice from Court consolidating appeals for briefing purposes, setting deadline for Appellants to file opening brief; Receive and review EDOK filings re record complete and transcript order form
1658.0002	06/24/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	(Federal Court) Receive and review Defendants' Notice of Appeal (Interlocutory), Transmission of Notice of Appeal, and Appeal Information
1658.0002	06/24/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	22-7030 - Receive and review Notice of Appeal and forward deadline to file Appearance to attorneys
1658.0002	06/24/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	22-7017 - Receive and review Appellants' Motion for Injunction or Stay Pending Appeal and forward to attorneys
1658.0002	06/27/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Receive and review Appellants' Motion to Consolidate
1658.0002	06/27/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Receive and review Court's Order taking Motion to Consolidate appeals under advisement, and vacating Appellants' briefing deadline
1658.0002	06/29/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Assist Paula Jantzen with reviewing certain Plaintiff trial exhibits
1658.0002	06/30/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	22-7030 - Prepare and file Appearance for Pat Ryan, Jason Ryan and Paula Jantzen
1658.0002	07/05/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	22-7017 & 22-7018 - Receive and review Appellee's Motion for Extension of Time to Respond to Motion for Injunction or Stay Pending Appeal
1658.0002	07/05/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	22-7017, 22-7018 - Receive and review Court's Order granting Appellee's Motion for Extension of Time to Respond to Motion for Stay or Injunction Pending Appeal and forward new response deadline to attorneys
1658.0002	07/05/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	22-7030 - Receive and review Appearances on behalf of McClure and Dekovich
1658.0002	07/07/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	22-7030 - Receive and review Appearance of Stevenson for Sunoco
1658.0002	07/08/2022	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50	22-7030 - Receive and Review Appearances of Yetter and Woods for Sunoco, Barnes & Lewis for Client, Burrage for Client, Clement and Murphy for Sunoco, Docketing Statement and Transcript Order Form
1658.0002	07/11/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Transcript order form in 22-7030 filed in federal court; Receive and review Notice from Court that record is complete for appeal
1658.0002	07/12/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Court's Minute Order setting deadline for completion of record; Receive and review Court's Notice that record is complete
1658.0002	07/15/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	Receive and review Appellee's Memorandum Brief re Appellate Jurisdiction, Appellee's Response to Motion for Injunction to Stay Pending Appeal, and Appellants' Memorandum Brief on Appellate Jurisdiction; Forward all to attorneys
1658.0002	07/15/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	Access U.S. Supreme Court dockets to obtain copy of all filings in case
1658.0002	08/04/2022	JM	275.00	0.30	82.50	22-7017, 22-7018, 22-7030 - Receive and review Court's Orders, forward to attorneys, and forward briefing deadline for Sunoco in 22-7018
1658.0002	08/05/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Letter to client enclosing 10th Circuit Orders of 08/04/2022
1658.0002	08/05/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50	Receive and review EDOK's filing of 10th Circuit decisions
1658.0002	08/25/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	21-7018 - Receive and review Sunoco's Motion for Administrative Stay, and forward to attorneys
1658.0002	08/26/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Cline's Notice to Court and forward to attorneys
1658.0002	08/31/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00	Receive and review Defendants' Letter to EDOK re notification of

Client	Trans Date	Tkpr	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount
Client ID 1658.0002 Cline/Perry					
1658.0002	08/31/2022	JM	275.00	0.50	137.50 recent activity in U.S. Supreme Court; Forward to attorneys; Forward deadline imposed by U.S. Supreme Court for Cline to respond
1658.0002	08/31/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Access U.S. Supreme Court case and obtain filings to update file
1658.0002	09/14/2022	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Receive and review Class Rep's Response to Notice of Recent Development and forward to attorneys for review
1658.0002	10/03/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 22-7018 - Receive and review Court's Notice of Acceptance of Appellants' Brief, setting response deadline; Forward deadline to attorneys
1658.0002	10/14/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 20-7064, 20-7072 - Receive and review 10th Circuit's filing of U.S. Supreme Court's Order denying Petition for Writ of Certiorari
1658.0002	11/04/2022	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 22-7018 - Receive and review Appellee's Response to Opening Brief
1658.0002	01/11/2023	JM	275.00	0.20	55.00 Appeal 22-7018 - Receive and review Sunoco's Reply Brief
1658.0002	01/13/2023	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 22-7018 - Receive and review oral argument notice; Forward deadline to complete notice and date of oral arguments to attorneys
1658.0002	01/17/2023	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Oral Argument Calendar Notice/Acknowledgement Form of Russell Post on behalf of Perry Cline
1658.0002	01/17/2023	JM	275.00	0.10	27.50 Receive and review Oral Argument/Calendar Acknowledgement Form for Paul Clement on behalf of Sunoco
Subtotal for Timekeeper JM			Billable	36.70	10,092.50 JoAnn Mickle

Cline v. Sunoco Brad Beckworth Time		
3/7/16	Review email re filing claim vs Sunoco	0.75
2016 Total		0.75
6/30/17	Review claim and draft of entry of appearance and approve same	0.5
7/13/17	Review and revise drafts of petition and initial service documents	3
7/20/17	Work on initial discovery (RFP, RFA, ROGs and review emails re same)	1
8/1/17	Review email from DP to me and counsel re discovery draft and PR and JR reply	0.1
8/2/17	Email to/from JR and DP re filing and service; email from Pat Malone re exemption of time to answer; discuss extension and send email to Malone agreeing	0.5
8/3/17	Email from LM re filing and dates	0.1
8/9/17	Read services and reply services of emails to/from Mark Christian re extension of time and filing errors	0.25
8/15/17	Review and research removal papers filed by Sunoco	1
8/15/17	Review and discuss related case motion	0.25
8/17/17	Review case notice filings and scheduling order	0.25
8/21/17	Read Sunoco's answer; Discuss same w/ DP and Draft/Send emails with revised re answer strategy	1
8/22/17	Review and revise drafts of letter to MC re consent to Judge West and internal emails re same	1
8/23/17	Email to/from DM re scheduling conference; internal discussion re same	0.2
8/24/17	Internal discussion re attendance for scheduling conference	0.1
8/25/17	Email to/from Malone re scheduling conference	0.1
8/28/17	Correspondence from MB to MC and review reply	0.1
9/5/17	Review case reassignment and discuss internally	0.1
9/12/17	Emails from MC and DM re discovery and research and prepare our response to same	0.2
9/15/17	Finalize and approve reservice of RFA, RFP, etc.	1
10/2/17	Review proposed scheduling order from MC	0.2
10/6/17	Review and finalize draft of Joint Status Report; email from DP re same; Email to LM re attendance; Email to/from DP and MC re status report	1
10/9/17	Revise JSR draft to reject and email to/from DP re same	0.5
10/11/17	Emails to/from MC and DM re JSR revisions and negotiations	1
10/17/17	Review defendant's discovery responses	1

10/19/17	Email from DP re revision JSR; Review defendant's proposal	0.25
10/25/17	Read Judge Payne's Order	0.1
10/27/17	Review Sunoco's initial disclosures	0.2
11/6/17	Work on drafts of agreed protective order	1.5
11/21/17	Emails w/ DM and DP re meet and confer and document production	0.1
11/23/17	Review defendant's first RFP's and ROGs to Cline	2
11/28/17	Email re discovery call	0.1
12/13/17	Read email from DM re document production	0.1
12/20/17	Read Sunoco's letters to Cline and family re payments; email w/ DP and TD re same and client pick-off rules; research client / class rep "pick-off cases"	5
12/28/17	Work on Interim Class Counsel Motion; emails re same	1
12/29/17	Email from PR re Interim Class Counsel Motion	0.1
2017 TOTAL		24.9
1/2/18	Email from DP and letter/ email from PM re accounting data and our class definition	0.25
1/3/18	Review, draft and approve Cline discovery objections and answer	2
1/16/18	Review 30(B)(6) draft notice and revise; work on DP draft letter re discovery response deficiencies; Emails to/from PR, JR and DP re same and ICC motion	2
1/19/18	DM email re depo scheduling re Holland and Koelling and 30(b)(6)	0.1
1/22/18	Email w/ DP and DM re depositions; internal discussion re same	0.1
2/1/18	Review memo and research re 30(b)(6) deposition becoming fact depo and waiver issues	1
2/7/18	Emails re depo scheduling and internal discussions	0.2
2/9/18	Email from DM re depo and review calendar	0.1
2/15/18	Read Sunoco's RFA answers; review depo notice	0.2
3/8/18	Review depo summary re Koelling depo	0.5
3/26/18	Review ESI letter to Sunoco	0.2
3/30/18	Review Holland depo summary	0.5
4/12/18	Emails w/ JR and DM re outstanding discovery issues	0.1
4/13/18	Read memo re OCC and open records request	0.1
4/15/18	Read DM letter re ESI and internal emails re same	0.2
4/16/18	Discovery	1.38
4/23/18	Email w/ PR re depositions	0.1
4/28/18	Review DM email and attachment re E-Discovery; email w/ PR re depositions; internal emails re RFP and strategy; read W.I.O. memo	1
4/30/18	Discovery; Meeting (NPR Team)	2.75

4/30/18	Review memo from RB re defenses for depo questions	1
5/2/18	Emails from PR re discovery	0.1
5/7/18	Email w/ DP re schedule and discovery call	0.1
5/9/18	Email from DM re ESI and 30(b)(6) depo; internal discussion w/ DP and JA re depositions re defenses asserted by defendant	0.5
5/12/18	Read proposal by DM re search terms; internal email and discussion re schedule and Judge Payne	0.5
5/15/18	Multiple emails and discussion re outstanding discovery issues; review suspense code ex. From DP	2
5/16/18	Multiple emails re Cline depo	0.1
5/22/18	Email from DM; memo to BC re case assignments and discussion re same	0.5
5/23/18	Email from DP response to Sunoco re outstanding discovery issues	0.1
5/29/18	Various emails re ESI issues and extension of discovery deadlines	0.2
5/30/18	Review discovery; prepare for t/c and conduct with counsel re discovery issues; work on new discovery requests	2
6/3/18	Review emails and data from Sunoco	0.2
6/4/18	Discovery; Email Communication; Meeting	2.75
6/7/18	Read emails from DM re 30(b)(6) witnesses and supplement to ROGs	0.1
6/8/18	Memo from DM to PJ requesting fee agreement; research same; internal conversations re Sunoco's request for fee agreement	1.2
6/11/18	Review memo from PR re outstanding discovery issues	0.5
6/18/18	Discovery; Teleconference; Email Communication	5.5
6/18/18	Read Sunoco's response to motion to extend deadlines; internal discussion re same	0.5
6/20/18	Review discovery and status memo from PR	0.2
6/24/18	Team call	0.5
6/25/18	[REDACTED]	4
6/27/18	Emails re draft of MTC and review Judge Shredder's orders	0.2
6/28/18	Internal Discussion re Sunoco's privilege log	0.1
6/29/18	Emails w/ Sunoco re the MTC re privilege	0.1
7/2/18	Read Sunoco's responses to 2nd RFP and ROGs - discussion re same	0.5
7/3-5/18	Work on MTC	2
7/8/18	Review and discuss PowerPoint draft for MTS hearing	0.5

7/9/18	Review discovery responses and draft MTC and internal discussion re same	3
7/11/18	Read report from PR re hearing; review Sunoco response brief; emails; read orders	1
7/12/18	Review drafts of new depo notices per order; internal emails re same	1
7/23/18	Internal strategy emails	0.1
7/31/18	Email and discussion re Cline call about 0 getting new royalty on Sunoco well; email w/ DP re discovery vendor	0.1
8/3/18	Read transcript of depo; internal discussions re strategy and outstanding discovery	2
8/7/18	Read Sunoco's 2nd ROGs to Cline	0.5
8/13/18	Internal emails re depositions and documents	0.1
8/17/18	Analyze ██████████ data from Adam and Ley; internal emails re Sunoco's amended discovery responses	1
8/20/18	Work on new ROGs to 30(b)(6) notice; emails re same	0.5
8/22/18	Review depo summaries and annotations for Jones, Koelling and Holland by BC	2
8/27/18	Email from DM re depo notices and internal emails re strategy for response	0.1
8/30/18	Work on draft responses for ROGs; internal emails re depositions	0.5
8/31/18	Email from DM re depositions and DP and Internal emails re same	0.1
9/5/18	Internal emails re discovery responses and deposition assignments	1.5
9/6/18	Internal emails and strategy discussion re confidentiality designations and general strategy	0.5
9/9/18	Work on MTC draft and related emails	1
9/10/18	Emails to/from Sunoco re second depo of Jones and discovery issues; internal strategy emails; review PJ memo	1
9/11/18	Email from Sunoco re Redding and proposed order from Sunoco	0.1
9/12/18	Emails re 30(b)(6) depo topics	0.1
9/13/18	Email to/from DP	0.1
9/14/18	Read Warren rough transcript; email from DP re ██████████	1
9/18/18	Memo to BC re case projects and meeting re same	1
9/20/18	Review defendant objections to 30(b)(6) notice	0.1
9/21/18	Read defendants' motions/ ECF Filings	0.1
9/23/18	Read and approve letter re meet and confer and compromise offer re discovery emails re same	1

9/28/18	Review PJ response to DM proposal; discuss with DP; emails re same	0.5
10/1/18	Discuss and review call log dispute; Emails re same	1
10/3/18	Review Sunoco's response to MTC and exhibits; internal discussions re same and hearing preparation	2
10/4/18	Memo re spoliation and discuss w/ DP and BC; emails from JR re MTC response and hearing review and approve Ley invoices	1
10/8/18	Emails re [REDACTED]; internal discussion re [REDACTED] and call; review Sunoco's briefs and motion re confidentiality; memo for DP to JW re same	2
10/9/18	Read order re MTC; discuss same	0.2
10/15/18	Internal team strategy email re Koelling	0.1
10/17/18	Review PJ memo re meet and confer and discovery issues; internal discussion re discovery and Cline depo	0.3
10/21/18	Work on draft response re defendant's motion to preserve confidentiality; emails w/ RB, PJ and DP re same	2
10/22/18	Read docs considered for exhibits to response; email from PJ re same; Email from DM re scheduling	1
10/28/18	Email w/ team re discovery deadline extension strategy	0.1
10/30/18	Read defendant's responses to 4th and 5th ROGs and Amended disclosures; internal discussion re same	1
11/20/18	Email w/ PR and DP re additional discovery needed and Sunoco's response	0.1
11/13/18	Approve motion to modify	0.1
2018 TOTAL		69.63
1/21/19	Review draft Ley report and internal discussion re same	2
1/27-28/19	Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] emails (PR, PJ, RB) re Ley report and issues re date	1
2/4/19	Internal discussions re [REDACTED] for class certification issues; emails to/from DM and DP re Ley depo	1
2/5/19	Review letter form PR to PM re Ley report	0.2
2/6/19	Emails to/from counsel re depositions	0.1
2/12/19	Emails from BL	0.2
2/13/19	Read BL [REDACTED]; internal emails re depo preparation	0.5
3/9/19	Email to/from PR re continuance issues	0.1
3/16/19	Review BL depo transcript	1
3/30/19	Read Krause report and BC depo summary	2
4/8/19	Review Sunoco CLO docs and emails	1
4/22/19	Internal emails re motion for continuance	0.1

6/7-17/19	Work on Class Cert motion	5
7/20/19	New Gibney cases	1
7/30/19	Read DM request re response to cert motion and internal emails re same	0.1
7/31/19	Read Sunoco's motion - Emails re same	0.1
8/6/19	Read Judge Gibney pretrial scheduling order; internal emails	0.1
8/8/19	PR email memo re class cert research issues; memo from PR re outstanding discovery and motion to compel strategy	0.5
8/9-10/19	Review Sunoco's MTD - pick off attempt; research same; email w/ PR, DP and JW re same; internal [REDACTED] discussions	4
8/12/19	Internal memos re pick off motion response and discovery; review new discovery drafts	2
8/14/19	Emails from Sunoco re filings	0.1
8/18/19	Read Sunoco's class cert response and exhibit work on JW draft response to MTD	4
8/20/19	DP and PJ emails re Ley	0.1
8/21/19	Work on final comments from term on MTD response and email re same; 4th set of discovery to defendants; internal discussions re response	3
8/27-28/19	Class cert reply - work on drafts; internal emails and discussion re same; Ley response to motion to exclude drafts; internal discussions re [REDACTED]	5
9/3/19	Read defendant response brief	0.1
9/4/19	Work on DP letter re defendant discovery; internal emails	0.2
9/6/19	Read Sunoco's Reply brief; research same	0.5
9/9/19	Email from Sunoco re sur-reply; internal strategy emails re response; review email and memo from PJ & PR	1
9/11/19	Read and research Sunoco's reply re Ley; emails with PR, DP and BL	0.5
9/12/19	Memo and email from LW re sur-reply issues; read Sunoco's motion; discuss same internally; review draft response; review letter to DM re discovery deficiencies and email re same	2
9/13/19	Review Sunoco's new discovery responses; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; letter from Cole	1.5
9/16/19	Review Email from PH re call with Judge Gibney's clerk and requests for filing protocol	0.1
9/17/19	Read defendant's sur-reply	0.1

9/29/19	Review Sunoco's discovery response and updated spreadsheet; internal emails and discussions re Cline final discovery requests to Sunoco	0.5
10/2/19	Review Ley invoices and approve	0.1
10/3/19	Read order re class cert; MTO and Experts; discuss orders and strategy w/ DP; internal emails	1
10/4/19	Work on Motion to Compel	1
10/6/19	Emails and discussion re outstanding discovery issues	0.1
10/7/19	Strategy discussion re [REDACTED]; emails re discovery issues	0.5
10/8/19	Team meeting re trial prep and strategy; read DM Email; review drafts of notice and plan; discuss missing data for experts review discovery and prep for trial	3
10/9/19	Read and research motion to stay; discuss trial deadlines and prepare internal discussions re well data project	2
10/11/19	Work on respond to motion to stay; emails w/ DP and PR re response; internal communications w/ Ley and Adam and DP re well data; internal emails re mediation strategy; memo from PR re Krause; work on notice and notice plan	5
10/13/19	[REDACTED]	0.1
10/14/19	Internal discussions w/ DP and BC; EME strategy w/ DP; Emails w/ DP and DM re status report; read memo for PR re ETP and Sunoco structure and assets; emails re notice protocol and discussion re same; discuss mediation strategy w/ DP	4
10/15/19	Read Sunoco's reply and discuss same with team; work on draft motion re notice; DP and DM emails re payment database; internal emails w/ Ley and Adam re data and spreadsheet	0.5
10/16/19	Email to/ from DM re mediation	0.1
10/17/19	Read Sunoco's 23(f) motion and quick research same	0.5
10/18/19	Work on draft of MSJ re PRSA; internal discussions re MSJ; Amended disclosures	3
10/21/19	Memo/ email from Drew re missing data; internal email and discussion re [REDACTED]; email from DM re data; PJ memo re info needed for Ley and analysis	0.5
10/22/19	Review memo from PR re punitive and ETP net worth and email with MB re punitive questions for depositions; internal trial team discussion re [REDACTED] on escheat accounts; review DP email re [REDACTED]	1

10/23/19	Email from DM re mediation w/ Royal Ferguson; discuss mediation w/ Drew; Email PR and JR draft email to DM to PY re mediations and plaintiff's requested conditions; emails to/from PR re net worth and punitive research	1
10/24/19	Internal discussions and emails w/ trial team re [REDACTED]; internal team strategy re [REDACTED]; email from DM re EPT financials; term Stickley discussions re trial witnesses and Dr. Caldwell	3
10/25/19	Work on draft 23(f) response; internal discussion and research re outstanding [REDACTED] review Sunoco's revised class notice; email to DP re [REDACTED] mediation emails w/ DM and Judge RF; Include proposal term sheet draft and DP email re same	4
10/28/19	Review Sunoco's response re notice; work on our 23(f) response draft; email from JW re 23(f) response; Email from DP re notice and w/ next redlines; email from/ to DM re another notice to stay	2
10/29/19	Emails from DP and DM; internal discussion and email w/ DP re mediation brief; work on mediation statement; [REDACTED] internal strategy discussion re [REDACTED]; memo re motion in limine; review Sunoco's motion to strike; internal strategy discussions re [REDACTED]	6
10/30/19	Work on exhibit list and review exhibits; discuss JND notice w/ DP; read draft response to MTS from JW; read orders; email dix RF	2
10/31/19	Emails w/ Judge RF re mediation; work on revised notice w/ DP	0.2
11/1/19	Finalize mediation statement and emails with RL and DP re same; read Sunoco supplemental authority filing; email to DP re his disrespect for the judicial process and mediation and explaining that we would pop Sunoco trial; request for call w/ Judge RF [REDACTED]; review JW draft of response to Sunoco's supplemental notice; review Judge Gibney's order re notice; internal trial [REDACTED] discussions	4
11/2/19	Read Krause report and internal discussion re same; read Sunoco's response to MSJ research escheat issues raised by Krause memo to trial team re escheat issues and team strategy; discussion updated draft of mediation statement	3

11/3/19	Prepare Mediation; Review all Expert Drafts and Orders	4
11/4/19	Attend Mediation; Meet w/ Client; Prepare and Serve Subpoena on Koelling	6.5
11/15/19	Read and Review; Meet w/ DP; Talk to PR	4
11/16/19	Talk w/ DP; Motion to Clarify; Research Escheat Law; Review Cert Motion, Exhibits and Orders	4
11/17/19	Work on Motion to Clarify Brief	2
11/18/19	Work on Motion to Clarify Brief	6.5
11/23/19	Work on and Research Escheat, Read and Review Koelling Depos	4
11/24/19	Read all Defendant Depositions; Prepare for Hearing; Talk w/ DP twice	5
11/25/19	Talk w/ DP; Prepare for Hearing and make decision on demand; Talk to ██████ regarding Settlement	2
11/26/19	Talk to ██████ regarding Settlement; Talk w/ TD; Talk w/ DP three times; Talk w/ RF twice; Talk w/ SW; and Review Order	3
11/30/19	Trial Prep; Review all Expert Reports	5
12/2/19	Meet w/ Trail Team; Meet w/ DP; Talk w/ MB re Muskogee and Settlement Issues; Work on W/S and Trial; Help DP Prepare for Krause Depo	8
12/3/19	Meet w/ Team on Expert/ Trial Brief; Talk w/ WB, Pat and Drew	4.5
12/4/19	Prepare for Krause Depo; Prepare for O/S; Prepare for P/C; Talk w/ JR re Statute; Work on Trail Briefs	13
12/5/19	Prepare for Krause Depo; Travel to Depo; Attend Depo; Talk w/ RF; Talk to Yetter re Schedule; Work on Motion to Exclude Krause; Prepare for MSJ Hearing	12
12/6/19	Work on Expert/ Trial Briefs; Meet w/ DP to Prepare for Hearing; Hearing Call Conference w/ PR, DP, JR, PC; Work with MM on O/S; Meet w/ LB re Fraud; Email w/ B&L re Punitive; Work on Briefs; Final Review on Briefs; Need to Respond to Defendant Trial Briefs ██████	12
12/7/19	Talk w/ DP; Email to Team re Research Projects for Trial; Trial Prep	4
12/8/19	Work on Opening Statement	2.5
12/9/19	Team Meeting re Trial Prep and Research; Prep for Perry Depo; Talk w/ ██████ and Jason Ryan; Review Defendant's New Exhibit Spreadsheet from Pat and Jason	11
12/10/19	Work on Trial Exhibits; Work on Plaintiff's Direct; Work on Trial Exhibits	10
12/11/19	Meet w/ DP re Barbara; Call w/ RB; Work w/ DP on Trial; Plaintiff Direct; Teleconference w/ ██████; Work FOF/COL	14

12/12/19	Work on Opening Exhibits; Work on Escheat Issues; O/S, Prep	11
12/13/19	Work on O/S; Meet w/ Mike; Email to Yetter re Schedule; Talk w/ PR; Meet w/ DP re Damages; Prep for P/C; Work for Trial; Work on Trail; Teleconference w/ Jason Ryan, PC, O/S	12
12/15/19	Travel to Muskogee (2); let with team to handle exhibits and pretrial (7); meet with Perry trial prep (2); work with Median (1.5); work on o/s (2)	14.5
12/16/19	Trial	15
12/17/19	Trial	12
12/18/19	Trial	14
12/20/19	Trial; break down trial office; travel home	12
2019 Total		315.8
5/27/20	Review new order (.1); Discuss closing (.25); me x3 w/ trial team re closing (0/25)	0.6
6/9/20	(.1) Email from court re argument; 0.2 me x 2 w/ defense counsel re timing of fee motion and pros issues	0.3
6/10/20	(0.2) Email from/to Yetter; (1.0) discuss fee and judgment briefs w trial team	1.2
2020 Total		2.1
6/12/21	(0.2) Emails w/ defense counsel and court re logistics for argument	0.2
6/14/21	Review record and trial trans to prepare for closing	5
6/15/21	Travel Montana to Muskogee (5.0); (7.0) prepare for closing	12
6/16/21	(4.0) Prepare for conduct closing; (5.0) return travel	9
8/17/21	Review orders and judgment; t/c w Plt counsel and team; emails re same	2
11/1/21	Read & Review 10th Circuit Order; Call w/ Appellate Counsel; Call w/ Nathan Hall and Drew Pate; Draft and Read Emails with JJA and MB; Research	1.5
11/2/21	Draft and Review Multiple Emails with Appellate Counsel (7 total); Review prior agreements with Sunoco re Stay; T/C with Pat Ryan	2
11/3/21	Research applicable rules for enforcing judgment; T/C with Paul Yetter; Email to Paul Yetter	1.25
11/8/21	Meeting with DP, SW and JW re Appellate Issues and Judgment Enforcement; T/C with JR, PW, SW, JW, RB, PL re enforcing judgment and PRSA fee shifting research and case law; Research OK and Federal Law re Enforcing Judgment and PRSA Fee Shifting	3.5
11/9/21	Draft and Send Email to Paul Yetter re 408 Settlement Demand; Research same	0.5

11/11/21	Read and Review Sunoco's Pet for Rehearing En Banc; Draft and Review Emails w/ Appellate Counsel re Rehearing En Banc; Research Issues Raised in Rehearing Petition	2
11/18/21	[REDACTED]	1
11/28/21	Review Sunoco Draft Motions re Stay of Judgment and Bond Issues; Research OK and Federal Law re Enforcement of Judgment; Draft Memo re same	2.5
11/29/21	Review 10th Circuit Order; Email to Team; Research Enforcement Issues; Email to Co-Counsel re Enforcement Issues; Call w/ DP	2.05
11/30/21	Call w/ Paul Yetter re Settlement; Draft Memo to Team re Post Appeal Briefs; Meet w/ LB re sam; Call w. Russell Post and LB re Post Order Strategy, Scotus Procedure and Enforcement Options; Call w/ MB re EDOK Marshal Jurisdiction; Call w/ DP re Yetter and Russell calls and Follow Up Research Issues	4.3
12/1/21	Review Russell Emails w/ Defendant re Mandamus and Draft Response Email; Research Mandamus Issue; Draft Email to Litigation Team re Call w/ Russell and Yetter; Review [REDACTED] from Pat Ryan and Review Strategy Emails from DP	2.1
12/2/21	Meeting w/ Russell Post and JJA re appeal and strategy	1
12/2/21	(.25) t/c w/ RP about 10th circuit order and next steps; (.25) t/c w/ MB about execution strategy; (.5) draft memo to trial team about next steps; (1) research same	2
12/11/21	Draft motions re enforcement and assessment hearings; attorneys fees; research same; emails to/from co-counsel re same	5
12/13/21	Review final drafts of all motions and approve; email RY re meet/ confer; call w/ DP re filing; internal strategy email re [REDACTED]	2
12/14/21	Read 10th Circuit order; email to/from RP re fee order issues; call w/ DP	2
12/17/21	Read email and draft content not to sue from Yetter; email memo to co-counsel re our response to same	0.5
12/21/21	Read Order re Mandamus Response from Circuit; phone call w/ Russell Post re same and strategy for response; phone call w/ DP re same; email memo to co-counsel	1.5
12/24/21	Texts and emails w/ Yetter; Call w/ Yetter re extensions of time; call w/ DP re same; email to co-counsel re same; review email from RP re mandamus response	0.3

12/27/21	Read Sunoco's response to fee motion; research; email to/ from DP; draft email RP re same	1
12/28/21	T/c w/ DP and work with Barbara Ley	2
2021 Total		68.2
1/3/22	Review order re attorney fees; strategy email memo to R. Post re mandamus response; review R.P. memo; work on response; work on motion for asset hearing	7.5
1/4/22	Revise mandamus response and review R.P.'s draft; review Ley memo and data	3
1/5/22	Work on Mandamus response; work w/ paralegals and expert on same	8
1/6/22	Finalize response	2
1/10/22	Finalize reply I/S/O asset hearing	1
1/11/22	Review order	0.1
1/14/22	Read email from R.P. re defendants reply	0.1
1/18/22	Read defendant's reply re mandamus	0.5
1/25/22	Email and admin re expert invoices	0.1
1/31/22	Email w/ Russell Post	0.1
2/2/22	Read 10th Cir. Order denying mandamus; strategy meeting and work on draft notice to trial court	0.5
2/3/22	Emails to/ from Russell Post re next steps and asset hearing strategy; emails w/ Lit. team; review orders	1
2/4/22	Emails w/ Litigation team re upcoming briefs	0.5
2/9/22	Review Judge West's order re hearing on assets; strategize and prep for same; email from Yetter re (1) fee stipulation and (2) mlc re R/ 58/60; email to R.P. re same; email to Yetter and review defendants draft motion; strategy emails re [REDACTED]	7.5
2/10/22	Zoom meeting w/ Litigation Team re enforcement process; complete meet content and read defendant's motion; email to Yetter re LR 7.1; review asset data	3.5
2/11/22	Memo to team and research fee stipulation issues; email from R.P. re same; asset research; email to/ from Yetter; work on MTS	4.5
2/12/22	Work w/ team re stipulation; work on asset searches	1.5
2/13/22	Email w/ counsel re [REDACTED]	0.1
2/14/22	Team call re briefing assignments; work on filing judgment in state court	1
2/15/22	Prepare and send memo re next steps to team; emails from team re same	1.5
2/16/22	Email from SW re experts and admin	0.1
2/17/22	Strategy email w/ DP and RP re [REDACTED]; review defendant filings	0.5

2/19/22	Review and work on draft responses re MTS and defendants objections to R&R; strategy emails w/ R.P. re waiver emails w/ NH and DP re defendants new filing	0.5
2/20/22	Read and research issues re R&R objections from Paula and R.B.; strategy email to team	1
2/21/22	Revise JW's draft of MTS; review RB strategy email re [REDACTED]; memo to team re R. 69 and A.S. 842; emails to/ from team re same	4.5
2/22/22	Review MTS draft; review P.J.'s draft of motion for production of asset info; revise draft and emails to/ from team re same	3.5
2/23/22	Research cases granting R. 60 relief; work on response	2.75
2/24/22	Finalize MTS R. 58 motion to response; strategy email to/ from R. Post re same; email to Yetter re fees stipulation	5
2/25/22	Review defendant's draft fee stipulation; discuss same w/ R.P. and DP; m/c email from Yetter re response	2.5
2/26/22	Work on MTS R. 60 motion and response; emails to/ from JW re same	3
2/27/22	Work on MTS/ response	1
3/1/22	Work on fee brief and related issues w/ SW	2
3/2/22	Continue work on fee issues; internal emails re strategy; finalize MTS response; work on fee stipulation and email to Yetter; email to JW and NH re Ramby subpoena	2.5
3/3/22	Review order; finalize stipulation and get client approval; research and review cases from NH re compelling witness attendance at asset hearing	3.5
3/7/22	Read defendant's response; work on proposed order and email DP, SW re same; strategy emails w. [REDACTED] re public filings; read defendant's reply; finalize briefs and files; emails to/ from team	4.5
3/8/22	Prepare reply to defendant's response to MTS and work w/ team on same	5
3/10/22	Order from JAG re zoom; confer w/ Yetter to schedule	1
3/21/22	Review article from Pat	0.5
3/22/22	Schedule zoom w/ defendants; work w/ Mike Medina	0.5
3/29/22	Review Sunoco Scotus stay request and email w. RP and PR re same	0.2
3/30/22	Review 10th Cir. letter order	0.1
3/31/22	Review memos from JW re defendant's finality arguments; review PJ memo; emails w/ J.R.; meet w/ DP and prepare for hearing; conduct hearing; call w/ MB	4
4/1/22	Email to PL and RB re hearing	0.1
4/4/22	Admin re transcript filing	0.1

4/5/22	Email to Yetter re compliance w/ order to mediate; coordinate w/ DP re dates	0.2
4/6/22	Review orders denying defendant's motion and email w/ Yetter	0.1
4/7/22	Email from Yetter re schedule	0.1
4/8/22	Confirm mediation date for 5/13	0.1
4/12/22	Schedule mediation w/ court	0.1
4/14/22	Email from P. Ryan re mediation	0.1
4/22/22	Emails w/ DP and RP re mediation	0.1
4/27/22	Work on settlement conference statement	2.5
4/28/22	Emails w/ R.P. re cert. and Scotus strategy and [REDACTED]; research same; review defendant's Petition for Cert. and R.P.'s memo re same	3.5
4/29/22	Review defendant's two new appeals; email re strategy w/ R.P.; [REDACTED]; team emails re response and strategy research	2.5
5/2/22	Team meeting; finalize settlement conference memo; email to team re appellate briefs	2
5/3/22	Email w/ R.P.	0.1
5/8/22	Email to Yetter re settlement demand	0.1
5/9/22	Review settlement offer from Sunoco	0.1
5/10/22	Email to/from Burrage; email Autumn Dickenson	0.1
5/11/22	Email to/from Magistrate; email R. Post	0.1
5/13/22	Admin review itemized expenses; review appellate filings	0.75
5/16/22	Dinner w/ Jason & Pat; review admin filings; work on MOU per Judge Colombell order; Email w/ DP re same and Email from Yetter	5
5/17/22	Work on MOU; memo to Yetter; email to/ from Yetter; review R. Woods email to Dickerson; email to/ from R. Post re cert petition response; emails re same	3.5
5/18/22	Email to/ from Jason Ryan	0.1
5/24/22	Meet w/ DP re mediation; work on JND costs and admin	1
5/25/22	Prepare for and attend mediation; emails to team re same; review articles from Pat	4
5/27/22	Review Yetter's rejection of settlement	0.1
6/2/22	Draft email to Magistrate clerk; work on notice to count re stay expiration; internal emails	1
6/3/22	Finalize notice for filing	0.1
6/7/22	Review Scotus filing deadline ext.; Email R. Post	0.1
6/14/22	Review briefing order from JAG; discuss briefing assignments; email w/ SW and DP; email Russell Post	0.5
6/16/22	Review SW draft of response to order	0.2

6/20/22	Email to SW and DP re revisions to response; review defendants request re stay @ 10th Circuit; research same; email w/ R. Post	1
6/21/22	Email SW re response and finalize for filing	0.1
6/26/22	Review Defendant appeal and request for injunction; memo to Russell Post re same; research injunction cases	3
6/30/22	Read 10th Circuit order to brief jurisdictions; email from DP re strategy; review R.P.'s memo re order and strategy	1
7/1/22	Emails w/ RP and DP re defendants request for stay of execution	0.5
7/5/22	Review extension of time filing and order	0.1
7/8-9/22	Work on cert petition response and revise; memo to R. Post re notes and strategy; review email from R. Post research; review and revise jurisdictional response to 10th Cir. Order; email w/ DP re same	6
7/11/22	Memo to R. P. re stay of execution response; work on revisions to R.60 appeal; emails w/ DP, NH and RP re same	5
7/12/22	Work on appellate briefs; strategize and work on draft	3
7/13/22	Motion re referral to M.J.; finalize reply re settlement motion; email w/ J.W. re execution and seizure	0.5
7/14/22	Work on finalizing appellate briefs; emails w/ litigation team re asset seizure	2.5
7/15/22	Work on asset seizure research	0.5
7/17/22	Email w/ J.W. re filing judgment	0.1
7/18/22	Email w/ J.W. and DP re filing judgment and strategy	0.1
7/22/22	Email memo to RP re appellate and post judgment strategy	0.5
8/4/22	Review 10 Circuit orders; review RP email & research re new briefs; email to/ from DP	1
8/5/22	Email memo to Litigation Team re next steps strategy	0.5
8/8/22	Emails w/ Litigation Team re enforcement strategy	0.5
8/9/22	Review order re asset hearing; discuss w/ team	1
8/10/22	Read emails w/ team re corp assets and defendant changing name and structure	0.75
8/11/22	Email from DP re same	0.25
8/16/22	Review memo from JW re asset enforcement; review and approve response to defendant objections	0.25
8/18/22	Emails w/ R.Post re overtime from defendant counsel; research on agreements	0.5
8/19/22	Research re enforcement and asset hearing; strategy emails re same	2

8/22/22	Multiple emails w/ Yetter re objections; emails w/ RP re settlement and outreach from defendants' research memos from DP; emails w/ DP	2.25
8/23/22	Review email from Yetter; JW memo re same; research defendants efforts to post security; research and draft response to same; email to Yetter; call w/ Yetter; review defendant's filing; draft memo of our response brief	5.5
8/24/22	Review draft response; zoom w/ team; emails w/ Litigation Team; review defendant's low offer from Yetter; revise and edit response and approve for filing	4.5
8/25/22	Review defendant 10th Cir. request for stay; research asset seizure issues; begin drafting response; emails w/ Litigation Team re asset hearing; review 10th Cir. Order	2.5
8/27/22	Research execution issues; review Litigation team memos re same; read defendant's reply	1
8/28/22	Read defendant emergency @ scotus; emails and research	2.5
8/30/22	Discuss notice of defendant injunction notice filing w/ trial court w/ R.P.; memo to JW re same; review JW memo re asset transfer; discuss notice and Scotus issues w/ team	2.75
8/31/22	Review emergency memo from RP re Scotus notice; work on and revise response notice for trial court; work on misrepresentation memo for use in Scotus brief w/ DP; emails to Litigation Team; work on motion for Writ of Execution; research impact of objection on mag. order; email from Yetter re stay request; email from RP and letter from Erin Murphy; call w/ Yetter and DP; draft Notice of Non-Compliance	8
9/1/22	Review asset document production; work on misstatement claims; email w/ DP and RP re brief; respond to Law 360 issues; discuss strategy re stay motion w/ DP and RP	3
9/2/22	Email w/ NH re Notice; email w/ Yetter re Meet and Confer; finalize Notice of Non-Compliance	1.5
9/4/22	Work on BR draft of Scotus response; review DP edits and commute	1.25
9/5/22	Work on Scotus stay brief; multiple emails re same with DP and RP	5
9/6/22	Emails to/ from Litigation Team	0.25
9/7/22	Prepare for meeting re [REDACTED] strategy; conduct meeting; read defendant's reply to Scotus and response to notices	2.5
9/8/22	Research subpoena rules for asset hearing; meet w/ team; draft email to Yetter	1

9/9/22	Review defendant email from Yetter; review and discuss strategy re Scotus order denying stay; work on draft asset order; review new production; email w/ Litigation Team re hearing	2.5
9/10/22	Revise draft order w/ DP; help DP re hearing strategy	1.25
9/12/22	Review document production and BL analysis	0.5
9/13/22	Discuss hearing w/ DP; review defendant's new appeal; email w/ Litigation Team	1
9/14-15/22	Team re asset enforcement and seizure; emails w/ NH and RP re appeal; research and draft memo re R. 60 issues	3.5
9/16/22	Work w/ team on research and strategy re R. 60 responses	4.25
9/19/22	Email w/ Litigation re additional asset production; email RP; call w/ RP re appeal strategy; review defendant's response to our draft R&R; review new document production; discuss response brief w/ DP	3.5
9/20/22	Read asset hearing transcript; email w/ DP and RP; email w/ NH re response	0.75
9/21/22	Revise reply re R&R draft; email to NH and DP re same	2
9/22/22	Finalize and approve filing of Reply	1
9/23/22	Email w/ team re response	0.1
9/26/22	Review M/C email from Yetter; discuss w/ DP; review defendant's motion	0.25
9/27/22	Review order re sur-reply; email w/ DP re same;	0.25
10/3/22	Review Scotus cert. denial; discuss same w/ DP	0.1
10/5/22	Review defendant sur-reply; work on short response and email with team re same	1
10/6/22	Email from court re mediation; discuss strategy re same w/ team; response to request	0.5
10/7/22	Work on garnishment summons; email to Autumn Dickenson re mediation	1
10/10/22	T/C w/ counsel for Gunvor and w/ John Carlisle re summons; email w/ DP, NH and PF re same	0.5
10/11/22	Review NH email and research; respond to email from Autumn; email w/ Robert re m/c about motion to tender; t/c w/ Robert and DP re same; review draft motion; draft response; email w/ TAC re summons; work on edits to R. 60 response; read defendant's motion to tender and discuss w/ DP; call w/ NH	4.5

10/12/22	Work on strategy w/ DP and NH re motion to tender; draft memo re response to team; email w/ DP, NH and JU re response; review and revise draft; email with JNP re account; emails w/ DP re marathon garnishment; email w/ Autumn re zoom; revise R/ 60 brief and send to DP and RP; email with/ Litigation Team	5
10/13/22	Review defendant's reply re motion to pay; email w/ Litigation Team; meet w/ DP re mediation; conduct mediation; work on appeal response; work on Range's summons issues	4.25
10/14/22	Draft memo to JW and SW re issues about answering for garnishees; [REDACTED]; discuss same w/ team; email from RW w/ [REDACTED]	2
10/15/22	Email from RP re tender and appeal	0.1
10/16/22	Email to/ from JW re research on [REDACTED]	0.25
10/17/22	Email w/ JND re investment account; review garnishment summons answers; work on notice to court re judgment fund	0.5
10/19/22	Email from PJ re ETP check to Perry	0.1
10/20/22	Email from Autumn re settlement offer; discuss same w/ team and respond; m/c email from Robert Woods re hearing request and response	0.25
10/21/22	Email from Autumn re settlement and respond	0.1
10/24/22	Email from Autumn; draft response and discuss strategy re same w/ DP	0.5
10/25/22	Email and declaration from JND; finalize and approve filing of notice; prepare for hearing w/ DP; conduct hearing w/ Judge West; call w/ MB re strategy	2
10/26/22	Email from DP re Range's Summons response	0.1
10/28/22	Draft email to Autumn responding to 10/24 email	0.25
10/31/22	Review Phillip 66's garnishment affidavit	0.1
11/1/22	Email re DP garnishment; work w/ JND re defendant's request for account info; email w/ DP re Marathon; email w/ NH and memo re depositions and default re garnishees; review motion; email w/ DP re answers and responses by garnishees	1.5
11/2/22	Review/ revise draft motion for execution and email w/ DP and NH re same; email re depo notices to MB; review defendant's notice of tender of check w/ JND and discuss w/ DP	0.5
11/3/22	Email from JND re deposit	0.1

11/4/22	Email from BP; review R&R from Judge West and discuss strategy w/ DP	0.5
11/7/22	Review Marathon's filings; email w/ JND re investment options and defendant's reg. re affidavit; review DP's draft brief re new schedule	0.25
11/8/22	Draft email response to Gunvor's counsel and discuss w/ DP; review defendant's MTD garnishment	0.5
11/9/22	Review defendant's verified answers and discuss w/ DP and NH; discuss revisions of new schedule draft w/ D{	0.25
11/10/22	Prepare for and attend mediation w/ Judge Colomsel w/ DP	1
11/11/22	Email to/ from Yetter re garnishment	0.25
11/14/22	Discussion w/ [REDACTED]; email w/ JND from DP; meet w/ JJA re [REDACTED] call	1
11/15/22	Email w/ JND re investment funds options; Email w/ Robert Woods to m/c re defendant's motion to stay garnishment; work on response to MTD garnishment	1.5
11/16/22	Email w/ JND; Email w/ DP	0.1
11/18/22	Review JND declaration and finalize MTD response; review defendant's objection to R&R; review defendant's motion to enjoin	2.5
11/21/22	Review defendant's motions; discuss w/ Litigation Team	0.25
11/22/22	Work on motion to strike and responses to objection to R&R; email w/ Litigation Team	2
11/23/22	Revise response; revise transcript of hearing	1.5
11/27/22	Call w/ MB re Hearing; Prepare for Hearing	1
11/28/22	Work on draft responses to Motion to Enjoin and Objection	3
11/29/22	Prepare for Hearing; Meetings w/ DP; Call w DP & Tim McCann	5
11/30/22	Call w/ DP; Meet w/ DP; Call w/DP & Tim Mconn; Meet w/ NH & DP; Prepare email; Draft docs for stipulation; call with Tim Mconn; Read & respond to defendant's response re garnishment; call w/ MB	4
12/1/22	Prepare for Hearing; Hearing Meeting; Travel to and from	8
12/5/22	Read Order; Meet w/ DP; T/C w/ MB	1
12/6/22	Email defendant's re joint response; email w/ JND re account	0.1
12/7/22	Review email from T. McConn	0.1
12/8/22	Email w/ T. McConn; internal strategy discussion	0.2
12/13/22	Email w. T. McConn and DP; internal emails	0.1
12/15/22	Meeting re notice and motions; research case 1 AM	2
12/19/22	Work on Supplemental notice briefing; team emails re strategy	1

12/20/22	Review order	0.1
12/21/22	Approve filing of voluntary dismissal of garnishment proceeding	0.1
12/28/22	Review 10th Cir. Orders; emails and calls re response and strategy; memo to team re trial response; 2:00 meeting	6
2022 Total		284
1/3/23	Email w/ T. McConn re filing	0.1
1/5/23	Email and discussion w/ DP re defendant's request to file motion to clarify	0.2
1/6/23	T/c w/ DP x 2; read orders re hearing; work on notice; email to admin re notice	2
1/8/23	Work on notice; research notice issues	3
1/9/23	Finalize notice; meet w/ DP and NH	3.5
1/10/23	Work on class member declaration; meet w/ DP	2
1/23/23	Work on Briefs	2
1/24/23	Work on Briefs	4
1/25/23	Work on Briefs	2
1/26/23	Work on Briefs	4
1/27/23	Work on Briefs	1.5
1/28/23	Work on Briefs	4
1/29/23	Work on Briefs	2
1/30/23	Work on Briefs	8
1/31/23	Review and finalize filings for motions for fees, expenses and CCA	8
2023 Total	TOTAL	46.3
	TOTAL	811.68

Cline v. Sunoco
Jeff Angelovich Time

10/2/17 Draft/Review Pleadings; Scheduling Orders	0.75
10/9/17 Draft/Review Pleadings; Status Report; Disclosures	1.75
10/16/17 Discovery; Email Communication	1.75
10/23/17 Scheduling Orders; Discovery; Disclosures	1.5
11/6/17 Draft/Edit/Revise/Final; Motions; Protective Orders	0.5
11/20/17 Draft/Review Pleadings; Discovery	1.25
12/11/17 Email Communication	0.25
1/15/18 Discovery; Meet and Confer; Subpoena	1.5
TOTAL	9.25

Cline v. Sunoco
Susan Whatley Time

7/14/17	Receive/review email attaching initial filings in case	0.25
8/9/17	Receive/review email from defense counsel (MC) requesting extension of time	0.1
8/15/17	Receive/review email attaching notice of removal	0.25
8/21/17	Email correspondence with NC re filing EOA in case	0.5
8/25/17	Email correspondence re setting Rule 26(f) conference	0.25
8/28/17	Email correspondence re setting Rule 26(f) conference	0.25
9/7/17	Receive/review email attaching minute orders reassigning case to White and Payne	0.1
10/7/17	Draft/Review Pleadings; Notice of Pendency of Class Action	1.5
9/12/17	Email correspondence re discovery responses	0.1
9/15/17	Receive/review email attaching discovery request to defendants	0.1
9/27/17	Receive/review email attaching minute order re joint status report and setting scheduling conference	0.1
10/2/17	Email correspondence re proposed scheduling order	0.25
10/6/17	Email correspondence re proposed scheduling order	0.25
10/9/17	Email correspondence re redline version of joint status report from defense counsel	0.1
10/13/17	Receive/review email attaching filed joint status report; minutes of proceedings	0.25
10/16/17	Receive/review emails re defendants' responses to plaintiff's first set of discovery requests; minute sheet from status and scheduling conference	0.5
10/24/17	Receive/review email attaching court filings (notice of proposed schedule & defendants' notice)	0.1
10/25/17	Receive/review email attaching court filing (scheduling order)	0.1
10/27/17	Receive/review emails attaching parties' initial disclosures	0.25
11/7/17	Receive/review email attaching court filing (joint motion for protective order)	0.1

11/8/17	Receive/review email attaching court filing (order granting agreed protective order)	0.1
11/22/17	Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM) attaching discovery requests to plaintiff	0.5
1/17/18	Receive/review email attaching letter from DP to defendants	0.25
1/19/18	Receive/review email exchange re deposition scheduling	0.1
2/14/18	Receive/review email exchange attaching notice of deposition	0.1
4/4/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM) attaching letter response to Jason Ryan	0.25
4/9/18	Receive/review email exchange between counsel re scheduling conference call	0.1
4/25/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel to DP re 30(b)(6) deposition	0.25
4/26/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM) to Paula re e-discovery proposal	0.25
4/27/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM) to Pat re RFPS	0.25
4/30/18	Receive/review email from Robert Barnes re defenses in 570.10 interest cases and multiple follow-up emails re same	0.5
5/2/18	Receive/review email from Pat Ryan to defense counsel re discovery	0.1
5/3/18	Receive/review email from Paula J. re E-discovery	0.25
5/7/18	Receive/review emails from defense counsel re document production	0.25
5/9/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM) to PJ re E-discovery	0.25
5/11/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM) to Paula re email search terms	0.25
5/16/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM) to Pat and Drew re various discovery issues	0.1
5/22/18	Receive/review emails from defense counsel (DM) re document production	0.1
5/23/18	Receive/review email exchange between counsel re ESI	0.25
5/25/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM) re ESI	0.1
5/29/18	Receive/review email from Paula J. re E-discovery	0.1

5/30/18	Receive/review email exchange between counsel re ESI and conference call re same	0.5
6/1/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel re document production	0.25
6/5/18	Receive/review email attaching court filing (plaintiff's motion to amend scheduling order)	0.1
6/6/18	Receive/review email exchange between counsel re document production	0.1
6/7/18	Receive/review email exchange between DM and PJ re document custodians	0.1
6/11/18	Receive/review multiple emails between counsel re document production	0.25
6/18/18	Receive/review email attaching court filing (Defendants' opposition to plaintiff's motion to extend scheduling order)	0.1
6/21/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel (RC) attaching privilege log	0.25
6/25/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel (RC) attaching D's amended answer to Rog 4	0.1
6/27/18	Receive/review emails attaching court filings and follow-up emails re same	0.25
6/28/18	Receive/review emails attaching court filings and follow-up emails re same	0.25
6/29/18	Receive/review emails attaching court filings and follow-up emails re same	0.1
7/2/18	Receive/review email from DM attaching second set of discovery to plaintiff	0.25
7/5/18	Receive/review email attaching court filings	0.1
7/6/18	Receive/review email attaching court filing	0.1
7/9/18	Receive/review emails from DM attaching amended privilege log and document production	0.25
7/11/18	Receive review email attaching court filings	0.1
7/12/18	Receive/review email attaching court filing	0.1
7/13/18	Receive/review email attaching court filing	0.1
7/16/18	Receive/review email attaching court filing	0.1
7/26/18	Receive/review multiple emails re plaintiff's first amended notice of 30(b)(6) deposition; D's document production	0.25
8/1/18	Receive/review email from DM attaching document production	0.1
8/3/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel (RC) attaching amended discovery responses	0.25

8/6/18	Email attaching D's second set of rogs to P	0.25
	Email attaching P's responses/objections to second	
9/5/18	set of rogs	0.1
	Receive/review email re deposition transcript	
9/6/18	corrections and confidentiality designation	0.1
	Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM)	
9/10/18	re document production	0.1
	Receive/review email attaching court filings re	
9/11/18	Plaintiff's motion to compel	0.25
	Receive/review emails attaching court filings re	
9/12/18	sealed exhibits	0.1
	Receive/review emails attaching court filings re	
9/13/18	sealed exhibits	0.1
	Receive/review email from defense counsel	
9/19/18	attaching D's objections to 30(b)(6) Depo. Notice	0.1
	Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM)	
9/20/18	attaching Sunoco's answers to third set of rogs	0.1
	Receive/review email attaching letter from DP to	
9/24/18	defendants	0.1
	Receive/review email attaching court filings re	
	minute order granting motion to file brief in excess	
	of page limitations; D's opposition to P's motion to	
10/1/18	compel	0.25
	Receive and forward expert invoice to accounting;	
	receive/review email attaching court filing (D's	
	motion for judicial approval of confidential	
10/8/18	designations of 30(b)(6) depo excerpts)	0.5
	Receive/review email attaching court filings	
	(minute sheet re motion to compel and order re	
10/10/18	motion to compel)	0.25
	Receive/review email attaching court filing (minute	
	order referring motion for approval of confidential	
10/11/18	designations to magistrate judge shreder)	0.1
	Receive/review email from defense counsel with	
10/12/18	new document production	0.1
	Receive/review email attaching court filings (P's	
	response to D's motion for judicial approval of	
10/22/18	confidential designation of 30(b)(6) depo excerpts	0.1
	Receive/review email attaching court filing (minute	
	order granting motion for approval of confidential	
10/24/18	designations)	0.1

10/26/18	Receive/review emails from defense counsel attaching errata sheets and confidentiality designations; D's objections to P's amended notice of second 30(b)(6) deposition	0.1
10/29/18	Team meeting discussing case development, discovery, class cert; receive/review email from defense counsel attaching D's responses to 4th/5th set of rogs and 3rd set of RFPs	0.5
10/30/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel attaching D's amended disclosures	0.1
10/31/18	Receive/review email attaching court filing (P's motion to extend scheduling order)	0.1
11/2/18	Receive/review emails from defense counsel (DM) attaching depo errata sheets/sig pages	0.1
11/6/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel attaching letter re D's October 2018 accounting data	0.1
12/14/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel attaching depo errata sheet, sig page, and confidentiality designations	0.1
12/17/18	Receive/review email from defense counsel attaching depo errata sheet, sig page, and confidentiality designations	0.1
1/9/19	Receive and forward expert invoice to accounting	0.1
1/14/19	Receive/review email attaching court filing re P's motion to modify 2d amended scheduling order	0.1
1/28/19	Receive/review email from Paula J. attaching expert report of Barbara Ley	0.25
2/13/19	Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM) attaching depo notice for B. Ley	0.1
3/3/19	Receive and forward litigation support invoice to accounting (Matlin)	0.1
3/15/19	Receive and forward expert invoice to accounting	0.1
3/20/19	Receive and forward court reporter invoice to accounting	0.1
3/25/19	Receive and forward court reporter invoice to accounting	0.1
3/28/19	Receive/review emails from Robert Barnes/Pat Ryan re B. Ley deposition	0.1
3/29/19	Receive/review email from defense counsel attaching D expert report of Eric Krause	0.25
4/9/19	Receive and forward expert invoice to accounting	0.1

4/17/19	Receive/review email from defense counsel attaching depo confidentiality designations for B. Ley	0.1
4/20/19	Receive/review email from Pat Ryan re depo summaries, case strategy	0.1
4/22/19	Receive/review emails from DP and Pat Ryan re case strategy	0.1
4/25/19	Receive and forward court reporter invoice to accounting	0.1
4/26/19	Receive/review email attaching court filing (P's Motion for extension of time)	0.1
5/2/19	Receive/review email attaching court filing (Minute order directing expedited response to P's Motion for Extension)	0.1
5/6/19	Receive/review emails attaching court filings (D's response to P's Motion for Extension; amended response; and 4th amended scheduling order)	0.25
5/8/19	Receive/review email from Robert Barnes re case strategy	0.1
5/15/19	Receive and forward expert invoice to accounting	0.1
5/17/19	Receive/review email from defense counsel attaching depo confidentiality designations for E. Krause	0.1
5/24/19	Receive/review/reply to email from DP re class cert briefing	0.1
5/25/19	Draft/send email to Paula J. re class cert briefing	0.1
5/31/19	Email exchanges with Paula J. re class cert briefing	0.25
6/11/19	Email exchange with Paula J. re class cert briefing	0.1
6/13/19	Receive/review email from Paula J. attaching class cert brief draft; review draft, edit, send back	1.5
6/17/19	Receive/review email attaching court filing (P's motion to certify class)	0.1
6/21/19	Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM) attaching amended answers to certain rogs	0.25
6/25/19	Receive/review email exchange re amended discovery responses/searching in emails for same	0.25
7/8/19	Receive and forward expert invoice to accounting	0.1
7/18/19	Receive/review email attaching court filing (Minute order reassigning case to Judge Gibney)	0.1
7/21/19	Receive and forward litigation support invoice to accounting (Matlin)	0.1

Receive/review email from Court's chambers re conference call to discuss class cert motion;	
7/29/19 multiple follow-up emails re same	0.25
Receive/review email exchanges re D's request to file 75 page opp to class cert	
7/30/19	0.25
Receive/review email attaching court filings (Minute order setting telephonic status conference; D's Motion for leave to file brief in excess of page limits)	
7/31/19	0.1
Receive/review email attaching court filing (Pretrial Order by Judge Gibney)	
8/6/19	0.25
Receive/review email attaching court filing (D's MTD for lack of subject matter jurisdiction)	
8/8/19	0.1
8/10/19 Receive/review email exchange re D's MTD	0.1
Receive/review emails re D's motion for leave to file exhibits under seal	
8/14/19	0.1
Receive/review email attaching court filings (D's Response to P's Motion to Certify Class; Appendix of Exhibits; D's Motion to Exclude Reports/Opinions of B. Ley	
8/15/19	0.25
Receive/review email attaching court filing (Order Directing Ds to file response w/in 14 days as to why exhibits should be filed under seal)	
8/19/19	0.1
Receive/review email attaching court filing (P's Response to D's MTD)	
8/22/19	0.25
Receive/review email attaching court filing (P's Notice to Court de-designating exhibits)	
8/26/19	0.1
Receive/review email attaching court filing (P's Conditionally unopposed motion for leave to file oversized reply brief)	
8/27/19	0.1
Receive/review email attaching court filing (Order Granting P's Motion for Leave to File Oversized Reply Brief)	
8/28/19	0.1
Receive/review email attaching court filings (P's Opposition to D's Motion to Exclude Ley; P's Reply ISO Motion to Certify Class)	
8/29/19	0.25
Receive/review email attaching court filings (D's Response Re Sealing Exhibits; Notice to Court by P)	
9/3/19	0.1
Receive/review email attaching letter from DP to defendants	
9/4/19	0.1
Receive/review email attaching court filing (D's Reply ISO MTD)	
9/5/19	0.25

9/9/19	Receive/review email exchanges re MTD/case strategy	0.25
9/11/19	Receive/review emails attaching court filings (D's Reply ISO Motion to Exclude B. Ley; D's Motion for leave to file Sur-reply re Class Cert	0.5
9/12/19	Receive/review email exchanges re D's sur-reply to Class Cert; receive/review email attaching court filing (P's Response to D's Motion for Leave to File Sur-reply)	0.25
9/13/19	Receive/review email from defense counsel attaching letter	0.1
9/17/19	Receive/review email attaching court filing (D's Reply ISO Motion for Leave to File Sur-Reply); receive/review emails from defense counsel re same	0.1
9/25/19	Receive/review emails re additional discovery requests	0.25
9/26/19	Receive/review emails re additional discovery requests	0.1
9/27/19	Receive/review emails re additional discovery requests	0.1
10/2/19	Receive and forward expert invoice to accounting	0.1
10/3/19	Email exchange with NC re EOA; receive/review email attaching court filings (Order on D's MTD; Order on Motion to Exclude B. Ley; Order granting Class cert)	0.5
10/4/19	Email exchange re Orders of 10/3/19	0.25
10/7/19	Receive/review email attaching court filing (Minute Order setting telephone conference); email exchange with DP, BC re class notice); draft proposed class notice	1.5
10/8/19	Email exchanges re draft class notice; continue work on same; receive/review email attaching court filing (D's Motion to Stay Case Pending Rule 23(f) Appeal	2
10/9/19	Receive/review multiple email exchanges re case strategy	0.25
10/10/19	Receive/review emails attaching court filings (SW EOA; Orders from Court directing briefing re class notice)	0.25
10/11/19	Receive/review emails attaching court filings (P's Response to D's Motion to Stay Case; P's Motion to Approve Form and Manner of Notice)	0.25

	Receive/review emails re case strategy; receive/review email attaching court filings (Status Report Regarding Class Notice; D's Reply ISO	
10/14/19	Motion to Stay Case re Rule 23(f))	0.5
	Receive/review email from DP attaching draft class notice data brief; receive/review email attaching	
10/15/19	court filing (Parties' briefs re Class Notice Data)	1.25
	Receive/review email attaching D's Rule 23(f)	
10/17/19	Petition	0.5
	Receive/review email attaching DP letter to Judge Gibney re courtesy copy of P's MPSJ; receive/review	
10/21/19	email from defense counsel (DM) re FTP site	0.25
10/23/19	Email exchange re case strategy (PR, MB)	0.25
	Receive/review email attaching court filing (D's Response to P's Motion to Approve Form and Manner of Class Notice); receive/review email from	
10/25/19	Paula J attaching Expert Report of B. Ley	0.75
	Receive/review email attaching court filings (Answer to Rule 23(f) Petition; Status Report and Motion for Status Conference; D's Motion to Strike P's MPSJ); receive/review emails from Court and	
10/29/19	counsel re scheduling conference call	0.5
	Receive/review emails re scheudling of status conference; receive/review emails attaching court filings (Order re Motion to Stay Case; Order Denying D's Motion to Strike P's MPSJ); email exchange re	
10/30/19	same	0.5
	Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM) attaching document production; receive/review emails attaching court filings (Order re telephone conference re P's Motion to Approve Form and	
10/31/19	Manner of Class Notice)	0.25
	Receive/review email from DP to Court attaching revised notice documents; receive/review email attaching court filings (D's Supplemental Authority; Order Granting Motion to Approve Form and Manner of Notice; D's Response to P's MPSJ); receive/review emails from defense counsel (DM) attaching expert reports of Eric Krause and Kraettli	
11/1/19	Epperson	1.25

Receive and forward litigation support invoice to accounting (Matlin); receive/review emails with	
11/6/19 court filings	0.25
11/7/19 Receive/review emails with court filings	0.1
11/12/19 Receive/review emails with court filings	0.1
Receive/review email attaching court filing (Order	
11/14/19 Denying 23(f) Petition)	0.1
11/15/19 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1
Receive/review email from defense counsel (DM) attaching depo designations; receive/review emails	
11/16/19 attaching court filings (witness list, exhibit list, etc.)	0.25
Receive/review email exchange re case strategy	
11/17/19 from RB, BB, research past cases for brief help	1.25
Receive/review emails attaching court filings;	
11/18/19 receive and forward email attaching expert invoice	0.1
11/19/19 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1
Receive/review emails attaching court filings;	
11/20/19 emails re expert invoices	0.1
11/21/19 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1
Receive/review emails attaching court filings;	
11/22/19 emails re case strategy	0.1
Receive/review emails attaching court filings;	
11/25/19 receive email from RL re research assistance	0.25
Email exchange re expert invoices; research assistance to RL and email re same; receive/review	
11/26/19 emails attaching court filings	0.5
Receive/review emails attaching court filings; email exchange between counsel re MPSJ issues; email from defense counsel attaching supp report of E.	
12/2/19 Krause	0.1
12/3/19 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1
Receive/review emails attaching court filings;	
12/4/19 receive/review email from RB re case strategy	0.1
12/5/19 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1
12/6/19 Receive and forward expert invoice to accounting	0.1
12/9/19 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1
12/10/19 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1
12/11/19 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1
12/12/19 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1
12/13/19 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1
12/16/19 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1

Receive/review emails attaching court filings; email from TD requesting research assistance; process	
12/17/19 invoices	0.5
12/19/19 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1
12/23/19 Receive, forward, process multiple trial invoices	0.5
12/30/19 Receive and forward expert invoice to accounting	0.1
Receive/review email attaching court filing; emails	
1/2/20 re case invoices	0.1
1/14/20 Receive/review email attaching court filing	0.1
1/15/20 Receive/review email attaching court filing	0.1
1/24/20 Receive/review email attaching court filing	0.1
1/27/20 Receive/review email attaching court filing	0.1
1/28/20 Receive and forward expert invoice to accounting	0.1
2/19/20 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1
2/23/20 Email exchange re post-trial filings	0.25
3/2/20 Receive/review email attaching court filings	0.1
3/10/20 Receive/review email attaching court filing	0.1
3/11/20 Receive/review email attaching court filing	0.1
3/12/20 Receive/review multiple emails re post trial issues	0.1
4/14/20 Emails exchanges re post-trial issues	0.25
5/5/20 Receive/review emails attaching court filings	0.1
5/14/20 Receive/review email attaching court filing	0.1
Emails re closing arguments/post-trial	
6/11/20 issues/research	1
6/24/20 Emails with NH re research for post-trial issues	0.25
6/30/20 Call with expert re post-judgment procedure	0.5
Draft/Review Pleadings; Joint Motion to Suspend	
8/21/20 Deadlines for the Filing of Costs and Fees	2
Review and edit draft Declaration of Barbara Ley	
8/24/20 ISO Post-Judgment Notice of Damages	0.5
Draft/Review Pleadings; Notice Regarding Total	
8/24/20 updated damages pursuant to court order	2.25
Draft/Review Pleadings; Proposed Plan for	
8/31/20 Distribution	3.5
11/16/21 Draft motion for costs and fees	2.5
11/21/21 Call with expert re post-judgment procedure	1
Draft motion to approve form and manner of notice	
11/23/21 and briefing schedule	3
11/24/21 Edit/revise/receive edits to fee motions	1.5
11/30/21 Edit/revise/receive edits to fee motions	2
2/7/22 Edit/review fee motions	2.25

2/8/22	Edit/review fee motions	1.5
2/15/22	Edit/review fee motions	3
2/16/22	Edit/review fee motions	2.5
2/17/22	Edit/review fee motions	1.25
2/22/22	Draft supporting document for fee motions	3
2/23/22	Draft supporting document for fee motions	2.75
2/24/22	Draft supporting document for fee motions	4
2/25/22	Revise motions	2
2/26/22	Draft supporting document for fee motions	1.75
2/28/22	Revise motions and supporting docs	3.5
3/4/22	Draft/review Motion for Statutory Costs and Fees	2
	Research fee issues and edit/revise Motion for Stat.	
3/7/22	Fees	1.5
1/9/23	Draft supporting document for fee motion	1
1/10/23	Work on supporting documents for fee motion	0.75
1/11/23	Work on supporting documents for fee motion	0.5
1/12/23	Work on supporting documents for fee motion	0.5
1/17/23	Work on supporting documents for fee motion	1.25
1/18/23	Work on supporting documents for fee motion	1
1/19/23	Work on supporting documents for fee motion	2
1/23/23	Work on supporting documents for fee motion	2.25
1/24/23	Work on supporting documents for fee motion	5
1/25/23	Work on supporting documents for fee motion	6
1/26/23	Work on supporting documents for fee motion	6.5
	Work on supporting documents for fee motion;	
1/27/23	team call re same	7.5
1/28/23	Work on supporting documents for fee motion	2
1/29/23	Work on supporting documents for fee motion	4
		137.5

Lisa Baldwin
Cline v. Sunoco Time

Date	Description	Hours
2/17/17	Emails re petition	0.2
2/8/17	Emails re petition	0.1
2/9/17	Email re motion for extension of time	0.1
2/9/17	Team call re Sunoco	0.5
2/9/17	Email re Sunoco petition	0.1
3/7/17	Emails re Sunoco agreement	0.1
3/7/17	Reviewed agreement re Sunoco	2
7/14/17	Email re Sunoco initial filings	0.1
8/2/17	Email re extension request	0.1
8/8/17	Email re filing in Sunoco	0.1
8/9/17	Email re motion for extension of time to answer and reviewed motion	0.1
8/11/17	Reviewed scheduling order and drafted/reviewed emails re same	0.2
8/14/17	Email re Sunoco filing	0.1
8/17/17	Reviewed order setting scheduling conference and notice of removal and related filings	0.2
8/21/17	Reviewed answer to Petition	1.5
8/25/17	Emails regarding 26(f) conference	0.1
8/25/17	Reviewed draft scheduling order	0.5
8/27/17	Email regarding correspondence	0.1
8/30/17	Discuss case strategy with team	0.5
9/12/17	Emails regarding discovery requests	0.1
10/2/17	Discuss case strategy with team	0.5
10/6/17	Emails regarding joint status report	0.2
10/9/17	Discussion with team re joint statut report and case strategy	0.5
10/9/17	Emails and edits to joint status report	0.4
10/11/17	Emails re joint status report and proposed schedule	0.1
10/17/17	Emails re notice of proposed schedule	0.1
10/19/17	Reviewed discovery responses	1
10/25/17	Reviewed/drafted emails re scheduling order and reviewed scheduling order	0.2
10/25/17	Reviewed/responded to emails re well research project	0.1
10/27/17	Reviewed defendants iniital disclosures	0.3
12/12/17	Reviewed correspondence	0.1
12/21/17	Reviewed/responded to email re interim class counsel motion	0.1
1/2/18	Email re class defintion	0.1
1/19/18	Email re depositions	0.1
1/22/18	Emails re depositions	0.1
1/26/18	Reviewed correspondence	0.5
2/7/18	Email re depositions	0.1
2/9/18	Emails re depositions	0.1
2/15/18	Email re depositions	0.1
2/26/18	Discuss case strategy with team	0.5
4/4/18	Reviewed correspondence	0.3
4/5/18	Emails re calls re Sunoco matter	0.1
4/9/18	Emails re calls re Sunoco matter	0.1
4/25/18	Reviewed correspondence	0.5
4/26/18	Email re e-discovery	0.2
4/27/18	Reviewed correspondence	0.5
4/30/18	Emails re case defenses	1.5
5/2/18	Email re Rule 37 conference	0.1
5/3/18	Email re e-discovery	0.3
5/7/18	Emails re document production	0.1
5/9/18	Email re e-discovery	0.3
5/11/18	Email re e-discovery	0.2
5/11/18	Email re Cline deposition	0.1
5/16/18	Emails re Cline deposition and various discovery issues	0.5

5/17/18	Email re Cline deposition	0.1
5/22/18	Email re Sunoco document production	0.1
5/23/18	Emails re e-discovery	0.2
5/25/18	Email re e-discovery	0.1
5/29/18	Email re e-discovery	0.1
5/30/18	Emails re e-discovery	0.1
6/1/18	Email re document production	0.1
6/6/18	Emails re e-discovery	0.1
6/7/18	Email re discovery issues and e-discovery	0.1
6/8/18	Email re discovery issues and e-discovery	0.1
1/14/19	Reviewed Third Amended Scheduling order	0.1
6/21/19	Reviewed Sunoco's amended rog answers and emails re same	0.5
7/29/19	Emails re conference call with parties	0.1
7/29/19	Emails re page limits for Sunoco response brief	0.1
7/30/19	Emails re conference call with parties	0.1
7/31/19	Reviewed emails re scheduling conference call with parties	0.1
8/6/19	Reviewed pretrial order	0.2
8/14/19	Emails re electronic copies of sealed documents	0.1
8/14/19	Reviewed Sunoco's Motion to Exclude Barbara Ley	0.75
8/14/19	Reviewed Sunoco's response to Motion for Class Certification	1.5
8/19/19	Reviewed court order re sealed exhibits	0.1
8/30/19	Reviewed response by Sunoco re sealing exhibits	0.5
10/3/19	Reviewed opinion on motion to exclude expert Barbara Ley	0.4
10/3/19	Reviewed opinion on motion to dismiss	0.5
10/3/19	Reviewed draft Motion to Compel	0.2
10/3/19	Reviewed opinion on class certification and order re same	0.75
10/4/19	Emails re conference call on notice	0.1
10/4/19	Email re motion to compel	0.1
10/6/19	Emails re draft motion to compel	0.1
10/7/19	Emails re conference with court re notice	0.1
10/8/19	Emails re proposed class notice & proposed notice	0.5
10/8/19	Reviewed Sunoco Motion to Stay pending appeal	0.6
10/9/19	Reviewed/edited/drafted document for trial prep and drafted email re same	0.75
10/9/19	Emails re class notice	0.2
10/9/19	Email re conference call	0.1
10/9/19	Reviewed current deadlines	0.1
10/9/19	Reviewed/drafted emails re well info	0.2
10/10/19	Reviewed response to motion to stay	0.3
10/10/19	Reviewed court orders	0.1
10/10/19	Email re response to motion to stay	0.1
10/11/19	Emails re response to motion to stay	0.1
10/15/19	Reviewed Sunoco's Brief Re CM Data	0.2
10/15/19	Reviewed Sunoco's Reply in Support of Motion to Stay Case	0.3
10/17/19	Reviewed Sunoco's Rule 23(f) petition	1
10/17/19	Reviewed draft MSJ re PRSA and emails re same	0.5
10/18/19	Email re disclosures	0.1
10/18/19	Reviewed/edited MSJ re PRSA and emails re same	1
10/21/19	Emails re accounting data	0.1
10/28/19	Review information for upcoming work with consultant - trial prep	2
10/28/19	Reviewed Sunoco's response to motion to approve form/manner of notice	0.3
10/29/19	Emails re work with consultant & trial prep	0.1
10/29/19	Reviewed Sunoco's Motion to Strike Plfs' PMSJ	0.2
10/29/19	Emails re unclaimed property	0.1
10/29/19	Team meeting re Sunoco trial prep	0.5
10/30/19	Emails re conference call & minute order	0.1
10/30/19	Reviewed opinion denying Sunoco's motion to stay	0.1
10/30/19	Reviewed opinion denying Sunoco's motion to strike	0.1

10/31/19	Reviewed Sunoco's motion for stay pending appeal	0.75
10/31/19	Email re document production	0.1
10/31/19	Reviewed order re motion to approve form/manner of notice	0.1
10/31/19	Reviewed 10th Cir. order re response deadline	0.1
11/1/19	Review/edit draft trial prep materials for work with consultants and emails re same	1.1
11/1/19	Email re notice and exclusion form	0.1
11/1/19	Reviewed Sunoco supplemental authority	0.1
11/1/19	Emails re expert reports	0.1
11/2/19	Reviewed/drafted emails re trial prep documents	0.1
11/4/19	Emails re mailing class notice and case strategy	0.1
11/4/19	Reviewed Sunoco motion for leave to file reoly in support of class cert appeal	0.1
11/6/19	Email re work with consultant - trial prep	0.1
11/6/19	Reviewed reply of Sunoco re motion for stay pending appeal	0.3
11/7/19	Reviewed reply of Sunoco re Petition to appeal class cert order	0.1
11/7/19	Reviewed order re class website	0.1
11/11/19	Emails re team meeting re Sunoco and review agenda re same	0.2
11/12/19	Team trial prep with consultant and work on trial graphics	9
11/12/19	Reviewed order re agreed motion to modify pretrial order	0.1
11/13/19	Review order denying Sunoco's request to appeal class cert order and emails re same	0.1
11/13/19	Team trial prep with consultant and work on trial graphics	9
11/14/19	Team trial prep with consultant and work on trial graphics	9
11/15/19	Email re affidavit	0.1
11/16/19	Emails re Sunoco depo designations & exhibit lists	0.1
11/17/19	Emails re Sunoco's motion to amend class cert definition	0.2
11/17/19	Reviewed Sunoco's motion to amend class cert definition	1
11/18/19	Email re escheat payments	0.1
11/18/19	Reviewed order re response to motion to clarify class definition	0.1
11/18/19	Call with expert re affidavit; work with expert re affidavit	3
11/18/19	Drafting re response to Sunoco's motion to amend class definition	3
11/18/19	Email re response to Sunoco's motion to amend class definition	0.1
11/19/19	Call with expert re response to Sunoco motion to clarify class definition	0.3
11/19/19	Draft/edit brief re response to motion to clarify class definition	4.5
11/19/19	Work with team re punitive damages	2
11/22/19	Email re discovery requests	0.1
11/25/19	Reviewed Sunoco reply in support of motion to clarify class cert definition	0.5
11/26/19	Reviewed memorandum order	0.2
12/2/19	Draft/edit brief re Response to Sunoco's Motion for Leave to file sur-reply	1.5
12/2/19	Emails re Plaintiffs' PMSJ	0.1
12/2/19	Reviewed supplemental expert report of Krause	2
12/2/19	Team meeting with case, strategy and trial prep	4
12/3/19	Reviewed order re motion to relocate trial	0.1
12/3/19	Draft/review/revise trial briefs and research related thereto	5
12/3/19	Work with team on prep for hearing on Plfs' Partial MSJ	2
12/4/19	Reviewed Sunoco's reply in support of motion to file sur-reply	0.1
12/4/19	Emails re case strategy; trial prep with team	2
12/5/19	Emails re Krause supplemental report and supplemental documents	0.2
12/5/19	Emails to team re trial strategy	0.2
12/5/19	Drafted/Reviewed/Edited pre-trial briefs	3
12/6/19	Emails re draft of pre-trial brief	0.2
12/6/19	Call re pre-trial brief	0.2
12/6/19	Review/revise/edit draft pre-trial briefs; partial MSJ hearing	6
12/6/19	Reviewed draft response to Sunoco's supp post-trial brief	0.75
12/6/19	Reviewed order re briefing on Plfs' motion to strike Sunoco's expert	0.1
12/9/19	Email re unclaimed property	0.1
12/9/19	Email re exhibit list	0.1
	Team strategy sessions re trial prep; work on various projects with team re trial prep;	
12/9/19	Review response to motion to strike expert Krause	8

12/10/19	Reviewed court's order on plaintiffs' partial MSJ	0.5
12/10/19	Trial prep with team	5
12/10/19	Work with team on reply in support of motion to strike	1.5
12/11/19	Email re modifications to PRSA	0.1
12/12/19	Emails re Sunoco findings of fact	0.2
12/12/19	Emails re unclaimed property	0.2
12/12/19	Emails re trial exhibits	0.1
2/11/20	Reviewed post-trial briefing and emails re same	1.5
2/14/20	Emails re post-trial briefing	0.2
2/15/20	Emails re post-trial briefing	0.2
2/17/20	Emails re post-trial briefing	0.2
2/13/20	Reviewed Sunoco's post-trial brief and internal emails re same	2.5
2/26/20	Reviewed response to Sunoco's post-trial brief and emails re same	3
3/11/20	Reviewed Sunoco's suppl. post-trial brief	0.2
3/12/20	Emails re closing arguments	0.1
3/13/20	Emails re scheduling closing arguments	0.1
	Reviewed/drafted email re royalty owner and reviewed emails re scheduling closing arguments & emails re responses to Sunoco's suppl post-trial brief; drafted email re	
3/16/20	response to Sunoco's supp. post-trial brief	0.3
4/21/20	Email correspondence re RO inquiry about case	0.1
4/24/20	Email correspondence re RO inquiry about case	0.1
4/30/20	Reviewed email from Court re June 17th hearing	0.1
5/1/20	Reviewed email re June 17th hearing	0.1
5/7/20	Team meeting re Sunoco - update	0.5
5/11/20	Team meeting re Sunoco	0.5
5/14/20	Review Sunoco response to Notice	0.2
5/27/20	Reviewed order	0.1
6/8/20	Team meeting re Sunoco - fee issues/research	0.5
6/11/20	Email re Sunoco case strategy	0.2
6/22/20	Team meeting on Sunoco re motion status update	0.5
6/29/20	Team meeting on Sunoco re research on notice	0.5
6/29/20	Reviewed research on notice	1
8/17/20	Reviewed opinion re judgment, emails re same, discussed with team	2
8/17/20	Emails re interest and discussed same with team	0.2
8/24/20	Discussion with team re notice of updated damages	0.2
8/26/20	Reviewed order re notice of updated damages	0.1
8/27/20	Reviewed order awarding damages	0.1
8/31/20	Team meeting re Sunoco motion/distribution plan	0.5
9/14/20	Team meeting re Sunoco appeal/bond	0.5
9/16/20	Reviewed emails and discussion re appellate counsel	0.2
10/5/20	Team call re brief re finality/response to motion for new trial/motion to alter	0.5
10/6/20	Email re appellate counsel	0.2
11/9/20	Team discussion re brief re finality	0.5
11/16/20	Team discussion re brief on finality	0.5
11/30/20	Team discussion re response to post-trial motions	0.5
12/7/20	Team discussion re Sunoco response brief	0.2
12/21/20	Team discussion re Sunoco appeal	0.5
3/1/21	Team discussion re Sunoco	0.5
11/1/21	Reviewed 10th Cir Order and internal emails re same	0.3
11/3/21	Emails re 10th Cir. order	0.1
12/1/21	Emails re Sunoco appellate strategy	0.1
2/2/22	Reviewed 10th Cir order denying Sunoco's petition for writ of mandamus	0.1
2/7/22	Reviewed order re Sunoco appearing and answering concerning assets	0.1
2/14/22	Email re drafting responsibilities and discussion re same	0.5
2/20/22	Emails re asset hearing and doc production	0.5
2/21/22	Emails re asset hearing and doc production	0.4

2/22/22	Emails re asset hearing and doc production	0.5
2/23/22	Emails re objection to areas of inquiry for asset hearing	0.1
2/24/22	Emails re motion to strike	0.2
3/4/22	Emails re statutory fees	0.2
3/7/22	Email re Sunoco case strategy	0.2
3/22/22	Emails re Sunoco assets	0.2
5/2/22	Team discussion re settlement conference	0.3
8/22/22	Reviewed research re execution of judgment	1
8/30/22	Emails re emergency application for injunction or stay	0.1
9/14/22	Emails re final appealable order	0.2
10/12/22	Emails re motion for leave to deposit funds into court registry	0.1
12/19/22	Email re Sunoco fee, expense, CCA briefing	0.1
	TOTAL	148.55

Cline v. Sunoco
Trey Duck Time

Tuesday, June 13, 2017	Draft/Edit petition	2.00
Wednesday, June 14, 2017	Email communications	0.1
	Review of summons	0.25
Wednesday, August 2, 2017	Email from Defense counsel, relate internal email communications	0.25
Wednesday, August 9, 2017	Review motion to extend time to answe	0.1
Tuesday, August 15, 2017	Review removal papers; related email discussions	2
	Research removal issues	3.5
Monday, August 21, 2017	Read/review answer	1
	Related case notice and related email communications	1
Tuesday, August 22, 2017	Related revised case issue and related email communications	0.5
Wednesday, August 23, 2017	Emails regarding meet and confer	0.25
Monday, August 28, 2017	Emails regarding related case issues; meet and confer teleconference; team discussion	2.25
Tuesday, September 12, 2017	Email from Defense counsel	0.1
Friday, September 15, 2017	Review plaintiff's first dicsovery requests to defendnats	1.00
Wednesday, October 4, 2017	Review joint status report and related emails	0.25
Friday, October 6, 2017	Review/edit and discuss proposed scheduling order	0.5
Monday, October 9, 2017	Team meeting and further discussion regarding and review of scheduling order and status report	1.5
Tuesday, October 10, 2017	Meet and confer regarding and internally discuss scheduling order	0.5
Wednesday, October 11, 2017	Emails with defendants regarding and finalization of schedule and status report	3
Thursday, October 12, 2017	Email from defendant to court regarding filings, discussion with DP regarding status conference	0.5
Monday, October 16, 2017	Review defendants responses to written discovery	1
Thursday, October 19, 2017	Review proposed protective order and related emails	0.25
Tuesday, October 24, 2017	Review defendants changes to proposed protective order	0.2
Friday, October 27, 2017	Initial disclosures review	1
Tuesday, November 7, 2017	Email regarding final protective order	0.1
Tuesday, November 21, 2017	Emails regarding Sunoco's production	0.25
Thursday, November 23, 2017	Review defendants first discovery requests to plaintiff	2
Monday, November 27, 2017	Emails setting up meet and confer	0.25
Sunday, December 3, 2017	Review rog responses and emails regarding class certification	0.5
Monday, December 4, 2017	Emails setting up meet and confer	0.5
Thursday, December 7, 2017	Meet and cofner on discovery responses and follow up discussion	2.5
Friday, December 15, 2017	Document and data production review	3.00
Tuesday, December 19, 2017	Discussion and related research regarding defendants sending check and contacting plaintiff directly	5.25
Thursday, December 21, 2017	Emails and discussion regarding above, and motion to appoint interim class counsel	4
Thursday, December 28, 2017	Emails about and review of motion to appoint intermin class counsel	1.5
Wednesday, January 3, 2018	Review plaintiffs discovery responses and related emails	2
Friday, January 5, 2018	Review documents to be produced	1
Monday, January 8, 2018	Team meeting on case	0.5
Wednesday, January 17, 2018	Review draft letter to defendant; review and discussion 30(b)(6) notice	2
Thursday, January 18, 2018	Review Pat's summary of document production	0.5
Friday, January 26, 2018	Review defendants letter from yesterday regarding contacting Perry	0.25
Wednesday, February 7, 2018	Deposition scheduling emails	0.2
Monday, February 12, 2018	Deposition scheduling and review of new document production from plaintiff	0.75
Thursday, February 15, 2018	Read defendnats responses to RFAs	0.25
Thursday, March 8, 2018	Review pat's summary of Koelling deposition; discuss Holland depo prep	1

Wednesday, April 4, 2018	Review letter from defense counsel	0.25
Tuesday, April 10, 2018	Meet and confer	1
Thursday, April 26, 2018	Read defense counsel's letter from yesterday regarding 30(b)(6) notice; review and discuss email from defense counsel about e-discovery proposal	1.5
Friday, April 27, 2018	Review and discuss letter from defense counsel regarding Defendants' discovery responses	0.75
Wednesday, May 2, 2018	Review emails re 30(b)(6)	0.25
Thursday, May 3, 2018	Email regarding search terms	0.2
Wednesday, May 9, 2018	Email in response to above re search terms	0.5
Wednesday, May 16, 2018	Email from defense about RFPs	0.1
Friday, May 18, 2018	Team call regarding discovery responses and plan	0.75
Friday, May 25, 2018	Catch up on email threat regarding e-discovery proposal	1
Wednesday, May 30, 2018	ESI meet and confer and prep re meeting with Perry	2
Saturday, June 2, 2018	Review document production made yesterday	4
Wednesday, June 6, 2018	Emails about ESI	0.2
Monday, June 11, 2018	Emails about ESI and custodians; discuss client depo	0.5
Tuesday, June 22, 2021	Review priv log defense sent yesterday	1
Monday, June 25, 2018	quick review of motion to strike priv log [REDACTED]	0.5
Monday, July 2, 2018	Review and email discussion about defendants' second rog answers	0.75
Tuesday, July 3, 2018	Emails regarding DP's motion to compel. Discussion with DP	1
Monday, July 9, 2018	Review defendants' amended priv log, assist in hearing prep	1.50
Tuesday, July 17, 2018	Review Paula's email re witnesses	0.25
Friday, July 27, 2018	Document review	3.5
Tuesday, August 21, 2018	Catch up on case emails; review deposition annotations from Brooke.	5
Tuesday, September 4, 2018	Review and edit rog responses	2
Wednesday, September 5, 2018	Emails regarding finalizing rog responses	0.5
Thursday, September 20, 2018	Review defendants responses to third rogs, email catch up.	2.25
Sunday, October 14, 2018	Review backlog of case emails regarding depositions and other discovery issues and discuss case with DP	3.5
Sunday, October 21, 2018	Review response to confidentiality motion	0.75
Sunday, January 20, 2019	Quick review of Ley report [REDACTED]	0.50
Tuesday, February 12, 2019	Email review and document catch up	3
Monday, July 29, 2019	Email and internal discussion regarding case assignment and related research.	1
Tuesday, July 30, 2019	Email and document review catch up; trial planning	7
Monday, August 19, 2019	Team meeting on case; discuss responses to motions to exclude and to dismiss. Research cases in MTD and review draft.	3.5
Wednesday, August 28, 2019	Review and edit motion to exclude Ley	2.5
Monday, September 9, 2019	Team meeting on case	1
Thursday, September 12, 2019	Emails and discussion regarding def's request for surreply; discuss mailed discovery responses.	2.5
Monday, October 7, 2019	Team meeting on case; discuss motion to compel given the court orders; discuss class notice issue; email catch up	4.75
Tuesday, October 8, 2019	Meeting regarding assignments and staffing for pretrial and trial; discuss class notice	2
Wednesday, October 9, 2019	Listen in to conference call with Court regarding class notice and follow up discussion	1
Monday, October 14, 2019	Review emails from last week; review briefs being filed	3.5
Thursday, October 17, 2019	Emails regarding motion for summary judgment; review reply to motion to stay from 10/15; review 23(f) petition and discuss.	4
Monday, October 18, 2021	Discuss MSJ before finalizing; emails about 23(f)	2
Monday, October 21, 2019	Team meeting on case and pretrial prep	1.5
Tuesday, October 22, 2019	Discussion regarding putitives; plan for trial witness subpoenas	2.25
Thursday, October 24, 2019	Team discussion regarding pretrial filings and assignments	1.75

Friday, October 25, 2019	Discuss trial witnesses	1.5
Sunday, November 3, 2019	Research escheatment issue and review letter	4
Monday, November 4, 2019	Team meeting on case; discuss motion to stay and depo designations; plan for mediation; emails	2
Tuesday, November 5, 2019	Mediation strategy talk; depo designations; discuss draft MOU	3
Thursday, November 7, 2019	Meditation discussion	0.5
Monday, November 11, 2019	Trial prep and discussion of late data production from Krause; emails regarding legal issues for trial	3
Tuesday, November 12, 2019	Trial prep meeting; graphics development	4
Sunday, October 13, 2019	Trial prep meeting; graphics development	5.25
Thursday, November 14, 2019	Trial prep meeting; graphics development; case email catch up	6
Friday, November 15, 2019	Trial prep and discussion of [REDACTED]; review pretrial brief; emails regarding pretrial order	3.5
Saturday, November 16, 2019	Emails and research re escheat issues and legal arguments	2.25
Sunday, November 17, 2019	Emails related to and discussion about motion to amend class definition or to decertify	1.5
Monday, November 18, 2019	Work on cline affidavit and ley affidavit and emails about same; emails and discussion about Caldwell letter	12
Tuesday, November 19, 2019	Continue work on affidavits and discussion re pat's email about Cline affidavit; motion to clarify/decertify	4
Friday, November 22, 2019	Discuss motion to clarify and hearing; emails about designations;	4.75
Tuesday, November 26, 2019	Review court orders on motion to clarify; review other pretrial filings made today	5
Wednesday, December 4, 2019	Review/edit motion to strike late Krause report; emails and research on compounding interest	12
Thursday, December 5, 2019	Discussion Krause deposition and prep; motion to strike late Krause report	12
Monday, December 9, 2019	Ley deposition prep and planning; trial prep; review Defendants pretrial filings; trial project emails	12
Tuesday, December 10, 2019	Trial prep; witness planning/order; document organization; review defendants pretrial filings	12.00
Wednesday, December 11, 2019	Trial prep; trial projects and related emails	12.00
Thursday, December 12, 2019	Trial prep; witness planning/order; document organization; trial emails	12
	Trial prep and discuss/emails for damages related escheat	12
Sunday, December 15, 2019	Travel; Trial and trial prep; trial emails	12
Monday, December 16, 2019	Trial and trial prep; trial emails	12
Tuesday, December 17, 2019	Trial and trial prep; trial emails	12
Wednesday, December 18, 2019	Trial and trial prep; trial emails	10
Thursday, December 19, 2019	Trial and trial prep; trial emails	12
Friday, December 20, 2019	Travel; trial emails	3
Wednesday, January 15, 2020	Emails regarding trial exhibits	0.5
Monday, February 10, 2020	Team meeting on case; post trial strategy planning and assignments for filings	2.50
Thursday, February 13, 2020	Review FOFCOL; review post trial emails from past weeks	4
Friday, February 14, 2020	Review post-trial brief	2.5
Saturday, February 15, 2020	Email regarding post-trial filings	1.5
Monday, February 17, 2020	Team meeting on case; discuss and assign posttrial filings and briefs; Posttrial emails and drafts	5.5
Tuesday, February 18, 2020	Posttrial emails and drafts	3
Wednesday, February 19, 2020	Posttrial emails and drafts; related discussions	4
Thursday, February 20, 2020	Posttrial emails and drafts	1
Friday, February 21, 2020	Posttrial emails and drafts	1
Sunday, February 23, 2020	post trial emails	0.75

Friday, February 28, 2020	Review past week of email traffic and attachments regarding legal issues/postrial	2
Monday, March 9, 2020	Team meeting on case	2
Tuesday, March 10, 2020	Review defendnats supplemental post trial brief	1
Monday, March 16, 2020	Review response to supplemental post trial brief; emails related to same	1.5

TOTAL	370.55
--------------	---------------

Week Of	Day	Cline v. Sunoco Drew Pate Time	Daily Hours
8/28/17	--		
	8/28/17	Discuss case strategy during weekly meeting, review draft scheduling order, R26 conference, and related emails	2.00
	8/30/17	Review, Revise draft joint status report	0.75
9/11/17			
	9/12/17	Review emails re initial discovery requests and deadline to respond, discuss among team	0.5
	9/14/17	Emails re deadline for discovery responses	0.25
	9/15/17	Emails re discovery response and revising discovery post-removal	1.25
10/2/17			
	10/2/17	Discuss case status during weekly meeting	0.5
	10/4/17	Draft/revise status report, email for review	1.5
	10/6/17	Emails w/ team re draft status report, and upcoming scheduling conference, revise status report/schedule, emails w/ opposing counsel on status report and schedule	2
10/9/17			
	10/9/17	Discuss case status during weekly meeting, review and revise schedule and status report, emails with team and defendant on status report	2.25
	10/10/17	Emails re travel arrangements, email w/ defendant regarding status report and draft proposed schedule, review proposed edits	1
	10/11/17	Emails re status report and proposed schedule, review/revised proposals from defendant and finalize for filing, fly to OKC	6
	10/12/17	Travel to Muskogee, argue status conference, travel back from Oklahoma	6.5
10/16/17			
	10/16/17	Review defendants' discovery responses	1
	10/17/17	Emails related to proposed scheduling order and draft scheduling order	0.5
	10/18/17	Emails relates to proposed scheduling order, protective order, and revise both	1
	10/19/17	Emails regarding proposed scheduling order and protective order	0.25
10/23/17			
	10/23/17	Emails regarding proposed scheduling order; review draft notice of proposed scheduling order	1.25
	10/24/17	Emails related to filing schedule	0.1
	10/25/17	Review Scheduling Order entered by court, emails discussing strategy	0.2
	10/27/17	Review defendants initial disclosures, emails regarding plaintiff's initial disclosures, review/revise initial disclosures, emails re proposed protective order, review draft proposed protective order	2.5
10/30/17			
	10/30/17	Review revised proposed protective order	0.5
	11/1/17	Emails regarding revised proposed protective order	0.1
	11/3/17	Emails regarding revised proposed protective order; review revised proposal from defendants	0.5
11/6/17			
	11/6/17	Emails re proposed protective order changes from defendants; team call	1.25
	11/7/17	Emails and coordinating finalizing and filing agreed protective order	0.5
11/27/18			

	11/27/17	Review defendants' discovery responses; emails re meet/confer on responses; review and discuss defendants' discovery requests; coordinate draft responses	3.5
	11/28/17	Emails re meet/confer	0.25
	11/29/17	Review initial document production by defendants; review defendants' rog answers and discuss strategy	1.25
12/4/17	12/4/17	Email discussions and team meeting; discuss rog answers; emails re meet/confer;	1.5
	12/7/17	Meet and confer on discovery responses; discuss meet/confer; discuss plaintiff's responses	2.5
12/11/17	12/13/17	Emails and Coordinate defendant doc production loading	0.5
	12/15/17	Document review, data analysis coordinate	3.5
	12/19/17	Review email from defense counsel regarding check sent, emails re response, discuss strategy for [REDACTED], discuss response for [REDACTED], legal research regarding attempts to moot class representative claims; client discussions regarding improper letter and contact from Sunoco; emails regarding data production	6
	12/20/17	Review letters received by Cline family from Sunoco; improper contact by defendant/counsel; emails regarding response; client communications; discuss strategy of Sunoco concession of liability to Cline; evaluate strategy options for relief	3
	12/21/17	Emails re potential interim class counsel motion; emails re plaintiff discovery responses; review/review discovery responses	2.5
12/25/17	12/26/17	Emails re draft motion for interim class counsel;	1
1/1/18	1/3/18	Emails and review draft discovery responses	1.5
	1/5/18	Emails and discuss draft discovery responses, client discussions re discovery responses	1.5
1/8/18	1/8/18	Team meeting case discussion	0.5
	1/9/18	Legal research re interim class counsel motion	1
1/15/18	1/15/18	Team meeting case discussion; draft/revise letter re discovery	1
	1/16/18	Draft/revise letter re discovery; review/revise 30b6 notice; emails related to discovery and 30b6	2.5
	1/17/18	Emails re discovery letter and requesting dates for depositions, finalize and send letter, review revised 30b6 and letter	1
	1/18/18	Document review; depo prep	3
1/22/18	1/22/18	Emails re deposition scheduling	1
	1/25/18	Review defendants' response to letter re checks, discuss/emails regarding response	1
	1/26/18	Review defendants' response to discovery letter and depo topics, research authority provided	2
1/29/18	1/30/18	Emails re defendants' letter on 30b6 depositions, legal research re 30b6 notice and issues, doc review for depo prep	2

	2/2/18 Doc review	2
2/5/18	2/5/18 Emails re deposition scheduling and prep	0.5
	2/7/18 Emails re depositions scheduling and prep	0.75
	2/9/18 Doc review for production	1
2/12/18	2/12/18 Emails re documet production	0.5
	2/14/18 Review defendants' discovery responses, work with experts re data provided	1
	2/16/18 Plan deposition takers	0.25
2/19/18	2/20/18 Emails coordinating with Pat on travel and depositions; emails regarding 30b6 response letter;	0.5
	2/23/18 Emails re deposition scheduling/planning and travel	0.5
2/26/18	2/27/18 Review documents for Koelling deposition, help prep for deposition	2
	3/1/18 Discuss Koelling deposition	1
3/5/18	3/6/18 Review rough draft of depo transcript, prep for Holland depo, doc review	4
	3/8/18 Review deposition summary of Eric Koelling, prep for Holland depo	2
3/12/18	3/12/18 Emails and consider re next steps in discovery and depositions to notice	2
	3/13/18 Doc review and depo prep; emails with team re deposition strategy and issues	2
	3/14/18 Deposition of Holland and travel	7.5
	3/15/18 Review draft open records requests	1
3/19/18	3/22/18 Emails re defendants' discovery responses and next steps	0.5
	3/23/18 Doc Review	1
4/2/18	4/2/18 Review Holland transcript, review summary of Holland depo	2
	4/4/18 Emails re defendants' letter response on 30b6 topics and next steps, review defendants' letter	0.5
	4/5/18 Emails re meet/confer	0.25
	4/6/18 Emails re additional discovery and consider additional discovery	0.75
4/9/18	4/9/18 Emails re meet/confer and prep for meet/confer	0.25
	4/10/18 Meet/confer re discovery responses, emails with team	1.75
	4/11/18 Review and revise draft letter/email re discovery dispute, review and revise proposed esi search terms	1.5
4/23/18	4/25/18 Review response re 30(b)(6)	0.5
	4/26/18 Review response re ESI issues; emails re 30b6 response	1
	4/27/18 Review response re discovery deficiencies; emails re response	1
4/30/18	5/2/18 Emails re Sunoco discovery deficiencies	0.75
	5/3/18 Emails re meet/confer	0.25
	5/8/18 Coordinate and prep for meet/confer	0.5
	5/9/18 Meet and confer re discovery responses, plan response to defendant re position on 30b6, review response on search terms and ESI,	1

	5/16/18	Review response regarding discovery position and issues by Defendant and determine next steps	1
	5/17/18	Emails re Sunoco's ESI searches	0.5
	5/18/18	Team call and emails re Sunoco's discovery positions and impact on deadlines	0.75
5/21/18	5/21/18	Draft response to Defendants re discovery positions	0.5
	5/22/18	Emails re production formatting	0.5
	5/23/18	Emails and plan response on electronic searching, terms, custodians, and response to defendant	1
	5/25/18	Doc review, draft/edit/revise emails regarding discovery issues	1.25
5/28/18	5/28/18	Review/revise proposed email response to defendants	0.5
	5/29/18	Review proposed response on ESI, emails related to discovery and scheduling strategy,	1
	5/30/18	Meet and confer re discovery; prep for client meeting	2
	5/31/18	Client meeting and depo prep; draft/revise discovery requests	3
	6/1/18	Review doc production from defendants	3
6/4/18	6/4/18	Review/revise draft motion to extend;	1
	6/5/18	Collect documents for production; client communications re discovery and depo	1
	6/7/18	Doc review; client depo prep and meeting; review defendant request for additional documents; client communications re discovery	3
	6/8/18	Review and discuss Defendants' request for discovery of fee agreements; legal research on discoverability of fee agreements and other issues	1
6/11/18	6/11/18	Client depo prep and dinner meeting	2
	6/12/18	Client deposition	8
	6/13/18	Review summary of certain doc production	1
6/18/18	6/18/18	Review defendants' response to motion to extend; emails re discovery	1.25
	6/20/18	Discuss and coordinate/emails drafting of discovery motions; draft/edit/revise motion to compel	2.5
	6/21/18	draft/revise motion to compel; conference call re motions	3
	6/22/18	Review defendants privilege log	1
6/25/18	6/25/18	Review/revise draft motion re defendants' privilege log; review defendants' amended discovery responses	3
	6/27/18	Review Court orders and discuss hearing regarding motion to strike privilege log;	1
	6/28/18	Review Defendants notice and cited cases	1.5
	6/29/18	Meet/confer re privilege dispute; emails re privilege dispute; work with experts	2
7/2/18	7/2/18	Work with expert; review defendants' discovery responses; draft/revise motion to compel	3
	7/3/18	Review/revise/email re filing on local rule compliance	2
	7/5/18	Coordinate hearing plan	0.5
	7/6/18	Review/revise motion to compel, coordinate exhibits	1
7/9/18			

	7/9/18 Review documents produced and new privilege log; help prep fo rhearing on motion to strike	3
	7/10/18 Hearing on motion to strike; travel	3.5
	7/12/18 Revise depo notices per court order and email discussions, review issues for meet/confer with defendants; discuss draft response to motion to reconsider; review documents sent to client by Sunoco	4
7/30/18		
	7/30/18 Review depo prep suggestions from team	1
	7/31/18 Deposition prep	1
	8/1/18 Deposition prep; document review	2.5
	8/2/18 Deposition and travel	8
	8/3/18 Plan deposition strategy and discuss additional witnesses	1.5
8/6/18		
	8/6/18 Review Defendants' second set of discovery	1
	8/10/18 Discuss deponents	0.75
9/10/18		
	9/10/18 Review revised motion to compel; review meet/confer follow up and testimony deficiencies;	0.75
	9/11/18 Review new doc production; discuss and assign next draft of written discovery	1
	9/12/18 Depo prep	4
	9/13/18 Deposition of Kathy Warren; travel; work with expert regarding data production; discuss follow up requests following deposition	8
9/17/18		
	9/17/18 Review/revise letter on follow ups for Warren	0.25
	9/18/18 Depo prep; work with experts on data questions for depo	2
	9/19/18 Depo prep	4
	9/20/18 Deposition of Koelling as 30b6	9
	9/21/18 Review defendants' responses to third rogs; emails re meet/confer related to motion to compel	0.25
9/24/18		
	9/24/18 Meet/confer re motion to compel items; team discussion and emails on response and position; emails with defendants on meet/confer	1
	9/26/18 Review defendants' email on discovery dispute;	0.25
	9/28/18 Review and revise written discovery requests to Sunoco	1
10/1/18		
	10/1/18 Emails re discovery follow up from Warren depo	0.25
	10/3/18 Review Defendants' response to Motion to compel;	0.5
	10/4/18 Review Defendants' response to Motion to compel and discuss strategy for hearing; emails regarding hearing on motion to compel;	1.5
10/8/18		
	10/8/18 Meet/confer re defendants' confidentiality designations; emails related to meet/confer	0.75
10/15/18		
	10/17/18 Discuss Defendants' discovery letter and request for additional deposition, confer re defendants' request	0.5
	10/18/18 Review response from Defendants' regarding redactions	0.25
	10/19/18 Review/revise brief related to confidentiality; emails related to brief	2
10/22/18		
	10/24/18 Depo prep for Koelling follow-up and travel	2
	10/25/18 Depo prep and Deposition of Koelling as 30b6	3

10/29/18	10/30/18 Review/revise draft motion to extend; review/revise amended disclosures	1.5
	11/2/18 Review email from experts re data and work with experts	0.5
12/17/18	12/17/18 Work with experts to resolve data issues from Defendants' production; emails related to corrupted data	0.5
	12/20/18 Work with experts to resolve data issues from Defendants' production; emails related to corrupted data	1
	12/21/18 Emails with Defendants regarding data corruption issues	0.5
12/24/18	12/27/18 Emails re accounting data re-production and data corruption issue for experts	0.25
1/7/19	1/9/19 Emails re extension of expert deadlines due to data production	0.5
	1/10/19 Review motion related to extension	0.5
1/14/19	1/16/19 Work w/ experts re class certification; revise draft; discuss report	1
1/21/19	1/21/19 Review draft regarding expert for class certification, emails regarding class certification and experts	3.5
	1/24/19 Work w/ experts re data and class certification; review defendants' request re Gwen Cline	2
	1/25/19 Review draft expert report regarding class certification	1.5
1/28/19	1/28/19 Work w/ experts re class certification report	2.75
2/4/19	2/4/19 Emails re request for Ley depo, scheduling and planning	1
	2/5/19 Emails re additional information requested related to Ley from Sunoco Emails and discussion re deposition of Ley and data issues; review draft	0.5
	2/6/19 response	1.25
4/1/19	4/1/19 Review expert report of Eric Krause	3
4/8/19	4/10/19 Draft/revise motion to extend deadline	0.5
	4/11/19 Draft/revise motion to extend deadline; emails re motion	0.75
4/22/19	4/24/19 Review/revise motion to extend deadlines; emails re motion	0.75
5/6/19	5/7/19 Consider/discuss potential revised class definition and email	0.75
7/29/19	7/29/19 Emails re Judge reassignment, scheduling conference availability and strategy for conference, review request from defendants for 3x increase to page limits on class cert response	1
	7/30/19 Emails re defense request for page limit increase and response; emails coordinating hearing date	0.75
	7/31/19 Emails coordinating hearing date	0.5
8/5/19	8/5/19 Review/revise draft response to Sunoco's motion for page extension; prep for status conference with new Judge; status conference	2.5

	8/6/19	Review class certification motion and expert reports; deposition transcripts; discuss amended case schedule and strategy	5.5
	8/8/19	Review Defendants' motion to dismiss; Research related to Campbell-Ewald standard and picking off class rep; emails with team re motion to dismiss and legal research	3
	8/9/19	Discuss and begin drafting response to motion to dismiss	1
8/12/19	8/12/19	Review/revise draft discovery; emails re discovery; team meeting re case; draft response to motion to dismiss	6
	8/13/19	Discuss research questions w/ team re motion to dismiss response; legal research	3
	8/15/19	Review Defendants' class cert response and motion to exclude Ley; discuss and take notes for reply and response; emails re briefs	8
	8/16/19	Call re additional discovery; discuss briefing responsibilities; draft/edit response; work with expert;	8
8/19/19	8/19/19	Team meeting re case; draft/edit response brief on motion to exclude Ley; draft/edit response brief on MTD; emails re briefing; review/edit draft discovery;	6
	8/20/19	Calls re draft discovery; review cases cited in MTD briefing; review/revise MTD brief; draft/edit response re expert; emails re briefs and discovery	8
	8/21/19	Review, incorporate final edits on MTD response; finalizing MTD response for filing; emails re final response; review/revise draft discovery requests	5
	8/22/19	Coordinate filing MTD response	1
	8/23/19	Emails re reply brief ISO class cert and discuss issues related to reply with team; review material for reply; response re expert	6
8/26/19	8/26/19	Team meeting re case; discuss briefs; review/revise reply brief ISO class cert; review/revise response brief re motion to exclude Ley;	6
	8/27/19	discuss/research class definition for reply; review/revise class cert related drafts (motion to exclude and reply); emails related to drafts	8
	8/28/19	Finalize briefs for filing, class cert reply, response to motion to exclude; emails related to filings and class definition	4
	8/29/19	Emails re confidentiality designations	0.25
	8/30/19	Emails re confidentiality designations	0.25
9/2/19	9/3/19	Draft letter to defendants re discovery;	0.75
	9/5/19	Review Defendants' reply re motion to dismiss	2
9/9/19	9/9/19	Team meeting re case; discuss Defendants' request for additional sur-reply	1
	9/10/19	Review defendants' reply re motion to exclude Ley; emails re motion to exclude	2
	9/11/19	Review defendants' request for sur-reply	0.75
	9/12/19	Discuss response to defendants' request; emails related to response; review draft response; review defendants' discovery responses (which they intentionally served by mail instead of email); consider deficiencies and response	4
	9/13/19	Review and discuss defendants' response to letter;	0.75
9/16/19	9/16/19	Team meeting re case; discuss response to Defendants' discovery response; emails re meet/confer	1

	9/17/19	Prep for meet/confer	0.5
	9/18/19	Meet/confer with defendant re discovery responses; discuss meet/confer	1
	9/20/19	Emails re discovery dispute	0.25
9/23/19			
	9/23/19	Team meeting re case; pretrial deadlines and task coordinate	1.5
	9/24/19	Review draft additional discovery requests	1
	9/25/19	Email discussing potential draft discovery requests; review data production and work w/ experts on additional data	0.75
	9/26/19	Revise/edit additional discovery requests	1
	9/27/19	Emails re additional discovery requests; review draft motion to compel re data	3
9/30/19			
	10/2/19	Review/revise draft motion to compel on prior years data	1.5
	10/3/19	Emails re draft motion to compel; review Court orders re class certification, motion to exclude, and motion to dismiss; discuss court orders and next steps with team; respond to Court request for availability	7
	10/5/19	Emails re conference; pretrial work on exhibit and witness lists; research 23(f) standard; research class notice requirements; consider partial MSJ points	8
10/7/19			
	10/7/19	Team meeting re case; review/discuss defendants' discovery responses and revisions to motion to compel in light of court orders; research notice requirements; review prior notice campaigns for contested class action; coordinate with potential class administrator; emails re class notice and admin; coordinate with trial graphics consultant	7
	10/8/19	Discuss pretrial/trial prep tasks and allocating assignments; work with experts regarding missing discovery components and trial prep; review/revise draft class notice; emails with defendant re outstanding discovery items	5
	10/9/19	Prep for Conference call w/ Court re class notice; Conference w/ Court re class notice; emails re trial plan and strategy; work with expert on DFS; draft/revise response to motion to stay	3
	10/10/19	Discuss DFS research and project; revise draft response to motion to stay; emails re response	7.25
	10/11/19	Finalize response to motion to stay; emails re potential mediators; review deposition testimony for trial designations; review draft motion to approve notice; meet/confer re notice and discovery	8
10/14/19			
	10/14/19	Team meeting re case; work with experts; discuss defendants' request for information; draft response to defendants' proposal; draft brief related to notice data	6.5
	10/15/19	Review defendants' reply re motion to stay; discuss DFS schedule; emails re discovery; work with experts; draft/revise brief related to notice data; emails re data brief; emails re mediation;	6
	10/16/19	Review proposed designations for trial testimony of Holland, Redding; review draft MSJ; emails re mediators	4.75
	10/17/19	Review/revise draft MSJ; work w/ expert on info needed for trial; review 23(f) petition; emails re MSJ and 23(f)	8
	10/18/19	Review/revise R26 disclosures; discuss comments and finalize MSJ; emails re 23(f) brief	8

10/21/19	10/21/19 Team meeting re case; follow up on discovery items previously/improperly withheld pending class certification; work with experts; review and transmit data production from defendants;	7
	10/22/19 Emails re expert testimony, mediation, discuss punitive damages; emails and discuss trial subpoenas and witnesses to call live vs. designation;	3.5
	10/23/19 Emails re mediation with Judge Royal Furgeson; discuss and pull documents for exhibit list; review Sunoco financial statements; mediation prep	8
	10/24/19 Work with experts regarding report; review draft; discuss status of pretrial filing drafts and tasks; review draft 23(f) petition response; emails re defendants' position on notice;	7.5
	10/25/19 Work with experts regarding report; emails re mediation plan and scheduling; plan mediation statement; discuss trial witnesses; emails and confer re class notice; review/revise 23(f) petition	8.5
10/28/19	10/28/19 Prep materials for Judge Furgeson; review Defendants' response on class notice; review draft exhibit list; discuss depo designations for trial, formatting and process for trimming; draft status report;	6.5
	10/29/19 Emails with defendant re data for experts; review defendants' motion to strike; work with administrator re anticipated class notice; emails re damages calculations; plan response to motion to strike; review research related to one-way intervention; edit exhibit list	8
	10/30/19 Review draft response to motion to strike MSJ; work with experts on trial testimony; review draft mediation statement; prep for hearing on notice	8
	10/31/19 Telephonic hearing re Class Notice; review and transmit information produced by Defendants; finalize draft notices	4
	11/1/19 Submit revised notices to Court; coordinate with notice administrator; review sunoco's supplemental authority; review response to sunoco's supp authority;	8
11/4/19	11/4/19 Team meeting re case; review draft response to motion to stay; review/revise depo designations for trial; finalize mediation memo; coordinate notice with adminsitator; discuss potential trial witness testimony; review/revise/coordinate exhibit and witness lists; finalize motion to stay response (10th circuit);	5
	11/5/19 Review and discuss defendants' emails and position re unclaimed property; mediation strategy discussion; update exhibit list; review depo designations; submit proposed website for class; work with expert re mediation and damages; review draft MOU revisions from defendant and discuss mediation;	9
	11/6/19 Work with trial witnesses; review/discuss depo designations, exhibit list and witness list; revise/discuss potential stipulated facts; review/revise draft reply ISO MSJ;	9
	11/7/19 Mediation; finalize reply ISO MSJ; review draft rebuttal expert report;	8
	11/8/19 Review/discuss draft rebuttal expert report; work with experts; trial prep themes, opening, demonstratives	9
11/11/19	11/11/19 Trial prep tasks and coordinate, consider expert depositions, how to handle Defendants' late production; response to Defendants' arguments on unclaimed property; trial prep retreat with team [REDACTED]	10

	11/12/19	Trial prep work with team [REDACTED]; develop trial graphics;	9
	11/13/19	Trial prep work with team [REDACTED]; develop trial graphics; work with experts	9
	11/14/19	Trial prep work with team [REDACTED]; develop trial graphics; work with experts; outline examinations of trial witnesses	9
	11/15/19	Review Defendants' motion to clarify and discuss response; trial prep work on opening and witness examinations	9
	11/16/19	Emails and revise proposed stipulated facts	2
11/18/19	11/18/19	Review defendants' witness and exhibit list; discuss/draft response to motion to clarify; support for motion to clarify response; emails related to draft and supporting material;	12
	11/19/19	Finalize response to motion to clarify; emails related to finalizing brief, support and filing	12
	11/20/19	Review draft objections to exhibit and witness list; depo designations; work with expert; review defense exhibits and discuss any rebuttal needed	10
	11/21/19	Coordinate and schedule expert depositions; return class member calls; work with expert on demonstratives and trial testimony; review potential rebuttal exhibits, rebuttal exhibit list; review opt outs received and arrange call backs; prep for hearing on motion to clarify	10
	11/22/19	Coordinate pretrial tasks and deadlines re exhibit objections, depo designation objections; call opt outs; pre-trial prep; prep for hearing on motion to clarify	10
11/25/19	11/25/19	Emails re depo designations; hearing prep; hearing re motion to clarify; discuss hearing with team; settlement strategy	8
	11/26/19	Emails re trial exhibits; emails re agreement on Koelling; emails re trial witnesses; calls to opt-outs; prep potential witness testimony outlines; emails re potential witness objections; review court order on motion to clarify	6
	11/27/19	Prep for deposition of Eric Krause; review/discuss/research defendants' objections to exhibits and witnesses	3
12/2/19	12/2/19	Deposition prep (Krause); work with expert; prep for MSJ hearing; team meeting re case and trial prep/tasks; plan/outline trial brief issues and allocate; research related to trial briefs; witness research and examination outline (Caldwell); review supplemental expert report for Krause;	12
	12/3/19	Discuss/outline motion to strike Krause; review/revise draft trial briefs; Depo pre (Krause) and prep exhibits for depo; review/revise response to motion for leave for sur-reply; call re trial logistics; work with expert re issues raised by Krause;	12
	12/4/19	Prep for MSJ Hearing; Deposition prep for Krause; review/revise trial briefs; review/revise motion to strike Krause; review court directions on exhibits and coordinate logistics;	12
	12/5/19	Deposition of Eric Krause; Prep for MSJ hearing; review/revise trial briefs; revise motion to strike Krause	12
	12/6/19	MSJ Hearing; review/revise trial briefs, discuss edits and finalizing for	12
12/9/19	12/9/19	Deposition prep (Ley); trial prep	12
	12/10/19	Ley Deposition defend; trial prep	12
	12/11/19	Trial prep	12

	12/12/19 Trial prep	12
	12/13/19 Trial prep	12
	12/14/19 Trial prep	12
12/16/19		
	12/16/19 Trial; Trial Preparation	14
	12/17/19 Trial; Trial Preparation	14
	12/18/19 Trial; Trial Preparation	14
	12/19/19 Trial; Trial Preparation	7
12/30/19		
	12/30/19 Emails regarding mailing exhibits to court	0.75
	1/2/19 Emails regarding exhibits	0.75
1/6/20		
	1/6/20 Discuss updated info from JND on opt outs	0.75
1/13/20		
	1/13/20 Team meeting case discussion	0.75
	1/14/20 Emails re court conference	0.5
	1/15/20 Telephonic conference	0.5
	1/17/20 Emails w/ defendant	0.25
2/3/20		
	2/6/20 Emails re opt-outs and JND; calls with class members	0.75
	2/7/20 Discuss supplemental declaration from JND	0.75
2/10/20		
	2/10/20 Team meeting re case and posttrial filings; discuss post-trial filings; draft amended proposed findings	5
	2/11/20 Draft/edit/revise post-trial brief, amended proposed findings; emails related to briefing	8
	2/12/20 Draft/edit/revise post-trial brief, amended proposed findings; emails related to briefing	3
	2/13/20 Draft/edit/revise post-trial brief, amended proposed findings; emails related to briefing	9
	2/14/20 Draft/edit/revise post-trial brief, amended proposed findings; emails related to briefing	8
2/17/20		
	2/17/20 Team meeting re case; discuss finalizing post trial briefs; emails re final edits to post trial briefs; incorporate final edits; review post trial briefs	6
	2/18/20 Finalize post trial briefs; incorporate edits	12
	2/19/20 Review Sunoco post-trial filings and draft response	8
	2/20/20 Review Sunoco post-trial filings and draft response	8
	2/21/20 Review Sunoco post-trial filings and draft response	8
	2/27/20 Review Sunoco post-trial filings and finalize response	8
3/2/20		
	3/2/20 Review and discuss Sunoco response brief	3.25
	3/3/20 Discuss plan for closing argument	0.5
3/9/20		
	3/9/20 Team meeting re case; discuss defendants' emails re Unit case	2.25
	3/10/20 Research and discuss fee issues related to common fund and fee shift; discuss response to Sunoco supplement	2.5

	3/12/20	Discuss whether to postpone closing argument; outline draft response re Unit ruling on interest	1.75
3/16/20			
	3/16/20	Draft/edit/revise supplemental brief on Unit; emails re supplemental brief; emails re brief	4
5/4/20			
	5/4/20	Team meeting re case; schedule call w/ Court re closing hearing; discuss closing plan; review and discuss Unit reconsideration order	2.5
	5/5/20	Draft/revise notice re Unit	3
	5/7/20	Review prior closing argument demonstratives and transcript	2
5/25/20			
	5/25/20	Team meeting re case; plan for closing	1
	5/27/20	Gather documents and information for closing prep; emails w/ team re hearing	2
6/8/20			
	6/8/20	Review defendants' post-trial briefs, review Plaintiff's post-trial briefs, review transcript	8
	6/9/20	Prep for closing argument	3.5
	6/10/20	Prep for closing argument	4
	6/11/20	Prep demonstratives for hearing	6
	6/12/20	Prep for closing argument	1
6/15/20			
	6/15/20	Prep for closing and demonstratives; emails with team re closing	6
	6/16/20	Prep for closing and demonstratives; emails with team re closing	5
	6/17/20	Hearing on closing argument; travel	7.5
6/29/20			
	6/29/20	Team meeting re case; research related to PRSA fees; emails re research	1.5
	6/30/20	Research re PRSA fees and staying fee issue	0.5
8/17/20			
	8/17/20	Review court orders, discuss orders with team and next steps	2.5
	8/18/20	Emails w/ expert re updated calculations ordered; confirm deadlines and next steps	1.5
	8/19/20	Review information from experts re updated damages per court order	1
	8/20/20	Work w/ experts to finalize damages;	0.75
	8/24/20	Finalize notice for filing re damages	1.5
	8/27/20	Prep for hearing; Hearing regarding interest calculations	1.5
8/31/20			
	8/31/20	Discuss/draft proposed plan of allocation	1.5
	9/2/20	Review revised draft plan of allocation	2.00
	9/4/20	Work w/ experts re allocation	1
	9/8/20	emails re proposed plan of allocation; call with team; finalize draft for	2
9/21/20			
	9/21/20	Review Sunoco appeal brief	1
	9/22/20	Review and discuss possible appellate counsel; emails regarding latest sunoco brief and review brief	3
	9/23/20	Emails regarding potential appellate counsel; discuss reply re plan of allocation.	1.5
	9/24/20	Emails regarding arguments for reply and evidence in support	0.75
9/28/20			
	9/25/20	Review reply re Plan of allocation	2.5

	9/28/20 Finalize reply re plan of allocation	1.5
	Review motions for new trial and to amend; discuss response; draft/edit	
	9/29/20 revise responses	5
	Draft/edit revise responses to motions for new trial and to amend; call w/	
	9/30/20 appellate counsel	4.2
	Draft/edit revise responses to motions for new trial and to amend; emails	
	10/1/20 re response	2
	10/2/20 Call w/ appellate counsel	0.5
10/5/20	Draft/edit revise responses to motions for new trial and to amend; emails	
	10/5/20 re response; team call	5
	Draft/edit revise responses to motions for new trial and to amend; emails	
	10/7/20 re response	4
	10/8/20 Finalize and file responses to motion to amend and for new trial	2
	11/13/20 Call w/ appellate counsel	0.3
	12/21/20 Call w/ appellate counsel	0.5
	1/26/21 Coordinate and email with JND regarding website updates	0.25
	Emails with appellate counsel regarding ability to execute; discuss	
	2/18/21 research needed	0.25
	3/2/21 Call w/ appellate counsel and emails	1.5
	3/5/21 Review Sunoco appeal brief, email and discuss with appellate counsel	2
	Review record regarding representations made by Sunoco in appeal; draft	
	3/11/21 summary of misrepresentations	4
	Emails regarding procedural history for purposes of appeal and responding	
	3/12/21 to Sunoco misreps	0.5
	Emails regarding appeal response points; continue review of record to	
	3/29/21 summarize misreps by Sunoco in briefing	4.75
	Emails regarding appeal brief, email summary of misreps by Sunoco and	
	3/30/21 support	2
	4/1/21 Review and revise outline of appeal response brief	1
	4/13/21 Call w/ appellate counsel re brief	0.3
	4/23/21 Call w/ appellate counsel regarding comments and appeal brief	1
	4/26/21 Revise outline and notes for appellate counsel and email	0.75
	5/23/21 Review and revise appeal brief	3
	5/24/21 Review and revise appeal brief, consolidate comments/edits	4
	5/28/21 Review and revise draft appeal brief	1
	5/31/21 Review and revise draft appeal brief	2.5
	6/1/21 Call regarding finalizing appeal brief, and final revisions	1
	6/23/21 Review Sunoco reply appeal brief and emails discussing	1.5
	7/11/21 Review and revise draft response to Rule 28(j) letter	0.5
	10/15/21 Review and discuss order from 10th for supplemental briefing	1
	10/18/21 Call w/ appellate counsel re jurisdiction	0.5
	10/20/21 Review Sunoco filing on supp briefing and emails regarding response	1.5
	10/22/21 Review and revise supp brief	0.5
	Review and discuss 10th cir order dismissing appeal, emails regarding	
	11/1/21 order	1.5
	11/2/21 Call regarding 10th cir order and next steps	0.5
	11/11/21 Review petition for rehearing en banc, emails and discuss	1
	11/30/21 Emails and discuss strategy following denial of rehearing en banc	1.5
12/6/21		

	12/7/21	Emails re motion to enforce judgment, asset hearing and for attorney fees under PRSA; review research; review/revise draft motion	2
	12/8/21	Emails re motion to enforce judgment, asset hearing and for attorney fees under PRSA; review research; review/revise draft motion	3
	12/13/21	Review/revise motion for asset hearing; emails related to motion and research; finalize motions	2
	12/28/21	Call w/ appellate counsel re allocation and undivided	0.3
1/9/22			
	1/9/22	Review draft reply ISO motion on fees/costs deadline, revise/edit and emails on draft reply	0.5
	1/10/22	Review research related to supersedeas bond	0.5
1/31/22			
	2/4/22	Emails re statutory fee motion and research issues	0.25
2/14/22			
	2/16/22	Review/revise/draft statutory fee motion	1.5
	2/17/22	Review Sunoco filings on finality and discuss strategy and response	0.5
	2/18/22	Discuss and draft responses to Sunoco judgment execution filings and asset hearing filings.	0.5
2/21/22			
	2/21/22	Review and revise briefing on motion to strike and related briefs; emails related to briefing	1
	2/22/22	Draft section for response to Sunoco objection to producing documents and having asset hearing	2
2/28/22			
	3/1/22	Draft motion to approve form and manner of notice	0.6
	3/2/22	Discuss, review and revise stipulation regarding attorney fees	2
3/7/22			
	3/7/22	Review and revise fee motion regarding stipulated amount	0.5
	3/8/22	Call to discuss Sunoco , emails regarding drafts regarding motion to strike	1.5
	3/9/22	Discuss and review reply regarding motion to strike Sunoco's motion for injunction	1
3/21/22			
	3/22/22	Call w/ Pat	0.1
3/28/22			
	3/30/22	Call w/ absent class member regarding status of case and class membership	0.5
	3/31/22	Prep for hearing and motion hearing on motion to strike, motion to alter, motion for injunction, review finality briefing	5
4/4/22			
	4/5/22	Emails w/ Defense counsel regarding scheduling settlement conference	0.25
4/11/22			
	4/13/22	Coordinate with co-counsel regarding settlement conference plan and travel	0.25
	4/14/22	Review inquiry from absent class member, discuss with experts, and draft email, and update JND	0.75
4/18/22			

	4/22/22	Review/revise Mediation memo for Magistrate Judge Colombell; emails regarding mediation issues	3
4/25/22			
	4/27/22	Revise mediation memo	0.5
	4/28/22	Review cert petition by Sunoco and emails discussing	2
5/2/22			
	5/3/22	Finalize mediation memo	0.5
5/9/22			
	5/12/22	Meeting with co-counsel regarding settlement conference	2
	5/13/22	Settlement conference	3
5/16/22			
	5/16/22	Review Sunoco edits to the proposed term sheet	0.5
5/23/22			
	5/25/22	2nd Settlement Conference	3
5/30/22			
	6/3/22	Review and finalize draft notice to court	0.5
6/20/22			
	6/20/22	Review and revise Supp Brief re notice	1
	6/21/22	Review and finalize Supp Brief re notice and distribution schedule	0.5
6/27/22			
	6/27/22	Emails and discuss strategy responding to Sunoco appeals and motion to enjoin	1.5
	6/29/22	Emails with absent class members regarding claims; review and revise insert for appellate brief regarding stay	3
	6/30/22	Review, discuss, and emails regarding 10th Circuit order for memorandum briefs	0.5
	7/1/22	Emails regarding extension request in 10th Cir	0.1
7/4/22			
	7/10/22	Review and revise response to motion to stay in appellate court and memo brief	1.75
	7/11/22	Review draft response to jurisdictional inquiry and motion to stay, emails regarding draft, gather research/briefing regarding bond	1.25
7/11/22			
	7/13/22	Review and finalize Reply ISO supp brief for notice and distribution	0.1
7/18/22			
	7/18/22	Discuss filing statements of judgment	0.1
	7/20/22	Review research regarding Sunoco assets for execution	0.5
8/1/22			
	8/5/22	Meet to discuss strategy and options for execution, research regarding execution.	1
8/8/22			
	8/9/22	Emails regarding execution strategy	0.25
	8/11/22	Emails regarding execution strategy, research regarding execution	1
8/15/22			
	8/19/22	Review research regarding execution steps and discuss additional research questions	0.5
	8/21/22	Gather collective research on execution and enforcement, prior briefing, orders related to asset hearing, and steps following hearing. Draft summary email	1.5
8/22/22			

	8/22/22	Revise and send summary email	0.1
	8/23/22	Review and revise email regarding Sunoco's proposed motion; respond to absent class member email	0.2
	8/24/22	Conference call; review, revise and finalize response to Def's objections re documents and asset hearing	2.5
	8/25/22	Emails regarding garnishment	0.25
8/29/22			
	8/29/22	Review and discuss research related to execution; review emergency application for injunction or stay	0.75
	8/30/22	Review and revise application for writ of execution; research regarding execution, draft email memo regarding execution issues.	3
	8/31/22	Review and finalize Response to Defendants' Notice re appeal ; call to discuss response; identify and draft list of misreps for use by appellate counsel	3.5
	9/1/22	Asset hearing prep	2
	9/2/22	Review and finalize notice of non-compliance	1
	9/4/22	Review and revise opposition to application for injunction/stay	1
9/5/22			
	9/6/22	Asset hearing prep	1
	9/7/22	Asset hearing prep	1
	9/9/22	Review additional production from Sunoco for asset hearing	0.5
	9/10/22	Review and revise draft proposed order for asset hearing	1.5
9/12/22			
	9/12/22	Asset hearing; travel	10
9/19/22			
	9/22/22	Conference call; review and finalize reply ISO report and recommendation	1.5
10/3/22			
	10/4/22	Draft response to Sunoco reply	1
	10/5/22	Review and Finalize resp to sur-reply re report and recommendation	0.25
	10/7/22	Discuss and finalize garnishment summons	0.25
10/10/22			
	10/10/22	Review and revise appelle brief related to Rule 60 appeal	1.75
	10/11/22	Email with JND to set up judgment fund account.	0.1
	10/12/22	Review and finalize response to emergency motion; call with garnishee	1.5
	10/14/22	Call with garnishee	0.25
10/17/22			
	10/17/22	Draft and review notice regarding judgment account	0.5
10/24/22			
	10/24/22	Review and revise notice and affidavit regarding the judgment fund account.	0.5
	10/25/22	Hearing with Judge West regarding motion to deposit funds	0.25
10/31/22			
	11/2/22	Review and finalize motion for entry of order and notice of default	0.75
	11/2/22	Call re payment notice by Sunoco	1
11/7/22			
	11/8/22	Draft omnibus response to Sunoco MTDs	0.25
	11/9/22	Draft omnibus response to Sunoco MTDs and circulate	3
11/14/22			
	11/14/22	Revise omnibus response to Sunoco MTDs and circulate	1
	11/18/22	Finalize and email regarding response to Sunoco MTDs on garnishment	1.5

11/21/22	11/21/22 Review Sunoco objection to West; draft outline for response and circulate; emails regarding response	1.5
	11/22/22 Review Sunoco motion to enjoin; draft outline of response/motion to strike and circulate to team; emails related to draft	2.5
	11/23/22 Revise and revise draft response to Sunoco objection to West Findings and Recommendation; coordinate and email regarding subpoena for Riccuiti	1.5
11/28/22	11/28/22 Emails and discuss subpoena for witness for garnishment hearing;	0.5
	11/29/22 Call w/ Defendant regarding garnishment and execution; discuss next steps and plan for hearing; Review and revise draft responses to Sunoco Objection/Motion to Enjoin and review/revise draft motion to strike; emails and discuss briefing	3
	11/30/22 Calls w/ Defendant regarding garnishment and motions set for hearing, discuss and draft proposal; prep for hearing on garnishment/execution motions	3
	12/1/22 Prep for hearing re garnishment and garnishment hearing, travel; emails regarding notice on fees and planning	7.5
	12/5/22 Review findings and recommendation; emails regarding next steps	0.5
	12/14/22 Call and meeting re upcoming briefing ; emails/organization on drafting responsibility; review draft statement from Sunoco	2
	12/19/22 Discuss drafting notice re proposed schedule for notice, fees, expenses, CCA and review draft notice.	1
	12/20/22 Call w/ co-counsel re briefing	0.25
	12/21/22 Discuss and review draft filings re dismissing garnishment and withdrawing notice of default	0.5
	1/5/23 Review and revise draft documents in support of fee briefing	3
	1/6/23 Review draft notices and emails re notices and upcoming briefing; emails re notice with JND; review and discuss court orders regarding schedule for notice and briefing, emails and calls regarding orders and next steps	3.5
	1/9/23 Review revised notice, emails regarding notice, meet regarding notice and fee briefing	2.5
	1/10/23 Emails regarding supporting documents for upcoming briefing	0.75
	1/16/23 Review and revise fee briefing and supporting documents	2
	1/18/23 Review and revise fee briefing and supporting documents.	1.5
	1/20/23 Review and revise fee briefing and supporting documents	5
	TOTAL	1247.4

<u>Cline v. Sunoco</u>			
C. Hill - Total (Summary) Table - TimeSheetEntries			
Year	Total Time	Hourly Rate	Lodestar
2017	23.7	\$400	\$9,480.00
2018	40.85	\$400	\$16,340.00
2019	38.6	\$400	\$15,440.00
2020	7.5	\$600	\$4,500.00
TOTAL	110.65		\$45,760.00

<u>Cline v. Sunoco</u>				
C. Hill - 2017 - TimeSheetEntries				
Date	Tasks	Time	Hourly Rate	Lodestar
2/3/17	Review/analyze memo re [REDACTED]	0.7	\$400.00	\$280.00
2/6/17	Mtg. - discuss venue for Sunoco interest case	0.3	\$400.00	\$120.00
	Research OK venue statutes/case law + 10th Cir. Venue cases post-removal; analyze Sunoco royalty payment information, property/asset ownership by county & public website/data sources re property/asset ownership. Draft [REDACTED]	2.8	\$400.00	\$1,120.00
2/9/17	Meet w/ O&G team members re Sunoco petition drafting/venue/case strategy	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
2/10/17	Review DP memo re [REDACTED]	0.3	\$400.00	\$120.00
	Correspond w/ DP/LB/TD re drafting plan & assignments for Sunoco petition	0.4	\$400.00	\$160.00
2/11/17	Review & update [REDACTED] Memo based on analysis of [REDACTED]; work on draft Petition based on updated info/analysis	3.1	\$400.00	\$1,240.00
2/16/17	correspondence & follow-up call re draft P. Cline-Sunoco Petition based on [REDACTED]	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
	Review well info from OCC/L. Beebe investigation re Boss Hogg, Snowman, Cline wells & Transfer of Ops; Incorporate info into draft Petition	2.2	\$400.00	\$880.00
2/17/17	Complete draft Petition & circulate to team for review with [REDACTED]	3.4	\$400.00	\$1,360.00
	Review DP correspondence re petition/moving forward	0.2	\$400.00	\$80.00
	Review L. Beebe updated information re Cline lease/well info & comments re draft Petition	1.5	\$400.00	\$600.00
8/16/17	Review/analyze Sunoco removal filings	0.8	\$400.00	\$320.00
8/18/17	Review timing in Order for scheduling conference/report	0.2	\$400.00	\$80.00
8/22/17	Analyze/annotate Sunoco Answer	0.6	\$400.00	\$240.00
8/28/17	Review MB correspondence to defense counsel re proceeding before Judge K. West	0.2	\$400.00	\$80.00
9/12/17	Review correspondence from D. McClure re extension for discovery responses; follow-up correspondence among team re same	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
10/11/17	Review draft Jt Status Report	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
10/20/17	Annotate Sunoco discovery responses/objections for issues to pursue	1.2	\$400.00	\$480.00
10/25/17	Review/calendar dates from Court's Scheduling Order	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
10/27/17	Analyze Sunoco Initial Disclosures for discovery strategy/plan	0.4	\$400.00	\$160.00
11/23/17	Review & annotate Sunoco discovery requests for responses/objections	1.3	\$400.00	\$520.00
12/18/17	Doc review - Sunoco data production set, accounting docs focus	1.6	\$400.00	\$640.00
TOTAL (2017)		23.7	\$400.00	\$9,480.00

<u>Cline v. Sunoco</u>				
C. Hill - 2018 - TimeSheetEntries				
Date	Tasks	Time	Hourly Rate	Lodestar
1/13/18	Doc review - Sunoco productions	2.5	\$400.00	\$1,000.00
1/19/18	Doc review - Sunoco productions	1.4	\$400.00	\$560.00
2/18/18	E. Koelling docs produced by Sunoco - doc review/dep prep	1.3	\$400.00	\$520.00
2/20/18	Doc review for E. Koelling depo	2.1	\$400.00	\$840.00
2/27/18	Prep for E. Koelling depo	1.6	\$400.00	\$640.00
	Correspond with PR/DP re E. Koelling depo	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
2/28/18	Analyze PR/DP memos re [REDACTED]; prep for depo - hot doc analysis	2.8	\$400.00	\$1,120.00
2/28/18	Travel to Houston for Sunoco Depo; meet & prep w/ PR for depo	4.2	\$400.00	\$1,680.00
3/1/18	final prep work for E. Koelling depo; attend depo; Travel back to Austin	8.5	\$400.00	\$3,400.00
3/5/18	Review DP/PR memos re [REDACTED]	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
3/9/18	Review E. Koelling depo transcript for [REDACTED]	1.4	\$400.00	\$560.00
4/1/18	Analyze [REDACTED]	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
4/25/18	Evaluate D. McClure corresp. Re 30b6	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
4/27/18	Analyze D. McClure correspondence re discovery issues	0.8	\$400.00	\$320.00
5/3/18	Review PJ correspondence to D. McClure re discovery issues	0.3	\$400.00	\$120.00
5/9/18	Analyze search term proposal in D. McClure email	0.4	\$400.00	\$160.00
5/12/18	Review D. McClure email/spreadsheet re search terms	0.8	\$400.00	\$320.00
6/2/18	Review recent D. McClure correspondence re discovery; PJ responses; document review of Sunoco productions	2.5	\$400.00	\$1,000.00
6/7/18	Review D. McClure discovery correspondence	0.3	\$400.00	\$120.00
6/20/18	Correspondence re Motion to Compel	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
6/25/18	Evaluate privilege claims/review motion to strike	0.8	\$400.00	\$320.00
6/28/18	Review Court Orders/updated schedule	0.3	\$400.00	\$120.00
7/12/18	Review Sunoco filings - mtn for reconsideration	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
9/17/18	Doc review - Sunoco data productions	2.1	\$400.00	\$840.00
9/20/18	Review Sunoco objections to 30(b)(6) notice	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
10/2/18	Analyze/annotate Sunoco Opp. to Mtn to Compel	1.25	\$400.00	\$500.00
10/10/18	Review Order on Mtn to Compel; analyze Sunoco confidentiality brief	0.6	\$400.00	\$240.00
10/16/18	Doc review - Sunoco call logs	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
10/17/18	Revisions to Opp. to Sunoco confidentiality motion	0.4	\$400.00	\$160.00
10/29/18	Review DP memo re [REDACTED]	0.3	\$400.00	\$120.00
11/2/18	Review timing in Amended Sched. Order	0.2	\$400.00	\$80.00
TOTAL (2018)		40.85	\$400.00	\$16,340.00

<u>Cline v. Sunoco</u>				
C. Hill - 2019 - TimeSheetEntries				
Date	Tasks	Time	Hourly Rate	Lodestar
4/2/19	Analyze Sunoco Expert Report - Krause	1.5	\$400.00	\$600.00
7/19/19	Review PR [REDACTED]	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
8/13/19	Analyze Sunoco Opp. to Class Cert. Mtn, share feedback	1.2	\$400.00	\$480.00
9/4/19	Review/provide comments/revisions re Class Cert reply	1.8	\$400.00	\$720.00
10/4/19	Analyze class cert order	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
10/5/19	Legal research/draft revisions re: Class Notice plans/motion	2.3	\$400.00	\$920.00
10/9/19	Review DP Memo re [REDACTED]; prepare thoughts on Rule 23(f) appeal strategy/briefing	0.4	\$400.00	\$160.00
10/12/19	Update memo/comments re [REDACTED]	0.8	\$400.00	\$320.00
10/14/19	Review/provide feedback re Class Notice brief	0.4	\$400.00	\$160.00
10/19/19	Analyze & annotate Sunoco (1) Rule 23(f) Petition & (2) MSJ	2.2	\$400.00	\$880.00
11/2/19	Review Court Orders re Class Notice & Sunoco Mtn to Stay	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
	Review D. McClure correspondence; expert reports	1.5	\$400.00	\$600.00
11/4/19	Review BEB/PL memos	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
11/7/19	Work on [REDACTED] for trial prep session next week	1.5	\$400.00	\$600.00
11/8/19	Work on/provide feedback re: [REDACTED] for week of trial prep sessions	0.8	\$400.00	\$320.00
11/10/19	Review DP Memo/discuss issues raised w team	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
11/11/19	Review BEB Memo	0.4	\$400.00	\$160.00
	Case strategy & trial prep session with O&G team	3.5	\$400.00	\$1,400.00
11/12/19	Case strategy & trial prep session with O&G team	4	\$400.00	\$1,600.00
11/13/19	Case strategy & trial prep session with O&G team	4.5	\$400.00	\$1,800.00
11/14/19	Case strategy & trial prep session with O&G team	2.5	\$400.00	\$1,000.00
11/17/19	Analyze BEB Memo re [REDACTED]	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
	Research re [REDACTED] prepare Memo outlining [REDACTED]; circulate to DP/BEB/SW, follow-up corresp. Re same	3.2	\$400.00	\$1,280.00
11/18/19	Review/provide feedback re class definition / sunoco motion to clarify	0.6	\$400.00	\$240.00
11/30/19	Review Court Order re class definition; analyze/evaluate Sunoco objections to exhibits, depositions, witnesses	1.2	\$400.00	\$480.00
12/2/19	Provide comments/feedback to team re trial briefs	0.5	\$400.00	\$200.00
12/7/19	Analyze supplemental info re Sunoco experts - Krause data	0.8	\$400.00	\$320.00
TOTAL (2019)		38.6	\$400.00	\$15,440.00

<u>Cline v. Sunoco</u>				
C. Hill - 2020 - TimeSheetEntries				
Date	Tasks	Time	Hourly Rate	Lodestar
1/26/20	Annotate trial transcripts for closing argument prep / post-trial issues	1.5	\$600	\$900
3/10/20	Strategy mtg w/ team re [REDACTED]	1.2	\$600	\$720
3/12/20	Analyze Sunoco supp. Post-trial brief	0.4	\$600	\$240
6/11/20	Review DP Memo re [REDACTED]	0.5	\$600	\$300
6/12/20	Research & prepare memo re [REDACTED]	2.4	\$600	\$1,440
6/29/20	Discuss post-verdict class notice/claims process research - team mtg.	0.5	\$600	\$300
8/17/20	Review/analyze/annotate Court's Opinion & Order	0.5	\$600	\$300
9/14/20	Review/discuss Bond Memo	0.5	\$600	\$300
TOTAL (2020)		7.5	\$600	\$4,500



James E. Warner III
Attorney Timesheet

Cline v. Sunoco, Inc. (R&M)
 6:17-cv-00313-JAG
 (E.D. Okla.)

DATE	ACTIVITY	TIME
10/9/18	Draft response to motion for judicial approval of deposition designations	7.0
10/22/18	Draft motion to file under seal and proposed order granting same	.5
1/10/19	Review and revise draft motion to modify scheduling order and proposed order	.4
1/10/19	Draft proposed agreed protective order	4.0
1/11/19	Revise draft of third amended scheduling order	.3
1/15/19	Draft supplemental exhibits in support of motion for class certification	5.0
4/9/19	Draft motion for extension of time due to opioid trial	3.0
5/9/19	Draft unopposed motion for extension of deadlines	.5
8/4/19	Draft opposition to defendants' motion to file oversized brief	1.0
8/8/19	[REDACTED]	2.0
8/9/19	[REDACTED]	7.0
8/12/19	Draft response to motion to dismiss for lack of subject matter jurisdiction	5.0
8/12/19	Research re: standard for dismissal for lack of subject matter jurisdiction	1.5
8/12/19	Research re: [REDACTED]	4.0
8/16/19	Draft response to motion to dismiss	5.0
8/19/19	Revise response to motion to dismiss per edits by D. Pate	1.5
8/23/19	Draft motion to file documents under seal and proposed order	.4
8/23/19	Review and revise draft reply in support of class certification	3.0
8/28/19	Review draft response to motion to exclude testimony B. Ley	4.0

James E. Warner III Cline v. Sunoco, Inc. (R&M)

Timesheet

8/29/19	Draft motion to file Ex. 5 to response brief under seal	.3
9/12/19	Research regarding objections to filing surreply	1.0
10/3/19	Review order granting class certification	1.0
10/3/19	Review order denying motion to dismiss	1.5
11/1/19	Draft response to supplemental notice	.5
11/1/19	Revise response to supplemental notice	.2
11/4/19	Draft response to motion to stay	8.0
11/4/19	Research of cases that have denied motions to stay	4.0
11/5/19	Draft response to motion to file reply	1.5
11/13/19	Office conference regarding pretrial briefs and research needed	.5
11/14/19	Review draft brief regarding whether 6% or 12% interest rate applies to damages under PRSA	1.0
11/19/19	Review and revise response to motion to clarify	4.0
12/2/19	Telephone conference with P. Jantzen regarding drafting proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law	1.0
12/3/19	Draft proposed conclusions of law	5.0
12/4/19	Same	2.0
12/5/19	Same	3.0
12/10/19	Revise draft proposed conclusions of law	1.5
12/13/19	Same	3.0
12/12/19	Perform cite check of draft conclusions of law	4.0
2/24/20	Draft response to post-trial brief	4.0
2/27/20	Same	2.5
4/13/20	Research [REDACTED]	2.0
8/18/20	Review opinion by court	4.0
8/30/20	Research [REDACTED]	1.5
9/3/20	Research [REDACTED]	2.5
10/8/20	Cite check response to motion for new trial	4.0
2/20/21	Research regarding enforcement of judgment in federal court	7.0
11/2/21	Telephone conference with firm regarding enforcement of judgment and post-appeal issues	.7
11/30/21	Draft motion for costs and bill of costs	5.0
12/2/21	Draft motion for stay of deadline to file motion for attorney's fees	1.5

James E. Warner III Cline v. Sunoco, Inc. (R&M)

Timesheet

12/3/21	Review and revise motion for stay per edits by D. Pate and S. Whatley	.5
12/3/21	Draft motion for hearing on assets and order in accordance with Oklahoma law	1.0
12/3/21	Telephone conference with P. Jantzen regarding enforcement of judgment	.5
12/11/21	Revise motion to stay re: attorney fee deadline per edits by B. Beckworth, D. Pate and R. Post	.6
1/3/22	Draft reply in support of motion for hearing on assets	1.5
1/10/22	Research [REDACTED]	2.0
2/2/22	Draft notice to court and order setting hearing regarding assets	.7
2/8/22	Review and revise draft of motion to approve form and manner of notice regarding motion for attorney's fees	2.5
2/8/22	Review and revise draft motion and brief for statutory fees and costs	2.0
2/10/22	Telephone conference with P. Jantzen and N. Hall regarding enforcement of judgment and filing statement of judgment	1.5
2/11/22	Draft motion to strike motion to modify plan of allocation and enter order under Rule 58	2.0
2/13/22	Revise motion to strike per edits/comments by B. Beckworth	5.0
2/20/22	Same	6.0
2/21/22	Same	2.0
2/21/22	Review and revise response to objection to document production by P. Jantzen	1.5
2/22/22	Continue research on recoverable costs under Oklahoma law	2.5
2/22/22	Revise motion to strike per edits by B. Beckworth	2.0
2/22/22	Draft response to Defendants' motion to modify and issue Rule 58 order	3.0
2/23/22	Same	4.5
2/24/22	Revise draft response to Defendants' motion to modify and issue Rule 58 order per edits by R. Post	.8
2/24/22	Review Defendants' motion to enjoin enforcement proceedings	.7
2/24/22	Draft motion to strike Defendants' motion to enjoin enforcement proceedings	3.5
2/25/22	Continue drafting motion to strike Defendants' motion to enjoin enforcement proceedings	2.0

James E. Warner III Cline v. Sunoco, Inc. (R&M)

Timesheet

2/26/22	Draft response to Defendants' motion to enjoin enforcement proceedings	5.5
2/27/22	Review and revise draft motion to strike Defendants' motion to enjoin enforcement proceedings	1.5
2/28/22	Review and edit draft Motion to Approve Form and Manner of Notice & Approve Proposed Schedule, and accompanying exhibits thereto (Postcard Notice and Publication Notice)	.6
3/2/22	Review and edit draft motion to file under seal	1.7
3/3/22	Draft order granting Motion to Approve Form and Manner of Notice & Approve Proposed Schedule	1.1
3/4/22	Review drafts of Motion for Statutory Costs and Fees Pursuant to the PRSA in the Stipulated Amount of \$5,000,000.00; Motion to: (1) Approve Form and Manner of Notice to the Certified Class of Class Counsel's Motion for Attorney's Fees and Litigation Expenses, and Class Representative's Motion for Case Contribution Award Pursuant to Rule 23(h); and (2) Approve Proposed Schedule; and proposed order	1.2
3/7/22	Draft alternate order regarding attorney fee schedule	.5
3/7/22	Research re: Tenth Circuit decisions addressing two-step process for awarding attorney's fees in class action cases	.7
3/7/22	Edit proposed order granting Motion to: (1) Approve Form and Manner of Notice to the Certified Class of Class Counsel's Motion for Attorney's Fees and Litigation Expenses, and Class Representative's Motion for Case Contribution Award Pursuant to Rule 23(h)	.4
3/7/22	Review Defendants' response to motion to strike motion to alter/amend judgment	1.0
3/8/22	Attend office conference regarding reply to Defendants' response to motion to strike motion to alter/amend judgment	.5
3/8/22	Draft reply to Defendants' response to motion to strike motion to alter/amend judgment	3.1
3/9/22	Draft reply to Defendants' response to motion to strike motion to enjoin enforcement proceedings	5.1
6/2/22	Draft notice to court regarding expiration of stay on enforcement proceedings	.6
7/12/22	Draft motion to withdraw	2.3

James E. Warner III Cline v. Sunoco, Inc. (R&M)

Timesheet

7/13/22	Research [REDACTED]	1.3
7/20/22	Draft statement of judgments for execution in Oklahoma and Beckham counties	.5
8/16/22	Draft response to Defendants' objection to order requiring judgment debtor to appear and answer concerning assets	2.0
8/23/22	Draft response to Defendants' objections to magistrate order requiring production of documents	4.3
8/24/22	Research [REDACTED]	2.5
8/24/22	Revise draft response to Defendants' objections to magistrate order requiring production of documents pursuant to edits by DP and NH	1.5
8/25/22	Draft notice to court regarding Defendants' motion for administrative stay	.4
8/26/22	Research [REDACTED]	5.7
8/27/22	Draft memorandum regarding [REDACTED]	3.5
8/30/22	Draft notice to court regarding Defendants' emergency application for stay in US Supreme Court	.5
8/31/22	Edit [REDACTED]	.5
9/1/22	Review and edit draft notice of non-compliance	.8
10/5/22	Review and edit draft response to Defendants' sur-reply in response to draft report and recommendation	.5
10/12/22	Review and edit draft response to Defendants' motion to deposit funds into court registry	.3
10/13/22	Draft notice to court regarding creation of judgment fund	.5
10/17/22	Draft garnishment summons for Range Resources, LLC—Appalachia	.3
10/20/22	Review and revise draft notice to court regarding creation of judgment fund pursuant to edits by BB	.5
11/18/22	Review and edit draft response to Defendants' motion to dismiss garnishment proceedings	.6
11/22/22	Draft response to Defendants' objections to magistrate's findings and recommendation	3.1

James E. Warner III Cline v. Sunoco, Inc. (R&M)

Timesheet

12/19/22	Draft unopposed notice to court regarding updated schedule for filing motion for attorney's fees and issuance of notice	.6
12/21/22	Draft notice of dismissal of garnishment proceedings and withdrawal of motion for default	.5
1/3/23	Draft attorney declaration in support of motion for attorney's fees and costs	.7
1/3/23	Draft motion for reimbursement of litigation expenses	2.1
1/9/23	Update draft motion for reimbursement of litigation expenses	.9
1/12/23	Draft proposed order granting motion for reimbursement of litigation expenses	1.1
	TOTAL	237.9

**Robert Winn Cutler
Cline Sunoco Hours**

Date	Description	Hours
8/21/19	Edit Response to Defs Motion to Dismiss	0.75
10/3/19	Edit Motion to Compel	0.25
10/30/19	Depo designations	3
11/1/19	Depo designations	3
11/3/19	Letter to Mediator - Escheat	4.5
11/11/19	Trial Preparation	6.25
11/12/19	Trial Preparation	5.5
11/13/19	Trial Preparation	6.5
11/14/19	Trial Preparation	5.75
11/19/19	Resp to Mtn to Clarify	6.5
11/22/19	Def Exhibit List Objections	3
11/25/19	Def Exhibit List Objections	1
11/25/19	Call Opt Outs	2
11/26/19	Def Exhibit List Objections	1
11/26/19	Call Opt Outs	2.5
12/3/19	Motion for Leave Resp	3.5
12/4/19	Tr. Brief - Punitives	4.25
12/4/21	Depo quote pull	2.5
12/5/19	Tr. Brief - Compound Interest	3.5
12/5/19	Kraus Mtn to Strike	3
12/6/19	Tr. Brief - Punitives	4.5
12/6/19	Tr. Brief - Compound Interest	1
12/9/19	Opt Out Correspondence	1
12/10/19	Krause Reply	1
12/11/19	Pocket Br re Adequate Remedy	1.5
12/12/19	Pocket Br re Proceeds	0.5
12/13/19	Opt Out Correspondence	0.5
12/15/19	Pocket Br re Proceeds	0.5
12/15/19	Trial Prep	6

12/16/19 Trial	12
12/17/19 Trial	12
12/18/19 Trial	12
12/19/19 Trial	6
1/27/20 Post Trial Br	1.5
2/5/20 Post Trial Br	4
2/6/20 Post Trial Br	5.75
2/7/20 Post Trial Br	3.5
2/10/20 Post Trial Br	6.25
2/11/20 Post Trial Br	7
2/12/20 Post Trial Br	4
2/16/20 Post Trial Br	1
2/17/20 Post Trial Br	2.5
2/18/20 Post Trial Br	2
2/20/20 Post Trial Resp. Br	3.25
2/24/20 Post Trial Resp. Br	4.75
2/27/20 Post Trial Resp. Br	3
2/28/20 Post Trial Resp. Br	2
3/16/20 Review Responses to Trial Briefs	0.5
8/3/20 Depo video/transcript location	1.5
8/6/20 Depo video/transcript location	1
8/7/20 Depo video/transcript location	0.5
10/5/20 Resp to Mtn for New Trial	0.5
10/7/20 Resp to Mtn for New Trial	5.5
10/8/20 Resp to Mtn for New Trial	1.5
TOTAL	188.25

Ross Leonoudakis - Hours for Cline v. Sunoco		
Date	Description	Hours
8/19/19	Review Response to Defs Motion to Dismiss	0.5
9/26/19	Research and Draft Motion to Compel - pay data	3.5
10/1/19	Resarch and draft - motion to compel pay data	4.25
10/3/19	Resarch and draft - motion to compel pay data	2.25
10/14/19	Motion for Partial SJ - PRSA	5
10/15/19	Motion for Partial SJ - PRSA	4
10/17/19	Motion for Partial SJ - PRSA	3
10/18/19	Motion for Partial SJ - PRSA	2.5
10/23/19	Mediation Statement	6.25
10/24/19	Mediation Statement	3.25
10/30/19	Mediation Statement	4.5
11/1/19	Mediation Statement	5
11/2/19	Letter to Mediator - Escheat	3
11/3/19	Letter to Mediator - Escheat	2.5
11/4/19	Mediation Statement	2.25
11/5/19	Reply ISO SJ	4
11/6/19	Reply ISO SJ	3.25
11/7/19	Reply ISO SJ	2.5
11/11/19	Trial Preparation	6.25
11/12/19	Trial Preparation	7.5
11/13/19	Trial Preparation	8.25
11/14/19	Trial Preparation	6.75
11/15/19	Review - Presumption of mkt title and 12% interest	1
11/19/19	Objections to Witness List	2
11/20/19	Objections to Witness List	2.25
11/26/19	Call Opt Outs	2
12/3/19	Trial Brief - Choice of Law unclaimed property	5
12/4/19	Trial Brief - Choice of Law unclaimed property	4
12/6/19	Trial Brief - Choice of Law unclaimed property	2.5
12/6/19	Call Opt Outs	2.25
12/9/19	Draft - motion for sanctions	3
12/10/19	Draft - motion for sanctions	2.5
12/14/19	Trial Prep	15
12/15/19	Trial Prep	13.5
12/16/19	Trial	12.5
12/17/19	Trial	13.25
12/18/19	Trial	12
12/19/19	Trial	6.75
2/25/20	Post Trial Briefing	4.25
2/27/20	Post Trial Briefing	5
3/16/20	Review Responses to Trial Briefs	1.5
5/28/21	Research into jurisdictional issues	2.25

6/14/21	Research into jurisdictional issues	0.75
4/1/21	Research into record related to unclaimed prpty and marketable title	1.5
	TOTAL HOURS	205

Brooke Churchman Cline v. Sunoco - Time		
Date	Detail	Time
7/16/18	Meeting; Miscellaneous	2.75
7/30/18	Depositions; Research	13.75
8/6/18	Miscellaneous	2.75
8/13/18	Miscellaneous	13.75
8/27/18	Correspondence; Discovery	11.00
9/10/18	Research; Draft/Edit/Revise/Final Correspondence	8.25
9/17/18	Research	2.75
9/24/18	Discovery	11.00
10/1/18	Discovery	8.25
TOTAL		74.25

<u>Cline v. Sunoco</u>		
N. Hall - Time in Case (By Task)		
Date	Time	Tasks
8/19/19	3.50	review / edit response to MTD (12/b/1/) ("pickoff")
8/21/19	1.00	review / edit response to MTD (12/b/1/) ("pickoff")
10/28/19	0.50	proof / edit status report re: class notice and request for status conference
11/4/19	2.75	proof / edit response to motion to stay (appeal)
11/7/19	0.50	proof / edit Reply ISO Summary Judgment
11/14/19	0.25	concerence call / mtg. on "6 v. 12" burden issue
11/14/19	8.25	research / drafting "6 v. 12" pretrial brief
11/15/19	0.50	editing "6 v. 12" pretrial brief
11/18/19	4.50	research / drafting unclaimed propoerty law servey
12/3/19	2.75	editing "6 v. 12" pretrial brief
12/4/19	2.75	editing "6 v. 12" pretrial brief
2/17/20	5.00	edit /proof / cite check FOF/COL
2/18/20	4.00	edit /proof / cite check FOF/COL
2/23/20	4.00	research for post-trial response brief
2/24/20	6.00	research / drafting post-trial response brief
2/25/20	5.00	research / draft / edit post-trial resp. brief
2/27/20	3.25	edit / cite check post-trial response brief
3/10/20	1.00	conference / research on fee issues
6/8/20	2.00	research on jurisdictional impact / timing of fee request (trial court vs. appellate)
6/8/20	5.00	research / drafting memo on jurisdictional impact / timing of fee request (trial court vs. appellate)
6/10/20	4.00	research / review substantive fee law in 10th circuit /OK
6/11/20	3.25	research / conference /mtg. to discuss class axn. Fee law
6/16/20	1.50	research post-judgment class-action fee law / procedure
6/17/20	1.50	follow-up research on timing of fee request / procedural mechanism
6/17/20	2.15	research post-judgment class-action fee law / procedure
6/18/20	1.50	research post-judgment class-action fee law / procedure
6/19/20	2.10	drafting motion to suspend cost and fee deadlines
6/24/20	1.70	research post-judgment class-action fee law / procedure
6/25/20	0.75	research post-judgment class-action fee law / procedure
6/29/20	2.50	research / drafting memo on post-judgment class action procedure
6/29/20	0.70	research OK fee law / editing Motion to Suspend Fee and Cost deadlines
6/30/20	0.50	Call with Gensler on post-judgment procedure
6/30/20	1.50	editing motion to suspend cost and feed deadlines
7/1/20	1.40	editing motion to suspend cost and feed deadlines
7/6/20	3.50	editing motion to suspend cost and feed deadlines / researching costs recoverable under PRSA
7/21/20	0.50	Call with Gensler on post-judgment procedure
8/25/20	0.50	editing / revising motion to suspend cost and feed deadlines
8/31/20	0.50	editing / revising motion to suspend cost and feed deadlines
9/3/20	0.50	conference calls re superseadeas-bond issues
9/3/20	0.70	review memo on supersedeas-bond issues
9/8/20	0.50	conference call re: plan of allocation
9/8/20	0.70	reviewing / editing Proposed Plan for Distribution
9/8/20	1.00	drafting / revising proposed order on Motion to Stay Fee & Cost issues
9/23/20	0.50	call on reply to Obj. to Plan of Distribution
9/24/20	3.75	research / drafting Reply ISO Plan of Allocation
9/25/20	2.00	edit reply ISO Plan of Distribution
9/28/20	2.80	edit / finalize reply ISO Plan of Distribution (and accompanying docs (Mtn to seal; PO))
9/29/20	2.50	drafting proposed order on plan of allocation / distribution
9/30/20	0.75	editing proposed order on Plan of Allocation
10/1/20	1.20	review / edit response to motion to file sur-reply (Dkt. No. 328)
10/6/20	5.00	researching / drafting / revising response to motion for new trial
10/8/20	3.50	editing / revising / cite-checking response to motion for new trial
11/16/20	4.75	research / drafting notice re premature appeals
11/24/20	0.25	review Notice re Sunoco's premature appeals
1/20/21	0.75	research on updating notice to class members
5/31/21	0.50	research on waiver argument
6/14/21	0.60	research on continuing jdxn of trial court during appeal
11/1/21	0.75	discussion of 10th Circuit's dismissal order
11/29/21	0.75	review of Sunoco's drafe Motion for Stay of Execution Pending Appeal
11/30/21	0.50	conference call re: post-judgment execution procedure
12/3/21	0.50	conference call re: appeallate developments (denile of MTN to stay mandate) and post-judgement procedure
12/23/21	0.10	review e-mail regarding strategy on mandamus response
1/10/22	0.25	conference call re: issues related to continuning appeal attempts
2/8/22	1.00	review / edit Mtn to Approve Form / Manner of Notice
2/9/22	0.80	review of draft Sunoco motion to modify the plan of allocation order (and e-mail exchange related thereto)
2/10/22	0.50	conference call re: Sunoco's draft motion to modify plan of allocation
2/10/22	1.50	conference call re: post-judgement execution procedure; Statement of Judgment process
2/12/22	0.20	e-mail communication re Statement of Judgment
2/15/22	0.30	review e-mail communication re: fee issues / procedures
2/17/22	0.10	review e-mail re: pending motion to stay execution; asset hearing / briefing
2/24/22	0.75	draft Declaration in Support of Motion for Statutory Fees
2/25/22	0.50	edit / review declaration in support of Motion for Statutory Fees and e-mail to Susan
3/3/22	2.00	research / call w/ James re: § 842 procedure
3/3/22	0.25	draft e-mail mem re: research into §842 procedure with corporate defendants
4/28/22	2.00	Review Sunoco cert petition
4/28/22	0.30	review e-mail analysis of cert petition by appellate counsel
6/27/22	0.75	Emails / discussion re response to Sunoco appeals and motion for injunction pending appeal
6/28/22	3.50	researching /drafting for irreparable injury section of response to Sunoco's Motion for Injunction
6/29/22	2.00	drafting irreparable injury section of response to Sunoco's Motion for injunction

6/29/22	0.50	edit irreparable injury section for response to Sunoco's Motion for Injunction / e-mail to co-counsel
6/30/22	0.50	discussion on 10th circuit's order re jdxnl briefing on new appeals
8/4/22	0.50	Review Sunoco reply ISO cert
8/4/22	0.40	review 10th Circuit Orders dismissing appeals
8/5/22	1.00	meeting to discuss execution strategy
8/22/22	2.00	review prior research on post-judgment collection process
8/24/22	0.20	research timing of execution process under federal rules
8/24/22	0.50	conference call on response to OBJ. to producing docs for asset hr'g
8/24/22	1.50	edit response to OBJ. to producing docs for asset hr'g
8/25/22	0.20	e-mails regarding notice to DC of Stay Motion filed in 10th
8/25/22	3.00	research re garnishment [REDACTED]
8/27/22	4.50	research / e-mail correspondence re federal garnishment process / strategy
8/29/22	0.50	research / draft e-mail regarding impact of [REDACTED] on pending appeals
8/29/22	0.50	research / review draft application for writ of execution
8/31/22	1.00	research / review / edit drat application for writ of execution
9/1/22	1.00	team conference re Sunoco post-judgment proceedings (execution / asset hr'g)
9/1/22	1.00	review documents Sunoco produced for asset hearing
9/8/22	1.25	research regarding corporate witnesses at asset hearing / Sunoco objections to withholding banking information
9/9/22	3.00	review / edit proposed R&R for asset hr'g
9/12/22	10.00	asset hearing / travel
9/16/22	6.00	research re sunoco's 60(b)(6) appeal
9/20/22	2.50	research / draft reply ISO proposed R&R
9/21/22	6.60	research / draft reply ISO proposed R&R
9/21/22	1.75	revise reply ISO proposed R&R / draft revised R&R
9/22/22	1.00	conference call w/ co-counsel re remaining appellate issues
9/22/22	1.50	revise / finalize / file reply ISO proposed R&R and revised R&R
9/27/22	3.50	research 10th cir. 60(b)(6) precedents
9/30/22	4.00	research 10th cir. 60(b)(6) precedents
10/3/22	9.00	preparing / filing garnishment forms (affidavits / requests for summons)
10/4/22	6.00	research 10th cir. 60(b)(6) precedents / e-mail memo to co-counsel
10/5/22	0.40	edit response to Sur-Reply re proposed R&R
10/6/22	1.70	coordinate service of garnishment materials with co-counsel
10/7/22	1.00	edit proofs of service re garnishment materials
10/10/22	0.75	research on [REDACTED] garnish [REDACTED]
10/10/22	1.50	draft papers from Judgment Admin. Re establishment of judgment fund
10/11/22	5.50	review / edit Brief of Appellee on 60(b)(6) appeal
10/12/22	2.00	draft response to emerg. Motion to Deposit Funds
10/25/22	0.25	Hearing with Judge West re Motion to Deposit Funds
10/31/22	0.60	review memo on [REDACTED] garnishment [REDACTED]
11/1/22	2.00	research next steps in garnishment proceedings / e-mail regarding proposed strategies
11/1/22	3.00	draft [REDACTED], motion for order (notice of default), and proposed order
11/2/22	1.00	revise / finalize motion for order (notice of default) and proposed orders
11/3/22	0.25	e-mail re [REDACTED] garnishment [REDACTED]
11/3/22	0.45	review sunoco reply on 60(b)(6) appeal
11/30/22	1.20	call w/ Defendant re garnishment and pending motions / discuss and draft proposal
12/14/22	1.00	concerence call re remaining post-judgment briefing
12/21/22	0.50	review dismissal of garnishment proceedings and notice of withdrawal of pending motion (notice of default)
1/9/23	1.00	discuss / review / edit class notices
1/10/23	7.00	research / draft brief ISO fee motion
1/11/23	4.00	research / draft brief ISO fee motion
1/12/23	3.50	research / draft brief ISO fee motion
1/16/23	6.00	research / draft brief ISO fee motion
1/18/23	0.75	editing brief ISO fee motion
1/20/23	1.00	call with Susan to discuss fee briefing / proposed order; editing brief ISO fee motion per discussion
	265.35	TOTAL

Week of	Day	Cline v. Sunoco - Jessica Underwood Time	Daily Hours
8/29/22			
		Review and revise draft list of misrepresentations 8/31/22 for use by appellate counsel.	0.7
9/5/22			
		9/7/22 Asset Hearing Prep Conference Call	1
10/10/22			
		Revise and finalize response to emergency 10/12/22 motion; prepare for filing.	3.7
10/24/22			
		Prepare for and attend hearing with Judge West 10/25/22 re: motion to deposit funds.	0.4
11/21/22			
		Review outline for motion to strike/response to 11/22/22 motion to enjoin garnishment proceedings; research.	2.3
		Email correspondence re: motion to strike and 11/23/22 response to motion to enjoin.	0.4
		Draft motion to strike motion to enjoin 11/27/22 garnishment proceedings.	3.1
11/28/22			
		Draft response to motion to enjoin garnishment 11/28/22 proceedings; revise motion to strike motion to enjoin; research.	11.4
		Revise motion to strike and response to 11/29/22 incorporate team edits; prepare for filing; prep for hearing on garnishment/execution motions.	4.2
TOTAL			27.2

Eastern District of Oklahoma

Paralegal

Date	Activity	Time
8/10/17	Save Plaintiff's First Set of Requests for Production of Documents, Requests for Admission, and Interrogatories to Defendants	0.25
8/10/17	Save Plaintiff's First Set of Requests for Production of Documents, Requests for Admission, and Interrogatories to Defendant Sunoco, Inc. (R&M)	0.25
8/10/17	Draft - Edit and finalize Plaintiff's First Set of Requests for Production of Documents, Requests for Admission, and Interrogatories to Defendant Sunoco Inc. (R&M)	2
8/10/17	Draft - Edit and finalize Plaintiff's First Set of Requests for Production of Documents, Requests for Admission, and Interrogatories to Defendant Sunoco Partners Marketing & Terminals, LP	2
8/21/17	Draft - Appearance of Counsel - Andrew G. Pate	0.75
8/21/17	Draft - Appearance of Counsel - Brad Beckworth	0.75
8/21/17	Draft - Appearance of Counsel - Jeff Angelovich	0.75
9/15/17	N. Cameron draft and save email with First Discovery Requests to Defendants	0.25
9/15/17	Save Plaintiff's First Set of Requests for Production of Documents, Requests for Admission, and Interrogatories to Defendant Sunoco Inc. (R&M)	0.25
9/15/17	Save Plaintiff's First Set of Requests for Production of Documents, Requests for Admission, and Interrogatories to Defendant Sunoco Partners Marketing & Terminals, LP	0.25
9/15/17	Draft - Edit, organize and finalize Plaintiff's First Set of Requests for Production of Documents, Requests for Admission, and Interrogatories to Defendant Sunoco Partners Marketing & Terminals, LP	1
10/11/17	Draft - Edit and finalize Cline_Sunoco Scheduling Order (Plaintiff's Proposed)- Attached to 10-11-17 Joint Status Report & Emailed to Court	1
10/12/17	Save Defendants' email to Court	0.25
10/12/17	N. Cameron draft and save email to Court with Plaintiff's Proposed Scheduling Order	0.25
10/16/17	Save Sunoco's Objections, Responses and Answers to Plaintiff's First Set of Requests for Production of Documents, Requests for Admission and Interrogatories	0.25
10/23/17	Draft - Edit, organize and finalize Plaintiff's Proposed Scheduling Order	1.5
10/27/17	Save Plaintiff's Initial Disclosures	0.25
11/22/17	Save Email from D. McClure serving Sunoco's First Requests for Production and Sunoco Partners' First Set of Interrogatories and calendar response date	0.5
11/22/17	Save Sunoco's First Set of Interrogatories to Plaintiff Perry Cline	0.25
11/22/17	Save Defendants' First Set of Requests for Production of Documents to Plaintiff Perry Cline	0.25
11/28/17	Save letter from R. Cole Letter to D. Pate with Production - Bates Nos. SUN-CL-000001 - SUN-CL-000433	0.25
12/4/17	Production - Download and Save 2017-11-28- Production - Bates Nos. SUN-CL-00000001 - SUN-CL-00000433	1
12/12/17	Save letter from R. Cole to D. Pate with Production - Bates Nos. SUN-CL-000434 - SUN-CL-001330	0.25

12/15/17	Production - Download and Save 2017-12-12- Production - Bates Nos. SUN-CL-00000434 - SUN-CL-00001324	1.5
12/15/17	Production - Download and Save 2017-12-12- Production - Bates Nos. SUN-CL-00001325 - SUN-CL-00001330	1
1/5/18	Save Plaintiff's Production in Response to Defendants' First Request for Production	0.75
1/5/18	Save Perry Cline's Verification for Answers to Defendants' First Set of Interrogatories	0.25
1/5/18	Save Plaintiff Perry Cline's Answers and Objections to Defendants' First Set of Interrogatories	0.25
1/5/18	Save Plaintiff Perry Cline's Responses and Objections to Defendants' First Set of Requests for Production of Documents	0.25
1/5/18	Draft - Edit, organize and finalize Plaintiff Perry Cline's Answers and Objections to Defendants' First Set of Interrogatories	1
1/5/18	Draft - Edit, organize and finalize Plaintiff Perry Clines' Responses and Objections to Defendants' First Set of Requests for Production of Documents	1
1/8/18	Production - Save 2018-01-05 Plaintiff's Production in Response to Defendants' First Request for Production - Bates Nos. PLC-000001 - PLC-000063	1
1/17/18	Save letter from D. Pate to Defendants re Inadequate Discovery Responses	0.25
1/17/18	N. Cameron draft and save email to Counsel with Letter re Inadequate Discovery Responses	0.25
1/17/18	Draft - Edit, organize and finalize Exhibit A- Rule 30(b)(6) Notice with DP edits (Final) (Emailed as Attachment to Letter)	0.75
1/17/18	Draft - Edit and finalize Ltr - D. Pate to Defendants re Inadequate Discovery Responses	0.25
1/22/18	Save email from P. Jantzen to Defendants with Cline Verification for First Set of Interrogatories.	0.25
1/22/18	Save letter from P. Jantzen to Sunoco re December Checks to Perry Cline	0.25
1/25/18	Save email from P. Jantzen to D. McClure inquiring about response to January 22, 2018 Letter	0.25
1/25/18	Save letter from D. McClure to Paula Jantzen in response to her January 22, 2018 Letter	0.25
1/26/18	Save letter from Sunoco re Discovery Issues Response Letter to January 17, 2018 Letter	0.25
2/1/18	Save letter from D. McClure to D. Pate enclosing SUN-CL-001331 - 001341 (Replacements for 001325 - 001330)	0.25
2/2/18	Production - Save Production Letter from 02/01/2018	0.25
2/12/18	Production - Save Plaintiff's Privilege Log	0.25
2/14/18	N. Cameron draft and save email to Counsel serving Deposition Notice for Eric Koelling	0.25
2/14/18	Save and calendar Notice of Intention to take Oral:Video Deposition of Eric Koelling	0.5
2/14/18	Draft - edit and finalize Notice of Intention to take Oral:Video Deposition of Eric Koelling; serve, set up court reporter	1.5

2/15/18	N. Cameron draft and save email to Counsel serving Deposition Notice for Alice Holland	0.25
2/15/18	Save and calendar Notice of Intention to take Oral:Video Deposition of Alice Holland	0.5
2/15/18	Draft - edit and finalize Notice of Intention to take Oral:Video Deposition of Alice Holland; serve, set up court reporter	1.5
2/15/18	Production - Save 2018-02-12 Plaintiff's Supplemental Production in Response to Defendants' First Request for Production - Bates Nos. PLC-000064 - PLC-000172	1
3/7/18	Save depo rough draft - Eric Koelling	0.25
3/12/18	Download deposition transcripts, save and log- Eric Koelling	1
3/19/18	Save Defendants' Amended Answers to Interrogatory Numbers 2, 3, and 6	0.25
4/11/18	Save Koelling errata sheet	0.25
7/10/18	Transcript - Order and save Hearing on Plaintiff's Motion to Strike the Transcript - Order and save Defendants' Privilege Log	0.75
7/23/18	Save email - P. Jantzen-D. McClure-P. Ryan thread re Need for Meet and Confer	0.25
8/3/18	Save email from R. Cole serving Amended Responses to Plaintiff's First and Second Set of Requests for Production	0.25
8/20/18	Annotate Deposition of A. Jones in DepoSmart	2.5
8/21/18	Annotate Deposition of A. Jones in DepoSmart	2
8/21/18	Save Annotation Report - Austin Jones	0.25
9/2/18	Draft - Edit and finalize Plaintiff Perry Cline's Responses and Objections to Defendants' Second Set of Interrogatories	1
9/5/18	N. Cameron draft and save email serving Plaintiff Perry Cline's Responses and Objections to Defendants' Second Set of Interrogatories	0.25
9/5/18	Save Plaintiff Perry Cline's Responses and Objections to Defendants' Second Set of Interrogatories	0.25
9/13/18	Save email regarding September 20, 2018 deposition - start time, topics, etc	0.25
9/14/18	Save depo rough draft - Kathy Warren	0.25
9/18/18	Save depo rough draft - Patricia Redding	0.25
9/19/18	Save Defendants' Objections to Plaintiff's September 6, 2018 Amended Notice of Rule 30(b)(6) Deposition of Defendants	0.25
9/20/18	Save email from D. McClure serving Defendant Sunoco Partners and Sunoco Inc.'s, now Sunoco (R&M), Answers to Plaintiff's Third Set of Interrogatories	0.25
9/20/18	Save Defendants' Answers to Plaintiff's Third Set of Interrogatories	0.25
9/24/18	Save email from N. Cameron sending D. Pate Letter to Defendants re Call Log Production	0.25
9/24/18	Save letter from D. Pate to Defendants re Call Log Production	0.25
9/24/18	Save signature page, errata sheet, confidential designations - Austin D. Jones	1
9/24/18	Draft - Edit and finalize Ltr - D. Pate to Defendants re Call Log Production	0.5
9/26/18	Draft - Edit, finalize and file Notice of Firm Name Change	0.5
10/2/18	Download deposition transcripts, exhibits, videos and save and log- Patricia Redding	2
10/5/18	Transcript - Order and save Hearing on Motion to Compel	0.75

10/8/18	Draft - Edit, finalize and file Draft - Edit, finalize and file Entry of Appearance - Brooke Churchman	0.75
10/9/18	Download deposition transcripts, save and log- Kathy Warren	1
10/9/18	Download deposition transcripts, exhibits, videos and save and log- Demi Lanceslin	2
10/9/18	Download deposition transcripts, save and log- Eric Koelling	1
10/22/18	Work on and Finalize Exhibit 1 - Austin Jones Depo Excerpt	0.75
10/22/18	Create cover sheet- Exhibit 2 - Cover Sheet- To Be Filed Under Seal	0.25
10/22/18	Work on and Finalize ExhibitExhibit 2- Filed Under Seal - A. Jones Deposition (CONFIDENTIAL portions Highlighted)	1
10/22/18	Draft and finalize Order Granting Motion for Leave to File Exhibits Under Seal; email to Court	0.75
10/22/18	Draft - Edit, organize and finalize Plaintiff's Response in Opposition to Sunoco's Motion for Judicial Approval of Confidential Designation of 30(b)(6) Deposition Excerpts and Brief in Support; file	2
10/22/18	Draft - Edit and finalize Unopposed Motion for Leave to File Exhibits Under Seal; file	1
12/14/18	Save email from R. Marcum to Counsel with Austin Jones' Deposition Changes and Confidential Designations	0.25
12/14/18	Save email from R. Marcum to Counsel with Terry Oakley's Deposition Changes and Confidential Designations	0.25
12/14/18	Save email regarding confidential designations - Austin Jones (Afternoon)	0.25
12/14/18	Save two emails regarding Oakley's confidential designations	0.25
1/7/19	Production - Save 2019-01-02 Production Bates No. SUN-CL-00021486	0.75
1/11/19	Draft - Edit and finalize (Proposed) Third Amended Scheduling Order	1
1/11/19	Draft - Edit and finalize Plaintiff's Unopposed Motion to Modify Second Amended Scheduling Order; file	2
1/28/19	Save email from P. Jantzen to Counsel with Dropbox link to Barbara Ley Expert Report	0.25
1/28/19	Save final draft of Barbara Ley Expert Report; serve final version	0.5
4/1/19	Download deposition transcripts, save and log- Austin Jones (Afternoon)	1
4/1/19	Download deposition transcripts, save and log- Austin Jones (Morning)	1
4/1/19	Save depo transcripts - Terry Oakley	0.5
4/1/19	Download deposition transcripts, save and log- Barbara Ley	1
4/23/19	Save Eric Krause depo summary	0.25
4/26/19	N. Cameron draft and save email to Court with Proposed Order Granting Plaintiff's Motion for Extension of Time	0.25
4/26/19	Draft - Edit and finalize (Proposed) Order Granting Plaintiff's Motion for Extension of Time; email to Court	1
4/26/19	Draft - Edit and finalize Plaintiff's Motion for Extension of Time; file	1
5/15/19	Save Eric Krause errata sheet	0.25
6/14/19	Draft - Edit, organize, add tables and finalize Motion to Certify Class, to Appoint Class Representative, and to Appoint Class Counsel and Brief in Support	4

6/21/19	Save email from D. McClure to Counsel with Sunoco Defendants' Amended Answers to Interrogatory Numbers 2, 3, and 6 originally served on 03-19-2018	0.25
8/2/19	NC draft and save email to Court and Counsel with Dial-in Information for August 5, 2019 Status Conference with Court	0.25
8/14/19	Save letter from D. McClure to Judge Gibney sending a copy of Appendix of Exhibits to Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Motion to Certify Class and Certain Exhibits to be Filed Under Seal.	0.25
8/22/19	Draft - Edit, organize, help gather exhibits and finalize Plaintiff's Response in Opposition to Defendants' Motion to Dismiss for Lack of Subject Matter Jurisdiction and Brief in Support and Exhibits	6
8/23/19	Draft - Edit and finalize Notice to Court; file	1
8/28/19	Draft - Edit, organize, help gather exhibits and finalize Plaintiff's Opposition to Defendants' Motion to Exclude the Reports and Opinions of Plaintiff's Proposed Expert Barbara A. Ley and Exhibits	6
9/3/19	Draft - Draft, edit and finalize Notice to the Court re Exhibit 5 re de-designation; file	1
9/17/19	Save letter from P. Ryan to Judge Gibney re courtesy copies	0.25
9/28/19	Draft - Edit and finalize Plaintiff's Opposition to Defendants' Motion to Exclude the Reports and Opinions of Plaintiff's Proposed Expert Barbara A. Ley; file	1
10/14/19	Save email from D. Pate and D. McClure email thread re Sunoco Data	0.25
10/14/19	Draft - Edit and finalize Status Report re Meet and Confer on the Form and Manner of Notice	1.5
10/16/19	NC draft letter to Judge Gibney sending Courtesy Copies of Filings	0.25
10/29/19	Save email from D. McClure to Court & Counsel with Proposed Order re Defendants' Motion to Strike or Continue Class Representative's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment	0.25
11/20/19	Save email from B. Kellogg to Counsel with Exhibits 9, 11, and 12 (To Be Filed Under Seal) to Docket 177	0.25
11/26/19	Save email from D. McClure to Court re Defendants' Summaries of Designated Depositions and Objections to Plaintiff's Trial Exhibits	0.25
11/26/19	Save letter from D. McClure to Court re Defendants' Summaries of Designated Depositions and Objections to Plaintiff's Trial Exhibits	0.25
11/27/19	N. Cameron draft and save email to Counsel sending Notice of Intention to take Oral_Video Deposition of Eric Krause.	0.25
11/27/19	Save depo notices and calendar - Epperson and Krause	0.5
11/27/19	Draft - Draft and finalize Notice of Intention to take Oral_Video Deposition of Eric Krause; serve, set up court reporter; calendar	2
12/4/19	Save email from Teka Stephens (Courtroom Deputy) to Attorneys regarding Trial Details	0.25
12/11/19	Transcript - Order and save Pre-Trial Hearing (Telephonic)	0.75
3/2/20	N. Cameron draft and save letter to Judge Gibney sending Courtesy Copies of Filings	0.25
3/2/20	Draft letter - N. Cameron to Judge Gibney sending Courtesy Copies of Filings; print documents for sending; organize, tab and bind	2

5/5/20	Draft - Edit and finalize Class Representative's Notice Regarding Reconsideration and Reversal of Opinion in the Case Sunoco Relied upon for Its Supplemental Post-Trial Brief; file	1
6/17/20	Transcript - Save Closing Arguments Transcript	0.25
8/24/20	Draft - Finalize Exhibit A - Sunoco - Declaration of B. Ley in Support of Plaintiff's Notice Regarding Total Updated Damages Pursuant to Court Order (Dkt. 299)	0.75
8/24/20	Draft - Finalize Exhibit B - Sunoco - Email thread regarding Calculations	0.75
8/24/20	Draft - Finalize Exhibit C - Sunoco - Email regarding Notice	0.75
8/24/20	Draft - Finalize and file Notice Regarding Total Updated Damages Pursuant to Court Order (Dkt. 299)	1
8/27/20	Transcript - Order and save Hearing - Miscellaneous	0.75
9/8/20	N. Cameron draft and save email to Court sending proposed order granting Joint Motion to Stay Proceedings on Attorney Fees and Costs Pending Appeal	0.25
9/8/20	Draft - Finalize and file Class Counsel's Proposed Plan for Distribution of Damages Award Pursuant to Court Order (Dkt. 299)	1
9/8/20	Draft - Finalize and email to Court Proposed Order on Dkt. No. 316 (Joint Motion to Stay Proceedings on Attorney Fees and Costs Pending Appeal)	0.75
9/8/20	Draft - Finalize Exhibit 1 - Declaration of Barbara A. Ley in Support of Proposed Allocation, including Exhibit 1	0.25
9/8/20	Draft - Finalize and file Joint Motion to Stay Proceedings on Attorney Fees and Costs Pending Appeal	0.25
9/24/20	Save email from D. McClure to Court with Proposed Orders regarding Dkt. 322 and Dkt. 323	0.25
9/28/20	N. Cameron draft and save email to Court sending proposed order granting Motion for Leave to File Exhibit 5 to Class Representative's Reply in Support of Proposed Plan for Distribution of Damages Award and Exhibit 5 (to be Filed Under Seal)	0.25
9/28/20	Draft - Finalize and email to Court - (Proposed) Order Granting Motion for Leave to File Under Seal Exhibit 5 to Class Representative's Reply in Further Support of the Proposed Plan for Distribution of Damages Award	0.5
9/28/20	Draft - Finalize and file Class Representative's Reply in Further Support of the Proposed Plan for Distribution of Damages Award; gather and organize exhibits, finalize exhibits for filing; create cover sheet for exhibit to be filed under seal; draft Motion for Leave to file exhibit under seal and file	5
10/1/20	N. Cameron to Court (Teka Stephens) submitting Proposed Order re Plan for Distribution of Damages Award (Dkt. 317)	0.25
10/1/20	Draft - Finalize and file Class Representative's Response to Defendant's Motion for Leave to File Sur-Reply (Dkt. 328)	0.75
10/1/20	Draft - Finalize and email to Court Proposed Order re Plan for Distribution of Damages Award	0.75
10/8/20	Draft - Edit and Finalize Class Representative's Response to Sunoco Defendants' Motion to Alter or Amend the Judgment; file	1.5
10/8/20	Draft - Edit, add tables, finalize and file Class Representative's Response to Defendants' Motion for New Trial	3

11/25/20	Save email from D. McClure to Court with Proposed Orders re Motion for New Trial and Motion to Alter-Amend Judgment (Dkt347 & Dkt348)	0.25
11/25/20	Save to our File - Defendants' Proposed Order Granting Motion for New Trial Following Plan of Allocation	0.25
11/25/20	Save to our File - Defendants' Proposed Order Granting Motion to Alter or Amend the Judgment Following Plan of Allocation	0.25
1/12/21	Draft and save letter from D. Pate to P. Cline	0.25
1/22/21	Draft and save letter from D. Pate to P. Cline	0.25
12/13/21	Draft - Edit and Finalize Opposed Motion to Set Deadlines; file	1
12/13/21	Draft - Finalize and email to Court Proposed Order re Opposed Motion to Set Deadlines	0.25
2/3/22	Draft - Finalize and email to Court Proposed Order Setting Hearing	0.25
2/3/22	Draft - Edit and Finalize Notice to Court; file	0.75
2/9/22	Email to Court sending Attorneys' Phone Numbers for Hearing	0.5
3/7/22	Draft - Edit and Finalize Motion to Approve Form & Manner of Notice and Set Briefing Schedule; file	1.5
3/7/22	Draft - Finalize and email to Court Proposed Order Granting Manner of Notice and Set Scheduling Order	0.25
3/7/22	Draft - Edit and Finalize Motion for Statutory Costs and Fees; file	0.75
4/12/22	Save to our File - Memo re Procedures for Settlement Conference	0.5
6/21/22	Draft - Edit and Finalize Supplemental Brief re Motion to Approve Form & Manner of Notice and Set Briefing Schedule; file	1
6/21/22	Draft - Finalize and email to Court Proposed Order Granting Manner of Notice and Set Scheduling Order	0.5
7/20/22	Save to our File - J. Ryan email re Options	0.5
8/24/22	Draft - Edit and Finalize Response to Objection to Order re Hearing and Production of Documents; file	1.25
8/25/22	Draft - Edit and Finalize Notice to Court of Motion to Stay with Exhibit; file	1
8/31/22	Draft - Edit and Finalize Response to Defendants Notice to Court re Supreme Court Motion to Stay; file	0.75
9/2/22	Draft - Finalize and email to Court Proposed Order Granting Motion to Seal re Notice	0.5
Multiple	Calendar of Deadlines	4

TOTAL: 134.25

M. Gomez		
Cline v. Sunoco- Time Record		
Date	Description	Time
2/14/18	Document Production log	0.2
3/12/18	Printed Documents for Deposition	1
5/17/18	Calendared and filed on Box Deposition Notice	0.1
5/22/18	Sunoco Production, extract and log	1
6/1/18	Sunoco Production, extract and log	1
6/7/18	Admin. Hotel reservation and confirmation for deposition	0.15
6/11/18	Admin. Hotel reservation and confirmation for Class Resp	0.1
7/9/18	Saved Document Production	1
7/10/18	Email re_ gathering document production sent to B. Ley	1
7/13/18	Saved Correspondence to Box	0.1
7/16/18	Deposition Scheduled court reporter and video	0.15
7/25/18	Saved and logged Discovery	0.3
7/26/18	Draft, finalized and served via Email Plaintiff's First Amended Notice of Rule 30(b)(6)	0.3
7/26/18	Research Defense privilege log for attorney	0.35
7/26/18	Saved Document Production	1
8/1/18	Extracted and saved Document Production	1
8/12/18	Printed Documents for Attorney review	0.3
9/6/18	Calendared and filed on Box confidentiality depo designations correspondence	0.15
10/12/18	Saved Document Production	1
10/20/18	Saved, logged to Box and mailed transmittal letter and flashdrive to B. Ley's review	0.3
10/23/18	Pint, Cal, upload to Box deposition notices	0.15
10/24/18	Spreadsheet review- looking for "interest"	4
10/26/18	Production link to B. Ley for her review	0.15
8/28/19	Search production for exhibits (check stubs)	0.15
10/10/19	Class Cert Spreadsheet meeting and began spreadsheet review	3
10/11/19	Filed CLASS REPRESENTATIVE'S MOTION TO APPROVE THE FORM AND MANNER OF CLASS NOTICE	2
10/29/19	Saved Plaintiff's expert reports	0.1
11/4/19	Saved Epperson Expert Report to Box	0.1
11/18/19	Correspondence saved to Box	0.1
12/2/19	Calendared Deposition for B. Ley	0.1
12/3/19	Saved Expert Report to Box	0.1
12/6/19	Finalized and filed punitive damages trial brief	1
12/18/19	Downloaded files for Trial from B. Ley	0.3
12/15/19	Sunoco Demonstratives Printed	0.3
12/15/19	Trial travel, prep, print, gathered exhibits, etc	60
12/17/19	Confidential designation highlighted and saved to Box.	1
1/30/20	Invoices to be paid	0.35
2/26/20	Check requests	0.3
3/17/20	Check requests	0.3
3/30/20	Saved research on Box re_2nd circuit fee case	0.15
6/9/20	Lexis Research cases	0.35
6/19/20	Letter mailed to Court RE_Flashdrives	1
8/6/20	Created a flashdrive for defense	0.35
8/22/20	Saved subpoena research to Box	0.15

8/28/20	News update	1
11/23/20	Email DP RE_client update	0.15
12/2/21	Help gather time records for BB	4
12/3/21	Create zoom call	0.15
1/25/22	Email DP Re_Client case update	0.15
2/24/22	Draft/finalize/File - CLASS REPRESENTATIVE'S RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO DEFENDANTS' OPPOSED MOTION TO MODIFY THE PLAN OF ALLOCATION ORDER AND ISSUE A RULE 58 JUDGMENT	5
2/25/22	Saved word draft of Classs rep response in opposition to Defs. Opposed moiton to modifythe plan of allocation order and issue a rule 58 Judgment to Litify	0.15
2/25/22	5/25/22 Printed and email copy to the court Classs rep response in opposition to Defs. Opposed moiton to modifythe plan of allocation order and issue a rule 58 Judgmen	1
3/1/22	Time Records keeping	2
3/2/22	Search docket	0.3
3/2/22	Draft/Finalize - Reponse in Opposition to Defendants' Motion to Enjoin Enforcement of the Judgment and Any Action in Support therefo and Brief in Support	2
3/7/22	Email DP RE_client update	0.15
3/7/22	Filed - Class Representative's Motion for Statutory Costs and Fees, Class Representative's Motion to: (1) Approve Form and Manner of Notice to the Certified Class of Class Counsel's Motion for Attorney's Fees and Litigation Expenses, and Class Representative's Motion for Case Contribution Award Pursuant to Rule 23(h); and (2) Approve Proposed Schedule and Proposed Notice and Briefing Order	2
3/7/22	Emailed court proposed order	0.15
5/2/22	DP Check request	0.2
7/6/22	Printed dkt. 425 for attorney review	0.1
8/30/22	Saved research memo to Litify	0.15
9/19/22	Reasearch project in document production in Sunoco Statements	6
10/5/22	Filed - CLASS REPRESENTATIVE'S RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' SUR-REPLY IN RESPONSE TO PLAINTIFF'S DRAFT REPORT AND RECOMMENDATION	1
11/18/22	Emailed from DP Regarding filing _ CLASS REPRESENTATIVE'S OMNIBUS RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTIONS TO DISMISS GARNISHMENT PROCEEDINGS	0.3
11/22/22	Subpoena service research for Robert M. Ricciuti	0.3
1/10-12/2023	Gathered Documents for expert review	5

TOTAL 117.25

Cline v. Sunoco		
Shelley Prince - Time		
Date	Detail	Minutes
2017-03-16	Check Request - Matlin Petroleum - Inv. 0217-12	10
2017-06-05	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2017-07-07	Petition - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-14	Dkt001 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-14	Dkt002 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-15	Dkt003 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-15	Dkt004 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-16	Dkt005 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-16	Dkt006 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-16	Dkt007 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-16	Dkt008 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-17	Dkt009 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-17	Dkt010 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-17	Dkt011 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-17	Dkt012 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-17	Dkt013 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-17	Dkt014 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-17	Dkt015 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-17	Dkt016 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-17	Dkt017 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-18	Dkt018 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-18	Dkt019 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-21	Dkt020 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-21	Dkt021 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-21	Dkt022 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-08-21	Dkt023 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-09-01	Dkt024 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-09-05	Dkt025 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-09-27	Dkt026 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-10-10	Dkt027 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-10-10	Dkt028 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-10-12	Dkt029 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-10-12	Dkt030 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-10-23	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2017-10-23	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2017-10-23	Dkt031 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-10-23	Dkt032 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-10-25	Dkt033 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-11-07	Dkt034 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-11-08	Dkt035 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2017-11-28	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10

2018-03-06	Check Request - Cody Hill - Travel	10
2018-03-13	Check Request - Lexitas - E. Koelling - Transcript (3/1/18)	10
2018-03-13	Check Request - Lexitas - E. Koelling - Video (3/1/18)	10
2018-03-27	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2018-04-02	Check Request - Lexitas - A. Holland - Transcript	10
2018-04-03	Check Request - Lexitas - A. Hollard - Video	10
2018-06-04	Dkt036 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-06-05	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2018-06-18	Dkt037 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-06-19	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2018-06-25	Check Request - Professional Reporters - Perry Cline - Transcript	10
2018-06-26	Dkt038 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-06-27	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2018-06-27	Dkt039 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-06-27	Dkt040 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-06-27	Dkt041 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-06-27	Dkt042 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-06-28	Dkt043 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-06-28	Dkt044 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-06-28	Dkt045 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-06-29	Dkt046 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-06-29	Dkt047 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-07-03	Dkt048 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-07-09	Dkt049 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-07-10	Dkt050 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-07-10	Dkt051 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-07-12	Dkt052 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-07-13	Dkt053 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-07-16	Dkt054 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-07-18	Check Request - Drew Pate - Copies	10
2018-07-18	Check Request - Drew Pate - Copies	10
2018-07-18	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2018-08-07	Check Request - Brooke Churchman - Travel	10
2018-08-07	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2018-08-14	Check Request - Lexitas - 30(b)(6) Transcript	10
2018-08-14	Check Request - Lexitas - A. Jones - Video	10
2018-08-20	Check Request - Ken Sidwell - Copy of Hearing Transcript	10
2018-09-10	Dkt055 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-09-11	Dkt056 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-09-11	Dkt057 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-09-12	Dkt058 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-09-12	Dkt059 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-09-12	Dkt060 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-09-12	Dkt061 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-09-12	Dkt062 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5

2018-09-21	Dkt063 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-09-24	Dkt064 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-09-25	Dkt065 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-09-26	Check Request - Drew Pate - Postage (295.97) *	10
2018-09-26	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2018-09-26	Dkt066 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-09-28	Dkt067 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-01	Dkt068 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-01	Dkt069 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-01	Dkt070 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-02	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2018-10-02	Check Request - Lexitas - E. Koelling - Transcript (9/20/18)	10
2018-10-02	Dkt071 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-03	Dkt072 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-05	Dkt075 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-08	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 23407	10
2018-10-08	Check Request - Lexitas - S. Widener - Transcript	10
2018-10-08	Dkt073 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-08	Dkt074 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-09	Dkt076 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-10	Check Request - Lexitas - D. Lanceslin - Transcript	10
2018-10-10	Check Request - Lexitas - D. Lanceslin - Video	10
2018-10-10	Check Request - Lexitas - E. Koelling - Transcript (9/20/18)	10
2018-10-10	Check Request - Lexitas - E. Koelling - Video (9/20/18)	10
2018-10-10	Check Request - Lexitas - K. Warren - Transcript	10
2018-10-10	Check Request - Lexitas - K. Warren - Video	10
2018-10-10	Check Request - Lexitas - P. Redding - Transcript	10
2018-10-10	Check Request - Lexitas - P. Redding - Video	10
2018-10-11	Dkt077 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-17	Check Request - Assured Civil Process Agency - D. McClure	10
2018-10-22	Dkt078 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-22	Dkt079 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-23	Dkt080 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-24	Dkt081 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-10-30	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2018-10-31	Dkt082 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-11-01	Dkt083 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2018-11-06	Check Request - Lexitas - E. Koelling - Transcript	10
2018-11-06	Check Request - Lexitas - E. Koelling - Video	10
2018-11-07	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2018-11-13	Check Request - Professional Reporters - Perry Cline - Transcript	10
2018-11-19	Check Request - Professional Reporters - Terry Oakley - Transcript	10
2018-11-19	Check Request - Professional Reporters - Terry Oakley - Video	10
2018-11-27	Check Request - Professional Reporters - Austin Jones - Video	10
2018-11-27	Check Request - Professional Reporters - Austin Jones Transcript	10

2019-01-09	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 23682	10
2019-01-11	Dkt084 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-01-14	Dkt085 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-03-11	Check Request - Matlin Petroleum - Inv. 24	10
2019-03-11	Check Request - Matlin Petroleum - Inv. 33	10
2019-03-12	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2019-03-18	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 23868	10
2019-03-20	Check Request - Professional Reporters - Barbara Ley - Transcript	10
2019-04-09	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 23960	10
2019-04-15	Check Request - Derek Gilliland - Travel	10
2019-04-26	Dkt086 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-04-29	Check Request - Professional Reporters - E. Krause - Transcript (4/1	10
2019-04-29	Check Request - Professional Reporters - E. Krause - Video (4/11/19	10
2019-05-02	Dkt087 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-05-06	Dkt088 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-05-06	Dkt089 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-05-06	Dkt090 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-05-15	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 24221	10
2019-05-21	Check Request - Derek Gilliland - Travel	10
2019-06-14	Dkt091 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-06-14	Dkt092 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-06-17	Dkt093 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-06-17	Dkt094 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-06-18	Dkt095 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-06-19	Dkt096 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-07-09	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 24316	10
2019-07-18	Dkt097 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-07-23	Check Request - Matlin Petroleum - Inv. 90	10
2019-07-31	Dkt098 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-07-31	Dkt099 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-05	Dkt100 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-05	Dkt101 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-05	Dkt102 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-08	Dkt103 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-14	Dkt104 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-14	Dkt105 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-14	Dkt106 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-14	Dkt107 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-16	Dkt108 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-22	Dkt109 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-23	Dkt110 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-27	Dkt111 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-28	Dkt112 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-28	Dkt113 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-08-28	Dkt114 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5

2019-08-30	Dkt115 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-09-03	Dkt116 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-09-05	Dkt117 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-09-10	Dkt118 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-09-11	Dkt119 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-09-12	Dkt120 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-09-16	Dkt121 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-02	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 24605	10
2019-10-03	Dkt122 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-03	Dkt123 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-03	Dkt124 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-03	Dkt125 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-03	Dkt126 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-03	Dkt127 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-03	Dkt128 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-03	Dkt129 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-04	Dkt130 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-08	Dkt131 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-10	Dkt132 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-10	Dkt133 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-10	Dkt134 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-11	Dkt135 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-11	Dkt136 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-14	Dkt137 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-14	Dkt138 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-15	Dkt139 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-15	Dkt140 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-17	Dkt141 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-18	Dkt142 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-18	Dkt143 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-25	Dkt144 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-28	Dkt145 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-29	Dkt146 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-30	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2019-10-30	Dkt147 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-30	Dkt148 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-30	Dkt149 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-30	Dkt150 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-30	Dkt151 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-30	Dkt152 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-30	Dkt153 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-30	Dkt154 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-31	Dkt155 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-31	Dkt156 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-10-31	Dkt157 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5

2019-10-31	Dkt158 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-01	Dkt159 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-01	Dkt160 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-05	Check Request - Ferguson Malouf Law PLLC - Mediation	10
2019-11-05	Check Request - Michael Medina - Travel	10
2019-11-05	Dkt161 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-06	Dkt162 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-06	Dkt163 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-07	Dkt164 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-07	Dkt165 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-11	Check Request - Matlin Petroleum - Inv. 128	10
2019-11-11	Dkt166 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-11	Dkt167 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-12	Dkt168 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-13	Dkt169 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-13	Dkt170 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-15	Dkt171 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-15	Dkt172 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-16	Dkt173 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-16	Dkt174 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-16	Dkt175 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-18	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 24760	10
2019-11-18	Dkt176 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-19	Dkt177 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-19	Dkt178 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-20	Check Request - Amy G. Hall - Training	10
2019-11-20	Check Request - Cody Hill - Meals for Team	10
2019-11-20	Dkt179 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-21	Dkt180 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-21	Dkt181 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-22	Dkt182 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-25	Dkt183 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-25	Dkt184 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-26	Check Request - Baker & Baker, Ltd. - Subpoena Service - Koelling	10
2019-11-26	Dkt185 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-26	Dkt186 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-26	Dkt187 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-26	Dkt188 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-26	Dkt189 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-26	Dkt190 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-26	Dkt191 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-26	Dkt192 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-26	Dkt193 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-11-30	FIRM PLANE EXPENSE	10
2019-12-02	Dkt194 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5

2019-12-02	Dkt195 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-02	Dkt196 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-03	Dkt197 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-03	Dkt198 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-03	Dkt199 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-04	Dkt200 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-04	Dkt201 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-05	Dkt202 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-05	Dkt203 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-05	Dkt204 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-05	Dkt205 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-05	Dkt206 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-05	Dkt207 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-05	Dkt208 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 24816	10
2019-12-06	Dkt209 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt210 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt211 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt212 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt213 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt214 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt215 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt216 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt217 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt218 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt219 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt220 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt221 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt222 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt223 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt224 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt225 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt226 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-06	Dkt227 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-09	Dkt228 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-09	Dkt229 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-09	Dkt230 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-09	Dkt237 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-10	Check Request - Almighty Moving Services	10
2019-12-10	Check Request - Brittany Kellogg - Printer Ink	10
2019-12-10	Check Request - Gilbert F. Halasz, OCR - Transcript - 12/6/19	10
2019-12-10	Check Request - Karla S. McWhorter - Transcript of motion hearing	10
2019-12-10	Check Request - Michael Medina - Travel	10
2019-12-10	Dkt231 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-10	Dkt232 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5

2019-12-10	Dkt233 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-10	Dkt234 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-11	Dkt235 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-11	Dkt236 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-11	Dkt238 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-11	Dkt239 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-11	Dkt240 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-13	Dkt241 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-13	Dkt242 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-13	Dkt243 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-13	Dkt244 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-13	Dkt245 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-13	Dkt246 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-13	Dkt247 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-15	Dkt248 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-16	Dkt249 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-16	Dkt250 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-16	Dkt251 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-16	Dkt252 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-16	Dkt253 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-17	Check Request - Matlin Petroleum - Inv. 160	10
2019-12-17	Check Request - Professional Reporters - K. Epperson - Transcript	10
2019-12-17	Dkt254 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-17	Dkt255 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-18	Dkt256 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-18	Dkt257 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-18	Dkt258 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-19	Check Request - Almighty Moving Services - moving fees	10
2019-12-19	Dkt259 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-19	Dkt260 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-23	Check Request - Brittany Kellogg - Supplies & Printing	10
2019-12-23	Check Request - Brittany Kellogg - Travel	10
2019-12-23	Check Request - Idox - Inv. 128464	10
2019-12-23	Check Request - Idox - Inv. 128565	10
2019-12-23	Check Request - Veritext - Eric Krause - Transcript	10
2019-12-23	Check Request - Veritext - Eric Krause - Video	10
2019-12-30	Dkt261 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2019-12-31	FIRM PLANE EXPENSE	10
2019-12-31	FIRM PLANE EXPENSE	10
2019-12-31	FIRM PLANE EXPENSE	10
2019-12-31	FIRM PLANE EXPENSE	10
2020-01-02	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 24848	10
2020-01-02	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 24896	10
2020-01-07	Check Request - Maria Gomez - Ground Transportation	10
2020-01-07	Check Request - Michael Medina - Supplies	10

2020-01-07	Check Request - Michael Medina - Travel	10
2020-01-07	Check Request - Ross Leonoudakis - Travel	10
2020-01-07	Dkt262 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-01-08	Check Request - Drew Pate - Postage (2088.25) *	10
2020-01-08	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2020-01-08	Check Request - Esquire Deposition Solutions	10
2020-01-08	Check Request - Winn Cutler - Entry of Appearance	10
2020-01-08	Check Request - Winn Cutler - Travel	10
2020-01-14	Dkt263 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-01-15	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 1966	10
2020-01-15	Dkt264 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-01-22	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2020-01-24	Dkt265 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-01-27	Check Request - Brad Beckworth - Travel	10
2020-01-27	Dkt266 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-01-27	Dkt267 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-01-27	Dkt268 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-01-27	Dkt269 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-01-27	Dkt270 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-02-04	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 1986	10
2020-02-04	Check Request - Karla S. McWhorter - Transcript of Non-Jury Trial	10
2020-02-10	Check Request - Ken Sidwell - Transcript	10
2020-02-12	Check Request - Legal-Graphics, Inc. -	10
2020-02-12	Check Request - Trey Duck - Travel	10
2020-02-17	Check Request - Matlin Petroleum - Inv. 166	10
2020-02-18	Dkt271 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-02-18	Dkt272 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-02-18	Dkt273 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-02-18	Dkt274 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-02-18	Dkt275 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-02-20	Dkt276 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-02-28	Dkt277 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-02-28	Dkt278 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-02-28	Dkt279 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-03-03	Check Request - Gilbert F. Halasz, OCR - Transcript - 12/11/19	10
2020-03-03	Check Request - Ross Leonoudakis - Entry of Appearance	10
2020-03-03	Check Request - Ross Leonoudakis - Meals	10
2020-03-10	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2079	10
2020-03-10	Dkt280 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-03-11	Check Request - Trial Exhibits, Inc. - Equipment & Shipping	10
2020-03-11	Dkt281 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-03-11	Dkt282 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-03-16	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 25119	10
2020-03-16	Dkt283 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-03-17	Dkt284 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5

2020-03-23	Dkt285 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-03-23	Dkt286 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-04-01	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2150	10
2020-04-15	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 25234	10
2020-05-05	Dkt287 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-05-05	Dkt288 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-05-06	Check Request - Issus Discovery	10
2020-05-06	Dkt289 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-05-14	Dkt290 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-05-27	Dkt291 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-06-09	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2174	10
2020-06-15	Dkt292 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-06-17	Dkt293 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-06-18	Dkt294 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-06-19	Dkt295 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-06-30	FIRM PLANE EXPENSE	10
2020-06-30	FIRM PLANE EXPENSE	10
2020-07-06	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2197	10
2020-07-06	Dkt296 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-07-07	Check Request - Shelley Otwell, RPR - Transcript - 6/17/20	10
2020-07-13	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 25513	10
2020-07-15	Check Request - American Express - Travel	10
2020-07-15	Check Request - American Express - Travel	10
2020-08-04	Check Request - Matlin Petroleum - Inv. 185	10
2020-08-07	Dkt297 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-11	Check Request - Issus Discovery	10
2020-08-17	Dkt298 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-17	Dkt299 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-24	Dkt300 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-24	Dkt301 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-25	Dkt302 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-25	Dkt303 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-26	Dkt304 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-27	Dkt305 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-27	Dkt306 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-27	Dkt307 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-27	Dkt308 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-27	Dkt309 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-27	Dkt310 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-27	Dkt311 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-08-28	Dkt312 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-01	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2222	10
2020-09-02	Dkt313 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-02	Dkt314 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-04	Dkt315 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5

2020-09-08	Dkt316 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-08	Dkt317 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-10	Dkt318 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-11	Dkt319 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-11	Dkt320 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-15	Check Request - Maria Gomez - Postage (8.09) *	10
2020-09-15	Check Request - Shelley Otwell, RPR - Transcript - 8/27/20	10
2020-09-22	Dkt321 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-23	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 25756	10
2020-09-24	Dkt322 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-24	Dkt323 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-28	Dkt324 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-28	Dkt325 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-29	Dkt326 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-09-30	Dkt327 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-01	Dkt328 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-01	Dkt329 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-02	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2243	10
2020-10-02	Dkt330 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-02	Dkt331 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-07	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 25833	10
2020-10-08	Dkt332 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-08	Dkt333 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-13	Dkt334 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-16	Dkt335 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-16	Dkt336 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-22	Dkt337 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-22	Dkt338 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-30	Dkt339 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-30	Dkt340 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-30	Dkt341 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-10-30	Dkt342 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-11-02	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2273	10
2020-11-03	Dkt343 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-11-16	Check Request - Matlin Petroleum - Inv. 201	10
2020-11-18	Dkt344 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-11-18	Dkt345 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-11-24	Dkt346 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-11-25	Dkt347 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-11-25	Dkt348 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-12-08	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2266	10
2020-12-09	Dkt349 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-12-09	Dkt350 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-12-09	Dkt351 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-12-09	Dkt352 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5

2020-12-09	Dkt353 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-12-21	Dkt354 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2020-12-21	Dkt355 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2021-01-05	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2273	10
2021-02-02	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2295	10
2021-03-01	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2316	10
2021-03-23	Dkt356 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2021-04-05	Check Request - Matlin Petroleum - Inv. 223	10
2021-04-06	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2350	10
2021-05-03	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2368	10
2021-05-03	Check Request - Matlin Petroleum - Inv. 225	10
2021-06-02	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2387	10
2021-07-07	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2410	10
2021-08-02	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2428	10
2021-09-07	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2447	10
2021-10-05	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 2465	10
2021-11-01	Dkt357 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2021-12-01	Check Request - Elevated Trial Services - Inv. 233	10
2021-12-01	Dkt358 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2021-12-07	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 002505	10
2021-12-13	Dkt359 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2021-12-13	Dkt360 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2021-12-21	Dkt361 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2021-12-27	Dkt362 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2021-12-27	Dkt363 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-01-07	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 002523	10
2022-01-10	Dkt364 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-01-10	Dkt365 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-01-11	Dkt366 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-01-25	Check Request - Matlin Petroleum - Inv. 261	10
2022-02-01	Check Request - Barbara Ley - Inv. 27160	10
2022-02-01	Check Request - Issus Discovery - Inv. 002526	10
2022-02-02	Dkt369 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-02-03	Dkt367 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-02-03	Dkt368 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-02-07	Dkt370 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-02-09	Dkt371 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-02-10	Dkt372 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-02-10	Dkt373 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-02-10	Dkt374 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-02-16	Check Request - Geoffrey P. Miller	10
2022-02-16	Dkt375 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-02-16	Dkt376 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-02-17	Dkt377 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-02-22	Dkt378 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5

2022-02-24	Dkt379 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-02-28	Dkt380 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-01	Dkt381 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-02	Dkt382 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-02	Dkt383 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-04	Dkt384 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-04	Dkt385 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-04	Dkt386 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-04	Dkt387 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-07	Dkt388 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-07	Dkt389 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-07	Dkt390 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-07	Dkt391 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-07	Dkt392 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-08	Dkt393 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-08	Dkt394 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-08	Dkt395 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-09	Dkt396 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-22	Dkt397 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-23	Dkt398 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-24	Dkt399 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-28	Dkt400 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-29	Dkt401 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-29	Dkt402 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-30	Dkt403 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-31	Dkt404 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-03-31	Dkt405 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-04-04	Dkt406 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-04-05	Check Request - Karla S. McWhorter	10
2022-04-06	Dkt407 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-04-29	Dkt408 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-04-29	Dkt409 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-04-29	Dkt410 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-04-29	Dkt411 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-04-29	Dkt412 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-04-29	Dkt413 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-05-03	Dkt414 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-05-16	Dkt415 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-05-16	Dkt416 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-05-16	Dkt417 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-06-01	Check Request - Drew Pate - Meal for Team	10
2022-06-02	Check Request - Barbara Ley	10
2022-06-03	Dkt418 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-06-09	Dkt419 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-06-14	Dkt420 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5

2022-06-21	Dkt421 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-06-24	Dkt422 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-06-24	Dkt423 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-06-24	Dkt424 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-07-06	Dkt425 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-07-08	Dkt426 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-07-11	Dkt427 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-07-13	Dkt428 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-08-04	Dkt429 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-08-09	Dkt430 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-08-23	Dkt431 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-08-24	Dkt432 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-08-25	Dkt433 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-08-26	Dkt434 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-08-30	Dkt435 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-08-31	Dkt436 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-08-31	Dkt437 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-09-02	Dkt438 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-09-02	Dkt439 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-09-07	Dkt440 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-09-09	Dkt441 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-09-12	Dkt442 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-09-12	Dkt443 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-09-12	Dkt444 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-09-13	Check Request - Nathan Hall - Printing	10
2022-09-13	Check Request - Nathan Hall - Travel	10
2022-09-19	Dkt445 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-09-19	Dkt446 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-09-20	Check Request - Karla S. McWhorter	10
2022-09-20	Check Request - Shelley Ottwell, RPR	10
2022-09-22	Dkt448 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-09-22	Dkt449 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-09-26	Dkt450 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-09-27	Dkt451 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt452 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt453 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt454 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt455 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt456 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt457 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt458 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt459 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt460 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt461 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt462 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5

2022-10-03	Dkt463 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt464 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt465 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt466 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt467 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt468 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt469 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt470 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt471 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt472 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt473 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt474 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt475 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt476 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt477 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt478 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt479 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt480 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt481 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-03	Dkt482 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-04	Dkt483 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-05	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2022-10-05	Dkt484 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-05	Dkt485 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt486 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt487 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt488 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt489 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt490 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt491 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt492 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt493 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt494 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt495 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt496 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt497 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt498 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt499 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-06	Dkt500 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-11	Dkt501 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-11	Dkt502 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-11	Dkt503 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-12	Dkt504 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-13	Dkt505 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-10-14	Dkt506 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5

2022-11-08	Dkt552 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt553 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt554 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt555 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt556 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt557 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt558 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt559 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt560 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt561 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt562 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt563 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt564 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt565 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt566 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt567 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt568 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt569 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt570 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt571 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt572 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt573 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-08	Dkt574 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-09	Dkt575 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-18	Dkt576 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-18	Dkt577 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-18	Dkt578 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-18	Dkt579 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-18	Dkt580 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-21	Check Request - Drew Pate - Travel	10
2022-11-22	Dkt581 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-22	Dkt582 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-23	Dkt583 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-23	Dkt584 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-28	Check Request - Assured Civil Process Agency	10
2022-11-29	Check Request - Joanna Smith, RPR	10
2022-11-29	Dkt585 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-29	Dkt586 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-29	Dkt587 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-29	Dkt588 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-29	Dkt589 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-29	Dkt590 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-29	Dkt591 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-29	Dkt592 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-29	Dkt593 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5

2022-11-29	Dkt594 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-29	Dkt595 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-30	Dkt596 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-30	Dkt597 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-30	Dkt598 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-11-30	Dkt599 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-12-01	FIRM PLANE EXPENSE	10
2022-12-01	Dkt600 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-12-05	Check Request - MJO Legal Process Services	10
2022-12-05	Dkt601 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-12-06	Check Request - Assured Civil Process Agency	10
2022-12-06	Check Request - Shelley Ottwell, RPR	10
2022-12-06	Dkt602 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-12-14	Dkt603 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-12-19	Dkt604 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-12-20	Dkt605 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-12-21	Dkt606 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2022-12-21	Dkt607 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2023-01-03	Dkt608 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2023-01-06	Dkt609 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2023-01-06	Dkt610 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2023-01-10	Dkt611 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
2023-01-11	Check Request - Geoffrey P. Miller	10
2023-01-12	Dkt612 - Formatted, Bookmarked, Circulated & Saved	5
	Minutes	4790
	TOTAL HOURS	79.833

Amanda Thompson
Cline Sunoco Time

Date	Activity	Time
4/30/18	Save correspondence	0.2
5/10/18	Save correspondence	0.2
5/23/18	Save correspondence	0.2
5/29/18	Save correspondence	0.2
6/4/18	Save & log production	0.5
6/5/18	Calendar Defendant response deadline	0.1
6/18/18	Calendar Reply deadline	0.1
7/6/18	Pull Exhibits for filing	1.0
7/9/18	Save & log discovery	0.5
7/11/18	Calendar Reply deadline	0.1
8/14/18	Send deposition exhibits to co-counsel	0.2
8/21/18	Calendar deposition; Make list of all current depositions	0.5
8/27/18	Edits/formatting to discovery responses	0.3
9/5/18	Schedule court reporters for depositions	0.5
9/5/18	Emails re amended deposition notices	0.3
9/10/18	Email court reporter amended deposition notices	0.1
9/11/18	Organize deposition prep folders	0.3
9/12/18	Email confirming deposition	0.1
9/17/18	Email confirming deposition	0.1
9/19/18	Email confirming deposition	0.1
10/1/18	Calendar Defendant discovery response date	0.1
10/3/18	Calendar Reply deadline	0.1
10/10/18	Calendar Response deadline	0.1
10/22/18	Emails regarding flash drive of production	0.2
10/23/18	Emails regarding flash drive of production	0.2
10/23/18	Draft deposition notice; serve deposition notice; schedule court reporter	1.0
10/24/18	Email confirming deposition	0.1
10/29/18	Email co-counsel deposition exhibits	0.2
10/29/18	Highlight confidential deposition designations for 3 depositions	1.0
10/29/18	Calendar Response deadline	0.1
10/30/18	Highlight confidential deposition designations	0.5

10/30/18	Email co-counsel deposition exhibits	0.2
11/5/18	Calendar dates from Amended Scheduling Order	0.4
11/19/18	Draft letter re supplemental accounting issues	0.4
11/19/18	Email co-counsel deposition exhibits	0.2
11/20/18	Serve correspondence re supplemental accounting issues; calendar deadline	0.2
8/19/19	Calendar Defendant Response deadline	0.1
9/3/19	Calendar Reply deadline	0.1
9/4/19	Serve correspondence re supplemental accounting and payment history production	0.2
10/10/19	Meeting re well project	0.5
10/10/19	Research wells in pay history	3.0
10/15/19	Email L. Beebe re well list	0.1
10/18/19	Edits to Motion & pull exhibits	1.00
10/18/19	Email to P. Jantzen with Motion & exhibits for filing	0.1
10/21/19	Draft letter; print and send courtesy copy of filing to judge	0.5
10/22/19	Save and log Amended Disclosures	0.2
10/24/19	Print B. Ley report	0.1
10/24/19	Emails to co-counsel re deposition exhibits	0.2
10/24/19	Log exhibits	4.0
10/24/19	Pull 10Ks for entities; send to B. Ley & A. Farr	0.6
10/25/19	Log exhibits	3.0
10/28/19	Log exhibits	2.5
10/29/19	Save deposition designations	0.2
10/30/19	Draft Appearance of Counsel for R. Leonoudakis	0.3
11/5/19	Check Exhibit log for specific exhibits	0.2
11/6/19	Highlight depositions designations	3.0
11/7/19	Save correspondence	0.1
11/7/19	Prepare Exhibits and file Reply	0.6
11/7/19	Draft cover letter, print and send courtesy copy to judge	0.5
11/8/19	Email to M. Medina re initial designations	0.1

11/11/19	Call to court reporter, download and save deposition video	0.3
11/15/19	Finalize motion for filing; file	0.5
11/18/19	Save defendant deposition designations	0.3
11/18/19	Download and save defendant's trial exhibits	0.5
11/18/19	Flag witness list	0.4
11/19/19	Pull exhibits for filing	0.5
11/19/19	Emails re filing	0.2
11/20/19	Draft cover letter, print and send courtesy copy to judge	0.5
11/21/19	Serve rebuttal exhibits	0.2
11/26/19	Emails with co-counsel re downloading exhibits	0.2
12/2/19	Email to A. Harmes with requested pleadings; print and mail courtesy copies of same	0.4
12/3/19	Download late payment spreadsheets; format; calls to printer; deliver to printer	2.0
12/3/19	Email to M. Medina re counter-designations	0.1
12/4/19	Download and save corrected expert report	0.1
12/6/19	Finalize and file pre-trial briefs	1.0
12/12/19	Download and save Requests for Exclusion	0.2

12/12/19	Emails and calls with co-counsel re bindres for late payment spreadsheets	0.3
12/13/19	Email to B. ley re updated Opt-Outs Report	0.1
12/15/19	Finalize and file declaration	0.5
12/18/19	Emails re updated exclusion spreadsheet; download and save updated spreadsheet; send to B. Ley	0.3
1/6/20	Organize exclusion spreadsheets	0.4
2/6/20	Emails re exclusion spreadsheet	0.2
2/18/20	Finalize and file declaration	0.5
2/18/20	Finalize and file FOF & Post-trial brief	1.0
2/19/20	Prepare word version of FOF	0.1
2/19/20	Save and email filings to group	0.2
2/20/20	Email re page limit for response brief	0.1
3/5/20	Call re royalty payments; email to D. Pate re update	0.3
11/23/20	Format notice	0.4
	TOTAL	43.6

Cline v. Sunoco
Brittany Kellogg Time

4/25/18	0.3	saved correspondence
5/7/18	0.1	logged production
6/1/18	0.2	saved correspondence
6/7/18	0.5	Trial prep
6/27/18	0.1	saved correspondence
6/27/18	0.2	Deposition logging
6/27/18	0.1	saved correspondence
6/28/18	0.1	saved correspondence
7/2/18	0.3	Expert prep
7/6/18	0.5	drafting/exhibit prep
7/6/18	0.2	Deposition logging
7/6/18	0.5	drafting/exhibit prep
7/11/18	0.25	drafting/exhibit prep
7/17/18	0.5	Deposition prep
7/16/18	0.1	Deposition prep
7/18/18	0.2	Deposition prep
7/18/18	0.1	Deposition prep
7/25/18	0.1	Deposition prep
8/1/18	0.1	Deposition prep
8/6/18	0.25	draft discovery shells
8/13/18	0.3	Deposition logging
8/14/18	0.5	invoice processing
8/17/18	0.25	production processing
8/17/18	0.5	drafting/exhibit prep
8/20/18	6	Trial Preparation
8/21/18	0.2	drafting/exhibit prep
8/21/18	1	filing
8/22/18	0.3	Deposition logging
8/27/18	0.5	discovery drafting
9/10/18	6	Draft/Edit/Revise/Final; Discovery
9/11/18	0.5	discovery drafting
9/11/18	0.2	Deposition prep
9/14/18	0.1	Deposition prep
9/17/18	2	Deposition Preparation
9/27/18	0.2	Deposition logging
9/28/18	0.1	saved correspondence
9/30/18	0.5	discovery drafting
10/12/18	0.2	saved correspondence
10/29/18	0.1	saved correspondence
10/29/18	1	Team meeting
11/1/18	0.1	saved correspondence
2/13/19	0.1	saved correspondence

4/23/19	0.1	saved correspondence
8/28/19	1	Expert report prep
8/20/19	0.1	research
9/16/19	0.1	saved correspondence
9/26/19	0.2	production processing
10/11/19	1	drafting/exhibit prep
10/18/19	0.5	class cert prep
10/24/19	0.1	production processing
10/31/19	0.2	production processing
11/6/19	4	Exhibit list prep
11/11/19	1	Trial prep
11/12/19	0.2	Exhibit list prep
11/13/19	0.2	Exhibit list prep
11/13/19	0.5	class member call
11/14/19	0.5	Trial prep
11/15/19	0.1	saved correspondence
11/19/19	1	trial exhibit prep
11/19/19	1	Expert prep
11/19/19	1	Expert report prep
11/19/19	3	drafting/exhibit prep
11/20/19	1	drafting/exhibit prep
11/20/19	0.5	rebuttal list
11/21/19	0.2	trial exhibit prep
11/21/19	0.5	witness prep
12/2/19	0.1	saved correspondence
12/4/19	1	drafting PHV
12/5/19	0.1	saved correspondence
12/5/19	0.1	saved correspondence
12/5/19	0.2	filing
12/6/19	1	trial brief prep
12/9/19	0.1	trial prep
12/9/19	0.1	saved correspondence
12/10/19	0.1	Trial prep
12/10/19	0.2	saved correspondence
12/10/19	1	trial prep
12/11/19	0.12	saved correspondence
12/12/19	0.5	trial exhibit prep
12/14/19	13	admin
12/15/19	14	trial prep
12/16/19	15.5	Trial
12/17/19	14.2	Trial
12/18/19	14.5	Trial
12/19/19	9.5	Trial
12/20/19	3.5	Trial
12/23/19	0.2	invoice processing

1/2/20	0.1	saved correspondence
1/3/20	1	FOF/COL
1/27/20	0.2	invoice processing
1/28/20	0.1	saved correspondence
1/28/20	0.2	court record preparation
3/9/20	0.5	court record preparation
5/7/20	1	FOF/COL
6/15/20	1	closing preparation
6/22/20	0.2	Team meeting
6/29/20	0.2	Team meeting
8/24/20	0.2	Team meeting
8/31/20	0.2	Team meeting
9/14/20	0.2	Team meeting
10/5/20	0.2	Team meeting
11/16/20	0.2	Team meeting
11/30/20	0.2	Team meeting
12/7/20	0.2	Team meeting
12/21/20	0.2	Team meeting
3/5/21	0.1	saved correspondence
5/28/21	0.1	deadline tracking

Total	138.67
--------------	---------------

Robert N. Barnes
Cline, et al., v. Sunoco, Inc. (R&M) et al.
ED/OK 6:17-CIV-00313-JAG

Date	Notes	Hours	Rate	Amount
1/17/18	Go over discovery and make suggested changes	1.5	\$1,075.00	\$1,612.50
4/7/18	Review all pending discovery issues & emails	1.20	\$1,075.00	\$1,290.00
4/10/18	Work on e-discovery terms	1.00	\$1,075.00	\$1,075.00
4/25/18	Defenses to WIO claim	1.60	\$1,075.00	\$1,720.00
4/27/18	Claims of all Owners & Sunoco defenses	0.80	\$1,075.00	\$860.00
4/30/18	List of defenses raised by defendant & how to respond to each; look at discovery documents	2.20	\$1,075.00	\$2,365.00
6/1/18	Review what defendant still has not produced	1.50	\$1,075.00	\$1,612.50
6/11/18	Review new discovery documents	1.50	\$1,075.00	\$1,612.50
6/25/18	Review briefs	2.10	\$1,075.00	\$2,257.50
6/27/18	Review new orders; work w/team on further action	1.50	\$1,075.00	\$1,612.50
6/30/18	Work on discovery disputes	3.50	\$1,075.00	\$3,762.50
7/2/18	Reviewing all briefs on motion	1.80	\$1,075.00	\$1,935.00
7/10/18	Review briefs	1.20	\$1,075.00	\$1,290.00
7/13/18	Review Designated Rep. areas of inquiry; review discovery	1.80	\$1,075.00	\$1,935.00
7/15/18	Reviewing Defendant documents & accounting data	6.00	\$1,075.00	\$6,450.00
7/24/18	30(b)(6) notice; review produced data	2.50	\$1,075.00	\$2,687.50
8/3/18	Reviewing depo transcripts related to document production & defenses	3.00	\$1,075.00	\$3,225.00
8/4/18	Issues about identification of Class members as requested by Defendant	2.50	\$1,075.00	\$2,687.50
8/7/18	Various correspondence from & to Sunoco; work w/expert on identifying Class members	2.00	\$1,075.00	\$2,150.00
8/14/18	Reviewing discovery responses & work on discovery abuse by Sunoco; reviewing data from Sunoco	2.00	\$1,075.00	\$2,150.00
8/19/18	Reviewing discovery issues	1.50	\$1,075.00	\$1,612.50
8/31/18	Discovery disputes	1.50	\$1,075.00	\$1,612.50
9/5/18	Discovery issues about missing pay data; conference w/ expert Ley about damage calculations	1.50	\$1,075.00	\$1,612.50
9/6/18	Discovery abuse issues	1.00	\$1,075.00	\$1,075.00
1/22/19	Reviewing outstanding discovery issues & how to resolve;	5.50	\$1,075.00	\$5,912.50
2/8/19	Expert reports & deposition prep. w/Ley	2.00	\$1,075.00	\$2,150.00
2/9/19	Reviewing discovery documents	2.50	\$1,075.00	\$2,687.50
2/14/19	Deposition of experts prep	3.50	\$1,075.00	\$3,762.50
3/11/19	Deposition prep	2.50	\$1,075.00	\$2,687.50
4/4/19	Review Sunoco expert reports & compare to evidence & Ley report	5.50	\$1,075.00	\$5,912.50
4/5/19	Prep for Sunoco Expert deposition; review Krause depo in other cases; reviewing Krause 100 page report & check references	10.50	\$1,075.00	\$11,287.50
4/6/19	Krause depo prep; develop questions of Krause; complete reports first review	11.00	\$1,075.00	\$11,825.00
4/7/19	Krause report & supporting documents; prepare for depo; legal & factual research	7.50	\$1,075.00	\$8,062.50

4/8/19	Reviewing Krause data	5.50	\$1,075.00	\$5,912.50
4/10/19	Travel to Houston for Krause depo; more prep for depo	6.00	\$1,075.00	\$6,450.00
4/11/19	Prepare for & take depo of Krause; travel to OKC	9.50	\$1,075.00	\$10,212.50
4/12/19	Work on Ley rebuttal report	2.50	\$1,075.00	\$2,687.50
4/13/19	Rebuttal expert report issues	2.20	\$1,075.00	\$2,365.00
4/26/19	Rebuttal reports	2.30	\$1,075.00	\$2,472.50
5/4/19	Work on rebuttal report	2.00	\$1,075.00	\$2,150.00
5/28/19	Document review for Class Cert. brief	3.50	\$1,075.00	\$3,762.50
6/2/19	Class certification	3.50	\$1,075.00	\$3,762.50
6/10/19	Class certification brief review	4.50	\$1,075.00	\$4,837.50
7/14/19	Damage calculation	2.40	\$1,075.00	\$2,580.00
9/13/19	Briefing	4.50	\$1,075.00	\$4,837.50
11/12/19	Review briefs; suggest issues for SJ & work on same	4.50	\$1,075.00	\$4,837.50
11/13/19	Review denial of Class Cert. appeal; planning for trial	1.50	\$1,075.00	\$1,612.50
11/19/19	Issues to present to Court on Unclaimed Property	2.00	\$1,075.00	\$2,150.00
11/27/19	Extensive review of new order addressing Unclaimed Property & affect on damages & evidence	2.70	\$1,075.00	\$2,902.50
11/29/19	Legal research on Unclaimed Property issues	0.70	\$1,075.00	\$752.50
12/3/19	Extensive review of Krause supplemental report; comments to team	3.80	\$1,075.00	\$4,085.00
12/4/19	Extensive research and writing about recovery of fees & expenses under PRSA & Class action	4.50	\$1,075.00	\$4,837.50
12/5/19	Research on claims (torts); trial prep; MPSJ presentation issue	4.50	\$1,075.00	\$4,837.50
12/6/19	Phone hearing on MPSJ; research on tort claims & punitive damages; damages for trial	3.60	\$1,075.00	\$3,870.00
12/7/19	Research & investigation on S/L issues; reviewing all briefs filed on last Friday	6.00	\$1,075.00	\$6,450.00
12/8/19	Reviewing briefs filed Friday	4.30	\$1,075.00	\$4,622.50
12/9/19	Research & writing long emails responding to Sunoco trial briefs; reviewing Sunoco exhibits dealing w/"individual issues"	7.90	\$1,075.00	\$8,492.50
12/10/19	Reviewing all Sunoco exhibits dealing w/Sunoco claim of "individual issues" & work on responses	6.80	\$1,075.00	\$7,310.00
12/11/19	Trial prep; reviewing briefs; hearing	3.00	\$1,075.00	\$3,225.00
12/13/19	Trial prep; responses to Sunoco's various newly filed briefs	7.00	\$1,075.00	\$7,525.00
12/14/19	Trial prep	6.50	\$1,075.00	\$6,987.50
12/15/19	Work on responses to Sunoco exhibits; long emails about burden of proof	7.50	\$1,075.00	\$8,062.50
12/16/19	Full trial day	9.50	\$1,075.00	\$10,212.50
12/17/19	Full trial day; work w/witnesses	10.00	\$1,075.00	\$10,750.00
12/18/19	Trial issues; research on Unclaimed Property - (Sunoco did not need to wait 5 years)	6.50	\$1,075.00	\$6,987.50
12/24/19	Summary of best claims & defenses address in FFCL	3.00	\$1,075.00	\$3,225.00
12/30/19	Issues to cover in proposed FFCL; unclaimed property issues	5.00	\$1,075.00	\$5,375.00
2/4/20	Reviewing transcript of first trial for proposed order	4.50	\$1,075.00	\$4,837.50
2/6/20	Research for proposed order	3.10	\$1,075.00	\$3,332.50
2/11/20	Checking testimony to support order	2.50	\$1,075.00	\$2,687.50
2/13/20	Review and revise post trial briefs & proposed orders	5.50	\$1,075.00	\$5,912.50
2/14/20	More work on post trial briefs & orders	3.50	\$1,075.00	\$3,762.50

2/15/20	Work on Post trial brief and on FOFCOL	6.20	\$1,075.00	\$6,665.00
2/17/20	Edit Post trial brief & findings	6.50	\$1,075.00	\$6,987.50
2/18/20	Final research & drafting on brief & proposed orders	3.70	\$1,075.00	\$3,977.50
2/20/20	Reviewing Sunoco brief etc. & work on response ideas	4.50	\$1,075.00	\$4,837.50
2/22/20	Reviewing Sunoco brief & proposed order (200 plus pages)	6.50	\$1,075.00	\$6,987.50
2/23/20	More review of Sunoco post trial filings and research response and provide some response ideas to team	5.20	\$1,075.00	\$5,590.00
2/25/20	Work on reply brief	5.20	\$1,075.00	\$5,590.00
12/2/21	Extensive review of orders and options open; legal research	3.30	\$1,075.00	\$3,547.50
12/4/21	Many emails & communications w/co-counsel about execution on judgement or settlement; locate defendant's property in Oklahoma	6.50	\$1,075.00	\$6,987.50
12/5/21	Many drafts of 30b6 Areas of Inquiry associated w/hearing on assets; research on Okla executive law	7.20	\$1,075.00	\$7,740.00
12/6/21	Revisions to 30b6 Areas of Inquiry; research on possible reaction of Sunoco to hearing on assets; research when & how to apply for fees from Sunoco	6.20	\$1,075.00	\$6,665.00
12/7/21	More work and many emails dealing with fees & costs on appeal & district court; plan course of action	4.50	\$1,075.00	\$4,837.50
12/8/21	Review & comment on research about execution on judgement	3.80	\$1,075.00	\$4,085.00
12/9/21	Research possible claim for additional 12% interest; research assists of defendants	2.70	\$1,075.00	\$2,902.50
12/10/21	Research Sunoco defendants & their related entities - extremely complex business organization; research piercing veil if assets of Sunoco have been moved to related entities	5.50	\$1,075.00	\$5,912.50
12/11/21	More work on assets owned by Sunoco & how to execute	2.80	\$1,075.00	\$3,010.00
12/13/21	Extensive review of 1. draft motions on atty fees and 2. motion for asset hearing & notice to Sunoco - offer comments on	4.70	\$1,075.00	\$5,052.50
1/8/22	Reviewing draft Replies to and Sunoco Responses in opposition to asset hearing and setting deadline for attorney fee motion	2.20	\$1,075.00	\$2,365.00
2/8/22	Review of recent orders and discussion with team	1.40	\$1,075.00	\$1,505.00
2/17/22	Review Sunoco's Supplement, Motion to Enjoin Enforcement of the Judgment and Response to Motion for asset hearing	2.80	\$1,075.00	\$3,010.00
2/18/22	Analysis of ET affidavits and emails to group	1.20	\$1,075.00	\$1,290.00
2/18/22	Read and analysis of recent Sunoco briefs, 2 filings; memo about potential compromise on document request	2.20	\$1,075.00	\$2,365.00
2/22/22	Review of Brief on documents to be produced at hearing on assets; further emails to group	1.00	\$1,075.00	\$1,075.00
7/17/22	Reviewed our brief in opposition filed with US Supreme Court	0.80	\$1,075.00	\$860.00
8/19/22	Review pleading/briefs for Asset Hearing	2.50	\$1,075.00	\$2,687.50
8/20/22	Further review for Asset Hearing	2.00	\$1,075.00	\$2,150.00
8/21/22	Research on Sunoco assets available for execution. Concentrate on bank accounts & other creditors	4.00	\$1,075.00	\$4,300.00
8/22/22	Legal research on garnishment; reviewing briefs & Orders relating to Execution	5.00	\$1,075.00	\$5,375.00
8/23/22	Work w/oil marketing professionals on likely accounts (Bank) where Sunoco will have large cash amounts at specific times of month	3.75	\$1,075.00	\$4,031.25

8/24/22	Work on areas of questioning for Sunoco Rep. Research piercing Corporate veil to get Sunoco assets held by other ET entities	5.70	\$1,075.00	\$6,127.50
8/25/22	Work w/team on how to approach Asset Hearing; advise co-counsel on where & how Sunoco is likely holding huge sums of cash	6.50	\$1,075.00	\$6,987.50
8/27/22	Fact investigation on location of defendant bank accounts and accounts of refiners who owe money to defendant; work on garnishment	4.50	\$1,075.00	\$4,837.50
8/28/22	Continued research on location of cash assets; fact investigation on what ET affiliates may be holding Sunoco cash; garnishment	2.70	\$1,075.00	\$2,902.50
8/29/22	Review Sunoco emergency stay filed in SCOTUS; further fact investigation on location of assets for garnishment of refineries and Sunoco affiliates	4.50	\$1,075.00	\$4,837.50
8/30/22	more research on out of state execution and assets in Texas; discussion of emergency stay in SC	2.75	\$1,075.00	\$2,956.25
8/31/22	Review briefs on stay; order denying stay; research ET corporate structure for execution; decide on course of action based on recent filings and orders; ideas on sanctions due to Sunoco's non-compliance	5.20	\$1,075.00	\$5,590.00
9/1/22	review of Sunoco document production and consult with expert; research on sanctions	5.70	\$1,075.00	\$6,127.50
9/2/22	Continue review of Sunoco document production; emails and phone calls with co-counsel about where responses were insufficient and what is now known for execution	4.20	\$1,075.00	\$4,515.00
9/6/22	Close review of latest filings; hearing prep; research on Corporate veil; long conf. w/industry expert	3.90	\$1,075.00	\$4,192.50
9/7/22	Extensive prep for Asset Hearing; long conference w/co-counsel; Corporate veil research	4.20	\$1,075.00	\$4,515.00
9/8/22	Hearing prep; prep exhibits	6.10	\$1,075.00	\$6,557.50
9/9/22	Prep for Asset Hearing	5.50	\$1,075.00	\$5,912.50
9/10/22	Further prep for Asset Hearing	4.50	\$1,075.00	\$4,837.50
9/11/22	Further review of Sunoco documents; prepare for hearing	5.10	\$1,075.00	\$5,482.50
9/12/22	Travel to and from Muskogee; interrogate witnesses all day at Asset Hearing	11.00	\$1,075.00	\$11,825.00
9/13/22	Review position on Execution in light of Asset Hearing testimony & new documents	2.50	\$1,075.00	\$2,687.50
9/14/22	Review Sunoco brief on latest appeal; emails w/co-counsel about forcing more Asset discovery from Sunoco	6.20	\$1,075.00	\$6,665.00

Total Case Hours	480.10	\$516,107.50
-------------------------	---------------	---------------------

Patranell B. Lewis
Cline, et al., v. Sunoco, Inc. (R&M) et al.
ED/OK 6:17-CIV-00313-JAG

Date	Notes	Hours	Rate	Amount
7/6/17	Review draft Petition	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
8/14/17	Review Notice of Removal and supporting docs	1.20	\$875.00	\$1,050.00
8/16/17	Review Corporate Disclosure Statement	0.80	\$875.00	\$700.00
10/16/17	Discussion of scheduling and time needed	0.50	\$875.00	\$437.50
11/6/17	Review of scheduling order	0.80	\$875.00	\$700.00
11/9/17	Review of protective order, motion to enter	1.60	\$875.00	\$1,400.00
1/8/18	Discuss strategy re:discovery	0.20	\$875.00	\$175.00
1/15/18	Strategy Re: interim counsel motion	0.20	\$875.00	\$175.00
1/16/18	Work on discovery; interim class counsel motion	1.70	\$875.00	\$1,487.50
1/22/18	Stratery re: upcoming depo	0.30	\$875.00	\$262.50
2/12/18	Discussion of depo topics	0.60	\$875.00	\$525.00
3/8/18	Discussion re: Eric Koelling depo	0.40	\$875.00	\$350.00
3/30/18	Review depo of Alice Holland, notes on upcoming discovery	2.80	\$875.00	\$2,450.00
4/6/18	Continued work on discovery issues & emails; input on depo topics	1.90	\$875.00	\$1,662.50
4/9/18	Input re: e-discovery terms, review ENK's draft	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
4/11/18	Work on discovery letter to McClure; discussion re:same	0.40	\$875.00	\$350.00
4/25/18	Work on Defenses re: working interest owners	1.60	\$875.00	\$1,400.00
4/26/18	Work on claims of all owners	1.80	\$875.00	\$1,575.00
4/28/18	Review of discovery and responses to defenses, 30b6 scope	1.30	\$875.00	\$1,137.50
6/1/18	Discussion of unclaimed property issues	0.80	\$875.00	\$700.00
6/3/18	Discussion of scheduling	0.50	\$875.00	\$437.50
6/12/18	Review data; fact investigation	0.60	\$875.00	\$525.00
6/18/18	Review Sunoco opposition re:scheduling	0.50	\$875.00	\$437.50
6/24/18	Review depo of Perry Cline	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
6/24/18	Review Motion to strike privilege log and waiver of defenses	2.80	\$875.00	\$2,450.00
6/25/18	Review and edit Motion to strike	1.80	\$875.00	\$1,575.00
6/27/18	Strategy in light of new orders	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
6/28/18	Review Eric Koelling depo summary	2.30	\$875.00	\$2,012.50
6/29/18	Review of exhibits re:privilege log	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
7/1/18	Work on discovery disputes; review of supplement brief	1.30	\$875.00	\$1,137.50
7/9/18	Review Sunoco response brief re:privilege log and waiver	2.50	\$875.00	\$2,187.50
7/11/18	Work on discovery; discuss missing data	0.30	\$875.00	\$262.50
7/12/18	Review motion for reconsideration	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
7/13/18	Work on designated rep discovery	1.70	\$875.00	\$1,487.50
7/15/18	Reviewing Defendant documents & accounting data	6.00	\$875.00	\$5,250.00
7/24/18	Review of 30(b)(6) notice and documents produced	2.50	\$875.00	\$2,187.50
8/3/18	Work on discovery; review whether received missing data	0.60	\$875.00	\$525.00
8/4/18	Issues about identification of Class members as requested by Defendant	2.50	\$875.00	\$2,187.50
8/7/18	Work on class definition	2.00	\$875.00	\$1,750.00
8/14/18	Work on discovery abuse by Sunoco	0.40	\$875.00	\$350.00
8/19/18	Review Outline of data Ley needs	0.60	\$875.00	\$525.00
8/29/18	Review depo of Austin Jones	1.80	\$875.00	\$1,575.00
8/31/18	review emails re: possible motion to compel	0.30	\$875.00	\$262.50

9/5/18	review attempts to resolve discovery dispute	0.40	\$875.00	\$350.00
9/6/18	review issues to raise in motion to compel not resolved	0.30	\$875.00	\$262.50
9/9/18	Review Motion to Compel	1.70	\$875.00	\$1,487.50
9/30/18	Review depo summary of Patricia Redding; notes re: continued discovery	3.50	\$875.00	\$3,062.50
10/9/18	Review Motion re:confidential documents	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
10/9/18	Review Order on Motion to Compel	0.70	\$875.00	\$612.50
10/21/18	Review Response to approval of confidential documents	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
10/30/18	Second Scheduling Order	0.50	\$875.00	\$437.50
11/15/18	Review depo of Terry Oakley	2.00	\$875.00	\$1,750.00
12/1/18	set out issues for experts to address	0.70	\$875.00	\$612.50
1/11/19	Third Scheduling Order	0.50	\$875.00	\$437.50
1/22/19	Reviewing outstanding discovery issues & how to resolve; damages	5.50	\$875.00	\$4,812.50
2/8/19	Expert reports & deposition prep. w/Ley	2.00	\$875.00	\$1,750.00
2/14/19	Expert prep work continued	3.50	\$875.00	\$3,062.50
3/30/19	Deposition summary of Ley	2.00	\$875.00	\$1,750.00
4/4/19	preparation for upcoming depositions	4.80	\$875.00	\$4,200.00
4/5/19	continued deposition preparation	2.10	\$875.00	\$1,837.50
4/6/19	follow up on issues for deposition preparation	1.40	\$875.00	\$1,225.00
4/7/19	Review Krause report & supporting documents	7.50	\$875.00	\$6,562.50
4/9/19	Review depo summary of Demi Lanscelin	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
4/9/19	Reviewing Krause data	5.50	\$875.00	\$4,812.50
4/10/19	Research re: deposition prep for Krause	6.00	\$875.00	\$5,250.00
4/11/19	Coninued research for Krause depo prep and work on discovery	9.50	\$875.00	\$8,312.50
4/12/19	Work on Ley rebuttal report; review documents	4.00	\$875.00	\$3,500.00
4/13/19	Rebuttal expert report issues	3.00	\$875.00	\$2,625.00
4/26/19	Rebuttal reports	2.00	\$875.00	\$1,750.00
5/2/19	Review damage estimates	1.20	\$875.00	\$1,050.00
5/3/19	Conferenced with Ley re report	1.80	\$875.00	\$1,575.00
5/28/19	Document review for Class Cert. brief	3.50	\$875.00	\$3,062.50
6/4/19	Class certification briefing	4.20	\$875.00	\$3,675.00
6/10/19	contnued work on class cerification briefing	3.80	\$875.00	\$3,325.00
6/13/19	edits re: class certication briefing	3.50	\$875.00	\$3,062.50
7/14/19	Work with experts re:Damage calculation	2.40	\$875.00	\$2,100.00
8/8/19	Review Sunoco motion re:dismissal lack of jurisdiction	2.00	\$875.00	\$1,750.00
8/14/19	Review Sunoco motion to exclude Ley	2.50	\$875.00	\$2,187.50
8/15/19	Work on discovery in light of motions	3.50	\$875.00	\$3,062.50
8/27/19	Review response to exclude Ley	2.50	\$875.00	\$2,187.50
8/27/19	Review Reply re: certification	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
9/4/19	Review Reply re: lack of jurisdiction	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
9/15/19	Reply re: certification	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
9/30/19	Review depo summary of Kathey Warren and notes for discovery	2.30	\$875.00	\$2,012.50
10/4/19	Review of Court's Orders	5.00	\$875.00	\$4,375.00
10/8/19	Review Sunoco Motion to Stay	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
10/9/19	Telephone Conference with Counsel and Judge Gibney	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
10/10/19	Review Motion to approve form of notice	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
11/12/19	Summary judgment issues; work on claims	2.70	\$875.00	\$2,362.50

11/13/19	Review denial of Class Cert. appeal; planning for trial	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
11/14/19	Emails on mediation	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
11/17/19	Email on amended class definition	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
11/19/19	Issues to present to Court on Unclaimed Property	2.00	\$875.00	\$1,750.00
11/19/19	Review Response to Motion to Clarify Class	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
11/25/19	Review of objections to Exhibit List	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
11/26/19	Work on possible rebuttal witness for trial	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
11/27/19	Extensive review of new order addressing Unclaimed Property & effect on damages & evidence	2.70	\$875.00	\$2,362.50
11/29/19	Legal research on Unclaimed Property issues	4.70	\$875.00	\$4,112.50
12/3/19	Extensive review of Krause supplemental report; comments to team	3.80	\$875.00	\$3,325.00
12/4/19	Extensive research and writing about recovery of fees & expenses under PRSA & Class action	4.50	\$875.00	\$3,937.50
12/5/19	Research on claims (torts); trial prep; MPSJ presentation issue	3.80	\$875.00	\$3,325.00
12/6/19	Telephone Conference with Counsel and Judge Gibney	2.00	\$875.00	\$1,750.00
12/7/19	Worked on pretrial issues	3.50	\$875.00	\$3,062.50
12/9/19	Reviewed amended objections to depo designations	2.50	\$875.00	\$2,187.50
12/9/19	Emails re: refuting Sunoco arguments re: individual issues	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
12/10/19	Reviewed all indemnity agreements to refute individual issues claim	8.10	\$875.00	\$7,087.50
12/11/19	Reviewed briefs and Telephone hearing with Judge and counsel	4.00	\$875.00	\$3,500.00
12/11/19	Reviewed all division orders to refute Sunoco argument on individual issues	5.00	\$875.00	\$4,375.00
12/15/19	Work on responses to Sunoco exhibits; long emails about burden of proof	2.50	\$875.00	\$2,187.50
12/17/19	Trial and prep;review exhibits	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
12/18/19	Trial and prep; discussion of witness testimony	2.50	\$875.00	\$2,187.50
12/18/19	research on Unclaimed Property	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
12/19/19	worked on rebuttal to Sunoco claims	2.00	\$875.00	\$1,750.00
12/19/19	Trial	2.20	\$875.00	\$1,925.00
1/4/20	Worked on findings of fact and conclusions of law	3.00	\$875.00	\$2,625.00
1/5/20	additional work on findings of fact and conclusions of law	2.50	\$875.00	\$2,187.50
2/4/20	Review of Trial Transcript	4.50	\$875.00	\$3,937.50
2/5/20	Continued review of Transcript	4.10	\$875.00	\$3,587.50
2/13/20	Work on Unclaimed property issues	2.50	\$875.00	\$2,187.50
2/14/20	work on post trial brief	3.50	\$875.00	\$3,062.50
2/15/20	Additional review of trial transcript	5.70	\$875.00	\$4,987.50
2/17/20	Worked on Post trial briefing	4.30	\$875.00	\$3,762.50
2/18/20	Final review of briefing	1.70	\$875.00	\$1,487.50
2/18/20	Review amended Sunoco findings of fact and conclusions of law	5.00	\$875.00	\$4,375.00
2/20/20	Review Court minute order	0.50	\$875.00	\$437.50
2/23/20	Review and edits to Response to Sunoco post trial brief	1.80	\$875.00	\$1,575.00
2/26/20	Work on reply brief	2.30	\$875.00	\$2,012.50
3/11/20	Review Supplemental Brief	1.20	\$875.00	\$1,050.00
5/5/20	Notice regarding reversal of opinion relied upon by Sunoco	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
6/17/20	Oral Closing Arguments	4.00	\$875.00	\$3,500.00

8/17/20	Review Opinion and Order	2.00	\$875.00	\$1,750.00
8/24/20	Work on updated damage calculations	1.80	\$875.00	\$1,575.00
9/8/20	Review distribution of damages briefing	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
9/24/20	Review Motion for new trial	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
9/28/20	Review Reply on damages	0.50	\$875.00	\$437.50
10/8/20	Review Response to Motion for new trial	0.80	\$875.00	\$700.00
10/9/20	Review Motion to alter/amend judgment	0.60	\$875.00	\$525.00
10/13/20	Review Order on allocation/distribution	0.20	\$875.00	\$175.00
10/19/20	Review Sunoco's brief on allocation/distribution	0.40	\$875.00	\$350.00
10/20/20	Review PL's statement re distribution	0.50	\$875.00	\$437.50
10/22/20	Review Sunoco's reply briefs on Motion to alter judgment and Motion for new trial	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
10/29/20	Review draft of Plan of Allocation	0.80	\$875.00	\$700.00
10/31/20	Review Notice of appeal and second amended notice of appeal	0.40	\$875.00	\$350.00
11/3/20	Reviewed order dismissing appeal	0.20	\$875.00	\$175.00
11/25/20	Review Sunoco's Motion for new trial and motion to alter judgment	0.60	\$875.00	\$525.00
12/9/20	Review Opinion and Order denying Sunoco's motions	0.80	\$875.00	\$700.00
12/10/20	Review Notice of appeal	0.40	\$875.00	\$350.00
3/24/21	Reviewed Joint stipulation re interest payments	0.40	\$875.00	\$350.00
11/2/21	Review Circuit Court dismissal of appeal	0.60	\$875.00	\$525.00
11/30/21	Worked on info for hearing on assets	6.00	\$875.00	\$5,250.00
12/3/21	Research on structure and assets of Sunoco parent company	3.00	\$875.00	\$2,625.00
12/4/21	Worked on 30b6 topics for asset hearing notice	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
12/5/21	Status conference with BL on current state of efforts	1.40	\$875.00	\$1,225.00
12/6/21	Work on 30b6 Exhibit A	1.50	\$875.00	\$1,312.50
12/7/21	Review BL combined research efforts and memos on executing judgment	2.20	\$875.00	\$1,925.00
12/8/21	Research on bond	0.50	\$875.00	\$437.50
12/13/21	Work on Motion for Hearing on Assets	1.20	\$875.00	\$1,050.00
12/27/21	Review Response to Motion for Hearing on Assets	0.50	\$875.00	\$437.50
1/10/22	Work on Reply ISO Hearing on Assets	1.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
2/7/22	Review Order re: Granting Motion Require Sunoco to appear	0.20	\$875.00	\$175.00
2/10/22	Review Order re: hearing on assets and discuss prep	0.40	\$875.00	\$350.00
2/11/22	Review Opposition to Motion to Modify Plan of Allocation	0.50	\$875.00	\$437.50
2/12/22	Review email re: Sunoco property	0.40	\$875.00	\$350.00
2/18/22	Review Opposition to Document Discovery; emails re: same	1.70	\$875.00	\$1,487.50
2/20/22	Emails re: strategy assets and enforcement of judgment	1.30	\$875.00	\$1,137.50
2/21/22	Emails re: collection of assets; discussion with expert re: same	1.70	\$875.00	\$1,487.50
2/21/22	Review Proposed Order on assets; emails re: same	2.50	\$875.00	\$2,187.50
2/22/22	Response Asset Hearing Brief and emails re: same	2.80	\$875.00	\$2,450.00
3/7/22	Conferenced re current briefing issues	1.20	\$875.00	\$1,050.00
4/28/22	Reviewed mediation statement in preparation for settlement conference	0.60	\$875.00	\$525.00
4/29/22	Reviewed mediation statement in preparation for settlement conference	1.20	\$875.00	\$1,050.00
5/13/22	Attended settlement conference and prepared memo for team	3.00	\$875.00	\$2,625.00

5/25/22	Attended mediation with Sunoco	4.00	\$875.00	\$3,500.00
6/8/22	Conference with class member re status; forwarded his contact info and description to team	0.40	\$875.00	\$350.00
6/24/22	Reviewed Sunoco Motion for Injunction pending appeal	0.40	\$875.00	\$350.00
7/15/22	Reviewed Brief in opposition filed with SCOTUS	1.20	\$875.00	\$1,050.00
8/4/22	Conferenced with class member re status of case	0.20	\$875.00	\$175.00
8/30/22	Met with team and reviewed current research on ET entities; reviewed current pertinent filings.	3.40	\$875.00	\$2,975.00
9/8/22	Conferenced with team re preparing for upcoming hearing; organized list of items needed for witnesses	4.20	\$875.00	\$3,675.00
9/11/22	Prepared for hearing on assets; met with team; prepared witness notebooks in preparation for testimony	5.40	\$875.00	\$4,725.00
9/12/22	Traveled to Muskogee and attended hearing on assets; drafted summary of hearing; prepared list of items promised by defendant.	11.00	\$875.00	\$9,625.00
9/19/22	Conference re documents produced by Sunoco; cross-checked with list of promised items; drafted memo to file re missing items	2.20	\$875.00	\$1,925.00
11/5/22	Reviewed Sunoco's appeal 22-7018 and all related briefing	2.20	\$875.00	\$1,925.00
Total Case Hours		378.20		\$330,925.00

Emily N. Kitch
Cline, et al., v. Sunoco, Inc. (R&M) et al.
ED/OK 6:17-CIV-00313-JAG

Date	Notes	Hours	Rate	Amount
10/23/17	Reviewed D's discovery responses, began draft of discovery	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
10/23/17	Received and reviewed Scheduling order and D's proposed	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/25/17	Reviewed scheduling Order, diaried all dates.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/8/17	Review PO and MTE.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/8/17	Review Order granting PO.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/1/18	Reviewed and edited Motion to appoint interim class counsel.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
3/8/18	Reviewed and analyzed Pat's depo summary of Eric Koelling; confer with PBL and RNB; diary DO manager depo.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
3/26/18	Review Jason's letter to D re discovery deficiencies; corresponded with team re the same.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
3/30/18	Received and reviewed Alice Holland depo summary from Pat.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
4/4/18	Review McClure's response to our discovery deficiency letter, discuss response and approach with team.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
4/6/18	Review Gastar checks and correspondence from Paula re problems with cashing them, discussed with team.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
4/6/18	Receive correspondence from Pat re to-dos prior to McClure conference, discuss with team.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
4/9/18	Receive search term ESI from Paula, collect all previous ESI agreements and compare in preparation for drafting ESI search	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
4/10/18	Revise ESI list of search terms and confer with team.	4.60	\$700.00	\$3,220.00
4/11/18	Review Pat's email re draft letter to McClure, discuss with PBL.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
4/27/18	Review 30b6 topics, Pat's email, McClure's objections, suggested response; conference with team re response.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
5/11/18	Review team emails re discovery.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
6/25/18	Reviewed and redlined MT Strike.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
6/25/18	Reviewed Drew's redline.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
6/27/18	Review correspondence re motion to compel; conference with team on strategy.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
9/5/18	Reviewed discovery and compared with production from Sunoco to date.	3.80	\$700.00	\$2,660.00
9/13/18	Receive and review MT file exhibits under seal, Orders setting hearing, allowing sealed exhibits, diary important dates.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
9/28/18	Review D's Motion for excess pages; review flings from the week, upcoming deadlines.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
9/28/18	Worked on discovery to D, reviewed discovery requests.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/3/18	Reviewed DF's MTC Response and MT file exhibits under seal.; reviewed case status, upcoming deadlines.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/4/18	Reviewed correspondence re timeline of communications re discovery disputes; reviewed minute order, sealed exhibits.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
10/10/18	Reviewed DF's Motion re Judicial Hold designations and Order re MTC.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
10/18/18	Reviewed correspondence with team re discovery, minute order re confidential designations, conferred re problems with opening latest production.	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00

10/20/18	Reviewed response re confidentiality.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/22/18	Reviewed redline of response, correspondence with team, re response.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/23/18	Receive and review 2 depo notices re disc on disc, diary dates, review topics.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/23/18	Review minute order and response; look through our supplemental document production to D.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/24/18	Review team correspondence re Cline depo testimony and minute order granting confidentiality motion.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/29/18	Review correspondence re late payment and interest calculations for Perry, follow-up letter to McClure re discovery; reviewed DF's objections to notices, DF's confidential designations, McClure response.	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
10/30/18	Review M to Amend Scheduling Order, discuss with team; reviewed damage model, checkstub, Perry's Amended Disclosures	1.80	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
11/2/18	Review Amended ROG responses and 2A Scheduling Order; diary dates.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/17/18	Reviewed DF's depo confidential designations for Oakley.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
12/17/18	Reviewed DF's corrections and designations for Jones.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/7/19	Discussed case status with team.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/14/19	Reviewed Motion to extend deadlines, 3A Scheduling Order and diary all dates.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/21/19	Reviewed Ley's draft report.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
1/22/19	Review discovery responses/production status, damages for Ley's report, discussed with team.	5.40	\$700.00	\$3,780.00
1/28/19	Review Paula's redline, multiple correspondence with team re damages and Ley's report.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
2/4/19	Confer with team re Gwen Cline suspense money.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/5/19	Review correspondence re expert disclosures, possibly using Miller, look up Ley's testimony case list; reviewed Pat's proposed response to DF.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
2/5/19	Review lengthy team correspondence re Ley deposition, expert reports, timing, strategy.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
2/6/19	Review McClure email re Ley depo dates, conference with team.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/11/19	Confer with team re case status, strategy, Ley deposition, expert reports.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
2/12/19	Review multiple emails re Ley deposition and Ley's damages.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
2/14/19	Reviewed multiple correspondence with team re Ley deposition planning; reviewed Koelling depo excerpts from RNB.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
2/18/19	Team call re case status.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
4/24/19	Reviewed correspondence re extension of deadlines, review motion to extend, DP's redline.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/6/19	Received and reviewed DF's Response and Amended Response to our Motion for extension of deadlines.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/7/19	Review Ley's Rebuttal report draft.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
5/8/19	Reviewed current draft of Ley report from Jason, reviewed Pat's edits.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00

5/8/19	Conferenced with PBL and RNB re class cert issues, Chaparral opinion; review RNB correspondence to team.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/15/19	Review Krause jurat/errata and compare with depo, note changes.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/21/19	Review final draft of Ley rebuttal.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
5/22/19	Team discussion re rebuttal reports handling in case law, statutory law; review correspondence re the same.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/24/19	Review correspondence with team re final edits to Ley rebuttal.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
5/30/19	Review DF response to Ley rebuttal, questions about methodology; discuss with PBL.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
6/13/19	Review, redline class cert motion.	1.80	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
6/14/19	Conference re DF's ROG 2 amended answer missing.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
7/18/19	Receive review minute order reassigning case to John A. Gibney; conference with PBL.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
7/30/19	Review McClure email re page limit and confer with team.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
7/31/19	Review minute order setting status conference; diary.; discuss with PBL	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/1/19	Review DF's motion to exceed page limits.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/5/19	Prepared for status conference, drafted and filed EOA, attended status conference.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
8/6/19	Review Pretrial Order; diary all dates; discuss trial schedule with PBL and RNB.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
8/9/19	Review correspondence with team re confidentiality of letter to Cline with interest pmt.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/9/19	Review DF's MTD for lack of SMJ.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
8/10/19	Continue review of DF's MTD.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
8/12/19	Review new draft discovery to Sunoco.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
8/15/19	Reviewed Sunoco's Response to our Class Cert Motion; made notes.	2.60	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
8/16/19	Reviewed Sunoco's Motion to Exclude Ley.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
8/16/19	Reviewed correspondence with team re motion to exclude Ley.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/19/19	Reviewed Order re explain why docs should be sealed.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/21/19	Reviewed draft response to MTD, made notes.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
8/21/19	Correspond with team re draft response edits.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/27/19	Worked on Reply to Class Cert motion; discussed with team; reviewed all redlines.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
8/28/19	Conferenced with team re Reply on class cert; reviewed redlines; reviewed final draft.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
9/5/19	Review DF's Reply on MTD.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
9/9/19	Confer with team re DF's surreply; lack of new evidence.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
9/11/19	Review Sunoco's Reply on MT Exclude Ley.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
9/12/19	Reviewed DF's Motion to file surreply.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
9/17/19	Review DF's Reply re their surreply.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
9/23/19	Call re case status with team; reviewed PJ's table of deadlines.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
9/25/19	Receive and review TAX IDs and API info from Sunoco; conference with team re additional discovery to Sunoco.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/3/19	Reviewed draft MTC.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00

10/3/19	Received and reviewed Order and Opinion denying MTD, Order and Opinion denying MT Exclude Ley, Order allowing D's surreply, D's surreply, and Order and Opinion granting Class Cert!	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
10/4/19	Conference and correspond with team re Orders.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/8/19	Review draft Notice ahead of conference with Judge Gibney tomorrow.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
10/9/19	Review correspondence from McClure re court reporter for status conference with Judge Gibney, conference with team.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/10/19	Review draft response to DF's motion to stay.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/11/19	Conference with team re response, mediation.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/14/19	Review McClure email re owner names. conference with team re case strategy, upcoming deadlines.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/14/19	Review Sunoco's Reply on Motion to Stay.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/15/19	Reviewed current brief on Notice and data, conferenced with team.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/18/19	Reviewed draft MPSJ on PRSA claims.	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00
10/18/19	Reviewed additional redlines to MPSJ	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/18/19	Reviewed Sunoco's Petition for Permission to Appeal.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/23/19	Review lengthy correspondence from Pat re punitive damages, conference with PBL re punitives.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/26/19	Reviewed draft Response to Pet to Appeal Class Cert.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
10/28/19	Review Sunoco's Response to our Motion to Approve Notice.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/28/19	Reviewed Cline's status report.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/29/19	Reviewed Sunoco's MT Strike our MPSJ.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/29/19	Conference with PBL and RNB re 2/3 of the \$80 million relates to Unclaimed Property; discuss with team.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/30/19	Review Order and Opinion denying DF's MT Stay; conference with team.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/30/19	Receive and review Opinion and Order denying D's Motion to Strike our MPSJ.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/31/19	Review Sunoco's Motion for Stay pending appeal.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/1/19	Receive and review McClure email re document production, revised Notices and forms for optouts.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
11/1/19	Reviewed Sunoco's notice of Supp authority.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/4/19	Review Order granting form and manner of Notice; reviewed Sunoco's Response to our MPSJ.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
11/4/19	Conference with RNB and PBL re unclaimed property issues, clarifying that State owns nothing, they are merely the holders of property for benefit of Owners.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
11/5/19	Review Krause expert report.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
11/5/19	Reviewed and analyzed report of Kraettli Epperson.	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
11/5/19	Review Brad's lengthy email re escheat, mediation, trial issues, unpaid interest, punitives; discussed with PBL.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
11/5/19	Review Ley spreadsheet with claim breakdown.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/7/19	Review Reply on MPSJ.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/11/19	Review correspondence from Royal Furgeson re mediation, unclaimed property issues.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/12/19	Conference with team re handling of Sunoco callers, begin spreadsheet of calls.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00

11/13/19	Review denial of appeal on class certification	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
11/14/19	Review Order from Circuit Court denying Sunoco's Permission to Appeal Class Cert.; discuss with team	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/16/19	Review deposition designations and defendants exhibits.	1.80	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
11/17/19	Review Motion to Clarify Class Definition.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
11/17/19	Review Sunoco's proposed exhibit list.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/17/19	Review Sunoco proposed witness list.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/17/19	Review multiple correspondence and conference with team regarding unclaimed property.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
11/18/19	Review all briefing relating to class cert appeal again, make notes in preparation for responding to Motion to Clarify.	3.40	\$700.00	\$2,380.00
11/18/19	Review Stipulation of Facts by Cline.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
11/18/19	Review Gibney Order for Response on Mtn to Clarify; conference with team.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
11/18/19	Reviewed Alice Holland depo, summary and pertinent exhibits.	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
11/18/19	Reviewed deposition of Barbara Ley, summary and exhibits; compared with Unit depo.	3.60	\$700.00	\$2,520.00
11/19/19	Review Motion to File exhibit list under seal.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/19/19	Reviewed Demi Lanceslin and Kathey Warren depositions, summaries, and exhibits, compare testimony.	4.80	\$700.00	\$3,360.00
11/19/19	Reviewed depositions of Patricia Redding and Eric Koelling, exhibits and summaries. Reviewed Pat's emails re Koelling and annotation reports.	5.20	\$700.00	\$3,640.00
11/20/19	Reviewed deposition of Perry Cline and exhibits.	2.00	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
11/20/19	Reviewed Terry Oakley deposition, changes and exhibits.	1.60	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
11/20/19	Reviewed Krause 3-29 report, deposition, summaries, and pertinent exhibits. Reviewed and analyzed RNB's comments.	5.40	\$700.00	\$3,780.00
11/20/19	Reviewed Response to Motion to Clarify; conferenced with PBL.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/21/19	Review Gibney Order setting Mtn to Clarify for telephonic hearing.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/21/19	Reviewed our proposed rebuttal exhibit list.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/21/19	Reviewed our counter depo designations.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
11/21/19	Reviewed Austin Jones depo and summary	1.60	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
11/21/19	Reviewed depo designation motions and orders re Austin Jones; cross checked with other testimony.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
11/22/19	Review DF's motion for leave to file reply., etc.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
11/22/19	Reviewed all Cline class rep file documents including OGL, assignments, interest calculation, correspondence with Sunoco, revenue check stubs, DOFS OCC info.	7.00	\$700.00	\$4,900.00
11/25/19	Attended telephonic hearing on Motion to Clarify class.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
11/25/19	Review Sunoco Reply.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
11/26/19	Review Order denying Sunoco's mtn to clarify.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/26/19	Review Objections to W&E list, depo designations on behalf of both parties.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
11/27/19	Review Depo Notice to Krause.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/27/19	Review depo notice to Kraettli Epperson.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
12/2/19	Review Gibney Order admitting Exhibit 1 of PRSA chart.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
12/2/19	Reviewed Ley depo notice.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00

12/2/19	Review correspondence re pending MPSJs.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/2/19	Review D's Motion for leave to file surreply.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/2/19	Review Krause supplemental report.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/5/19	Review McClure email enclosing SQL codes for Krause's Supplemental Report; conference with team re report, upcoming depositions; trial.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/6/19	Review our Motion to Strike Krause.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
12/6/19	Review pretrial interest rate brief.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
12/6/19	Reviewed multiple correspondence re damages, conferenced with RNB and PBL.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/6/19	Attended telephonic hearing on MPSJ; continued research on unclaimed property issues.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
12/7/19	Reviewed and analyzed Sunoco's pretrial briefs on BOP, Fraud, punitives, interest on interest, and individual liability; looked up relevant cases cited, conferenced with RNB and PBL re SOL issues.	4.60	\$700.00	\$3,220.00
12/9/19	Reviewed and analyzed Sunoco's pretrial brief re standing, unclaimed proceeds; researched cited cases; reviewed our amended objection to depo designations.	3.40	\$700.00	\$2,380.00
12/9/19	Reviewed our pretrial briefs on compounding interest, fraud, amount of PRSA interest owed on Unclaimed property. punitives.	1.60	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
12/9/19	Conference with DP re exhibits objections and identifying documents; conference with team and begin working.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
12/9/19	Confer with team re interest on interest in Sunoco's pretrial brief.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/9/19	Review correspondence from team re unclaimed property re Sunoco's pretrial brief; conference with team.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/10/19	Review Reply on Motion to Strike Krause.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/10/19	Analyze notes and all trial briefs again in preparation for trial; make more notes; confer with RNB and PBL re trial schedule.	7.00	\$700.00	\$4,900.00
12/10/19	Review Opinion and Order granting our MPSJ! Conference with team.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/11/19	Attended pretrial telephonic hearing.	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00
12/11/19	Conference with team re hearing; review correspondence re hearing.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
12/11/19	Review letter and Order re Betty Oaks.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/12/19	Review and analyze Fof and CoL from Sunoco.	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
12/12/19	Review our FoF and CoL.	1.60	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
12/12/19	Conference with team, review correspondence re trial strategy.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
12/13/19	Review multiple EOA filings and orders re filing exhibits under seal.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/15/19	Reviewed Keough Notice.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/16/19	Traveled to Muskogee and attended trial Day 1.	11.00	\$700.00	\$7,700.00
12/17/19	Attended trial Day 2 and returned to okc.	12.00	\$700.00	\$8,400.00
12/17/19	Research Okla Admin Code re early delivery of property and inclusion of interest.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/19/19	Traveled to Muskogee and attended Trial day 4, returned.	12.00	\$700.00	\$8,400.00

12/20/19	Attended final trial day and returned to okc.	12.00	\$700.00	\$8,400.00
12/20/19	Conference with PBL RNB re trial, notes, result, witnesses, upcoming damages hearing.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/30/19	Review Order re proposed FOF and COL, conference with team.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/6/20	Conference with team re case status, to do list.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/13/20	Team conference re case status, trial, FOF and COLs.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/13/20	Review Gibney Order for hearing, diary dates, conference re damages hearing.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/14/20	Conference call re conference with Gibney.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
1/15/20	Attended telephonic hearing re closing arguments.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
1/24/20	Review DF's filing exhibits, review case status, outstanding items to do.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/27/20	Receive and review notices of filing of trial transcripts; conference re court fees for copies.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/3/20	Discuss case status with team.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/10/20	Correspond with team re unclaimed.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
2/10/20	Conference with team re case status, research re due diligence requirement for search for owner of unclaimed property for CoL.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
2/12/20	Revise Post trial Brief.	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00
2/13/20	Review and revise our post trial brief.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
2/16/20	Review Robert's revisions on FOf CoL.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
2/16/20	Review current draft of FoF CoL.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
2/16/20	Revise posttrial brief and send draft to RNB.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
2/17/20	Review multiple correspondence with team re undivided and unclaimed; continue working on draft of FOF COL.	3.20	\$700.00	\$2,240.00
2/18/20	Review Keough Supp Decl.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
2/19/20	Reviewed Sunoco's Post Trial brief and proposed orders.	4.20	\$700.00	\$2,940.00
2/20/20	Review and analyze Sunoco's proposed FOF and COL; review Order re 25 pg limit for post trial responses.	4.40	\$700.00	\$3,080.00
2/26/20	Conferenced and corresponded with team re unclaimed issues in briefing; response brief outline; strategy.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
2/27/20	Review response to Sunoco post trial brief.; reviewed Sunoco's response to our trial brief.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
3/10/20	Review Sunoco's Motion for leave to file supplement to post trial brief, conference with team re objection.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
3/11/20	Review Sunoco's Supplement.	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00
3/16/20	Review draft Response to Sunoco's supplement, Motion for leave to file response to Sunoco's Supplement, and Gibney Order resetting final arguments.	3.60	\$700.00	\$2,520.00
3/23/20	Review Order granting our motion to file response; review our Response to DF's Supplemental Brief.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
3/30/20	Team status conference re case.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
4/3/20	Conference with team re research on unclaimed property treatment in bankruptcy, case law review; conference with RNB.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
4/13/20	Team conference re case issues, status, to do list, oral arguments.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00

4/27/20	Conference re case status, issues to raise in closing arguments.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
5/1/20	Confer with team re availability for conference with Judge re possibly holding closing arguments via videoconference.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
5/5/20	Review Notice re Reconsideration and reversal of Opinion.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
5/6/20	Attend telephonic conference with Gibney re closing arguments.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/14/20	Review Sunoco's response reversal of opinion.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/27/20	Review Order re closing arguments, masks, 6 ft apart.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
6/17/20	Attended closing arguments via telephonic hearing; conferenced with team re results.	4.40	\$700.00	\$3,080.00
6/20/20	Reviewed notices of filings of demonstratives.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
8/7/20	Review Notice of filing of exhibits.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
8/17/20	Receive and review ORDER, discuss with team!!!	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
8/18/20	Conference with team re accrued interest, post judgment, pre-judgment.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/24/20	Review notice re updated damages.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
8/24/20	Review Sunoco's notice re objection to our damage calculations, confer with team.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
8/25/20	Receive and review Order setting videoconference re total damages, confer with team re availability.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/27/20	Reviewed Sunoco's supplement to objection on damages; attended hearing on damages, interest.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
8/27/20	Review notice of appeal, discuss with team.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
8/27/20	Review Judgment as to count 1; amended notice of appeal.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
8/28/20	Review Joint motion for additional trial transcript.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
9/2/20	Review joint motion re deposition testimony played at trial.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
9/8/20	Review joint motion to stay ruling on attorneys fees and costs.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
9/8/20	Review Class Counsel's brief re distribution of damages.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
9/11/20	Draft EOAs for BL on appeal	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
9/18/20	Review Order re Appellants to brief finality, confer with team	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
9/21/20	Review Sunoco's brief on finality	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
9/24/20	Review Sunoco's Motion for new trial, conferenced with team.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
9/24/20	Review Motion to alter Order.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
9/28/20	Review Reply re damages award.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/1/20	Review DF's Mtn to file surreply.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/2/20	Review D's Surreply.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/6/20	Review Memo re finality of judgment.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/8/20	Review our response to motion for new trial and motion to alter or amend judgment.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
10/13/20	Review Order re statement re allocation and distribution.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/19/20	Review Sunoco's allocation vs. distribution statement.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/20/20	Review our statement re distribution.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/22/20	Review DF's reply re motion to alter judgment and motion for new trial.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
10/29/20	Review draft Plan of Allocation Order.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/31/20	Review Notice of appeal and second amended notice of appeal.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00

11/3/20	Review order dismissing appeal.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/25/20	Review Sunoco's mtn for new trial and motion to alter judgment.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/9/20	Review Opinion and Order denying motion for new trial and to alter judgment.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/10/20	Review Notice of appeal.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/2/21	Reviewed Decision from Circuit Court dismissing the appeal, conferenced with team.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
11/11/21	Reviewed Sunoco's petition for rehearing en banc.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
11/30/21	Review correspondence from BB re assignments for HOA, executing on judgment, assets, fee motion; conference with team re strategy; in-depth research re Sunoco entity structure.	5.20	\$700.00	\$3,640.00
12/3/21	Confer with team re execution on judgment; continue research on ET structure, interrelatedness of Sunoco entities, assets.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
12/4/21	Continue research on ET entities; draft spreadsheet outline of entities.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
12/5/21	Conference with team re status of research on ET entities; continue research.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
12/6/21	Review 30b6 Exhibit A areas of inquiry for HOA deponent scope; confer with team re the same.	3.20	\$700.00	\$2,240.00
12/7/21	Continue research on ET/Sunoco entities/assets; review PJ's memo on execution and garnishment; conference with team re all.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
12/8/21	Conference with team re bond; research re posting bond.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/10/20	Review Notice of appeal	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
3/4/21	Reviewed Sunoco's opening brief o appeal	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
3/11/21	Reviewed Amicus Curiae brief from US Chamber of Commerce	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
3/11/21	Reviewed Amicus Curiae brief from Petroleum Alliance	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
3/24/21	Reviewed joint stipulation re interest payments	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
6/2/21	Reviewed Brief of Appellee	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
6/8/21	Reviewed NARO amicus brief	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
6/23/21	Reviewed Reply brief of Appellants	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00
6/28/21	Reviewed notice of supplemental authority by Sunoco	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/18/21	Reviewed Order re supplemental briefs; conferenced with team	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/20/21	Reviewed Sunoco's memo on final order	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/22/21	Reviewed our draft memo on finality	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/25/21	Reviewed supplemental memo on finality; researched case law referenced	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
11/2/21	Reviewed Decision from Circuit Court dismissing the appeal,	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
11/11/21	Reviewed Sunoco's petition for rehearing en banc.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
11/30/21	Review correspondence re assignments for HOA, executing on judgment, assets, fee motion; conference with team re strategy; in-depth research on Sunoco entity structure	5.20	\$700.00	\$3,640.00
12/3/21	Confer with team re execution on judgment, continue research on ET structure, interrelatedness of Sunoco entites, assets.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00

12/4/21	Continue research on ET entities; draft spreadsheet outline of entities.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
12/5/21	Conference with team re status of research on ET entities; continue research.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
12/6/21	Review 30b6 Exhibit A areas of inquiry for HOA deponent scope; confer with team re the same.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
12/7/21	Continue research on ET/Sunoco entities/assets; review PJ's memo on execution and garnishment; conference with team re all.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
12/8/21	Conference with team re bond; research re posting bond.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/11/21	Review all correspondence re ET structure, assets summary, Exhibit A to 30b6.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/13/21	Review Motion for hearing on assets and motion to set deadline for motions for attorney fees.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/13/21	Review drafts of Motion for Asset Hearing and deadline for attorneys fees extension with proposed orders.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
12/27/21	Review DF's Response to Motion for HOA.; discuss with team	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/27/21	Review Sunoco's response to our motion to set deadline for motion on attorney fees.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/10/22	Review draft replies ISO our Motion for HOA and Deadline for Atty fees.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
1/11/22	Review Order re ruling on our motion for deadline is deferred pending appeal status; conference with team.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/24/22	Conference with team re case status, upcoming deadlines.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/3/22	Review Order granting our motion to set deadline for atty fee motion.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/7/22	Conference with team re case status; review Order granting asset hearing and referring to MJ West.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
2/8/22	Conference with team re fee motions, experts, reports, deadlines; reviewed 1099 sent to Perry.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
2/9/22	Review West Order re telephonic hearing.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/10/22	Attend telephonic conference with Judge West re asset hearing; review Minute Order.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
2/11/22	Review Sunocos Motion to Modify the Plan of Allocation Order; discussed with team.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
2/15/22	Conference with team re fee experts, case strategy.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
2/17/22	Review Sunoco's Supplement and Motion to Enjoin Enforcement of the Judgment.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
2/17/22	Review Sunoco's Response to Hearing on Assets.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
2/21/22	Review multiple correspondence re cases strategy; review PJ's redline of brief on documents to be produced.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
2/22/22	Reviewed Brief on documents to be produced at hearing on assets.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
2/24/22	Reviewed Motion to Strike Sunoco's Motion to Modify/Rule 58 Motion and response brief	1.80	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
2/28/22	Review SCOTUS order granting extension; Sunoco's Motion for Leave to File Reply in Opposition to Document Discovery Concerning Defendants' Property and Assets	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
3/1/22	Reviewed minute order, diary new deadline	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00

3/2/22	Worked on BL Declaration, circulated draft; conferenced with PBL re changes; reviewed current litigation expenses; conferenced with group re stipulation.	3.40	\$700.00	\$2,380.00
3/3/22	Reviewed JAG order re reply, diary date	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
3/4/22	Reviewed JAG orders re replies, updated dates, reviewed Sunoco Response to motion for hearing	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
3/7/22	Review multiple correspondence re recoverable fees under PRSA; conference with team; reviewed Sunoco's Reply on Motion to Alter Judgment and Response to our Motion to Strike	1.80	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
3/8/22	Review correspondence re our Reply to Motion to Strike; review Reply.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
3/9/22	Review our reply to Motion to Enjoin	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
3/22/22	Review correspondence re hearing date; diary hearing.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
3/29/22	Reviewed SCOTUS order granting more time; conference with team re notice	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
3/31/22	Prepare for and attend Video Conference Hearing for Motion to Alter Order, Motion for Preliminary Injunction and 2 Motions to Strike Documents	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
4/6/22	Review JAG order	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
4/28/22	Reviewed Sunoco's Petition for Writ of Certiorari; reviewed Settlement conference statement	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
5/2/22	Review current draft of mediation statement	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/14/22	Reviewed PBL's memo re mediation	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
5/17/22	Reviewed correspondence re mediation and MOU; prepared for upcoming mediation; conferenced with team	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
7/1/22	Reviewed multiple filings by Sunoco and order by Tenth requesting briefs addressing jurisdiction	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
7/13/22	Reviewed our Reply and Sunoco's Response to our Supplement to Motion for Atty Fees	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
7/14/22	Reviewed both jurisdictional memos; conferenced with team	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
7/15/22	Reviewed our response re injunction pending appeal; reviewed correspondence with team regarding execution on assets	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
7/16/22	Reviewed our Brief in Opposition filed with SCOTUS	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
8/4/22	Reviewed Tenth Circuit order denying Sunoco's motion for injunction and motion to consolidate; diaried briefing schedule	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/8/22	Reviewed Order granting HOA; diaried all info; discussed with team	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
8/21/22	Began preparing for HOA; organizing and indexing documents and pleadings; reviewed discovery responses and documents produced	5.20	\$700.00	\$3,640.00
8/22/22	Further preparation for HOA; reviewed all pertinent pleadings regarding assets; reviewed local rules on execution; multiple conferences regarding discovery.	6.80	\$700.00	\$4,760.00

8/23/22	Review Sunoco's objection to HOA and doc production; draft correspondence regarding fact that Rule 72 applies only to pretrial motions so the entire basis for their objection is wrong. This is a post judgment enforcement action, not a pretrial action.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
8/25/22	Review Sunoco's motion to stay case; conference with RNB re strategy; reviewed order denying motion for stay and motion for administrative stay	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
8/26/22	Reviewed Sunoco's Reply re their objection to HOA and producing documents; conferred with team re strategy going forward.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
8/27/22	Conferenced with team re strategy on execution; continued preparing documents for hearing; began drafting line of questioning for witnesses	7.20	\$700.00	\$5,040.00
8/29/22	Continued preparing for hearing on assets; prepared documents; conferenced with team; reviewed memo on fraudulent transfers	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
8/30/22	Conferred with local counsel re collection efforts/staret;	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
8/31/22	Research re ET assets; reviewed multiple SEC filings of multiple ET entities;	6.20	\$700.00	\$4,340.00
9/1/22	Conferenced with team re SEC filings; reviewed Sunoco's document production; prepared index of documents; further conferencing and correspondence with team	7.80	\$700.00	\$5,460.00
9/2/22	Reviewed our Notice of noncompliance	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
9/7/22	Conference with team re upcoming hearing; reviewed Reply ISO ER application for stay pending cert petition	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00
9/8/22	Continued preparation for HOA; gathered and reviewed pertinent checkstubs and contracts	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
9/9/22	Review and analyze Sunoco's document production; conference with team re the same; correspond with team re upcoming Hearing on Assets	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
9/11/22	Continue prep for hearing; began printing and preparing witness notebooks; conferenced with team; prepared outline of questioning	4.40	\$700.00	\$3,080.00
9/12/22	Travel to and attend hearing on assets, conduct witness questioning, return	11.00	\$700.00	\$7,700.00
9/13/22	Conference with team about hearing, new documents to be produced, defendants now referring to Sunoco as ET f/k/a Sunoco.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
9/13/22	Reviewed Sunoco's opening brief on appeal 22-7018	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
9/19/22	Reviewed and analyzed Sunoco's document production; reviewed Sunoco's response brief to our proposed Report & Recommendations; conferenced with team	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
9/23/22	Review our Reply on Report and Recommendations and revised proposed R&R	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/3/22	Review SCOTUS Order denying cert; conference with team	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/4/22	Review all garnishment motions and summons	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/5/22	Review Sunoco's surreply on Report & recommendations; review our Response to surreply	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00

10/12/22	Reviewed Sunoco's ER motion to deposit funds into court registry; conference with team; review our Response	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/13/22	Review Sunoco's reply on ER motion to deposit funds and proposed order submitted to court	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/14/22	Review our Response brief in appeal 22-7018	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
10/21/22	Review Sunoco's motion for hearing on its motion to deposit funds	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/25/22	Conference with team about hearing, notice to be filed	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/2/22	Reviewed our Motion for default judgment and proposed orders on garnishment affidavits; reviewed Sunoco's Notice of funds deposited	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/4/22	Reviewed Sunoco's Reply on 22-7018	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
11/5/22	Reviewed entry of court's Report & Recommendations; conferenced with team	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/9/22	Reviewed Sunoco's MsTD garnishment proceedings	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/18/22	Reviewed Sunoco's objection to court's report & recommendations; reviewed our responses to Sunoco's MsTD garnishments; reviewed JND Decl	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/29/22	Review Order setting hearing on Sunoco's motion to dismiss garnishments; conferenced with team; reviewed Sunoco's Reply on garnishments	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/30/22	Reviewed our Motion to Strike and Response to Sunoco's objection to court's report and recommendations	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/1/22	Travel to and attend hearing on Sunoco's Motions to dismiss garnishment proceedings	8.00	\$700.00	\$5,600.00
12/5/22	Reviewed Court's Findings and Recommendation re Dec 1 hearing; conferenced with team	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/14/22	Reviewed our Agreed Response to court's Findings and recommendations	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
12/21/22	Reviewed our proposed schedule on various remaining motions, dismissals of garnishments, and JAG Order adopting Report & Recommendation related to Dec 1 hearing	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
1/3/22	Review Sunoco's withdrawal of objection to our motion to set deadline for atty fee motions	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/6/23	Review JAG Order setting hearing on motion for attorney fees/costs, diary, conference with team	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/10/23	Review Tenth Cir Order re oral argument; conference with team	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00

Total Case Hours	444.60	\$311,220.00
-------------------------	---------------	---------------------

Barnes & Lewis
Cline, et al., v. Sunoco, Inc. (R&M) et al.
ED/OK 6:17-CIV-00313-JAG

	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
Robert N. Barnes	480.10	\$1,075	\$516,107.50
Patranell B. Lewis	378.20	\$875	\$330,925.00
Emily N. Kitch	444.60	\$700	\$311,220.00
	1,302.90		\$1,158,252.50

Whitten & Burrage, LLP
 512 N. Broadway Avenue, Suite 300
 Oklahoma City, OK 73102
 (405) 516-7800

Tax ID #26-1468767

Royalty Payment Attorney Contingent Fee Cases

Page: 1
 01/23/2023
 Account No: 460-0002
 Statement No: 1

Cline, Perry v. Sunoco (RUL)

Interim Statement

Fees

			Hours	
12/15/2019	MB	Travel to Muskogee, OK; meeting with co-counsel to prepare for trial.	7.80	
12/16/2019	MB	Meetings with co-counsel - Trial.	10.30	
12/17/2019	MB	Meetings with co-counsel - Trial.	9.50	
		For Current Services Rendered	27.60	24,150.00

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
Michael Burrage	27.60	\$875.00	\$24,150.00

Total Current Work 24,150.00

Balance Due \$24,150.00

Please include account number on check and make check payable to Whitten & Burrage, LLP.

Thank you

Beck Redden LLP

1221 McKinney Street, Suite 4500
Houston, TX 77010
(713) 951-3700
FED. I.D. #76-0355070

December 22, 2022

Billed through: 12/22/22

INVOICE #: 2576 - 00001 - 0 RSP

Perry Cline
c/o Bradley E. Beckworth
Nix Patterson L.L.P.
3600 N. Capitol of Texas Highway, Suite 350B

Austin, TX 78746

No. 20-7055; Perry Cline v. Sunoco, Inc., et al.; In the United States Court of Appeals for the Tenth Circuit

No. 6:17-cv-313-JAG; Perry Cline v. Sunoco, Inc., et al.; In the United States District Court for the Eastern District of Oklahoma

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

RSP	09/16/2020		0.60	0.60	775.00	465.00
09/16/20	RSP	Conference with B. Beckworth regarding potential 10th Circuit appeal.				0.60 hrs
RSP	09/21/2020		2.00	2.00	775.00	1,550.00
09/21/20	RSP	Cline - Review district court opinions on final judgment and class certification and related briefing; correspondence regarding potential engagement; prepare fee proposal.				2.00 hrs
RSP	09/23/2020		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
09/23/20	RSP	Cline - Review response to plan of distribution.				0.20 hrs
RSP	09/30/2020		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
09/30/20	RSP	Cline - Conference with D. Pate regarding response to post-judgment motions and 10th Circuit briefing order.				0.20 hrs
RSP	10/01/2020		1.00	1.00	775.00	775.00
10/01/20	RSP	Review 10th circuit briefing order and defendants' jurisdictional brief; review motion to alter or amend judgment.				1.00 hrs
RSP	10/02/2020		2.30	2.30	775.00	1,782.50
10/02/20	RSP	Conference with D. Pate regarding response to 10CA jurisdictional inquiry and post-judgment motions; review notice of appeal and amended notice of appeal; legal research regarding finality.				2.30 hrs
RSP	10/03/2020		2.50	2.50	775.00	1,937.50
10/03/20	RSP	Draft memorandum brief regarding appellate jurisdiction.				2.50 hrs
RSP	10/04/2020		0.80	0.80	775.00	620.00
10/04/20	RSP	Draft and revise memorandum brief regarding appellate jurisdiction.				0.80 hrs
RSP	10/05/2020		0.70	0.70	775.00	542.50
10/05/20	RSP	Correspondence regarding 10th Circuit jurisdictional brief; revise same and prepare for filing; correspondence regarding same.				0.70 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 2

RSP	10/06/2020			2.00	2.00	775.00	1,550.00	
10/06/20	RSP	Correspondence regarding final draft of jurisdictional brief; finalize and file same; research regarding standard for Rule 59 motions.						2.00 hrs
RSP	10/07/2020			2.30	2.30	775.00	1,782.50	
10/07/20	RSP	Legal research and revise procedural sections for Rule 59 responses; correspondence regarding same; review draft responses to post-judgment motions.						2.30 hrs
RSP	10/08/2020			1.20	1.20	775.00	930.00	
10/08/20	RSP	Review and comment on draft responses to motion to alter/amend and motion for new trial.						1.20 hrs
RSP	11/03/2020			0.80	0.80	775.00	620.00	
11/03/20	RSP	Review 10th Circuit jurisdictional order and supplemental briefing order; correspondence regarding same and next steps.						0.80 hrs
RSP	11/06/2020			0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00	
11/06/20	RSP	Review materials related to jurisdictional inquiry.						0.20 hrs
RSP	11/08/2020			2.80	2.80	775.00	2,170.00	
11/08/20	RSP	Draft supplemental brief regarding appellate jurisdiction.						2.80 hrs
RSP	11/10/2020			2.00	2.00	775.00	1,550.00	
11/10/20	RSP	Revise jurisdictional brief and incorporate comments from trial counsel; study briefing regarding plan of allocation and revise supplemental brief.						2.00 hrs
RSP	11/13/2020	L520	A107	0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50	
11/13/20	RSP	Conference with D. Tate regarding jurisdictional brief and next steps.						0.30 hrs
RSP	11/17/2020			1.80	1.80	775.00	1,395.00	
11/17/20	RSP	Revise memorandum brief regarding finality and file same; review filing by Sunoco.						1.80 hrs
OJM	11/18/2020			0.30	0.30	555.00	166.50	
11/18/20	OJM	Conference with R. Post; begin review of case documents.						0.30 hrs
RSP	12/09/2020			0.40	0.40	775.00	310.00	
12/09/20	RSP	Review order overruling post-judgment motions and correspondence regarding same.						0.40 hrs
RSP	12/10/2020			0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00	
12/10/20	RSP	Correspondence regarding alternate security and payment of bond premiums.						0.20 hrs
RSP	12/18/2020			0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50	
12/18/20	RSP	Review order lifting abatement and correspondence regarding same; review draft guaranty agreement and correspondence regarding same.						0.30 hrs
RSP	12/21/2020			2.30	2.30	775.00	1,782.50	
12/21/20	RSP	Conference with D. Pate regarding bond premiums as appellate costs; legal research and correspondence regarding same.						2.30 hrs
RSP	12/23/2020			0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00	
12/23/20	RSP	Correspondence regarding mediation conference.						0.20 hrs
RSP	01/05/2021			1.40	1.40	775.00	1,085.00	
01/05/21	RSP	Participate in mediation call with Tenth Circuit.						1.40 hrs
RSP	01/12/2021			0.50	0.50	775.00	387.50	
01/12/21	RSP	Review recent grant of certiorari regarding bond premiums and correspondence regarding same.						0.50 hrs
OJM	01/20/2021			7.60	7.60	555.00	4,218.00	
01/20/21	OJM	Continue review of case documents.						7.60 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 3

DNN	02/08/2021		2.80	2.80	505.00	1,414.00
02/08/21	DNN	Review Plaintiffs' Original Opinion, Opinion on class certification, Opinion and Order following trial on the merits, and Judgment Order following trial on the merits to gain basic familiarity with factual background and legal issues in case for appeal.				2.80 hrs
RSP	02/18/2021		0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50
02/18/21	RSP	Conference and correspondence regarding execution on judgment.				0.30 hrs
RSP	02/25/2021		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
02/25/21	RSP	Correspondence with trial counsel.				0.20 hrs
OJM	03/01/2021		3.80	3.80	555.00	2,109.00
03/01/21	OJM	Continue review of orders and opinions.				3.80 hrs
RSP	03/02/2021		1.50	1.50	775.00	1,162.50
03/02/21	RSP	Conference with J. Angelovich, B. Beckworth and D. Pate and correspondence regarding same.				1.50 hrs
OJM	03/02/2021		7.60	7.60	555.00	4,218.00
03/02/21	OJM	Continue review of orders and opinions; begin review of hearing transcripts.				7.60 hrs
RSP	03/03/2021		1.00	1.00	775.00	775.00
03/03/21	RSP	Review brief of appellant.				1.00 hrs
OJM	03/03/2021		9.50	9.50	555.00	5,272.50
03/03/21	OJM	Continue review of transcripts; begin review appellant's brief; begin review of authorities on [REDACTED]				9.50 hrs
RSP	03/04/2021		0.50	0.50	775.00	387.50
03/04/21	RSP	Review appellant's brief.				0.50 hrs
OJM	03/04/2021		6.20	6.20	555.00	3,441.00
03/04/21	OJM	Continue review of briefs; begin review of applicable authorities.				6.20 hrs
RSP	03/05/2021		1.60	1.60	775.00	1,240.00
03/05/21	RSP	Conference with D. Pate regarding strategy for brief of appellee; correspondence regarding same.				1.60 hrs
OJM	03/05/2021		5.30	5.30	555.00	2,941.50
03/05/21	OJM	Prepare for call with Nix firm; continue review of briefing, applicable authorities, and record.				5.30 hrs
DNN	03/05/2021		1.40	1.40	505.00	707.00
03/05/21	DNN	Confer with R. Post, O. McGovern, and D. Pate regarding D. Pate's initial impressions of Appellants' brief, general strategy for response, and plan of action going forward.				1.40 hrs
RSP	03/08/2021		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
03/08/21	RSP	Correspondence regarding amicus briefs.				0.20 hrs
RSP	03/08/2021		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
03/08/21	RSP	Conference with O. McGovern regarding joint appendix.				0.20 hrs
OJM	03/08/2021		1.70	1.70	555.00	943.50
03/08/21	OJM	Conference with M. Heidler regarding corrupted record; prepare for conference with D. Nightingale; conference with D. Nightingale.				1.70 hrs
DNN	03/08/2021		5.20	5.20	505.00	2,626.00
03/08/21	DNN	Study entirety of Appellants' Brief; confer with O. McGovern regarding initial tasks and division of responsibility regarding same.				5.20 hrs
JPR	03/08/2021		0.40	0.40	470.00	188.00
03/08/21	JPR	Draft email to O. McGovern regarding Tenth Circuit waiver/forfeiture jurisprudence; review appellant's brief.				0.40 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0 PAGE 4

OJM	03/09/2021		5.50	5.50	555.00	3,052.50
03/09/21	OJM	Review district court briefing; begin review of authorities cited therein.				5.50 hrs
DNN	03/09/2021		1.40	1.40	505.00	707.00
03/09/21	DNN	Review trial court docket sheet to identify motions and briefs requiring review for appeal; review Appellant's post-trial brief and cross reference with Appellant's Opening Brief to determine extent to which Appellant properly preserved arguments in Opening Brief in proceedings below.				1.40 hrs
RSP	03/10/2021		1.20	1.20	775.00	930.00
03/10/21	RSP	Conference with trial counsel and potential amici regarding amicus briefs; internal conference regarding key issues.				1.20 hrs
OJM	03/10/2021		7.50	7.50	555.00	4,162.50
03/10/21	OJM	Continue review of briefing; continue review of applicable authorities.				7.50 hrs
DNN	03/10/2021		0.80	0.80	505.00	404.00
03/10/21	DNN	Prepare short outline of Appellants' Brief for use in preservation review; continue to review Appellant's post-trial brief and cross reference with Appellant's Opening Brief to determine extent to which Appellant properly preserved arguments in Opening Brief in proceedings below.				0.80 hrs
OJM	03/11/2021		3.00	3.00	555.00	1,665.00
03/11/21	OJM	Continue review of briefing; continue review of applicable authorities.				3.00 hrs
OJM	03/14/2021		1.00	1.00	555.00	555.00
03/14/21	OJM	Continue review of briefing; continue review of applicable authorities.				1.00 hrs
OJM	03/15/2021		6.30	6.30	555.00	3,496.50
03/15/21	OJM	Continue review of briefing; continue review of applicable authorities.				6.30 hrs
DNN	03/15/2021		0.10	0.10	505.00	50.50
03/15/21	DNN	Confer with R. Post and O. McGovern regarding status and plan of action for Appellees' Brief.				0.10 hrs
OJM	03/16/2021		7.00	7.00	555.00	3,885.00
03/16/21	OJM	Continue review of briefing; continue review of applicable authorities.				7.00 hrs
OJM	03/17/2021		8.30	8.30	555.00	4,606.50
03/17/21	OJM	Continue review of briefing; continue review of applicable authorities.				8.30 hrs
OJM	03/18/2021		7.80	7.80	555.00	4,329.00
03/18/21	OJM	Conference with M. Heidler regarding request for extension; continue review of briefing and applicable authorities.				7.80 hrs
OJM	03/22/2021		6.50	6.50	555.00	3,607.50
03/22/21	OJM	Continue review of briefing; continue review of applicable authorities.				6.50 hrs
RSP	03/23/2021		1.60	1.60	775.00	1,240.00
03/23/21	RSP	Review amicus briefs; conference with O. McGovern and D. Nightingale regarding strategy for appellee's brief.				1.60 hrs
OJM	03/23/2021		10.20	10.20	555.00	5,661.00
03/23/21	OJM	Continue review of briefing; continue review of applicable authorities; continue drafting preservation and issue chart; conference with R. Post and D. Nightingale.				10.20 hrs
DNN	03/23/2021		2.40	2.40	505.00	1,212.00
03/23/21	DNN	Review Appellants' Brief and R. Post's outline of preservation issues to reengage with case and prepare for conference with O. McGovern and R. Post; confer with O. McGovern and R. Post regarding overall strategy, detailed responses to each argument in Appellants' arguments in brief, and next steps for appeal.				2.40 hrs
OJM	03/24/2021		7.50	7.50	555.00	4,162.50
03/24/21	OJM	Prepare draft outline of appellee's brief.				7.50 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 5

DNN	03/24/2021		0.30	0.30	505.00	151.50
03/24/21	DNN	Review O. McGovern's high level, initial outline of Appellees' Brief.				0.30 hrs
RSP	03/25/2021		0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50
03/25/21	RSP	Review outline of appellee's brief and correspondence regarding same.				0.30 hrs
OJM	03/25/2021		8.30	8.30	555.00	4,606.50
03/25/21	OJM	Continue review of authorities cited in trial court briefing.				8.30 hrs
RSP	03/27/2021		3.00	3.00	775.00	2,325.00
03/27/21	RSP	Review plaintiff's post-trial briefs and outline issues for appellate brief.				3.00 hrs
RSP	03/29/2021		3.50	3.50	775.00	2,712.50
03/29/21	RSP	Review and revise outline of brief; [REDACTED]; conference with O. McGovern regarding same; correspondence with trial counsel regarding same; revise outline.				3.50 hrs
OJM	03/29/2021		0.40	0.40	555.00	222.00
03/29/21	OJM	Conference with R. Post.				0.40 hrs
RSP	03/30/2021		2.80	2.80	775.00	2,170.00
03/30/21	RSP	Revise outline of brief of appellees; correspondence regarding same; conference with O. McGovern regarding same; review comments from trial counsel and incorporate into outline; correspondence with trial counsel regarding same.				2.80 hrs
OJM	03/30/2021		1.30	1.30	555.00	721.50
03/30/21	OJM	Conference with R. Post.				1.30 hrs
OJM	03/31/2021		2.20	2.20	555.00	1,221.00
03/31/21	OJM	Review outline and draft proposed division of research and drafting responsibilities.				2.20 hrs
RSP	04/01/2021		1.00	1.00	775.00	775.00
04/01/21	RSP	Conferences with O. McGovern and D. Nightingale regarding allocation of responsibility for brief of appellees; review comments from D. Pate regarding outline and correspondence regarding same.				1.00 hrs
OJM	04/01/2021		0.80	0.80	555.00	444.00
04/01/21	OJM	Conference with R. Post.				0.80 hrs
DNN	04/01/2021		0.30	0.30	505.00	151.50
04/01/21	DNN	Review most recent version of outline of Appellees' Brief and O. McGovern's proposed division of labor regarding same; confer with R. Post regarding division of labor on Appellee's Brief.				0.30 hrs
OJM	04/05/2021		6.70	6.70	555.00	3,718.50
04/05/21	OJM	Begin abstracting trial testimony.				6.70 hrs
OJM	04/06/2021		9.00	9.00	555.00	4,995.00
04/06/21	OJM	Continue abstracting trial testimony.				9.00 hrs
OJM	04/07/2021		7.00	7.00	555.00	3,885.00
04/07/21	OJM	Continue abstracting trial testimony.				7.00 hrs
DNN	04/07/2021		6.30	6.30	505.00	3,181.50
04/07/21	DNN	Review O. McGovern's division of responsibilities and R. Post's outline of Appellee's Brief; review and outline sections of Appellant's Brief and all lower court briefing and district court rulings relevant to assigned sections of Appellee's Brief to formulate more detailed counterarguments to relevant portions of Appellant's Brief and determine whether Sunoco has adequately preserved contested arguments.				6.30 hrs
OJM	04/08/2021		8.30	8.30	555.00	4,606.50
04/08/21	OJM	Continue abstracting trial testimony.				8.30 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 6

DNN	04/08/2021	7.50	7.50	505.00	3,787.50
04/08/21	DNN	Review notes from review of relevant briefing and rulings below; consolidate counterarguments devised from same and revise sections of personal version of R. Post's outline of Appellees' Brief arguing that [REDACTED]			7.50 hrs
RSP	04/09/2021	0.40	0.40	775.00	310.00
04/09/21	RSP	Conferences regarding appeal.			0.40 hrs
DNN	04/09/2021	7.80	7.80	505.00	3,939.00
04/09/21	DNN	Review notes and annotated outline of assigned sections of Appellee's Brief; review and identify all trial court documents on Beck Redden drive to confirm all relevant documents have been reviewed and studied; review trial court briefing and ruling on Sunoco's motion to alter or amend the judgment and motion for a new trial to identify and assess arguments relevant to appeal and determine if Sunoco adequately preserved arguments in Section I of Appellee's Brief; research applicable authorities to [REDACTED] [REDACTED] research applicable authorities on "clear error" standard in general.			7.80 hrs
OJM	04/10/2021	6.30	6.30	555.00	3,496.50
04/10/21	OJM	Continue abstracting trial testimony.			6.30 hrs
DNN	04/12/2021	5.40	5.40	505.00	2,727.00
04/12/21	DNN	Review 69 of 69 pages of O. McGovern's record abstract, making note of record excerpts relevant to Section I of Appellee's Brief; review relevant portions of record and incorporate citations into applicable portions of detailed Section I outline; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; incorporate all research findings into detailed Section I outline.			5.40 hrs
RSP	04/13/2021	0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50
04/13/21	RSP	Conference with D. Pate regarding strategy for appellees' brief.			0.30 hrs
DNN	04/13/2021	9.30	9.30	505.00	4,696.50
04/13/21	DNN	Review detailed outline of Section I of Appellee's brief in preparation for drafting of same; review portions of testimony of E. Koelling and B. Ley cited by district court to support liability findings and incorporate citations to same into detailed outline; draft Section I.A.2 of Appellee's Brief arguing that Sunoco violated Product Revenue Standards Act on classwide basis; draft Section I.B.1 of Appellee's Brief [REDACTED] [REDACTED]			9.30 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 7

RSP	04/14/2021	0.70	0.70	775.00	542.50
04/14/21	RSP	Conference with O. McGovern and D. Nightingale regarding appellees' brief.			0.70 hrs
OJM	04/14/2021	5.30	5.30	555.00	2,941.50
04/14/21	OJM	Prepare for conference with R. Post and D. Nightengale; review record abstract for key testimony.			5.30 hrs
DNN	04/14/2021	9.10	9.10	505.00	4,595.50
04/14/21	DNN	Review and revise Section I.A.2 of Appellee's Brief arguing that Sunoco violated Product Revenue Standards Act on classwide basis; continue to research applicable authorities for law supporting argument that [REDACTED] confer with R. Post and O. McGovern regarding Appellee's Brief; draft Section I.B.2 of Appellee's Brief arguing that class members whose payments were sent to unclaimed property funds "received" those payments through the state, conducting follow-up research and reviewing relevant record materials as necessary.			9.10 hrs
OJM	04/15/2021	1.70	1.70	555.00	943.50
04/15/21	OJM	Draft motion for extension.			1.70 hrs
DNN	04/15/2021	8.40	8.40	505.00	4,242.00
04/15/21	DNN	Review and revise Section I.A.2 of Appellee's Brief arguing that Sunoco violated Product Revenue Standards Act on classwide basis; finish drafting Section I.B.2 of Appellee's Brief arguing that class members whose payments were sent to unclaimed property funds "received" those payments through the state, conducting follow-up research and reviewing relevant record materials as necessary; draft Section I.B.3 of Appellee's Brief arguing that class members were "legally entitled" to proceeds, conducting follow-up research and reviewing relevant record materials as necessary.			8.40 hrs
RSP	04/16/2021	0.70	0.70	775.00	542.50
04/16/21	RSP	Draft motion for extension of time and correspondence regarding same.			0.70 hrs
DNN	04/16/2021	7.50	7.50	505.00	3,787.50
04/16/21	DNN	Finish drafting Section I.B.3 of Appellee's Brief arguing that class members were "legally entitled" to proceeds, conducting follow-up research and reviewing relevant record materials as necessary; review and revise Section I.A.2 of Appellee's Brief arguing that Sunoco violated Product Revenue Standards Act on classwide basis, Section I.B.1 of same arguing that district court did not clearly err in finding Sunoco liability to class members whose proceeds were sent to unclaimed property funds, and Section I.B.2 of Appellee's Brief arguing that class members whose payments were sent to unclaimed property funds "received" those payments through the state.			7.50 hrs
DNN	04/19/2021	3.10	3.10	505.00	1,565.50
04/19/21	DNN	Review and revise Section I.A.2 of Appellee's Brief arguing that Sunoco violated Product Revenue Standards Act on classwide basis, Section I.B.1 of same arguing that district court did not clearly err in finding Sunoco liability to class members whose proceeds were sent to unclaimed property funds, Section I.B.2 of same arguing that class members whose payments were sent to unclaimed property funds "received" those payments through the state, and Section I.B.3 of same arguing that class members were "legally entitled" to proceeds.			3.10 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 8

DNN	04/21/2021		1.30	1.30	505.00	656.50
04/21/21	DNN	Review and revise Sections I.A.2 and I.B.1 through I.B.3 of Appellee's Brief; review section of Appellants' Brief challenging standing in preparation for drafting response to same; draft opening of Section I.B.4 of Appellee's Brief summarizing Sunoco's standing arguments.				1.30 hrs
DNN	04/22/2021		9.70	9.70	505.00	4,898.50
04/22/21	DNN	Review and revise Sections I.A.2 and I.B.1 through I.B.3 of Appellee's Brief; continue drafting Section I.B.4 of Appellee's Brief refuting Sunoco's standing arguments, researching applicable authorities as necessary; draft Section I.B.5 of Appellee's Brief arguing that Sunoco's protests of impossibility and injustice ring hollow; review O. McGovern's trial abstract of E. Koelling's testimony to identify record citations relevant to assigned portion of Statement of Facts concerning Sunoco's business practices.				9.70 hrs
RSP	04/23/2021		1.20	1.20	775.00	930.00
04/23/21	RSP	Prepare for and participate in strategy conference with D. Pate, O. McGovern, and D. Nightingale.				1.20 hrs
OJM	04/23/2021		0.70	0.70	555.00	388.50
04/23/21	OJM	Conference with D. Pate.				0.70 hrs
DNN	04/23/2021		7.50	7.50	505.00	3,787.50
04/23/21	DNN	Draft section of statement of Facts summarizing Sunoco's business practices and basic facts of litigation, consulting underlying record materials as necessary; confer with R. Post, O. McGovern, and D. Pate regarding D. Pate's comments to R. Post's original outline for Appellee's Brief; review prior correspondence between D. Pate and R. Post regarding Appellee's Brief and D. Pate's outline of significant issues; review and revise Sections I.A.2 and I.B of Appellee's Brief in light of same and conference with team.				7.50 hrs
RSP	05/03/2021		0.80	0.80	775.00	620.00
05/03/21	RSP	Correspondence with B. Beckworth regarding [REDACTED]; review draft of liability section of brief.				0.80 hrs
OJM	05/10/2021		7.00	7.00	555.00	3,885.00
05/10/21	OJM	Review outlines; review correspondence from co-counsel; begin review of authorities in preparation for briefing.				7.00 hrs
OJM	05/11/2021		5.00	5.00	555.00	2,775.00
05/11/21	OJM	Continue review of trial briefing and authorities in preparation for briefing; begin review of key district court orders in preparation for drafting statement of facts.				5.00 hrs
OJM	05/12/2021		4.30	4.30	555.00	2,386.50
05/12/21	OJM	Continue review of key briefing, orders, and testimony.				4.30 hrs
RSP	05/13/2021		2.00	2.00	775.00	1,550.00
05/13/21	RSP	Study record abstract and outline notes for argument section of brief.				2.00 hrs
RSP	05/14/2021		2.50	2.50	775.00	1,937.50
05/14/21	RSP	Study record abstract and outline notes for argument section of brief; conference with D. Nightingale regarding revisions to argument section on liability and unclaimed property.				2.50 hrs
OJM	05/14/2021		3.80	3.80	555.00	2,109.00
05/14/21	OJM	Begin drafting certification arguments.				3.80 hrs
DNN	05/14/2021		1.00	1.00	505.00	505.00
05/14/21	DNN	Review draft versions statement of facts regarding Sunoco's business practices, Section I.A.2, and Section I.B of Argument of Appellee's Brief; confer with R. Post regarding revisions to same.				1.00 hrs

Client-	2576	00001	Invoice # 0			PAGE	9
RSP	05/15/2021			6.80	6.80	775.00	5,270.00
05/15/21	RSP	Draft statutory construction section and burden of proof on marketable title section of brief of appellee.					6.80 hrs
RSP	05/16/2021			12.20	12.20	775.00	9,455.00
05/16/21	RSP	Draft burden of proof on marketable title section, compound interest section, and punitive damages section of brief of appellee.					12.20 hrs
OJM	05/16/2021			5.00	5.00	555.00	2,775.00
05/16/21	OJM	Continue drafting certification arguments.					5.00 hrs
DNN	05/16/2021			5.70	5.70	505.00	2,878.50
05/16/21	DNN	Review and revise statement of facts regarding Sunoco's business practices and Sections I.A.2, I.B.1, and I.B.2 of Appellee's Brief in light of R. Post's feedback, conducting follow-up research and reviewing record materials as necessary.					5.70 hrs
RSP	05/17/2021			6.80	6.80	775.00	5,270.00
05/17/21	RSP	Conferences with O. McGovern and D. Nightingale regarding status of argument sections of brief and plan for circulation of draft sections; correspondence with trial team; study record draft predominance section regarding 570.10.C.4; revise liability section of brief; circulate Part I of brief to trial counsel.					6.80 hrs
OJM	05/17/2021			8.80	8.80	555.00	4,884.00
05/17/21	OJM	Continue drafting certification arguments; begin drafting Section 2 arguments.					8.80 hrs
DNN	05/17/2021			4.70	4.70	505.00	2,373.50
05/17/21	DNN	Review and revise statement of facts regarding Sunoco's business practices and Sections I.B.3, I.B.4, and I.B.5 of Appellee's Brief in light of R. Post's feedback; confer with R. Post regarding same; review R. Post's drafts of Sections I.A and II of Appellee's Brief.					4.70 hrs
RSP	05/18/2021			4.40	4.40	775.00	3,410.00
05/18/21	RSP	Conferences with O. McGovern regarding revisions to damages and class certification sections of brief; revise class certification argument; circulate class certification section to trial counsel.					4.40 hrs
OJM	05/18/2021			11.50	11.50	555.00	6,382.50
05/18/21	OJM	Synthesize comments from Nix Patterson; continue drafting section 2 arguments; conference with R. Post; revise Part III; continue drafting Part II.					11.50 hrs
RSP	05/19/2021			4.00	4.00	775.00	3,100.00
05/19/21	RSP	Correspondence regarding expansion of word limits; revise motion to exceed word limits and file same; revise draft argument on damages; draft adequacy and typicality section and circulate draft brief.					4.00 hrs
OJM	05/19/2021			8.00	8.00	555.00	4,440.00
05/19/21	OJM	Revise Part II.A.2; draft motion for extension; begin drafting statement of facts.					8.00 hrs
RSP	05/20/2021			3.50	3.50	775.00	2,712.50
05/20/21	RSP	Draft statutory background section for statement of the case; conference with O. McGovern regarding same; review draft statement of facts and conference with O. McGovern regarding revisions to same; review draft brief for coverage of all issues; review trial counsel comments on key factual themes.					3.50 hrs
OJM	05/20/2021			9.90	9.90	555.00	5,494.50
05/20/21	OJM	Continue drafting statement of facts; conference with R. Post; revise same.					9.90 hrs
RSP	05/21/2021			5.80	5.80	775.00	4,495.00
05/21/21	RSP	Review draft statement of facts and revise same; conference with O. McGovern regarding same; revise statement of facts; conference with O. McGovern regarding notes from trial counsel; revise draft brief and circulate to trial counsel.					5.80 hrs

Client-	2576 00001	Invoice # 0			PAGE	10
OJM	05/21/2021		9.30	9.30	555.00	5,161.50
05/21/21	OJM	Revise statement of facts; circulate same to R. Post; conference with R. Post; review draft argument section; conference with R. Post to review comments from Nix Patterson.				9.30 hrs
RSP	05/22/2021		3.00	3.00	775.00	2,325.00
05/22/21	RSP	Review draft brief of appellee and outline revisions.				3.00 hrs
RSP	05/23/2021		3.00	3.00	775.00	2,325.00
05/23/21	RSP	Review draft brief of appellee and outline revisions.				3.00 hrs
RSP	05/24/2021		8.50	8.50	775.00	6,587.50
05/24/21	RSP	Conferences with O. McGovern and D. Nightingale regarding revisions to brief of appellee; revise brief.				8.50 hrs
OJM	05/24/2021		6.10	6.10	555.00	3,385.50
05/24/21	OJM	Conference with R. Post; review authorities on punitive damages in cases of statutory violations.				6.10 hrs
DNN	05/24/2021		9.20	9.20	505.00	4,646.00
05/24/21	DNN	Review draft of entire Argument section of Appellee's Brief; [REDACTED]				9.20 hrs
RSP	05/25/2021		10.00	10.00	775.00	7,750.00
05/25/21	RSP	Revise brief of appellee and incorporate trial counsel comments.				10.00 hrs
OJM	05/25/2021		7.20	7.20	555.00	3,996.00
05/25/21	OJM	Continue review of authorities on punitive damages in cases of statutory violations; review correspondence from B. Beckworth and related cases; review comments from Nix Patterson.				7.20 hrs
DNN	05/25/2021		9.30	9.30	505.00	4,696.50
05/25/21	DNN	Review R. Post's revised version of Appellee's Brief; review D. Pate's and B. Beckworth's comments to original version; continue to research applicable authorities on [REDACTED] research applicable authorities on [REDACTED] analyze key authorities to develop argument that [REDACTED]				9.30 hrs
RSP	05/26/2021		11.50	11.50	775.00	8,912.50
05/26/21	RSP	Revise brief of appellee and incorporate trial counsel comments; circulate revised draft to entire team.				11.50 hrs
OJM	05/26/2021		4.50	4.50	555.00	2,497.50
05/26/21	OJM	Continue review of authorities related to JMA decision and amicus briefs.				4.50 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 11

DNN	05/26/2021		7.50	7.50	505.00	3,787.50
05/26/21	DNN	Research applicable authorities on waiver based on a party's failure to develop an argument in an appellate brief draft insert for Argument section of Appellee's brief contending that [REDACTED]				7.50 hrs
RSP	05/27/2021		4.50	4.50	775.00	3,487.50
05/27/21	RSP	Review and edit draft brief.				4.50 hrs
DNN	05/27/2021		2.10	2.10	505.00	1,060.50
05/27/21	DNN	Review R. Post's revised version of Appellee's Brief to identify potential areas to cut.				2.10 hrs
RSP	05/28/2021		11.20	11.20	775.00	8,680.00
05/28/21	RSP	Revise brief of appellee and conferences and correspondence regarding same; incorporate comments from trial counsel.				11.20 hrs
RSP	05/29/2021		1.00	1.00	775.00	775.00
05/29/21	RSP	Revise brief of appellee and correspondence with trial counsel; review appellant's brief and outline for final evaluation.				1.00 hrs
RSP	05/30/2021		2.00	2.00	775.00	1,550.00
05/30/21	RSP	Review appellant's brief and outline for final evaluation.				2.00 hrs
RSP	05/31/2021		13.00	13.00	775.00	10,075.00
05/31/21	RSP	Revise appellee's brief and respond to comments from trial counsel.				13.00 hrs
RSP	06/01/2021		7.60	7.60	775.00	5,890.00
06/01/21	RSP	Revise brief of appellee and conferences regarding same; conference with D. Pate regarding final revisions and incorporate same; circulate near-final draft.				7.60 hrs
OJM	06/01/2021		10.00	10.00	555.00	5,550.00
06/01/21	OJM	Review latest draft of Appellee's brief; cite check same (record cites).				10.00 hrs
DNN	06/01/2021		6.50	6.50	505.00	3,282.50
06/01/21	DNN	Confer with R. Post regarding finalization of Appellee's Brief; proofread and conduct legal cite check on entirety of Appellee's Brief; combine redlines with O. McGovern's redlines and submit consolidated version of revised Appellee's Brief to R. Post.				6.50 hrs
OJM	06/02/2021		3.50	3.50	555.00	1,942.50
06/02/21	OJM	Review authorities and draft motion to take judicial notice; search record to update various citations; assist in finalizing brief.				3.50 hrs
RSP	06/07/2021		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
06/07/21	RSP	Review amicus brief filed by national royalty owners' association.				0.20 hrs
DNN	06/08/2021		0.30	0.30	505.00	151.50
06/08/21	DNN	Review Amicus Curiae brief filed by Oklahoma Chapter of the National Association of Royalty Owners.				0.30 hrs
OJM	06/22/2021		1.00	1.00	555.00	555.00
06/22/21	OJM	Review reply brief.				1.00 hrs
RSP	06/23/2021		1.00	1.00	775.00	775.00
06/23/21	RSP	Review reply brief.				1.00 hrs
RSP	06/24/2021		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
06/24/21	RSP	Correspondence with D. Pate regarding reply brief.				0.20 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 12

DNN	06/24/2021		1.50	1.50	505.00	757.50
06/24/21	DNN	Draft Notice of Appearance and send to L. Crain for filing; review Sunoco's Reply Brief, referencing relevant portion of Appellee's Brief as necessary.				1.50 hrs
DNN	07/06/2021		5.40	5.40	505.00	2,727.00
07/06/21	DNN	Review Sunoco's Rule 28(j) letter notifying court of supplemental authority and TransUnion LLC v. Ramirez, case invoked by Sunoco on standing issue; formulate counterargument to Sunoco's Rule 28(j) letter and draft response to same.				5.40 hrs
RSP	07/07/2021		0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50
07/07/21	RSP	Revise Rule 28(j) letter and circulate same to entire team.				0.30 hrs
DNN	07/07/2021		1.00	1.00	505.00	505.00
07/07/21	DNN	Review and revise response to Sunoco's Rule 28(j) letter; submit same to R. Post.				1.00 hrs
RSP	07/12/2021		0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50
07/12/21	RSP	Finalize and file response to Rule 28(j) letter.				0.30 hrs
RSP	09/14/2021		2.50	2.50	775.00	1,937.50
09/14/21	RSP	Review brief of appellee and prepare settlement evaluation; correspondence regarding same.				2.50 hrs
RSP	09/20/2021		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
09/20/21	RSP	File oral argument acknowledgment.				0.20 hrs
RSP	10/05/2021		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
10/05/21	RSP	Correspondence regarding remote oral argument.				0.20 hrs
RSP	10/18/2021		0.50	0.50	775.00	387.50
10/18/21	RSP	Conference with D. Pate and O. McGovern regarding jurisdictional inquiry and briefing.				0.50 hrs
OJM	10/18/2021		1.60	1.60	555.00	888.00
10/18/21	OJM	Review order from court; review briefing on finality.				1.60 hrs
OJM	10/19/2021		6.00	6.00	555.00	3,330.00
10/19/21	OJM	Draft supplemental brief on finality and appellate jurisdiction.				6.00 hrs
RSP	10/20/2021		0.80	0.80	775.00	620.00
10/20/21	RSP	Review draft supplemental brief regarding jurisdiction and correspondence regarding same; review appellant's supplement and correspondence regarding same.				0.80 hrs
OJM	10/20/2021		1.40	1.40	555.00	777.00
10/20/21	OJM	Review applicable authorities on authority of court to abate appeal pending remand; revise supplemental brief; review supplemental brief from Sunoco; revise Plaintiff's supplemental brief.				1.40 hrs
OJM	10/21/2021		2.50	2.50	555.00	1,387.50
10/21/21	OJM	Revise supplemental brief on finality.				2.50 hrs
RSP	10/25/2021		0.40	0.40	775.00	310.00
10/25/21	RSP	Conference with P. Ryan regarding oral argument strategy and review memorandum regarding same; finalize and file supplemental brief regarding finality.				0.40 hrs
OJM	10/25/2021		1.70	1.70	555.00	943.50
10/25/21	OJM	Review comments from D. Pate and B. Beckworth; revise and finalize supplemental brief and exhibits.				1.70 hrs
RSP	10/29/2021		1.00	1.00	775.00	775.00
10/29/21	RSP	Review briefs in preparation for oral argument.				1.00 hrs
RSP	10/31/2021		0.80	0.80	775.00	620.00
10/31/21	RSP	Review briefs in preparation for oral argument.				0.80 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 13

RSP	11/01/2021		4.20	4.20	775.00	3,255.00
11/01/21	RSP	Review briefs and district court orders in preparation for oral argument; review order dismissing appeal and conferences and correspondence regarding same.				4.20 hrs
DNN	11/01/2021		0.20	0.20	505.00	101.00
11/01/21	DNN	Review Tenth Circuit's order dismissing appeal for lack of jurisdiction.				0.20 hrs
RSP	11/02/2021		2.00	2.00	775.00	1,550.00
11/02/21	RSP	Correspondence regarding next steps and conferences regarding panel; legal research regarding 10th Circuit procedure on [REDACTED] and jurisdictional issues.				2.00 hrs
RSP	11/03/2021		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
11/03/21	RSP	Conference with P. Ryan regarding fee applications and next steps.				0.20 hrs
RSP	11/11/2021		1.00	1.00	775.00	775.00
11/11/21	RSP	Review petition for rehearing en banc and correspondence regarding same; legal research regarding same.				1.00 hrs
DNN	11/11/2021		0.50	0.50	505.00	252.50
11/11/21	DNN	Review Sunoco's motion for rehearing en banc and correspondence between R. Post and B. Beckworth regarding same.				0.50 hrs
RSP	11/12/2021		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
11/12/21	RSP	Conference with P. Ryan regarding en banc rehearing.				0.20 hrs
RSP	11/29/2021		0.50	0.50	775.00	387.50
11/29/21	RSP	Correspondence regarding [REDACTED]; review order denying rehearing and rehearing en banc and correspondence regarding same.				0.50 hrs
DNN	11/29/2021		0.10	0.10	505.00	50.50
11/29/21	DNN	Review correspondence between R. Post and B. Beckworth regarding [REDACTED]				0.10 hrs
RSP	11/30/2021		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
11/30/21	RSP	Correspondence regarding response to motion to exclude expert.				0.20 hrs
RSP	11/30/2021		0.90	0.90	775.00	697.50
11/30/21	RSP	Conference with B. Beckworth regarding next steps.				0.90 hrs
RSP	12/01/2021		2.40	2.40	775.00	1,860.00
12/01/21	RSP	Conference with P. Ryan and P. Jantzen regarding status of appeal; research regarding [REDACTED] and conference with D. Nightingale regarding same; correspondence with M. Yeates regarding motion to stay issuance of mandate; review motion to stay mandate; legal research regarding 10th Circuit procedure for panel assignments; review mandamus petition and correspondence regarding same.				2.40 hrs
OJM	12/01/2021		1.60	1.60	555.00	888.00
12/01/21	OJM	Review correspondence from R. Post; research procedure for seeking appellate fees in 10th Circuit.				1.60 hrs
DNN	12/01/2021		0.30	0.30	505.00	151.50
12/01/21	DNN	Review correspondence between R. Post, B. Beckworth, and O. McGovern regarding Sunoco's planned mandamus filing, appellate attorneys' fees, and [REDACTED]; confer with R. Post regarding research on [REDACTED]				0.30 hrs
RSP	12/02/2021		0.50	0.50	775.00	387.50
12/02/21	RSP	Review petition for mandamus.				0.50 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 15

OJM	12/09/2021		5.80	5.80	555.00	3,219.00
12/09/21	OJM	Draft application for appellate attorneys' fees.				5.80 hrs
RSP	12/10/2021		0.60	0.60	775.00	465.00
12/10/21	RSP	Conference with O. McGovern regarding next steps; revise application for attorney's fees.				0.60 hrs
RSP	12/13/2021		1.10	1.10	775.00	852.50
12/13/21	RSP	Correspondence regarding application for appellate fees; finalize and file same; review motion for hearing on assets and correspondence regarding same.				1.10 hrs
RSP	12/21/2021		1.30	1.30	775.00	1,007.50
12/21/21	RSP	Review order requesting response to petition for writ of mandamus and correspondence regarding same; conference with B. Beckworth regarding same; outline response to petition for mandamus.				1.30 hrs
RSP	12/22/2021		3.20	3.20	775.00	2,480.00
12/22/21	RSP	Conference with O. McGovern and D. Nightingale regarding strategy for mandamus response; draft finality section of response.				3.20 hrs
OJM	12/22/2021		1.30	1.30	555.00	721.50
12/22/21	OJM	Review mandamus petition; conference with R. Post and D. Nightingale.				1.30 hrs
DNN	12/22/2021		5.50	5.50	505.00	2,777.50
12/22/21	DNN	Confer with R. Post and O. McGovern regarding strategy and division of responsibility for response to Sunoco's petition for a writ of mandamus; review and outline relevant sections of petition for writ of mandamus and panel opinion; research applicable authorities on doctrine of laches generally and circumstances in which it precludes a party from seeking a writ of mandamus; draft section of response to Sunoco's petition for writ of mandamus contending that petition is untimely, conducting follow-up research and reviewing record materials research as necessary.				5.50 hrs
RSP	12/23/2021		4.50	4.50	775.00	3,487.50
12/23/21	RSP	Draft response to petition for writ of mandamus.				4.50 hrs
DNN	12/23/2021		5.20	5.20	505.00	2,626.00
12/23/21	DNN	Review and revise section of response to Sunoco's petition for writ of mandamus contending that petition is untimely; draft statement of the case section of same, consulting record materials as necessary; submit both sections to R. Post for integration into master document.				5.20 hrs
RSP	12/24/2021		3.50	3.50	775.00	2,712.50
12/24/21	RSP	Draft statement of the case for response to petition for writ of mandamus.				3.50 hrs
RSP	12/26/2021		4.50	4.50	775.00	3,487.50
12/26/21	RSP	Draft response to petition for writ of mandamus.				4.50 hrs
RSP	12/27/2021		4.80	4.80	775.00	3,720.00
12/27/21	RSP	Review response to fee application and correspondence regarding reply; draft response to mandamus petition and study record regarding same; legal research regarding same.				4.80 hrs
OJM	12/27/2021		0.40	0.40	555.00	222.00
12/27/21	OJM	Review response opposing attorneys' fees; review authorities cited therein and correspond with R. Post regarding same.				0.40 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 16

RSP	12/28/2021		3.70	3.70	775.00	2,867.50
12/28/21	RSP	Correspondence with B. Beckworth and D. Tate regarding [REDACTED]; review and revise response to petition for writ of mandamus; conference with O. McGovern regarding reply in support of fee application and motion to assign mandamus to merits panel; conference with D. Tate regarding plan of allocation and undivided accounts; further revisions to mandamus response.				3.70 hrs
OJM	12/28/2021		2.60	2.60	555.00	1,443.00
12/28/21	OJM	Begin drafting reply supporting attorneys' fees; begin review of authorities on prevailing party status and procedural waiver.				2.60 hrs
RSP	12/29/2021		1.60	1.60	775.00	1,240.00
12/29/21	RSP	Revise response to petition for writ of mandamus and circulate draft to entire team.				1.60 hrs
RSP	12/30/2021		0.60	0.60	775.00	465.00
12/30/21	RSP	Correspondence regarding finality issue and revisions to mandamus response.				0.60 hrs
RSP	12/31/2021		0.40	0.40	775.00	310.00
12/31/21	RSP	Review and revise reply in support of application for appellate fees and correspondence regarding same.				0.40 hrs
OJM	12/31/2021		3.60	3.60	555.00	1,998.00
12/31/21	OJM	Continue review of authorities; continue drafting reply supporting fee application; circulate same.				3.60 hrs
RSP	01/03/2022		1.80	1.80	775.00	1,395.00
01/03/22	RSP	Review order denying application for appellate attorney's fees; correspondence regarding finality and mandamus response; incorporate changes to mandamus response.				1.80 hrs
RSP	01/04/2022		4.80	4.80	775.00	3,720.00
01/04/22	RSP	Revise mandamus response and circulate revised draft to entire team.				4.80 hrs
RSP	01/05/2022		0.40	0.40	775.00	310.00
01/05/22	RSP	Conference with O. McGovern regarding finality research issue; review comments on revised draft of mandamus response.				0.40 hrs
OJM	01/05/2022		4.00	4.00	555.00	2,220.00
01/05/22	OJM	Conference with R. Post; review applicable authorities on finality.				4.00 hrs
RSP	01/06/2022		3.70	3.70	775.00	2,867.50
01/06/22	RSP	Revise mandamus response and correspondence regarding same.				3.70 hrs
OJM	01/06/2022		3.00	3.00	555.00	1,665.00
01/06/22	OJM	Continue review of applicable authorities on finality; draft correspondence to R. Post regarding same.				3.00 hrs
RSP	01/07/2022		2.80	2.80	775.00	2,170.00
01/07/22	RSP	Revise and finalize mandamus response; conference with B. Beckworth regarding same; correspondence with D. Pate regarding same; finalize and file.				2.80 hrs
OJM	01/07/2022		0.60	0.60	555.00	333.00
01/07/22	OJM	Cite check legal authorities.				0.60 hrs
DNN	01/07/2022		0.60	0.60	505.00	303.00
01/07/22	DNN	Citecheck section I of response to Sunoco's petition for a writ of mandamus.				0.60 hrs
RSP	01/14/2022		0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50
01/14/22	RSP	Review reply brief in mandamus and correspondence regarding same.				0.30 hrs
RSP	02/02/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
02/02/22	RSP	Review order on mandamus denial and correspondence regarding same.				0.20 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 17

RSP	02/03/2022		0.40	0.40	775.00	310.00
02/03/22	RSP	Conferences and correspondence regarding [REDACTED].				0.40 hrs
RSP	02/08/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
02/08/22	RSP	Conference with B. Beckworth regarding [REDACTED].				0.20 hrs
RSP	02/09/2022		1.20	1.20	775.00	930.00
02/09/22	RSP	Correspondence regarding [REDACTED]; review draft Rule 60 motion and correspondence regarding same; conference regarding [REDACTED] and correspondence regarding same.				1.20 hrs
RSP	02/10/2022		0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50
02/10/22	RSP	Participate in status conference regarding asset hearing.				0.30 hrs
RSP	02/12/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
02/12/22	RSP	Review and revise stipulation regarding attorney's fees.				0.20 hrs
RSP	02/19/2022		0.80	0.80	775.00	620.00
02/19/22	RSP	Correspondence with B. Beckworth and D. Pate regarding [REDACTED]; conference with D. Gunn regarding same.				0.80 hrs
RSP	02/22/2022		0.60	0.60	775.00	465.00
02/22/22	RSP	Review motion for extension of time to file cert. petition and correspondence regarding same.				0.60 hrs
RSP	02/24/2022		0.70	0.70	775.00	542.50
02/24/22	RSP	Review draft response to Rule 60 motion and correspondence regarding same.				0.70 hrs
RSP	02/25/2022		0.70	0.70	775.00	542.50
02/25/22	RSP	Review drafts of stipulation regarding attorney's fees and correspondence regarding same.				0.70 hrs
RSP	03/01/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
03/01/22	RSP	Correspondence regarding deadlines for action on cert. petition.				0.20 hrs
RSP	03/02/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
03/02/22	RSP	Review revised stipulation regarding attorney's fees and correspondence regarding same.				0.20 hrs
RSP	03/29/2022		0.80	0.80	775.00	620.00
03/29/22	RSP	Review order granting extension of cert. petition deadline and correspondence regarding same.				0.80 hrs
RSP	03/31/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
03/31/22	RSP	Conference with B. Beckworth regarding results of hearing on motion for relief under Rule 58 or Rule 60.				0.20 hrs
RSP	04/01/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
04/01/22	RSP	Review order granting injunction in part.				0.20 hrs
RSP	04/26/2022		1.00	1.00	775.00	775.00
04/26/22	RSP	Research US Supreme Court procedure for distribution of petitions and conference lists.				1.00 hrs
OJM	04/28/2022		2.00	2.00	555.00	1,110.00
04/28/22	OJM	Review cert petition; review opinion and briefing below.				2.00 hrs
RSP	04/29/2022		1.00	1.00	775.00	775.00
04/29/22	RSP	Correspondence regarding waiver of response to cert. petition; review new notices of appeal and correspondence regarding same.				1.00 hrs
RSP	05/02/2022		1.00	1.00	775.00	775.00
05/02/22	RSP	Conference with B. Beckworth and P. Ryan regarding waiver of response to cert. petition and next steps; prepare and file waiver; correspondence regarding same.				1.00 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 18

RSP	05/11/2022		0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50
05/11/22	RSP	Correspondence regarding [REDACTED]				0.30 hrs
RSP	05/13/2022		0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50
05/13/22	RSP	Conference with B. Beckworth regarding mediation and next steps.				0.30 hrs
RSP	05/16/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
05/16/22	RSP	Review docketing notice and deadlines for injunction appeal.				0.20 hrs
RSP	05/17/2022		0.40	0.40	775.00	310.00
05/17/22	RSP	Correspondence regarding call for response to cert. petition.				0.40 hrs
OJM	05/23/2022		0.30	0.30	555.00	166.50
05/23/22	OJM	Conference with R. Post.				0.30 hrs
RSP	05/26/2022		0.50	0.50	775.00	387.50
05/26/22	RSP	Prepare brief in opposition to cert. petition.				0.50 hrs
OJM	05/26/2022		11.80	11.80	555.00	6,549.00
05/26/22	OJM	Continue review of cert petition, mandamus briefing, and jurisdictional briefing; begin review of applicable authorities; brief key cases.				11.80 hrs
RSP	05/27/2022		0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50
05/27/22	RSP	Conference with O. McGovern regarding strategy for response to cert. petition.				0.30 hrs
OJM	05/27/2022		0.90	0.90	555.00	499.50
05/27/22	OJM	Begin outlining response to cert petition; conference with R. Post.				0.90 hrs
RSP	06/01/2022		0.80	0.80	775.00	620.00
06/01/22	RSP	Review Supreme Court rules regarding extension of time for brief in opposition and draft letter regarding same.				0.80 hrs
OJM	06/01/2022		8.30	8.30	555.00	4,606.50
06/01/22	OJM	Continue outlining response to cert petition; circulate same; begin review of additional authorities in preparation for drafting response.				8.30 hrs
OJM	06/17/2022		4.00	4.00	555.00	2,220.00
06/17/22	OJM	Continue review of applicable authorities.				4.00 hrs
RSP	06/19/2022		1.20	1.20	775.00	930.00
06/19/22	RSP	Review and revise outline of response to cert. petition.				1.20 hrs
RSP	06/20/2022		5.00	5.00	775.00	3,875.00
06/20/22	RSP	Review and revise outline for response to cert. petition and research regarding same.				5.00 hrs
RSP	06/21/2022		1.20	1.20	775.00	930.00
06/21/22	RSP	Review and revise outline for response to cert. petition and research regarding same; conference with O. McGovern regarding same.				1.20 hrs
OJM	06/21/2022		0.80	0.80	555.00	444.00
06/21/22	OJM	Review revised outline; conference with R. Post regarding same.				0.80 hrs
GMD	06/23/2022		2.00	2.00	125.00	250.00
06/23/22	GMD	Review order from 10th Circuit and Petition for Writ of Certiorari; confer with O. McGovern regarding research on applicable case law for response.				2.00 hrs
RSP	06/24/2022		0.50	0.50	775.00	387.50
06/24/22	RSP	Review motion for injunction pending appeal and correspondence regarding same.				0.50 hrs
OJM	06/24/2022		8.20	8.20	555.00	4,551.00
06/24/22	OJM	Review proposed joint appendix; correspond with opposing counsel regarding same; continue review of authorities; review motion for injunction; conference with R. Post.				8.20 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 19

RSP	06/26/2022		0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50
06/26/22	RSP	Review motion for injunction pending appeal and correspondence regarding same.				0.30 hrs
OJM	06/26/2022		6.40	6.40	555.00	3,552.00
06/26/22	OJM	Continue review of authorities; review correspondence from B. Beckwith and R. Post.				6.40 hrs
RSP	06/27/2022		1.20	1.20	775.00	930.00
06/27/22	RSP	Conferences and correspondence regarding response to motion for injunction pending appeal.				1.20 hrs
OJM	06/27/2022		13.70	13.70	555.00	7,603.50
06/27/22	OJM	Continue review of authorities and drafting; correspondence regarding interlocutory appeal and details of enforcement procedure; conference with co-counsel; continue review of authorities and drafting response to petition for certiorari.				13.70 hrs
ZTN	06/27/2022		5.60	5.60	480.00	2,688.00
06/27/22	ZTN	Confer with O. McGovern about researching standards for the opposing party's burden on its motion to enjoin execution of judgment pending appeal; Update case notes; Research Tenth Circuit case law on motions for stays pending appeal; Draft memorandum on research findings.				5.60 hrs
GMD	06/27/2022		1.40	1.40	125.00	175.00
06/27/22	GMD	Research case law regarding pleading appellate jurisdiction.				1.40 hrs
RSP	06/28/2022		0.40	0.40	775.00	310.00
06/28/22	RSP	Conference with O. McGovern regarding response to cert. petition.				0.40 hrs
OJM	06/28/2022		11.30	11.30	555.00	6,271.50
06/28/22	OJM	Continue review of applicable authorities, record materials, and drafting response opposing certiorari.				11.30 hrs
ZTN	06/28/2022		6.00	6.00	480.00	2,880.00
06/28/22	ZTN	Continue researching standards for issuing stays pending appeal in the Tenth Circuit; Continue drafting memorandum on research findings.				6.00 hrs
GMD	06/28/2022		2.50	2.50	125.00	312.50
06/28/22	GMD	Further reseach of applicable case law regarding [REDACTED]				2.50 hrs
DMS	06/28/2022		1.90	1.90	125.00	237.50
06/28/22	DMS	Researching [REDACTED]				1.90 hrs
DMS	06/28/2022		3.00	3.00	125.00	375.00
06/28/22	DMS	Researching [REDACTED]				3.00 hrs
OJM	06/29/2022		12.50	12.50	555.00	6,937.50
06/29/22	OJM	Continue drafting response.				12.50 hrs
ZTN	06/29/2022		0.50	0.50	480.00	240.00
06/29/22	ZTN	Continue drafting the memorandum on standards for establishing irreparable harm and a likelihood of success on the merits for a stay pending appeal in the Tenth Circuit; Send the memorandum to R. Post and O. McGovern for review.				0.50 hrs
GMD	06/29/2022		5.00	5.00	125.00	625.00
06/29/22	GMD	Draft memorandum to O. McGovern regarding circuit court cases where court [REDACTED]; further research regarding same.				5.00 hrs

Client-	2576	00001	Invoice #	0	PAGE	20
RSP	06/30/2022		3.40	3.40	775.00	2,635.00
06/30/22	RSP	Review order from Tenth Circuit regarding jurisdictional briefing; correspondence and conferences regarding same; draft and revise response to motion for stay pending appeal.				3.40 hrs
OJM	06/30/2022		10.00	10.00	555.00	5,550.00
06/30/22	OJM	Continue drafting response; review order on jurisdictional briefing; review correspondence regarding same.				10.00 hrs
GMD	06/30/2022		1.50	1.50	125.00	187.50
06/30/22	GMD	Further research regarding [REDACTED] in D.C. Circuit and [REDACTED]; revise memorandum regarding same.				1.50 hrs
RSP	07/01/2022		3.30	3.30	775.00	2,557.50
07/01/22	RSP	Conference with O. McGovern regarding strategy for response to motion for stay pending appeal and jurisdictional briefing; correspondence regarding same; revise same and prepare for filing; draft response to motion for injunction or stay pending appeal.				3.30 hrs
OJM	07/01/2022		8.30	8.30	555.00	4,606.50
07/01/22	OJM	Continue drafting response; conference with R. Post.				8.30 hrs
OJM	07/02/2022		2.40	2.40	555.00	1,332.00
07/02/22	OJM	Proofread response opposing certiorari.				2.40 hrs
OJM	07/03/2022		3.20	3.20	555.00	1,776.00
07/03/22	OJM	Revise response opposing certiorari; proofread and circulate same.				3.20 hrs
RSP	07/05/2022		4.30	4.30	775.00	3,332.50
07/05/22	RSP	Review and revise response to cert. petition.				4.30 hrs
OJM	07/05/2022		7.50	7.50	555.00	4,162.50
07/05/22	OJM	Review applicable rules and related authorities cited in Tenth Circuit's request for jurisdictional briefing.				7.50 hrs
RSP	07/06/2022		5.60	5.60	775.00	4,340.00
07/06/22	RSP	Review and revise response to cert. petition.				5.60 hrs
RSP	07/07/2022		8.00	8.00	775.00	6,200.00
07/07/22	RSP	Review and revise response to cert. petition; conference with O. McGovern regarding response to jurisdictional briefing order.				8.00 hrs
OJM	07/07/2022		8.00	8.00	555.00	4,440.00
07/07/22	OJM	Review revisions to response opposing certiorari; conference with R. Post regarding jurisdictional briefing; continue review of authorities and district court briefing regarding same.				8.00 hrs
RSP	07/08/2022		1.30	1.30	775.00	1,007.50
07/08/22	RSP	Circulate draft response to cert. petition and correspondence regarding same; conference with A. Fung regarding citecheck; conference with O. McDaniel regarding jurisdictional analysis of appeals from stay order and strategy for jurisdictional briefs regarding same; revise response to motion for stay pending appeal.				1.30 hrs
OJM	07/08/2022		8.30	8.30	555.00	4,606.50
07/08/22	OJM	Continue review of authorities on jurisdictional briefing; conference with R. Post; begin drafting same.				8.30 hrs
AYF	07/08/2022		1.50	1.50	125.00	187.50
07/08/22	AYF	Reviewing brief in opposition of petition for certiorari.				1.50 hrs
AYF	07/08/2022		2.00	2.00	125.00	250.00
07/08/22	AYF	Reviewed brief in opposition.				2.00 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 21

DMG	07/09/2022		0.80	0.80	700.00	560.00
07/09/22	DMG	Read cert petition by Sunoco; read draft brief in opposition.				0.80 hrs
RSP	07/09/2022		2.30	2.30	775.00	1,782.50
07/09/22	RSP	Correspondence regarding strategy for cert. opposition; draft response to motion for stay pending appeal.				2.30 hrs
AYF	07/09/2022		4.00	4.00	125.00	500.00
07/09/22	AYF	Reviewed brief in opposition.				4.00 hrs
RSP	07/10/2022		5.60	5.60	775.00	4,340.00
07/10/22	RSP	Draft and revise response to motion for stay pending appeal; review and revise draft response to jurisdictional inquiry in injunction appeals; circulate responses to entire team; review comments on response to cert. petition and revise same.				5.60 hrs
OJM	07/10/2022		5.80	5.80	555.00	3,219.00
07/10/22	OJM	Continue drafting jurisdictional brief; review draft motion opposing stay of litigation; correspond with R. Post regarding same.				5.80 hrs
AYF	07/10/2022		6.00	6.00	125.00	750.00
07/10/22	AYF	Reviewed brief in opposition.				6.00 hrs
RSP	07/11/2022		11.60	11.60	775.00	8,990.00
07/11/22	RSP	Revise response to cert. petition and circulate updated draft to entire team; conference with O. McGovern regarding revisions to response to jurisdictional inquiry and motion to stay enforcement; correspondence with B. Beckworth regarding same; revise responses; legal research and record review regarding same.				11.60 hrs
OJM	07/11/2022		6.80	6.80	555.00	3,774.00
07/11/22	OJM	Proofread revised response opposing certiorari; conference with R. Post; review additional authorities and revise brief on jurisdiction; continue proofread; review correspondence from R. Post and Nix Firm.				6.80 hrs
AYF	07/11/2022		1.00	1.00	125.00	125.00
07/11/22	AYF	Reviewed brief in opposition.				1.00 hrs
AYF	07/11/2022		2.10	2.10	125.00	262.50
07/11/22	AYF	Reviewed brief in opposition.				2.10 hrs
RSP	07/12/2022		7.30	7.30	775.00	5,657.50
07/12/22	RSP	Correspondence regarding revisions to response to jurisdictional inquiry and motion to stay enforcement; further revisions to same; finalize brief in opposition to cert. petition; legal research regarding Rule 58 and finality issues.				7.30 hrs
OJM	07/12/2022		4.60	4.60	555.00	2,553.00
07/12/22	OJM	Review redlines from A. Fung; conference with R. Post and A. Fung; review cases cited in redline and make suggested changes to response; begin review of authorities on [REDACTED]				4.60 hrs
AYF	07/12/2022		1.90	1.90	125.00	237.50
07/12/22	AYF	Reviewed briefs in CA10 appeals.				1.90 hrs
RSP	07/13/2022		8.30	8.30	775.00	6,432.50
07/13/22	RSP	Citecheck and revise response to motion for stay pending appeal.				8.30 hrs
OJM	07/13/2022		1.30	1.30	555.00	721.50
07/13/22	OJM	Cite check and proofread jurisdictional brief.				1.30 hrs
RSP	07/14/2022		3.40	3.40	775.00	2,635.00
07/14/22	RSP	Review and finalize jurisdictional brief in injunction appeals; review and finalize response motion to stay pending appeal; review and finalize brief in opposition to cert. petition; citecheck response to stay motion; correspondence regarding filing of jurisdictional briefs; review brief of appellant regarding same.				3.40 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 22

DMS	07/14/2022		1.20	1.20	125.00	150.00
07/14/22	DMS	Research standard of review for appellate review of a Rule 60(b)(6) motion (.6).				1.20 hrs
RSP	07/15/2022		1.00	1.00	775.00	775.00
07/15/22	RSP	Approve filing of brief in opposition to cert. petition; finalize and file response to motion to stay pending appeal.				1.00 hrs
OJM	07/15/2022		0.50	0.50	555.00	277.50
07/15/22	OJM	Review Sunoco's jurisdictional brief; correspond with R. Post regarding same.				0.50 hrs
DMS	07/15/2022		3.50	3.50	125.00	437.50
07/15/22	DMS	Researching state of the law regarding Rule 60(b)(6) motions.				3.50 hrs
DMS	07/17/2022		1.00	1.00	125.00	125.00
07/17/22	DMS	Researching the state of the law for Rule 60(b)(6) motions.				1.00 hrs
RSP	07/18/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
07/18/22	RSP	Conference with opposing counsel regarding cert. opposition.				0.20 hrs
DMS	07/18/2022		3.80	3.80	125.00	475.00
07/18/22	DMS	Researching the state of the law for Rule 60(b)(6) motions (2) and drafting memo containing research findings (1.8).				3.80 hrs
OJM	07/19/2022		0.50	0.50	555.00	277.50
07/19/22	OJM	Review memorandum on Rule 60; conduct supplemental research.				0.50 hrs
OJM	07/21/2022		0.20	0.20	555.00	111.00
07/21/22	OJM	Conference with R. Post.				0.20 hrs
RSP	07/27/2022		0.80	0.80	775.00	620.00
07/27/22	RSP	Review briefing in related appeal regarding [REDACTED]				0.80 hrs
SNS	07/27/2022		1.60	1.60	125.00	200.00
07/27/22	SNS	Review case law regarding the appealability of denials of FRCP Rules 58 and 60 orders (1.6).				1.60 hrs
AYF	07/27/2022		1.00	1.00	125.00	125.00
07/27/22	AYF	Reviewed authorities regarding appellate jurisdiction.				1.00 hrs
AYF	07/27/2022		0.80	0.80	125.00	100.00
07/27/22	AYF	Reviewed authorities regarding appellate jurisdiction.				0.80 hrs
SNS	07/28/2022		2.00	2.00	125.00	250.00
07/28/22	SNS	Review case law regarding the appealability of denials of FRCP Rules 58 and 60 orders (2).				2.00 hrs
SNS	07/28/2022		4.00	4.00	125.00	500.00
07/28/22	SNS	Review case law regarding the appealability of denials of FRCP Rules 58 and 60 orders (4).				4.00 hrs
AYF	07/28/2022		2.00	2.00	125.00	250.00
07/28/22	AYF	Reviewed authorities regarding Rule 60 jurisdiction.				2.00 hrs
AYF	07/28/2022		2.30	2.30	125.00	287.50
07/28/22	AYF	Reviewed authorities regarding Rule 60 jurisdiction.				2.30 hrs
RSP	08/01/2022		0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50
08/01/22	RSP	Review 10th Circuit rules and correspondence regarding brief [REDACTED]				0.30 hrs
OJM	08/01/2022		1.00	1.00	555.00	555.00
08/01/22	OJM	Review memoranda from A. Fung and N. Suresh; begin additional research on appealability of Rule 58 order combined with Rule 60 order.				1.00 hrs
RSP	08/03/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
08/03/22	RSP	Review reply in support of cert. and correspondence regarding same.				0.20 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 23

OJM	08/03/2022		3.00	3.00	555.00	1,665.00
08/03/22	OJM	Continue additional research on appealability of Rule 58 order; review reply supporting certiorari.				3.00 hrs
RSP	08/04/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
08/04/22	RSP	Review order dismissing attempted appeals of stay orders.				0.20 hrs
OJM	08/04/2022		2.60	2.60	555.00	1,443.00
08/04/22	OJM	Review orders from Tenth Circuit; continue research on jurisdiction over Rule 58 motion.				2.60 hrs
RSP	08/18/2022		0.50	0.50	775.00	387.50
08/18/22	RSP	Conference with C. Pfeiffer regarding potential stay of execution and correspondence with B. Beckworth regarding same.				0.50 hrs
RSP	08/22/2022		0.40	0.40	775.00	310.00
08/22/22	RSP	Correspondence with B. Beckworth regarding Sunoco overture; conference with C. Pfeiffer regarding same; correspondence with B. Beckworth regarding same.				0.40 hrs
RSP	08/25/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
08/25/22	RSP	Review motion for administrative stay; review order denying motion for stay pending appeal and administrative stay.				0.20 hrs
RSP	08/29/2022		0.40	0.40	775.00	310.00
08/29/22	RSP	Conference with B. Beckworth regarding response to motion for stay pending appeal; review same and correspondence regarding same.				0.40 hrs
OJM	08/29/2022		1.10	1.10	555.00	610.50
08/29/22	OJM	Review emergency motion; review correspondence regarding same.				1.10 hrs
RSP	08/30/2022		1.70	1.70	775.00	1,317.50
08/30/22	RSP	Review Supreme Court rules regarding motions to stay and correspondence regarding strategy for response; conference with O. McGovern regarding same; correspondence with B. Beckworth regarding same.				1.70 hrs
OJM	08/30/2022		2.30	2.30	555.00	1,276.50
08/30/22	OJM	Continue review of emergency motion; begin review if Supreme Court authorities regarding stays, injunctions, and irreparable harm; conference with R. Post; review judges who have participated in this case; correspond with D. Nightengale.				2.30 hrs
RSP	08/31/2022		2.40	2.40	775.00	1,860.00
08/31/22	RSP	Conference with O. McGovern regarding strategy for response to motion for stay; review supplemental letter to Supreme Court regarding same and correspondence regarding same; review motion and outline notes regarding response.				2.40 hrs
OJM	08/31/2022		7.00	7.00	555.00	3,885.00
08/31/22	OJM	Review briefing opposing injunction from the Tenth Circuit; begin drafting response to emergency application for injunction; continue review of Supreme Court authorities regarding stays and begin review of authorities regarding standard of review for stay pending resolution of petition for writ of certiorari; conference with R. Post; review all recent cases granting stay pending resolution of petition for certiorari.				7.00 hrs
RSP	09/01/2022		0.70	0.70	775.00	542.50
09/01/22	RSP	Correspondence regarding response to motion for stay pending cert. and related issues; review current draft of response and correspondence regarding same.				0.70 hrs
OJM	09/01/2022		9.50	9.50	555.00	5,272.50
09/01/22	OJM	Continue drafting response to emergency motion.				9.50 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 24

RSP	09/02/2022		6.00	6.00	775.00	4,650.00
09/02/22	RSP	Review and revise response to motion for stay in supreme court; correspondence regarding same.				6.00 hrs
OJM	09/04/2022		2.50	2.50	555.00	1,387.50
09/04/22	OJM	Assist in preparation of appendix; cite check brief; review exhibits and identifying additional exhibits.				2.50 hrs
RSP	09/05/2022		4.80	4.80	775.00	3,720.00
09/05/22	RSP	Review comments on response to motion to stay pending certiorari and revise same; revise response and circulate to entire team.				4.80 hrs
OJM	09/05/2022		0.50	0.50	555.00	277.50
09/05/22	OJM	Review brief and [REDACTED] additional exhibits.				0.50 hrs
RSP	09/06/2022		3.70	3.70	775.00	2,867.50
09/06/22	RSP	Finalize and file response to motion to stay pending certiorari.				3.70 hrs
OJM	09/06/2022		0.30	0.30	555.00	166.50
09/06/22	OJM	Review exhibits in preparation of filing.				0.30 hrs
RSP	09/07/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
09/07/22	RSP	Review reply in support of motion for stay pending certiorari.				0.20 hrs
RSP	09/07/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
09/07/22	RSP	Review reply in support of petition for certiorari and correspondence regarding same.				0.20 hrs
RSP	09/08/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
09/08/22	RSP	Review order denying application for stay pending certiorari and correspondence regarding same.				0.20 hrs
OJM	09/12/2022		0.40	0.40	555.00	222.00
09/12/22	OJM	Review joint appendix; correspond with R. Post regarding same.				0.40 hrs
RSP	09/14/2022		0.80	0.80	775.00	620.00
09/14/22	RSP	Review appellant's brief in Rule 60 appeal.				0.80 hrs
RSP	09/22/2022		0.70	0.70	775.00	542.50
09/22/22	RSP	Conference with B. Beckworth et al. regarding strategy for appellee's brief in Rule 60 appeal; correspondence regarding same; conference with O. McGovern regarding same.				0.70 hrs
OJM	09/26/2022		9.00	9.00	555.00	4,995.00
09/26/22	OJM	Review authorities on Rule 60(b)(6); draft memorandum regarding same.				9.00 hrs
RSP	10/03/2022		1.20	1.20	775.00	930.00
10/03/22	RSP	Review cert. denial and correspondence regarding same; draft brief of appellee.				1.20 hrs
OJM	10/05/2022		2.30	2.30	555.00	1,276.50
10/05/22	OJM	Begin revising citations in Appellee's brief.				2.30 hrs
RSP	10/06/2022		6.40	6.40	775.00	4,960.00
10/06/22	RSP	Conference with O. McGovern regarding brief of appellee; review Rule 60 research and outline argument; draft brief of appellee.				6.40 hrs
OJM	10/06/2022		2.40	2.40	555.00	1,332.00
10/06/22	OJM	Continue revising citations; conference with R. Post; review rules on supplemental appendix; review outline; conference with R. Post.				2.40 hrs
RSP	10/07/2022		5.50	5.50	775.00	4,262.50
10/07/22	RSP	Revise Rule 60 section of brief of appellee, conference with O. McGovern regarding same, and transmit draft to trial counsel; study appellant's brief and outline notes for final revisions.				5.50 hrs

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 25

OJM	10/07/2022		4.70	4.70	555.00	2,608.50
10/07/22	OJM	Review prior filings to support Rule 60(b)(6) argument; review Appellee's brief and add additional citations; conference with R. Post; continue review of record for additional citations and items to add to appendix.				4.70 hrs
RSP	10/10/2022		1.10	1.10	775.00	852.50
10/10/22	RSP	Conferences and correspondence with O. McGovern regarding revisions to brief of appellee.				1.10 hrs
OJM	10/10/2022		8.00	8.00	555.00	4,440.00
10/10/22	OJM	Review district court docket to locate specific citations; review briefing and applicable authorities regarding follow-up questions from R. Post; conferences with R. Post.				8.00 hrs
RSP	10/11/2022		0.30	0.30	775.00	232.50
10/11/22	RSP	Review comments on draft brief from trial counsel and correspondence regarding same; conference with O. McGovern regarding finalizing brief.				0.30 hrs
OJM	10/11/2022		4.20	4.20	555.00	2,331.00
10/11/22	OJM	Cite check and proofread Appellee's brief; revise same.				4.20 hrs
RSP	10/12/2022		6.20	6.20	775.00	4,805.00
10/12/22	RSP	Incorporate citecheck revisions and comments from trial counsel into brief of appellee; revise brief.				6.20 hrs
OJM	10/12/2022		2.60	2.60	555.00	1,443.00
10/12/22	OJM	Review record for additional citations; review Tenth Circuit's local rules on oral argument requests and correspond with R. Post regarding same; review comments from B. Beckworth; correspond with R. Post regarding same; cite check new sections of brief; circulate redlines to R. Post.				2.60 hrs
RSP	10/13/2022		7.00	7.00	775.00	5,425.00
10/13/22	RSP	Finalize and file brief of appellee and correspondence regarding same.				7.00 hrs
OJM	10/13/2022		3.00	3.00	555.00	1,665.00
10/13/22	OJM	Conduct additional research on Rule 60 argument.				3.00 hrs
RSP	11/03/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
11/03/22	RSP	Review reply brief and correspondence regarding same.				0.20 hrs
OJM	11/04/2022		1.30	1.30	555.00	721.50
11/04/22	OJM	Review reply brief.				1.30 hrs
OJM	12/05/2022		1.30	1.30	555.00	721.50
12/05/22	OJM	Review Enervest brief.				1.30 hrs
RSP	12/21/2022		0.20	0.20	775.00	155.00
12/21/22	RSP	Correspondence regarding application for attorney's fees.				0.20 hrs
TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER						\$700,184.50

EXPENSESAmount

E106	10/31/2020	\$0.40	
10/31/20	Computerized research performed 10.2020 (PACER)		0.40
E106	11/30/2020	\$23.02	
11/30/20	Computerized research performed 11.2020(WESTLAW)		23.02
E106	12/31/2020	\$67.82	
12/31/20	Computerized research performed 12.2020(WESTLAW)		67.82
E106	12/31/2020	\$0.50	
12/31/20	Computerized research performed 12.2020 (PACER)		0.50

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 26

E106	12/31/2020	\$0.20	
12/31/20	Computerized research performed 12.2020 (PACER)		0.20
E106	01/31/2021	\$2.30	
01/31/21	Computerized research performed 1.2021 (PACER)		2.30
E106	02/28/2021	\$0.40	
02/28/21	Computerized research performed 2.2021 (PACER)		0.40
E106	02/28/2021	\$1.40	
02/28/21	Computerized research performed 2.2021 (PACER)		1.40
E106	03/31/2021	\$47.00	
03/31/21	Computerized research performed 3.2021 (PACER)		47.00
E106	03/31/2021	\$137.00	
03/31/21	Computerized research performed 3.2021 (PACER)		137.00
E106	03/31/2021	\$127.01	
03/31/21	Computerized research performed 3.2021(WESTLAW)		127.01
E106	03/31/2021	\$17.07	
03/31/21	Computerized research performed 3.2021(WESTLAW)		17.07
E106	04/30/2021	\$3.90	
04/30/21	Computerized research performed 4.2021 (PACER)		3.90
E106	04/30/2021	\$391.61	
04/30/21	Computerized research performed 4.2021(WESTLAW)		391.61
E106	05/31/2021	\$0.50	
05/31/21	Computerized research performed 5.2021 (PACER)		0.50
E106	05/31/2021	\$135.51	
05/31/21	Computerized research performed 5.2021(WESTLAW)		135.51
E106	05/31/2021	\$253.98	
05/31/21	Computerized research performed 5.2021(WESTLAW)		253.98
E106	05/31/2021	\$262.15	
05/31/21	Computerized research performed 5.2021(WESTLAW)		262.15
E106	06/30/2021	\$2.20	
06/30/21	Computerized research performed 6.2021 (PACER)		2.20
E106	06/30/2021	\$12.70	
06/30/21	Computerized research performed 6.2021(WESTLAW)		12.70
E106	06/30/2021	\$24.43	
06/30/21	Computerized research performed 6.2021(WESTLAW)		24.43
E106	06/30/2021	\$23.48	
06/30/21	Computerized research performed 6.2021(WESTLAW)		23.48
E106	07/31/2021	\$9.16	
07/31/21	Computerized research performed 7.2021(WESTLAW)		9.16
E106	10/31/2021	\$23.77	
10/31/21	Computerized research performed 10.2021(WESTLAW)		23.77
E106	12/31/2021	\$659.57	
12/31/21	Computerized research performed 12.2021(WESTLAW)		659.57
E106	12/31/2021	\$143.30	
12/31/21	Computerized research performed 12.2021(WESTLAW)		143.30
E106	12/31/2021	\$337.21	
12/31/21	Computerized research performed 12.2021(WESTLAW)		337.21

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 27

E106	01/31/2022	\$182.06	
01/31/22	Computerized research performed 1.2022(WESTLAW)		182.06
E106	01/31/2022	\$4.51	
01/31/22	Computerized research performed 1.2022(WESTLAW)		4.51
E106	03/31/2022	\$1.10	
03/31/22	Computerized research performed 3.2022 (PACER)		1.10
E106	05/31/2022	\$9.00	
05/31/22	Computerized research performed 5.2022 (PACER)		9.00
E106	05/31/2022	\$28.51	
05/31/22	Computerized research performed 5.2022(WESTLAW)		28.51
E106	06/30/2022	\$29.90	
06/30/22	Computerized research performed 6.2022 (PACER)		29.90
E106	06/30/2022	\$284.27	
06/30/22	Computerized research performed 6.2022(WESTLAW)		284.27
E106	06/30/2022	\$363.18	
06/30/22	Computerized research performed 6.2022(WESTLAW)		363.18
E106	06/30/2022	\$142.07	
06/30/22	Computerized research performed 6.2022(WESTLAW)		142.07
E106	06/30/2022	\$17.04	
06/30/22	Computerized research performed 6.2022(WESTLAW)		17.04
E106	06/30/2022	\$493.97	
06/30/22	Computerized research performed 6.2022(WESTLAW)		493.97
E106	07/31/2022	\$294.49	
07/31/22	Computerized research performed 7.2022(WESTLAW)		294.49
E106	07/31/2022	\$534.03	
07/31/22	Computerized research performed 7.2022(WESTLAW)		534.03
E106	07/31/2022	\$201.48	
07/31/22	Computerized research performed 7.2022(WESTLAW)		201.48
E106	07/31/2022	\$119.05	
07/31/22	Computerized research performed 7.2022(WESTLAW)		119.05
E106	07/31/2022	\$63.18	
07/31/22	Computerized research performed 7.2022(WESTLAW)		63.18
E102	08/16/2022	\$700.00	
000886	Invoice # 1590-6088		
08/16/22	American Express; Outside Printing		700.00
E102	08/16/2022	\$979.11	
000886	Invoice # 1299-5220		
08/16/22	Cockle Legal Briefs; Outside Printing		979.11
E106	08/31/2022	\$209.39	
08/31/22	Computerized research performed 8.2022(WESTLAW)		209.39
E106	08/31/2022	\$0.40	
08/31/22	Computerized research performed 8.2022 (PACER)		0.40
E124	09/29/2022	\$8.00	
RSP	Invoice # 092922RSPVAR		
09/29/22	Russell S. Post; SWA Wi-Fi		8.00

Client- 2576 00001 Invoice # 0

PAGE 28

E106	09/30/2022	\$55.50	
09/30/22	Computerized research performed 9.2022 (PACER)		55.50
E106	10/31/2022	\$1.30	
10/31/22	PACER research performed 10.2022		1.30
E106	10/31/2022	\$43.43	
10/31/22	Computerized research performed 10.2022(WESTLAW)		43.43
E123	12/22/2022	\$548.46	
12/22/22	Electronic printing		548.46
E107	12/22/2022	\$369.87	
12/22/22	Delivery Expenses		369.87
TOTAL EXPENSES FOR THIS MATTER			<u>\$8,390.89</u>

BILLING SUMMARY:

Darrah, Grace M	12.40 hrs @	\$125.00 /hr	1,550.00
Fung, Anson Y	24.60 hrs @	\$125.00 /hr	3,075.00
Gunn, David M.	0.80 hrs @	\$700.00 /hr	560.00
McGovern, Owen J.	528.20 hrs @	\$555.00 /hr	293,151.00
Nelson, Zachary T.	12.10 hrs @	\$480.00 /hr	5,808.00
Nightingale, Daniel N.	188.50 hrs @	\$505.00 /hr	95,192.50
Post, Russell S.	384.40 hrs @	\$775.00 /hr	297,910.00
Redmon, Patrick	0.40 hrs @	\$470.00 /hr	188.00
Shokry, Danny M	14.40 hrs @	\$125.00 /hr	1,800.00
Suresh, Srinidhi Nidhi	7.60 hrs @	\$125.00 /hr	950.00
FEE RECAP TOTALS	<u>1173.40</u> hrs		<u>\$700,184.50</u>

TOTAL FEES	\$700,184.50
TOTAL EXPENSES	\$8,390.89
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE	<u>\$708,575.39</u>
TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE	<u>\$708,575.39</u>